MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) 11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/economy
ES Windows, LLC

3550 NW 49" Street

Miami, FL 33142

ScorE:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER -
Product Control Section to be used in Miami Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami Dade County) reserve the right to
have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform
in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately
revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the
right to revoke this acceptance, if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this
product or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building
Code, including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “EL400-10” Aluminum Sliding Glass Door - L.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. 20-12D Rev C, titled “ES-EL400-10" Alum. Sliding Glass Door
(L.M.L)”, sheets 1 through 23 of 23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation dated 09/11/20 and last revised on
AUG 16, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control
Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County
Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant

Limitations:

1. See Elevations in sheets 1, 2, 3, 4 and anchors requirements. See Header anchor capacity charts in sheet 6
and Glass capacity VS size in sheet 5. Overall Lower Design Pressure (DP) controls for entire assembly.

2. See sheets 7 thru 13 for various configurations, tracks, pockets, non-pockets and allowable frame area.

3. See Water Rating qualified Sill Riser and alternate Sill Riser in sheet 22.

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,

Columbia, S.A., series, and the following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved",
unless otherwise noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in
the materials, use, and/or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of
any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its
distributors and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.
This NOA renews NOA # 21-0728.01 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3, E-4 and
E-5, as well as approval document mentioned above.
The submitted documentation was reviewed by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.
NOA No. 22-0118.05
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
I ;(/\4? { ] lézm:)g Apprmlf)al Date: Februarg 17,2022
Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

ES Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.
2. Drawing No. W16-73, titled “ES-EL400 Alum. Sliding Glass Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 23 of 23, dated 11/28/16, with revision A dated 07/12/17, prepared by Al-
Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Forced Entry Test, per FBC, and TAS 202-94
6) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
7) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of an aluminum sliding glass
door, prepared by Blackwater Testing, Inc., Test Report No. BT-ESW-17-009, dated
06/15/17, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E. with Letter of Clarification
issued on 07/13/17, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.

C. CALCULATIONS

1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC-5"
Edition (2014) and FBC-6'" Edition (2017), dated 06/20/17 and revised on 07/13/17,
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

2. Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09.

3. Analysis recommendation letter prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation dated AUG 03,
2020 for #10 screw boss for Extrusion parts # ES-EL-400-.001, -.002 and -.005,
signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 16-1117.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers”, expiring on
07/08/19.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their

“Sentry Glass® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayer”, expiring on 07/04/18.

3. Notice of Acceptance No. 15-1201.11 issued to Eastman Chemical Co. (MA) for
their “Saflex Clear and Color Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 05/21/21.

4. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0423.15 issued to Eastman Chemical Co. (MA) for
their “Saflex CP — Saflex and Saflex HP (o macita Clace Tntprlgyers with PET
Core”, expiring on 11/11/18. | ;(«4? Eio

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
Approval Date: February 17, 2022



ES Windows, LLC

F.

D.

E.

N

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

STATEMENTS
Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC-5" Edition (2014) and FBC-6"
Edition (2017) and No financial interest, dated 07/12/17, issued by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
Distributor Agreement signed by Carlos Garcia and by Evelyn Daes.
Laboratory compliance statement for Test Report No. BT-ESW-17-009, issued by
Blackwater Testing, Inc., dated 06/15/17, signed and sealed by Dennis Dufty, CEO.
Proposal No. 16-1478 issued by the Product Control Section, dated 11/17/16, signed by
Ishaq Chanda, P.E.

Evidence submitted under previous approval.

DRAWINGS

I. Drawing No. 20-12D Rev A (former W16-73 Rev A), titled “ES-EL400 Alum. Sliding Glass
Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1 through 23 of 23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation dated 09/11/20,
signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

TESTS
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Forced Entry Test, per FBC, and TAS 202-94
6) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
7) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
8) ANSI-Z97.1
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum sliding glass doors,
prepared by Blackwater Testing, Inc., Test Report No. BT-ESW-19007, dated 12/09/19,
signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.

CALCULATIONS

1 Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis dated 09/11/20, complying
with FBC-7% Edition (2020), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed
by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

2. Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09 and -016.
QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers”, expiring on

07/08/24.
| 9%'2 [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
Approval Date: February 17,2022



ES Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 07/04/23.

3. Notice of Acceptance No. 15-1201.11 issued to Eastman Chemical Co. (MA) for their
“Saflex Clear and Color Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 05/21/21.

4. Notice of Acceptance No. 18-0301.06 issued to Eastman Chemical Co. (MA) for their
“Saflex CP — Saflex and Saflex HP Composite Glass Interlayers with PET Core”,
expiring on 11/11/23.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC-7" Edition (2020) and No financial
interest, dated 09/11/20, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.
2. Test Lab Compliance statement, as part of test report.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA # 16-0617.02 and updates to FBC 2020 (7™ Edition) expiring
07/20/22.
2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows,
LLC, dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen.
MGR) respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOAC(s) files.
3.  RER Test proposals #19-1155 dated 01/10/20 approved by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

| QL@? [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
Approval Date: February 17,2022



ES Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. 20-12D Rev C, titled “ES-EL400-10” Alum. Sliding Glass Door (L.M.1.)”,
sheets 1 through 23 of 23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation dated 09/11/20 and last revised
on AUG 16, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.
C CALCULATIONS
1 Comparative structural section properties sill riser analysis, dated 07/07/21, prepared
by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
2. Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09 and -016.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
I. Notice of Acceptance No. 21-0216.01 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
(former Solutia, Inc.) for the “Saflex: Saflex Clear & Color glass interlayer”, expiring
on 05/21/26.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC-7" Edition (2020) and No financial
interest, dated 07/07/21, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.
2. Test Lab Compliance statement, as part of test report.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA No. 20-0427.11 and updates to FBC 2020 (7" Edition) expiring
07/20/22.

2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows,
LLC, dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen.
MGR) respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOAC(s) files.

3. Comparative Sectional properties analysis of sill Risers.

| QL@? [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
Approval Date: February 17,2022



ES Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

5. New Evidence submitted.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. 20-12D Rev C, titled “ES-EL400-10” Alum. Sliding Glass Door (L.M.L.)”,
sheets 1 through 23 of 23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation dated 09/11/20 and last revised
on AUG 16, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C CALCULATIONS
1 None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 21-0216.01 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
(former Solutia, Inc.) for the “Saflex: Saflex Clear & Color glass interlayer”, expiring
on 05/21/26.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC-7" Edition (2020) and No financial
interest, dated 01/12/22, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA renews NOA No. 21-0728.05, expiring 07/20/27.
2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows,
LLC, dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen.
MGR) respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOAC(s) files.
3. Comparative Sectional properties analysis of sill Risers (under previous approval).

| 9%'2 [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date: July 20, 2027
Approval Date: February 17,2022



PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0728.01

Expiration Date 07/20/2022

By \QL«'? [. L hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 22-0118.05
Expiration Date 07/20/2027

By \QLW? [ Ké‘?ﬂj%

Miami-Dade Product Control

DAYLITE OPENING WIDTH:
PANEL WIDTH - 5.688"

DAYLITE OPENING HEIGHT:
PANEL HEIGHT — 5.813"

PANEL HEIGHT = DOOR FRAME HEIGHT — 1.250”"

THESE DOORS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.
SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.

PRODUCT COMPLIES WITH REQUIREMENTS OF ANSI Z87.1.
SAFEGUARD REQUIREMENTS TO BE VERIFIED.

SERIES ES—-EL400-10
ALUMINUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR

THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION) FLORIDA BUILDING CODE
INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON ‘ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

15" MAX. 6"
HEAD TYP.
3"

HEAD ANCHORS

AT INTERLOCK ENDS
CLUSTER OF 4 OR 6

SEE SHEET 6

FOR QUANTITY & CAPACITY

ﬁq—w

|
Miﬁ/

SHALL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

| - : ; ) 2 TRACK
%ﬁ S : -] ? FRAME HEAD
*
g ) 98 1/4" ‘
A DOOR FRAME WIDTH/\\
- () &)
|
1
’i !
g ‘I‘.“Z::: pol
| |
| |
l |
.::dvf;:::':::;f:':
i }
. ' I §s
o e e e e e e s i
[ &
gL P o = . @ e |:@ . @ i
gz‘f .Eg e % . (.:xf:) :."‘9 4] ::::%;{/:::;Qx.._: ;///' 2 1“3
-m:mo ;///// s fw \% 10, §|//, 45 s/
ox|>3 4 QZ " |IT 2° e e
— O T % ,// — é © | i ;E o ! 9
T e ol TV PN L [T U N
O ©< b - <z‘ - 0 ‘—‘“‘%fw—"_ ‘\m"‘_- <b
Z ot a7 l ¢ noa
- 8 ;l i 1.13/16 ;L
e SR —— MIN. T T
! L
i i
I '
m BEEE :
{ > o
220 n oy
S 2 I R 1 <
S AT NS
¥ 8 ; ! ©
® © Tr
POCKET JAMB FALSE MUNTIN | » TRACK
ANCHORS OPTIONAL i y
| 43 15/16 FRAME JAMB
[ »
| 43 15/16 B.L. OPG.
D.L. OPG. )
3| 49 5/8"
iy 49 5/8" PANEL WIDTH
D= PANEL WIDTH
= e S — 2 TRACK
T [ g ) Lt s FRAME SILL
—GSI—TC\X;«% . SILL ANCHORS
CORNERS 15" MAX 6" AT INTERLOCK ENDS
: CLUSTER OF 4
SiLL P
TYPICAL ELEVATION
INSTRUCTIONS; ox
USE CHARTS AS FOLLOWS ‘
STEP 1 DETERMINE DESIGN WIND LOAD REQUIREMENT BASED
=== ON WIND VELOCITY, BLDG. HEIGHT, WIND ZONE
USING APPLICABLE ASCE 7 STANDARD.
STEP 2 DETERMINE DOOR CAPACITY FROM TABLE ON SHEET 5
: FOR THE REINFORCING OPTION USED.
TEP USING CHARTS ON SHEET 6 SELECT ANCHOR OPTION
' WITH DESIGN RATING MORE THAN DESIGN LOAD SPECIFIED
IN STEP 1 ABOVE.
STEP & THE LOWEST VALUE RESULTING FROM STEPS 2 AND 3

f
C

ﬂa
COMP—ANL\20-12D—ES )}

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 2626978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

|

FAX. {305) 638-5158

STREET
FL. 33142

TEL. {305) 638~-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49

MIAMI,

)[ ES-EL400-10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LML) )

S——"
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

SiLL. RISER REVISED
SILL RISER OPTIONS ADDED

by [ descriptio

(revisions:
nol date

A 109.02.201
8 06.25.21
C 108.04.21

(sheet 1 of 23)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


o )
HX 0
:ié‘ g-m ;/
2'<= 24 //
00
= U)\I ///
25|~ 8 /s
¥ | Z v
Oco<
pd
<
< &
m
i3y
Lo
= 195
vi o
POCKET JAMB
ANCHORS

120"

TYPICAL ELEVATION

OX—-XO

157 MAX. Tgp HEAD ANCHORS
. HEAD AT INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS PRODUCT RENEWED
6" MAX. ©| | 3 CLUSTER OF 4 OR 6 as complying with the Florida
HEAD SIZ ADDL. SEE SHEET 6 A Building Code
CORNERS = PAIR FOR QUANTITY & CAPACITY NOA-No. 22-0118.05
T ) < L] *\Y _ _ e ) ; 1 ? 2 TRACK Expiration Date 07/20/2027
. . TR Y ° . \ 7 3
=SR1 SRR T FRAME HEAD By Steg | Lhan
e 2 Miami-Dade Product Control
194 3/4” TYP.
DOOR FRAME WIDTH
@ @ PRODUCT REVISED
o as complying with the Florida
Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0728.01
| ) Expiration Date 07/20/2022
! I By sy | Lhan
’tL :1 Miami-Dade Product Control
fresdbegbus Sumalibiesdbuhs sffomey
™~ [
T
I l
Z::i“":::'}:::: 3
- i | 1|8
g ‘: s :‘ @ / J / / M é =
o . x| \E W v 7 7 I
T o= 15 ol S L 45y e v/ o -
w { NG 8 R ;I'—_-h e 7/ s
I 0|0 v I
= m Lo S S S
<C a0 T ! y ! s - 4
o LR TN ___._Jr_itﬁ.,,.._jlg_mﬁ_
4 fa smmomgmmoomdhesss
—lg = ! | <l[:’ ‘:{> .
g = ! I 113/16" ]
o S — ﬁ MIN.
i {
T
:::?l_::::ﬁ[::: % &)
| ! o
l i 2 g“z"
- !:::::[F‘: N ._3%
L i © o
B © I
FALSE MUNT!N/ Q
43 15/16" D.L. OPG. M
D.L. OPG.
49 5/8"
49 5/8" PANEL WIDTH
PANEL WIDTH
— $EPLEE e : ; T ; : | 2 TRACK
: e - ) . . LA . . FRAME SILL
" ©
6 S!*C/L\X . L Tz \SILL ANCHORS
"nIs » ” AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS
CORNERS 155’3‘AX. 6 CLUSTER OF 4

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
89360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

)[ ES—EL400—10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.I.)j AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

.

COMP—ANL\20—12D—ES )

FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

MIAMI,

(

FAX. (305) 638-5158

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

A |09.02.20
B |06.23.21
C {08.04.21

(revisions:
nol date

1'Q”

02-14-20

L3
o0
N
M

B
o
o
@

date:

drawing

dr. by: TARIQ

no.

20-12D

chk. by:



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida [
Building Code

NOA-No.

6" MAX.

HEAD
CORNERS

[

15" MAX. 6"

HEAD TYP.

3"
PAIR

4 -

ADDL.

HEAD ANCHORS

AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS

CLUSTER OF 4 OR 6
SEE SHEET 6
FOR QUANTITY & CAPACITY

v

N

21-0728.01

Expiration Date 07/20/2022
By \9‘«47 [. Lhande

0.

N2

iz

)
(]1 27N
=
- ]
TN~

288 3/16"

._‘/
e

Miami-Dade Product Control

10" MAX.

ANCHORS ‘A" & 'B’

. @
g.o
e
. & S
©0 O ol
NI 7/
-0
| Z S
© <C 4

4" MAX
JAMB
CORNERS

POCKET JAMB
ANCHORS

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

TYPICAL ELEVATION

OXX—=XXO

/! I
:ﬁ:::: -
.i :, PRODUCT RENEWED
i i as complying with the Florida
~~:‘1L———~'*j:—“ Building Code
T T NOA-No. 22-0118.05
| |
j ;;: Expiration Date 07/20/2027
g %: [: By !9L\<7 l. £ hande
s H s s s
R @ Yo g'@ S @ S @ Miami-Dade Product Control - £
xI i+ o Filo ::::‘Ep:;ﬁ: l:u_: // // // // //
:O Ll }% }% ‘; 7/ || e oS o oS e
NE -1 ‘l {/ !I {/ ’{/ S '{/ ’{/
- & E? g ™~ S ::::#::::‘I::::
e 1T = ! !
s ° ! | <= <= : = =
i
r
I !
i h
f l
= ]:::'_":;_j:
§| (‘
® ©
FALSE MUNTIN
43 15/16 D.L. OFG.
D.L. OPG.
49 5/8"
49 5/8” PANEL WIDTH
PANEL WIDTH
. e oo S
. v . 7 [ Sy / B . . N /
! . . . L I \ . . J
» w |
6" MAX. L NE \SILL ANCHORS
SILL " = 15”7 MAX. 6" AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS
CORNERS SILL TYP. CLUSTER OF 4

MIN.

3 TRACK
FRAME HEAD

13 3/4"
MAX
JAMBS

2 3/8" H«

L

J

3

3 TRACK
FRAME JAMB

3 TRACK
FRAME SILL

6" MAX.
JAMB

CORNERS

TN
n
H-U iy
© S
&
AN b
&
~
£ 3R
o
Q- 38|z
-Z mgz
B=u o)
<E Z.Na_
ml:. S @l=
Qo 2olg
°mg Qo
g ;
Loy %
Eor u
b D
8358
gud
O0Szmo
o <
°n.ogﬁ
O%Lz 4
Fouo &
czo
quUoi g
]
u_ZU'l.:o
L2038 0
w 00dq ;
Z20= o
LSas ¥
j——
—
= ©
= 2
[I9]
s i
(@) M)
P [{e]
2 B
g 2]
(_Do é
Z13aF b
=N iy
7 N
=jnnds
D; -
2O m Y
ol Mw
| &=
. ~~
832“‘«0
< 3
Sl RE
! 0 I
SlWm s E
-/
=
LG
Lt | Gd | Lt
r|T!ixT
[ RRT BRG]
vigln
SIEIEE
i bd Ll
8212|¢
Ljgig|g
OlE|Z|Z
mUUU
Vigiolo
olZiZ 2
>
Lo
28 [ala
o-i—'NT’)*t‘
Qlojein|o
~";"°888
gg<mo
8
(w3 o
N
e
dil B E
< [0} .
Iy
B9«
<3 Q [ <
© 12 o Q
(T T TN
drawing no.

(sheet 3 of 23)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


TYPICAL ELEVATION
OXXX—XXXO

157 MAX. 6 HEAD ANCHORS
HEAD TYP. AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS
. 3" CLUSTER OF 4 OR 6
W] T ™ ADDL. SEE SHEET 6
6" MAX. = Z PAIR FOR QUANTITY & CAPACITY
CORNERS r " . - —— P
; — S - - e P ; \ 7 \ 7 x 4 TRACK
‘ . . '\ . ) '\ / . (NERER \ s / . . N\t . . \; ;/ FRAME HEAD
= T = p——— Aj_,A 6" == -
381 1/2" TYP.
FALSE MUNTIN DOOR FRAME WIDTH
OPTIONAL\ @ @
\1‘ L
Sp====dhs
| i
| |
! |
r [ E
AT
| |
P G =
™ P [ s et NS 2]
%0 ® £l f 5 . , . . (F . (F . R
e <- s |f }, W F g e B S F Ve J S yes ys =S
Ix 2& //; ::::%:ﬁ,ﬁ:%;-A: T L0 25 /// /// /; //// //// -
C i . . i . 2 PRI ¥ ~ Q. e e e " .
S2REI g A 216 7 2 ¥ 7 7
2578 S AN Sl Y i i . / ‘
I l£<z( L < cmomtooost oo & - % ™ _DJ
2 Lo s E | i
e { i "
: | 3 E => => )} 2 15/16
::::;[.L::::::W]Tt::: o 4—_‘-’ Q: Q—:' :f‘> —t M!f<
| i .
| |
! |
:::;L::::|¢::: . %]
9 ol X0l
x| o I ¢ =22
<DL ] | <
S22z | | - s 172 (@]
<% =ho=== © o
L176 I it
O P
B @ PRODUCT REVISED r
POCKET JAMB O as complying with the Florida PRODUCT RENEWED 4 TRACK
ANCHORS 43 15/16” Building Code as complying with the Florida FRAME JAMB
15/16” NOA-No. 21-0728.01 Building Code
43 15/ D.L. OPG. 20/ NOA-No. 22-0118.05
D.L. OPG. Expiration Date 07/20/2022
49 5/8" 44— Expiration Date 07/20/2027
49 5/8" PANEL WIDTH By lagtcevs |cbas |. Lhand
PANEL WIDTH Miami-Dade Product Control By 2o e liE
Miami-Dade Product Control
e T ﬁ_,_ A A 7S 7 4 TRACK
‘ \ o S . . . Lo FRAME SILL
6" MAX. L 2|z SILL ANCHORS
SILL ~NIE 15" MAX. 6" AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS
CORNERS 0 SILL P, CLUSTER OF 4

e
f
C

(C.A.N. 3538) L
COMP—ANL\20-12D-ES )

FAX. (305) 2626978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

C

-5158 '

FAX. (305) 638

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

J[ ES—EL400-10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM.L)

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

B {06.23.21
C {08.04.21

(revisions:
nol date
A |09.02.20

02-14-20

=)
_l
-
e
& [
«© <
~ |t
2]
&
[+
Q L
12 =l

date:
chk. by:

ST
drawing no.

20—-12D



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
GLASS TYPES
AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME ‘A & ‘Al
PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT
INCHES INCHES EXT.(+) | INT.(-)
30 65.0 65.0 3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS
386 65.0 65.0 .
e 50 | 650 PRODUCT REVISED Sentryios
82 as complying with the Florida By 'K A . Ine.’
48 65.0 65.0 Building Code O){Q uraray America, inc.
54 65.0 65.0 NOA-No. 21'072801 075" lnterloyer
60 65.0 65.0 Expiration Date 07/20/2022 Saflex CP With PET Core
30 65.0 65.0 ] lé—\ By 'Eastman Chemical Co.
By 9 <7 . 1Nnde
36 65.0 65.0 Miami-Dade Product Control 3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS
42 65.0 65.0
84
48 65.0 65.0 )
54 65.0 65.0 &
60 65.0 65.0 PRODUICT REt':ltEI:NED ~|®
as complying wi e Florida z n
30 65.0 65.0 Building Code = 2
36 65.0 65.0 NOA-No. 22-0118.05 N E
42 %0 65.0 65.0 Expiration Date 07/20/2027 m_
48 65.0 65.0 By !9{/\47 [ [4‘7&1\]&.
54 65.0 65.0 Miami-Dade Product Control
60 65.0 65.0 &
30 65.0 65.0 A
386 65.0 65.0 &
42 65.0 65.0
48 96 65.0 65.0
: - GLASS TYPE ‘A’
>4 65.0 65.0 7/16" OVERALL LAM. GLASS
60 65.0 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 GLAZING OPTIONS
36 65.0 65.0 :
42 102 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0
54 57.8 57.8
30 65.0 65.0
36 65. .
108 5.0 65.0
42 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0
30 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 €65.0
114
42 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0
30 65.0 65.0
36 65. .
120 5.0 65.0
42 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0

DOOR FRAME WIDTH
NUMBER OF PANELS

AVERAGE PANEL WIDTH =

DOOR HEIGHT AND WIDTH SIZE MUST COMPLY
EGRESS REQUIREMENTS PER FBC AS REQUIRED.

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCA05-DEC-219

SEE CHART ABOVE FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF
DESIRED GLASS SIZE.

SEE CHART ON SHEET 6 FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART
OR HEAD ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

3/4" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

!

3/16" TEMP. GLASS

3/8" AIR SPACE

3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090" Interlayer

SentryGlas

By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’
OR

.075" Interlayer

Saflex CP With PET Core
By 'Eastman Chemical Co.'

3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘A1’

1" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

3/8” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:
SPACER:

‘HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
BY ‘LINGERMANN GMBH’

AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.
PERIMETER SEALANT:

SILICONE

DOWSIL 791

GE 2000

f
C

COMP—ANL\20-12D—ES )

a

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 2626978

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

C

-5158 ]

FAX. (305) 638

LLC

3550 N.W. 439 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 6385151

E.S. WINDOWS,

J[ ES—EL400-10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM..) |

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

A 109.02.20
B 106.23.21
C |08.04.21

nol date

(revisions:

02-14-20

dr. by: TARIQ

date:
chk. by:

T e TN
drawing no.

20-12D



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

ANCHOR TYPES ‘A" & ‘B’

ANCHOR TYPE ‘C’

1/4” MAX. SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM 1/2” MAX. SHIM 1/4” MAX. SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM
4 ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS | 4 ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS | 4 ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS 4 ANCHORS 4 ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS
AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG.
AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME| STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS STILE ENDS STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS
PANEL WIDTH]  HEIGHT EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+)
INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. () INT. () INT. (=) INT. (=)
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 8 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 62.6 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
54 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 55.6 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
60 65.0 65.0 64.4 65.0 50.1 65.0 65.0 64.7 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 84 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 61.1 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
54 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 54.3 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
60 65.0 65.0 62.9 65.0 48.9 65.0 65.0 63.1 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 % 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 57.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
54 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 50.7 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
60 65.0 65.0 58.7 65.0 45.6 60.8 65.0 58.9 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 o 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 61.1 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 53.5 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
54 65.0 65.0 61.1 65.0 475 63.4 65.0 61.4 65.0
60 62.1 65.0 55.0 65.0 42.8 57.0 65.0 55.2 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 102 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 57.5 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 64.7 65.0 50.3 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
54 64.9 65.0 57.5 65.0 44.7 59.6 65.0 57.8 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 108 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 63.4 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 54.3 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 61.1 65.0 475 63.4 65.0 61.4 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 14 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 60.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 51.5 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
48 65.0 65.0 57.9 65.0 45.0 60.0 65.0 58.1 65.0
30 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
36 120 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 57.0 65.0 65.0 65.0 65.0
42 65.0 65.0 62.9 65.0 48.9 65.0 65.0 63.1 65.0
48 62.1 65.0 55.0 65.0 42.8 57.0 65.0 55.2 65.0

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 22-0118.05
Expiration Date 07/20/2027

By J 9(«47 l. £hand

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0728.01
Expiration Date 07/20/2022

By |9L\<7 |. £ hand

Miami-Dade Product Control

SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF

DESIRED GLASS SIZE.

SEE CHART ABOVE FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART
OR HEAD ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

/_—‘——f\
O Bl
Lt
B ‘
o
()] S
&
-
2 SRS
O 282
RE 2§
. Saglis
EOQEOO
Goa ¢©
o ;
Loy ¥
ok w
[
8358
w e
gug
OSgsmeo
& &
o::.ogﬁ
O3LzE 3
mwwog
zJ
gUoE g
L ¥v_o
|ZOEQ
428 ;
oS ¥
f—
—
= ©
) n
g “’r")
o |
S 8
= ©
2 o
3 2
< R
>
glo,. &
sSldw
Al ¢
e
=0T
2|Bene
ﬁ‘ml
oD. ®
|E= 5°
s ~~
SBZL"g
= o=nh
hg ~—r
L?J(Qu“%?t_j
W
-/
Py
4
el
=in|n
Q
Slele
S
Eoi | w
EHEE
SlaHE
Oiglolo
M| <
>
Lo
I NRIRE
OMNI')Q‘
Olola|a|o
210181818
>
g8<mu
(@)
o
hs c
1 g
8 [
> el
B a0
3 513
T T T T
drawing no.



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


1y )\
DOOR FRAME W. PRODUCT RENEWED NOTE: y @ £
lyi ith the Florid
L | Building Code . oroe 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. © S
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. 2z os I
% o~
O, 2, 2, © = Expiration Date 07/20/2027 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. o. 3%% =
2 77 = o3
W 7 % ) By steg [ Lhank 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF EE g%
g @._-., <= L Miami-Dade Product Control 2 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 243.4 SQ. fFT. PER FBC. < E i ﬁ o
L B = PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN || g & S @[z
o E PRODUCT REVISED CHART ON SHEET 5. , EERE
2 as complying with the Florida g >N 5
a Building Code g E <
NOA-No. 21-0728.01 g £S5, w
on
OX ( : EXTERIOR Expiration Date 07/20/2022 (8] 2 m-:
SHOWN —_— Yo
X0 By ]9L\<7 |. L hande ¢ 8 £ 2 g
Miami-Dade Product Control 0 ; a o) §
| DOOR FRAME W. | OLE
| <hztg
hzog8
. = i wad LZ.) 8 S .
T @ Z Z @ {j\ /’% < bos ¥
Y 7 7 a = e
F
I I -
E Eﬂ @ @ w r:: <>‘> j | g: m
14 e [Te]
o) L = 2
8 — z 3
o S 3
EXTERIOR o =
XX (SHOWN) % 8
[ &4 .
>
DOOR FRAME WIDTH (zD _OJ u z
ol
i
B S EARE:
2 ©® % 7 (D 7 © E:ﬂ ENEF Y
o « o % AEELE
L o : ~~
Fﬂ S pd 0
& - 5 o8
8 LJI-J U) g <<
L D, =H
EXTERIOR ) J
OX—0O (SHOWN)
0—X0O
el
. DOOR FRAME WIDTH Yoy
| Slalo
55|27
' SHHE
= — AC R i 2 i S
: oz S ® = ; °
& <= i => <= 4 E - o
S Eledsig
b Qlloleiaio
= S EIEE
= d|[o <|o]o
EXTERIOR 2e
OX—XX (SHOWN) 2
XX—XO X o
OX—XO * g
XX —XX 8 .
PPROVE FIGURATIONS H 2|l
NON—-POCKETED DOORS PRPASUPA LA
TWO (2) TRACKS drawing  no.
20—-12D



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME HT.

DOOR FRAME HT.

DOOR FRAME HT.

FRAME W NOTE: (@) (@)
. . Wl
[ PRODUCT RENEWED 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. m& c’:
N as complying with the Florida 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. \ J|<
_______ Building Code e |
= ® & NOA-No. 22-0118.05 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. z 328
2 (H
i & % - Expiration Date 07/20/2027 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF o E &8 A
<§: = @___ 7 | Sé tas |. Lhand 2 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 243.4 SQ. FT. PER FBC. = w = o ‘f
g 58 <+ Iz By Sl Lhmnl PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN || € £ 3 Yo
- zi 3 : 52 Miami-Dade Product Control CHART ON SHEET 5. fr So © g g
Q Gz SF OQmg ¢°
3l | ¥ I 8y PRODUCT REVISED 5. POCKETS NOT PART OF THIS APPROVAL. R
= §; | &5 B as_co_m:;".f,’;,,g with tﬁe Florida POCKET AREA IS NOT INCLUSIVE AS FRAME AREA. & Ww 2
EXTERIOR Bulldlng Code o [ 5 ™
L NOA-No.  21-0728.01 gs8ag
oW
zé (SHOWN) Expiration Date 07/20/2022 o9 E 8o
- Q
By ]9L\<7 Ivléﬂnlc, o ;Qs §
DOOR FRAME WIDTH Miami-Dade Product Control 8 0 Ei) % &
rza
guUSL g
B 2285,
e /;/; @ /;/}@ l % :Z woe -
E @ . | 53 =
o9 B ! » AT nig = B
z | t:lf q j \__i h’;)
5L bogF o
X ! Ol [+ I
S ! oo 8 3
a o | S — P ©
L EXTERIOR I &
2 3
PXX (SHOWN) a ~
XXP x
219 =
o bt
_ DOOR FRAME WIDTH N 21 r
[92]
l-. { TN -
ppe==- =|gv9s
e e o] = D o 0
, , , , = = S N
e O 2 G 5 O 2 ® Om L — TIZE=Z 59
% 7 7 7 7 | | SIEEE -
o - 7 A 4 } }-—5 i S ; pd [fe)
=S <= <& = <= 12z L <L L < .O__-,%
Sz i B o ] Hilnld="
0 B hluin =4
g6 p— —
L EXTERIOR
yz
PXX—XX (SHOWN) zElE
il
XX—XXP 2|27
SMEE
DOOR FRAME WIDTH 21| L
2HHE
S REE
Vimlolo
_____ oixiZiZ
{1 = R
. P P . o
e ®1— 2O 4 O 204 46 E |E— -
< ’/// //// //// 7z ! < L ) Ol = 1=
o ’ ’ 4 . =35 cllolSiaie
P <= <= = 122 L <L - OI5/81313
22 | g2 ] SEIRIE
L—J‘L’ X & o g <m0
8u_ I d O
a o S 8
| EXTERIOR i)
N
PXX—XO (SHOWN) 8 5
OX—XXP 8 -
° S
PPR URAT drawing no.
POCKETED DOORS 20-12D
TWO (2) TRACKS Theei B o753



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME WIDTH

NOTE:
1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR I[LLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY.

. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5.

— 2
L e 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19.
2 ©® 5O 2 ® P = 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF
" =z Z 7 i L Sl — B 3 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC.
b= ’ ‘ Oni= q . PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN
& < e | ) CHART ON SHEET 5.
0.4
o
8 L q
- PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
EXTERIOR Building Code
OXX (SHOWN) NOA-No. 22-0118.05
XXO Expiration Date 07/20/2027
By ]9“‘7 f ZA‘MJQ
Miami-Dade Product Control
DOOR FRAME WIDTH , PRODUCT REVISED
1 as complying with the Florida
Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0728.01
£ @ P @__M ., @ P Expiration Date 07/20/2022
7 7 7z —
LﬁJ 7 7 7 @ B = ~L B¥ .19@47 l. Lhande
= {]ﬁ Miami-Dade Product Control
T = < <= i -
&
2 il
- EXTERIOR
XXX (SHOWN) -
DOOR FRAME WIDTH
2| ® 7 O 2 © % ,%@
w 7 7 Tedl 7 1
&
[ &= ] => <G
&
8 L i
EXTERIOR
OX—XX (SHOWN)
XX—XO
OX—XO
XX=—XX

PPROVE F RAT
NON-—POCKETED DOORS
THREE (3) TRACKS

)
0
ku 1
© 8
o~
S
=
Z SR
O 182
= M‘?Z
Nl
i 38l
o
ozf &°
o .
Loy %
ok oy
[
8358
ui o
gy
OFE™
Oaoady
L2 ?
O%LE
Fono g
gzod
Lus ¢
u_‘”tl)..:o
|-Z-OE‘3
4285
g5z &
f-'\f—_—"—\—‘.)
—~
= o
) [s]
g 5
o |
3 8
< ©
2 B
3 )
S R
>
glo. &
Sl—w
=i -
o &
z|Qv< s
om0
‘fm'
ol @
B EETE
glzz+0
g -8
| O E
e
Dl s
N/
Py
£
ARE
2 5|5
Blalw
Sl | &
2% gy
SHEE:
HESESES
m_U()
Viiolo
oI 22
>
5
2ol][5]5
o-ﬁ-’Nl”)ﬁ'
QOlploin|o
NI iwi
gg<mo
o
N
b <)
i) ¢
3] =
> £
¥ EN
3 513
drawing no.

(sheet 9 of 23)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


THREE (3) TRACKS

T
NOTE: q_u 1
PRODUCT RENEWED 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. || (§ o
as complying with the Florida -
Building Code 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. —
| —| . [+4]
NOA-No. 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. g ZEIS
—r =
Expiration Date 07/20/2027 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF Bz ° ME
By I5he |- Lk 3 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC. < =&|4
< o~
e T I T PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN || ¢ & S g2
CHART ON SHEET 5. ca8%88
PRODUCT REVISED gy 3
DOOR FRAME WIDTH _ as complying with the Florida o o §
f ] Building Code gokE uw
i NOA-No. 21-0728.01 Ob5ap
-
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 g 088 .
. 14 ]
E @ ;/ %/@ /;} @ {}/; ////@ ///; H By l;Lu:? [ Ké’lm]c. o o Qg $
W 7 7 7 7 7 7 Miami-Dade Product Control OILE 3
2 Gain Gan €226 §
i < « ) = = < )
« bzo58
S =802 5
e €505 ¢
™ —
OXX—=XXX (SHOWN) = .
XXX —XXO = )
OXX—XXO [ } - & i
XXX —XXX = = &
’%‘ = 2 g
2 8
U = 9t - = [::i” T 1|13 =
>
q ’g 1 ; glo,. &
5w
- = w
- E LN ) o
ot G T |=z[gv9s
* EXTERIOR ~ < g Qo P
o ||l .r’) @®
TIZE=E 3¢
S22+ %
< -3
g 1
)02
W msHE
R
W
ziGlE
Sk
Sle|o
St
S22
912135
dltloio
olx|Z2iZ
>
O
RSN
I ERE
2oz 8|8
&llo
LL_"/ c <L|[M]{O
&
+ o
) g
o =
(=3 ..
» HE
2 ]
i)
P o U NS drawing no.
NON—POQCKETED DOORS 20-12D

sheet §.10f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


'SR
NOTE: Qe
) DOOR FRAME WIDTH - L
| 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. m“- &
N
TorTTTTTT === _— — 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. \ )\
1 :% @ﬁ: ’q% 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. .4 S §
=N /;@" 7\ 7 e S = 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF Or 882
w1 7 7 2 12z L S -L 4z 3 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC. a8
2 1 es (K G Lo PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN |/ &€ £ 3 Nja
£ | g% = < « | ke CHART ON SHEET 5. Eoosgd
I
§ P 5e 186 5. POCKETS NOT PART OF THIS APPROVAL. 8 Eﬁ vy
8 | 8- : q b;C., POCKET AREA IS NOT INCLUSIVE AS FRAME AREA. o aE g
! s L 0b % o
————— ~
A ———— EXTERIOR 03 u
PXXX (SHOWN) o 8%} E: g
XXXP Gaongd
[a)
O2hLE 5
E229
J < H oW ﬁ
T EEE & — 1= L2258
PRODUCT REVISED % =] ol GO
as complying with the Florida 1o < :—J_QE‘“J; \ﬁ E < E 8 =¥
Building Code : 5o L e —— B — L 1 -
NOA-No. 21-0728.01 122 <r T “i ] - = =T T )
=2 ﬁ_ ~
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 : %E ﬁ = B
- - - =" e —1
By |9L\<7 l. Lhank : 86 < ; KT’
Miami-Dade Product Control | A 8 2
IL ,,,,, o /“i
DOOR FRAME WIDTH EXTERIOR % §
o =
— [P >
: 2 (_j) -
| PRODUCT RENEWED =8 =an
T L ®- P el Q % J 2 O 2® /;; (&) as complying with the Florida >l i
g 18 z 7 7 7 Z 7 NOANG. ¢ 22.0118.05 =209 5
< < <= &= &= = . : ) -
[~ fo7) 0
£ 22 ) Expiration Date 07/20/2027 SI8¥ R4
o < .
8 : E’g By ISLW?[-K%an <!D %gii
e | §L6 Miami-Dade Product Control 1= < . :9:
] Sl03 3
. niuBs e
PXXX—=XXO (SHOWN) | :i W
OXX—XXXP _@E S
—
Pe g Gk
l’ao = % %
192 Slale
|52 §15|7 |7
|(:§E5 =IE8|6
& I ESE
K] Cle | XX
| AN
I olglolo
I oiE|ZiZ
b >
DOOR FRAME WIDTH . EXTERIOR ) 2
| 4 BNEE
—r==-- i EEE
: LI«
: K T . - ’, J 7, . . N~
w1 7 7 7 7 Z Z N
z < = &= &= =D = <& 4 o
P | 50 - &
L. : zz [ & s
@ wn o e
o 1 BE s || &
8 150 A
; o «Q
! oo - N N
I APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS drawing ~ no.
PXXX—XXX (SHOWN) POCKETED DOORS 20—-12D
XXX —XXXP =
PXXX—XXXP THREE (3) TRACKS (sheet 10 of 23)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

RN

NSNS

\\Q\\

RN
©

1)
]
1)

OXXX (SHOWN)
XXXO

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

RN

SN

SR

RN
©

)
¢
1l

XXXX (SHOWN)

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

EXTERIOR

e

%

EXTERIOR

NOTE:

1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY.
2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5.

3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 18.

4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF
4 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC.
PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN
CHART ON SHEET 5.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date 07/20/2027

By IQL\<7 [ ZéﬁnJA
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0728.01
Expiration Date 07/20/2022

By ‘SL@‘? |. Lhand

Miami-Dade Product Control

DOOR FRAME HT.

SO
SR
SRR

\§§§§\

4

\§§§,§\

XXX—XXO  (SHOWN)
OXX—XXX
OXX—XXO
XXX — XXX

=
=
L]

N,

_

<

{ ]

EXTERIOR

APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS
NON-—POCKETED DOORS

FOUR (4) TRACKS

o
0
&U 1
© S
o~
S
4 a,‘EN
) 2 2ls
g 59|z
EE .8
€= 3984
o S g@is
mQQUcO
omg ¢|°
~ .
Loy %
ok u
=3
6318
v
829
cn:n: &
Coodw
JE2 Y
Oz i
Er229 «
guU>it g
u_‘”w_:o
T Z0E 0
2885
Loz ¥
A —
—~
= ©
1 '3
~ o
& b
2 3
2 2
5 0
o .
zZ — L
a(—uw
=
~ =
slnnd =
S + ©
(O™ ®?
ﬁ‘m‘
o TR
N EERER
=l B
(=
= o=h
Plna z 7
nlluv s o
vl M Z
./
=
|
ieljs
2lnin
[e]
Sluln
655"
P  w|w
EHHE
Slelxix
U)‘UO
dlalolo
Mo &| &
>
)
NEENE
O-G-JNN')*?
LOlole|n|o
2|°18|88
\ggr(mo
(@]
0
bt o
0, &
8 =
8 2\
3 5%
R S
drawing no.
-

sheet 11 0f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


( (o)
wV ¢
PRODUCT RENEWED NOTE: [\ g
gflifgi':g'&“dgew"h the Florida 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. -
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. >z 3 g
o
Expiration Date 07/20/2027 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. Or 8 ¢|z
DOOR FRAME WIDTH - (ElaaeE TAom: 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF : s =8/
: By _coi/ 4 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC. gL Iaz
Miami-Dade Product Control PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN o agtgl8
CHART ON SHEET 5. g %‘“ g
5}
: ) , , , , oF
= Oy AEEE . nEe e
wu Z z 7 Z Z Z P2 2 ~
W = = = / ol 7 N ggar
g © ® ® 2 ® ® PRODUCT REVISED 0229 o
& => <= <= <& ! = => = as complying with the Florida EE S
o Building Code Qaog &
x g
g NOA-No.  21-0728.01 8 ILE 3
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 S ETE
.o
By ISL\=7 |. £ hand g g 8 E 9
é);(;(())((:))(())(())i()z (SHOWN) Miami-Dade Product Control < 5 8 S é
OXXX—XXXO g
XXX X —X XXX )
= o
3 w
~ o
S &
R e
—n u k7 3
=2 < 2
= o %
- - S EHEF
=t ~ e P B g‘}\ 4 L % a é
E E :ﬁt___ TN~
4 B [ = g N« 0
- Z|3om o
(ﬁ (o]
M x -] TIZ= 59
Gi ] { I S EEa
<+ —
L_J ﬂ JllElwB 32 °
EXTERIOR Dl s E
il
2|55
EIEES
Slolw
SlE|F |
Lo QL | L
2e«|Z|E
e
vlmliolo
MolxiZ |2
>
L0
AR
oI5| 8133
INEIRE
\% g <|m|o
8
+ o
& =
o .
3y I
1 N
3 55
APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS “drawing  no.
NON—POCKETED DOORS 20—-12D
FOUR (4) TRACKS S o



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME HT.

¥ m
Y ¥ |1
m o
o™
DOOR FRAME WIDTH , n
~~~~~ —r ]
| i == z 3|8
__._I,:====== i ©.- v 3o
; i B - FE .§c
: b 7 % % //}@ : =7 I - Tr L <E i% %
i% ®r 10, 72 ® 7® % :’E ggg&lgg
s * - - « & gy X
| 22 =g FoE u
| 2 : £z R A
PXE ) 02,5
o i EI 2R i
| Ol X I ) 2 [
| &0 1oL ORE™ 3
Lot e m l&c Oaodd
| ﬁ Q 3
PXXXX (SHOWN) b g 3 EE 3
XXXXP cz9 o
hEE
5588 ¢
PRODUCT REVIS NOTE: $11 8-
as complying w“,,'t,,f,?,o,ida 1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. — J
Building Code 2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. =
NOA-No.  21-0728.01 = .
c 5772020 3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. = 2
irati D < —
xpiration Date 0 //20/2022 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF o o
By ISteq | Lhan 4 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC. S 8
Miami-Dade Product Control PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN = ©
CHART ON SHEET 5. 9 3
5. POCKETS NOT PART OF THIS APPROVAL. 3 L
POCKET AREA IS NOT INCLUSIVE AS FRAME AREA. .
¢lg, &
213
A
— - _|z|g09a
E = [, VTS
! L |OZmm Y
| L = o2 "8
| N Eg
| - N - N e add il g= =T —_u 8 ; < 8
| ’ = o=l
: & L n 2
& B |la w8 s e
: SO —
2= al M)
1+ -
57 .
12s 3
I Yiww
| I =S | z Hlo
EXTERIOR gz 2lg
PRODUCT RENEWED S | w
| DOOR FRAME WIDTH =t as complying with the Florida Q2|2
i ] Building Code o1%|3|3
=== NOA-No. 22-0118.05 8zlole
|
do Expiration Date 07/20/2027 >
IOy 4 / ;O 2 / / 5 ® o VB I
w | E 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 7 y A s AREEE
2 : & . @“ — 7 @"_’ g @ g 4 @ {@ {®_“ g Miami-Dade Product Control ,5 % SRS
£ 183 <« < < « = <> < 2[og|8|2
14 pZ2 0 cim|o
8 | E% \=AE
a ; 5[»— 9
| Ou ;
| £0 + o
ToLoa. & =
PXXXX—XXXO (SHOWN) ° S
OXXX—=XXXXP £ e
© R+l Q
APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS no.
POCKETED DOORS
OORS 20-12D
FOUR (4) TRACKS PRI



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


—
Q|2
NOTE: m‘. 1
1. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY. \_________/5?
2. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES SEE SHEET 5. 4 3 5
3. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 14 THRU 19. O g§ 2
<
PRODUCT REVISED 4. FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. OVERALL FRAME AREA OF E £ =&,
as complying with the Florida 4 TRACK FRAMES NOT TO EXCEED 360.2 SQ. FT. PER FBC. g 38|z
:g-‘{:h;g Code | 0728.01 PANELS WIDTH AND HEIGHT NOT TO EXCEED SIZES SHOWN IN 6 %8“ glg
—Ne- - : CHART ON SHEET 5. 8
m >
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 5. POCKETS NOT PART OF THIS APPROVAL. [ aE E
=D
By Steg | Lhunk POCKET AREA IS NOT INCLUSIVE AS FRAME AREA. 8 5ap
Miami-Dade Product Control (® 8 g § <]
rx &
Qa0 g b
Hi
Ec29 a8
PRODUCT RENEWED qEREa
as complying with the Florida ul' £ o E 2
Building Code LS80 5
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 <ZJs ¢
Expiration Date 07/20/2027 e
By !QL@? [ léﬂmk g ©
Miami-Dade Product Control = L4
[Ty
o {
o [+o]
S 2
N m
< 8
(&) .
elo,_ &
= .
oflmp
78
S ERE:
e |58351
“lZz 59
[T = | — ; 4
r e =l
: % :: j i - %
i ﬂgy—— | o LC(D) = v
| UI) [ Ts <
| Jik <L L <L L §re SR d= Fl—ﬂ gpe I EEE
Nerrerad
§ ™
] . _ — P
| o
(- 4 : % »
12 ; ElblE
pd Loy
52 = - Ul | 1355
I = olulw
'8 ClalE|E
b = 2§32
EXTERIOR 5|5
SEEE
>
) DOOR FRAME WIDTH w e
i | A NEIEE
eee SIS
! ESEHE
. Vi9«cim|o
T . ® 7 % % Z © % % % @ I =4S
& 53 = <« <« e | > < <> - : o
x z=z g S
S LE - s 1B
a X 2 2l s
e 3 5 )3
LRI
T APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS drawing  no.
§§§§x§§§§?§ (SHOWN) POCKETED DOORS 20—-12D
PXXXX—XXXXP FOUR (4) TRACKS sheet 13 0f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


($3-021-0Z\INv=dN00 ) 8516-859 (S0C) "Xv4 1S1G-829 (S08) "3l 2
U W%M.MWN“N.”M@O&MV xvd mhﬁmmonnﬂﬂdwmw“_ﬂ N.V ﬁmm .o_.l‘_ .:2<~§ {Q3aav SNOILJO d3sid 1S LZv0'80| O ,m
.h 022 31INS “AAIMA 13SNNS 09E6 Eumwm 6v MN omm £ Q3ISIATY ¥ISH TS le£eso] 8 g ¥
INIWCHOTIAIA LONAOYd B SHIINIONI 011 'SMOANIM 'S'3 L33HS SiHL 3NVHO ON ozzotol v || «b = 8/F wwes|s ol

£ | NOILYHOJdH0D DooHVYA-TY ( (rw1) ¥ooa ssvio onians Wy 01-00¥13-53 | woncuiosop 19 “mm%msmw t—r-20 wwp) s N 2

21-0728.01
Expiration Date 07/20/2022

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

PRODUCT REVISED
NOA-No.

F

19L\<7 |. £ handa
Miami-Dade Product Control

By

@ SIHOIFH TS
= S/ ¢
B W

1HOI3H T3Nvd

WNIHS XYW ,Z/1

W_W = ‘040 1°d n
M, v N Te]
=N ONEIDIE) @ g
o =z
oM <
: -
<C
Q
[2
&
ol
N
)
592
T L .
MEM ..Qlu . g L e =
guo a RE: 8
@ O s
g L TEREEE W= s
S & QI W77 T = o e e e o ] o e e JLT.WH_.WQPMn S5 Q
o Lt ! \7 4%@ ud
W o TN S e e ] e Al O™
HOIdHLXH @
9 {33IHS
1YYHO 33S
(ONpv3g avol) .m % ﬂ 5 1HOI3H JAVY4 €004 XYW .2/
WIHS "XVYN .2/ a 5 ol o =
Wi < s o
29 O o =
£ Ol N - <
g JIx| 48 b o
= < |3
N z3
> “9“ M e a MGW &W.MW
X [ Q e [a)
a8 033 £ (|8 i T 3hE
X - D2m¢é L U a ﬁ &WW%SN
Ea - QEcz £ 1 S EEoteR
o8, 085 & |[E €) 8bs 05,
Bm q ht Rs.mo m. >3 WHN___Tgmun &
- . - s s o
e s LodZ 4O o= 2223 %
v m
v, .A,..v A
T : 3
: i 2
AP AERE ) |©/® = 5
© 4 i
NE m
R / i
. . o T i —— e R — I
NSO -] .. K i i i
RWN o 1 R N e B R Ll
oHE = - = & -
N&S - N | - .
. . . . v
ASR n v m 9 _mM
= Q el s = mm )
O i e e N e 4 R T }ﬂllﬂ.n.«.lxw.. SR ET
= o . T it Ld: xv_ Lt
s 8 Y N AR s e TR
...44 J e I N R lLlh}lilt\\ 4.%3
s 'e] —
A\ s HOIYHILXHA @ @ "=
@ 940 T Q
9 133HS 1HOI3H 13NvVd
1dVYHO 33S
(ONi¥v3IE avoT) JHOIAH INVed4 »00d XYW L2/ L

SEE ELEV.

SEE ELEV.

FOR SPACING

FOR SPACING



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


"oV
Lt
L '
METAL 2
\M STR%’CTURES m '?
EDGE_DIST. ' g £0GE DIST 1 13/16" 1/8" THK. ~olo
TMIN. 82 f ] Z S 512
I | Or 5§37
Ll 4
TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING i =4 . 8F
: i € S9a)g
r —  —  —  — . — AT HEAD —_— e — — — ! DN — ¢§o§§g
| [CRiRe:
TYPE ‘A'— 1/4”" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWAIT’ (Fu=164 KS|, Fy=148 KSi) _ u %G L 5 E%g ;
INTO WOOD STRUCTURES : | & vElko = 52 ko gor &
2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD X85 <3 Eg 8'g5’>‘,3
[ o I
THRU 1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS INTO CONCRETE 1 Zolud 2o |wi o,gg§ o
1-3/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE, 1—1/2" MIN. EDGE DIST. NEh 03O $13E:
> S 0%
() n . N o E"' <
l TYPE B~ 4 ULT N Y DEW, (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI) f o npEd
(e}
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS [ e e E G52 g
» » : SEE ELEV. . MIAMI=DADE COUNTY APPR’D MULLION I [ ]
TYPE 'C'— 1/4" DIA. TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS) ' {i {; €588 E
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS | B S e
INTO METAL STRUCTURES | , = @
(3) THREADS MIN. PENETRATION BEYOND SUBSTRATE ‘ & = -
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.) | PRODUCT RENEWED S @
STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.) PRODUCT REVISED as complying with the Florida = ©
ing Code o~
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TC BE PLATED OR PAINTED) gs (I:gmplying with the Florida NOA_No. 22.0118.05 % ,,8)
mmm—«—w—-«—uw—w———*J uilding Code °
AT SIL - NOA-No.  21:0728.01 Expiration Date07/20/2027 © ¥
s , Gl TYPICAL ANCHORS 210, &
TYPE 'B'— 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT’ (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI) Expiration Date 07/20/2022 By Tedimiie SEE ELEV. ) j L
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE B 1%47 B Miami-Dade Product Control FOR SPACING a a‘é
. y 4 Nels .’_‘__
1—3/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE Miami-Dade Product Control =2 g5
S At 2320
—_— —  — AT JAMBS — — —  — — ol|@ " Mg
L] ’ L] 1] T z ; -J ©
TYPE ‘A~ ON+ BY 'DEWALT’ (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI) gz o
INTO WOOD STRUCTURES ) > 53t
2” MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD S ujb‘% <
¥ M ZE
THRU 1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS INTO CONC. OR FILLED BLOCK | o
1=3/4” MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE
1-3/4” MIN. EMBED INTO GROUT FILLED BLOCKS |
w
TYPE 'B'— 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT' (Fu=164 KS|, Fy=148 KSI) Al
= n
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR GROUT FILLED BLOCKS | Slulo
2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE - S|z F |
2” MIN. EMBED INTO GROUT FILLED BLOCKS | S22
ole iz |x
TYPE 'C'—~ 1/4" DIA, TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS) \ a1l
olelZz|Zz
g\go MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS 1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURE NOT BY E.S. WDW. 2
INTO METAL STRUCTURES | MUST SUSTAIN LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM SRR
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063~T5 MIN.) | SEeeis
STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.) Selt]?le
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) o
U 5 .
ANCHOR EDGE_DISTANCES & z
INTO CONCRETE AND MASONRY = 2-1/2" MIN. (UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE) IR
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1”7 MIN. 5 s || #
INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4" MIN. “drawing  no. .
WOOD AT HEAD OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN. 20—12D
CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN. AUG 16 2000
C-90 GROUT FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PS! MIN. sheet 15 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS

©®

FIX. PANEL
INTERIOR TRACK

PANEL WIDTH

©)

MOV. PANEL
EXTERIOR TRACK

METAL
STRUCTURE

SEE ELEV.— -
-\ TYPICAL ANCHORS
FOR SPACING_' SEE ELEV.
y / FOR SPACING
7_‘ \\ y ——“T
t3 R -(D
2. 3 NP
BE 3 - =
N e 7 1
" .
v —
' 0
1%} ]
el ] s
S | I LM} e
g 2 : : i E
2 o @ N 1
3 E:> <)> PRODUCT RENEWED @
as complying with the Florida EXTERIOR @ G:J
Building Code
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 PANEL WIDTH
18Y OR 28BY
WoOD BUCKS Expiration Date 07/20/2027 3/8" MAX
1/2" MAX. TR MAX. DOOR FRAME WIDTH ‘
< 3 N
LOAD BEARING By _io&/ LORD, BEARING
SHIMS Miami-Dade Product Control
PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0728.01
TYPICAL ANCHORS
@ Expiration Date 07/20/2022 @ SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING
— MOV. PANEL By |Steg | Lhank EXT?I%IOEN:'%\CK
N INTERIOR TRACK Miami-Dade Product Control
TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING L
— ,%Qm @F+ =5
N >
- = [ ~ -
- S = f——}:ﬁ{b S »
B 1 : w
: a w 14
5 Lo =Sy a =
3 Wy o b 3
L B % h L] A x
2 ccz) SR w =0
w z @ -1 EXT. EXT. @
OX<g
OO
MAX. DOOR FRAME WIDTH 1/2" MAX.
LOAD BEARING
) SHIMS
1/2" MAX. MAX. DOOR FRAME WIDTH
LOAD BEARING
SHIMS

V)
n
hu 1
© 8
N
&
Z =gls
O 23|2
[ Qiz
[ 4 MNZ
=W o) T
<2 E.NO_
A PREIE
o
oZ&~8&|c
>0
Loy %
o
[
Qon®
Q244
gug
OLzmo
o x &
©Qaoaog
£
Hi
mngﬂ
guUSE @
T
T 205 Q
- GO
0= I
gios &
._..___.___—-—_—)\J
Y Y S —
~
= w
d w
pa— -
n
g ]
Q ©
0 ™)
171 o
35 5
o .
o 2
z|9- &
D__IL*J
=5 Lt
al &
slvunq
5= s
<|o2nY
o |a ®
TIHIEE 5 °©
832“‘8
S .o
LummE
| i <
Bl = ¢
L —
P
[l ingin]
fad |l |
T X
wniuv|w
vluly
SIEIFIE
] BT RN A}
a2 8
LI
UIII
mU(.JU
Violioio
o221
>
O
AMNRE
SIBielN|3
2018|818
o0 <m0
SelT
o || -
g
. e
@
i 5 8
B8 °
<] O A T
el w o Q
T T )
drawing no.

sheet 16 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


)

LOCK STILE

EXTERIOR TRACK

CH

PRODUCT

as complying

Building Code

NOA-No.

(V)

LOCK STILE

INTERIOR TRA

PRODUCT REVISED
RENEWED as complying with the Florida

with the Florida

Expiration Da

By \9%7 [.

Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0728.01
22-0118.05 Expiration Date 07/20/2022
te07/20/2027 By |9 P
L hande Miami-Dade Product Control

Miami-Dade Product Control

HOOK STRIP ANCHORS
SEE ELEVS.
FOR SPACING

1 ®

2" MIN, 7
EDGE DIST @ @

i

HOOK STRIP ANCHORS: StE ELEV. FOR SPACING

/]

/

e /

/

o0

@)

POCKET

POCKETED JAMB OPTION

POCKET CAVITY NOT BY E.S. WINDOWS
—NOT PART OF THIS NOA

TO BE REVIEWED BY AHJ

1/4" DIA, ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSi)

DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR GROUT FILLED BLOCKS
1-3/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE
1-3/4" MIN. EMBED INTO GROUT FILLED BLOCKS

#14 SMS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1—1/2” MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

#14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO METAL STRUCTURES

(3) THREADS MIN. PENETRATION BEYOND SUBSTRATE
ALUMINUM: 5/32” THK. MIN. (6063-T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

TYPICAL EDGE DISTANCE

INTO CONCRETE AND MASONRY = 2" MIN.
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1" MIN.

INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4" MIN.

N
%
ku T
© S
o~N
S
4 © RIS
0. 332
o ]
= 2 MNZ
B=u 3T
<E Z.Nn_
€&.S2(3
oz& ¢&°
N .
Loy %
EoE
5
ObEao
024N
oWy
(o -1 -]
xae <
O&Qgﬁ
O%Lz 4
mmmow
L3 5
o
u_%‘h_'o
r <08 2
2 58%
g€ Gos &
AN
S N Y
—~
= ©
— ['e]
g Al
['e]
z ]
Q 3
w i)
173 o
5 2
o .
o =
z9- &
D_JLLJ
= L
») &
sluonds
Sl Y2
Z|om Y
ol Ma
=z < .0
&€= 3
QIE=Zz+0
= -3
Luuj%Ev
! N <
Blums e
! e
|4
253
Z2jninm
8le|e
SglF|”
;mmu
SHHE
SlEIE]E
oidlole
olxiZ2| 2
>
1O
ANKINE
O-QJC\I")Q'
QOlojelnic
2|°|8 818
gg««:u )
o
o™
: o
i g
N =
> O
s N
3 5|3
drawing no.

sheet 17 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


—
METAL U @
1BY OR 2BY STRUCTURES L ,
WOOD BUCK w 1/8" THK. 2
(SEE NOTE SHEET 1) Wz 5 (SEE SHEET 15) m -
n 5= Q . 3 5/8" -~ [}
EDGE pisT. ([, . 3 5/8 ) & 2 W Z I %[,)SGTE MI< r4 2 R
. ¢ - ""‘.’4"‘ ,,v-»‘,c :'.:4,:._‘{41 Ol") o L va‘ 7 ;m _8 g
i SN T V7% 1Y N ] MIN. ! § 'gil \ ;~L',T’_/—:~,‘H”TT ] | < E 3 ~ %'
,><“ ﬁ § g - (& LI = Ko, 8|8
L = nOo =R PSS
J———— i ——— e |- T2 Oy ¢°
a2 ) —— : = n = n_ > ¢
= o . e ; = A ] Zin Bw %
7 73 L = U%ﬁ'l =5 % % Li} o I-5- W
=~ =20 = © =
= ; T2 £ i 2| > } U nZ =507 Qgap
é U)EL—J 1>;<J ng %co % %E ‘@a‘:ﬁ ogujﬂ
i x0T HlE TYPICAL ANCHORS PR 0928 o
<m|E 0Py = |n T
L2105 2Ty o SEE ELEVS. IA-LE
. 2w Rg%m i\'gﬁ FOR SPACING O“a"ei
Ll 2]
TYPICAL ANCHORS S8 TYPICAL ANCHORS S IEICEL JAICHORS > S S - Foas g
FOR SPACING ) FOR SPACING FOR SPACING (Vi -DAGE  GOUNTY APPR'D MULLION | LR
|| SEE SEPARATE NOA 1 w2 $8
Il (SEE \SHEET 15) i 438% 5
) | <ZQsE
PRODUCT RENEWED R 1 __
as complying with the Florida === m=Sm——ag j—— == (.
Building Code So =
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 K E 9
L ~ -
PRODUCT REVISED Expiration Date 07/20/2027 o i
as complying with the Florida el %
Building Code e A 2 S
NOA-No. 21-0728.01 Miami-Dade Product Control n 5
[%p] o
e 2
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 AL ANCHORS ~PICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS g ¥
By Siwg |- Lhmn A SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. glo,. ¢
Miami-Dade Product Control FOR SPACING FOR SPACING FOR SPACING FOR SPACING 5 - L
w o
T oo -
@ 1/27 MAX. _> 3/8" MAX. 3 Qoss
. ] LOAD BEARING LOAD BEARING T|O0%0?
. 1/2" MAX. — SHIMS ==~ SHIMS ol Mgy
LOAD BEARING TIE=Z 5 ©
- - =) ¥ - 3
WOOD STRUCTURE L=
] il =
N | N N ——
-
I .
T—'\L/\L‘ ‘_J“j o +-F lh"“ } _]fﬂ 8
ng R
- = ) <
2 = T [+ xI
o Lz < z 13 = 2 E g
LNk . N ES M ] ) 2|28
N &= ~ Y o~ e o~ 9: &S
/ ) = n = o - :: - s ’? é% g g
. = = S ] =i o|5|E e
1= v =13 by n J
S o = o = Olgl|=|=2
. < . oIZ 6|n
L R an Lt B _se.5) Lad
TYPICAL ANCHORS % | bl I e . 2l 2 2
SEE ELEVS. o = ExT 8a ExT. 8 3
FOR SPACING EXT. : ANERE
1/2" MAX. - OI5I8|RIS
p— e wirolo | 8| ©
LOAD BEARING E DL
m
SHIMS 1BY OR 2BY Sel=<?1° | J
WOOD BUCK

1/2" MAX.

. CONCRETE

3 KSI MIN.

(SEE NOTE SHEET 1)

3 TRACK FRAMES

ANCHOR LOCATIONS

02-14-20

Q
%
=
ES
O
._‘
A

date:
chk. by:

St e e
drawing no.

20—-12D
_sheet 18 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


N N METAL 3§ m
18Y OR 2BY B 25 le STRUCTURES Y L
WOOD BUCK 2 2 HE 1/8" THK. o
L
(SEE NOTE SHEET 1) s 9 L L (SEE SHEET 15) o
L s T e = % 105 H 3 5/8 —t
o kpee bist. ce 4L ©35/87 L sl U LZX : 2w EDGE DIST. < 4 = R
i e e £} coms it S vV SR o AL < EDGE DIST. __/ 8 NS | \ MIN. d 0. B2<
R N MINe O MIN. e =AY b EZ =3z
- T m Y w :©
T | . ; N~ R &4
- | i — ] Es.c8)3
R - | o= Q@
= — i ? ; |8l
i W Bl L - I
wow
. =5 Leo) Lo < gok &
- F Qo ; > ﬁ' L -
£ T % : & TYPICAL ANCHORS 105 8 6ag
= o | TYPICAL ANCHORS SEE ELEVS. s 2w Rud
L a
) 25 SEE ELEVS. FOR SPACING L85 |l g¢ez® o
< 2y FOR SPACING Y ofd<s
@ TYPICAL ANCHORS N wz Ao OILZ?
SEE ELEVS. - 53 R W l TYER:
FOR SPACING N | DRy S T 1P L '\ MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPR'D MULLION X gz o
cloooEpeE ST LT A ¢ 3 /8 L gt LEX 1| SEE SEPARATE NOA ! L
P T e e T 8e | (SEE SHEET 15) | kzos o
& - 2 g . L 4 aa — e le ~ A | ! ~
H u I i -l 90
= - | . =l ias ¥
PRODUCT REVISED = =~ ) =
as complying with the Florida FQ o : oy
Building Code S e BE | £ = @
NOA-No. 21-0728.01 % 0 = 0
TYPICAL ANCHORS Lo o
Expiration Date 07/20/2022 SEE ELEVS. ol S 2
B oy o "
By  |EEk — FOR SPACING S Q P
Miami-Dade Product Control % g
M
(&
TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS <
SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. elo,. &
PRODUCT RENEWED FOR SPACING FOR SPACING FOR SPACING FOR SPACING 57w
—
as complying with the Florida " . » " o . x
Building Code et L /2T M /2T Max. 3/8" MAX. sllvh Qs
NOA-No. 22-0118.05 LOAD_ BEARING LOAD BEARING ~7 ["TL0AD BEARING 312,35
SHIMS SHIMS SHIMS = ISR
Expiration Date 07/20/2027 =\ i PR
gty |- Lhand = | = ) = TE= e
By 2 I Er AN
Miami-Dade Product Control o : B
WOOD STRUGTURE Z2lrsos2
NS
Dl m s E
| et L =t -
1 1= "’_"'\'j o B R 7 A% @ M
= e = o] = 2 ] 8
© . © ] e 2 ] Ll |8
NS Nz |2 N2 bo|<
o3 9|3 o el R AR
[SRRGRR=
o~ o~ o~ o~ ciTiolE
9 o
| ' - L Sl
. : . : : ==
& 5 5 5 e
TYPICAL ANCHORS o e D e s e 2
SEE ELEVS. " u "
FOR SPACING a o ) g IS
L e [ < ] Lad L clho Y d
S 3 Lo ¢ e | U S SEIEE
< | L= P
EXT. EXT. EXT. EXT. 3l
, ”» t) & < MO
P . 1/2" MAX. 1BY OR 2BY -
LOAD BEARING WOOD BUCK o A A ey o+
SHIMS (SEE NOTE SHEET 1) Tl s
- 2 =
R A
. . LAy . ,.ql, N Lo . o > E\
% Sete e e e 1 T CONCRETE PREREN
g EDGE 5 7/16" MIN 2l 3 KSI MIN. SIS )s]%
Q DIST. drawing no.
4 TRACK FRAMES 20-12D

ANCHOR LOCATIONS

B 16 20

sheet 19 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


ITEM # PART # REQD. DESCRIPTION MATERIAL MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS
E1 ES—EL400-001 1 FRAME HEAD (2 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E1A ES-EL400-201 AS REQD. | FRAME HEAD (3 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E1B ES~EL400-205 AS REQD. | FRAME HEAD (4 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E2 ES-—-EL400~002 1 FRAME SILL (2 TRACK) 606376 -
E2A ES—EL400--202 AS REQD. | FRAME SILL (3 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E2B ES-EL400-206 AS REQD. | FRAME SILL (4 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
£3 ES—EL400--003 2 FRAME JAMB (2 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E3A ES—EL400-203 AS REQD. | FRAME JAMB (3 TRACK) 6063-T6 -
E3B ES—-EL400-207 AS REQD. | FRAME JAMB (4 TRACK) 6063~T6 -
E4 ES~EL400-004 1/ PANEL | TOP RAIL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
ES ES—EL400~005 1/ PANEL | BOTTOM RAIL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E8 ES-EL400-006 AS REQD. | JAMB STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063~T6 -
E8 ES-EL400-009 1/ PANEL | TOP RAIL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E9 ES—-EL400-010 1/ PANEL | BOTTOM RAIL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E10 ES—-EL400-011 AS REQD. | JAMB STILE (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E11 ES-EL400-030 AS REQD. | INTERLOCK STILE (LAM. GLASS) 606376 -
E11A ES—EL400-031 AS REQD. | INTERLOCK STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E12 ES—-EL400-028 AS REQD. | ASTRAGAL STILE (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E12A ES—EL400~029 AS REQD. | ASTRAGAL STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E13 ES-EL400-014 AS REQD. | JAMB COVER 6063~T5 -
E14 ES—EL400-015 AS REQD. | POCKET JAMB 606316 -
E1S ES—EL400-016 AS REQD. | SiLL TRACK 6063-T6 -
E16 ES-EL400-017 AS REQD. | HEAD COVER 6063-T5 -
E17A £S--2020-007 AS REQD. | SILL RISER 6063-T6 -
E17B ES—2020-041 AS REQD. | ALT. SILL RISER 6063-T6 -
E18 ES-EL400-020 AS REQD. | FIXED PANEL BOTTOM GUIDE 6063-T6 -
E26 ES~6011 AS REQD. | SCREW COVER 6063-T6 -
M1 ES—EL400-GO1 4/ PANEL | GLAZING GASKET (LAM. GLASS) SILICONE DUROMETER 70+3 SHORE A
M2 ES—EL400-G02 4/ PANEL | GLAZING GASKET (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) SILICONE DUROMETER 7013 SHORE A
M3 £52020-G04 AS REQD. | INTERLOCK BUMPER pPvC DUROMETER 60+5 SHORE D
M4 W33271NK AS REQD. | PILE W'STRIPPING (INTERLOCK) WOOoL -
M5 W33181NK AS REQD. | PILE W'STRIPPING WOOL -
M6 PS01-0014 AS REQD. | DOOR HANDLE DIE CAST ALUM TWO POINT HANDLE
M7 PS01—-1015 AS REQD. | STRIKE FOR MORTISE LOCK ST. STEEL -
M8 PS01-1036 AS REQD. | MORTISE 2 POINT LOCK ST. STEEL -
M9 GT-R34/3-01-A 2/ PANEL | ROLLER ASSEMBLY ZAMAK -
M10 6844.1 AS REQD. | BUMPER ALUM/NYLON -
M11 ES—EL400~FPI SL AS REQD. | FIX. PANEL CLIP ST. STEEL -
M12 #8 X 3/4° AS REQD. | KEEPER FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M13 #10 X 1-1/4" AS REQD. | PANEL ASSEMBLY FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M14 #10 X 1-1/2" AS REQD. | FRAME ASSEMBLY FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M15 #6 x 3/8" AS REQD. | FIX. PANEL CLIP FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M186 #8 X 1/2" AS REQD. | FIX. PANEL CLIP FASTENERS ST. STEEL F.H. SMS
M18 #10 X 1/27 AS REQD. | ROLLER FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M19 #10 x 17 AS REQD. | LOCK INSTALLATION FASTENERS ST. STEEL F.H. SMS
M20 #8 X 1/27 AS REQD. | HANDLE INSTALLATION FASTENERS ST. STEEL F.H. SMS
SEALANT:

ALL JOINTS AND FRAME CONNECTIONS SEALED WITH

WHITE/ALUMINUM COLORED SILICONE.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No. 22-0118.05
Expiration Date 07/20/2027
By | SL@‘? l. Lhand

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0728.01

Expiration Date 07/20/2022

By |9L\<7 |. £ hand
Miami-Dade Product Control

LOCK:

SURFACE MOUNT METALLIC HANDLE AT 44" FROM BOTTOM
FASTENED TO LOCK STILE WITH
(2) #8 X 1/2" FH SMS

SURFACE MOUNT METALLIC 3 PLY DUAL HOOK LOCK
44" FROM BOTTOM

FASTENED TO LOCK STILE WITH

(2) #10 X 1 FH SMS

SURFACE MOUNT METALLIC KEEPER AT 44" FROM BOTTOM
FASTENED TO FRAME JAMB AND ASTRAGAL STILE WITH
(3) #8 X 3/4" PH SMS

VTTTT7

. L

3 5% JCENSg ™}

MG 16 207

)[ES—EL400-10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOCOR (LM.) J| AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

(revisions:

u 177
\\\\\\)‘%& . E@@/”/

N

f
C

COMP—ANL\20-12D-ES )

a

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

-5158 ](

FAX. (305) 638

LLC

3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS,

|

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

SiLL RISER REVISED
SILL RISER OPTIONS ADDED

by description

A |09.02.20
B |06.23.21
C |08.04.21

nol date

02~14-20

<)
o
<
=
=
a
._‘
©

date:
chk. by:

e T
drawing no.

20-12D

sheet 20 0f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


4.575 5.686 | 7.496
i [ o6z 082 t 070
4T X r T i e ] =1 e . oy i e C:v’_____-__r\
743 L &J b 1.351 (o] ISV (31 IS Lo 1 ?51
¢ ._,i i { l LR t }
@ FRAME HEAD (2 TRACK) E1A FRAME HEAD (3 TRACK) E1B FRAME HEAD (4 TRACK)
062 .070
,oszl 2,000 —l 2.000 B 2.000
b ) L b B T A T T
'6?« w7 B (R I 5_-“
4.782 ] I 5.894 | 7.704 |
@ FRAME SILL (2 TRACK) E2A FRAME SILL (3 TRACK) E2B FRAME SILL (4 TRACK)
= 1380 =
~>‘ 1.380 = G w2
»1 1.380 rk =
[ 072~ 062 === PRODUCT REVISED PRODUCT RENEWED
’ et as complying with the Florida as complying with the Florida
B N Building Code Building Code
F L s NOA-No. 21-0728.01 NOA-No. 22-0118.05
L X
w3715 L Expiration Date 07/20/2022 Expiration Date(m
4.585 . ' 5.686 5.525 7.496 L——rn 7.335 By steg |- Ll By steg | Lhank
oL 072 062~ Miami-Dade Product Control Miami-Dade Product Control
062 L: D
o
IS 23 —ete— 072
ﬂ Jo.5
FRAME JAMB (2 TRACK)| FRAME JAMB (3 TRACK) FRAME JAMB (4 TRACK)
—eff=— 062
1.745 o 1.732 —
L f=—="0" 433
178 ‘?
2.750
E14 POCKET JAMB

f
C

COMP—ANL\20—12D—ES )

a

(C.AN. 3538)

FAX. (305) 2626978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

|

FAX. (305) 638—5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

)('ES—EL400-10 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM.L.) ]

|

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

(revisions:
nol daie
A [09.02.20
B [06.23.21
C |08.04.21

02-14-20

<
z
=
b
)
IS
©

dote:
chk. by:

drawing no.

20-12D

sheet 210f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


1]
1.340 f= l=—1.875 1.875 U u
—= 1.340 = *°; 189 Io¥ vj 189 G '
] 9 = i 1 S
TR FE % S b
1.811 Z =9
(o] et 2.686 ©-—<><:-.052 —ofe— 062 et 062 Q= 5 8 2
2.686 —oibo— 062 a = 12
. 3509 T &L 3509 § &k = =480 ‘EE 28|
= | ES.S 8|3
[ A 1.905 1.340 1.905 1.340 @ GLAZING GAKET o-a~¢&lo
o 4
vl.seelm Ly = | l Ly B LAM. GLASS & E%i’ E
4 4 0bap
@ PANEL TOP RAIL @ PANEL TOP RAIL 125 125 0 %3‘5
(LAM. GLASS) (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 3422 3422 | 1 340 oo 2 2.
eo< 3
o
A>| .866 r» < o2 ¢
ASTRAGAL STILE ASTRAGAL STILE v 08 x 3
?D [f-‘ o E12 (LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) ! -9;2 5 Cz S«
SE @
e o
062 v[ E z gz <
= = = = 1.075 b= < J
2,993 —ofl=— 062 2.993 —{l— 062 —.040 <555 B
2.118 2.118 —= 711 j_,_ -,
Lo o : 28T @ GLAZING GASKET R
v ¥ v v } . —.050 | INSUL. LAM. GLASS =
E d DR T ol =] B
1 1.340 b el 1.340 = .275—? MATERIAL = SILICONE o 7
HARDNESS = 703 S 5
TENSILE STRENGTH = 1139 PS e
PANEL BOTTM RAIL PANEL BOTTM RAIL E16 HEAD COVER ELONGATION AT BREAK = 235% 9 @
@ (LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) E15 TRACK INSERT TEAR STRENGTH = 107 Lb/IN < 3
243 o jo BRITTLENESS TEMPERATURE = —40° F o ¥
2.926 , 2.926 : i 863 T COMPRESSION SET = 12.5% (22h@212°F) PRODUCT RENEWED 210, =
062 062 : b as complying with the Florida a0
: : Building Code - — W
=7 = L T S NOA-No. 22-0118.05 2
? | ] )5 ¢ 441 050 —Ba 1791 =4 V5
1.490 1.340 1.490 1.340 .087 1 PRODUCT REVISED Expiration Date 07/20/2027 Z % > 5o
- as complying with the Florida <+ !
é _,ﬁlJ é ) Building Code By She9 | Lhank o2 Mo
L—z 051 e 2.051 NOA-No. 21-0728.01 Miami-Dade Product Control clp § = L.:i ﬁ
: ' FIX. PANEL BOTTOM GUIDE E13 JAMB COVER Expiration Date 07/20/2022 g i.—g
oS8
B Jgsbas |. Lhanl L‘lJ U? 8 <
PANEL JAMB STILE PANEL JAMB STILE y 2 nilws @
E10 (LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) Miami-Dade Product Control - =
287 -
2.750 ——=1 * 2.750 A’ r {
o0
| 203 l ' 203 .040 711 : g
} 1 t 5ol2
.062 062 —e{lr— 0o
1.3&40 1.886 T-TO 1.886 SEEE
£26 =
=N Y _ » SCREW COVER SHHEE
n|© i,
.240—? .240—Jﬁ olo|D|2
ol<in|wn
1.622 1.622 = N
O
INTERLOCK STILE INTERLOCK STILE AREINES
E11 (LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) Sigsin| s
500 = 2[|g8[8]8
500 - == 8g<]=]o
] b
. g
3.596 l &
’ 3.063 : ° L5
. FRi
D .
1.742 1.742 g 5 E
(T
| drawing no.
062~ 062~ 20-12D
@ SILL RISER @ ALT. SILL RISER sheet 22 of 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


FRAME TOP CORNER

2 TRACK FRAMES (SHOWN)
3 TRACK FRAMES (SIMILAR) WITH (1) ADDL. FASTENER
4 TRACK FRAMES (SIMILAR) WITH (2) ADDL. FASTENERS

FRAME BOTTOM CORNER
2 TRACK FRAMES (SHOWN)
3 TRACK FRAMES (SIMILAR) WITH (1) ADDL. FASTENER
4 TRACK FRAMES (SIMILAR) WITH (2) ADDL. FASTENERS

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 22-0118.05

Expiration Date 07/20/2027
By l ;L\“Z { lé’ch.

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0728.01

Expiration Date 07/20/2022
By |9L\<7 |. £han,

Miami-Dade Product Control

PANEL TOP/BOTTOM CORNER
LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SHOWN)
INSUL. LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SIMILAR)

N A

W

Ty
0
V|
© S
o~
NS
S
~
Z IR
© s a7
E &%z
e 7 alg
22 i
: o
mn. Gz
Ol glo
Oga o°©
N A
Bou X%
FokE u
D
83a8
w v
820
O™ g
Qaoog o
it
zn:zg“‘
guUusoi g
v o
T 205 2
2885
g5z ¥
AN
N TN
—
= ©
ol ['s]
S -
['93
x I
S 8
< ©
%) ™
N o
5 )
o .
=
o <
2|9 &
= g
(%) -g
=005 5
o N
IO m?
ol M
TE=E e
Iz
< -9
il I e
{ 0 I
iy =
| ST N U ——
P
Lib| e
Lut Lot | L
po ol B gl e g
ninmn
vlole
PEEE
;mww
SIZIZix
mUDU
Llololo
Felzl 2 2
>
Te]
I NEE
OMNT")Q
Qlojain|o
wifo|o|o|o
'; o|lo|lo
LQ_‘_’)S«mo
[w]
o
i o
o &
S| F
v >
. £
B8 2 ")
5] o o <
© o - (5]
/——'__‘”—M
drawing no.

sheet 23 0f 23



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


	22011805w
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	ES Windows, LLC
	ES Windows, LLC
	ES Windows, LLC
	ES Windows, LLC
	ES Windows, LLC

	22011805
	21072801DWG
	SS - ES-EL400-10 SGD LMI - DWG 20-12D





