MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786)315-2590 F(786)315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/building
E.S. Windows, LL.C

3550 NW 49 Street

Miami, FL 33142

Scopk:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER-
Product Control Section to be used in Miami-Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami-Dade County) and/ or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami-Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to
perform in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may
immediately revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER
reserves the right to revoke this acceptance if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section
that this product or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “5000" Outswing Aluminum Casement Window — L.M.L

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W08-08, titled “S-5000 Alum Outswing Casement Wdw.
(L.M.1.)”, sheets 1 through 10 of 10, dated 01/23/08, with revision H dated 08/25/20, prepared by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control
Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County Product
Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Colombia, model/series, and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", unless
otherwise noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been
no change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change
in the materials, use, and/ or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement
of any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure
to comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed,
then it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its
distributors and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA No. 20-0915.02 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3 and
E-4, as well as approval document mentioned above.
The submitted documentation was reviewed by Manuel Perez, P.E.

NOA No.22-1227.02
M'AM'UNTY Expiration Date: April 03,2028
Approval Date: January 19,2023

1/10/23 Pagel


http://www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LLC

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s
DRAWINGS

1.

2.

Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.

(Submitted under NOA No. 11-0419.01)

Drawing No. W08-08, titled “S-5100 Alum Outswing Casement Wdw. (L.M.1.)”,
sheets 1 through 10 of 10, dated 01/23/08, with revision H dated 08/25/20, prepared
by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-0915.02)

TESTS

1.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of a mulled series 5000
outswing aluminum casement and a fixed window, prepared by Fenestration Testing
Laboratory, Inc., Test Report No. FTL-12112, dated 06/19/20, signed and sealed by
Idalmis Ortega, P.E.
Test reports on: 1) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

2) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of a series 5000 outswing
aluminum casement window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test
Report No. FTL-9711, dated 07/26/18, signed and sealed by Idalmis Ortega, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 19-0708.03)
Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, Type “B” Window, Grade 10, per FBC 2411

3.2.1, TAS202-94 and per ASTM F 588-07

along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 5000 outswing
aluminum casement window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test
Reports No. FTL-6294 and FTL-6295, dated 02/25/11 and 03/16/11 respectively, both
signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 11-0419.01)

Manuel Perez,P.E.
Product Control Exami
NOA No. 22-1227.0
Expiration Date: April 03,2628
Approval Date: January 19,2023




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA'’s (CONTINUED)
B. TESTS (CONTINUED)

4.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, Type “B” Window, Grade 10, per FBC 2411

3.2.1, TAS202-94 and per ASTM F 588-04

along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 5000 outswing
aluminum casement window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test
Report No. FTL-5336, dated 11/16/07, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No.08-0204.05)

C. CALCULATIONS

1.

2.

Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 6t
Edition (2017), dated 10/27/14, revised on 09/22/17 and updated to comply with FBC
7th Edition (2020), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 08/27/20, signed and
sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-0915.02)

Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE

1.

Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1.

Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 05/09/19,
expiringon 07/08/24.
Notice of Acceptance No. 18-0725.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Kuraray SentryGlas® Xtra™ (SGX™) Clear Glass Interlayer” dated 05/23/19,
expiring on 05/23/24.

Manuel Perez,P.E.
Product Control Exami
NOA No. 22-1227.0
Expiration Date: April 03,
Approval Date: January 19,2023




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)
F. STATEMENTS

1.

Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 6 Edition (2017), with FBC 7t
Edition (2020), and of no financial interest, dated August 27, 2020, issued by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-0915.02)

Laboratory compliance letter for Test Reports No. FTL-6294 and FTL-6295, issued by
Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., dated 02/25/11 and 03/16/11 respectively, both
signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 11-0419.01)

Laboratory compliance letter for Test Report No. FTL-5336, issued by Fenestration
Testing Laboratory, Inc., dated 11/16/07, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 08-0204.05)

G. OTHERS

1.

Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0708.03, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC, for their Series
“5000” Outswing Aluminum Casement Window - L.M.I., approved on 08/01/19 and
expiring on 04/03/23.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exami
NOA No. 22-1227.0
Expiration Date: April 03,2628
Approval Date: January 19,2023




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

2. NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED
A. DRAWINGS

1. None.
B. TESTS

1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7t Edition (2020) and of no
financial interest, dated December 23, 2022, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and
sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

G. OTHERS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.02, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC, for their Series
“5000” Outswing Aluminum Casement Window - L.M.I., approved on 12/17/20 and
expiring on 04/03/23.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exami

NOA No.22-1227.0
Expiration Date: April 03,2628
Approval Date: January 19,2023




7 I /4
I /
I /
% [N I, /DY
% H &/ [ S—— \&8/
1T
/DN T = 7
= & LE WG »¢ 7 )
é% @ >I >% k% —K :::::XL::::: H—
gz ‘ = . Ar 11
— +|0 ol ~[d W NI
= |Z ~e Ng 9o 0 |8
m18 Z S AN I —Z|=
Z 1. = N w =
= N i "
@ | ::::\SH::::: 'F-_
N
N ) o\ .
Y- ST |
) - g ) +..._
= [ !
CAM LOCKS ¢
(2) LOCKING POINTS X 4,
ALL SIZES Z|nk
30” Q %5
D.L. OPG <18
35 1/4” "
VENT WIDTH
37"
WINDOW WIDTH
SERIES 5000
ALUMINUM OUTSWING CASEMENT WINDOW SINGLE (X)

DESIGN LOAD RATINGS FOR THESE WINDOWS TO BE AS PER
CHARTS SHOWN ON SHEET 2.

APPROVAL APPLIES TO SINGLE OR DOUBLE WINDOWS OR SIDE BY SIDE
COMBINATIONS OF CASMT/CASMT OR CASEMENT WITH SERIES 5100
FIXED WINDOWS USING MULLIONS IN BETWEEN.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURE FROM CASEMENT WINDOW, FIXED WINDOW
OR MULLION CHART WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017 (6TH EDITION)/2020 (7TH EDITION) FLORIDA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF’S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017/2020 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR

WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.
CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,

AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.
DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON ‘ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)’.

9"
SURFACE APPLIED

-
FALSE MUNTINS ( : ) r—'
OPTIONAL 4
[ I
§ HH N I
AN
AN
AN
N\ I
| i N
— AN
= é £ % = [0 \
Yz Yz Q5 7
— — | ™ >-—-——————
a‘| E3 it /s _
<+ O N E o~ s =
~Nla ~ hZJ 0 | # Q>< &?
= > / -
= / 0 =3
y a
1 i , -t
i /
‘ 7 5
Jﬁ I - ”
i1 P
4t i
= AN | =E ] i
MULT! POINT LOCK ’ I I :
x'
LOCKING POINTS g o
SEE CHART 30 5/8" 30 5/8" g Eg
NO. OF D.L. OPG D.L. OPG =g
WDW. HEIGHT| EEPERS "
UPTO AT SASH 35 7/8" 35 7/8"
26" 2 VENT WIDTH VENT WIDTH
40" 3 .
g2 : WINDOW WIDTH
76" 5
DOUBLE (XX)

TYPICAL ELEVATIONS

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

Ex.l%ion Date: 5410312028
By: 2o

SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.

THESE WINDOWS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-0915.02

Exgi?/awtion Dat&'j 54/03/2023
By: A

22-1227.02

Miamiépade Produc,t’Cq)'ltrol

Miamj/;Dade Produqt"C;ntrol

ccD

-

q (=)
Y ¥ ||
w
©
(1] 8
— e o)
8
Z 3Rz
O 832
E o 9lz
- allZ
hu 2'C0|
g2 T Nl
€5.38|3
oy &l°
N A
Loy %
o u
=2
OQocap
O2uy
24y
O'mE"W
S)
Qn.agﬂ
HiE
mn:zg“‘
qusi g
u.'i'lﬂ_'o
P 05 Q
.Jggs_i
oS ¥
IR
e )
—
-y [+e]
= 0
=) 0
|
= B
= ©
; ~~
— 0
] )
= .
2|9y
L s
Siaoy
M
=l tm N -
%gww“m
2030 ¢
OD M o
M
= -
= ESgnie
<32“"§
(o) —™m
.o=n
Slnne =~
ol INE T I
Ll =
C_—————————
@
AL
S|l ||
HNAE
cl |RIZIR
Ol ollo
-‘azr—gr—
clalalzle
() ()
ol |E|Z|E
ol_|<|9|<
‘DEEOE
Mm|x|D|Z|D
Pe
o
2l 2= =R
o-t—'(D!Df\ln
QOlo|o|=|N|a
2I°8|=8|8
\g\guu.ozj
c—— —>
ol ©
QU
e i o
QAL g
LY E
ol s || 5
Blls|l° |«
Sl &5 |5
S
drawing no.

(sheet 1 of 10



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY — PSF FOR ( X ) SIZES

DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF FOR ( XX ) SIZES

WITH CAM LOCKS WINDOWS WITH MULTI POINT LOCK

WITH CAM LOCKS WINDOWS WITH MULTI POINT LOCK

GLASS TYPES GLASS TYPE GLASS TYPE GLASS TYPES GLASS TYPE GLASS TYPES GLASS TYPE GLASS TYPE GLASS TYPES
WINDOW DIMS. A, B, CDEF ‘A ‘B’ ‘¢, 'D', ', 'F ‘G’ WINDOW DIMS. A, B, C,DEF N ‘B’ ‘¢, ‘D, 'E, 'F, ‘¢
WIDTH HEIGHT | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) [ExT.(+) [ INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) [ EXT.(+) | INT.(-) WIDTH HEIGHT | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(-)
19-1/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 37" o5 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
26-1/2" g 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 53-1/8" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
37" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 1028 37" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
42" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.6 53-1/8" 38-3/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
19-1/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 74" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
26-1/2" 38-3/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
37" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 104.5 37" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
42" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 92.0 53-1/8" 50-5/8" 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
19-1/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 74" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
26-1/2" 50-5/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" 850 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
37" 85.0 85.0 850 | 85.0 90.0 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 105.6 37" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
42" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 93.0 53-1/8" 63" 796 | 79.6 79.6 79.6 796 | 79.6 79.6 79.6
19-1/8" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 74" 61.4 61.4 61.4 61.4 61.4 | 61.4 61.4 61.4
26-1/2" 63" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" - - - - - — 56.5 56.5
37" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 106.1 37" - - = - - - 66.6 66.6
42" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 93.4 53-1/8" | 74-1/4" - - - - - - 47.6 47.6
19-1/8" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 74" - = - - - - 36.0 36.0
26-1/2" | 74-1/4" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 37" = = - - . - 62.0 62.0
37" - - - - = = 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0 53-1/8" 76" - - = = - = 44.3 44.3
19-1/8" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 74" - - - - = - 33.4 33.4
26-1/2" 76" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 111.1 48” 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
36" B - - - - - 85.4 | 85.4 85.4 | 85.4 56" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
24" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
28" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 72" 48" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
32" ., 85.0 | 85.0 850 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 80" 85.0 | 850 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
36" “® 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
40" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 103.0 48" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
42" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 98.1 56" 850 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
24" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
28" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 72" 54" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
32" N 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 80" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
36" > 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
40" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 48" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 90.0
42" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 109.0 56" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 88.9 | 889 88.9 88.9
24" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" 80.0 | 80.0 80.0 80.0 80.0 | 80.0 80.0 80.0
28" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 72" 60" 735 | 735 73.5 73.5 735 | 735 73.5 73.5
32" 60" 85.0 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 80" — - = - . - 68.7 68.7
36" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 84" - — - = . = 66.8 66.8
40" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 103.0 48" 75.2 75.2 75.2 75.2 752 | 75.2 75.2 75.2
42" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 98.1 56" 65.7 65.7 65.7 65.7 65.7 | 65.7 65.7 65.7
24" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" . 58.9 58.9 58.9 58.9 58.9 | 589 58.9 58.9
28" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 72" o0 — - = B - . 53.8 53.8
32” 66" 85.0 | 85.0 85.0 | 85.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 80" - - - - - - 49.9 49.9
36" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 104.1 48" = - - - - - 57.4 | 57.4
40" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 93.7 56" = - = - -~ - 50.0 50.0
24" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" 72" - - = = - - 44.6 44.6
28" ., - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 72" - - = = - - 40.6 40.6
32" 2 - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 107.3 48" - - - - - = 48.6 48.6
36" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 95.4 56" - - - = - - 42.3 42.3
24" - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 114.0 64" 76" = = = - - - 37.6 37.6
28" ., - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 | 105.7 72" - = = - . - 34.1 34.1
32" 78 - - - - - - 90.0 | 90.0 90.0 94.1
36" - - - - - - 85.4 | 85.4 85.4 | 85.4
26-3/8" | 60-3/4" - - = = - - - - 90.0 | 114.0 NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCA05-DEC-219

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 22-1227.02

Ex@r;ﬁtion Date; 54/0312028
By: 'i M‘;’

Miami-Dade ProductControl

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-0915.02

Exgi?/awtion Dat&'j 54/03/2023
By: A

Miamj{—pade Produqt"C;ntrol

SEP i © 700

~

f
C

COMP—ANL\WO8—08ESW]

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

)iﬂﬁ

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

(S~5000 ALUM OUTSWING CASEMENT WDW. (L.M.I

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
GLASS OPTION ADDED
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

10.16.17

E |05.06.15
G 109.27.18
H |08.25.20

F

(revisions:
(no[ date

|

01-23-08

<4
x
<
=
=
o
o
°

date:
chk. by:

| G
————
drawing no.

W08-08



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090” Interlayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795/983

1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090” Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.’

1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795/983

5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE
5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE
5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

*

el

WS

5/32” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090” Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.’

1/8" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795/983

aa 2 [
o S S
o o [0
= = E
& & &S
GLASS TYPE ‘A’ GLASS TYPE ‘B’ GLASS TYPE ‘C’
5/32" HEAT STREN'D GLASS 5/32" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

OR
5/32" TEMP. GLASS

OR
5/32" TEMP. GLASS

1/4" AIR SPACE 1/4” AIR SPACE

1/8” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090" Interlayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

5/32" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
SILICONE

1/8” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.'

5/32" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SentryGlas

5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘D’

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.’

1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 983

— ]

SILICONE .

Q DOWSIL 795/983 o DOWSIL 795/983 .

z | E £ |

. D . |@D . |D

z =z Z |,

=12 =12 |2
3 ' 2 s

NJ[E :l g o g o

1 F% ] 1[ ]

S S S

@ @ x

[} (] (]

= = =

&S &S &

GLASS TYPE ‘E’ GLASS TYPE ‘F’

GLAZING OPTIONS

NOTE:
TO QUALIFY FOR SMALL MISSILE IMPACT RATING 1/4” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:
EXTERIOR PLY OF GLASS TYPES ‘E’ & ‘F° MUST BE TEMPERED. SPACER:

‘HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
BY ‘LINGERMANN GMBH'

AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.
PERIMETER SEALANT:

SILICONE

DOWSIL 791

GE 2000

\

GLASS TYPE ‘G’

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

5/32" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
.090" Interlayer

By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’
1/8” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795/983

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795

5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

ALT. GLAZING OPTION

THESE GLAZING STOP CAN BE USED WITH
GLASS TYPES ‘A, 'B’, 'C’ & D"

@ AT 1/4 POINTS ON LITES
WIDER THAN 36"

SETTING BLOCKS AT LAM. GLASS
NOTCH GLAZING BEAD LEG
TO CLEAR BLOCKS

@AT 1/4 POINTS ALL SIZES

SETTING BLOCKS AT INSUL. LAM. GLASS
NOTCH GLAZING BEAD LEG
TO CLEAR BLOCKS

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 22-1227.02 NOA-No. 20-0915.02
Exgi?/a;;ion Date: %4/03/2028 Expiration Date-j %34/03/2023
By: M By?W §477)
Miamii_pade Produc(f(:o)ltrol Miamj/;Dade Produqt‘t;ntrol

Sgp 1 200

\
a
f
C

|

COMP—ANL\WO8—08ESW )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158 1

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI,

(5-5000 ALUM OUTSWING CASEMENT WOW. (LM.1.)

|

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
GLASS OPTION ADDED
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

E |05.06.15
F 110.16.17
G |09.27.18
H |08.25.20

(revisions:
nol date

|

01-23-08

o
S
=
=
o

(e
°

date:
chk. by:

|

drawing no.

W08-08

(sheet 3 of10)



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

EDGE DIST.

e 4 , A v‘A]'l/‘l':G‘"A

4

a

<

R .\"4 7.

1BY
WOOD BUCK

WINDOW HEIGHT

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING\

w [F3]
____________________ S 2
EDGE METAL [P oo o 1 2
DIST STRUCTURE | | MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED I, o =
: |:MULLION & MULLION ANCHORS :, EDGE S &
I PARATE NOA I
EDGE |:SEE & o :. DIST. .8
DIST. II :: oo
} I
_____________________________ |
x %
. 2s
. |IE ks
el N
Ny —
M

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURE NOT BY ‘E.S. WINDOWS'
MUST SUSTAIN LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM
AND TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

19A) INTERLOCK

[&])
W

1/4" MAX.
SHIMS

%
@] q:
17 i |E
: el \ x|@
!
BTN
il | (9
H |
g 1
1 :
if i I
W l
B |
1 |
if i {
i |
i
B |
i |
T i f '
T I o | |
8 % o 1] I |
T o |
i L | |\ il 1
= - =
2 9 3 T 2
> 1 =
Y e}
iif fi g
I 4
Ri z
| |
i w
! &
[%2]
I 1
i :
I |
i
B |
1 :
1 |
|
] 12) /1. 19) TRUTH
L]
= >
g <
3|z
=
21 1| @20 ¥
212
a2 A

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

20A J
I
? PRODUCT REVISED
PRODUCT RENEWED as complying with the Florida
as complying with the Florida Building Code
Building Code . 1>> NOA-No. 20-0915-02
NOA-No. 22-1227.02 7 v Expiration Date; 04/03/2023
Expiration Date; . ' %m@%
XQ%IOII ate g4l0312028 o i Byl:{W 747)
B.y: : 2 TYPICAL ANCHORS Miamj{—pade Produqt"C;ntrol
Muamépade Produc(t’cgntrol EDGE DIST. SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT’ (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1—1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)

DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS

1-1/4” MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1-1/4” MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)

1-3/4” MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. (FOR MULLION CLIPS ONLY)

#14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS

OR

INTO METAL STRUCTURES (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

(3) THREADS MIN. PENETRATION BEYOND SUBSTRATE
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

TYP GE DISTA

INTO CONCRETE AND MASONRY = 2-1/2" MIN.

INTO CONCRETE = 1-1/2" MIN. (INTERIOR ANCHORS AT MULL CLIP)
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 11/16" MIN.

INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 11/16" MIN.

WOOD AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.

CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.
C-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.

3 =)
“-u 0
L
0
(o] 8
8
4 PEdE
o B>
°] © gl
= o ©
hm 2’(9|
g2 T Nl
€&,S3)3
048\'80
w ~r
Lo %
gor &
=2
Ocan
O2u4u
8@
O9zmo
xx o
(o -0
|__Qo)
O%LE ¢
Lo §
rza o
quUsSiL §
LL“-‘U)_-O
|EOE$
- OO0
20 =0
<mm§:—J
G |
Gl
—
T [s0]
= re}
= 0
I
= =
o ©
= ~
= g
L £
= .
U')O,_ x
sid4L £
o
g| &
=l AN -
%gmd-m
S02m Y
OD M o
. ),
S|E=.°
<§ZL“§
o —_ M
.o n
8U)m<§(.
HIEES:
o M= -
">
O
{4
glg|k|g
T |5 o i TH
2~
|°l3|2|S
o|g|N|F |2
sl ewR
Ql o e
S E
oClE 2
Oln|a|o|a
o|lx|(D|Z|D
>
I3
2lez 55| R
Ollo|o| = ||
20‘8988
38“"“‘01
O
29}
o
bl 1] o
2 o
iKYk
ol s|l®
5152
SEE ¢
e —— .5
f—"——‘_
drawing no.



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


EDGE DIST.

3/16" MAX.
SHIM @ 48 1/4" MAX.
SHIM
49 43 o
Rt 1BY
/wvooo BUCKS
TYPICAL ANCHORS .
SEE ELEV. ,
FOR SPACING .
---------- SCREEN _ Y
1 1/4”
A
N == !
w b SR IR || e = -
ol ;
85 4 ) N4
h 9
b TYPICAL ANCHORS
: SEE ELEV.
v  FOR SPACING
EXTERIOR “ o
METAL 4 [
STRUCTURE D.L. OPG. S EEHE I
AT G | MULTI POINT LOCK OPTION
WINDOW WIDTH
SINGLE VENT WINDOWS
1/4" SHIM
©

BY WOOD BUCK
0
WORD STRUCTURE

EDGE
DI

SCREEN OPT.—==—-—

CAM S _OPTION
1/4" MAX.
SHIMS S

1

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

EDGE DIST.

TYPICAL ANCHORS 36
SEE ELEV. @ ® D.L. OPG. EXTERIOR D.L. OPG.
FOR SPACING
VENT WIDTH VENT WIDTH
WINDOW WIDTH
DUAL VENT WINDOWS
PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 22-1227.02 NOA-No. 20-0915.02
Expiration Date; 04/03/2028 Ex%ion Date'ﬁ4/03/2023
ByRW By: §277)
Miamiépade Produc,t’Ct)ntrol Miamj/;Dade Produqt‘t;ntrol

Sgp i 2

A1 ]

,,,,,,
°e

- &
No. 81223~ v‘
'l */ \ /1’4 E

)
)
Y ¥ ||
()
0
(1] 3
N o
8
—
Z 3Rz
(o] v 217
- 7 (.:‘Z
= u - o
= |
<E T Nl
< ~
€S.,5282
ozd§ ¢g[°
>N ]
Loy %
o
=2
Qoap
O2u+
0% m
O%zmo
x o o
OQ.Qgﬂ
O%Lz <
TEEE:
xz
quUsSi g
weon_o
|EOEQ
- OO0
Zm_m
Sos ¥
—— | —
S
(= )
= 8
= Bl
2 [s0]
= 3
- )
= o
bl L
5| O 3
siaE &
4w
2| &
LR
S5lo2mY
= co
| EXTap
<§ZL‘-’8\
(o) —_ M
o=2
Slnn 2~
mujmi(_J
& M s
|
=
i)
AL
LT |
g':mo
coc’%g
oY FIY
nggE
NI
viglalo|a
o2 |Z2|2
>
fe]
2llpl= =2 IR
O-O—JtD(Dr\ID
Olo|o| =[N~
218 2(8|8
o|[o
\b\cm‘-‘-OIJ
| —
e}
g
M
o
|
by .
b
. o
£ <
° 5
[ G
f.—ﬁ
drawing no.



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEVS. FOR SPACING

k" > B
EDGE DIST.. - | |
- B

A4

1°1/4"
v

-3

ALT.

2
i

1/4" MAX!
SHIMS

/

EDGE DIST. |

1/4” MAX
SHIMS

v

N, . 7 o
TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

EDGE
DIST.

TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

METAL
STRUCTURE

J

L

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

0w

|
|
|
|
EDGE |

DIST. || A

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

e e e 1
___________ |
IAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED ||
ULLION & MULLION ANCHORS !
EE SEPARATE NOA ::
L
| |
| |
______________ J |
________ J
1/4" MAX. . a5 ALT.
SHIMS '
s boa
A A.

EDGE DIST.

I

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 22-1227.02

Ex%ion Date: 04/03/2028
By

Miamiépade Producrlfcgntrol

INSTALLATION DETAILS WITH FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-0915.02

Exgi?/awtion Dat&'j 54/03/2023
By: A

Miamj/;Dade Produqt"C;ntrol
SEP i ° Z0Zd

T
[ Oz
L. 0
(]
0
(1] 8
A
8
=
Z 3SRIZ
o © 3|2
g .8|%
g2 Z alla
E&.S8|2
oo
oS~ ¢&lo
N .
Loy %
ok w
=2
Ocap
O2uh
gud
OS2 o
re . o
On.ngﬁ
O%LzE 4
rLvo §
egza W
uUsSh 5
w
u_ztn_.-o
P 208 @
-l OO0
ZM0= 0
LTos &
—/
| S |
=
= 3
= BI
: s8]
§ B
. )
= o
= &
3|9~
= L s
o i ey
2| &
= N~
A EARRE
S5lo2m?
OD M oo
o M
Sl EE
<32‘-‘-’uoa‘
& " )
O
Slue =T
Yo) 0 <
N L=
. I . SSR———
>
=S
@
Zlall|a
m|w|m
S|l ||
= n
3= ln|]
SEANE
ﬁ29§9
cClw|glz|8
AR
WBEOE
Olx|{D|Z|D
>
1e)
ANENEE
Siels|2 (5|0
%’"“39%8
9_)8“1“-‘-"1
| il
c————>
0
g
M o
‘T‘ x
<
5 -
> o)
3 o
- . 5
3 I
| G |
S " . |
drawing no.

——sheet 6 of 10



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


®

514
|
.900
[

->l LH .080

SNUBBER

2.595

3.030 2.061
062 -l 2.530
A FL
691
i
0800 FRAME
o——1.848 ——
.
»@.oez 4
1.876 l 392

53

.720

<>} Iﬂf.329
}__

.803 050

ol

GLAZING STOP (LAM. GLASS)

2.125

Uj.QSO*’
1.186

IMPOST

1.098

g

o o
.803 .050
1.0830!

GLAZING STOP (INSUL. LAM.

147
—r

.062

837 L

.803
P

GLAZING STOP (LAM. GLASS)

GLASS)
«>] r».328 ';‘i‘j {"
543 803 _|_ 950
| L.zso L
— 837

GLAZING WEDGE

GLAZING STOP (LAM. GLASS)

&

<*——*1.8884*}
062

1 : 1

. |

2.063 {

FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER

@

1 1.030 =
1L

—

1.844

«1.794 «e

IMPOST STIFFENER

125

[.188

0‘ 1.000 r
338

—

3.000

.338

1 X3
(23) CUSTOM MULLION

—= =—.125

‘T 1.000 Iﬂ*

—= F=.125

3.000

1 X3
@ STD. MULLION

— .720 =
;
o 2.750
2.000
§r J e
! 3.750 1
MULLION CLIP

NOTCH
OPTIONAL

1/2"
TYP.

Ed.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 22-1227.02

Expiration Date: 04/03/2028
Bymmwﬁ%m

Miamiépade ProducrfCJntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-0915.02

Expiration Date: 04/03/2023
Bymwuzﬁm

Miamj/;Dade Produqt"C;ntrol

)
O Bl
gl
(I]
0
(] 3
3
—
4 PR E
ﬂ‘)m/
Or 38|32
n O
- 7 N{
'-u Z'(D|
<§ T N g
€53 8|3
o
ozZs~¢glo
> N ;
Loy %
xokE w
=2
Qoap
Q24w
o%m
O%szmeo
x o <]
oEdzs
O <
mmwog
<his5d 5
)
Lwen_o
r4 [
1 =02 &
4888
ios ¥
—/
>
—
= o]
= Ie)
= 2
= S
(=] ©
; P
n
= =
L‘J N
= .
Al O %
Z|lah &
Siay
g| £
ZlinHF N -
%gwﬁ'm
= — 0
80@"71
M
O M
SlEE N
<32LLT§
() [ )
O S
Slnn 2
PluBs e
& M =
| G
N\
e
I
Z~8lc
SR
Cly Qx|
1218 (e |80
Qly o
cClEle|o|e
(lh.l (]
ol |E|n |k
o|lZ|E|3|E
Mol |D|o|D
>
O
INEIRNEE
cl8ls| 6| x|
2o T NN
iojw|jo|o |0
'; Oo|l~|O|OC
\g\guuozj
| C——
o]
o
,,N‘, 1 o
2 @
AN
s || 2
RERER
Sl 8| o |l
° o ||ls || o
[ )
SR AN
drawing no.



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


ITEM PART # | QUANTITY |DESCRIPTION MATERIAL | MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS ( u \ (=)
1 £S5001 1 FRAME HEAD 6063-T6 | — G Q
2 ES5001 1 FRAME SILL 6063-T6 | — N <
3 ES5001 1/ VENT | FRAME JAMB—HINGE SIDE 6063-T6 | — > sa §
4 ES5001 1/ VENT | FRAME JAMB—LATCH SIDE 6063-T6 | — 0. 3 § %
5 ES5002 1/ VENT |VENT TOP RALL 6063-T6 | — B2 ° g <
6 ES5002 1/ VENT | VENT BOTTOM RAIL 6063-T6 . < E ﬁ 8 a
7 ES5002 1/ VENT |VENT SIDE RAIL—HINGE SIDE 6063-T6 | — Ecosd 2
8 E£S5002 1/ VENT |VENT SIDE RAIL—LATCH SIDE 6063-T6 | — 8 Y g ©
9 E£S5004 2/ VENT | SNUBBERS, 2—1/2" LONG 6063-T6 | — gor £
10A ES1103 AS REQD. | GLAZING BEAD (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T5 | — OLa2m
108 - AS REQD. | GLAZING BEAD (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T5 | — o gu.u‘:
10C ES1008 AS REQD. | GLAZING BEAD (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — oL na: & 8
10D ES—1017 AS REQD. | GLAZING BEAD (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — 8 ;E‘é §
11 27-425 AS REQD. | GLAZING GASKET EPDM DUROMETER 60+5 SHORE ‘A’ & §§ g
1A £S1010 AS REQD. | GLAZING WEDGE SOFT PVC | DUROMETER 655 SHORE ‘A’ q u SL g
118 5008A AS REQD. | GLAZING WEDGE SILICONE | DUROMETER 655 SHORE ‘A’ Lz_ 58
12 - AS REQD. | FRAME & VENT ASSEMBLY SCREWS = #10 X 1-1/2" PH SMS - 98 4
13 - 2/ SNUBBER| SNUBBER INSTALLATION SCREWS = #8 X 1/2" PH SMS <ios - L
14 £202 AS REQD. | OUTER WEATHERSTRIPPING (POLYPROPYLENE BASE, TPE BULB) — DUROMETER 65 SHORE ‘A’ )
15 ES5005 AS REQD. | INNER WEATHERSTRIPPING EPDM DUROMETER 60 SHORE ‘A’ g o
16 PJS40—SS | AS REQD. | CORNER LOCK ST. STEEL | SULLIVAN & ASSOCIATES | o
17 301SS 2/ VENT |4 BAR HINGES—HEAVY DUTY = TRUTH HARDWARE = S
18 - 3/ HINGE | HINGE MOUNTING SCREWS AT FRAME - #10 X 1/2" PH SMS = ©
18A - 4/ HINGE | HINGE MOUNTING SCREWS AT VENT — #10 X 1/2" PH SMS = 8
19 23 SERIES 1/ VENT | SINGLE ARM OPERATOR (AT 8—1/2" FROM ENDS) — TRUTH HARDWARE % =
19A NOVA 1/ VENT | SINGLE ARM OPERATOR (AT 8—1/2" FROM ENDS) = INTERLOCK 2 e HoZ
20 - 4/ OPER. | OPERATOR MOUNTING SCREWS - #10-24 X 3/8" PH SMS - et =
20A -~ 8/ OPER. | OPERATOR MOUNTING SCREWS N #8 X 1/2" FH SMS slvh
21 30175 1/ OPER. | 13-3/4" LONG TRACK ST. STEEL | TRUTH HARDWARE = % on o
21A - 1/ OPER. | OPERATOR TRACK ST. STEEL | INTERLOCK SIay¥m g'g
22 - 2/ TRACK | TRACK MOUNTING SCREWS - #10 X 3/8" PH SS SMS ZE= 5°©
22A - 3/ TRACK | TRACK MOUNTING SCREWS - #8 X 1/2" FH SMs (== “— Q
23 - AS REQD. | 1X3 CUSTOM MULLION 6063-T6 | — § w2 <§( 3
23A - AS REQD. | 1X3 STANDARD MULLION 6063-T6 | — TIWgs e
24 - AS REQD. | MULLION CLIP 6063-T6 | — S| S
25 27-372 2/ UTE | SETTING BLOCK, 7/16" X 3/16" X 3—1/2" LONG EPDM AT 6” FROM EACH END, DUROMETER 755 SHORE A S
25A = 2/ LTE | SETTING BLOCK, 5/16" X 5/8" X 4" LONG EPDM AT 6” FROM EACH END, DUROMETER 755 SHORE A
26 - 8/ LTE | TAPE SPACER (1/4" X 1/27) FOAM AT 6” FROM GLASS ENDS 2,0 o
30 - OPTIONAL | 5/16" BOX SCREEN - - PRODUCT RENEWED $IE gk
33 E£S5009 2/ VENT | ANTI SAG SKATE, 2" LONG NYLON/CELCON| M&M PLASTICS Sf.i?:.’i'.‘.‘;%’i:‘fe‘"’“" the Florida |38 § ? §
34 - 2/ SKATE | SKATE MOUNTING SCREWS - #6 x 1/2" PHSMS NOA-No. 22-1227.02 % & o % )
36 ES5003 1 IMPOST 6063-T6 Expiration Date: 04/03/2028 c|flalo|g
37 ES5010 AS RQD. |IMPOST STIFFENER 6063-T6 R%W §; '§ § '§
45 CLO1-0500 - MULTI—POINT LOCK MECHANISM INTERLOCK By: 2482 Sl
46 = - LOCK FASTENER PLATE - SEALANTS: Miamiénade P’°d“°ffc‘)"t’°' 2]

47 - 2/ LOCK | LOCK FASTENER SCREWS IHEEAE FOE ALL FRAME AND VENT CORNERS AND INSTALLATION SCREws |[€eZ|5[Z[S
48 [CLOT-2250-XXX| - | SNAP ON COVER = SEALED WITH CLEAR/ALUMINUM COLORED SEALANT. aEENR
43 [CLOT—1050—XXX N SNAP ON HANDLE - T I e P
50 = = GUIDE (ACETAL) - o J
51 - = KEEPER (ACETAL) -
52 - - LOCK BAR (304 ST/ST) — PRODUCT REVISED 8

as complying with the Florida ) o
53 ES—-5017 AS REQD. | FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER 6063-T5 | OPTIONAL Building Code N g
54 = 1/ VENT | LOCKING HANDLE - SULLIVAN & ASSOC. NOA-No. 20-0915.02 o Tl s
55 - 2/ VENT | LOCKING CAM (AT 11-1/2" & 50—1/2" FROM BOTTOM) - SULLICAN & ASSOC. Expiration Date: 04/03/2023 8 27
56 - 2/ LOCK | LOCK MOUNTING SCREWS - #6-32 x 1/2 PH MS By?WWHE@ 5%&2 3 515
57 ES5013 1/VENT | LOCK HANDLE/CAM CONNECTOR - 1/4" x 1/2" ALUM. BAR Miamjl;na de Produ qf'C;ntrol r—m——ﬁ(ﬁ
58 ES5011 2/ BAR | CONNECTOR SCREWS » CUSTOM
59 CS—200K-SS | 2/ VENT | KEEPERS (AT 12" & 51" FROM BOTTOM) ST STEEL | SULLIVAN & ASSOC. W08—-08
60 - 2/ KEEPER | KEEPER MOUNTING SCREWS - #10 X 3/8" PH SMS €D 4 ¢



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


( MS380—80OM\INV—dNOD ) esig-8c9 (s08) “xv4 1S1G—8¢9 (S0g) 1AL

o
s - e . . ‘ 084 0202 OL d31lvadn 02°G2'80| H ”
o | NMMMNNMW&@ A 00FE¥OT (508 AL criee “Il4 INVIN 133HS SHL 3ONVHO ON 812260 © °
mhhﬁmm VAIHOT T ._rmmm._.m @.V M'N O@mm 084 £10¢ OL Q31vadn L1°9L0L| 4 ()]
* 0ZZ 31INS ‘IAIYA 1ISNNS 09E6 511 ‘SMOANIM °S°3 S sisosol 3 -~
ANFNJOTIAIA LONAO0YHd @ SHIINIONI uonduosap | Aq | 21op |ou %
L €| NoILYHOJdH0D DooUVY-1V T.:jv 'MAM INIW3SYO ONIMSLNO WNTY ooomlmw ( Suoisinel) | 205210 op <
©
3 m N o
as NIQ k-]
g n &l 5
20 |0
ws ol
N = N 3
w e = b
e, (&8
=23 |3 o
E) OSo | e T
= 2o 0 K] 8
QEE2|E <D
! 083¢|E > &
/ 4 w30 X > 8
Xy o Z 4 o = mw
[x¢) [t}
3 M N ° o~
= qif=] =
£ o= Q.
o nNne ] m.
] Sz 9 3 S Lt
= nE NS 5 (7p
o Zs, (I
(@] g.nﬂw © o
© =£o (B 3
Q>0 s S
L 5e6 (.0 Q
= QEEZ |0
< 083 4|k £
- 550 & 5 8
afaz § o £

VENT CORNER

IMPOST CORNER



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


CLIPPED MULLIONS

TYPICAL ANCHORS

MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
1X3 1X3 1X3 1X3
WINDOW DIMS. STD. MULL |CUSTOM MULL WINDOW DIMS. STD. MULL |CUSTOM MULL
EXT.(+) EXT.(+) EXT.(+) EXT.(+)
WIDTH (W) [LENGTH (L) INT.(-) INT.(=) WIDTH (W) [LENGTH (L) INT.(-) INT.(=)
26-1/2" 90.0 90.0 30" 90.0 90.0
37" 90.0 90.0 36" 90.0 90.0
42" 90.0 90.0 42" 90.0 90.0
45" 58" 90.0 90.0 48" 54" 90.0 90.0
48" 90.0 90.0 54" 90.0 90.0
53-1/8" 90.0 90.0 60" 90.0 90.0
62" 90.0 90.0 62" 90.0 90.0
26—1/2" 90.0 90.0 30" 90.0 90.0
37" 90.0 90.0 36" 90.0 90.0
42" 90.0 90.0 42" 90.0 90.0
45" 63" 90.0 90.0 48" 60” 90.0 90.0
48" 90.0 90.0 54" 90.0 90.0
53-1/8" 90.0 90.0 60" 90.0 90.0
62" 90.0 90.0 62" 90.0 90.0
26-1/2" 90.0 90.0 30" 90.0 90.0
37" 90.0 90.0 36" 90.0 90.0
42" ) 83.3 90.0 42" ., 90.0 90.0
45" T4=1/4 79.4 90.0 48" 60 90.0 90.0
48" 76.1 90.0 54" 90.0 90.0
53—1/8" 71.7 90.0 59" 90.0 90.0
26-1/2" 90.0 90.0 30" 90.0 90.0
37 85.0 90.0 36" 90.0 90.0
42" _ 77.2 90.0 42" 72" 90.0 90.0
45” 73.5 90.0 48" 84.5 90.0
48" 70.4 88.3 54" 79.2 90.0
51" 67.8 85.0 30" 90.0 90.0
36" 86.9 90.0
42" 76" 77.2 90.0
48" 70.4 88.3
51" 67.8 85.0
NOTES:
1. USE CHART ON THIS SHEET FOR SIDE BY SIDE CONNECTION
CAPACITY OF WINDOW MULLION.
2. FOR CASEMENT WINDOW CAPACITY SEE SHEET 2 OF 10.
FOR FIXED WINDOW CAPACITY SEE SEPARATE NOA.
LOWER VALUES FROM STEPS 1, 2 OR 3 WILL APPLY TO
ENTIRE SYSTEM.
CASEMENT WINDOW @ e
SERIES 5000

CASEMENT WINDOW

4 PER CLP _—1 | C

SEE SHEET 4

FOR DESCRIPTION

SERIES 5000

CASEMENT WINDOW

WINDOW WIDTH

[ Teasanmmnil

)

T====:=:==:::===F
/ AN / :}: ::i \
|

// \\ // X 1 \\

2 7 ® N S .~ ! N
g 4 g > | | /
AN / N i /
AN / AN $l| A
AN / AN :' /

W1 W2 W1 w2 W1
S S —— I ———
| T T T====77=°°

A0 i ! 1 A I

Al [ 1 | ki

~ / Il o~ i b / Ll i
= G | | = | | G } |
2| | O =TI | PASO |
= 7 I Z moo= i 7 h Z Il Z b
Q N 7 X ’ e i & 1 & X & fi
4 i oS i i i
N I b ' b N i i

AN 1IN i

[ [ |

| I | ﬂ:==================l!:

W1 W1 W2

TYPICAL ELEVATIONS

SIDE BY SIDE WINDOWS
y L E SIDE BY SIDE APPLIES TO TWO OR MORE WINDOWS
1/2" @ <

oﬁf_ z

B3, 480 WIDTH (W) = WI—;XV—Z—

223 &5

0 <
i
™
®
_
~
>
PRODUCT RENEWED

__SERIES 5100
| FIXFD WINDOW

EXTERIOR

WINDOW WIDTH

T

CASEMENT TO CASEMENT MULLION

WINDOW WIDTH

SN

i

i ,mm__ _

?ﬁ% =
EXT(-;RIOR

WINDOW WIDTH

CASEMENT TO FIXED MULLION

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 22-1227.02

Expiration Date: 04/03/2028
Bymmém

Miamiépade Produc,t’CJntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-0915.02

Exgi?/awtion Dat&'j 54/03/2023
By: A

Miamj{—pade Produqt"cgntrol

a

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

[S—SOOO ALUM OUTSWING CASEMENT WDW. (L.M.l.)]

|

L

|

|

f
C

(C.A.N. 3538)
COMP—ANL\WO8—08ESW )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

10.16.17

(revisions:
no[ date

E |05.06.15

F
G |09.27.18
H 108.25.20

01-23-08

date:

dra

|

|

W08-08

<4
4
<
=
=
a
[
°

chk. by:

wing no.

sheet 10 of 10



mp045
noa20091502

mp045
noa22-1227.02


	ADPF341.tmp
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADP7E0D.tmp
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC




