MIAMIDADE

Memorandum

Date: March 4, 2008
To: Honorable Ch Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1) (B)
and Membé '

From: George M8
County*Mana

Subject: Project Award Recommendation in the Amount of $500,000.00 Between All
Quality Electrical Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People's
Transportation Plan (PTP) Project Entitled Internally llluminated Street Name
Sign Installation Contract - Countywide (Project — CICC 7040-0/07 RPQ No.
20070784)

ger

Recommendation

The attached Project Award Recommendation for an Internally llluminated Street Name Sign
Installation Contract - Countywide (Project — CICC 7040-0/07 RPQ No. 20070784), in the amount
of $500,000.00, between All Quality Electrical Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County has been
prepared by the Public Works Department (PWD) and is recommended for approval. Proceeds
from the Charter County Transit System Sales Surtax (the Surtax) will be used to fund this project,
therefore, approval by the Board of County Commissioners (BCC) and Citizens’ Independent
Transportation Trust (CITT) is required.

Scope
The work to be performed under the life of this contract includes internally illuminated street name

sign installation at various locations within Miami-Dade County.  Approximately 35-40
intersections are to be covered through this contract, of which we have pre-identified the
following: SW 72 Avenue and SW 48 Street; SW 82 Avenue and SW 16 Street and SW 87
Avenue and SW 168 Street, located within Commission Districts 7, 8 and 10. Additional sites may
be added during the course of the contract.

Fiscal Impact/Funding Source

The fiscal impact will be $500,000.00 and will be funded from the Surtax. The proposed
improvements qualify under the allowable work categories included in the PTP Neighborhood
Improvements Section. Specific funding for this project will be allocated from the respective
Commission District PTP yearly allocations. The base contract amount is $439,732.00, but the
total allocated amount is $500,000.00, which is inclusive of the contingency and dedicated

allowances.

Delegation of Authority
No additional authority is being requested within the body of this contract.

Track Record/Monitor

The contractor, All Quality Electrical Services, Inc., is currently performing work for the PWD at an
above satisfactory level as reported by the Project Manager. Additionally, the Office of Capital
Improvement (OCI) database lists 12 awarded construction contracts. The referenced database
also lists a total of 10 contractor performance evaluations from PWD, all with satisfactory ratings
averaging 3.1, the highest rating being 4.0. The remaining contracts are currently under
construction or in the preliminary stages and do not yet have evaluations on file.

Following PWD'’s standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-construction
meeting will be scheduled. Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff person in PWD will
be the PTP Coordinator, Mr. Frank Aira, P.E. Following completion of the award process, the
project will be assigned to Mr. Oscar Rubio, P.E., Project Manager, for day to day responsibilities. ,



Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro
and Members, Board of County Commissioners
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According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, All Quality Electrical
Services, Inc., Company Principals are: Samuel Lightbourne and Shakira Lightbourne and the
Company’s address is listed as: 14500 N.W. 16" Court, Miami, Florida 33167.

Background
In an effort to accelerate the continued success of the PTP Neighborhood Improvements initiative,

PWD is taking advantage of various contracting mechanisms such as the subject Miscellaneous
Construction Contracting process available under the Office of Capital Improvements (OCI)
contract CICC 7040-0/07. Through this process, PWD forwards the Request for Price Quotation
(RPQ), by way of facsimile transmission and US-mail, to a pool of pre-qualified Community Small
Business Enterprise (CSBE) contractors for the subject trade. Interested contractors prepare their
bids according to the Job Order Contracting (JOC) process, whereby the County establishes unit
prices for the pay items in accordance with industry averages. The contractors submit their bid as
an overall percentage factor of the pricing established by the County. The project award
evaluation is based upon the lowest percentage submitted by the responsive, responsible bidder
for the project. In the event that the lowest JOC percentage submitted by a responsive and
responsible firm results in a tie (equal percentage), such firms shall have the opportunity to submit
a best and final bid equal to or lower than the percentage factor previously submitted. If a tie still
exists, the County will award the contract based on local preference, CSBE certification and the
least amount of dollars paid on County contracts over the last three (3) years.

PWD staff in conjunction with SBD determined that the scope of work for this project qualified for
a CSBE set-aside (Levels |, Il, and lll) designation. Therefore, on November 2, 2007, PWD
forwarded an RPQ for an Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation Contract, utilizing
the OCI contract CICC 7040-0/07, to a list of 23 pre-qualified firms. Six (6) firms purchased
contract documents and four (4) firms proffered a bid. As a result, on December 12, 2007, PWD
issued a recommendation of award for RPQ 20070784 with a percentage factor of 1.0 to All
Quality Electrical Services, Inc., with the stipulation that approval of this project must be obtained
from the BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated with the funding source.

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all
supervision, labor, required materials, tools and equipments required to provide the installation of
internally illuminated street name signs at various intersections in Miami-Dade County. The work
includes the removal of existing overhead signs, relocation of existing signal heads and tree
trimming in conflict with the proposed scope of work as directed by the Engineer. The Contractor
shall keep the Engineer informed at all times of his work schedule, in order for the project to be
inspected during all phases of installation, including wire splicing, installation of conductors and
any work involving the electrical connections at the controller cabinet.

Assistant County Ma\ryﬁ(



MEMORANDUM

(Revised)

TO: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro DATE: March 4, 2008

and Members, Board of County Commissioners

o

FROM: R.A.Cdeva
County Attorney

SUBJECT: Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1) (B)

Please note any items checked.

“4-Day Rule” (“3-Day Rule” for committees) applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required

Statement of fiscal impact required

Bid waiver requiring County Manager’s written recommendation

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing

Housekeeping item (no policy decision required)

No committee review



Approved Mayor Agenda Item No.8(P) (1) (B)
Veto 03-04-08

Override

RESOLUTION NO

RESOLUTION APPROVING A PROJECT AWARD RECOMMENDATION
IN THE AMOUNT  OF $500,000.00 BETWEEN ALL QUALITY
ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FOR THE
PEOPLE’'S TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP) PROJECT ENTITLED
INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGNS INSTALLATION
CONTRACT - COUNTYWIDE (PROJECT — CICC 7040-0/07 RPQ NO.
20070784)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the

accompanying memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board approves the
Project Award Recommendation in the amount of $500,000.00 between All Quality Electrical
Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Project
Entitled Internally llluminated Street Name Sign Installation Contract — Countywide in

substantially the form attached hereto and made a part hereof.



Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1) (B)
Page No. 2
The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner ,
who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner
and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:

Bruno A. Barreiro, Chairman
Barbara J. Jordan, Vice-Chairwoman

Jose "Pepe" Diaz Audrey M. Edmonson
Carlos A. Gimenez Sally A. Heyman

Joe A. Martinez Dennis C. Moss
Dorrin D. Rolle Natacha Seijas

Katy Sorenson Rebeca Sosa

Sen. Javier D. Souto

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this
4" day of March, 2008. This resolution shall become effective as follows: (1) ten (10)
days after the date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall
become effective only upon an override by this Board, and (2) either i) the Citizens'
Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response to the
CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote

of the Commission's membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK

By:
Deputy Clerk

Approved by County Attorney as /
to form and legal sufficiency. é .

Bruce Libhaber




Memorandum &

Date: December 19, 2007

To: Frank Aira, P.E.
Peoplg's Tgansportation Plan (PTP) Coordinator
ks Department

From: Moore
ger, Contracts
ublic Works Department

Subject: Recommendation of Award for:
RPQ No. 20070784 - CICC 7040-0/07
PTP — Internally llluminated Street Name Sign Installation Contract - Countywide
(Contractor — All Quality Electrical Services, Inc.)

The attached PTP contract is being recommended for award. The contractor, All Quality Electrical
Services, Inc., is currently performing work for PWD at an above satisfactory level as reported by the
Project Manager. .-Additionally, the Office of Capital Improvement (OCI) database lists 12 awarded
construction contracts. The referenced database also lists a total of 10 contractor performance
evaluations from PWD, all with satisfactory ratings (3.1). The remaining contracts are still under
construction or in the preliminary stages and do not yet have evaluations on file.

The Project Manager for the aforementioned project will be Mr. Oscar Rubio.

Therefore, please take the necessary action to obtain approval to award the contract, from the Citizens
Independent Transportation Trust.

MM:lc
Attachments

C: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Antonio Cotarelo, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Joaquin Urrechaga, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Oscar Rubio, PWD (w/o attachment)

Rodney McMillian, PWD (w/o attachment)
Lily Garcia, OCI (w/o attachment)

Clerk of the Board

Project File (w/o attachment)

Reading File (w/o attachment)
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T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

December 12, 2007

CERTIFIED MAIL No.

miamidade.gov

7004 1350 0004 5643 8710

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-688-6297, 305-968-7832

Mr. Samuel Lightbourne

All Quality Electrical Services, Inc.
14500 N.W. 16" Court

Miami, Florida 33167

Re: Recommendation for Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No.: 20070784 - CICC 7040-0/07
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP)
Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation - Countywide

Dear Mr. Lightbourne:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been recommended for
award for the above referenced RPQ based on your Price Quotation submitted
on Wednesday, December 5, 2007. The total RPQ amount is five hundred
thousand dollars and zero cents ($500,000.00). This includes a base contract
amount of four hundred thirty-nine thousand seven hundred thirty-two dollars and
Zero cents ($439,732.00), a contingency amount of forty-three thousand nine
hundred seventy-three dollars and zero cents ($43,973.00), and dedicated
allowances totaling sixteen thousand two hundred ninety-five dollars and zero
cents ($16,295.00). The contract duration is established as 100-calendar days.
However, the award is contingent upon the submission of the required items
listed below:

1. Performance and Payment Bond as required in Contract No. CICC 7040-
0/07, Section 2.0 Special Conditions, Page 13, Article 2.13,
PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BOND. (The original attached
documents must be used).

2. Letter from Bonding Agent granting Miami-Dade County authorization to
date the Performance Bond.

3. Copies of current insurance certificates.

4. Copies of required license(s).

The preceding documents are required as outlined within Contract CICC-7040-
0/07 and to be submitted within 10 business days. Failure to submit the
document(s) within the specified time, or any extension granted, will result in the
award being rescinded.

Subsequent to the review and approval of the
are required to obtain the required permits in
Upon obtalnlng the p rmlt(s) ac py() mu
Manager prior to ¢
permit unless the
permit(s).

!
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Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20070784

After receipt of the permits the Project Manager will schedule a Pre-Construction Conference and
issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the performance of the work. This letter will also serve as a
reminder that all work must be performed according to the scope of work and contract’s terms and
conditions, all permits and inspections and in accordance with all applicable Federal, State and
local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit System Sales
Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade County may be used to pay
for all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award of this contract shall be effective and
thereby give rise to a contractual relationship with the County unless and until the following have
occurred: 1) the County Commission awards the contract, and such award becomes final (either by
expiration of 10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by Commission override of a
veto); and 2) either i) the Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has approved same, or
ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds
(2/3) vote of the Commission’s membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Ms. Angelica De Limas, OCI office, at (305) 375-2606 to insure that your file is
complete for award consideration.

Should you have any questions please contact me at (305) 375-2930.

C: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
lan H. Yorty, OCI
Penelope Townsley, DPM
Antonio Cotarelo, P.E., PWD
Garfield Perry, P.E., PWD
Rodney McMillian, PWD
Orky Rodriguez, PWD
Alvaro Castro, PWD
Traci Adams-Parish, SBD
Patrice King, SBD
Veronica Robinson, SBD
Clerk of the Board
Reading File
Project File



Public Works Department

Contracts & Specifications Section AM‘DADE

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
RPQ No: 20070784

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Miami, FL 33128

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the Contract No. CICC- 7040-0/07.
Date Issued: 11/2/2007 Bid Date Due: 12/5/2007 Time Due: 2:00 P.M Submitted Via: Sealed Envelope
Date RPQ Added: 10/30/2007 Contractors Add Request Date: 11/2/2007 Contractors Add Date: 11/2/2007

Project Number: 20070784 Estimated Value: $423,500.00 CSBE Level: CSBE Level 3
(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)

Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation
Project Location: Countywide
Project Manager: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2698 Fax No: 305-375-2931
Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Section Phone: (305) 375-2930  Date:
11/2/2007
Document Pickup:  Location: 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Y/N: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:
Site Meeting: N N :
PreBid Meeting: Y N 11/14/2007 10:30 AM 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Lowest Percentage Factor
Performance/Payment Bond Required: Y  Bid Bond Required: Y _ Insurance Required: Y_
Comm Dist: 0 Davis Bacon: N

Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Y DBD Subcontract Forms Required: N

CSBE Requirements: Y  100% Trade Set-a-side: N

DBD Dates: Received: SOl Date: Compliance: N Memo Date:

Type: Trade: Count: Work%: Create Bid

Primary Electrical Contractor 100

Anticipated Start Date: 4/9/2008 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 100

Liquidated Damages: Y Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments

Funding Type: Federal: N State: N_ PTP: Y_ Other: N QNIP: N OMC: N

GOB: N GOB No:

Awarded To: Award Date: Paid Amt:
All Quality Electrical Services Inc. 12/12/2007 $0.00

Base Amt: $439,732.00 Cont Amt: $43,973.00 Ded Amt: $16,295.00 Award Amt: $500,000.00
Insurance: OCI Approved: N Date Approved: GL Ins Exp Dt: 5/27/2008
Bond Review: OCI Approved: N Date Approved: AL Ins Exp Dt: 4/19/2008

Risk Management: Approved: N Date Approved: WC Ins Exp Dt: 8/3/2008

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

The scope of work shall consist of, but is not limit to, the installation of Internally llluminated Street Name Signs
(IISNS) at various intersections in Miami-Dade County; the Contractor shall provide supervision, labor, materials,
tools, and equipments required to provide sign installation as well as the removal of existing overhead signs,
relocation of existing signal heads and tree trimming in conflict with the proposed scope as directed by the Engineer.
The Contractor shall keep the Engineer informed at all times of his work schedule, so that the project can be
inspected during all phases of installation, including wire splicing, installation of conductors and any work involving
the electrical connections at the Controller Cabinet. O’l

Page 1 of 3



Design Drawings Included: N
Project Qualifier: Luis O. Perez

Comments:

EMail:

Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y

Phone No: 305-375-2698 perezlu2@miamidade.qov

RPQ Document available on November 2, 2007 Pick up location: 111 N.W.1st Street, 15th Floor, Contracts and
Specifications Section (Document fee $25.00).

The Public Works Department has made changes with regard to how addendums and requests for information (RFI)
will be sent to document holders. Be advised that all Addendums, RFI's, and the document holders list (bidder’s list)
are now available to view online at the following web address:

http://services.miamidade.gov/DPM/SolicitationList.aspx

Therefore, during the advertisement period, the Department will not be sending these documents via certified mail. All
document holders must provide a dedicated fax number available at all hours. The Department will only be sending
addendums and RFI’s by fax and posting online at the aforementioned link. The bidders list will be updated every
Friday during the advertisement phase of the contract. Please be aware that acknowledgment of receipt of all

addendums and RFI's remain a requirement when submitting bids.

Pre-Bid Conference time and location: 10:30 A.M., Wednesday, November 14, 2007, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 15 Floor,

Front Conference Room.

Bid Opening Time and Location: 2:00 P.M., Wednesday, December 5, 2007, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 17th Floor, Clerk of

the Board Office.

Contractor / Bid Information (Bids added 11/2/2007)

pBD |[B3se Bid |-

Type ||Contractor Name Trade Bid [lok E"rf]oum Award || Type E’;ﬁ’e

|7040 ”A & P ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS, INC. ”Electrical Contractor ”N || ||g-00 ” |m|8/3112008 |
l7o4o ”Abcon Electric ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” ”8-00 ” ”Pri “8/31/2008 J
l7°40 ”Accura Electrical Contractors Inc. ||Electrica| Contractor ”N “ “ﬂ-oo || ”Pri ”8/31/2003 |
l7040 ”AII Quality Electrical Services Inc. ”Electrical Contractor “N lr ”ﬁ39,732.00 “Y ”P ri ”91 30/2009 I
|7040 ”All Tech Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor “N ” ”ﬂ-oo || ”P’i ||8’3112°°8 I
I7O4U[Canseco Electrical Contractors, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” “ﬂ-ﬂo || ”Pri —”8/31/2008 I
|7040 ”clearview Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” ”$0.00 || ”P' i —||8l31’2008 |
|7040 ”Code Plus Systems Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” ”i"-“o '( ”P'i 1’%"2008 |
I7040 ”Dc Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N || ”50-00 ” ”Pri ”9’30’2008 |
|7040 JIFelix Electric, Corp. ”Electrical Contractor HN “ ”so-oo ” ”P'i ”8/31’2008 |
I7O4L|lFoster & Son Electrical Contractors Inc. "Electrical Contractor ”N ” ”50-00 " ”Pri —”9/30/2008 I
|7040 ”Gancedo Technologies, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor “N ” ||$"'39’732'00 ”N ”Pri ”8131’2008 I
I704Q ”Jador International Corporation ”Electrical Contractor “N ” ”ﬂ'oo ” |F”i ”531/2008 I
|7040 ”James P. Moran, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor HN ” ”E.Oo ” JWISTMIZOOB |
l7040 "Juliana Enterprises Inc DBA Power Pro “Electrical Contractor ”N Il ”2‘00 |r “Pri ”EHZOOB |
WO ”Magesco, Inc. ”;ctrical Contractor ”N ” “ﬁss,nz.oo ”N ”Pri ”8’31’2008 |
|7040 "Marvelous Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N “ ||$£.00 " ”P'i ”8,31,2008 |

||;_“813112008 |

“Ruben Electric Technology, Inc.

|704O ”Maynard Electric "Electrical Contractor ”N “ ”$0.00 l[

7040 IR & 0 Etectric, inc. [lEtectricat contractor [N || |[s439,732.00 | |lpri|[8ra172008 |

|_7_0i”Rays Electrical Supplies, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” II$0.00 || 4”;ri ”8/31/2008J
”Electrical Contractor ”N ”

|7040
¥
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i i .
|7040 JISolares Electrical Services, Inc. i Electrical Contractor ”N ” ”50-90 “ “Pn ”3’31/2003 I

,7040 "Well Electric Technology, Inc. I Electrical Contractor ”N ” ||$0-00 II ”Pri ”8’31’2003 |
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BID SUMMARY SHEET
COINTRACT NO. CICC-7040-0/07
RPQ NO.: 20070784
PW D CSS ENG: Luis O. Perez

BID VALIDITY: O 120 [ 180
(Select One)

BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: December 5, 2007

BID OPENING DATE: December 5, 2007

PROJECT NAME: Internally Illuminated Street Name Signs Installation
COST ESTIMATE: $423,500.00

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: CSBE Level I, II & III

ADDENDUM (No. issued): 1

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issued): 0

BIDDERS Apparent
CSBE PROFFERED BID

Firm Low SCHEDULE OF Remarks

Bidder (US MONIES)
Telephone No. Position INTENT (+/)

Accura Electrical Contractors
305-827-3827

All Quality Electric Services, Inc. 10 0 7
305-968-7832 ¢

Gancedo Technologies J ( 249

305-265-1984 Lt

Jador International Corporation )
786-486-2377

Magesco, Inc. / 22
305-758-2268 ] .

Il R & D Electric, Inc. / 325
305-403-7841 [.

Revised 12/5/2007 Page 1 of 1



Public Works Department

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications Section FMIAME QADE

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
RPQ No: 20070784

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 i
Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to:Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid" if not submitting a price
proposal) .

Telephbne-rglé::véb:%;

Name of Person Si
Number of Adde

Signature:

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirem‘ents fo submit current copies of insurance cetrtificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Cettificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Appendix 5A




PROJECT TITLE:People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Intemally llluminated Street Name Sign Installtion

IF THIS P'R"OPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HUNDRED (100) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK®*.

Bid Form

PROJECT NO: 20070784

102-61 EA. BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
580-336 HRS TREE TRIMMING- $35.00
632-7-1B L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) $1.00
690-110 EA. RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or multiple section, span $700.00
| wire or mast arm mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket)
699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING $2,100.00 ! ! <
MOUNTING BRACKET)
700-48-60B EA. REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL $55.00
CONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE FACTOR / ¢ 3 5
L ] ¥

lxider‘s address \‘% 3 LY N L), ‘rf}m =t

R M\Qm‘ £ a0t




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

1141 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
MViiami, FL 33128 e e RPQ No: 20070784

public Works Department
Ccontracts & Specifications Section

K¢

e

RPQ Project Name: Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to- Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price

proposal)
/ 2 2 %ﬂe«)@@/ ~—

Bid der's Company Name: ﬂégﬁ% J;gi//
Company' At dress 7/4& Al - 5 j/%!' Q(,ﬂ,) % L
City: /%/4’7?/ SN ( - E State [Z Zip: 55[58

/ ﬂ 2 g Fax No: éf/ 7{g*%2ﬂ _‘v;"'::"E'Mail'ﬂ ér’%aﬁ ,@pcafw

Telephohé t}lo:; '

Name of Person Subm ‘tmg Quote (Prmt) //ﬂ

Number of Ad

Slgnature

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance cetrtificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Cetrtificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth i

the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

(G\ Appendix 5A



Bid Form

PR OJECT TITLE:People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Internally llluminated Street Name Sign Instalition

|F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HU NDRED (100) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK".

PROJECT NO: 20070784

102-61 EA. BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
580-336 HRS TREE TRIMMING- $35.00
632-7-1B L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) $1.00
690-110 EA. . | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or muitiple section. span $700.00
_ wire or mast arm mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket) ™=
699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING $2.100.00
MOUNTING BRACKET)
700-48-608B EA. REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL $55.00
CONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE FACTOR /I Z Z
[N S LN L L T T T o T =T —— T — v

Tax Identification Number: _J 7. 222 38 2L 3
D.C. Certificate of competency No: f C o 272 /
Bidder's Name: %ﬁé&’éw/ i,
Bidder's telephone Number;\/ff’j’ O 2222
Bidder's address: _Z2/2 ALE. A égé}/’ Pz lidd 2.33/38
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Addendum No.1 Revised RPQ

peablic Works Department

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
ceontracts & Specifications Section lA‘M

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
RPQ No: 20070784

14 1 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Mi#ami, FL 33128

RP Q Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Pri <e Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price

pro-posal) /’ ; L/7

Bidl der's Company Name: @a\/\ C@J@ —-’l/ec/\,\ o | 04 €S ) y1C.
Cor‘npany Address: ?:?L‘} ;’?5 A) w :'( ;Z,)

o Mics t] z.pZB/J; ~

208 _
Telephone No/ 7 j{i?‘f Fax No: (305 GEFAES EMail: kaﬂ/‘ﬁg QJQC‘M Ceaéﬁzl;u

Narme- of Person:Submitting Quote (Print): Q/),JZJ 05 6& V\vceclé

Number of Addendums received: / (if none’ write "None™)

Date: /¢2

Signature:

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance cettificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance

Cetrtificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

’>> ( Appendix 5A
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PR OJECT TITLE:People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Internally llluminated Street Name Sign Instalition

Bid Form

PROJECT NO: 20070784

|F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HU INDRED (100) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK™.

102-61 EA. BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
580-336 HRS TREE TRIMMING- $35.00
632-17-1B L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 canductor) $1.00
690- 110 EA. RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or multiple section, span $700.00
wire or mast arm mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket)
699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING $2,100.00
MOUNTING BRACKET)
700-48-60B EA. REMOVAL GF SIGN PANEL $55.00
CONTRACTOR S PERCENTAGE FACTOR /':' 4 :

bér:

""“phone Number: ?)0 5

Bidder's address: 3425/\) W 75 ;4/&9 e H 0\4(;[,55’5&




B S —

Weciprer s

. pubhc Works Department

Addendum Mo.1 Revised RPQ

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
RPQ No: 20070784

contracts & Specifications Section MQ&ME DA

14 1 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
mMmi#ami, FL 33128

RP Q Project Name: PTP Internally Illuminated Street Name Signs Installation

Pri<e Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the WOrk must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price

10O %%

Bid der's Company Name: ﬂ/&ualdiu réc rLu»i ga.«;w«@; N
Cormpany Address: __ |4 S0D /OLA )(O‘ti\ G\x(‘)’

City: Muawny State: L Zip: 331467
0SS z0S

Telephone No: _ 4687832 Fax No: 5387 X4 EMail:

Name of Person:Submitting Quote (Print):g(f SQ mo.e & & \ g}é bm!m

Number of Addendums received: :L (if none' write "None")

Signature: é:ﬂ“ ;Z Z :; 4{/&_ _ Date: [2-5—— 07

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance cetrtificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Appendix 5A



)

Bid Form

pIROJECT TITLE:People's Transportation Plan (PTP) internally llluminated Street Name Sign Instalition PROJECT NO: 20070784

iF THIS PROPOSAL 1S ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
4 HUJINDRED (100) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK*.

102-61 EA. | BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
? 3
' 58€1-336 HRS TREE TRIMMING- $35.00
i
: 632-7-1B L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) $1.00
' '
‘lg 690-110 EA. | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or multiple section, span | $700.00
wire or mast arm mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket) i
P 699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING $2,100.00
MOUNTING BRACKET)
5
700-48-60B EA. REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL $55.00

Hyrebrn

"mlxpmrv.‘m R s

CONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE FACTOR / DO %

‘B cfder's address: //75 OO 4/&) /(f'-w Cén

wro . ’S‘SIé?




| Status View

] [L_Payments ]

(SearchALL ] [

_Find Contracts With Search String ==> |

RPQ NO
20060168

DPT Type
PW 7360

PW 7360 20060169

PW 7360
PW 7360

20060188
20060189

PW 7360 20060315
PW 7360
PW 7360
PW 7360
PW 7040
PW 7360

20060330
20060336
20060342

PW 7360 20060381
PW 7360
PW 7040
SP 7040

20070671

* Yellow Status=inactive Contract

2 3 Other Emergency

Project
Name

School Flashers

School Flashers

Traffic Signal Replaceme
New Traffic Signal Insta

New Traffic Signal

PTP Traffic Signal Insta
PTP Traffic Signal Insta
PTP TRAFFIC SIGNAL INSTA
PTP TRAFFIC SIGNAL INSTA
New Traffic Signal Insta

Traffic Signal Installat
Traffic Signal Loop Inst

PTP Internally llluminat
Re-wire existing street

i [.,EXit» } | Goto Bottom

CSBE Level: 1

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Capital Improvements Information System
All MCC Projects Awarded to_All Quality Electrical Services Inc. -

FEIN: 542171753

Project
Location
NE 8th Ct. at NE 8500 Blk./

NE 25 Av. at NE 18700 BIk/

Euclid Avenue & 15th Street
SW 134th Avenue & SW 248th

SW 137 Avenue and SW 156 St

SW 102 Ave & SW 64 St.

SW 152nd Ave & SW 18th Stre

W 24TH AVENUE & W. 76 TH STR
NW 84 Avenue and NW 74 Stre
SW 87th Ave & SW 152nd Stre

Le Jeune Rd. & Loquat Ave.
County Wide

Countywide
Port Bascule Bridge, Port o

Work Type
Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf

Electrical Contra
Electrical Contra

Totals:

o\

Page 1 of 1

_ Backto Top

Notice % Comple
Date STATUS
6/29/2006 100% / Wi
Completi
Pending Cl

' Out
6/29/2006 100% / Wi
Complett
Pending Cl

Out
6/22/2006 0% / N/#
6/22/2006 100% / Wi
Complet
Pending Cl

Out
10/13/2006 70% /0
Schedul:
12/14/2006 0% / N//
12/14/2006 0% / N/#
12/14/2006 0% / N/#
12/6/2006 0% / Cance
12/7/2006 90% /0
Schedul
12/7/2006 90% /0
Schedul:
7/12/2007 0% / N/#
11/2/2007 0% / N/t
1/29/2007 100% /
Complet

14



PW 20060342

PW 20060330

PW 20060336
PW 20060315
PW 20060189
PW 20060380
PW 20060381
PW 20060168
PW 20060169

PW 20060188

7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.
7360 All Quality Electrical

Services Inc.

9/7/2007 Antonio
Edmead

9/7/2007 Antonio
Edmead

9/7/2007 Antonio
Edmead

9/7/2007 Antonio
Edmead

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

9/7/2007 Felix
Hernandez

Interim
Interim
Interim
Interim

Compiletion of
construction

Interim
Interim

Completion of
construction

Completion of
construction

Project conclusion or
closeout

10 All Quality Electrical Services Inc. Evaluations Average: 3.1
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