MIAMIDADE

Memorandum

Date: May 6, 2008
To: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(E)
and Members, Board of County Commissioners

From: George M. Burgess
County Manager

Subject: Contract Award *Recommendation the Amount of $409,139.01 Between
Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the
People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Project Entitled Internally llluminated Street
Name Signs Installation Contract - Countywide (Project — CICC 7360-0/08
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20070820)

Recommendation

The attached Contact Award Recommendation for an Internally llluminated Street Name Signs
Installation Contract - Countywide (Project — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ No. 20070820), in the amount
of $409,139.01, between Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade
County has been prepared by the Public Works Department (PWD) and is recommended for
approval. Proceeds from the Charter County Transit System Sales Surtax (the Surtax) will be
used to fund this project, therefore, approval by the Board of County Commissioners (BCC) and
Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) is required.

Scope
The work to be performed under this contract includes internally illuminated street name sign

installation at various locations within Miami-Dade County. Three (3) intersections have been
identified for this contract and are listed as follows: NW 5 Avenue and NW 29 Street; NW 5
Avenue and NW 103 Street and NW 5 Avenue and NW 119 Street, located within Commission
District 3. Additional sites may be added during the course of the contract.

Fiscal Impact/Funding Source

The fiscal impact will be $409,139.01 and will be funded from the Surtax. The proposed
improvements qualify under the allowable work categories included in the PTP Neighborhood
Improvements Section. Specific funding for this project will be allocated from the respective
Commission District PTP yearly allocations. The base contract amount is $358,606.25, but the
total allocated amount is $409,139.01, which is inclusive of the contingency and dedicated
allowances.

Delegation of Authority
No additional authority is being requested within the body of this contract.

Track Record/Monitor

The contractor, Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc., is currently performing work for
the PWD at a satisfactory level as reported by the Project Manager. Additionally, the Office of
Capital Improvement (OCI) database list one (1) awarded construction contract. However, since
the contractor is new to Miami-Dade County, there are no listed contractor performance
evaluations on file, since the contracts are still under construction or in the preliminary stages. In
addition, the Department of Small Business Development’s (SBD) History of Violation’s report lists
no violation for this contractor.

Following PWD’s standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-construction
meeting will be scheduled. l
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Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff person in PWD will be the PTP Coordinator, Mr.
Frank Aira, P.E. Following completion of the award process, the project will be assigned to Mr.
Oscar Rubio, P.E., Project Manager, for day to day responsibilities.

According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, Republic Intelligent
Transportation Services, Inc., Company Principals are: Wade L. White, Dennis L. Walther and
Jeffrey L. Asch and the Company’s address is listed as: 371 Bel Marin Keys Blvd., Suite 200,
Novato, California 94949.

Background
In an effort to accelerate the continued success of the PTP Neighborhood Improvements initiative,

PWD is taking advantage of various contracting mechanisms such as the subject Miscellaneous
Construction Contracting (MCC) process available under OCI contract CICC 7360-0/08. Through
this process, PWD forwards the RPQ, by way of facsimile transmission and US-mail, to a pool of
firms that have registered with OCI for the subject trade. Additionally, PWD advertises the project
in the Daily Business Review as well as providing courtesy notifications in the Diario De Las
Americas, Miami Herald, Miami Times, Haiti en Marche, Le Floridien, and Kiskeya Herald. The
project award evaluation is based upon the lowest sum bid submitted by the responsive,
responsible bidder for the project.

This project was previously advertised under RPQ No. 20070782 CICC 7040-0/07; however, the
bids exceeded the Department’s estimate and the lowest responsive, responsible bidder would
not agree to negotiate their prices. Therefore, the Department rejected all bids and subsequently
re-advertised the project on January 8, 2008 under a new number (20070820) and forwarded it to
a list of 41 pre-registered firms from the OCI database as noted above. During this advertisement,
none of the contract documents were sold by the time the Department held the pre-bid meeting;
revealing that there was insufficient contractor availability under the CICC 7040 set-aside
program. On January 22, 2008 PWD contacted the SBD and OCI and obtained their concurrence
in changing the project to the CICC 7360 process to allow for increased participation. Through the
CICC 7360 process, seven (7) firms subsequently purchased contract documents and four (4)
firms proffered a bid. As a result, on March 4, 2008, PWD issued a recommendation of award for
RPQ 20070820 to Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc., with the stipulation that
approval of this project must be obtained from the BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated
with the funding source.

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all
supervision, labor, required materials, tools and equipments required to provide the installation of
internally illuminated street name signs at various intersections in Miami-Dade County. The work
includes the removal of existing overhead signs, relocation of existing signal heads and tree
trimming in conflict with the proposed scope of work as directed by the Engineer. The Contractor
shall keep the Engineer informed at all times of his work schedule, in order for the project to be
inspected during all phases of installation, including wire splicing, installation of conductors and
any work involving the electrical connections at the controller cabinet.

e

Assistant County Manager 9




MEMORANDUM

(Revised)

TO: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro DATE: May 6, 2008
and Members, Board of County Commissioners

¢,

FROM: R.A.Cdevas, It} SUBJECT: Agenda [tem No. 8(P) (1) (E)
County Attorney

Please note any items checked.

“4-Day Rule” (“3-Day Rule” for committees) applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required

Statement of fiscal impact required

Bid waiver requiring County Manager’s written recommendation

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing

Housekeeping item (no policy decision required)

No committee review



Approved Mayor Agenda ltem No. 8(P) (1) (E)
Veto 5-6-08
Override

RESOLUTION NO

RESOLUTION APPROVING A CONTRACT AWARD RECOMMENDATION
IN THE AMOUNT OF $409,139.01 BETWEEN REPUBLIC INTELLIGENT
TRANSPORTATION SERVICES, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FOR
THE PEOPLE’'S TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP) PROJECT ENTITLED
INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGNS INSTALLATION
CONTRACT - COUNTYWIDE (PROJECT — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ NO.
20070820)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the

accompanying memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board approves the
Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $409,139.01 between Republic Intelligent
Transportation Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People’s Transportation Plan
(PTP) Project Entitled Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation Contract -~

Countywide in substantially the form attached hereto and made a part hereof.
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The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner ,
who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner

and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:

Bruno A. Barreiro, Chairman
Barbara J. Jordan, Vice-Chairwoman

Jose "Pepe" Diaz Audrey M. Edmonson
Carlos A. Gimenez Sally A. Heyman

Joe A. Martinez Dennis C. Moss
Dorrin D. Rolle Natacha Seijas

Katy Sorenson Rebeca Sosa

Sen. Javier D. Souto

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and
adopted this 6™ day of May, 2008. This resolution shall become effective as
follows: (1) ten (10) days after the date of its adoption unless vetoed by the
Mayor, and if vetoed, shall become effective only upon an override by this Board,
and (2) either i) the Citizens' Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has
approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County
Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Cornmission's

membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS

HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK

Approved by County Attorney as = __- By:
to form and legal sufficiency._#&="_« Deputy Clerk

Bruce Libhaber

©



MIAMI

Memorandum

Date: March 21, 2008
To: Frank Aira, P.E.
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Coordinator

Public W\

From:
ager, Contracts
ublic Works Department
Subject: Recommendation of Award for:

RPQ No. 20070820 - CICC 7360-0/08
PTP — Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation Contract - Countywide
(Contractor — Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc.)

The attached PTP contract is being recommended for award. The contractor, Republic Intelligent
Transportation Services, Inc. is currently performing work for PWD at a satisfactory level as reported by
the Project Manager. Additionally, the Office of Capital Improvement (OCI) database lists one (1)
awarded construction contract; however, since the contractor is new, there are no listed contractor
performance evaluations on file. In addition, the Department of Small Business Development’s (SBD)
History of Violation’s report lists no violations for this contractor.

The Project Manager for the aforementioned project will be Mr. Oscar Rubio.

Therefore, please take the necessary action to obtain approval to award the contract, from the Citizens
Independent Transportation Trust.

MM:lc
Attachments

C: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Antonio Cotarelo, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Bassam Moubayed, PWD (w/o attachment)
Clerk of the Board
Project File (w/o attachment)

Reading File (w/o attachment)



Public Works
111 NW T1st Street * Suite 1510

MI.,AMI-DADE Miami, Florida 33128-1970

T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

miamidade.gov
Carlos Alvarez, Mayor 8

March 4, 2008

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7006 0810 0005 3817 9812

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
415-884-4800; 415-884-3000

Mr. Jeffrey L. Asch

Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc.
371 Bel Marin Keys Bivd., Suite 200

Novato, California 94949

Re: Recommendation for Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No.: 20070820 - CICC 7360-0/08
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP)
Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation Contract - Countywide

Dear Mr. Asch:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been recommended for award for the
above referenced RPQ based on your Price Quotation submitted on Wednesday, February 27,
2008. The total RPQ amount is four hundred nine thousand one hundred thirty-nine dollars and
one cents ($409,139.01). This includes a base contract amount of three hundred fifty-eight
thousand six hundred six dollars and twenty-five cents ($358,606.25), a contingency amount of
thirty-five thousand eight hundred sixty dollars and sixty-three cents ($35,860.63), and
dedicated allowances totaling fourteen thousand six hundred seventy-two dollars and thirteen
cents ($14,672.13). The contract duration is established as 100-calendar days. However, the
award is contingent upon the submission of the required items listed below:

1. Performance and Payment Bond as required in Contract No. CICC 7360-0/08,
Section 2.0 Special Conditions, Page 16, Article 2.11, PERFORMANCE AND
PAYMENT BOND. (The original attached documents must be used).

2. Letter from Bonding Agent granting Miami-Dade County authorization to date the
Performance Bond.

3. Copies of current insurance certificates.

4. Copies of required license(s).

The preceding documents are required as outlined within Contract CICC-7360
submitted within 10 business days. Failure to submit the document(s) W|t', ,n!‘t 3
or any extension granted, will result in the award being rescinded.

to be performed without a permit unless
proceed without permit(s).
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Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20070820

After receipt of the permits the Project Manager will schedule a Pre-Construction Conference
and issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the performance of the work. This letter will also
serve as a reminder that all work must be performed according to the scope of work and
contract's terms and conditions, all permits and inspections and in accordance with all
applicable Federal, State and local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit System Sales
Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade County may be used to pay for
all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award of this contract shall be effective and thereby
give rise to a contractual relationship with the County unless and until the following have occurred: 1)
the County Commission awards the contract, and such award becomes final (either by expiration of
10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by Commission override of a veto); and 2)
either i) the Citizens’ Independent Transportationi Trust (CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response
to the CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-affirms its award by two-thlrds (2/3) vote of the
Commission's membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Ms. Lillian Garcia, OCI office, at (305) 375-2606 to insure that your file is
complete for award consideration.

Should you have any questions‘please contact me at (305) 375-2930.

C: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
Art Tillberg, OCI
Penelope Townsley, DPM
Antonio Cotarelo, P.E., PWD
Joaquin Urrechaga, P.E., PWD
Orky Rodriguez, PWD
Alvaro Castro, PWD
Patrice King, SBD
Clerk of the Board
Reading File
Project File



Public Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Miami, FL 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20070820

MIAMH

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the Contract No. CICC-7360-0/08.

Date Issued: 1/8/2008 Bid Date Due: 2/13/2008 Time Due: 2:00 P.M. Submitted Via: Sealed Envelope

Date RPQ Added: 12/10/2007 Contractors Add Request Date: 1/8/2008 Contractors Add Date: 2/8/2008

Project Number: 20070820 (Formerly Estimated Value: $423,500.00

20070782)

(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)

Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Project Location:  Countywide

Project Manager: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2698 Fax No: 305-375-2931

Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Section Phone: (305) 375-2930  Date:

1/8/2008
Document Pickup: Location: 111 N'W 1st Street, Suite 1510
YIN: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:

Site Meeting: N N

PreBid Meeting: Y N 1/22/2008 10:00 A.M. 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510

Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Lowest Responsible Bidder

Performance/Payment Bond Required: Y_ ‘Bid Bond Required: Y Insurance Required: Y_

Comm Dist: 30 Davis Bacon: N

Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Y DBD Subcontract Forms Required: N

CSBE Requirements: N_ 0% Trade Set-a-side: N

DBD Dates: Received: SOl Date: Compliance: N. Memo Date:

Type: Trade: Count: Work%: Create Bid

Primary Electrical Contractor 42

Anticipated Start Date: 6/1/2008 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 100

Liquidated Damages: Y. Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments

Funding Type: Federal: N State: N_ PTP: Y Other: N QNIP: N OMC: N

GOB: N GOB No:

Awarded To: Award Date: Paid Amt:

Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, Inc. 2/29/2008 $0.00

Base Amt: $358,606.25 Cont Amt: $35,860.63 Ded Amt: $14,672.13 Award Amt:  $409,139.01
_ Insurance: OCI Approved: N_ Date Approved: GL Ins Exp Dt: 10/1/2008

Bond Review: OCI Approved: N Date Approved: AL Ins Exp Dt: 10/1/2008

Risk Management: Approved: N Date Approved: WC Ins Exp Dt: 10/1/2008

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

The scope of work shall consist of, but is not limit to, the installation of Internally llluminated Street Name Signs (IISNS) at various
intersections in Miami-Dade County; the Contractor shall provide supervision, labor, materials, tools, and equipments required to
provide sign installation as well as the removal of existing overhead signs, relocation of existing signal heads and tree trimming in
conflict with the proposed scope as directed by the Engineer. The Contractor shall keep the Engineer informed at all times of his
work schedule, so that the project can be inspected during all phases of installation, including wire splicing, installation of
conductors and any work involving the electrical connections at the Controller Cabinet.

Design Drawings Included: N Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y_
Project Qualifier: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2698 EMail: perezlu2@miamidade.gov
Comments: C1
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Miami-Dade County Contractor's Certificate of Competency is required in one of the following: Electrical Contractor as applicable

to Chapter 10 of the Code of Miami-Dade County.

RPQ Document available on January 8, 2008 Pick up location: 111 N.W.1st Street, 15th Floor, Contracts and Specifications

Section (Document fee $25.00).

The Public Works Department has made changes with regard to how addendums and requests for information (RF!) will be sent to
document holders. Be advised that all Addendums, RFI’s, and the document holders list (bidder’s list) are now available to view

online at the following web address:

http://services.miamidade.gov/DPM/SolicitationList.aspx

Therefore, during the advertisement period, the Department will not be sending these documents via certified mail. All document
holders must provide a dedicated fax number available at all hours. The Department will only be sending addendums and RFI's by
fax and posting online at the aforementioned link. The bidders list will be updated every Friday during the advertisement phase of
the contract. Please be aware that acknowledgment of receipt of all addendums and RFI's remain a requirement when submitting

bids.

Pre-Bid Conference time and location: 10:00 A.M., Tuesday, January 22, 2008, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 15 Floor, Front Conference

Room.

Bid Opening Time and Location: 2:00 P.M., Wednesday, February 13, 2008, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 17th Floor, Clerk of the Board

Office.
Contractor / Bid Information (Bids added 2/8/2008)

Type |(|Contractor Name Trade Bid ||OK Bid Amount ||Award ||Type |Date
17360 |lA & PELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS, INC. |[Etectrical Contractor  |IN || |'so.00 It llowJlarstrz008]
|7360 ||Abcqn Electric ||Electrical Contractor HN H H$0.00 || ”Pri H813112008 |
|7360 ‘P\Gp Electric Inc. ||Electrica| Contractor ||Y || ||$418,149.50 HN ”Pri ||BI3112008 |
[7360 ||A|pert Electrical of South Florida Corp. ||Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$o.oo || |;i ||813112008—|
(7360 ||t Quaity Electrical Services Inc. | Etectrical Contractor [N || [s0.00 | lPri | 9r30rz009 |
|7360 ”AJJ Tech Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$o.oo || Hpri ||8I3112008 |
|7360 HBe‘nneﬁ Electric Service Company, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ||N || Hso.oo || ”Pri ||8/3112008 |
|7360 ”Cjuseeo Electrical Contractors, Inc. ||Electrica| Contractor ||N || ||$0-00 || HPri ||813112008 |
|735° ”9!earvit=.w Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor HN ” ”$0.00 || ”Pri ||3’31’2°°8 |
|7360 |9c Electric, Inc. ||Electrical Contractor | || |1s0.00 || ”Pri ||9l3012008 |
|7360 |§oster‘& Son Electrical Contractors Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$0-00 || HPri ||913012008 |
[1380 |Gancedo Technologies, Inc. | Erectrical contractor [N || |ls0.00 | |[pri|[sratr2008 |
(7360 ||Hgrsepower Etectric, Inc. |lEtectricat contractor  |[Y || |ls420,20000 [N |l |less1r2008 |
|7360 HJ;dor Intérnational Corporation ”Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$o.oo H ”Pri H813112008 |
(7380 | sgmes P. Moran, Inc. |[Erectricat contractor [N || |ls0.00 | Jlen |srs12008]|
|7360 ”ngana Enterprises Inc DBA Power Pro ”Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$0-00 || HPri ||813112008 |
17360 | i1¢an Power Etectric Inc |Etectricat contractor N || |[s0.00 I |lpri|js1sorz009 |
|7360 ||Mage§co, inc. ”Electrical Contractor ||N ” ||$0.00 || ||Pri ”8/31/2003 |
[7360 |Iarvelous Etectric, Inc. | Etectricat Contractor [N || |Is0.00 | |pri|8ra1r2008 |
17360 |\maynard Etectric |lEtectrical contractor [N || |ls0.00 | |l |rsrrz008|
17380 | {muti Etectric Corp |lEtectricat contractor [N || |[s0.00 | |lpri |j8r31/2008 |
|7360 .‘HMURRAY ELECTRIC OF MIAMI, INC. ”Electrical Contractor ||N || ||$o.oo || ||Pri ||813112008 |
|7360 |,|,0ut|ook International Inc. ||E|ectrica| Contractor ||N || ||$0-00 || ”Pri ||813112008 |
|7369 ”Pgtriot Electric Inc. ”Electrical Contractor ”N ” ||$0.00 || ||Pri ”8/31/2008 |
|7360 .\v|‘ﬁ>oole and Kent Company of Florida ”Electrical Contractor ||N |r ||$0-00 ” ||Pri ”3/31/2008 |
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|£f°_“Prime~Electrical Contractors, Inc. Hﬂectrical Contractor HN ” Hﬂo ‘ \Prl_‘ 9/30/2009
E‘;‘Z“R & D Electric, Inc. ”ﬂsctrical Contractor ”N H “mo , ‘Pn_} 8/31/2008 ,
@ZHR&\NM Electric Inc Hﬂactrical Contractor HN ”7 HWJO H:__‘ I:‘M
@“Rays EIeEt‘ricaI Supplies, Inc. Hﬂactrical Contractc-)r ‘ ”N ” ”@0 ‘ ’—| 8/31/2008
Republic Intelligent Transportation Services, ‘ '
IE Inc. hectrical Contractor Y $358,606.25 Pri  |[8/31/2008
7360 lRuben Electric\?échnology, Inc. ”Eectrical Contractor HN ” “ﬂo H HPri Hﬂ31/2003 |
|73—6—0_HS.E.R.L.L. Electic, Inc. HEIectrical Contractor “N w Hﬂo ‘ ’Pl‘l—l 9/30/2008
Igﬁ-o_f(s_h;k Free Electric Inc l[ilectrical Contractor ’F‘ “ HWJO H:l
[Eéo_HSolares Electric.él Services, Inc. Hilectrical Contractor HN H7 Hﬂo ||:||£|
7360 ”Sure Electrical éontractors Inc. ||5kactrical Contractor HN |r Hﬂo | ’Prl—| 9/30/2009
7360 lSNYcSTEMS INTEGRATION & MAINTENANCE, b ctrieal Contrdctor . $0.00 413112008
’—7;50 ||Trans Tech E!’ec.jtric LP ||5hctrica| Contfactbr ”N || HJO ‘ ’—_7‘ 8/31/2008
W“Under Powerf?gorp |@ctricaj Contractor ”Y H [$365,555.00 HL—_l-M
7360 '|-!:inoq 1E‘Igct;ig}a‘,l-Contfagtor, Ine. Electrical Contractor N l '$0 00 ‘L il L’30/2009 I
7360 ‘ Well Electric Tefchnology, Inc. Electrical Contractor N | $0.00 |L |ﬂ31‘12°08 ‘
[7380_|{west kendan Electric, inc. lEtectricat contractor N[ [lso.00 \Ljipn [pratr2008 |

il
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CO NTRACT NO. CICC-7360-0/08

RPQNO.: 20070820

PWD CSS ENG: Luis Perez
BID VALIDITY: [0 120 [0 180

{Select One)

BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: February 27, 2008

BID OPENING DATE: February 27, 2008

PROJECT NAME: People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Internally Illuminated Street Name Signs

Installation

COST ESTIMATE: $423,500.00

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: Not Applicable

ADDENDUM (No. issued): 1

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issued): 0

BIDDERS

Firmm
Telephone No.

Apparent
Low Bidder
Position

CSBE SCHEDULE OF
INTENT (+/}

PROFFERED BID
(US MONIES)

Remarks

AGC Electric, Inc.
305-823-2280

S50
418 1497, ]

—

305-819-4060

Horsepower Electric, Inc.

420,240 |

786-486-2377

Jador International Corp.

R & D Electric, Inc.
305-403-7841

Republic ITS
415-884-3000

358,60 |

Trans Tech Electric, L.P.
954-275-8657

Under Power Corp.
305-468-9900

365, 555. a;”_L,

Revised 2/27/2008

Page 1 of 1
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. MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

A & Specificati Secti :
tontrac *fs Sttt 1 e / REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
fi1 N.WFL a2 Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08

Miam, RPQNo: 20070820

s

yublic v™orks Department

RPQ P roject Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installationy

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price
' propOSEﬂ)

g4 w18, 149,50

Bidde r's Company Name: /H-(, E\!Z\V\L q ’D\ <

Comp any Address: W60 \,J: A} ST
Hinealn state: L Zip: _%_7)_0_%

City:

Telgfohgneqlzl?c:':’) 1LXO Fax No: 30§ $23 4615 EMail: e¢4¢c © %Q\e&v«c. cowma

(‘N
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): \10 WG \} d C,“‘”\’da

d: | (if none' write "None")

Number of Addendums recei
Signature: jM Date: ng{ag
(. Z |

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be

- notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies-of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review.
By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-

0/08 contract.

[



Bid Form

FROJECT TITLE People’s Transponation Plan (PTP) Internatly lliuminated Street Name Sign Installtion - PRQJECT NO: 20070820

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HUNDRED {1007 CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE "NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK™.

102-61 6.0000 EA. |BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) 140 .,00| \\+0. 00
580-336 100000 HRS [ TREE TRIMMING- 2%.00 | 1§0.00
632-7-18 58550000 LF. | TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - {4-7 condustor) 6.S0 (3805359
690-110 28.0000 EA. | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single o

multiple  section, span wire or mast arm S\w~ 00 ‘S \2{)‘0‘3

mountedj(Provide new ASTRO bracket}

599-1-1A 168.0000 AS. | INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIG 100,00 ‘I,SZ W. ©
(LED), (INCLUDING MOUNTING BRACKET)

700-48-608 2560000 EA. | REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL ‘.00 \0‘}9..’ ~

SUB-TOTAL §_ LH%_. ,} \\-\-c\ : SO

The bidder understands and agrees that the above grand fotal is inclusive of all work necessary to complete the job
" as described in the plans and specifications.

Quantilies are established and are included only for the purpose of facilitating the uniform comparison of bids
! submitted. The -County shall not be held responsible if the quantities are not accurate and all computations for
b compensation shall be based upon the actual work performed, whether greater or less than estimated gquantities.

Tax Identification Number _ $50%061¢>

A

D.C. Cettificate of competency’Na: EC 0000Y6 h
Bidder's Name: AiC EleXne Tw<
Bidder's telephone Number: 30( C‘ 7/79 L’L X o

Bidder's address: oy M %l“ H(a\“k\" JFC . ;;OIG

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS
01/08/2008 02:04 PM 1 4



Bid Form




P ublic Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section
411 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
miiami, FL 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20070820

RRPQ Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

P rice Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price

proposal)
170,24

Bidder's Company Name: l\@(_ﬁz&‘M&Z E!g[_—rQ\('i (not

C ompany Address: Bles west 2o Ale

City: ‘-[tkLEb\/\ State: L. Zip: BBD\‘L
Telephone No: Fax No: 2658 &)q4z222 EMail: ™| Me@/\o\@mwe(e lecHric
REINGIETGe) ' ' i (v

iote (Print): AUW\bt(ltG D\F\Y\'L.

N ame of Person Submitting

(if none’ write "None")

Signaturg: - Date: 2-2.1-0%

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies-of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review.
By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-
0/08 contract.

20



[ Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE:People’s Transporiation Plan (PTP) internatly liluminated Street Name Sign installtion PROJECT NO: 20070820

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HUNDRED (100} CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK®,

3 0 7] . .
7 102-61 6000d EA. | BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) 750 | 500
i &
580-336 10000&&&?5 TREE TRIMMING- /0 /"00
[ 1 632-7-1B 58550000 LF. |TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) 8 % %
L B ] # Fd
3 690-110 28.0000 EA. | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - {Single oJ Fovs hondréd ;
multiple  section. span wire or mast ar f ,47/ 7.50 I? MO
- . mountedj(Provide new ASTRO brgcket} { 4
} 62g-1-1A 168.0000 AS. | INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN ’1;7 gana,d _‘2 100 3 Z
- : - 2) il
N (LED), (INCLUDING MOUNTING BRACKET) né hyuds 7 SJ
n «Ly -
700-48-608 266.0000. EA. | REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL _ oo Fivt . 25 é 1/00
¥ jl 0
20,74
SUB-TOTAL § hlV
— = f

. The bidder understands and agrees that the above grand total is inclusive of all work necessary ta complete the job
' as described in the plans and specifications.

. Quantities are established and are included only for the purpose of facilitating the uniform comparison of bids
submitted. The County shall not be held responsibie if the guantities are not accurate and all computations far
- compensation shall be based upon the actual work performed, whether greater or less than estimated quantities.

L ’ Tax ldentification Number: 50‘ Z&ZZZ '

D.C. Certificate of competency No: _, | 1077} /EQOOO ns>

gj ' Bidder's Name: O@E 'P@NE{ ELK—TQ.(C \pnid

ki Bidder's telephone Number: &fﬁ [Cl wao

Bidder's address: 53!05 \N*fZD LVE_HIM gét‘\ ﬁ, 35(2]4

CSCCRP_PRGJECT_BID_ITEMS
04/08/2008 02:04 PM
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o o

p usblic Works Department
Cont'racts & Specifications Section
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Miami, FL 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

- REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20070820

BiAM

RPQ Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price
T proposal)

35%,606.325

L’ Bidder's Company Name: RQDUbllC l"lﬁ‘:@(l(ﬁ@ﬂ'f FMQQOW]‘WZMY\ S&W(ls /

7 Company Address: 3H Bé/ Mﬂﬁﬁj@é 5/{/5/ #;}00
E“ City: /\/0 va 7L0 State: _@_ Zip: Qélﬁ#é,‘

. Téegdegip?goge; !NOE: 0 Fax No: (4”'5)884 4800 EMail: J‘WMW&VQ r@PUbll'cl‘fs. Cam
: U '

- Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): f:mmé A W@Qﬂ”

Number of Addendums received: | (if none' write "None")

s-gnat% A M\éﬁwfz Date: 2-|2le8
\P E@m&rzrg

ostvetotns

Yoot sy

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time

E due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall

s result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the

Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Cettificates to CICC for Review.

By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-

0/08 contract.

o

4

e

s
A

i

[
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Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE:People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Intemally lliuminated Street Name Sign Installtion PROJECT NO: 20070820

b IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
7 HUNDRED (100} CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE "NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK".

a1
{ - 102-61 6.000d
‘ii &
580-336 100004 HRS | TREE TRIMMING-
2 e i -~ <
i 632-7-18 5.855.0000 LF. | TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor} W . N, G5, A
. 690-110 28000 EA. | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single o

multiple  section. span  wire or mast arm W/ > 32"50 Q/QO.vq

. mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket) ) ! 4
’ ¢ 3 o

§99-1-1A 168.0000 AS. | INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN W AN Gas oo 5,”, P4
| : {LED), (INCLUDING MOUNTING BRACKET) wmJe LAt /
700-48-608 266,000 EA. | REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL M[l;éq, /(/‘“{/ R2.9° ¢ Ho2-27
Fe
!
i SUB-TOTALS 35, éoé 25~
. The bidder understands and agrees that the above grand fotal is inclusive of all work necessary to complete the job
f as described in the plans and specifications.
B Quantities are established and are incjuded only for the purpose of facilitating the uniform compatison of bids
submitted. The County shall not be held responsible if the quantities are not accurate and all computations for
compensation shall be based upon the actual work performed, whether greater or less than estimated quantities.

13 Tax Identification Number: (087 0274w Zq' o l/d /
L& wn 7%’11
D.C. Cettificate of competency No: et afached Lontracter s t'cu’:e and Wﬁa/f? §/‘fﬂ.f)

Bidder's Name: i IntAls, ran &WCZS, /nc.
Bidder's telephone Number: (4/578W QDO

Bidder's address:.

#2000

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_JTEMS

01/08/2008 02:04 PM , Q Ll
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P ublic Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Miami, FL. 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20070820

RPQ Project Name: PTP Internally llluminated Street Name Signs Installation

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price
proposal)

<$ 3(S,5%S .00

Bidder's Company Name: U PDETL ?Owﬂ @3\"«2
Company Address: 1502 Mid 6o 57
City: DOV oot | State: o zip: 33/66

Telephone No: Fax No: 2ov =L L8B-IIT7  EMail: o Tvitss Dorda Lo 3 ong. cor

Number of Addengdyms received: 1 (if none’ write "None")

Zav— N L8-990s

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): A\KL‘D‘“WT,Mg

Signature: ~ Date: z,{‘u@ lo@

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be

_notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Cettificates to CICC for Review.
By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-
0/08 contract.

28



PROJECT TITLE: People's Transporation Plan (PTP) Intemally Hliuminated Street Name Sign Installtion

Bid Form

PROJECT NO: 20070820

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE
HUNDRED (100j CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK".

102-61 80000 EA. | BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) T P N 2%-a | /156, oo
-~ = 4
580-336 10.000d HRS | TREE TRIMMING- € ;z\,vm-s 5, 5] (3% =
5 P
832-7-1B 58550004 L.F. [ TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - {4-7 conductor) Do X 9. ow SL.65¢-
b 1% A FXUE)
690-110 28.00000 EA. | RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single of Ay . S,
multiple  section. span wire or mast arm| PR Eedt 2 ‘ii'
mounted)(Provide new ASTROC bracket) - il
, Qg TRDe D .
599-1-1A 168.000 . AS. | INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIG b HASHITNLD UL ad PYT TN
(LED}, (INCLUDING MOUNTING BRACKET) e e !
T SN
’]V-‘&if\‘ Sy g ‘% o
700-48-508 256.0000 EA. | REMOVAL OF SIGN PANEL P HIDINR LChS ' .
. PR
. D
SUBTOTALS___ @S ©%5

The bidder understands and agrees that the above grand total is inclusive of all work necessary to complete the job
as described in the plans and specifications.
Quantities are established and are included only for the purpose of facilitating the uniform comparison of bids
submitted. The County shall not be held responsible if the quantities are not accurate and ail computations for
compensation shall be based upon the actual work performed, whether greater or less than estimated quantities.

D.C. Certificate of competency No:

Tax Identification Number:

Bidder's telephone Number:

G - optsiIs

EC i Iou2o

Bidder's Name: O < PD&&/ Con R

3Bo% - L LE- A/

Bidder's address: IS0 pd v

Lo «T .‘V‘ﬁPf‘("”\;\i:\,v - A

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_|TEMS

01/08/2008 02:04 PM

2



E-Filing Se

Previous on List Next on List Return To List

Events Name History

Detail by Entity Néme

Foreign Profit Corporation

REPUBLIC INTELLIGENT TRANSPORTATION SERVICES, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number F06000004159

FE1 Number 680276727

Date Filed 06/15/2006

State CA

Status ACTIVE

Last Event CANCEL ADM DISS/REV

Event Date Filed 09/21/2007
Event Effective Date NONE
Principal Address

371 BEL MARIN KEYS BLVD., STE. 200
NOVATO CA 94949

Mailing Address

371 BEL MARIN KEYS BLVD., STE. 200
NOVATO CA 94949

Registered Agent Name & Address

BUSINESS FILINGS INCORPORATED

1203 GOVERNORS SQUARE BLVD., STE. 101

TALLAHASSEE FL 32301-2960 US

Officer/Director Detail
Name & Address
Title CP

WHITE, WADE L.
371 BEL MARIN KEYS BLVD., STE. 200
NOVATO CA 94949

Title DV

WALTHER, DENNIS L.
371 BEL MARIN KEYS BLVD., STE. 200
NOVATO CA 94949

Title DST

L1

Page 1 of 2




ASCH, JEFFREY L.
371 BEL MARIN KEYS BLVD., STE. 200
NOWVATO CA 94949

Annual Reports

Report Year Filed Date
2007 09/21/2007
2008 02/13/2008

Document Images

02/13/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT |
09/21/2007 ~ REINSTATEMENT ..
06/22/2007 -- Name Change
06/15/2006 -- Foreign Profit

Note: This is not official record. See documents if question or conflict.

Previous on List Next on List RetunTolist o

Events Name History

Home Contact us Document Searches E-Filing Services Forms Help
Copyright and Privacy Policies
Copyright € 2007 State of Florida, Department of State.

UAS

Page 2 of 2
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