Memorandum @

Date: April 7, 2009
To: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(D)
and Members, Board of County Commissioners

From: George M. Burgess.
County Manager

T,
P

Subject: Contract Award*Recommendationfin the Amount of $1,000,000.00 Between AGC
Electric, Inc. and Miami-Dade Cdunty for the People's Transportation Plan (PTP)
Project Entitled Advanced Traffic Management System (ATMS) Field Equipment
Installation Contact (Project — CICC 7360-0/08 Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No. 20080227)

Recommendation

The attached Contract Award Recommendation for the Advanced Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Field Equipment Installation Contract (Project — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ No. 20080227), in the amount of
$1,000,000.00 between AGC Electric, Inc. and Miami-Dade County has been prepared by the Public
Works Department (PWD) and is recommended for approval. Proceeds from the Charter County
Transit System Sales Surtax (the Surtax) will be used to fund this project, therefore, approval by the
Board of County Commissioners (BCC) and Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) is
required.

Scope
The work to be performed under the life of this contract includes ATMS field equipment installations at

various locations within Miami-Dade County.

Fiscal Impact/Funding Source

The fiscal impact will be approximately $1,000,000.00 and will be funded from the Surtax. The
proposed improvements are listed in Exhibit 1 of PTP Ordinance under Major Highway and Road
Improvements; Upgrades to the County’s Traffic Signalization System. The base contract amount is
$878,142.86, but the total allocated amount is $1,000,000.00, which is inclusive of the contingency and
dedicated allowances.

Delegation of Authority
No additional authority is being requested within the body of this contract.

Track Record/Monitor

The contractor, AGC Electric, Inc., is currently performing work for PWD at a satisfactory level as
reported by the Project Manager. PWD has reviewed the Office of Capital Improvement (OCI)
database and found seven (7) awarded construction contracts for AGC Electric, Inc. The referenced
database also lists a total of five (5) contractor performance evaluations with an overall performance
rating of satisfactory (3.6). In addition, the Department of Small Business Development’s (SBD) History
of Violations report lists no violations for this contractor.

Following PWD’s standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-construction
meeting will be scheduled. Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff person in PWD will be
the PTP Coordinator, Mr. Frank Aira, P.E. Following completion of the award process, the project will
be assigned to Mr. Oscar Rubio, Project Manager, for day to day responsibilities.

According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, AGC Electric, Inc., Company
Principals are: Tomas V. Curbelo, Enrique |. Guzman and Pierrette De La Sierra and the Company’s
address is listed as: 2660 West 79 Street, Hialeah, Florida 33016. [




Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss
and Members, Board of County Commissioners
Page 2

Background
In an effort to accelerate the continued success of the PWD PTP Major Highway and Roadway

initiative, PWD continues to take advantage of various contracting mechanisms such as the subject
Miscellaneous Construction Contracting process available under OCI contract CICC 7360-0/08.
Through this process, PWD forwards the Request for Price Quotation (RPQ), by way of facsimile
transmission, to a pool of firms that have registered with OCI for the subject trade. Additionally, PWD
advertises the project in the Daily Business Review and all solicitations are available on-line through
the Miami-Dade County portal under the “Procurement Solicitations” link. Interested contractors
prepare their bids according to the Job Order Contracting (JOC) process, whereby the County
establishes unit prices for the pay items in accordance with industry averages. The contractors submit
their bid as an overall percentage factor of the pricing established by the County. The project award
evaluation is based upon the lowest percentage submitted by the responsive, responsible bidder for the
project.

In the event that the lowest JOC percentage submitted by a responsive and responsible firm results in a
tie (equal percentage), such firms shall have the opportunity to submit a “Best and Final” bid equal to or
lower than the previously submitted Contractor's Percentage Factor. If a tie still exists, the County will
award the contract based on local preference, Certified Small Business Enterprise (CSBE) certification
and the least amount of dollars paid on County contracts over the last three (3) years.

PWD staff submitted the referenced project to the SBD Review Committee. The Review Committee
met on December 10, 2008, reviewed RPQ 20080227 and recommended no contract measures for this
project. On December 18, 2008, PWD forwarded an RPQ for the ATMS Field Installation Contract,
utilizing the OCI contract CICC 7360-0/08, to a list of 49 qualified firms. Thirteen (13) firms purchased
contract documents and six (6) firms proffered a bid. The lowest bidder, Tropical Electric, Inc.,
withdrew his bid due to their inability of adhering to the contract terms and conditions, specifically with
the Performance Bond. Additionally, the two lowest responsive, responsible bidders, AGC Electric, Inc.
and Horsepower Electric, Inc., proffered matching percentage factors of 0.89%. Therefore, on
February 11, 2009, both firms submitted a “Best and Final” bid and as a result, AGC Electric, Inc,,
proffered the lowest responsive, responsible base bid of 0.86 percentage factor, 14% below the
County’s cost estimate and the second lowest bidder, Horsepower Electric, Inc., proffered a base bid of
0.87 percentage factor, 1% over the lowest bidder. On February 17, 2009, PWD issued a
recommendation of award for RPQ 20080228 to AGC Electric, Inc. with the stipulation that approval of
this project must be obtained from the BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated with the use of
Surtax funds.

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all supervision,
labor, materials, special equipment and tools required to perform all operations necessary to install
Miami-Dade County traffic signal cabinets, traffic controllers, modification of traffic controller (firmware
and communication), installation of loops, conduits, and pull boxes. The County will furnish the
cabinets, controllers, and communications equipment. This contract also includes maintenance of
existing traffic signals for the duration of the required installation or upgrade activity.

Assistant County Manager
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MEMORANDUM

[~
(Revised)
TO: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss DATE: April 7, 2009

and Members, Board of County Commissioners

FROM: R.A. ev%}. SUBJECT: Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1) (D)
County Attorn€y

Please note any items checked.

“4-Day Rule” (“3-Day Rule” for committees) applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increas.es expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required

Statement of fiscal impact required

Bid waiver requiring County Mayor’s written recommendation

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing ‘ ‘

Housekeeping item (no policy decision required)

No committee review



Approved Mayor Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(D)
Veto 4-7-09
Override

RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION APPROVING A CONTRACT AWARD
RECOMMENDATION IN THE AMOUNT OF
$1,000,000.00 BETWEEN AGC ELECTRIC, INC. AND
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FOR THE PEOPLE'S
TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP) PROJECT
ENTITLED ADVANCED TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT
SYSTEM (ATMS) FIELD EQUIPMENT INSTALLATION
CONTRACT (PROJECT -~ CICC 7360-0/08 REQUEST
FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ) No. 20080227)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the
accompanying memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by
reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board
approves the Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $1,000,000.00
between AGC Electric, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People’s
Transportation Plan (PTP) Project Entitled Advanced Traffic Management
System (ATMS) Field Equipment Installation Contract (Project — CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No. 20080227) in substantially the form attached hereto and made a part
hereof.

The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner ,

who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner

and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:



Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(D)
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Dennis C. Moss, Chairman
Jose “Pepe” Diaz, Vice-Chairman

Bruno A. Barreiro Bruno A. Barreiro
Carlos A. Gimenez Carlos A. Gimenez
Barbara J. Jordan Barbara J. Jordan
Dorrin D. Rolle Dorrin D. Rolle

Katy Sorenson Katy Sorenson

Sen. Javier D. Souto Sen. Javier D. Souto

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this
7t day of April, 2009. This resolution shall become effective as follows: (1) ten (10)
days after the date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall
become effective only upon an override by this Board, and (2) either i) the Citizens'
Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response to the
CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote

of the Commission's membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF ’
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK
By:
Deputy Clerk
Approved by County Attorney as %
to form and legal sufficiency. Z

Bruce Libhaber
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Public Works

111 NW 15t Street ® Suite 1510
Miami, Florida 33128-1970

T 305-375-2830 F 305-375-2931

MIAMI-DADE

miamidade.gov
Carlos Alvarez, Mayor

February 17, 2009

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7005 1820 0004 0569 8618

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-828-4515; 305-823-2280

Mr. Tomas V. Curbelo
AGC Electric, Inc.
2660 West 79" Street
Hialeah, Florida 33016

Re: Recommendation for Award
Request for Frice Quotation (RPQ) No. 20080227 - CICC 7360-0/08
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Field Installation Contact

Dear Mr. Curbelo:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been recommended for award for the
above referenced RPQ based on your Price Quotation submitted on Wednesday, January 28,
2009. The total RPQ amount is one million dollars and zero cents ($1,000,000.00). This
includes a base contract amount of eight hundred seventy-eight thousand one hundred forty
dollars and zero cents ($878,142.86), a contingency amount of eighty-seven thousand eight
hundred fourteen dollars and twenty-nine cents ($87,814.29), and dedicated allowances totaling
thirty-four thousand forty-two dollars and eighty-five cents ($34,042.85). The contract duration
is established as 365-calendar days. However, the award is contingent upon the submission
of the required items listed below:

1. Performance and Payment Bond as required in Contract No. CICC 7360-0/08, Section
2.0 Special Conditions, Page 16, Article 2.11, PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BOND.
(The original attached documents must be used).

2. Letter from Bonding Agent granting Miami-Dade County authorization to date the
Performance Bond.

3. Copies of current insurance certificates.

4, Copies of required license(s).

The preceding documents are required as ouilined within Contract CICC-7360-0/08 and to be
submitted within 10 business days. Failure to submit the document(s) within the specified time,
or any extension granted, will result in the award being rescinded. Subsequent to the review
and approval of the aforementioned documents, you are required to obtain the required permits
in the time stipulated in the RPQ. Upon obtaining the permit(s), a copy(s) must be submitted to
the Project Manager prior to commencement of work. No work is to be performed without a
permit unless the Project Manager issues a written directive to proceed without permit(s).



Page 2
Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20080227

After receipt of the permits the Project Manager will schedule a Pre-Construction Conference
and issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the performance of the work. This letter will also
serve as a reminder that all work must be performed according to the scope of work and
contract's terms and conditions, all permits and inspections and in accordance with all
applicable Federal, State and local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit System
Sales Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade County may be
used to pay for all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award of this contract shall be
effective and thereby give rise to a contractual relationship with the County uniess and until the
following have occurred: 1) the County Commission awards the contract, and such award
becomes final (either by expiration of 10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by
Commission override of a veto); and 2) either i) the Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust
(CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County
Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission’s membership and
such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Mr. Uitimo De Oliveira, OCI office, at (305) 375-2606 to insure that your file
is complete for award consideration.

Shbuld you have any questions please contact me at (305) 375-2930.
Sincerely;

Frakhk Aira, P.E. CFM
Manager, Public Works Department

C: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
Johnny Martinez, OCI
Penelope Townsley, SBD
Bob Williams, P.E., PWD
Oscar Rubio, PWD
Luis O. Perez, PWD
Orky Rodriguez, PWD
Alvaro Castro, PWD
Patrice King, SBD
Clerk of the Board
Reading File
Project File
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| BESTNAN])' FINAL..

| CONTRACT NO. CICC-7360-0/08
RPC) NO.: 20080227
PW2D CSS ENG: J. Bernard Philippeaux

BID» VALIDITY: (1120 [J180
(Selec et One)

BID OPENING DATE: February 11, 2009

PROJECT NAME: People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)

Field Installation Contract

COST ESTIMATE: $878,142.86

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: N/A
ADDENDUM (No. issued): 1

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issued): 2

Revised 2/11/2009 Page 1 of 1

BIDDERS L‘:"’vp;ir;::r CSBE SCHEDULE PROFFERED BID R ks
Firm Position OF INTENT (%) (US MONIES) emar
Telephone No.
AGC Electric, Inc. .
305-823-2280 0.19
Horsepower Electric, Inc.
305-819-4060 0. %4
23




BIST AND FINAL OFFER

Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications  REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Section

Contract -~ 7360-0/08

11 1 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 No:
RPQ No: 20080227

MEAMIED

M# ami, FL 33128

RP Q Project Name: PTP Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS) Field Installation Contract

Pri ce Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not

subomitting a price proposal)

Bidder's Company Name: A 6’( E/(elwal <

Company Address: 7/550 L/ M S \

City: J;\t alean State: FC Zip: 339 1€
I%elo?hggg e FaxNo: 37Y $2% 441§  EMail: 2ac@age he8rc . coun

en
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): ‘ Onr- s, U. [\a AQ_\Q

Number of Addendums recei (if none’ write "None") €&/ 1/( I/Lg/o/

/M : Date: 2////9'30(4

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shalt
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for
Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the

CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Signature:

Appendix 5A

24
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Public Works

111 NW 15t Street » Suite 1510

MIAM 'DADE ’ Miami, Florida 33128-1970
COUNTY T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

iamidade,
Carlors Alvarez, Mayor miamidade.gov

February 5, 2009

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7005 1820 0004 0570 2452

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-823-4515; 305-823-2280

Mr. Tomas V. Curbelo
AGC Electric, Inc.

2660 West 79" Street
Hialeah, Florida 33016

Re:  Recommendation of Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20080227 — CICC 7360-0/08
People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Filed nstallation Coniract

Dear Mr. Curbelo:

The Public Works Department (PWD) has reviewed the Contractor's Percentage Factor
proposal submitted by your firn on Wednesday, January 28, 2009 and found that it is identical
to that submitted by another firm, thus both being the apparent lower bidder. In the event that a
RPQ results in-a tie, (equal dollar value) such firms shall have the opportunity {0 submit a best
and final bid equal to or lower than the Contractor's Percentage Factor previously submitted. If
a tie still exists, the firm with the least number of “Awarded” and/or "Recommended for Award”
contracts at the time of the “Best and Final” bid opening will be deemed the lowest bid for the
County’s award recommendation.

Therefore, PWD is requesting that your Firm submit a “Best and Final” bid to be received in the
Office of the Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Room 17-202, Stephen P. Clark,
111 N.W. 1% Street, Miami, up to 2:00 p.m., Local Time, Wednesday, February 11, 2009
where they will be publicly opened and read aloud.

Should your firm fail to submit a “Best and Final” bid by the time and date specified above, your
firm will be deemed non-responsive,

C: Rodney McMillian, PWD
Luis O. Perez, P.E., PWD

Bernard Philippeaux, PWD s o/yve s £ arpllenes Erery Day
Clerk of the Board T S N
Project File :
Reading File



BEST AND FINAL OFYER

Pwblic Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Section e

Contract ¢ 7360-0/08

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 No:
RPQ No: 20080227

Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: PTP Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS) Field Installation Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not

submitting a price proposal) ,
O, 84
Bidder's Company Name: HQE $@ PEWAL Elgc-i-, te Toe .

Company Address: 208 w. 20 Ao

City: H?ALQQ.C\ State: F(L Zip: 3

Telephone No: . l. Lo | .
- 91A-406o FaxNo: 20¢ 81a-42272 EMail: adilkke @ﬁavs@'pwaelzc#vzc

Name of Perso.n Submitting Quote (Print): Haulao.v’lo @VLQ_.

_one (if none' write "None")

Number of Addendums recei

‘Signature:_ [/

Date: 2 -ll-o0&%

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for
Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the

CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A

£)Z



Fek-05-2008 16:11 From=PHD CONTRACTS & SPECIFICATIONS 3053752931 =103 P.001/002 F-156

Public Works

111 NW 15t Street & Suite 1510
Miami, Florida 33128-1970

T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

MIAMI-DADE

Car los Alvarez, Mayor miamidade.gov

February 5, 2009

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7005 1820 0004 0570 2469

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-819-4222; 305-819-4060

Mr. Humberto Ortiz
Horsepower Electnc Ine.
8106 West 20" Avenue
Hialeah, Florida 33014

Re: Recommendation of Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20080227 - CICC 7360-0/08
People’s Transportation Plan (PTPR)-Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Filed Installation Cantract

Dear Mr. Ortiz:

The Public Works Department (PWD) has reviewed the Contractor's Percentage Factor
proposal submitted by your firm on Wednesday, January 28, 2009 and found that it is identical
to that submitted by another firm, thus both being the apparent lower bidder. In the event that a
RPQ results in a tie, (equal dollar value) such firms shall have the opportunity to submit 2 best
and final bid equal to or lower than the Contractor's Percentage Factor previously submitted. If
a tie still exists, the firm with the least number of “Awarded” and/or "Recommended for Award"
contracts at the time of the “Best and Final” bid opening will be deemed the lowest bid for the
County's award recommendation.

Therefore, PWD Is requesting that your Firm submit a “Best and Final” bid to be received in the
Office of the Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners, Room 17-202, Stephen P. Clark,

111 N.W. 1% Street, Miami, up to 2:00 p.m., Local Time, Wednesday, February 11, 2009
where they will be publicly openad and read aloud.

. Should your firm fail to submit a “Best and Final" bid by the time and date specified above, your
firm will be deemed non-responsive.

Sincerely,

C: Rodney McMillian, PWD
Luis O. Perez, P.E., PWD L i ‘L

Bernard Philippeaux, PND ‘P affvgrivie & weppll s re Ereimy T
Clerk of the Board e o S
Project File .
Reading File



CONTRACT NO. CICC-7360-0/08
RPQ NO.: 20080227
PWD CSS ENG: J. Bernard Philippeaux

BID VALIDITY: 1120 [1180
(Select One)

BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: January 28, 2009
BID OPENING DATE: January 28, 200908

PROJECT NAME: People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Field Installation Contract

COST ESTIMATE: $878,142.86

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: N/A
ADDENDUM (No. issued): 1

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issued): 2

BIDDERS Apparent | cqpp SCHEDULE PROFFERED BID

. Low Bidder
Firm Position OF INTENT (V) (US MONIES)

Telephone No.

Remarks

A. Bernal Services Corp. .
305-889-0887 Vo 914

AGC Electric, Inc.
305-823-2280

. ©

-

el

305-968-7832

L

Horsepower Electric, Inc.

305-819-4060

&

»

0
All Quality Electrical Services, Inc. /

/7?/ .
Raydan Electric, Inc.

305-345-5343 | /Uo &/

Republic ITS .
415-884-3000 bad

Solares kElectrical Services, Inc. é (‘g
305-717-6184 /Q) ¢

Southeast Underground Utilities |
Corp. //ﬂ é{ d

954-583-8745

3¢

Revised 1/28/2009 Page 1 of 2



CONTRACT NO. CICC-7360-0/08
RPQ NO.: 20080227

PWD CSS ENG: J. Bernard Philippeaux

BID VALIDITY: (0120 1180
(Select One)

BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: January 28, 2009

BID OPENING DATE: January 28, 200908

PROJECT NAME: People’s Transportatlon Plan (PTP) Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS)
Field Installation Contract :

COST ESTIMATE: $878,142.86

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: N/A
ADDENDUM (No. issued): 1

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issned): 2

BIDDERS Iz&p;;;::r CSBE SCHEDULE PROFFERED BID R Ks
Firm Position OF INTENT (¥) (US MONIES) emar
Telephone No.
System Integration Maintenance 0 7

F=4
305-624-1113 1% Jer

Traffic Control Devices, Inc.

407-869-5300 q.s % e

Trans Core ' | /w é[ La

954-342-0690 .

Tropical Electric . ' ) : /W
. &‘ ?6/ 2 é v -

305-362-7050

World Fiber Technologies 2
Bl

770-619-0118
hizd

_/Uo od

39

Revised 1/28/2009 Page 2 of 2



Pyulbwlic Works Deparnimemn
Corsfracts & Specifications REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RFW)

Section . Contract
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQNo: 20080227

Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: ATMS Field Installation Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State "No Bid' lf not
submitting a price proposal)

0. 84
Bidder's Company Naﬁé: AG'C é (ea vic LS.V\ C

Company Address: | 26 60 W }q é’ﬂeﬂ
City: _ taleadn | | state: L zip: _330/6
Tegg\'_m; 2oaay0 FaxNo: 325 $23 4JS  EMail:_sqcpageeleic. coun

Towes V. Coddo

‘Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print):

- Number of Addendums re

W | | Date: /Z. Z}Zé‘f

d: ‘ (if none' write "None")

-Signature:

Note Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review.
By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC- 7360-

0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A -



Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract

#F THIS PROPOSAL 1S ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

PROJECT NO: 20080227

WORK".
~102-61 ‘BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) EA. 2.0 $250.00 |
H10—'4A 'REMOVAL OF EXISTING PAVEMENT - {Asphalt, concrete, sidewalk, curb & gutler, inlets, pull S.Y. 3.0 $30.00
L— ' boxes, conduit, etc) _ .
331-72-08 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE TYPE'S [(Asphalt base and/or wearing course) (!nclﬁdes excavation of | TON 3.0 $110.00 |
roadway for. expansion, 12" stabilization of limerock subgrade, grading of swales, clearing and
grubbing) (All as approved by the Englneer)] (Please note that this item can only be used to a
| maximum of 150 Tons per site)
351-1A COLOR CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (Type F) L.F. 3.0 $44.00
35118 COLORED CONCRETE-SlDEWALK (4"- Thick) SY. 3.0 - $55.00
3E1-1C COLOR CONCRETE SIDEWALK (6"- Thick) SsY. 3.0 $92.00
35116 COLOR CONCRETE CROSSWALK (10" Thick) SY. 30 $105.00
351-2A CUEB RAMP DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE (Labor -and material as described in the S.F. 3.0 $62.07
Special Provisions and included per FDOT Standard Details Index No. 304 (Truncated Domes) As _
directed by Engineer. : :
520-2 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (Any type, lncludlng base preparatlon) L.F. 30 . $45._0Q
522-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK {4" Thick restoratlon and new, Class | Concrete 3000 P.S.ly (|nc|ud|ng S.Y. 3.0. $42.00
pedestnan ramps and sidewalk curbs)
522-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK (6" Thick, 3000 P.S.. concrete at 28 days) (including pedestriah ramps_ | S.Y. 3.0 . $55.00-
and sidewalk curbs) _ _ :
| 626-70-2 BRICK PAVERS - For sidewalk repair matph existing, includes incidental sand ifrequired. SY. .30 $66.00
5372 DETECTABLE WARNING ON WALKING SURFACE. S.F. 3.0 $62.07
575-1-1 SODDING (Pensacola Bahia or match existing) (includes watering) SY. 3.0 $5.00
580-336 “TREE TRIMMING- HRS: 3.0 $28.00
620-1-1 GROUNDING ELECTRODE LF. 1,200.0 $18.00
630-00 - Conduit cleaning and installation of pull string LF. 36,598.0 $1.25
'630-1-12 © | CONDUIT 2" PVC, UNDERGROUND . LF 7,320.0 $20.00 |
630-1-13° F)ONDUIT 2" PVC UNDER PAVEMENT (This item is contingent upon field conditions and may be | LF. 6,100.0 $34.00
: increased, decrease or eliminated by the Engineer)
630-1-14 - | CONDUIT. 2" PVC (UNDER GROUND DIRECTIONAL BORE) L.F. 7.320.0 $_34.00
-830-1-168 CONDUIT, 2" PVC [(Additional conduit installed in existing open trench) (This item is contlngent L.F. 9.0 $5.00
upon field conditions and may be increased, decreased or eliminated by the Engineer)]
632-7-1A TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (11-21 conductor) LF. . 3.0 $11.00
[
CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS: - CIcC
1271212008 11 57 AM Page 1 of 4

ull



Bid Form

. pROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract

PROJECT NO: 20080227

IFF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
H UNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

W ORK".

I 632-7-1B TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor)
I 632-8-212 'INTERCONNECT CABLE L.F. 30| $5.00
635-1-11 PULL BOX, 'METlER'TYPE(Pol‘ymer) AS. 122.0 $650.00 |
639-1-13 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES ( Includes NEMA-3R rain-tight inclosure, disconnect | AS. 3.0 $900.00
i switch, pole conduit) : o
639-1-23-A | ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES (Underground, Ineluding furnishing and installing 15' concrete AS. 30 $4,500.00
L_ _ pole, NEMA-3R raln-tight inclosure, disconnect switch, pole conduit)
' 639-2-1B SERVICE WIRE [(#6 AWG with (RHH/RHW/XLP) insulation) (Three conductor set (Black, White L.F. 3.0 $5.00
: . and Green))] )
I. 653-171 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, NEON NT'L SYMBOL, LOW WATTAGE AS. 3.0 $750.00
653-171-1 REPLACE PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL MESSAGE MODULE - (Furniéh & install neon, international | AS. 3.0 $350.00
I symbol, low wattage)(includes removal of existing if required) )
659-107 ALUMINUM ‘PlEDESTAL 4" |.D. (L_Jp to 20%) EA. 3.0 "~ $600.00
660-2-101 l_.OOP ASSEMBLY AS. 5.0 $906.00
660-4-4A LOOP LEAD IN CABLE (No. 14 AW.G.) L.F. 3.0 $4.00
.665-11 PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR (Includes Push Button Sign) ‘EA. 3.0 $170.00
672-1-3 INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up controller & components furnished by | AS. 3.0 $2,300.00
County. Contractor to construct foundation, mstall and wire controller & components for a complete :
installation) .
672-1-4 MQDIFICATION OF EXISTING TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY TYPE 170 - {Components AS. 20 $1,208.00
furnished by county. Contractor to install, remove or re-place components and/or modlfy phasing )
- and/or other operation) ]
672-1-5 MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Controller and components AS. . 2.0 $3,000.00
supplied by County. Contractor te construct foundation, install cabinet, build-up & wire controller &
compoenents for a complete installation) ) :
672-1-7 MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up Controller and | AS. 2.0 $2,500.00
components supplied by County. Contractor to install cabinet-on existing foundation, wire controller :
& components for a complete installation)
672-1-8 - MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Controller and components | AS. 2.0 $3,000.00.
supplied by County. Contractor to install cabinet on foundation, build-up & wire controller &
‘| components for a complete installation)
676-110-110 | CONTROLLER CABINET POLE MOUNTED - [(Includes circuit breaker relays & lrghtnmg EA. 2.0 $1,000.00
" suppressor, and flasher type 3)]
678-1-113 PROGRAMMABLE TIME SWITCH - (Solid state, 4 circuit, see Special Provisions) EA. 2.0 $967.00
690-50 REMOVE CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY EA. 24.0 -$415.00
690-51 REMOVE CONTROLLER FOUNDATION - Includes proper disposal, .and grading of area i | EA. 3.0 $392.00
required. i
690-100 REMOVE MISCELLANEOQOUS SIGNAL EQUIPMENT P.l. 24.0 $133.00
CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
12/12/2008 11:57 AM Page 2 of 4
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Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract PROJECT NO: 20080227

- IF THIS PROPOSAL 1S ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE “NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK"*.

box, meter box and ground restoration)

690-110 | RELOCATE ' SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or multiple section, span wire or mast arm [ “EA. 2.0 $600.00
mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket)
S » .
690-70A REMOVE PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR ASSEMBLY (Includes Push Button Sign) EA. | 3.0 : $4000 |-
|

The bidder understands and agrees that the Contractor Percentage Factor is Inclusive of all work necessary to complete the job as descnbed in
the Contract herem :

Contractor's Percentage Factor: O . g 6!

Biaders Name: ___F(-C Eledine Tre
Bidder's address: ___ ’LACO W 9 CTree k
Bidder's telephone Numbér: | 209 2% Q-Lga
Tax \dentification Number: ____ 6 006 1€ 5.
Mlamt Dade County Certificate of Competencyz F‘C wOCﬁ 6

FA!LURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
© 12/12/2008 11:57 AM
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| - Bid Form
p ROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract PROJECT NO: 20080227

I THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
+$ UNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

w ORK*,

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES THAT INCLUDED IN THE VARIOUS ITEMS OF THE PROPOSAL AND IN THE TOTAL BID
PRICE ARE COSTS FOR COMPLYING WITH THE FLORIDA TRENCH SAFETY ACT (90-96), LAWS OF FLA. -
EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 1st, 1990. THE BIDDER FURTHER IDENTIFIES THE COSTS . TO BE SUMMARIZED BELOW:

Trench Safety Units of Measure ' Unit Unit Exterided
Measure (LF, SY) {Quantity) Cost Cost
{Description) = ' :

TOTAL
FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE.
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APELTTIRE,

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

Section Contract
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 No: CICC 7360-0/08

RPQ No: 20080227

Public Works Department

Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: ATMS Field Installation Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not . -

submitting a price proposal)

0.4

‘Bidder's Company Name: [—/ [ RS;{,PO were E LECTR) (&) /nc.

Company Address: _8106S  \wWlest Jo AJE

City: _"1IIAL€A)’\ State: FL Zip: 3«30/5[

Telephone No: - _ ' . » ;
3e6 €19 Jo60 Fax No:_3058(94Z ?Z EMail: Mﬂ%&g«/cﬂé/ﬁ’ﬂlfc’gf;

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): J—lm\mﬁi’:ﬁ'\’f) OIZ.T VL
/

Number of Addpndums receiéed: J (if none’ write "None™)
Signature: ‘1 ( J/\m Date: /-28-09

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time
due and the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall
result in the rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be
notified, in the Notice of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance
certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the
Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review.
By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-

0/08 contract.

s
Appendix 5A
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Bid Form

PPROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract

PROJECT NO: 20080227

#F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
#HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT
WORK®.

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
12/12/2008 11:57 AM

02-61 BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) EA. 290 $250.00
110-4A REMOVAL QOF EXISTING PAVEMENT - {Asphalt, concrete, sidewalk, curb & gutter, inlets, pult | S.Y. 3.0 $30.00
‘ boxes, conduit, etc.) . :
| S
331-72.08 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE TYPE S [{Asphalt base and/or wearing course) {(Includes excavation of | TON 3.0 $110.00
roadway for expansion, 12" stabilization of limerock subgrade, grading of swales, clearing and i
grubbing) (All as approved by the Engineer)] (Please note that this item can only be used to a
F‘“ maximum of 150 Tons per site)
351-1A COLOR CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (Type F) LF. 3.0 $44.00
- .
351-1B COLORED CONCRETE SIDEWALK {4"- Thick) S.Y. 3.0 $55.00
351-1C COLOR CONCRETE SIDEWALK (6"- Thick) sY. 3.0 $92.00
351-1G COLOR CONCRETE CROSSWALK (10" Thick) s.Y. 30 $105.00
351-2A CURB RAMP DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE (Labor and material as described in the | S.F. 3.0 $62.07
Special Provisions and included per FDOT Standard Details Index No. 304 (Truncated Domes) As
directed by Engineer,
520-2 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (Any type, Including base preparation) L.F. 3.0 $45.00
522-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4" Thick restoration and new, Class | Concrete, 3000 P.S.l) (including EAS 3.0 $42.00
pgdestrian ramps and sidewalk curbs)
522-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK (6" Thick, 3000 P.S.l. concrete at 28 days) (including pedestrian ramps | S.Y. 3.0 . $55.00
and sidewalk curbs) '
526-70-2 BRICK PAVERS - For sidewalk repair match existing, includes incidental sand if required. SY. 3.0 $66.00
527-2 DETECTABLE WARNING ON WALKING SURFACE SF. 3.0 $62.07
575-1-1 SODDING (Pensacola Bahia or match existing) (includes watering) sY. 3.0 $5.00
580-336 TREE TRIMMING- HRS 3.0 $28.00
620-1-1 GROUNDING ELECTRODE - LF. 1,200.0 $18.00
| 630-00 Conduit cleaning and installation of pull string LF. 36,598.0 $1.25
630-1-12 CONDUIT 2" PVC, UNDERGROUND . LF 7,320.0 $20.00
630-1-13 CONDUIT 2" PVC UNDER PAVEMENT (This item is contingent upon field conditions and may be L.F. 6,100.0 $34.00
increased, decrease or eliminated by the Engineer)
630-1-14 CONDUIT 2" PVC (UNDER GROUND DIRECTIONAL BORE) L.F. 7,320.0 $34.00
630-1-16B CONDUIT, 2" PVC [(Additional conduit installed in existing open trench) (This item is contingent h.F. 9.0 $5.00
upon field conditions and may be increased, decreased or eliminated by the Engineer))
632-7-1A TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (11-21 conductor) L.F. 3.0 $11.00
S I I I

Page 1 of 4
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Bid Form

FPROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract

PROJECT NO: 20080227

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT
WVORK".

6532-8-212 INTERCONNECT CABLE L.F. 3.0 $5.00
‘g
r—535-1 -1 PULL BOX, METER TYPE (Polymer) AS. 122.0 $650.00 -
639-1-13 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES ( Includes NEMA-3R rain-tight inclosure, disconnect | AS. 3.0 $900.00
switch, pole conduit)
B839-1-23-A | ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES (Underground, Including furnishing and installing 15' concrete | AS. 3.0 - $4,500.00
pole, NEMA-3R rain-tight inclosure, disconnect switch, pole conduit)
l—539-2-18 SERVICE WIRE [(#6 AWG with (RHH/RHW/XLP) insulation) (Three conductor set (Black, White L.F. 3.0 $5.00
and Green))]
653-171 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, NEON INTL SYMBOL, LOW WATTAGE AS. 3.0 $750.00
653-171-1 REPLACE PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL MESSAGE MODULE - (Fumish &.install neon, international | AS. 3.0 $350.00
symbol, low wattage)(includes removal of existing if required)
659-107 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL 4" 1.D. (Up to 20) EA. 3.0 $600.00
L'660- -101 LOOP ASSEMBLY AS. 3.0 $906.00
66044A | LOOP LEAD IN CABLE (No. 14 AW.G.} L.F. 3.0 $4.00
665-11 PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR (Includes Push Button Sign) EA. 3.0 $170.00
672-1-3 INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up controller & components furnished by AS. 3.0 $2,300.00
County. Contractor to construct foundation, install and wire controller & components for a complete
installation)
672-1-4 MODIFICATION OF EXISTING TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY TYPE 170 - (Components | AS. 20 $1,208.00
fumished by county. Contractor to install, remove or re-place components and/or modify phasing
and/or other operation)
672-1-5 MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Controller and components | AS. 20 $3,000.00
supplied by County. Centractor to construct foundation, install cabinet, build-up & wire controller &
components for a complete instailation) .
672-1-7 MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up Controller and AS. 2.0 $22,500.00
components supplied by County. Contractor to install cabinet on existing foundatlon wire controller
& eomponents for a complete installation)
672-1-8 MODIFY AND INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - {Controfler and components AS. 20 $3,000.00
supplied by County. Contractor to install cabinet on foundation, build-up & wire controller &
components for a complete installation)
676-110-110 | CONTROLLER CABINET POLE MOUNTED - [(Includes circuit breaker, relays & lightning [ EA. 20 $1.000.00
suppressor, and flasher type 3)}
| 678-1-113 PROGRAMMABLE TIME SWITCH - (Solid state, 4 circuit, see Special Provisions) EA. 20 $967.00
890-50 REMOVE CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY EA. 24.0 $415.00
690-51 REMOVE CONTROLLER FOUNDATION - Includes proper disposal, and grading of area if | ‘EA. 3.0 $392.00
required.
L‘690-100 REMOVE MISCELLANEOUS SIGNAL EQUIPMENT P.1 24.0 $133.00
CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
12/12/2008 .1 1:57 AM Page 2 of 4
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Bid Form

FPROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract PROJECT NO: 20080227

gF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
#-{UNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WVORK".

690-101 REMOVE EXISTING POWER SERVICE - (Includes complete removal of riser, disconnect switch | AS. 30 $175.00
box, meter box and ground restoration)

690-110 RELOCATE SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY - (Single or multiple section, span wire or mast arm EA. 2.0 $600.00
mounted)(Provide new ASTRO bracket)

690-70A REMOVE PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR ASSEMBLY (includes Push Button Sign) EA. 3.0 $40.00

“The bidder understands and agrees that the Contractor Percentage Factor is inclusive of all work necessary to complete the job as described in
the Contract herein.

Contractdr's Percentage Factor: D |Q7(\
Bidder's Name: "‘\0 Reepowez  ElecTe ¢, N
Bidder's address: SO \A“Z(B AVE HJ#L"EA h FL 330 "“
Bidder's telephone Number: 305@ 19 %60
Tax Identification Number: .59 240 2221
Miami Dade County Certificate of Competency: | 77 IJ ELO00ISD

FAILURE TO COMPHETE THE INFORMATIBN IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE

Lo

Ty

B

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
12/12/2008 11:57 AM Page 3of 4

4R



[

e

[

T
B

Rk ]

f—

LR

)

[

LR |

Bid Form
PROJECT TITLE: PTP ATMS Field Installation Contract PROJECT NO: 20080227

IF THIS PROPOSAL 1S ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

VVORK*.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES THAT INCLUDED IN THE VARIOUS ITEMS OF THE PROPOSAL AND IN THE TOTAL BID
PRICE ARE COSTS FOR COMPLYING WITH THE FLORIDA TRENCH SAFETY ACT (90-96), LAWS OF FLA.
EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 1st, 1990. THE BIDDER FURTHER IDENTIFIES THE COSTS TO BE SUMMARIZED BELOW:
Trench Safety Units of Measure Unit Unit Extended
Measure (LF, SY) (Quantity) Cost Cost
(Description)

NI
A

Cowm>

TOTAL
FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE.

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
12/12/2008 11:57 AM ' : " Pagedof4
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Public Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 C
Miami, FL 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

- REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20080227

MIAMI-DADE
COUNTY

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the Contract No. CICC-7360-0/08.

Date Issued: 12/18/2008 Bid Date Due: 1/28/2009 Time Due: 2:00 P.M. Submitted Via: Sealed Enve
Date RPQ Added: 11/26/2008 Contractors Add Request Date: 12/16/2008 Contractors Add Date: 12/18/2008
Project Number: 20080227 Estimated Value: $878.142.86

(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)

Project Name: PTP Advance Traffic Management System (ATMS) Field Installation Contract ESP

See Atrticle #6 of the Special Provisions (Location of Work) for information pertaining to the
tentative Work Location(s)

Project Location:

Project Manager: Jean Bernard Philippeaux Phone No: 305-375-2930 Fax No: 305-375-2931
Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Section Phone: (305) 375-2930 Date: 12/18/2008
Document Pickup: Location: 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510

Y/N: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:
Site Meeting: N N
PreBid Meeting: Y N 1/13/2009  10:00 A.M. 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 , Front Conference Room
Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Low ercentage Factor
Performance/Payment Bond Required: Y_ Bid Bond Required: Y_ Insurance Required: Y_
Comm Dist: Various Davis Bacon: N AIPP: N  $0.00
Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Y RBD Subcontract Forms Required: Date Advertised:
CSBE Requirements: N 0% Trade Set-a-side: N
DBD Dates: Received: SOI Date: Compliance: Memo Date:
Type: Trade: Count: Work%: Create Bid
Primary Electrical Contractor 50
Anticipated Start Date: 7/13/2009 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 365
Liquidated Damages / $$ Perday: Y  §$1.423.00 Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments
Funding Type: Federal: N_ State: N_ PTP: Y Other: N QNIP: N OMC: N GOB: N
Awarded To: CSBE Exp Date: Award Date: Paid Amt:
AGC Electric Inc. 1/30/2009 $0.00
Collusion Affidavit Received: Y_ Date Collusion Affidavit Received: 2/4/2009
Base Amt: $878,142.86 Cont Amt: $87,814.29 Ded Amt: $34,042.85 Award Amt:  $1,000,000.00
Insurance: OCI Approved: Y_ Date Approved: 2/12/2009 GL Ins Exp Dt: 8/20/2009
Bond Review: OCI Approved: N Date Approved: AL Ins Exp Dt: 4/2/2009
Risk Management: Approved: N Date Approved: WC Ins Exp Dt: 4/1/2009

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

Work under this Contract shall consist of furnishing supervision, labor, materials, equipment, tools, and performing all oper:
necessary to install Miami-Dade County Traffic Signal Cabinets, replace traffic controllers, modify traffic controller (firmwar
communication), installation of, loops, conduits, and pull boxes. The County will furnish the cabinets, controllers.
communications equipment. This Contract also includes maintenance of existing traffic signals for the duration of the rec
installation or upgrade activity. The work to be performed under this contract shall be Countywide. Individual work orders v
provided with specific site locations after award of the contract and issuance of Notice to Proceed. Each work order will incl

SO



set of plans including quantities, details, and intersection diagrams, the County shall not be held responsuble for the accuracy ¢
quantities whether greater or lesser than the estimated quantities. Final quantities shall be determined in the field by the Eng
From the time the Contractor begins actual work at a specific location/intersection until the end of the burn-in period, the Cont
shall be responsible for maintaining the controller-cabinet and its components and any non-cabinet equipment modified ¢
installed as part of this project, including but not limited to pull boxes, conductors, loops, and conduit. Replacements fc
equipment that fails while it is being maintained by the Contractor, which was not provided by the Contractor and did not fail
contractor's performance, can be obtained from the County by the Contractor at no charge.

Design Drawings Included: N Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y_
Project Qualifier: Frank Aira Phone No: 305-375-2930 EMail: AiraF@miamidade.gov
Comments:

LICENSE REQUIREMENTS:

At the time of Bid and pursuant to the requirements of Section 10-3 of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida and
Solicitation and Contract Documents, the Bidder must hold a valid, current, and active Certificate of Competency as a
Electrical Contractor License or Electrical Utility Contractor License.

Pursuant to Section 255.20, Florida Statues (F.S.) and in lieu of the above, the County may consider a bid from a Bidder th:
duly licensed Contractor in good standing that has been prequalified and considered eligible by the Florida Departme
Transportation (FDOT) under Section 337.14, F.S. and Chapter 14-2, Florida Administrative Code, to perform the work descril
the Contract Documents. Contractors seeking consideration under this Paragraph shall submit along with the Bid Documer
review and consideration, current copy(ies) of their FDOT Certificate(s) of Qualification, Certification of Work Underway, and ¢
of Contract(s) On Hand. Acceptance FDOT prequalification(s) necessary to perform the work specified in the Project's Scc
Work shall include the Traffic Signals Work Class.

BID DOCUMENTS:

Bidding documents may be purchased from the Miami-Dade County Department of Public Works, Contracts and Specific:
Section, 111 NW 1st Street, 15th Floor, Miami, Florida 33128 for a non-refundable fee of Twenty Five dollars ($25.00) per
complete set of documents. Payment shall be in the form of a company check, cashier's check, or money order payable
“Board of County Commissioners of Miami-Dade County, Florida.”

ADDENDUMS - RFI'S;

The Public Works Department has made changes with regard to how addendums and requests for information (RFI) will be s
document holders. Be advised that all Addendums, RFI's, and the document holders list (bidder’s list) are now available tc
online at the following web address: http://services.miamidade.gov/DPM/SolicitationList.aspx

Therefore, during the advertisement period, the Department will not be sending these documents via certified mail. All doct
holders must provide a dedicated fax number available at all hours. The Department will only be sending addendums and RF
fax and posting online at the aforementioned link. The bidders list will be updated every Friday during the advertisement ph:
the contract. Please be aware that acknowledgment of receipt of all addendums and RFI's remain a requirement when subr
bids.

VENDOR REGISTRATION:

Due to the new Vendor Registration procedures of the Department of Procurement Management, updated definitions along wi
“Affirmation of Vendor Affidavits” has been added to the Bid Submittal Package. The successful bidder must be registered
this new procedure prior to award.

PREBID - BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE:
Pre-Bid Conference time and location: 10:00 A.M., Tuesday, January 13, 2008, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 15 Floor, Front Confe
Room.

Bid Opening Time and Location: 2:00 P.M., Wednesday, January 28, 2009, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 17th Floor, Clerk of the
Office.

Contractor / Bid Information (Bids added 12/18/2008)

DBD ||Base Bid ||LI Ex;
Type ||Contractor Name Trade Bid |[OK Bid Amount |[Award (|Type (|Date
[360 |[a & P ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS, INC. |[Etectrical Contractor |[N r [so00 || ler Jla?ﬂ_l
‘7360 Jl:sernal Services, Corp. Fectncal Contractor |N [50 00 ‘r ”Pri l 8/31/2(
|1360 Jlm“ Electric Jrectncal Contractor ”N JI—\ $0 00 J\ ”Pri ||-1_2—l;1—"
l7360 J'Accura Electrical Contractors Inc. ”Eectrical Contractor “N Jl H$°-°° J| “Pri ”TZTE
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llﬁo_“AGc Electric Inc. ‘Electrical Contractor ||_Y_“ H$878,142.88 HY ||Pri J|12/31I
|;| Quality Electrical Services |ﬁc. @trical Contractor 'Y ” WO-OO [N “Pri J‘_El
@_“;Irﬁm Electric, Inc. | I&ctrical Contractor E__” —|’§0-00 ( ”Pri J|12/31I
llﬁﬂ__”Bennett Electric Service Company, Inc. ] Electrical Contractor |ﬁ ‘r ”$0-00 ” “Pri ﬂ12/31/
lﬁfio_”maiuy Electric Corp. Electrical Contractor “;_”~ ||§0-00 H HPri J|8l3112(
[736Ll |;tlildexz Corp. Electrical Contractor W H ]ﬁO-OO ” ”Pri JLZI31/
ICanseco Electrical Contractors, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor HE_H |ﬁo.oo ” “Pri J|__213_1
|7_35°_ laearview Electric, Inc. lE!ectrical Contractor JDF ”;O-OO —” HPri “121311
[7360 |DC Electric, Inc. |Electrical Contractor ||i ” ||30~00 ” HPri J|12/31I
llﬁo_”:oster & Son Electrical Contractors Inc. “Electrical Contractor Wﬁ ” ”;O-OO I[ ”Pri J|12/31/
l735Ll|Gancedo Technologies, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor —”;__l l__”;o.oo 1[ HPri JLZI?AI
|T“L‘|Horsepower Electric, inc. “Electrical Contractor ”? ” H;0.00 ”N ”Pri H12/31/
‘Ei”;dor International Corporation “Electrical Contractor HN “ ”50 00 ‘” ”Prl JI8’31/2(
Wl;mes P. Moran, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor 4“N H__“;o 00 —” HPN “_2/3_1/
[7360 |Ju|iana Enterprises Inc DBA Power Pro ”Electrical Contractor ;”i ”30 00 W ”Pn J|12/31/
@”Klean Power Electric Inc HElectrical Contractor Jﬁ ‘ H$0 00 l[ Hpn J|9130/2(
beo “Magesco, Inc. —“Electrical Contractor llN__” “;0-00 ( HPri "12/31/5
|736Ll’;arey Electric, Inc. ||E|ectrical Contractor 4”i || H$0-00 [ “Pri ||9I30/2|
|773504”Marvelous Electric, Inc. HElectrical Contractor WE_'F |F0-00 l[ ”Pri H12/31/i
[7360 “Maynard Electric “Electrical Contractor JIN_” “50-00 T[ “Pri “12/31/1
[7360 |[mutti Etectric corp [Etectrical contractor [N || ||s0.00 I P |rarrae
vJXMURRAY ELECTRIC OF MIAMI, INC. W‘Electrical Contractor ler ||§0-00 H HPri ”12/31/1
@Icutlook International Inc. |Electrical Contractor jli “ ”$0-00 I[ “Pri “12/31!1
|§o—- Patriot Electric Inc. |Electrical Contractor J|i__|r ||;0-00 jl——”:‘”TBJ
|736° ‘;ole and Kent Company of Florida \Electrical Contractor :”N |r HEO-OO H HPri ‘\12’31”
[7360 | |Prime Electrical Contractors, Inc. [Erectrical contractor [N [ |fs0-00 | lpri  lorsorzx
’EO ||R & D Electric, Inc. ”Electrical Contractor jli_"_—||§o.oo ” ‘Pri “12/3111
[7360_||Raydan Electric Inc ltectrical contractor N || flso00 |1 lpri |30zt
[7360 ||Raymond Etectric, inc.  |tectrical contractor [N || [is0.00 | e |orsora
7360 |Rays Electrical Supplies, Inc. j|EIectrlcal Contractor r r ||g0.00 jr ”Pri “8’31’2‘
7360 :::ublic Intelligent Transportation Services, Electrical Contractor $0.00 Pri 12/81E
W‘Ruben Electric Technology, Inc. "Electncal Contractor 4”;4:”— | $0.00 W ”Pri ”12/31’1
[736U |;.R.L.L. Electric, Inc. j|EIectrical Contractor Ju| ||;0-00 |r ”Pri ||12/31If
[5.0.5. Etectricat Contractors Inc. [Erectrical contractor [N |[ [s000 I e |[raeen
|733L“Shock Free Electric Inc ‘__“Electrical Contractor "i H Hg0;00 W "Pri ”12’31“
[7360 [solares Etectrical Services, inc. [Etectricat contractor |\ |[Jfs0.00 I e [rarsee
[7360 [south Florida Coastat Etectric, inc. Dr | 1s0.00 | i |[erer

I

"Electrlcal Contractor

=



|7330 HSure Electrical Contractors Inc.

”Electrical Contractor

[ U

”Pri | 9/30/2(

SYSTEMS INTEGRATION & MAINTENANCE,

7360 INC.

Electrical Contractor

Y $0.00

Pri |[12131F

|7350 |F|'hevenin Enterprises Inc.

”Electrical Contractor

O TR

|73607ﬁrans Tech Electric LP

||Electrical Contractor

[ T

| Pri  |[12/31K
]’;}i |h2/31/:

|7360 IFI’ropical Electric Inc.

JIEIectricaI Contractor

v || |ls878,142.86 [N

“;,i | 9/30/2(

|7360 ”Under Power Corp

JEIectrical Contractor

[ YT

||;ri H9I30I2(

(7360 WUnion Electrical Contractor, Inc.

”Electrical Contractor

B O I YT

”Pri “9/3012(

|7360 FNeII Electric Technology, Inc.

||Electrical Contractor

| O YT

||:ri “12/31/;

|7350 WNest Kendall Electric, Inc.

J'Electrical Contractor

T Jem I

”;'i Hm:m:




[ SearchALL ] [

MIAMI-DADE

RPQ NO

DPT Type
PW 7360

PW 7360
PW 7360
PW 7360

PW 7360
PW 7360

PW 7360
PW 7360
GS 7040

* Yellow Status=Inactive Contract

20060346

20060401
20060402
20060403
20080060

20080115

20080227

Project
Name
PTP Traffic Signal Insta

PTP Signal Improvement C
PTP Signal Improvement C
PTP Signal Improvement C

Traffic Signal Installat
Traffic signal loop inst

PTP Advance Traffic Mana
PTP Advance Traffic Mana

EMERGENCY - REPAIR MAGNE

i ‘Contact Vlew

Level 1 2' 3 Other Erﬁéréencv

Lea ] |

.. Goto Bottom

)

Project
Location

SW 67 Avenue and SW 44 Stre

Countywide
Countywide
Countywide

Countywide
Countywide

See Article #6 of the Speci
See Article #6 of the Speci
7831 NE MIAMI COURT

Work Type
Electrical - Traf

Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf
Electrical - Traf

Electrical Contra
Electrical Contra

Electrical Contra
Electrical Contra
Electrician, Mast

Totals:

__BacktoTop |

CSBE

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Capital Improvements Information System

All MCC Projects Awarded to AGC Electric Inc. - FEIN:
650806153

Notice
Date

12/21/2006

1/11/2007
1/11/2007
1/11/2007

6/5/2008
5/29/2008

12/18/2008
12/18/2008
12/24/2003



Dept Contract

PW 20060401

PW 20060402

PW 20060403
PW 20060346

PW 20080115

Type Contractor / Architect Name Date Rater
7360 AGC Electric Inc. 3/14/2008 Antonio
Edmead
7360 AGC Electric Inc. 3/17/2008 Antonio
Edmead
7360 AGC Electric inc. 3/17/2008 Antonio
Edmead
7360 AGC Electric Inc. 3/17/2008 Kevin
Rivera
7360 AGC Electric Inc. 1/30/2009 William
Salazar

Evaluation Count: 5 Contractors: 1

9

\ Capital Improvements Information System
| Contractor Evaluations Report

Period
Interim

Interim
Interim
Interim

Completion of
construction

Average Evaluation: 3.6
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Froripa DepARTMENT OF St

DivisioNn oF CORPORATIH

Home ContactUs  E-Filing Services  DocumentSearches ~ Forms H
Previous on List Next on List Return To List
Events No Name History

Detail by Entity Name
Florida Profit Corporation
AGC ELECTRIC, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number P97000072705

FEI Number 650806153

Date Filed 08/21/1997

State FL

Status ACTIVE

Last Event CANCEL ADM DISS/REV

Event Date Filed 10/19/2004
Event Effective Date NONE
Principal Address

2660 W79 STREET
HIALEAH FL 33016 US

Changed 01/17/2001

Mailing Address

2660 W 79 STREET
HIALEAH FL 33016 US

Changed 01/17/2001

Registered Agent Name & Address

CURBELO, TOMAS V
801 SW 172 TERRA
PEMBROKE PINES FL 33029 US

Name Changed: 01/14/2002
Address Changed: 01/14/2002

Officer/Director Detail
Name & Address
Title PD

CURBELO, TOMAS V




801 SW 172TH TERRACE
PEMBROKE PINES FL 33016

Title VP

GUZMAN, ENRIQUE |
14780 SW 98TH AVE.
MIAMI FL 33176

Title SD

DE LA SIERRA, PIERRETTE
2635 W. 81 STREET
HIALEAH FL 33016

Annual Reports

Report Year Filed Date

2006 01/04/2006
2007 01/05/2007
2008 01/06/2008

Document Images

01/06/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT
01/05/2007 - ANNUAL REPORT
01/04/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT
01/13/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT
10/19/2004 -- REINSTATEMENT
01/15/2003 - ANNUAL REPORT
10/15/2002 -- Off/Dir Resignation
01/14/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT
01/17/2001 -- ANNUAL REPORT
03/13/2000 - ANNUAL REPORT
05/06/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT
03/20/1998 - ANNUAL REPORT
03/12/1998 —~ ANNUAL REPORT

_ Viewimage in PDF format____

08/21/1997 - Domestic Profit Articles | .- Vie

Note: This is not official record. See documents if question or conflict.
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