Memorandum &

Date: April 8, 2014
Agenda Item No. 1(F)5

To: Honorable Chairwoman Rebeca Sosa
and Members, Board of C Zommissioners

From: Carlos A. Gimene £< Zﬂ
Mayor L

Subject: Sunset Review of County Boafa?fgr 2014 — Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board

In accordance with the provisions of Section 2-11.40 of the Code of Miami-Dade County, | am
transmitting the 2014 Sunset Review of County Boards Report for the Fire Prevention and Safety
Appeals Board. The Board approved the attached report at its meeting of January 23, 2014 and has
recommended the continuation of its board.

Genaro "Chip” Iglesias /
Deputy Mayor

mayor04014



Date: January 27, 2014

To: Carlos A, Gimenez
Mayor
From: Suzanne Gilmore .
Chairperson, Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
Subject: Sunset Review of'County' Boards. for 2014 - Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals

Board

Pursuant to Section 2-11.40 of the Code of Miami-Dade County, | am submitting the 2014 Sunset
Review of County Boards Report for the Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board for transmittal to the

Board of County Commissioners (BCC). The Board approved the attached report at its- meeting of
January 23, 2014 .

It is recommended that the BCC approve the continuation of the F'fre Prevention and Safety: Appeals
Board,

BACKGROUND

The current configuration of the Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board was created and established
In 1989 primarily as a means for the public to have a declsive voice In the decision-making process

regarding the application of fire codes and standards by the various fire departiments throughout Miami-
Dade County: The Board rules on decisions of the fire marshals, resolves conflicts in fire cods rules

1

on -afternatives fo fire codes, In both new and existing 'constructlon, and parforms other duties as

estabilshed in County code Section 14-48,

The Board fulfills the purpose for which it was established. That purpose continues to be a necessary
and important element in the overall program of responsive governance In the county.

Suzanne Gilmore
Board Chairperson



SUNSET REVIEW QUESTIONNAIRE
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY BOARDS
2014

l. GENERAL. INFORMATION
1. Name of Board reporting:

Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
2. Indicate number of board members, terms of offics, and number of vacancies:

- Number of Board Members: Thirteen (13), Seven (7) of which are appointed.
Terms of Offiee: Three (3) vears
Number of Vacancies; Six (6}

3. ldentify number of meetings and members’ attendance (Attach records 'reflecting
activity) from Jan. 1, 2012 through December 31, 2013:

Number of Meetings: Two |
Nurber of Meetings with a Quarum: Two (2)
Attendance Records: See Attachment 1 and 2

2012 (Attachment A)

January 28, 2012 — Regular meeting, no appeals to be heard (9 of 10 attended)

March 29, 2012 — Cancelled regular meeting — No appeals to be heard

May 31, 2012 ~ Cancelled regular meeting — No appeals to be heard

July 26, 2012 ~ Cancelled regular mesting — No appeals to be heard

September 27, 2012 — Cancelled regular meeting ~ No appeals to be heard

November 29, 2012 — Regular meeting ~ No appeals to be heard (10 of 10
attended)

2013 (Attachment B)

January 31, 2013 — Cancelled regular meeting — No appeals to be heard

March 28, 2013 — Cancelled regular meeting — 1 appeal to be heard, no quorum

May 30, 2013 - Cancelled regular meeting — 2 appeals to be heard, no quotum

July 25, 2013 - Cancslled regular meeting — 1 appeal fo be heard, no quorum

September 19, 2013 - Cancelled regular meeting — 1 appeal te be heard, no

quorum

November 21,.2013 ~ Regular meeting (6 of 8 attended} 2 appeals to be heard,
cancelled maeting, no quorum

December 10, 2013~ Cancelled Speclal Mesting — 2 appeals to be heard, no
quorum

4. What is the source of your funding?

Funds-come from the Miami-Dade County Fire Rescue / Fire Prevention Division
budget. '

There is & $110.00 flling fee which provides a partial source of funding.
5. Date of Board Creation: December 15, 1987, In its current form.

6. Attach a copy of the ordinance creating the Board (Please Include all subsequent
amendments).

Seo Attachment C



7.

9.

10.

Include the Board’s Mission Statement or state its purpose:

The Board hears and decides appeals of decisions of the Fire Marshals of all of the
Fire Departments in Mlami-Dade County.

Attach the Board's standard operating procedures, if any.
None

Attach a copy of the Board's By-Laws, If any.

None

Aftach a copy of the Board minutes approving the Sunset Review Questionnaire,
including a vote of the membership.

See Attachment D

EVALUATION CRITERIA

1.

5.

Is the Board serving the purpose for which it was created? (Please provide detailed
information)

Yes, the Board continues to function as a quasi-judicial Board as created in
accordance with the Code of Miami-Dade County, Section 14-46. A copy of the
Code is attached (Attachment 3).

Is the Board serving current community needs? (Please provide detailed information)

Yes, the Board is providing a vital service to the entire community and as defined by
the Code of Miari-Dade County, Florida, The Board hears and decides appeals of
decisions of the Fire Marshals of all of the Fire Departments in Miami-Dade County.

What are the Board's major accomplishments?
a. Last 24 months ‘

The Board reviewed 0 out of 4 appeals, due to lack of quorum
b. Since established (in current form December 15, 1987)

The Board is composed of a group of professionals from diverse backgrounds
with an exceptional level of expertise charged with and fuifilling the responsibility
to interpret consistently the Florida Fire Prevention Code, including but not
limited to the Life Safety Code and the Fire Prevention Code, for the entire
Miami-Dade County community, including all the municipalities in the County.

Is there any other board, either public or private, which would better serve the
function of this board?

No, the Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has quasi-judicial responsibilities
and duties spedifically mandated by Fiorida statutes and County Code. County Cods
Chapter 14 prohibits any other board or body from ruling on issues within the
jurisdiction of the Fire Prevention and Safety Appsals Board.

Should the ordinance creating the Board be amended fo better enable the Board to
serve the purpose for which it was created? (If "Yes", attach proposed changes)

4



SUNSET REVIEW QUESTIONNAIRE
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY BOARDS
2014

NO
. Should the Board’s membership requirements be modified?

NO

. What is the operating cost of the Board, both direct and indirect? (Report on FY 2012
and FY 2013)

The direct operating cost of the Board was $451.00 in 2012 and $140.00 in 2013 for
court reporting services.

Indirect operating cost was approximately $3,838 per year to administer the board,
for a total of $7730 for incidental expenses, such as postage.

. Describe the Board's performance measures developed to determine its own
effectiveness in achieving its stated goals.

The Fire Prevention Code is intended fo provide minimum standards and
performance measures with respect fo fire prevention and life safety standards. The
Board interprets the Code based on these standards. To date, no decision rendered
by the Board has been reversed by the Appellate Division of the Eleventh Judicial
Circuit.



JUSSald
pasnoxX=
jussqy

puafa

%00°001 Z9|EZU05) 0pJedny
Y iy P LQUBORA
UET0Ty aousImen

%00°00)

16:

%00°00} d
%00'001 o

F %007Q01L d
%00°001 d Rip3lgd OpUBLLY
%0099 3 uslyon EAl
%00°001 d 1BAA NG
%00°00L | d SUeg 'S S9SA|N
Wweated |Bunesiy [eweds| ZLoZez/Li ZL0Z/9ZIL

souepusy

mm:wmms

10 a1eg

aWeN

ogsia
LUOISSILULLILIO D

vieu v

ZL0zZ pieog sieaddy Ajojes pue uonusisld alld

QY023 JONVANILLY adv0d - QvOod 3HL 40 Md310




Wweseld
pasnaxg
Juesqy

d

puaba

Z9[EZUOY) ORJEOR

3
-

JEJBA]

o
v.

)
s

UBL0D) SoURIME |

JIBIBA -

butieq iy

SIOUI[IS) BULEZNG

WESBAL

Emnoh._os_ puoLiAey

BIpsld opueliny

usyo)d BNl

opn g

SUBY 'S STSAIN

w—mmwmro:soom;g_

WaoIad

souepusylY |

pelpaney

SLOZOLEZE
‘Buingely [ejoads |

| Sroznzine

POJPOUED "
- ELOZILTIEL

<hoziziie.
1 pejeaues |
Terogrsiie

mchmet.

SLOZ/BIL |
‘palieaues |

“eioziesss
pafiedues |

| evozivers

ﬂvoﬁ. wﬂwm

mvumau\m

m,vmﬂ.\.mﬂ -
vo:mu:wb
ﬂbﬁvﬂr

shupsa Jo |1k

SWEN

RIS

UOISSILIIIIOD

g JueLuyIEy

eLoZ ﬁ._.mom sjeaddy Aj9jeg pue UOJUdADId o1
QHOOTE SONVANILLY Quv0og - uvod FHL S0 M¥310




Attachment C

Applicable Sections of Article III, Sect. 14, Code of Miami-Dade County

Sec, 14-43. Resolution of conflict of laws,

(A) In the event of a conflict between (i) the requirements of the South Florida Building
Code, as same may be amended from time to time, and (ii) the requirements of the South -
Florida Fire Prevention Code and this article, as all of same may be amended from time
to time, the conflict shall be resolved by agreement between the chief building code
enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or his designee, and the chief fire code
enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or his designee, in favor of the requirement of
either the South Florida Building Code or the South Florida Fire Prevention Code or this
article which provides the greatest degree of life safety or alternatives which would
provide an equivalent degree of life safety and equivalent method of construction.

(B) Any decision made by the chief building code enforcement official of the
jurisdietion, or his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of the
jurisdiction, or his designee, may be appealed to the Dade County Fire Prevention and
Safety Appeals Board,

(1) Hthe decision of the chief building code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or
his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or his
designee, is to apply the provisions of either the South Florida Building Code or the
South Florida Fire Prevention Code or this article, the Dade County Fire Prevention and
Safety Appeals Board may not alter the decision unless the Dade County Fire Prevention
and Safety Appeals Board determines that the application of the South Florida Building
Code or the South Florida Fire Prevention Code or this article is not reasonable.

(2) Ifthe decision of the chief building code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or
his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, ot his
designee, is to adopt an alternative to the South Florida Building Code, South Florida Fire
Prevention Code, and this article, the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals
Board shall give due regard to the decision rendered by the aforesaid officials and may
modify that decision if the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
adopts a better altetnative, taking into consideration all relevant circumstances,

(3) Inany case in which the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
adopts alternatives to the decision of the chief building code enforcement official of the
jurisdiction, or his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of the
jurisdiction, ot his designee, such alternatives shall provide a degree of life safety and
method of construction equivalent to the degree of life safety and method of construction
provided by the decision of the aforesaid building code and fire code enforcement
officials.

(C) Inthe event that the chief building code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or
his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of the jurisdiction, or his
designee, are unable to agree on a resolution of the conflict between the requirements of
(i) the South Florida Building Code and (ii) the South Florida Fire Prevention Code and
this article, the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board shall resolve the
conflict in favor of the requirement which provides the greatest degreeof life safety or
alternatives which would provide an equivalent degree of life safety and an equivalent
method of constroction.



Attachment C

(D) In the event of any conflict between a requirement of (i) this article or the South
Florida Fire Prevention Code and (ii) a requirement of Chapter 633, Florida Statutes, as
amended from time to time, or the rules promulgated by the State Fire Marshal pursuant
to Chapter 633, Florida Statutes, as amended from time to time, or the rules promulgated
by the State Five Marshal pursuant to Chapter 633, Florida Statutes, as said rules may be
amended from time to time, the provision which established the most stringent standard
shall prevail,

(B} Tn the event of any conflict between a provision of (i) this article or the South
Florida Fire Prevention Code and (i) a provision of any other County or municipal
ordinance, code or regulation, the provisions of subsections (A), (B} and (C) shall apply
if the confliet is with a requirement of the South Florida Building Code, or, if the conflict
is with a provision other than the South Florida Building Code, then the provision which
establishes the most stringent standard shall prevail.

(Ord. No, 87-89, § 3, 12-15-87)

Sec. 14-46, Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board.

(A) Established. There is hereby created and established the Dade County Fire
Prevention and Safety Appeals Board.

(B) Membership. This Board shall consist of thirteen (13) members appointed by the
County Commission. In order to secure representative membership upon the Board, the
Commission shall appoint one (1) architect, one (1) engineer, one (1) property manager,
one (1) representative from the fuel industry, one (1) representative from the fire
insurance industry, one (1) licensed general contractor possessing a current certificate of
competency, two (2) persons who are serving different jurisdictions in the fire fighting
serviceof such jurisdictions, the County Manager or his designee, one (1) representative
of the Dade County League of Cities, Inc., one (1) safety engineer certified by a
professional safety engineering society, one (1) city or county administrator, and one (1)
educator who has expertise in the development of a fire science curriculum. Three (3)
membets shall be appointed for a term of one (1) year, three (3) members shall be _
appointed for a term of two (2) years, and three (3) members shall be appointed for a term
of three (3) years. Theteafter, all members shall be appointed for a term of three (3)
years.

(1} When the jurisdiction of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
is exercised pursuant to Section 14-46(D)(2) of the Code of Metropolitan Dade County,
Florida, with respect to those duties and responsibilities of the local administrative Board
specifically described in Section 553.73(8)(c), Florida Statutes, as amended from time to
time, the membership of the Board shall consist of the eleven (11) members set forth in
Section 14-46(B) above as well as the following eleven (11) members of the Dade
County Board of Rules and Appeals who shall be designated by the Chairman of the
Dade County Board of Rules and Appeals:

(i) One (1) nonprofessional person;

(i) Two (2) representatives of the fire service;

(ili) One {1) master plumber;

(iv) One (1) mechanical engineer;

(v} One (1) master electrician;

(vi) One (1) structural engiveer;



Attachment C

(vii) One (1) developer;

(viti) Two (2) general confractors;

(ix) One (1) architect.

The aforesaid persons in (i) through (ix) shall be voting ex officio members of the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board only when the jurisdiction of the
Board is exercised as set forth hereinabove for those duties and responsibilities set forth
in Section 553.73(8)(c), Florida Statutes, as amended from time to time. Service on the
Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board by members of the Dade County
Board of Rules and Appeals ex officio as set forth above shall not be deemed to be
service on two (2) County Boards simultaneously for the purposes of Section 2-11.38 of
the Code of Metropolitan Dade County, Florida.

(C) Organization of the Board; quorum; Secretary. The members of the Board shall
elect a chairperson and such other officets as may be deemed necessary or desirable, all
of whom shall serve at the will of the Board. A majority vote of the members present
shall be necessary to take any action, Seven (7) members of the Board shall constitute a
quorum necessaty to hold a meeting and take any action. The Director of the
Metropolitan Dade County Fire Department or his designee shall be Secretary of the
Board and shall be responsible for the custody of all minutes and records of the Board.
The Secretary of the Board shall not be entitled to vote on any matter before the Board by
reason of holding the office of Secretary. The Chairperson or his designee may call
meetings of the Board; seven (7) members may call a meeting upon signinga written
notice; and the Board at any meeting may call meetings for any future dates. Minutes
shall be kept of all meetings of the Board,

(1) When the jutisdiction of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
is exercised as set forth in (B)(1) above: A majority vote of the twenty-two (22) members
. present shall be necessary to take any action; the presence of twelve (12) of the twenty-
two (22) members shall constitute a quorum necessary to hold a meeting and take any
action; and twelve (12) members may call a meeting upon signing a writen notice. In afl
other respects the organization of the Dade County Fire Prevention and SafetyAppeals
Board shall remain the same as set forth in (C) above,

[(2) Reserved.}

(D) Duties and powers of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board,
The Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board shall have the following
duties, functions, powers, and responsibilities:

(1) To exclusively hear and detetmine appeals by any person aggrieved by any action or
decision of any fire official of any jurisdiction in Dade County, Florida, with respect to
this article, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, or any municipal ordinance, code, or
regulation which regulates fire prevention or fire safety. Notwithstanding any provision
of the Code of Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention
Code, any municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or
municipal officer, agent, employee or Board, except as provided for code enforcement by
Chapter 162, Florida Statutes, or by Chapter 8CC of the Code of Metropolitan Dade
County, Florida, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade County Fire
Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine pursuant to
this subsection. The Board shall have the power and authority to affirm, modify, or
reverse the action or decision which was appealed.

10



Attachment C

(2) To exclusively perform the duties and responsibilitics of the local administrative
Board described in Section 553.73(8)(b) and Section 553.73(8)(c), Florida Statutes, as all
of same may be amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the Code
of Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any
municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal
officer, agent, employee or Board, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursuant to this subsection, The Board shall have the power and authority to adopt
alternatives and resolve conflicts as provided by the aforesaid provisions of Florida law,
as amended from time to time,

(3) To exclusively hear and determine appeals by any person aggrieved by the decisions
or actions of the chief fire official, or his designee, of any jurisdiction in Dade County,
Florida, with respect to existing buildings as provided by Section 633.025(8), Florida
Statutes, as amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the Code of
Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any
municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal
officer, agent, employee or Board, may hear or determine arry matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursuant to this subsection, The Board shall have the power and authority to affirm,
modify, or reverse the action of decision which was appealed.

(4) To exclusively perform the duties of the local authority as set forth in Section
633.022(2)(b), Flotida Statutes, as amended from time to time, by authorizing
alternatives to the uniform fire safety standards as set forth in Section 633.022(2)(b),
Florida Statutes, as amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the
Code of Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any
municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal
officer, agent, employee or Board, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursaant to this subsection. The Boatd shall have the power and authority to adopt
alternatives as provided by the aforesaid provision of Florida law, as amended from time
to time.

(5) 'To exclusively perform the duties of all jurisdictions with fire safety responsibilities
in Dade County, Florida,-as set forth in Section 633.025(5), Flotida Statutes, as amended
from time to time, by establishing alternative requirements to the requirements of this
article, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, or other more stringent fire safety
standards adopted by a municipality, as set forth in Section 633.025(5), Florida Statutes,
as same may be amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the Code
of Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Flotida Fire Prevention Code, any
municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal -
officer, agent, employee or Board, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursuant to this subsection. The Board shall have the power and avthority to adopt
alternative requirements as provided by the aforesaid provision of Florida law, as
amended from time to time.

(6) To exclusively hear and determine appeals by any person aggrieved by the actions or
decisions of the South Florida Fire Prevention Code Enforcement Officer established by

11



Attachment C

this article, as amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the Code of
Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any
nmnicipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal
officer, agent, employee or Board, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursuant to this subsection, The Boatd shall have the power and authority to affirm,
modify, or reverse the action or decision which was appealed.

(7) Upon the request of any chief fire official or his designee of any jurisdiction in Dade
County, Flotida, to render advice to the requesting party on any fire safety or fire
prevention matters in Dade County, Florida,

(8) To exclusively hear and determine, after notice to municipality, whether or not fire
safety standards adopted by a municipality are more stringent than the fire safety
standards set forth in this article and the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, as all of
same are amended from time to time. Notwithstanding any provision of the Code of
Metropolitan Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any
municipal ordinance, or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal
officer, agent, employse or Board, may hear or determine any matter which the Dade
County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine
pursuant to this subsection. The Board shall have the power and authority to order the
chief fire official, or his designee, of the municipality or the South Florida Fire
Prevention Code Enforcement Officer, or both, to enforce the five safety standards which
are the most stringent.

(9} To exclusively hear and determine, after notice of the affected County department or
County Board, whether or not a provision of the Code of Metropolitan Dade County,
Florida, other than the South Florida Building Code, conflicts with the provisions of this
article or the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, as all of same may be amended from
time to time, and, if such conflict exists, to determine which provision established the
most stringent standard, Notwithstanding any provision of the Code of Metropolitan
Dade County, Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any municipal ordinance,
or any other County ordinance, no other County or municipal officer, agent, employee or
Board, may hear and determine any matter which the Dade County Fire Prevention and
Safety Appeals Board has the power to hear and determine pursuant to this subsection.
The Board shall have the power and authority to order the chief fire officials, or their
designees, of all jurisdiction in Dade County, Florida, and the South Florida Fire
Prevention Code Enforcement Officer, to enforce the fire safety standards which are the
most stringent.

(10) Upon the request of the Board of County Cormmnissioners, to render advice to the
Board of County Commissioners or such other persons as the Board of County
Commissioners may direct, on any fire prevention or fire safety matters in Dade County,
Florida,

(11) To issue subpoenas to compel the presence of a witness or documents or other
items at any proceeding of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board
authorized under this article or the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, as all of same -
may be amended from time to time.

{12) To adopt, promulgate, amend and rescind such rules of procedure and evidence as
may be necessary to exercise the Board's anthority, provided, however, that no such rules

12



Attachment C

shall conflict with the provisions of this article or the South Florida Fire Prevention Code,
as all of same may be amended from time fo time,

(13) The powers enumerated in this section shall be in addition to and not a limitation of
or in derogation of any other powers granted to the Dade County Fire Prevention and
Safety Appeals Board by any other provision of this article, the South Florida Fire
Prevention Code, or by State law, rule or regulation, as all of same may be amended from
time fo time, Notwithstanding any provision of the Code of Meftropolitan Dade County,
Florida, the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, any municipal ordinance or any other
County ordinance, except as provided in subsection (1) herein, no other County or
municipal officer, agent, employee or Board shall exercise any of the powers granted to
the Dade County Fire Provention and Safety Appeals Board by this article, the South
Florida Fire Prevention Code or by State law, mile, or regulation, as all of same may be
amended from time to time,

(14) To designate one (1) or more persons to be members of one (1) or more technical
advisory panels to advise the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board on
technical matters related to fire provention or fire safety, The members of such panels
shall be persons technically skilled and qualified to render advice on particular matters of
fire prevention or fire safety pending before the Board. The members shall setve at the
will of the Board and shall furnish advice and information of a technical nature to the
Board for so long a petiod of time as the Board may request it. All such advice and
information given by the panel or any member thereof shall be in the form of testimony
either in person or by deposition before the Board at a regularly scheduled meeting and
subject to cross-examination at the deposition and meeting by any interested party. The
members of the panels shail not be deemed County officers or employees. Members of
the panels may be compensated by the County.

(15) To require and administer caths or affirmations to witnesses in any proceeding of
the Board,

{Ord. No. 87-89, § 3, 12-15-87; Ord. No. 94-7, § 1, 1-18-94)

Annotation-CAQO 76-39.

Sec. 14-48. Appeals from actions or decisions.

Any person aggrieved by any action or decision described in Section 14-46(D)(1), (2),
(3), (D), (5), (6), (8), and (9) of this Code may appeal to the Dade County Fire Prevention
and Safety Appeals Board by filing with the Secretary of said Board a written notice of
appeal within fifteen (15) days after the date of the action or decision which is the subject
of the appeal. Filing of a written notice of appeal shall not stay the effect of any such
action or decision which is the subject to the appeal. The written notice of appeal shall set
forth concisely the date and nature of the action or decision to be teviewed as well as the
reasons or grounds for the appeal. The Secretary of the Board shall set each such appeal
for hearing at the earliest practicable Board meeting date available and shall provide
written or oral notice of the hearing to the appellant and to the person whose action or
decision is the subject of the appeal. The Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety
Appeals Board shall hear and consider allfacts material and relevant to the appeal and
shall render a decision as soon as reasonably practicable. Irrelevant, immaterial or unduly
repetitious evidence of a type commonly relied upon by reasonably prudent persons in
the conduct of their affaits shall be admissible, whether or not such evidence would be

13



Attachment C

admissible in a trial in the courts of Florida. Any patt of the evidence may be received in
written form, and all testimony of parties and witnesses shall be made under oath or
affirmation. Hearsay evidence may be used for the purpose of supplementing or
explaining other evidence, but it shall not be sufficient in itself to support a decision of
the Board unless it would be admissible over objection in civil actions. The Chairperson
of the Board or the attorney of the Board or a Notary Public shall have the power to
administer oaths or affirmations. Subpoenas may be issued by the Chairperson of the
Board or another member of the Board designated by the Chairperson, upon the written
request of any partyor upon the Chairperson's or Board's own motion, to cotapel the
presence of a witness or documents or other items af any proceeding of the Board
authorized under this article ot the South Florida Fire Prevention Code, as all of same
may be amended from time to time. The Chairperson of the Board or another member of
the Board designated by the Chairperson, may permit discovery, on the written request of
any patty or upon the Board's own motion, by any means available to the courts and in
the manner provided in the Florida Rules of Civil Procedure, including the imposition of
sanctions, except contempt, Any person subject to a subpoena may, before compliance
and on timely petition, request the Board to invalidate the subpoena on the grounds that it
was not lawfully issued, is unreasonably broad in scope, or requires the production of
irrelevant material, Any party or the Board may seek enforcement of a subpoena, order
directing discovery, or order imposing sanctions issued hereunder by filing a petition for
enforcement in the Citcuit Court of Dade County, Florida. A failure to comply with an
order of the Court shall result in a finding of contempt, However, no person shall be in
contempt while a subpoena is being challenged as provided herein. The Court may award
to the prevailing party all or part of the costs and attorneys fees incurred in obtaining the
Court order. A party shall have the opportunity to respond, to present evidence and
argument on all issues involved, conduct cross-examination and submit rebuttal evidence.
‘When appropriate, the general public may be given an opportunity to present evidence. If
the Board intends to consider such evidence, then all parties shall be given an opportunity
to cross-examine, challenge, and rebut the evidence. When official recognition is
requested, the parties shall be notified and given an opportunity fo examine and contest
the matter requested to be officially recognized. All decisions of the Board, pursuant to
Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, as amended from time totime, shall be in writing and be
binding upon all persons but shall not limit the authority of the State Fire Marshal
pursuant to Section 633,161, Florida Statutes, as amended from time to time, All
decisions of the Board, pursuant to Section 553,73, Florida Statutes, as amended from
time to time, of general application shall be indexed by the Secretary of the Board by
building and fire code sections and shall be available for inspection and copying during
normal business hours, Similarly, all decisions ofthe chief building code enforcement
official of the jurisdiction, or his designee, and the chief fire code enforcement official of
the jurisdiction, or his designee, pursuant to Section 553.73, Florida Statutes, as amended
from time to time, shall be in writing and be binding upon all persons but shall not limit
the authority of the State Fire Marshal pursuant to Section 633,161, Florida Statutes, as
amended from time to time, and said decisions of general application shall be indexed by
the Secretary of the Board by building and fire code section and shall be available for
inspection and copying during normal business hours, All decisions of the Board shall be
in writing, shall set forth the reasons for the decision, and shall be signed by the

14



Aftachment C

Chairperson of the Board or other member of the Board designated by the Chairperson or
in the absence of the Chairperson, a member of the Board designated by the Board. The
decision of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board shall constitute
final administrative review and no rehearing or reconsideration shall be considered. Any
person aggrieved by any decision of the Dade County Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals
Board on an appeal may seek judicial review in accordance with the Florida Rules of
Appellate Procedure.

(Ord. No. 87-89, § 3, 12-15-87)

15



Attachment D

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
FIRE PREVENTION AND SAFETY APPEALS BOARD
MEETING MINUTES
January 23, 2014

The Fire Prevention and Safety Appeaf§ Board meeting was held on Thursday, January
23, 2014, in conference room 2-001 of the Training Building at the Miami-Dade Fire
Rescue Department Headquarters, 9300 NW 41 Street, Doral, Florida.

Members Present  Suzanne Gilmore, Chalrperson
Ricardo Gonzalez, Co-Chairperson
Raymond McDonald
Armando Pledra
Ulyses S. Banks
Al Darrihg
Bui Wei

All Members Present
Staff Present Carla Crook, Secretary to the Board
Michael Valdes, Assistant County Attorney

The meeting was called to order by Mr. Gonzalez at approximately at 9:31am.

There was a roll call of the Board Members. There was a quorum of seven persons.

Business meeting:

Motion to approve the minutes of the November 29, 2012 meeting was made by Mr.
Piedra-and seconded by Ms. Glimore. The motion carried unanimously by acclamation.

Motion to approve the 2014 meeting dates with stipulation that the January 3p

meeting be stricken, was made by Ms, Gilmore and was seconded by Mr. Piedra, The
motion carried unanimously by acclamation,

16



Flre Prevantion and Safety Appeals Board — January 26, 2012

The Sunset Review of County Boards for 2014 Questionnalre was reviewed by the Board
Members. Motion to accept the questionnalire as presented was made by Ms. Gilmore
and seconded by Mr. Banks. The motion carriad unanimously by acclamation,

New Business:

Motion to elect Ms. Suzanne Gilmore as the new Chairperson was made by Mr,
Gonzalez and was seconded by Mr, McDonald.

" There was a roll call taken of the Appellant(s) and Appei ee(s) Those persons who
Intended to testify were sworn in by the court reporter :

For SkyLofts Candominiums Association lnc. the Appellant was representad by Gary B.
_Goldman, Esa.

For Miami Dade Fire Rescue Department, the Appeilea was represented by Code

Enforcement Officer’s, Michael Marchl nd Emilio Rodnguez

Regular Appeal(s)

SkylLofts Condommmm Assocratlon Inc. &

The Appellant testiﬁed that: The department’s requlrement of the smoke detectors in
the individual units be mspeq:ted and, certlfled by the association, that they are in
working order. At s the bellef of the appeiiant that the applicable codes only require
certlfication of the common area smoke detectors under the care and control of the
assoc!atfon e =

The Appeltee, The Miami Dé'de Fire Restue Department, testifled that: The smoke
detectors in the lndiwdual umts are considered common area and therefore the
responsibllity of the condomtmum association. Miami Dade Fire Rescue Department is
requiring malntenance records for all smoke detectors located in common areas.

A motion was made by Mr. Gonzalez to deny the appeal and was seconded by Ms.
Gilmore. Six votes In favor, one against, the motion carried. ’

Emergency Appeal(s}

None

17



Fire Prevention and Safety Appeals Board — January 26, 2012

Additional Business

A matlon to have a plaque made for resigned Chairperson Larry Cohen was made by Mr.
Gonzalez and seconded by Mr. Darring.

Request was made by Mr. Piedra to order and distrlbute the latest Florida Fire
Prevention Book for each member for future reference 3

There being no other businéss, the meeting wag:gd]:«;a?néa'f'a"’t;.gpproximateiy 10:47 a.m,

X Januiary 24, 2014
Lt. Carla Crook, Secretary of the Board - Date’s.

i,

18



