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Override

OFFICIAL FILE Copy
CLERK OF THE BOARD

NTY COMMISSIONER
MIAMIDADE COUNTY, FLORIDJS!\

RESOLUTION NO  R-244-07

——RESOLUTION APPROVING A PROJECT AWARD
RECOMMENDATION IN THE AMOUNT OF $179,692.00 BETWEEN
RAYDAN ELECTRIC, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FOR THE
PEOPLE’S TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP) PROJECT ENTITLED
TRAFFIC SIGNAL INSTALLATIONS AT EAST 4 AVENUE AND
EAST 32 STREET IN COMMISSION DISTRICTS 6 AND 13
(PROJECT - CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ NO. 20060335)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the accompanying

memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board approves the
Project Award Recommendation in the amount of $179,692.00 between Raydan Electric, Inc.
and Miami-Dade County for the People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) proj;ect entitled Traffic
Signal Installations at East 4 Avenue and East 32 Street in Commission Districts 6 and 13
(Project — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ No. 20060335) in substantially the form attached hereto and

made a part hereof.



9 MEMORANDUM

‘(Revised)

TO - Honorable; Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro DATE: March 6, 2007
' v ;.a.nd Membersf;‘- Board of County Commissioners

SUBJECT: Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1)(D)

. County

Please note any items checked.

“4-Day Rule” (“3-Day Rule” for committees) applicab‘le if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to pubhc
hearing

: DecreaSes revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required |
| Statement of fiscal impaet_ required
Bid waiver requiring County Manager;s written recommendatioii

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing :

Housekeeping item (no policy decision requi_red)

No committee review

\rd
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The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner Rebeca Sosa , who
moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner Dennis C. Moss

and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows: ' ‘-

Bruno A. Barreiro, Chairman aye

: Barbara J. Jordan, Vice-Chairwoman aye
Jose "Pepe" Diaz aye Audrey M. Edmonson aye
Carlos A. Gimenez aye Sally A. Heyman aye
Joe A. Martinez aye Dennis C. Moss aye
Dorrin D. Rolle aye Natacha Seijas aye
Katy Sorenson aye Rebeca Sosa aye

Sen. Javier D. Souto aye

The Chairperson thereupoﬁ declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this
6™ day of March, 2007. This resolution shall become effective as follows: (1) ten (10)
days after the date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall
become effective only upon an override by this Board, and (2) either i) the Citizens'
Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response to the
CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote

of the Commission's membership and such reaffirmation becomes final.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

BY ITS BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS
4, HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK
Approved by County Attorney as§=Z, { -+ ;;l? By: KAY SE}LLEVAN
to form and legal sufficiency. 328 g v Y V4 Deputy Clerk -
Bruce Libhaber
uy

[l



R AM " 7 )
Memorandum :‘ 5
Date: January 3, 2007 : -

[a)

To: David Tinder, P.E. ' . Ty
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Coordinator '
Public Y{orks Department

From:

Recommendation of Award for:

RPQ No. 20060335 - CICC 7360-0/08
PTP — Traffic Signal Installations at
East 4" Avenue and 32" Street
(Contractor — Raydan Electric, Inc.)

Subject:

The attached People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) contract is being recommended for award. The
contractor, Raydan Electric, Inc., is currently performing work for the Public Works Department (PWD)
at an above satisfactory level as reported by the Project Manager. Additionally, the Office of Capital
‘Improvement (OCI) database lists a total of 11 awarded contracts for Raydan Electric, inc., with PWD.
The referenced database also lists a total of four (4) contractor performance evaluations, all with above
satisfactory ratings. The remaining contracts are still under construction or in the preliminary stages
and do not yet have evaluations on file.

The Project Manager for the aforementioned project will be Mr. Oscar Rubio.

Therefore, please take the necessary action to obtain approval to award the contract, from the Citizens" B
Independent Transportation Trust.

MM:lc
Attachments

cc: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
Antonio Cotarelo, P.E., PWD
Octavio Marin, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Rodney McMillian, PWD (w/o attachment)
Joaquin Urrechaga, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Oscar Rubio, P.E., PWD (w/o attachment)
Angelica De Limas, OCI (w/o attachment)
Veronica Robinson, DBD (w/o attachment)
Clerk of the Board
Project File
Reading File



Memorandum "'”3

Date: March 6, 2007
' Agenda Item No.8(P)(1)(D)
To: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro
S and Members, Board of @ounty Commissioners
From:: George M. Burgess
County Manager ~ /
Subject: Project Award Recommendation in the Amount of $179,692.00 Between Raydan

Electric, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People's Transportation Plan (PTP)
Project Entitled Traffic Signal Installation at East 4 Avenue and East 32 Street in
Commission Districts 6 and 13 (Project — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ No. 20060335)

RECOMMENDATION

The attached Project Award Recommendation for the Traffic Signal Installation at East 4 Avenue and
East 32 Street in Commission Districts 6 and 13 (Project — CICC 7360-0/08 RPQ No. 20060335), in the
amount of $179,692.00, between Raydan Electric, Inc. and Miami-Dade County has been prepared by
the Public Works Department (PWD) and is recommended for approval. Proceeds from the Charter
County Transit System Sales Surtax (the Surtax) will be used to fund this project, therefore, approval by
the Board of County Commissioners (BCC) and Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) is
required.

BACKGROUND

In an effort to accelerate the continued success of the People’'s Transportation Plan (PTP)
Neighborhood Improvements initiative, PWD is taking advantage of various contracting mechanisms,
such as the subject Miscellaneous Construction Contracting (MCC) process available under the Office
of Capital Improvements (OCI) contract CICC 7360-0/08. Through this process, PWD forwards the
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ), by way of facsimile transmission and US-mail, to a pool of firms
that have registered with OCI for the subject trade. Additionally, PWD advertises the project in the Daily
Business Review as well as providing courtesy notifications in the Diario De Las Americas, Miami
Herald, Miami Times, Haiti en Marche, Le Floridien, and Kiskeya Herald. Interested contractors
prepare their bids according to the Job Order Contracting (JOC) process, whereby the County
establishes unit prices for the pay items in accordance with industry averages. The contractors submit
their bid as an overall percentage factor of the pricing established by the County. The project award
evaluation is based upon the lowest percentage submitted by the responsive, responsible bidder for the
project.

PWD staff submitted the referenced project to the Department of Business Development's (DBD)
Réview Committee on November 29, 2006. The Review Committee reviewed and recommended no
contract measures for RPQ 20060335. However, in order to expedite the project and in aniticipation of
receiving no contract measures from the Review Committee, PWD issued an RPQ on October 27,
2006, for a Traffic Signal Installation Contract and forwarded it to a list of 12 pre-registered firms from
the OCI database as noted above. Five (5) firms purchased contract documents and four (4) firms
proffered a bid. However, All Quality Electrical Services, Inc. and EDCA, Inc. bids were declared non-
responsive because the firms failed to provide a percentage factor bid as required in the RPQ. As a
result, on December 20, 2006, PWD issued a recommendation of award for RPQ 20060335 with a -
percentage factor of 1.20 to Raydan Electric, Inc. with the stipulation that approval of this project must
be obtained from the BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated with the funding source.



Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro
and Members, Board of County Commissioners
Page 2

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all supervision, |

labor, required materials, and equipment and tools to perform traffic signal installation(s) including any
ancillary work at the intersection of East 4 Avenue and East 32 Street. The contractor shall furnish and
install grounding electrodes, conduits, pull boxes, foundations, eight (8) pedestrian signal heads and.
buttons with signs, overhead signs (internally llluminated LED signs), mounting hardware, signal cable,
power cable and power services. Additional work to be performed includes installing seven (7) vehicle
detection loops, four (4) traffic signal poles, signage, new pavement markings, and removing existing

signs, and old pavement markings in conflict with the proposed work. The base contract amount is

$154,440.00, but the total allocated amount is $179,692.00, which is inclusive of the contingency and
dedicated allowances. -

CONTRACTOR PERFORMANCE

The contractor, Raydan Electric, Inc., is currently performing work for PWD at an above
satisfactory level as reported by the Project Manager. PWD has reviewed the OCI| database and
found 11 awarded contracts for Raydan Electric, Inc., with PWD. The referenced database also
lists a total of four (4) contractor performance evaluations, all with above satisfactory ratings.
The remaining contracts are still under construction or in the preliminary stages and do not yet
have evaluations on file.

Following PWD’s standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-
construction meeting will be scheduled. Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff
person in PWD will continue to be the PTP Coordinator, Mr. David Tinder, P.E. Following

completion of the award process, the project will be assigned to Mr. Oscar Rubio, P.E., Project g

Manager, for day to day responsibilities.

According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, Raydan Electric, Inc.,
Company Principals are: Ramon Reyes, Helen Reyes and Lazaro L. Hernandez and the
Company’s address is listed as: 4100 S.W. 94" Avenue, Miami, Florida 33165.

FISCAL IMPACT

The fiscal impact will be approximately $179,692.00 and will be funded from the Surtax. The proposed
improvements qualify under the allowable work categories included in the PTP Neighborhood
Improvements Section. Specific funding for this project will be allocated from the Commission Districts
6 and 13 PTR yearly allogations.

1R

Assistant County Mar!ager Date ‘

Neas’



MIAMIDAD

ADA Coordination

Agenda Coordination

Animal Services

Art in Public Places

Audit and Management Services
Aviation

Building

Building Code Compliance

Business Development

Capital Improvements

Citizens’ lndependeanransppnation Trust
Commission on Ethics and Public Trust
Communications

Community Action Agency

o
Community & Economic Development

Community Refations

Consumer Services

Corrections & Rehabilitation

Cultural Affairs

Elections

Emergency Management

Employee Relations

Empowemment Trust

Enterprise Technology Services

Environmental Resources Management

Fair Employment Practices

Finance

Fire Rescue

General Services Admiﬁislration

Government Information Center

Historic Preservation

Homeless Trust

Housing Agency

Housing Finance Authority

Human Services

Independent Review Panel
ional Trade C¢

Juvenile Services

Medical Examiner

Metro-Miami Action Plan
Metropolitan Planning Organization
Park and Recreation

., Planning and Zoning

Police

Procurement Management

Property Appraisal

Public Library System

Public Works -

Safe Neighborhood Parks

Seaport

Solid Waste Management

Team Metro

Transit

Task Force on Urban Economic Revitalization
Vizcaya Museum And Gardens

Water & Sewer

Public Works

111 NW 1st Street ® Suite 1510

Miami, Florida 33128-1970

December 20, 2006 T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-293 1

CERTIFIED MAIL No. miamidade.gov
7005 3110 0002 0276 4992

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No. L
305-207-6161; 305-345-5343

Mr. Ramon Reyes
Raydan Electrlc Inc.
4100 S.W. 94" Avenue
Miami, Florida 33165

Re: Recommendation of Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No.: 20060335 - CICC 7360-0/08
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP)
Traffic Slgnal Installation(s) at
East 4" Avenue and East 32" Street

Dear Mr. Reyes:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been
recommended for award for the above referenced RPQ based on
your Price Quotation submitted on Wednesday, November 29, 2006.
The total RPQ amount is one hundred seventy-nine thousand six
hundred ninety-two dollars and zero cents ($179,692.00). This
includes a base contract amount of one hundred fifty-four thousand
four hundred forty dollars and zero cents ($154,440.00), a
contingency amount of fifteen thousand four hundred forty-four
dollars and zero cents ($15,444.00), and dedicated allowances
totaling nine thousand eight hundred eight dollars and zero cents
($9,808.00). The contract duration is established as 120-calendar
days. However, the award is contingent upon the submission of the
required items listed below:

1. Copies of current insurance certificates.
2. Copies of required license(s).

The preceding documents are required as outlined within Contract
CICC-7360-0/08 and to be submitted within 10 business days. Failure
to submit the document(s) within the specified time, or, any extensmn
granted, will result in the award bemg rescing : s




Page 2
Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20060335

Subsequent to the review and approval of the aforementioned documents, you are

required to obtain the required permits in the time stipulated in the RPQ. Upon

obtaining the permit(s), a copy(s) must be submitted to the Project Manager prior to
commencement of work. No work is to be performed without.a permit unless the
Project Manager issues a written directive to proceed without permit(s). After receipt
of the permits the Project Manager will schedule a Pre-Construction Conference and
issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the performance of the work.

This letter will also serve as a reminder that all work must be performed according to
the scope of work and contract’s terms and conditions, all permits and inspections and
in accordarice with all applicable Federal, State and local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit
System Sales Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade
County may be used to pay for all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award
of this contract shall be effective and thereby give rise to a contractual relationship
with the County unless and until the following have occurred: 1) the County
Commission awards the contract, and such award becomes final (either by expiration
of 10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by Commission override of
a veto); and 2) either i) the Citizens' Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) has
approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT’s disapproval, the County Commission
re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission’s membership and
such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Ms. Angelica De Limas, OCI office, at (305) 375-2606 to insure
that your file is complete for award consideration.

Should you have any questions please contact me at (305) 375-2930.

Sincerely,

ic Works Department

MM:lc

cC: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD, Roger Hernstadt, OCI, Marsha Jackman, DBD, Antonio Cotarelo,
P.E., PWD, Octavio Marin, P.E., PWD, Joaquin Urrechaga, P.E., PWD, Rodney McMillian,
PWD, Luis O. Perez, P.E., PWD, Angelica De Limas, OCIl, Orky Rodriguez, PWD, Marietta
Gutierrez, PWD, Traci Adams-Parish, DBD, Patrice King, DBD, Veronica Robinson, DBD, Clerk
of the Board, Reading File, Project File



BID SUMMARY SHEET

'CONTRACT NO. CICC-7360-0/08
RPQ NO.: 20060335
PWD CSS ENG: Luis O. Perez

BID VALIDITY: [0 120 [J 180
(Select One)

BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE: November 29, 2006
BID OPENING DATE: November 29, 2006

PROJECT NAME: People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Slgnal -
East 4" Avenue and East 32" Street _

COST ESTIMATE: $140,400.00

CSBE CONTRACT MEASURE: Not Applicable
ADDENDUM (No. issued): 0

REQUEST FOR INFORMATION (No. issued): 0

BIDDERS Apparent Low PROFFERED BID

. Bidder - cggﬂnsmcng%ls S MONIES Remarks
Firm Position U )
Telephone No.. :

Under Power Corp.
305-468-9900

Raydan Electric, Inc. i. 20
305-345-5343 '

All Quality Electrical Services, Inc. _ 75
305-968-7832 12¢ 362" |
EDCA, Inc. , -
305-255-8446 4372505,
Mastec North America, Inc. . _’L 45

954-587-1700

Revised 11/29/2006 Page 1 of 1




PROPOSALS LOG SHEET

BID NUMBER: 20060335 -

TITLE: PTP TRAFFIC SIGNAL

QUALIFICATION:

BID OPENING DATE: 11/29/2006 DEADLINE TIME: 2:00 PM

DEPT: PW .
MGR'S NAME: LUIS PEREZ PHONE NUMBER: (305) 375-2698
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Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners
111 NW 1 First Street, Suite 17-202
Miami, FL 33128 ‘
DEPT. RELEASED RESPONSES TO COB: ) Office: 305 375-5137-Fax 305 375-2484

DEPT RELEASED BIDS
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

NW s Suite 1510 ) Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
111 NW 1st Street, Suite RPQNo: 20060335

Miami, FL 33128

Public Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section

RPQ Project Name: PTP Traffic Signal

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price
proposal)

[e PO

Bidder's Company Name: ?yﬁéu"l 74#2 4 1/76
Yz W GY Ao

Company Address:
City: /VZ;D’?‘?, . State: /(4 Zip: 2’?5/’ (5’ S’
Telephone Nof %) 2 ¥< -53%%  Fax Nof ),;-’)‘,,é‘/" ¢iG/ EMail: Cj_ytfé?ﬂ electyos @butbotd A,

Name of Person Subml/t,tl@ Quote (Print). /@/n‘w’-y ,&?ﬁ)
4 ' 7
Signature: f,s"f-- 2 Date: <7/~ ‘Er‘@ié}

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in

the CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A

4
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PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signal at E4 Avenue and E 32 Street

Bid Form

PROJECT NO:20060335

F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES .,TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRED FIFTY
(150) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK*.

102-61 EA. BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
110-1-1W W.O. | CLEARING AND GRUBBING $250.00
522-1 S.Y. CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4" Thick restoration and new, Class | Concrete, 3000 $60.00 -
P.S.l) (including pedestrian ramps)
575-1-1 sY. SODDNG (Pensacola Bahia or match existing) (includes w atering) $4.50
620-1-1 L.F. GROUNDING ELECTRODE $19.71 -
630-1-12 ‘L.F. CONDUIT 2" PVC, UNDERGROUND $21.00
630-1-13 L.F. CONDUIT 2" PVC UNDER PAVEMENT (This item is contingent upon field $37.76
conditions and may be increased, decrease or eliminated by the Engineer)
630-1-14 L.F. 'CONDUIT 2* PVC (UNDER GROUND DIRECTIONAL BORE) $30.00
630-1-16 LF CONDUIT 2" PVC INSTALLED IN OPEN TRENCH (This item is contingent upon $23.00
field conditions and- may be increased, decreased or eliminated by the
Engineer) .
| 632-7-1A L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE- (11-21 conductor) $12.00
632-7-1B L.F. | TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) $9.00
635-1-11E EA. [ PULL BOX, METER TYFE (Polymer) $750.00
~639-1-13 AS. B.ECTRICAL POWER SERVICES ( Includes NEMA-3R rain-tight $1,125.00
inclosure, disconnect switch, pole conduit)
639-2-18B LF. [ SERVICE WIRE [(#6 AWG with (RHH/RHW/XLP) insulation) (Three conductor $5.00
set (Black, White and Green))]
647-11-01 EA. MAST ARM COMBINATION STANDARD - INSTALLATION ONLY- [{Pole, single $7,300.00
or dual, mast arm, and anchor bolts furnished by County)(Contractor
furnishes foundation, cuts and adjust arms to fit, furnish arm caps and other
incidentals)]
650-51-313 . AS. TRAFFIC SIGNAL (Furnish and Install) (3 SECTION, 1 WAY), (Complete with $1,050.00
horizontal mounting brackets and lamps) (LED)
650-51-513 AS. TRAFFIC SIGNAL {Furnish and Install) (5 SECT! ION, 1 WAY), - (Complete with $1,600.00
horizontal mounting brackets and tamps) (LED)
i
CCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS
I‘ 76 11:48 AM Bidder nmust fil-in completely the next page for the bid to be valid. Page 10of 4

/3



Bid Form .

PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signal at E4 Avenue and E 32 Street : PROJECT NO:20060335

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDREJ FIFTY
{150) GALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED N THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK".

653-179 AS. PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL (Furnish & instali) (LED-Countdow n) (One way) $750.00 .
| 660-2-101 | as. | LoopasseweLy ' $863.00
' ' 660-4-4A LF. ‘| LOOPLEAD IN CABLE (No. 14 AW.G.) $5.00 o
sg’ 665-11 EA. | PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR (Includes Push Button Sign) : $170.00
' "~ | 672-1-3 AS. | NSTALL TRAFFIC . CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Buid-up controller & $2,300.00 )
components furnished by County. Contractor to construct foundation, install
) and wire controller & components for a complete installation)
g 690-10 EA. | REMOVE TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEAD ASSMLY_ $186.00
; 690-20 EA. REMOVE PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY $100.00
‘i 690-32-2 I EA. POLE REMOVAL (Shaflow ) (Boit on Attachment) ) $1.800.0(_)
’ 690-50 EA. | REMOVE CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - $1,563.33
' .
: 690-51 EA. REMOVE CONTROLLER FOUNDATION - Includes proper disposal, and grading $392.00
of area if required. .
: 690-70 EA. REMOVE PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR ASSEMBLY $215.00
| ae0-80 EA. | REMOVE SPANWIRE ASSEMBLY $482.00
690-90 P.L REMOVE CABLE A ND CONDUIT | $2,500.0d
690-100 P.L REMOV E MISCELLANEOUS SIGNAL EQUIPMENT $2,500.00
699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY BLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED) {INCLUDING $2,150.00
t MOUNTING BRACKET)
700-46-01 AS. REMOVAL OF SIGN AND POST ) ' $60.00
711-35-61 L.F. | SOLD TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" White) (Thermoplastic) - , © $3.15
r 711-35-121 L.F. SOLID TRAFFIC STRPE (12" WHITE) (THERMOPLASTIC) j$3.15
71 1-35-241 L.F. éOLD TRAFFIC STRIPE (24" WHITE) (THERMOPLASTIC) $6.25
:,‘;OCRP_PROJEC'F_BID__-_TTE\AS
3072006 11:48 AM ) Bidder must fill-in completely the next page for the bid to be valid. Page 2 of 4
-

. 44
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Bid Form
PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signalat E4 Avenue and E 32 Street - PROJECT NO:20060335

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRED FFTY
{150) CALENDAR DAY S AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK*.

711-36-61 LF. | SOLD TRAFFIC STRIFE (6" yellow ) (Thermoplastic) $0.69

711-4 EA. DIRECTIONAL ARROWS (Thermoplastic) $95.00

/s FO

CONTRAQI_QB_'S_PERQENTAGE FACTOR.. . . _

{
{
. ’ > L 2F g e
Tax Kentification Number: CS-073768 5
e =
D.C. Certificate of competency No: . Z $& O 537
Bidder's Name: Z @) é‘iﬁfi(;;ﬁ}(f, Zre .
: Bidder's telephone Nurrber:(_/ Fer) S5Y5-53Y3
; Bidder's address: _7¢2e? Su/ Y Ave Mo, AL 22045
ICCRP_PROJECT_BID_[TEMS
'_/‘ 96 11:48 AM Bidder must fill-in completely the next page for the bid to be valid. Page 3 of 4
Y
—
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, o Bid Form

PROJECT TITLEFTP Traffic Signal at E4 Avenue and E 32 Street . PROJECT NO:20060335

F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEFTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRED FIFTY
(150) CALENDAR DAY'S AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED N THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK".

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES THAT INCLUDED IN THE VARIOUS ITEMS OF THE PROPOSAL AND IN THE TOTAL BID , ™
PRICE ARE COSTS FOR COMPLYING WITH THE FLORIDA TRENCH SAFETY ACT (90-96), LAWS OF FLA. EFFECTVE © 7
OCTOBER 1st, 1990. THE BIDDER FURTHER IDENTIFIES THE COSTS TO BE SUMMARIZED BELOW:

T,
(O et 78 A Ay, . o1

Trench Safety Units of Measure “Unit Unit Extended
; Measure (LF, SY) (Quantity) Cost Cost
H -(D;scription) : : -
A A;
B.

;oc
)

{ . TOTAL $

‘ -

k FAILU_RE TO COMPLETE THE ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSNE

L

| CCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS

‘_‘j/30/2006 11:48 AM ' ) ) " Bidder must filkin completely the next pagé for the bid to be valid. . Page 4of 4

ez



Public Works Department
- Contracts & Specifications Section

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

- ’ Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 RPQ No: 20060335

Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: PTP Traffic Signal

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State ‘No Bid’ if not submitting a price
proposal)

ALL QUALITY ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC. PROPOSES TO PERFORM WORK
FOR THE COST OF $156,362.75

Bidder's Company Name: ALL QUALITY ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC.

Company Address: _14500 NW 16" COURT

City: Miami State: FL Zip: 33167
lelephone No: _305.968.7832 Fax No: 305.688.6297 Email: allgualityelec@bellsouth.net.

Name of Person Submitting Quote {Print): SAMUEL LIGHTBOURNE

Signature: /-4;{;5// W—J Date: //-27-06

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the

“requirements to submit current copies of insurance cerlificates in accordance with the Coniract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Coniract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC-7360-0/08 contract.
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Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA -

Contracts & Specifications Section %%% REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
st Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510 RPQ No: 20060335 -
Miami, FL 33128 ——_‘_

RPQ Project Name: PTP Traffic Signal

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State ‘No Bid' if not submitting a price
proposal)

4h 131, 250.9°

Ore hundredthi sty Sever housend, Foo hondred e dgipty dellons
Bidder's Company Name: E%( A;,L X C.- |
Company Address: ] l{ 515 Sw ! L+ ht’"

City: e vaat state: 1. zipp _33/IFF
Telephone No:( ?@mgs?"%_q Y6 Fax No:( SZég ) 2558443 | EMail: _€c e d 24/ @cs. conn

N

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): EQQU-QI‘CQD CQ>C (- RS

Signature: % ‘ Date: _// ['2 R /2004

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance

Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08
RPQ No: 20060335

Public Works Department
IAMI-
Contracts & Specifications Section w

RIS -¢
M&ﬂv’

111 NW 1st Street, _Suite 1510
Miami, FL 33128

RPQ Project Name: PTP Traffic Signal

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price
proposal)

s

Bidder's Company Name: /ﬁﬂsﬁﬂ/ﬁ% %MM M
Company Address: d gﬁ / .S}(S 4[&24’ V Z %

City: % . QQ(ZM(L/LQL State: ﬁ/'_ Zip: 22531&[
' ' -

Telephone No:755/537- /ZM Fax No: 95%58%&% EMail: () 3] lUA . goyrwg/”ﬂs/lﬁ(&

Name of Persgh $ubmitting Quote (Print): \/AL“'% é}’%{, ﬁ[ur! V/Q:fffﬁ / (Z&t(j—‘

Signature: V/ Date: ///29 Zﬂ(é

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and the
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of the
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents:
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Cetrtificates to CICC for Review. By S|gnature the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set forth in
the CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A
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Bid Form

PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signal at E 4 Avenue and E 32 Street

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES ;TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRED FIFTY
(150) CALENDAR DAY S AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK®.

PROJECT NO:20060335

102-61 EA. BUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00
110-1-1W wW.0. CLEARING AND GRUBBING $250.00
522-1 SY. CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4" Thick restoration and new , Class | Concrete, 3000 $60.00 -
P.S.) (including pedestrian ramps)
575-1-1 S.Y. SODDING (Pensacofa Bahia or match existing) (includes w atering) $4.50
620-1-1 L.F. GROUNDING BL.ECTRODE $19.71 -
630-1-12 -L.F. CONDUIT 2" PVC, UNDERGROUND $21.00
630-1-13 L.F. CONDUIT 2" PYC UNDER PAVEMENT (This item is contingent upon field $37.75
conditions and may be increased, decrease or eliminated by the Engineer)
630-1-14 LF. CONDUIT 2" PVC (UNDER GROUND DIRECTIONAL BORE) $30.00
630-1-16 L.F. CONDUIT 2" PVC INSTALLED IN OPEN TRENCH (This item is contingent upon $23.00
field conditions and may be increased, decreased or elimnated by the
Engineer)
632-7-1A L.F. TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (11-21 conductor) $12.00
632-7-1B L.F. - | TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) $9.00
635-1-11E ’ EA. 'PULL BOX, METER TYPE (Polymer) $750.00
»639-1-13 AS. ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES ( Includes NEMA-3R rain-tight $1,125.00
inclosure, disconnect sw itch, pole conduit)
639-2-1B LF. | SERVICE WIRE [(#6 AWG with (RHH/RHW/XLP) insulation) (Three ‘conductor $5.00
set (Black, White and Green))]
647-11-01 EA. MAST ARM COMBINATION STANDARD - INSTALLATION ONLY- [(Pole, single $7,300.00
or dual, mast arm, and anchor bolls furnished by County)(Contractor
furnishes foundation, cuts and adjust arms to fit, furnish arm caps and other
incidentals)]
650-51-313 AS. TRAFFIC SIGNAL (Furnish and Install) (3 SECTION, 1 WAY), (Complete with $1,050.00
horizontal mounting brackets and lamps) (LED)
650-51-513 AS. TRAFFIC SIGNAL (Furnish and Install) (5 SECTION, 1 WAY), (Complete with $1,600.00
horizontal mounting brackets and lamps) (LED)

3CCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS
V2T 16 14:48 AM

Bidder must fill-in completely the next page for the bid to be valid.

2
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PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signal at E 4 Avenue and E 32 Street

IF THIS PROPOSAL 1S ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRE) FFTY
(150) CALENDAR DAY S AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK". .

Bid Form

PROJECT NO:20060335

653-179 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL (Furnish & install) (LED-Countdow n) (One way) $750.00
660-2-101 AS. LOOP ASSEMBLY $863.00
660-4-4A LF. | LOOPLEAD INCABLE (No. 14 AW.G.) $5.00 -
665-11 EA. | PEDESTRIANDETECTOR (includes Push Button Sign) $170.00
672-1-3 AS. | INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up controlier & $2,300.00
components furnished by County. Contractor to construct foundation, install
and wire controlfer & components for a complete installation)
690-10 EA. REMOV E TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEAD ASSEI.\;BLY $186.00
| 690-20 EA. REMOVE PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL HEAD ASSEMBLY $100.00
690-32-2 ] EA. POLE REMOVAL (Shaliow ) (Bolt on Attachment) $1,800.00
690-50 EA. | REMOVE CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY $1,563.33
690-51 EA. REMOVE CONTROLLER FOUNDATION - Includes proper dispral. and grading $392.00
of area if required.
690-70 EA. REMOVE PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR ASSEMBLY $215.00
690-80 EA. | REMOVESPAN WIREASSEMBLY ° $482.00
690-90 PL REMOVE CABLE AND CONDUIT $2,500.00
690-100 P.L REMOVE MISCELLANEOUS SIGNAL EQUIPMENT $2,500.00
699-1-1A AS. INTERNALLY RLLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING $2,150.00
MOUNTING BRACKET) . :
700-46-01 AS. REMOVAL OF SIGNAND POST $60.00
711-35-61 L.F. SOLD TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" White) (Thermoplastic) - $3.15
711-35-121 L.F. SOLD TRAFFIC STRIPE (12" WHITE) (THERMOPLASTIC) 53.15
711-35-241 LF. | soupTrRaAFFC sTRPE (24" WHITE) (THERMOPLASTIC) $6.25

JCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS
130/2006 11:48 AM

Bidder must fill-in completely the next page for the bid to be valid.

Page 2 of 4
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Bid Form
PROJECT TITLEPTP Traffic Signal at E4 Avenue and E 32 Street

F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN ONE HUNDRED FIFTY
(150) CALENDAR DAY'S AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED N THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT WORK®*.

PROJECT NO:20060335

$0.69

711-36-61 LF. | SOLD TRAFFIC STRIPE (6" yellow ) (Thermoplastic)

$95.00

711-4 - EA. DIRECTIONAL ARROWS (Thermoplastic)

CONTRACTOR'S PERCENTAGE FACTOR .. .

Tax ldentificatilon Numbér: é5 s 03%56 7

D.C. Certificate of competency No: _ 9,71 |
Bidder's Name:

Bidder's telephone Number:
Bidder's address:

/b Woéiaée, v 5287

SCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS

v 16 11:48 AM Bidder must filin completely the next page for the bid to be valid. Page 3 of 4
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BEL A WU e W1l RAJWAn Li1eCULrilic, iNC.
Dac-08-2006 08:58an  From=PYD CONTRACTS & SPECIFICATIONS 8053752631 7-125  P.001/001  F-T8)
Public Works
T11 NW 1st Streer ® Suile 1510
Miami, Florida 33128-1°
December 7, 2006 T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-22
sonconsenten  CERTIFIED MAIL No, iiamidade.gav
Ayrea Coordinutun 7005 3110 0002 0278 1557
Animal Scrviced
Ary 01 Publiy Piatee .
i bt FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE
Mg e 305-207-6161; 305-345-5343

Cuilding

Puliing Cade Cavplisige

Rugimns Oowianmont

Capital hnpiwimnenns

Ciizuns' indepse nd ool Tegnapantasion Tt
Cammgsivsr on Ethies and Volsile Tres
Cumenunieannng

Communly Actior-Agenvy—-~

Communily & Fromonts Develnprugar
Camawniy Xelaionz
Curaumir Serviors
| Cummgtions & Rehph it ton
Cul) At
EHectom
Eovegeniy Managemen
* mplovee Reations
Fapgegement Trs)
Enderpeine Texhmology Senicu
- I e

fair Fmpigymant Puciess
ajnce
Fire Retl
GCumetal SendcreAdmirisivion
Coveransdul iniarmation Conmer
Itinteic Fapsaivetion
Homatess Trust
rlausing Agerty
Honging Padme Authority
Homan Ssvices
Incleperident Rivigw Mot

fonad Yeade € .
Juvenile Scnvitet
Mpdicel Exarsinar
Medo-Miam: ACYion Flen
stranpaliun Manning Drpaniaaon
Pty and Recrealion

rolice
Procuscavzas Menagenvery

Proporey Appeiisal

Publc Lidany Systen

Public Worky

_ Sale Neighborhood Paks

$eapon

Sold YWoste Manapement

$rtegiz Buslness Maragament

Yedm Meto

. My

wee o Udan Zeanamic Aevinlitytion
Vigeays ssevm And Gandens

Waer I Stwer

Mr. Ramon Reyes
Raydan Electric, Ine.
4100 S.W. 94th Avenue
Miaml, Florida 33185

Re: Public Works Department (PWD)
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No. 20080335 - CICC 7360-0/08 -
People's Transportation Plan (PTP)
Traffic Slgnal Installation at
East 4™ Avenue and East 32™ Street

Dear Mr. Reyes:
The purpose of thus letter is for your firm to confirm the overall percentage-,

_factor reduction as npegotiated in the publicly noticed meeting held ¢

fIi);ac:ua-mber 6, 2006, with your firm. The aforementioned changes are as™
llows:

The Contractor's Percentage Factor ~ shall be reduced from 1.20to 1.10.

Please acknowledge your acceptance by signing in the space provided below
no iater than December 13, 2006.

ME nr Contracts
Public Works Department

A

Raydan Electric, In

/0006

Date *

Cc: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD, Octavio Marin, P.E., PWD, David Tinder,
P.E., PWD, Rodney McMu(Iuan, PWO, Luls O. Perez P.E., PWD, Angelica

De Limas, 0@,6 er]gapfme B'“ag,d, Pipjeet By f Read __139 .Fdle :

o g b

Y



Dept. of Business Development
Project Worksheet

! O
BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT

Project/Contract Title: PTP TRAFFIC SIGNAL EAST 4TH AVENUE AND EAST 32ND STREET (SIC 17) RC Date: 11/29/2006

. Project/Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08 - RPQ# 20060335 Funding Source: ~ Jtem No: 3-10
epartment: PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT PTP :
Resubmittal Date(s):

Estimated Cost of Project/Bid: $140,400.00

Description of Project/Bid:
MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT, AND TOOLS TO PERFORM TRAFFIC SIGNAL INSTALLATION(S) INCLUDING ANY

ANCILLARY WORK AT THE INTERSECTION OF EAST 4TH AVENUE & EAST 32ND STREET.

TO ESTABLISH A CONTRACT TO THAT CONSISTS OF, BUT IS NOT LIMITED TO, FURNISHING ALL SUPERVISION, LABOR,

Measure Program Goal Percent
No Measure CSBE 0.00%

This project is being awarded using the lowest percentage factor. As such, no CSBE measures can be applied.

CWP Not Applicable: CICC 7360-0/08 CONTRACT

% of Items |
Estimated Value to Base Bid Availability

Subtrade ' Cat.
CSBE $0.00 0.00% 0
| |
Tatal ' $0.00 0.00%

' Living Wages: ~ YES D NO Highway: YES NO D Heavy Construction: YES (:[ NO

Responsible Wages:  YES No [ ] Building: ,YES [::[ NO

Ordinance 90-143 is applicable to all construction projects over 100,000 that do not utilize Federal Funds

B e

Tier 1 Set Aside

Set Aside Level 1 Level 2 Level 3

Bid Preference

Trade Set Aside (MCC) i Goal

Deferred Selection Factor

s T AL L 13, /f/é«é

. al,
v _ % il2.9)06
Chalrperson, Review Conﬁ ttee Date County Manager

W
N

DBDRO090 v. 20051019



Public Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Miami, FL 33128

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ) e
Contract No: CICC 7360-0/08 , i
RPQ No: 20060335

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the Contract No. CICC-7360-0/08. o

Date Issued: 10/27/2006 Bid Date Due: 11/29/2006 Time Due: 2:00 P.M. Submitted Via: Sealed Envelope
Date RPQ Added: 10/17/2006 Contractors Add Request Date: 12/14/2006 Contractors Add Date: 10/26/2006
Project Number: 20060335 Estimated Value: $140,400.00
(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)
Project Name: PTP Traffic Signal
Project Location: East 4th Ave & East 32nd Street.
Project Manager: Luis-©:Perez - Phone No: 305-375-2698 Fax No: 305-375-2931
Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Phone: Date:
Document Pickup: Location: 111 N.W.1st Street, 15th Floor., Contracts and SLc1ﬁcat10ns Section
Y/N: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:
Site Meeting: N N
PreBid Meeting: Y N 11/15/2006 10:00 A.M. 111 NW 1st Street, 15th Floor, Front Conference Room
Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Lowest Percentage Factor
Performance/Payment Bond Required: N Bid Bond Required: N_ Insurance Required: Y _
Comm Dist: 0 Davis Bacon: N
Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Y DBD Subcontract Forms Required: N , ‘ f ;
Trade Set-a-side: : o
CSBE Requirements: N % N_ type=hidden
value="N">
DBD Dates: Received: SOl Date: Compliance: N Memo Date:
Type: Trade: Count: Work%: Create Bid
Primary Electrical - Traffic Signal Contractor  12_
Anticipated Start Date: 5/20/2007 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 120
Liquidated Damages: Y_ Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments
Funding Type: Federal: N State: N PTP: Y_ Other: N QNIP: N OMC: N
GOB: N GOB No:
Awarded To: Award Date: Paid Amt:
Raydan Electric Inc 12/18/2006 $0.00
Base Amt: $154.440.00 Cont Amt: $14,040.00 Ded Amt: $9,808.00 Award Amt: $178,288.00
Insurance: OCIl Approved: N Date Approved: GL Ins Exp Dt:
Bond Review: OCl Approved: N Date Approved: AL Ins Exp Dt:
Risk Management: Approved: N Date Approved: WC Ins Exp Dt:

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

The work included under this Contract consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all supervision, labor, materials, equipmen .
and tools to perform traffic signal installation(s) including any ancillary work at the intersection of East 4th Avenue & East 32na”
Street. Miami-Dade County will furnish Mast Arms. The Contractor shall furnish and install grounding electrodes, conduits, pull
boxes, foundations, pedestrian signal heads and buttons with signs, overhead signs, mounting harfiware, signal cable, power

Page 1 of 2
gelo :)(/



cable, and power service. Additional work to be performed include installing vehicle detection loops, signing, pavement marking,
and removing existing traffic signal devices, signs, and pavement markings in conflict with the proposed work.

Design Drawings Included: Y_ ~ Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y
Project Qualifier: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2698 EMail: perezlu@miamidade.gov
. smments:

RPQ Document available on October, 26, 2006 Pick up location: 111 N.W.1st Street, 15th Floor, Contracts and Specifications
Section (Document fee $25.00) on October 27, 2006.

Pre-Bid Conference time and location: 10:00 A.M., Wednesday, November 15, 2006, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 15 Floor, Front
Conference Room.

Bid Opening Time and Location: 2:00 P.M., Wednesday, November 29, 2006, 111 N.W. 1st Street, 17th Floor, Clerk of the Board
Office. /

Contractor / Bid Information (Bids added 10/26/2006)
r DBD |Base . | Bid |LExp |
Type ||Contractor Name Trade Bid [|OK Bid Amount |[Award |[Type ||Date
7360 |au Quallty Etectrical Services Inc electrical - Trafle Sanal Ty |s1 56,362.75  ||N |pn ’8/3112008
) Contractor
7360 (|EDCA, Inc Electrical - Trafflc Signal Y $137,250.00 |N Pri 9/30/2007
T Contractor
7360  |(Juliana Enterprises Inc DBA Power Pro Electrical - Traffic Signal N $0.00 Pri 12/31/2006
Contractor
: Electrical - Traffic Signal
7360 (|Imagesco, Inc. Contractor N $0.00 Pri 12/31/2006
Electrical - Traffic Signal ‘
7360 ||Mastec North America, Inc. Contractor Y $203,580.00 ||N Pri 9/30/2006
0 Raydan Electric Inc Electrical - Traffic Signal Y $154.440.00 v pri 4112007
1 Contractor
Electrical - Traffic Signal
7360 (|Southeast Underground Utilities Co. Contractor N $0.00 Pri 12/31/2008
Electrical - Traffic Signal
7360 |[SYSTEMS INTEGRATION & MAINTENANCE, INC. Contractor N $0.00 Pri 12/31/2006
Electrical - Traffic Signal
7360  |[Troplcal Electric Inc. Contractor N $0.00 Pri 12/31/2006
Electrical - Traffic Signal
7360 ||under Power Corp Contractor N $0.00 Pri |9/30/zoo7

) [ PrintLong_] [ PrintShort_]

__EMailb

ey

Date Last Edited : 12/20/2006 -08:58:54
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Find Contracls With Search Sting==>

Status View [ _Exit | [_Projests | .

Location /
DST DPT Contract Name Contractor
30 PW 20030014 PTP SCHOOL FLASHERS 0
30 PW 20030015 PTP TRAFFIC SIGNALS 0
30 PW 629510 Open Traffic Signal - Contract No. 4 Countywide
Totals:

* Contracts with Green Name are Construction, Design Build or CM at Risk
Contracts with Black Name aré PSA Agreements

Estimated

Completion
Date
712212005

5/23/2006
N/A

3

Staus.View | [ Exit. | [, Projects.

[ .GotoTop ]

Page 1 of 1 } (/

_GotoBottom ]

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Capital Improvements Information System
All Contracts for FEIN 650737688
Raydan Electric, Inc.

$1,000,000
$1,000,000
$1.569.995

$3,569,995

% Complete /

Status
0% / N/A
0% / NIA
0% / N/IA



== Capital Improvements Information System
' Contractor Evaluations Report

Dept Contract Type Contractor / Architect Name Date Rater Period
PW 20030014 CON Raydan Electric, Inc. 8/15/2006 Felix Completion of
Hernandez construction
PW 20030015 CON Raydan Electric, Inc. 8/15/2006 Felix Completion of
' Hernandez construction

Evaluation Count: 2 Contractors: 1 Average Evaluation: 3.3

Page 1 of 1 ; ?/
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[ Exit ] ([_GotoBotom.]

Bids for Raydan Electric Inc

Contractor / Bid Information M

Dept ||RPQ No Category CSBE Bid Amount ||Awarded Bid Type Date

||20050332 __” _ ”o | |$199,999.oo ”Y | || B |
PW ”20050292 |Electrlcal Contractor |5 : |$0.00 ” _—”Primary |FI1I1712005 —l
|Pw ||mm2§ |E1ectrlcal Contractor |5 ||so.oo ” ”Primary "11/17/2005 —|
|PW ”M_O_Z_El _“Electrical Contractor ”6 ||$199,999.00 ”Y —l Primary |FI1IZ112005 |
|PW ||2 1050282 —-”Electrlcal Contractor "6 ||so.oo || | Primary |F1Iz112005 T
lpw  [|z0050283 |[Etectricat Contractor s ls0.00 I j||Pr|mary |F1/z1/zoos |
|PW ”Mi *-——-—HE-Iectrlcal Contractor ”6 | $0.00 || |Prlmary 11/21/2005
[PW ”_2@5_02ﬂ "Electrlcal Contractor ”6 $0.00 ” |Primary F1Iz112005
|PW | \Mﬂ “Electrlcal Contractor jls $0.00 ] | |Pr|mary |F|217I2005 —|
|PW ”20050219 Electrical Contractor ”5 |so.oo ” —”Primary |F12I7/2005 |
|PW ”MJ_& Electrical Contractor ”5 |$0.00 | ”Primary |F2/712005 I
|Pw ||MQ0_3_19 Electrical Contractor ||5 ||$o.oo | ”Primary —|[12mzoos |
|PW | 20050320 ”Electrlcal Contractor - ”5 ||$0.00 ” ||Primary 121712005 |
|PW ”&Mlﬁl ”Electrical Contractor ”5 ||$0.00 ” ||Prlmary FIZI1412005 _ |
lpw  |[200s0173 ||Etectricat Contractor Ils |ls0.00 I ||Primary ||121141200. \,
lpw  |l2000337 [|Etectricat contractor s llso.00 | ||Primary 121512005 |
lPw 20050342 [Etectrical Contractor ls |lso.00 | |Primary 1271912005 |
[Pw ]zg..tmzzi lEIectrIcal Contractor |5 ”so.oo H ”Primary 1[1/6/2006 |
|PW H_2_00_5L3ﬁ |Electrlcal Contractor ”5 ||$0.00 ” ”Primary ”116/2006 |
PW |2_00_5Q22§. ”Electrical Contractor Is ‘so.oo ]l ”Primary ”1/6/2006 |
PW |Ml ”Electrical Contractor |5 |$0.00 || ”Prlmary - ”1/6/2006 I
lpw  |[|20050208  |lEtectricat contractor |ls [ls0.00 | ||Primary ||11612006 |
IPW ”ZD.MS_S : ”Electrical Contractor | 5 ”50.00 |[ ”Primary | 11612006

| ILIIZMQ |Electrlcal Contractor | 5 |$0.00 ” | Prlmary | 11612006

|Pw ||20060001 |Electrlcal Contractor [5 |$198,600.00 ||N | Primary ”1/10/2006 |
IPW “ZQ:OMZ [Electrlcal Contractor I5 I[$192,500.00 "N I Primary I 1/10/2006 I
|PW ”M?*_Ql |Electrlcal Contractor "5 ||$D.00 ” B ”Prlmary (111172006 |
|Pw ||mos_om |rElectrical Contractor ”5 ||so.oo ” ”Prlmary 1I1112066 |
\fw_| |25L0_5_0_3_0£ _”Electrical Contractor |5 | |so.oo r ”Prlmary ”1/11/2006 |
|PW ”M |IEIectrIcal Contractor |5 ||$0.00 | |Primary ”1/11/2006 J
|Pw ”.Z_Q.Qigﬁ).é |rEIectricaI Contractor ”5 ||so.oo | Frimary ”1/11/2006 J
Iﬂ | 20050306 "Electrical Contractor ”5 ||$0.00 ” —”;rlmary [1/11/2006. J
|PW | 20050326 |Electrical Contractor ”5 ||$0.00 ‘ |Primary 112/2006 _-I
|Pw ||20050326 Electrical Contractor ||5 ||so.oo | ~ |Pr|mary | 1/12/2006 J

I

Page 1 of 5 3 g(
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Ipw | 20060006

‘_“Electrlcal Contractor 5 Iso.oo J|Prlmary J|1l1712006 I

PW LOML j"'lectncal Contractor 5 ‘;o.oo 4”Prlmary |112512006 |
PW | |_0010L |ﬂectrlcal Contractor |5 [;o.oo r —l [Prlmary |112512006 —l

; _j 20060018 |r|ectrlcal Contractor _ | 5 ro 00 |r Primary Jluzslzooi_l

|PW J 20060022 "Eectrical Contractor |6 |r$0 00 r Primary |11251200:_‘
|Pw "_ZMQOQ.Q Electrlcal Contractor L \roo r _:HSub [2115/2996 ,
|PW | @M lEIectrlcal Contractor IL —| |;0.00 |r _:l |Sub |2/1 §/2006 —|
|Pw HZO_O.SM ”Electrical Contractor lL |;0.00 " 4“Sub |2l1512006
lw  |[20060032 ||Esectrical contractor ls ls0.00 | ~lsub l21512006
|PW |MM |Electrical Contractor JE j[ﬂsnsmo V |Primary Jlamzooe
E:@M I[Electrlcal Contractor 5 | $0.00 |r |Primary Jlslslzoos
W— 20060062 "Electrical Contractor 5 |$198,ooo.bo l[N— JlPrimary J|3I612606 |
|Pw ||MM T|[ETectrical Contractor Is |[$o.oo j |- J |Prlmary Jlsnuzoos —|
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| Florida Profit ”

RAYDAN ELECTRIC, INC.

PRINCIPAL ADDRESS

4100 SW 94 AVENUE
MIAMI FL 33165
Changed 02/04/2004

Document Number
P97000011812

State
FL

Last Event
REINSTATEMENT

MAILING ADDRESS

4100 SW 94 AVENUE
MIAMI FL 33165
Changed 02/04/2004

FEI Number
650737688

Status
ACTIVE

Event Date Filed
11/14/2006

Date Filed
02/03/1997

Effective Date
01/27/1997

Event Effective Date
NONE

Re&istered Agent

Name & Address

REYES, RAMON
4100 SW 94 AVENUE
MIAMI FL 33165

Address Changed: 04/04/2001

Officer/Director Detail

Name & Address

|r Title |

REYES, RAMON

4100 SW 94 AVENUE

MIAMI FL 33165

DP

HERNANDEZ, LAZAROL
17873 SW 114 AVE.

MIAMI FL 33157

DV

REYES, HELEN

4100 SW 94 AVENUE

MIAMI FL 33165

TS
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Annual Reports

Report Year || Filed Date l
2004 | 02/04/2004
l 2005 | 09/27/2005
| 2006 Hi 11/14/2006
_ .

__Previous Filing. . -

View Events
No Name History Information

Document Images
Listed below are the images available for this filing.

{11/14/2006 -- REINSTATEMENT

09/27/2005 -- REINSTATEMENT

02/04/2004 -- ANNUAL REPORT

02/03/2003 -- COR - ANN REP/UNIFORM BUS REP
03/06/2002 -- COR - ANN REP/UNIFORM BUS REP
04/04/2001 -- ANN REP/UNIFORM BUS REP
'1105/16/2000 -- ANN REP/UNIFORM BUS REP
11/15/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT

09/02/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT

04/08/1999 -- ANNUAL REPORT

04/29/1998 - ANNUAL REPORT

I

THIS IS NOT OFFICIAL RECORD; SEE DOCUMENTS IF QUESTION OR CONFLICT
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