OFFICIAL FILE COFY
CLERK OF THE BOARD
OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Memorandum ""‘"?23

Date: June 3, 2008

To: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro Agenda Item No. 8(F)(1)(A)

From: Resolution No. R-631-08

Subject: Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $1,099,840.00 between
ABC Construction Inc. and Miami-Dade County for improvements to the
Shenandoah Branch Library Contract - Countywide (Project — CICC 7040-
0/07 Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. Z00049-C)

Recommendation

It is recommended that the Board approves the attached Contract Award Recommendation
for Shenandoah Branch Library Contract — Countywide (Project — CICC 7040-0/07 RPQ No.
Z00049-C), in the amount of $1,099,840.00, between ABC Construction Inc., and Miami-
Dade County. This recommendation has been prepared by the General Services
Administration (GSA) on behalf of Miami-Dade Public Library System.

Background

The Shenandoah Branch Library is currently closed. Award of this contract accelerates the
reopening of the library for the citizens in the surrounding community. In order to continue
to successfully and expeditiously renovate the Miami-Dade Public Library System, GSA
utilizes various contracting mechanisms. The Miscellaneous Construction Contracting
process available under the Office of Capital Improvements’ (OCIl) Contract CICC 7040-
0/07, expedites renovation projects by allowing a pool of qualified Community Small
Business Enterprise (CSBE) contractors to submit bids. The project is awarded based upon
the lowest sum submitted by the responsive, responsible bidder for the project.

On December 3, 2007, GSA forwarded a Request for Qualifications for a General Building
Contractor Contract, utilizing CICC 7040-0/07, to a list of 81 qualified firms, 14 of which
purchased contract documents; six firms proffered a bid. The lowest bid amount submitted
was for $990,000.00 by ABC Construction, Inc. (ABC). On March 6, 2008, GSA negotiated
with ABC to lower the bid amount and they agreed to lower their bid by $8,000.00 for a new
base bid amount of $982,000.00. As a result, the lowest base bid amount submitted by
ABC plus the 10% contingency amount ($98,200) and the 2% allowance for permit fees
($19,640) exceeds the CICC7040-0/07 contract cap of $1 million. Therefore, the award for
Shenandoah Branch Library RPQ Z00049-C to ABC Construction, Inc. is being submitted to
the Board for approval.

Scope

The scope of work for this project consists of a 462 square foot-addition to include a staff
lounge, work room, electrical gear room, data equipment and phone switches room, as well
as complete interior/exterior remodeling including but not limited to men's and women's
bathroom, and re-roofing. Additional site improvements will be performed, such as a new
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Honaorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro
and Members, Board of County Commissioners
Page 2

entrance plaza, landscaping and irrigation system in accordance with the Contract
Documents. These improvements will have a countywide impact.

Track Record/Monitor

ABC Construction, Inc. has had a commendable performance and work ethic as a contractor
for Miami-Dade County. They have worked meticulously to keep their current county
projects moving ahead of schedule including the new International Mall Branch Library.
GSA has reviewed the OCI database and found nine construction contracts awarded to
ABC Construction, Inc.: one contract from the Aviation Department, one from GSA, one
from the Public Works Department (PWD) one from the Water and Sewer Department
(WASD), and five from the Parks and Recreation Department (MDPR); two of these projects
have been cancelled. The referenced database also lists a total of 12 contractor
performance evaluations with a total performance rating averaging 3.5, the highest rating
being 4.0. The contractor hires skilled professionals to perform the work and has provided
consistent on-site management. In addition, the Department of Small Business
Development (SBD) History of Violations Report does not list violations for this contractor.

Following GSA’'s standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-
construction meeting will be scheduled with the contractor.

Delegated Authority
The County Mayor or his designee is authorized to execute the contract documents.

@endi % rris, Director

General Services Administration



MEMORANDUM

(Revised)

TO: Honorable Chairman Bruno A. Barreiro DATE: June 3, 2008
and Members, Board of County Commissioners

é.,

FROM: R. A.Cdevas, Jr! SUBJECT: Agenda ltem No. 8(F) (1) (2)
County Attorney

Please note any items checked.

“4-Day Rule” (“3-Day Rule” for committees) applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required

Statement of fiscal impact required

Bid waiver requiring County Manager’s written recommendation

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing

Housekeeping item (no policy decision required)

No committee review



Approvéd Mayor Agenda ltem No. 8(F) (1) (R)
Veto 6-3-08
Override |

RESOLUTION NO. R-631-08

RESOLUTION APPROVING A CONTRACT AWARD
RECOMMENDATION IN THE AMOUNT OF $1,099,840
BETWEEN ABC CONSTRUCTION, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE
COUNTY FOR THE SHENANDOAH BRANCH LIBRARY
CONTRACT COUNTYWIDE (PROJECT CICC 7040-0/07
RPQ NO. Z00049-C)

WHEREAS, this Board further desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the
accompanying memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COLINTY, FLORIDA, that this Board hereby approves
the Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $1,099,840.00, between ABC
Construction, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the Shenandoah Branch Library Contract
Countywide (Project CICC 7040-0/07 RPQ No. Z00049-C) in substantially the form attached

hereto and made part hereof.

The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner Carlos A. Gimenez

who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner Sally A. Heyman

 and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:

Bruno A. Barreiro, Chairman aye

Barbara J. Jordan, Vice-Chairwoman aye
Jose “Pepe’ Diaz absent Audrey M. Edmonson absent
Carlos A. Gimenez  aye Sally A. Heyman aye
Barbara J. Jordan aye Dennis C. Moss aye
Joe A. Martinez aye Natacha Seijas absent
Dorrin D. Rolle :yfs:ent Rebeca Sosa absent

Katy Sorenson

Sen. Javier D. Souto @Y€



Resolution No. R-631-08

Agenda ltem No. 8(F) (1) ()
Page No. 2

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this
3" day of June, 2008. This resolution shall become effective ten (10) days after the
date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall become effective

only upon an override by this Board.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK

sy, Kay Sullivan
Deputy Clerk

Approved by County Attorney as
to form and legal sufficiency.

Richard Seavey

L‘//
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MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
172 West Flagler Street, REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP
Suite #330 Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: Z00049-C

General Services Administration

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Liprary - Addition and Remodeling

Price Proposal (Cost lo Perform the work must be stated here. State ‘No Bid" if not subrmitting a price proposal)

e
DGO, 000, —  QiMe %UNOIMQ QINW‘*\A""“‘WD'

Bidder's Company Name: /Q/?)@ @}m./é‘él&lcﬂ 7490 ‘vém‘_’/

Company aavess: L2580 WVl ST BT

City: 'L”?//;‘”””’h state: zip: 3/> ¢
Telephone No: 895, (oly3. 039S Fax No: 5. J0T. 2903 EMail: }ﬁan:w/{:a Oubs Corishiotosy

V// Iy

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): fffwé [JA/&/”}/EQ

received: / (if none’ write "None")

Date: &5942(_’{10 4

Number o.\ \
AN \

\ Y

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and t
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of th
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of lhe
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificales in accordance with the Contract Documents
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set for

the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Signature:

Appendix 5A



MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP

General Services Administration
172 West Flagler Street,

Suite #330 " . Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No:  Z200049-C

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Library - Addition and Remodetling

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price proposal)

+ 1), o2, coo =&

CANE FTiLLIGN  AND T et TTHPUSAND  oollAap<
AND FEro ceNTS.

Bidder's Company Name: D otd=Ec N

Company Address: 24 = Wl b‘(’-‘.k =T, uhu“r:l‘:’_z-

City: AL LEBAH State: FL Zip: =218

Telephone No: 2224 4o22. Fax No: 205 - B26-4=15 EMail:_d odec (2 exrthlink it

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): <Teven PANTEYE

Number of Addendums received: | (if none' write "None")

Signature:% Date: i—lﬁ-ﬁg

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, daté and time due and t
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of th
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to C/ICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set for
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Appendix 5A



12/14/2007 18:08 FAX

@ 003/003

FLORIDA

General Services Administration | MIAMI-DADE COUNTY,
172 Weat Flagler Street, MIAMI- REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP

Sulte #330
Miami, FL 33128 Gontraot No: Q1SS T

) Contract No: C 7040-0/067

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Library - Addition and Remodeling

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be sty here. State 'No Bid' if not submitii
&+ | osooee,

@he, (AN RSP VoN FT—-C-P), Ao g,;,wz crA o

ng a price proposal)

12

Bidder's Company Name: f/&’rﬁéx (,CW\S 7[/ wol//ﬁ/? M ;mm/,mng , I)é .

Company Address: /<5< (2o 4 [§u D

cny: Al S State: ~ | 2ip: 33/¢L
Telephone No: 25 -85 3% | Fax No: 3CE-883 /57 EMail;_Sde 32 e
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): L\BN\ LQQ/ Q D:rg/\bns /lpA, ]

Number of Addendums received: _&n € (if none’ write "None")

Signature: _H (2. D —7// —1 Date: AQ?Z%/Q&'

Nots: Quotes must be submitted on this form, Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, d

te and time due and t

Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall resylt in the rejaction of th
price quotation. Late bids wiil not be opened. Low bigder wili be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the

requirsments to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with ¢

Contract Documents

after review for compliance with the Contract Documants, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be boupd by the terms set for

the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Appendix 5A



_ MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

172 West Flagler Street, REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP
Suite #330 Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07

Miami, FL 33128 RPQNo:  Z00049-C

General Services Administration

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Library - Addition and Remodeling

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State ‘No Bid" if not submitting a priée proposal)
I/, 20 Y¢ VO

o yllenn o> ftvndbied Jonn Fve . f
s company ame:_RATARN_ CONSTRUCNOWS_ (op om0
company adaress: (1324 KW 10D e
City: o state: £1 Zip: m
Telephone No: 7’&?631'( 377(0 Fax No: 3&6"1“(9' %ﬁé?‘ EMail:
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): é/ AN / Da (C{

Number of Addendums received: (if none’ write "None")

Signature: %//ﬂ,"’ [%0/\ Date: ;) - é'og
/2R B

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and t
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of th
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set for
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

Appendix 5A
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General Services Administration

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

172 West Flagler Street, REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP
Sulte #330 Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07
Mlaml, FL 33128 RPQ No: £00048-C

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Library - Addition and Remodeling

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the wark must be stated here. State ‘No Big' if not submitting a price proposal)

Base Bid Yo lov. Ooan‘jen'cy'. “4 |, 56, 289 oo

07, (ontingen Ly p \ (3, 81
Total Base 1314 % 050,578

Bidder's Corhpany Name: J 2T COV’S’HVC{"\OV‘: (o.
Cor‘ﬁpanyAddress: bSol  N.W. 36 Stvee {;':FFIO(

City: E\\‘O\M'\ State: FC Zip: 3316
Stavefau@taretaconstru Cct;m .

Tolephane No: 305 376 1R Fax No: 308 k- 1441 EMail:

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): Aeovanny Tar ae

Number of Addendums recelved: (if none’ write "None™)

Signature: W iwﬂ% Date: E&L“ZOOB

-/

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and t
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall resllt In the rejection of th
_ price quotation, Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirernents to submit current copies of Insurance certificates in accordance with the Cantract Documents
aftar revisw for compliance with the Contract Documaents, user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to C/CC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set for
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

'T'a-!-a\l Base Bid Written in Words

> one villion, Tudo Mwmdied ik i Bn<onbl Ttk
?W‘LWW ?/\MAM ol 2or calls.

Appendix 5A




MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

172 West Flagler Street, REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RP
Suite #330 Contract No: CICC 7040-0/07

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: Z200049-C

General Services Administration
_, FDADE

RPQ Project Name: Shenandoah Branch Library - Addition and Remodeling

Price Proposal (Cost to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not submitting a price proposal)

/) R85, /183, ks

Bidder's Company Name: COre/anoé p@ﬂgfp&(dlbn CD[%D .
Company Address: /¢Q30/ S /R COG(F’IL,, S+€ /0 7

City: MI’QI’VN._ state: =L zip: D3/80
Telephone No: 325 -R A3~/ 70FFax No: 305- a 53’[809 EMail:
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): N€6+0f\ H@f‘nd V]Jé %/

(if none' write "None")

Date: £/¢Z 0?

¥ Number of Addend

Signature: /

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and t
Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the rejection of th
price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice of Award, of the
requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the Contract Documents
after review for compliance with the Contract Documents. user Department will forward all Insurance
Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be bound by the terms set for
the CICC- 7040-0/07 contract.

A Additional oocs. read not labeled as addendunm
) Facsim e Fransme el doted o-4-08
2) ‘QeS,DO”Se 1o RFL from ABC Const, doted 1/15/08

3) Mingtes of Fre-Bid M??

Appendix 5A
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" heniro p\kojwt it by Archifect 4 Record”

CEEEE

ERAZA ARCHITECTS,INC.

JORGE PEDRAZA. R A 1222 Sw 2} Street, Miomi, Horida 33145
{305) 285-3450 FAX {305} 285-3487

E-Mail pcice@belisouth.net

Siate of Flodda 0OD2715

March 12, 2008

Mr. Alberto Perdigon, CM3
GSA/Construction Mgmt. Div.
172 West Flagler Street, Suite 330
Miami, FL. 33130

RE: Shenandoah Library
Dear Mr. Perdigon:

At your request, we have reviewed our Probable Construction Cost Estimate for the referenced
project.

Our estimate was prepared a year a go on March 2007 and was based on an eight month
construction duration period. The following may be of help in reconciling a differential of (12.6%)
between our estimate of ($864,332.62) and the lowest bidder estimate of ($990,000.00):

1. Construction time established by the County is one year. This is four months in excess of
what our estimate was based on. The longer construction period affects the construction cost

as follows:
a. Insurance premiums
b. Rentals
i. Trailer
ii. Security fence
tii. Tools
iv. Portable toilets, trash bins
c. Utilities

d. Administrative costs

2. Construction work was added to the bid package in addition to the services provided by this
firm. This information was not available from the County when our estimate was prepared.
It was issued by the County as an addendum to the bid package
1. Partial Site Plan Sketch incorporating improvements to approximately 15%
of the existing sidewalks on both Public Right of Ways

ARCHITECTURE « PLANNING « INTERIOR ARCHITECIURE
CONSTRUCTION ADMINISTRATION

13



3. We know that security systems were included in the bid package and, as such, considered by
all bidders. Our estimate expressly excluded:
i. Security systems
ii. Asbestos removal
ili. Permit and Impact fees
iv. Furnishings

We are reasonably certain that once these additional costs are added to our Probable Construction

Cost Estimate, the construction cost of the project will be comparable to the one offered by the
lowest responsive bidder.

Please let us know if we can be of any further assistance.

Sincegely,

Jorge/Pedraza, R.A.
President

Ce: file



‘oL proposeo prodict bspwle

SHENANDOAH LIBRARY
Probabale Construction Cost

A B @clol e | fF [ 6 |

350

351

352

353

354

355

356

357

358

359

360

361/PROBABLE CONSTRUCTION COST ESTIMATE Prepared:

1362

363

364

365  piwision | Cost Amount ]

366

367|1-Gen. Conditions 127,737.44

368|2-5te Work 49,273.55

369|3-Consrete 18,256.00

370|4-Masonry 2.245.40

371|5-Metals 18,240.60

372}6-Wood 5,593.60

373|7-Thermal 34,238.00

374}8-DoorsAWindows 77.175.00

375]9-Finishes 73.423.05

376{10-Specialties 6,400.00

[ 377]11-Equipment -

378/|12-Fumishing -

379(13-Special Const. -

380/ 14-Conveying Syst. -

381{15-Mechanical 104,378.00
382! 16-Electrical 137,837.80
383

384|SUB-TOTAL 654,797 44
385|Profit @ 20% 130,959.49
386|Total $ 785,766.93
387 |Contingency 10% 78,575.69
388iProject Total E 864,332.62 |
388

390

391 Note: Probable Construction Estimate does not consider removal of asbestos and other contaminants,

392 permis, impac! fees, furnishings and security systems.

303

394

3485

366

387

388

3/28/2007

PEDRAZA

ARC

HITECTS Page 8 —

4242007




Castellanos, Ruth (GSA)

From: Anderson, Alecia (DBD)

Sent: Monday, April 14, 2008 1:31 PM

To: Hidalgo-Gato, Alice (DBD)

Cc: Castellanos, Ruth (GSA); Anderson, Alecia (DBD)
Subject: RE: ABC Construction - Violation History

Hi, Ruth
- There are no records in SBD History of Violation Database for ABC Construction. -

Alecia S. Anderson, Contractor Compliance Officer 11
Miami-Dade County Department of Small Business Development
305-375-3157

"Delivering Excellence Every Day”

From: Hidalgo-Gato, Alice (DBD)

Sent: Monday, April 14, 2008 12:04 PM

To: Anderson, Alecia (DBD)

Cc: Castellanos, Ruth (GSA)

Subject: ABC Construction - Violation History

Alecia, Can you please forward ABC’s violation history to Ruth. She is working on an award for them.
THX

Alice Hidalgo-Gato, Division Director
Contract Review and Compliance Division
Department of Small Business Development
(305) 375-3153 / Fax (305) 375-2343
miamidade.gov

"Delivering Excellence Every Day"

4/14/2008
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