OFFICIAL FILE COFY
CLERK OF THE BOARD
OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA Memo rand um MIAMIDADE

Date: October 5, 2010
To: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(0O)
and Members, Board of/County Commissioners

From: George M. Burgess i . .
Courty Manager M,YV\—-“ Resolution No. R-999-10

Subject: Contract Award Recommendation in the Amount of $1,000,000.00 between Statewide
Electrical Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People's Transportation Plan (PTP)
Project Entitled Traffic Signal Intersection Contract — Countywide (Project — Miscellaneous
Construction Contracting (MCC) 7360 Plan, Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No.
20100410) and Authorizing the Use of Charter County Transportation Surtax Funds

Recommendation

The attached Contract Award Recommendation for the Traffic Signal Intersection Contract - Countywide
(Project — MCC 7360 Plan, RPQ No. 20100410), in the amount of $1,000,000.00, between Statewide
Electrical Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County has been prepared by the Public Works Department (PWD)
and is recommended for approval. Proceeds from the Charter County Transportation System Sales Surtax
(the Surtax) will be used to fund this project, therefore, approval by the Board of County Commissioners (BCC)
and Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) is required.

Scope
The work to be performed under the life of this contract includes the installation of traffic signals at various

locations within Miami-Dade County.

Fiscal Impact/Funding Source

The fiscal impact will be approximately $1,000,000.00 and will be funded from the Surtax. The proposed
improvements qualify under the allowable work categories included in the PTP Neighborhood Improvements
Section. Specific funding for this project will be allocated from the respective Commission District PTP yearly
allocations. This is a work order based contract with a base contract amount of $852,000.00. The total
recommended award amount is $1,000,000.00, which is inclusive of the contingency and dedicated
allowances. The estimated operation and maintenance (O&M) costs are $2,800 annually for each Signal
installed and will be funded through the Department’'s General Funds.

Delegation of Authority
No additional authority is being requested within the body of this contract.

Track Record/Monitor

PWD has reviewed the Office of Capital Improvements (OCl) database and found three (3) awarded
construction contracts; one (1) contract from each of the following departments, Parks & Recreation, Water
and Sewer and PWD. The referenced database also lists a total of three (3) contractor performance
evaluations with an overall performance rating of satisfactory performance (3.5), out of a possible superior
performance (4.0) rating. The Department of Small Business Development's (SBD) History of Violation’s
report lists no violations for this contractor.

Following PWD's standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-construction meeting will be
scheduled. Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff person in PWD will be the PTP Coordinator, Mr.
Frank Aira, P.E. Following completion of the award process, the project will be assigned to Mr. George Brown,
Project Manager, for day to day responsibilities.
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According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, Statewide Electrical Services, Inc.,
Company Principal is: Noel Melo and the Company’s address is listed as: 12905 West Okeechobee Road,
Hialeah, Florida 33018.

Background
In an effort to carry on the success of the PTP Neighborhood improvements initiative, PWD continues to take

advantage of various contracting mechanisms such as the subject MCC process available under OCI contract
MCC 7360 Plan. Through this process, PWD forwards the RPQ, by way of facsiinile transmission, to a pool of
firms that have registered with OCI for the subject trade. Additionally, PWD advertises the project in the Daily
Business Review and all solicitations are available on-line through the Miami-Dade County portal under the
“Procurement Solicitations” link. Interested contractors prepare their bids according to the Job Order
Contracting (JOC) process, whereby the County establishes unit prices for the pay items in accordance with
industry averages. The contractors submit their bid as an overall percentage factor of the pricing established
by the County. The project award evaluation is based upon the lowest percentage submitted by the
responsive, responsible bidder for the project.

PWD staff submitted the referenced project to the SBD Review Committee. The Review Committee met on
April 14, 2010 reviewed RPQ No. 20100410 and recommended a 10% overall Community Small Business
Enterprise (CSBE) subcontractor goal and an 11.2% Community Workforce Program (CWP) goal based on the
project's scope of work and cost estimate of $1,000,000.00. Therefore, on April 22, 2010, PWD forwarded an
RPQ for the PTP Traffic Signal Intersections Contract - Countywide, utilizing the OCI contract MCC 7360 Plan,
to a list of six (6) pre-registered firms. A total of 12 firms purchased contract documents and 10 firms proffered
a bid.

On May 28, 2010, Statewide Electrical Services, Inc., proffered the lowest responsive, responsible base bid of
0.70 percentage factor, 30% below the County’s cost estimate; the second lowest bidders, AGC Electric, Inc.
and Horsepower Electric, Inc., proffered a base bid of 0.79 percentage factor, 9% over the lowest bidder; the
fourth lowest bidder, Magesco, Inc., proffered a base bid of 0.80 percentage factor, 1% over the second lowest
bidders. As a result, on July 13, 2010, PWD issued a recommendation of award for RPQ No. 20100410 to
Statewide Electrical Services, Inc., with the stipulation that approval of this project must be obtained from the
BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated with the funding source.

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all supervision, labor,
required materials, equipment and tools to perform all operations necessary for the installation of traffic signals
including any ancillary work at each specific location as indicated in the work orders. Traffic signalization
upgrades includes the installation of mastarm combinations, traffic controller assemblies, and milling and
resurfacing. Miami-Dade County furnishes mastarms and anchor bolts; the contractor shall furnish and install
all controller assemblies, grounding electrodes, conduits, pull boxes, foundations, pedestrian signal heads with
push buttons and signs, overhead signs, internally iluminated street name signs, mounting hardware, loop
assemblies, signal cable, solar school speed zone overhead flashing beacon assemblies and midblock traffic
signals consisting of mast arm combinations with signal heads or solar powered flashing beacon assemblies
and regulatory signs, and pedestals with signal heads or solar powered flashing beacon assemblies and
regulatory signs. Additional work also includes installation of pedestrian ramps, ground mounted signs, and
pavement markings, construction of sidewalks, curbs and gutters, installation of truncated dome, and removing
existing signs and traffic signalization devices in conflict with the proposed scope of Work.

AT

Assistant County Manage/




5 MEMORANDUM

L ot O (Revised)

TO: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss DATE: October 5, 2010
and Members, Board of County Commissioners

FROM: R. A. Cuevas, Jr. C SUBJECT: Agendaltem No. 8(P)(1)(0)
County Attorney

Please note any items checked.

“3-Day Rule” for committees applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required
Statement of fiscal impact required

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing

No committee review

Applicable legislation requires more than a majority vote (i.e., 2/3’s ,
3/5’s , unanimous ) to approve

\/ Current information regarding funding source, index code and available
balance, and available capacity (if debt is contemplated) required

>



Approved Mayor Agenda Item No.
Veto 10-5-10
Override

RESOLUTION NO. R-999-10

RESOLUTION APPROVING A CONTRACT AWARD
RECOMMENDATION IN THE AMOUNT OF $1,000,000.00 BETWEEN
STATEWIDE ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE
COUNTY FOR THE PEOPLE’S TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP)
PROJECT ENTITLED TRAFFIC SIGNAL INTERSECTIONS
CONTRACT - COUNTYWIDE (PROJECT - MISCELLANEOUS
CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTING (MCC) 7360 PLAN, REQUEST FOR
PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ) NO. 20100410) AND AUTHORIZING THE
USE OF CHARTER COUNTY TRANSPORTATION SURTAX FUNDS

8(P)(1)(0)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the accompanying

memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY

COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board approves the

Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $1,000,000.00 between Statewide Electrical

Services, Inc. and Miami-Dade County for the People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Project

Entitled Traffic Signal Intersections Contract — Countywide (Project MCC 7360 Plan, RPQ No.

20100410) in substantially the form attached hereto and made a part hereof.
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The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner Sally A. Heyman ,
who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner Rebeca Sosa

and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:

Dennis C. Moss, Chairman aye

Jose "Pepe" Diaz, Vice-Chairman aye
Bruno A. Barreiro aye Audrey M. Edmonson  aye
Carlos A. Gimenez aye Sally A. Heyman aye
Barbara J. Jordan aye Joe A. Martinez aye
Dorrin D. Rolle aye Natacha Seijas aye
Katy Sorenson aye Rebeca Sosa aye

Sen. Javier D. Souto ~ 3Y¥€

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this 5™ day
of October, 2010. This resolution shall become effective as follows: (1) ten (10) days after the
date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall become effective only upon
an override by this Board, and (2) either i) the Citizens' Independent Transportation Trust (CITT)
has approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-
affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission's membership and such
reaffirmation becomes final.
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

- HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK

By: DIANE COLLINS
Deputy Clerk

Approved by County Attorney as
to form and legal sufficiency. 3‘97

Hugo Benitez

UN



Public Works
111 NW 1st Street ® Suite 1510

MIAMI-DADE ' Miami, Florida 33128-1970

COUNTY T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

miamidade.gov

Carlos Alvarez, Mayor

July 13, 2010

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7009 3410 0002 3603 1308

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-823-1817; 305-592-6965

Mr. Noel Melo

Statewide Electrical Services, Inc.
12905 West Okeechobee Road, Suite 4
Hialeah Gardens, Florida 33018

Re: Recommendation for Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20100410 - CICC 7360-0/08
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections Contract

Dear Mr. Melo:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been recommended for award for the
above referenced RPQ based on your Price Quotation submitted on Wednesday, May 26,
2010. The total RPQ amount is for one million dollars and zero cents ($1,000,000.00). This
includes a base contract amount of eight hundred fifty-two thousand dollars and zero cents
($852,000.00), a contingency amount of eighty-five thousand two hundred dollars and zero
cents ($85,200.00), and dedicated allowances totaling sixty-two thousand eight hundred dollars
and zero cents ($62,800.00). The contract duration is established as 365-calendar days.
However, the recommendation of award is contingent upon the submission of the required
items listed below:

1. Performance and Payment Bond as required in Contract No. CICC 7360-0/08, Section
2.0 Special Conditions, Page 16, Article 2.11, PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BOND.
(The original attached documents must be used and three (3) sets must be provided).

2. Letter from Bonding Agent granting Miami-Dade County authorization to date the

Performance Bond.

Copies of current insurance certificates.

Copies of required license(s).

Submit Workforce Plan to the issuing/user department within fifteen (15) days of Notice

of Award for project specific and within fifteen (15) days from Notice to proceed for work

orders.

o b w

The preceding documents are required as outlined within Contract CICC-7360-0/08 and to be
submitted within -10 business days. Failure to submit the document(s) within the specified time,
or any extension granted, will result in the award being rescinded. Subsequent to the review
and approval of the aforementioned documents, you are required to obtain the required permits
in the time stipulated in the RPQ. Upon obtaining the permit(s), a copy(s) must be submitted to
the Project Manager prior to commencement of work.

b




Page 2
Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20100410

No work is to be performed without a permit uniess the Project Manager issues a written
directive to proceed without permit(s). After receipt of the permits the Project Manager will
schedule a Pre-Construction Conference and issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the
performance of the work.

This letter will also serve as a reminder that all work must be performed according to the scope
of work and contract’s terms and conditions, all permits and inspections and in accordance with
all applicable Federal, State and local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit System
Sales Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade County may be
used to pay for all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award of this contract shall be
effective and thereby give rise to a contractual relationship with the County unless and until the
following have occurred: 1) the County Commission awards the contract, and such award
becomes final (either by expiration of 10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by
Commission override of a veto); and 2) either i) the Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust
(CITT) has approved same, or i) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County
Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission’s membership and
such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Mr. Ultimo De Oliveira, OCI office, at (305) 375-5265 to insure that your file
is complete for award consideration.

Should you have any questions please contact me at (305) 375-2930.

Sincerely,

Cc:  Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
Orky Rodriguez, PWD
Office of Capital Improvements
Penelope Townsley, SBD
Robert Williams, P.E., PWD
George Brown, PWD
Rodney McMillian, PWD
Luis O. Perez, P.E., PWD
Alvaro Castro, PWD
Patrice King, SBD
Traci Adams-Parish, SBD
Clerk of the Board
Project File




COUNTY

Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Contracts & Specifications Section FHAMIDAD REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: CICC 7360-0/08

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100410

RPQ Project Name: Pedples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the Work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not

submitting a price proposal)
" 0/
j 2 o

Bidder's Company Name: SWEH)I /e @@ 7R/l Q@U/ZN‘ . ; e
Company Address: /2905 M0/£€€0'69@€£ M ‘#¢'
City: Wﬂﬁ) State: F ( Zip: &3” / P

Telephone No:225..59). 69 & 5  Fax NOM f)) )8 /7 email: S"‘QTC&DIAQQ/G?LCQFQ
. ‘jaiwo, Lo

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THEAERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): 06/ MQ /0

Number of Addendums received: / ) (if none’ write "None™)

Signature: Date: é’/a b // o
N——_

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-0/08 contract.

Appendix 5A



Addendum No. 1 Revised Bid Form

Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: Peoples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal intersection
IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE

HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED

PROJECT NO: 20100410

IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK”.

102-76 FLASHING ARROW BOARD (Temporary, EA/DAY 100.0 $9.00

102-77 HIGH INTENSITY FLASHING LIGHTS (TEMPORARY, TYPE "B") EA/DAY 300.0 $2.50

102-81-1A PAVEMENT MARKING TEMPORARY (Soiid) (Any width) (Yellow or White} ( Paint) L.F. 5,950.0 $0.30

102-75A CONSTRUCTION SIGNS EA/DAY 300.0 $1.50

102-91A PAVEMENT MARKING TEMPORARY (Skip) (Any width) (Yellow or White) { Paint) (10' stripe, 30' | L.F, 300.0 $0,90
space)

327-70-6A MILLING EXISTING ASPHALT PAVEMENT (1 1/2" average depth) sY. 6,250.0 $5.00

331-1-2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE WEARING COURSE - {Type FC-2, 5/8" Thick) TON 215.0 $130.00

331-72-1 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE (TYPE S-1) {1" THICK) TON 400.0 $85.00

520-2 CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (Any type, Including base preparation) L.F. 250.0 $35.00

5221 CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4" Thick restoration and new, Class | Concrete, 3000 P.8.!) (including | S.Y. 2850 $35.00
pedestrian ramps and sidewalk curbs)

527-2 DETECTABLE WARNING ON WALKING SURFACE SF. 160.0 $45.00

580-336 TREE TRIMMING- HRS 10.0 $150.00

620-1-1 GROUNDING ELECTRODE LF. 600.0 $15.00

630-1-12 CONDUIT 2" PVC, UNDERGROUND L.F. 900.0 $11.00

630-1-13 CONDUIT 2* PVC UNDER PAVEMENT (This item is contingent upon field conditions and may be L.F. 3,850.0 $20.00
Increased, decrease or eliminated by the Engineer)

630-1-16B CONDUIT, 2 PVC [(Additional conduit Installed In existing open trench) (This item is contingent L.F. 500.0 $9.00
upon field conditions and may be Increased, decreased or eliminated by the Engineer)]

632-7-1A TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (11-21 conductor) L.F. ' 2,000.0 $10.00

632-7-1B TRAFFIC CONTROL CABLE - (4-7 conductor) L.F. 1,520.0 $5.00

635-1-11 PULL BOX, METER TYPE (Polymer) AS. §5.0 $650.00

639-1-13 ELECTRICAL POWER SERVICES ( Includes NEMA-3R rain-tight inclosure, disconnect AS. 8.0 $1,200.00
switch, pole conduit)

639-2-1 SERVICE WIRE[(#6 AWG with THW Insufation)(Three conductor set)(Black,white and green)] L.F. 900.0 $4.50

641-2-12 PRESTRESSED CONCRETE POLES {Fumish & Instali) (Type P-ll Service Pole) EA. 12.0 $937.00

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
05/18/2010 10:00 AM Page 1 of 5




Addendum No. 1 Revised Bid Form

Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: Peoples Transportation Pian (PTP) Traffic Signat Intersection

IF TH!S PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE

PROJECT NO: 20100410

AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK".
OPTIONALE BID ITEMS
THESE ITEMS MAY OR MAY NOT BE USED THROUGHOUT THE PERFORMANCE OF THE CONTRACT.

§47-11.01C | MAST ARM COMBINATION STANDARD - INSTALLATION ONLY- (Contractor fumnishes EA 1.0 $6,500.00

foundation, cuts and adjust arms to fit, furnish arm caps and other incidentals)
672-1-3 INSTALL TRAFFIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY - (Build-up controller & components furnished by | AS. 1.0 $1,850.00

County. Contractor to construct foundation, install and wire controller & components for a complete

installation)

END OF OPTIONAL ITEMS.

647-11-28 MAST ARM 3 GA. POLE, TYPE 1, w/3GA 32 Ft. Arm (DS-10) AS. 2.0 $8,150.00
647-11-30 MAST ARM COMBINATION, STANDARD DADE CO. CLASS DS-11 AS. 1.0 $9,000.00
647-11-32 MAST ARM COMBINATION STANDARD, DADE CO. CLASS DS-12 AS. 1.0 $9,800.00
647-11-34 GALVANIZED STEEL POLE AND MAST ARM [(34' ARM) (DS-13)] AS. 1.0 $10,500.00
647-11-38 MAST ARM COMBINATION STANDARD (38' ARM) (DS-15) AS. 5.0 $12,000.00
647-11-40 MAST ARM STANDARD [(40' ARM) (DS-16) AS. 1.0 $14,000.00
647-11-44 MAST ARM STANDARD (44" ARM) (DS-18) AS. 5.0 $15,800.00
647-11-46 MAST ARM STANDARD (48" Arm) ((DS-25) AS. 2.0 $16,500.00
650-61-411 | TRAFFIC SIGNAL, (F&l) 1-Way, 4 Section, 12" Std. Aluminum Complete w/Horizontal Mounting AS. 4.0 $1,050.00

Bracket and Lamps
65051611 | TRAFFIC SIGNAL, 1 WAY, 5 SECTION 12° STANDARD ALUMINUM & LAMPS AS. 6.0 $1,600.00
§50-51-311A | TRAFFIC SIGNAL, (F&l) 1-Way, 3 Section, 12" Std. Aluminum Complete w/Horizontal Mounting | AS. 26.0 $900.00

Bracket and Lamps(LED)
653-191 PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, 1-Way (LED-Countdown) AS. 220 $750.00
659-107 ALUMINUM PEDESTAL 4" 1.D. (Up to 20) EA. 10.0 $670.00
659-112 SIGNAL HEAD AUXILIARIES (Mounting bracket , 2 way} EA 1.0 $170.00
660-2-101 LOOP ASSEMBLY AS. 16.0 $850.00
660-4-4A LOOP LEAD IN CABLE (No. 14 AW.G.) L.F. ] 2,000.0 $3.50

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
05/18/2010 10:00 AM Page 2 of 5
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Addendum No. 1 Revised Bid Form

Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: Peoples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersection

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE E
WORK*.

PROJECT NO: 20100410

AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
FFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

VEHICLE DETECTOR ASSEMBLY, (F & 1) (VIDEO)
665-11 PEDESTRIAN DETECTOR (Includes Push Button Sign) EA. 10.0 $240.00
670-5-12 TRAEEIC CONTROLLER ASSEMBLY (Fumish & Install) (Model 170) AS. 5.0 $18,000.00
676-110- CONTROLLER CABINET - POLE MOUNTED EA 24.0 $1,250.00
110A ’
578-1-113C | SOLAR PAGER PROGRAMABLE TIME SWITCH EA. 240 $2,500.00
685-165 SOLAR ENGINE (Inciudes electronics, batteries & solar panels), dual LED signal including, housing AS. 24.0 $3,950.00
and mounting hardware.
690-31 REMOVE SIGNAL PEDESTAL EA. 5.0 $70.00
699-1-1A INTERNALLY ILLUMINATED STREET NAME SIGN (LED), (INCLUDING MOUNTING BRACKET) AS. 18.0 $1,750.00
700-20-11 SINGLE POST SIGN (Furnish & Install) {Less than 12} AS. 5.0 $250.00
700-38-288 | SIGN PANEL INSTALLATION - (Mast amm, or span wire mount. County furnish sign only. EA. 5.0 $300.00
Contractor fumishes accessories, straps, cables, brackets, connectors, etc.)
706-1-12 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKERS (class B, mono or bi-directionel, all colors) EA. 150.0 $3.50
7114 DIRECTIONAL ARROWS (Thermoplastic) EA. 18.0 $50.00
711-11-121 | THERMOPLASTIC (White) {Solid) (6™) L.F. 1,800.0 $0.60
791-11-123 | THERMOPLASTIC (White) (Solid) (12) L.F. 1,200.0 $1.50
711-11-124 | THERMOPLASTIC (White) (Solid) (18") LF. . 200.0 $1.70
711-11-125 | THERMOPLASTIC (White) (Solid) (24") L.F. 850.0 $2.50
711-11-221 | THERMOPLASTIC (Yeliow) (Solid) (67) LF. 1,500.0 $0.60
711-11-224 | THERMOPLASTIC (Yellow) (Solid) (18") L.F. 400.0 $1.60
711-11-241 | THERMOPLASTIC (Yellow) (Skip) (67) L.F. 425.0 $0.50
CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_{TEMS_CICC
05/18/2010 10:00 AM Page 3 of 5
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Addendum No. 1 Revised Bid Form

Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: Peoples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersection PROJECT NO: 20100410

[F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK®*.

Contractor's Percentage Factor:

Bidder's Name:
Bidder's address:

Bidder's telephone Number:

Tax |dentification Number:

Miami Dade County Certificate of Competency: 4'9; [ )Q ;.é .

FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
05/18/2010 10:00 AM Page 4 of 5
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Addendum No. 1 Revised Bid Form

Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: Peoples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersection PROJECT NO: 20100410

[F THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK*.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES THAT INCLUDED IN THE VARIOUS ITEMS OF THE PROPOSAL AND IN THE TOTAL BID
PRICE ARE COSTS FOR COMPLYING WITH THE FLORIDA TRENCH SAFETY ACT (90-96), LAWS OF FLA.
EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 1st, 1990. THE BIDDER FURTHER IDENTIFIES THE COSTS TO BE SUMMARIZED BELOW:

Trench Safety Units of Measure Unit Unit Extended
Measure (LF, SY) (Quantity) Cost Cost
{Description)

1E
/

oo w>

TOTAL
FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE.

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_[TEMS_CICC
05/18/2010 10:00 AM ‘ _) Page 5 of 5




Project Worksheet
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MIAMIDADE

Memorandum
Date: June 25, 2010 .

To: Esther Calas, P.E., Director
Public Works Department

From: Penelope Townsley, Di
Small Business Developmer

Subject: Compliance Review
Contract No. CICC 7360-0/08, Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20100410
People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections

The Department of Small Business Development (SBD) has completed its review of the subject project for
compliance with the Community Small Business Enterprise (CSBE) Program for Construction Services. The
contract measure established for this project is a 10% CSBE subcontractor goal and an 11.2% Community
Workforce Program (CWP) goal.

The Contracts & Specifications Section of the Public Works Department has submitted bid documents from
Statewide Electrical’ Services, Inc. (#1), Horsepower Electric, Inc. (#2), and AG Electric, Inc. (#3) for
compliance review. Following is the pre-award compliance status and summary.

STATUS:

1. Statewide Electrical Services, Inc. Compliant
2. Horsepower Electric, Inc. Compliant
3. AGC Electric, Inc. Compliant
SUMMARY:

Statewide Electrical Services, Inc. (#1), a certified CSBE firm, submitted the required Schedule of Intent
(SOI) Affidavit committing to perform traffic signal electrical work with its own forces at 5%. ABC
Construction, a certified CSBE firm, was also listed on an SOI Affidavit to perform concrete work at 5%. ABC
Construction signed the SOI Affidavit in agreement with the information listed. Statewide Electrical Services,
Inc. has fulfiled the contract measure requirement and is in compliance with the CSBE Participation
Provisions.

Horsepower Electric, Inc. (#2) submitted the required SOl Affidavit comriitting to utize Star Paving Corp., a
certified CSBE firm, to perform miling, asphalt & concrete work at 7.2%. Miami Striping & Signs, Inc., a
certified CSBE firm, was also listed to perform striping & traffic signs and material handling work at 3%. Each
subcontractor signed its respective SOI Affidavit in agreement with the information listed. Horsepower
Electric, Inc. has fulfilled the contract measure requirement and is in compliance with the CSBE Participation
Provisions.

AGC Electric, Inc. (#3) submitted the required Schedule of Intent (SOI) Affidavits committing to utilize
Statewide Maintenance, Inc., a certified CSBE firm, to perform signs and striping work at 2% and Atlas
Concrete & Pavement, Inc., a certified CSBE firm, to perform concrete and asphalt work at 8%. Each
subcontractor signed its respective SOI Affidavit in agreement with the information listed. AGC Electric, Inc.
has fulfilled the contract measure requirement and is in compliance with the CSBE Participation Provisions.

S



'Esther Calas

June 25, 2010
RPQ No. 20100410
Page 2

Please note that SBD staff only reviewed and addressed compliance with the CSBE program. The
Contracts & Specifications Section of the Public Works Department is responsible for any other issues
that may exist. '

Should you have any questions or need any additional information, please do not hesitate to call Asa
Ferguson at (305) 375-4729.

¢. Rodney McMillian, PWD

Patrice King, SBD
File

[



COUNTY

Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Contracts & Specifications Section MMAMIDADERS oroyEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: CICC 7360-0/08

Miami, FL. 33128 RPQ No: 20100410

RPQ Project Name: Pedples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not

submitting a price proposal)
0\
Bidder's Company Name: /é/ﬁfﬁo W C%CVé//é’ , Lac

Company Address: 8/05 L(j&(’ 7{ zo Aoe |
City: /é Z /pa/’) state: £/ Zip: 330/Y

Telephone No: 305 -8/% - 40€0O Fax No: 305-517-4222 EMail: mhéé@lorse,powc‘eeéc 222

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): /(%r/ap/ /{'ée S ER

¢eived: | (if none' write "None")

Date: ©5/2¢ //'0

Number of Addendums

Signature: {\/ \§

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-0/08 contract. I 7
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Public Works Department
Contracts & Specifications Section COUNTY

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
MIAMIDADERS orqUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

Contract CICC 7360-0/08

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No:
Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100410

- a

RPQ Project Name: Pedples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not
submitting a price proposal)

0. 1

Bidder's Company Name: Aoc Hedvie , Ine

Company Address: 2660 0 IS, Hiale,, CC. 3Belg |

City: Bideah state: ©C  zip: 33016
Telephone No: _ 395 §23 1142 Fax No: 325 61§ 45/5  EMail: Ac},@&yg\u ViC. Com

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOGAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print):

TDW‘S \, Cv\r\-‘t\d

J‘ (if none' write "None")

Date: S z 7'51 [O

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and

the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-0/08 contract. | 4
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Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications Section LILAM REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

COURH Contract
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: CICC 7360-0/08
Miami, FL 33128 RPQNo: 20100410

RPQ Project Name: Pedples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not
submitting a price proposal)

79.¢ Z <§£V£U7 NtE + 8, [freceer)

Bidder's Company Name: /'{AGE\SCD . :ZN C.

Company Address: ‘70/0 N¢e 4”7 Que;’
City: V{r‘AM} State: 1T L Zip: 3,5' 3%
Telephone No: é}oﬁ) 798-22¢% Fax No: C—’N;) 8- 9020 EMaiI:}_V,. ZM%?GQ th:r @attnet

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): Mﬂk(’, G'RU‘TH:‘ZR_

Number of Addendums received: (if none’ write "None")

Signature: ; éé . Date: 5422{“2

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the CICC-7360-0/08 contract. \q
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Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications Section W'DADE REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

COUNTY Contract
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: MCC 7360 Plan
Miami, FL 33128 RPQNo: 20100410

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the MCC 7360 Plan .

Date Issued: 4/22/2010 Bid Date Due: 5/26/2010 Time Due: 2:00 P.M.
Bid shall be Submitted Via: Sealed Envelope to:

Name: EMail:

Address: Fax:

RPQ Added: 4/19/2010 User Bidder Request: 4/19/2010 OCI/OSBM Approval: 4/19/2010 Bidders Added:
4/22/2010

Project Number: 20100410 Estimated Value: $852,000.00
(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)

Project Name: Peoples Transportation Plan (PTP) Traffic Signal Intersections Emergency: N
Project Location:  Various (Refer to Special Provisions) ESP: N
Department Contact: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2930 Fax No: 305-375-2931

Project Manager: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2930 Fax No: 35-375-2931

Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Section Phone: 305-375-2930 Date: 4/23/2010
Document Pickup: Location: 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410

Y/N: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:
PreBid Meeting: Y N 5/12/2010 9:30 AM. 111 NW 1st Street, 14 Floor, Front Conference Room
Site Meeting: N N
Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Lowest Percentage Factor
Performance/Payment Bond Required: Y  Bid Bond Required: Y Insurance Required: Y_
Addition Insurance Required: N Addition Insurance Amount: $0.00
Comm Dist: Various Davis Bacon: N AIPP: N  $1,423.00
Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Yes DBD Subcontract Forms Required: N
Date Advertised: 4/22/2010 Review Committee Date: 4/14/2010
CSBE Requirements: Y 10.0% Trade Set-a-side: N
DBE Requirements: N 0.0% DBE Subcontract Forms Required: N
CWP Requirements: Y_ 11.2%
DBD Dates: Received: 7/13/2010 SOl Date: 7/13/2010 Compliance: N Memo Date:
Type: Trade: Count: Work%: Biﬁg:rs
Primar Electrical - Traffic Signal Contractor 999
Anticipated Start Date: 7/1/2010 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 365
Liquidated Damages / $$ Perday: Y  $1.423.00 Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments
CAPITAL BUDGET PROJECT # - DESCRIPTION MCC ESTIMATE
6037700- PEOPLE'S TRANSPORTATION PLAN NEIGHBORHOOD IMPROVEMENTS $852,000.00
FUNDING SOURCE:
SOURCE PROJECT NUM SITE # MCC ESTIMATE
People's Transportation Plan Bond Program N/A N/A 852,000.00
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Awarded To: STATEWIDE ELECTRICAL SERVICES INC CSBE Exp Date: Paid Amt: $0.00

Collusion Affidavit Received: Y_ Date Collusion Affidavit Received: 5/26/2010

Date Dept Awarded: 7/13/2010 Date Award Letter: 7/13/2010 PO Approval Date:
Base Amt: $852,000.00 Cont Amt: $85.200.00 Ded Amt: $62,800.00 Award Amt: $1,000,000.00
Insurance: OCI Reviewed: Y_ Date Approved: 7/23/2010 GL Ins Exp Dt: 2/12/2011

Bid Bond: Risk Approved: Y Date Approved: 7/22/2010 AL Ins Exp Dt: 11/7/2010

P & P Bond: Risk Approved: Y_ Date Approved: 7/22/2010 WC Ins Exp Dt: 2/12/2011

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

Work under this Contract includes furnishing of all supervision, labor, materials, tools, ecuipment and performing all
operations required to construct the Work in accordance with the Contract Documents.

Work includes but is not limited to furnishing all supervision, labor, materials, equipment, and tools to perform traffic signal
installation inciuding any ancillary work at each specific location as indicated in the work order. Traffic Signalization
upgrades includes the instailation of Mast Arms, Traffic Controller Assemblies, and milling and resurfacing. Miami Dade
County furnishes Mast Arms and anchor bolts. The Contractor shall furnish and install all Controller Assemblies, grounding
electrodes, conduits, pull boxes, foundations, pedestrian signal heads with push huttons and signs, overhead signs,
Internally llluminated Street Name Signs, mounting hardware, loop assemblies, signal cable, solar school speed zone
overhead flashing beacon assemblies and midblock traffic signals consisting of mast arm combinations with signal heads
or solar powered flashing beacon assemblies and regulatory signs, and pedestals with signal heads or solar powered
flashing beacon assemblies and regulatory signs. Additional work also includes installation of pedestrian ramps, ground
mounted signs, and pavement markings, construction of side walk, curb and gutter, installation of truncated dome, and
removing existing signs and traffic signalization devices in conflict with the proposed scope of Work.

If any changes are required due to conflict of design and or field conditions, the Engineer will make the final determination.
The Contractor and all subcontractors, under this Contract, are prohibited from performing any work, other than specified

in the Contract and/or directed by the Engineer, within the limits of the project site, without prior written notification to the
Engineer. This includes any work for private or commercial entities.

Design Drawings Included: N Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y.
Project Qualifier: Luis O. Perez Phone No: 305-375-2930 EMail: perezlu2@miamidade.gov
Comments:

Contractor - Bid Information (Bids added 4/22/2610)
. L!
DBD |[|Base Bid Exp
Type ||[Contractor Name Trade Bid |[OK Bid Amount |{Award {{Type Date
Electrical N Y $852,000.00 ||N i 8/31/2010
7360 ||{AGC Electric Inc. Contractor ,000. Pri
7360 Electrical || \4 $852,000.00 {|N 8/31/2010
36 Horsepower Electric, Inc. Contractor ,000. Pri
60 Electrical N $0.00 8/31/2010
73 Magesco, Inc. Contractor . Pri
7360 Electrical N Y $852,000.00 ||Y 8/31/2010
3 STATEWIDE ELECTRICAL SERVICES INC Contractor ,000. Pri
Electrical -
Traffic
7360 |[SYSTEMS INTEGRATION & MAINTENANCE, INC. Signal N $0.00 Pri 8/31/2010
Contractor
Electrical -
Traffic
7360 (|under Power Corp signal N $0.00 Pri 9/30/2011
Contractor J
7360 Electrical |V $0.00 9/30/2011

al
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( stwsView | [ ContactView ] [ Exit | [__GotoBottom ] [ Paymenss |

(searchALL J [ Find Contracts With Search String ==> ] CSBE Level: | 2 3 Other Emergency
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
MIAMI-DADE Capital Improvements Information System
COUNTY All MCC Projects Awarded to_ Statewide Maintenance/Striping, Inc. - FEIN: 204802403
Project Project Notice % Complete./
oer RPQ NO Name Location Work Tvpe Date STATUS * Amount Awarded To
PW 7040 20070792 PTP Pavement Marking Co Countywide Parking Strip Pai 12/27/2007  100% ! Closed $210,956.00 Statewide Maintenance/Str
PR 7040 61830 Tropical Park Equestrian 7800 SW 40 St Parking Strip Pai 4/21/2008 100% ¢ $2,090.33 Statewide Maintenance/Str
Complete
WS 7040 T1328 Hialeah Asphalt Striping 800 West 3 Ave, Hialeah Parking Strip Pai 2/1712010 100% ¢ $1,122.00 Statewide Maintznance/Str
Complete
Totals: 3 3214,168.33
Y yulicw Status=inactive Contact

I Exit | [ BacktoTop ]

33



PW

WS

Contract
61830

20070792

T1328

Type
7040

7040

7040

=

,‘g";, Capital Improvements Information System

\‘)° Contractor Evaluations Report

Contractor / Architect

Name Date Rater
Statewide 5/5/2008 Belkis Costello
Maintenance/Striping,

Inc.

Statewide 10/2/2008 Juan Cahizares
Maintenance/Striping,

Inc.

Statewide 4/13/2010 William Diaz
Maintenance/Striping

Inc.

Evaluation Count: 3 Contractors: 1 Average Evaluation: 3.5

| Exit

Period Rate
Project 3.0
conclusion

or

closeout

Interim 34

Project 4.0
conclusion

or

closeout



FrLoripA DEPARTMENT OF STATE

Division oF CORPORATIONS

Home Contact Us E-Filing Services Document Searches Forms Help

Previous on List Next on List Return To List Entity Name Search
No Events No Name History

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Profit Corporation
STATEWIDE ELECTRICAL SERVICES, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number P99000006863
FEI/EIN Number 650888796

Date Filed 01/25/1999
State FL
Status ACTIVE

Principal Address

12905 W OKEECHOBEE RD
BAY #4
HIALEAH FL 33018 US

Changed 03/10/2010

Mailing Address

12905 W OKEECHOBEE RD
BAY #4
HIALEAH FL 33018 US

Changed 03/12/2009

Registered Agent Name & Address

MELO, NOEL

12905 W OKEECHOBEE RD
BAY #4

HIALEAH FL 33018

Address Changed: 03/30/2005

Officer/Director Detail
Name & Address
Title P S

MELO, NOEL
12905 WEST OKEECHOBEE ROAD , BAY 4
HIALEAH GARDENS FL 33018 US

Annual Reports

Report Year Filed Date

2008 03/31/2008
2009 03/12/2009
2010 03/10/2010
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Document Images

03/10/2010 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

03/12/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format |

03/31/2008 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

03/16/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format |

02/20/2006 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

03/30/2005 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format |

04/26/2004 - ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

09/29/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format |}

05/16/2002 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

03/19/2001 - ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format |

04/26/2000 - ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format ]

01/25/1999 -- Domestic Profit | View image in PDF format |

Note: This is not official record. See documents if question or conﬂict‘|
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