OFFICIAL FILE COFY
CLERK OF THE BOARD

OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MIAMI=
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA '
Memorandum E
Date: October 5, 2010
To: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss Agenda Item No. 8(P)(1)(P)

and Members, Board of County Commissioners

From: George M. Burge
County Manager

Resolution R-1000-10

Subject: Contract Award Recommendation in the Amount of $826,300.00 between R & D
Electric, Inc., and Miami-Dade County for the People's Transportation Plan (PTP)
Project Entitled Street Lighting Contract — Countywide (Project — Miscellaneous
Construction Contracting (MCC) 7040 Plan, Request for Price Quotation (RPQ)
No. 20100499) and Authorizing the Use of Charter County Transportation Surtax
Funds

Recommendation

The attached Contract Award Recommendation for the PTP Street Lighting Contract - Countywide
(Project — MCC 7040 Plan, RPQ No. 20100499), in the amount of $826,300.00, between R & D Electric,
Inc. and Miami-Dade County has been prepared by the Public Works Department (PWD) and is
recommended for approval. Proceeds from the Charter County Transportation System Sales Surtax (the
Surtax) will be used to fund this project, therefore, approval by the Board of County Commissioners
(BCC) and Citizens’ Independent Transportation Trust (CITT) is required.

Scope
The work to be performed under the life of this contract includes street light installation at various
locations within Miami-Dade County.

Fiscal Impact/Funding Source

The fiscal impact will be approximately $826,300.00 and will be funded from the Surtax. The proposed
improvements qualify under the allowable work categories included in the PTP Neighborhood
Improvements Section. Specific funding for this project will be allocated from the respective Commission
District PTP yearly allocations. This is a work order based contract with a base contract amount of
$730,000.00. The total recommended award amount is $826,300.00, which is inclusive of the
contingency and dedicated allowances. This contract award will have no impact on the current or future
budget, since there are street lighting repair and maintenance contracts in place. The estimated
operation and maintenance (O&M) costs per street light is approximately $13.15 per month and will be
funded through the Department’s General Funds and Secondary Gas Tax.

Delegation of Authority
No additional authority is being requested within the body of this contract.

Track Record/Monitor

R & D Electric, Inc. is currently performing work for PWD at a satisfactory level as reported by the Project
Manager. PWD has reviewed the Office of Capital Improvements (OCl) database and found 23 awarded
construction contracts; one (1) contract from each of the following Departments, Parks & Recreation,
Transit, and Police; two (2) from the Water and Sewer: three (3) contracts from each of the following
Departments, Seaport, General Services Administration, and PWD; and nine (9) contracts from Housing.
The referenced database also lists a total of four (4) contractor performance evaluations with an overall
performance rating of satisfactory performance (3.7), out of a possible superior performance (4.0) rating;
the remaining contracts are still under construction. The Department of Small Business Development’s
(SBD) History of Violation's report lists no violations for this contractor.
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Following PWD's standard operating procedures, after award of this contract, a pre-construction meeting
will be scheduled. Throughout all PTP projects, the responsible staff person in PWD will be the PTP
Coordinator, Mr. Frank Aira, P.E. Following completion of the award process, the project will be assigned
to Mr. George Brown, Project Manager, for day to day responsibilities.

According to the Florida Department of State, Division of Corporations, R & D Electric, Inc., Company
Principals are: Rafael Echarri and Daniel Echarri, and the Company’s address is listed as: 7330 NW 12
Street, Miami, Florida 33126.

Background
In an effort to carry on the success of the PTP Neighborhood Improvements initiative, PWD continues to

take advantage of various contracting mechanisms such as the subject MCC process available under OCli
contract MCC 7040 Plan. Through this process, PWD forwards the RPQ, by way of facsimile
transmission, to a pool of pre-qualified Community Small Business Enterprise (CSBE) contractors for the
subject trade. Additionally, PWD advertises the project in the Daily Business Review and all solicitations
are available on-line through the Miami-Dade County portal under the “Procurement Solicitations” link.
Interested contractors prepare their bids according to the Job Order Contracting (JOC) process, whereby
the County establishes unit prices for the pay items in accordance with industry averages. The
contractors submit their bid as an overall percentage factor of the pricing established by the County. The
project award evaluation is based upon the lowest percentage submitted by the responsive, responsible
bidder for the project.

PWD staff determined that the scope of work for this project qualified for a CSBE set-aside {Levels |, Il
and Ill) designation. Therefore, on June 186, 2010, PWD forwarded an RPQ for the PTP Street Lighting
Contract, utilizing the OCI contract MCC 7040 Plan, to a list of 30 pre-qualified firms. A total of five (5)
firms purchased contract documents and four (4) firms proffered a bid.

On July 21, 2010, R & D Electric, Inc,, proffered the lowest responsive, responsible base bid of 0.70
percentage factor, 30% below the County's cost estimate; and the second lowest bidders, Statewide
Electrical Services, Inc., Brailly Electric Corp., and A. Bernal Services Corp. , proffered a base bid of 0.78
percentage factor, 8% over the lowest bidder. As a result, on August 4, 2010, PWD issued a
recommendation of award for RPQ No. 20100499 to R & D Electric, Inc., with the stipulation that approval
of this project must be obtained from the BCC and the CITT due to guidelines associated with the funding
source.

The work to be accomplished for this project consists of, but is not limited to, furnishing all supervision,
labor, required materials, equipment and tools to perform all operations necessary for the installation of
the new street lighting system. The work shall consists of the installation of light poles, conductors,
conduits, pull boxes, load center and the removal of any existing lighting system and all ancillary work
necessary to complete the project

e,

Assistant County Meafiager




Public Works
111 NW 1st Street ¢ Suite 1410

MIAMIDADE Miami, Florida 33128-1970
COUNTY T 305-375-2930 F 305-375-2931

Carlos Alvarez, Mayor : miamidade.gov

August 4, 2010

CERTIFIED MAIL No.
7009 3410 0002 3603 0295

FACSIMILE; TELEPHONE No.
305-403-7842; 305-403-7841

Mr. Rafae! Echarri

R & D Electric, Inc.

7311 N.W. 12" Street, Suite 27
Miami, Florida 33126

Re: Recommendation for Award
Request for Price Quotation (RPQ) No. 20100499 - MCC 7040 Plan
People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract- Countywide

Dear Mr. Echarri:

This letter will serve as your notification that you have been recommended for award for the
above referenced RPQ based on your Price Quotation submitted on Wednesday, July 21, 2010.
The total RPQ amount is for eight hundred twenty-six thousand three hundred dollars and zero
cents ($826,300.00). This includes a base contract amount of seven hundred thirty thousand
dollars and zero cents ($730,000.00), a contingency amount of seventy-three thousand dollars
and zero cents ($73,000.00), and dedicated allowances totaling twenty-three thousand three
hundred dollars and zero cents ($23,300.00). The contract duration is established as 365-
calendar days. However, the recommendation of award is contingent upon the submission of
the required items listed below:

1. Performance and Payment Bond as required in Contract No. MCC 7040 Plan, Section
2.0 Special Conditions, Page 16, Article 2.11, PERFORMANCE AND PAYMENT BOND.
(The original attached documents must be used and three (3) copies must be
provided).

2. Letter from Bonding Agent granting Miami-Dade County authorization to date the
Performance Bond.

3. Copies of current insurance certificates.

4, Copies of required license(s).

The preceding documents are required as outlined within Contract MCC 7040 Plan and to be
submitted within 10 business days. Failure to submit the document(s) within the specified time,
or any extension granted, will result in the award being rescinded. Subsequent to the review
and approval of the aforementioned documents, you are required to obtain the required permits
in the time stipulated in the RPQ. Upon obtaining the permit(s), a copy(s) must be submitted to
the Project Manager prior to commencement of work.
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MEMORANDUM

(Revised)
TO: Honorable Chairman Dennis C. Moss DATE: October 5, 2010
and Members, Board of County Commissioners
FROM: R. A. Cuevas, Jr. C SUBJECT: Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1)(P)
County Attorney

Please note any items checked.

“3-Day Rule” for committees applicable if raised
6 weeks required between first reading and public hearing

4 weeks notification to municipal officials required prior to public
hearing

Decreases revenues or increases expenditures without balancing budget
Budget required

Statement of fiscal impact required

Ordinance creating a new board requires detailed County Manager’s
report for public hearing

No committee review

Applicable legislation requires more than a majority vote (i.e., 2/3’s ,
3/8’s , unanimous ) to approve

Current information regarding funding source, index code and available
balance, and available capacity (if debt is contemplated) required



Approved Mayor Agenda Item No.

Veto
Override

10-5-10

RESOLUTION NO. R-1000-10

RESOLUTION  APPROVING A  CONTRACT  AWARD
RECOMMENDATION IN THE AMOUNT OF $826,300.00 BETWEEN R
& D ELECTRIC, INC. AND MIAMI-DADE COUNTY FOR THE
PEOPLE’S TRANSPORTATION PLAN (PTP) PROJECT ENTITLED
STREET LIGHTING CONTRACT - COUNTYWIDE (PROJECT -
MISCELLANEOUS CONSTRUCTION CONTRACTING (MCC) 7040
PLAN, REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ) NO. 20100499)
AND AUTHORIZING THE USE OF CHARTER COUNTY
TRANSPORTATION SURTAX FUNDS

8(P)(1)(P)

WHEREAS, this Board desires to accomplish the purposes outlined in the accompanying

memorandum, a copy of which is incorporated herein by reference,

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY

COMMISSIONERS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, that this Board approves the

Contract Award Recommendation in the amount of $826,300.00 between R & D Electric, Inc.

and Miami-Dade County for the People’s Transportation Plan (PTP) Project Entitled Street

Lighting Contract — Countywide (Project MCC 7040 Plan, RPQ No. 20100499) in substantially

the form attached hereto and made a part hereof.



Agenda Item No. 8(P) (1) (P)
Page No. 2

The foregoing resolution was offered by Commissioner Sally A. Heyman
who moved its adoption. The motion was seconded by Commissioner Rebeca Sosa
and upon being put to a vote, the vote was as follows:

Dennis C. Moss, Chairman  aye
Jose "Pepe" Diaz, Vice-Chairman aye

Bruno A. Barreiro  aye Audrey M. Edmonson  aye
Carlos A. Gimenez  aye Sally A. Heyman aye
Barbara J. Jordan aye Joe A. Martinez aye
Dorrin D. Rolle aye Natacha Seijas aye
Katy Sorenson aye Rebeca Sosa

Sen. Javier D. Souto  aye aye

The Chairperson thereupon declared the resolution duly passed and adopted this 5™ day
of October, 2010. This resolution shall become effective as follows: (1) ten (10) days after the
date of its adoption unless vetoed by the Mayor, and if vetoed, shall become effective only upon
an override by this Board, and (2) either i) the Citizens' Independent Transportation Trust (CITT)
has approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County Commission re-
affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission's membership and such

reaffirmation becomes final.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
BY ITS BOARD OF
COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

" HARVEY RUVIN, CLERK

py. DIANE COLLINS
Deputy Clerk

Approved by County Attorney as
to form and legal sufficiency. \;g%

Hugo Benitez



Recommendation of Award
RPQ No. 20100499

No work is to be performed without a permit unless the Project Manager issues a written
directive to proceed without permit(s). After receipt of the permits the Project Manager will
schedule a Pre-Construction Conference and issue a Notice to Proceed authorizing the
performance of the work.

This letter will also serve as a reminder that all work must be performed according to the scope
of work and contract’s terms and conditions, all permits and inspections and in accordance with
all applicable Federal, State and local laws, codes and regulations.

Further, it shall be understood that since proceeds from the Charter County Transit System
Sales Surtax levied pursuant to Section 29.121 of the Code of Miami-Dade County may be
used to pay for all or some part of the cost of this contract, no award of this contract shall be
effective and thereby give rise to a contractual relationship with the County unless and until the
following have occurred: 1) the County Commission awards the contract, and such award
becomes final (either by expiration of 10 days after such award without veto by the Mayor, or by
Commission override of a veto); and 2) either i) the Citizens' Independent Transportation Trust
(CITT) has approved same, or ii) in response to the CITT's disapproval, the County
Commission re-affirms its award by two-thirds (2/3) vote of the Commission’s membership and
such reaffirmation becomes final.

Please contact Mr. Ultimo De Oliveira, OCI office, at (305) 375-5265 to insure that your file
is complete for award consideration.

Should you have any questions please contact me at (305) 375-2930.

Sincerely,

Cc: Esther L. Calas, P.E., PWD
Orky Rodriguez, PWD
Johnny Martinez, OCl
Penelope Townsley, SBD
Robert Williams, P.E., PWD
Rodney McMillian, PWD
Luis O. Perez, P.E., PWD
Bernard Philippeaux, PWD
Alvaro Castro, PWD
Patrice King, SBD
Traci Adams-Parish, SBD
Clerk of the Board
Project File



Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Contracts & Specifications Section ‘%m REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
' Contract  \cc 7040 Plan

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: :

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100499

RPQ Project Name: People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State '"No Bid' if not
submitting a price proposal)

g 7

Bidder's Company Name: .W&& 57.644/ Cé‘/_é}%/(f.s; —r7C
Company Address:/%ﬁf Wfﬁfﬂ,éééCéé /[é [Z’@/&ﬂ’g #7
City: %MM ‘%f%ﬂf State: E_:é_" Zip: -‘330 /y

305—5 7264&5 Fax No: 205 EH 23/(8(71  Email: 6+a7(€w10/ e 9[667(/ r éa‘

Loo. R .-
THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER

TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION

WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPQOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): /\( e L M =Co
{

Telephone No

(if none' write "None")

Date: ﬂ71é &O/D

Number of Addendums received:

Signature:

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the MCC 7040 Plan.

Appendix 5A



Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications Section DADE REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

Contract  y00 7040 Plan
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No:

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100499

RPQ Project Name: People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State ‘No Bid' if not
submitting a price proposal)

.79 %
/,
Bidder's Company Name: BRF}I H}/ 6/501\‘173\C. Conb.
Company Address: |Or000 E. CA/USF) CZUB )2 .
City: ‘\/\"\ﬂf‘m’l State: Z . Zp: éél&é
Telephone No: 3@(‘522‘0@?/ Fax No: %af—ﬁéz 3}§f EMaiI:@E&EjE_@%@GmF};L .cOM

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quoty}: # £ f"jLDIZ B r3:38 ]>/
N,

Number of Agdéndum ived: oW E (if none’ write "None")

Date: é 7‘[9 “ZQ

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time dve and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the MCC 7040 Plan.

™ Appendix 5A



Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA
Contracts & Specifications Section 'DADE REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)

Contract MCC 7040 Plan
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No:

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100499

RPQ Project Name: People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not
submitting a price proposal)

Bidder’s Company Name: /4 &/é/(/ﬂé Jéf HES /O/Zﬂ
Company Address: 79\5 &f E ? €OU,€ /

City: /94/%54// state: L zip: /0
Telephone No: FOS5 §8F/687  FaxNo: X5 £X5 720 EMail: Gpamncod) Gberrar/ FroeES
CORL. o277

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF TS OFFER.

Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): % IO Zm/ﬂ(_

Number of Addendums received: 0 (if none’ write "None™)

Date: 74‘77 / 40 /0

Signature:

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the MCC 7040 Plan.

|O
Appendix 5A



Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: PTP Street Lighting Installation PROJECT NO: 20100499

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE "NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT

WORK*.

EUSINESS SIGNS (Temporary, Post Mounted) $250.00

102-76 FLASHING ARROW BOARD (Temporary, Multimode) EA/DAY 360.0 $9.00

102-77 HIGH INTENSITY FLASHING LIGHTS (TEMPORARY, TYPE "B") EA/DAY 1,080.0 $2.50

102-75A CONSTRUCTION SIGNS EA/DAY 1.0 $2.00

110-1-1W | CLEARING AND GRUBBING Ww.0. 10 $300.00

351-2A CURB RAMP DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE (Labor and material as described in the | S.F. 1.0 $65.00
Special Provisions and included per FDOT Standard Details Index No. 304 (Truncated Domes) As
directed by Engineer.

575-1-1A SODDING (Pensacola Bahia or match existing) (Includes watering and maintenance). (This item is S.Y. 1,000.0 $5.00
contingent upon field conditions and may be increased, decreased or eliminated by the Engineer).

580-336-1 TREE TRIMMING EA. 40.0 $100.00

620-1-1 GROUNDING ELECTRODE L.F. 1.0 $19.17

715-1-113 CONDUCTOR - (Fumish and instail three conductor set, No. 6 AWG RHWXLT stranded black, L.F. 15,620.0 $7.00
white, and green)

715-1-114D | CONDUCTOR (Fumish & Tnstall three conductor set, #4 AWG RHWXLT stranded black, white & L.F. 2,400.0 $9.50
green)

715-1-1158 | CONDUCTOR (Fumish & install three conductor set, #2 AWG RHWXLT stranded black, white, & LF. 1.0 $8.50
green)

715-2-3D INSTALL NEW WIRING TO LUMINAIRE (SOA #12 Cable). Terminate wires in breakaways (HEB- EA. 1.0 $175.00
AW-RYC and Het-AW-RYC).

715-2-215 CONDUIT (2" PVC-Schedule 40) (Underpavement) L.F. 17,950.0 $20.00

715-2-115B | CONDUIT, (2" PVC Schedule 40) (Underground) L.F. | 1.0 $19.00

715-2-115C | CONDUIT, 2" PVC [(Additional conduit installed in existing open trench) (This item is contingent L.F. 1.0 $12.00
upon field conditions and may be increased, decreased or eliminated by the Engineer)]

715-7-11B LOAD CENTER - Complete (includes switch, 15ft concrete pole, pull boxes, ground rod, and wire EA. 1.0 $4,500.00
at service point)

715-7-11E Load Center - Complete for 1207240 VAC/3wire operation. Include pull boxes, 15ft concrete stub EA. 1.0 $6,500.00
pole, grounding electrodes; wires
at service point.

715-10-002A | CONCRETE POLE BASE [(For 30" - 45 Pole)(Pre-cast conc. Furnish & Install) (Includes pullbox, EA 1.0 $750.00
and ground rod)]

715-10-002B | CONCRETE POLE BASE {[(For 30° - 45 Poie)(Pre-cast conc. Fumish & Install) (Includes EA. 15.0 $4,800.00
pullbox,and ground rod with concrete apron)}

715-10-002C | CONCRETE POLE BASE [(For 30' - 45" Pole)(Pre-Cast concrate fumished and install) (inciudes EA. 60.0 | $1,400.00
pull box w/ lid, grounding electrode, cadweld) (sidewalk flag/ramp replacement and/or restoration
and expansion material around concrete pole base).]

{715-11-219 Luminaire, Install Only, Roadway (special-decorative) EA. \ 1.0 $250.00

CSCCRP_F’ROJECT__BIDJTEMS_CICC
06/15/2010 05:24 PM
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Bid Form

PROJECT TITLE: PTP Street Lighting Instaliation PROJECT NO: 20100499

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT
WORK®. .

umbe

e TTiE Luminaire Install Only, Roadway, cobra head (480V)(400 Watts) . . §175.00
715-14-01A | Pull-Box Lock EA. 80.0 $80.00
715-14-12C | PULL BOX ( Includes ground rod, ground wire, rocks and cadweld) EA 19.0 $500.00
715-14-120 | PULL BOX ( Includes ground wire, rocks, cadweld, sidewalk flagiramp replacement and/or EA. 42.0 $450.00
restoration).
715-511- Direct Burial Decorative Concrete Pole (14’ - 22'). Fumished and installed complete with EA. 19.0 $7,000.00
122A 175W/MHV luminaire, lamp, rapid pulse start ballast, pole cable distribution system.
715-511- LIGHT POLE COMPLETE (Aluminum 30-45 #t mounting height). Fumish & Install. includes 10 ft EA. 60.0 $4,200.00
130B mounting bracket arm & transformer base, 400W/HPS cobra head juminaire (compietely wired
including the modular pole cable distribution system).
715-531-1 Light Pole (30-45 ft heignht) (including 10ft mounting bracket & transformer base), Installation Only. EA 1.0 $700.00

Contractor's Percentage Factor: . Ol ? @

Bidder's Name: ﬂ 4 -D E/ﬂ @4(7\6‘« "

Bidder's address: 78\?5 é)l/gzllﬂz St S\U/’\f( 20>
A
Bidder's telephone Number: ;/I/h.n / @5) "/0.?*-’73 (Z/

Tax |dentification Number: _@ // /42( 8‘95
Miami Dade County Certificate of Competency: /: a,/_«ZOO /52(,[

FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE

CSCCRP_PROJECT_BID_ITEMS_CICC
06/15/2010 05:24 PM ‘a"’
_ Page 2 of 3



PROJECT TITLE: PTP Street Lighting Installation PROJECT NO: 20100499

IF THIS PROPOSAL IS ACCEPTED, THE UNDERSIGNED AGREES TO COMPLETE ALL WORK UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHIN THREE
HUNDRED SIXTY FIVE (365) CALENDAR DAYS AFTER THE EFFECTIVE DATE ESTABLISHED IN THE *NOTICE TO PROCEED WITH CONTRACT
WORK™. .

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGES THAT INCLUDED IN THE VARIOUS ITEMS OF THE PROPOSAL AND IN THE TOTAL BID

PRICE ARE COSTS FOR COMPLYING WITH THE FLORIDA TRENCH SAFETY ACT (90-96), LAWS OF FLA.
EFFECTIVE OCTOBER 1st, 1990. THE BIDDER FURTHER IDENTIFIES THE COSTS TO BE SUMMARIZED BELOW:

Trench Safety Units of Measure Unit Unit Extended
Measure (LF, SY) {Quantity) Cost Cost
(Description)

\ e
-~ ~
o~ /);7

/'
,//// TOTAL

FAILURE TO COMPLETE THE INFORMATION IN THE SPACES PROVIDED ABOVE MAY RESULT IN THE BID BEING DECLARED NON-RESPONSIVE.

©c o w>»

CSCCRP_F’ROJECT__BID_ITEMS_CICC ‘ ) 7
06/15/2010 05:24 PM Page 3 0f 3



Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Contracts & Specifications Section %D“DE REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Contract o6 7040 Plan

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 No: A, FoaY P1all

Miami, FL 33128 RPQ No: 20100499

RPQ Project Name: People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract

Price Proposal (Lowest Percentage to Perform the work must be stated here. State 'No Bid' if not ,
submitting a price proposal) |

[0.90] 2e00 pount Saventoy |

Bidder's Company Name: K ié, b E lQ,Q % Q,i I—J’\C_ .
Company Address: 7 33 O p L&) \l% S‘l.\rf_f:{'/, SU I\/Z' 203 w
City: M’A""’“ State: & Zip: 32’2—(’0

1
|

Telephone No: 305 %02, 7&4’ Fax No: 395 403«7@4& EMail: @@gdd@’t'nc C[)m:

THE EXECUTION OF THIS FORM CONSTITUTES THE UNEQUIVOCAL OFFER OF PROPOSER i
TO BE BOUND BY THE TERMS OF ITS PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SIGN THIS SOLICITATION L
WHERE INDICATED BELOW BY AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE SHALL RENDER THE '
PROPOSAL NON-RESPONSIVE. THE COUNTY MAY, HOWEVER, IN ITS SOLE DISCRETION,
ACCEPT ANY PROPOSAL THAT INCLUDES AN EXECUTED DOCUMENT WHICH
UNEQUIVOCALLY BINDS THE PROPOSER TO THE TERMS OF ITS OFFER. |

——

i
Name of Person Submitting Quote (Print): ‘QCL f aog. }-/- C/l'\ Qry(i j
!

Number of Addendums received: ’ (if none' write "None")
Signature: W . Date: :Z ’20sz
o xS~ il

I/

Note: Quotes must be submitted on this form. Quote envelope must state RPQ Number, date and time due and
the Bidder's Name. Use of any other form for submission of the price quotation shall result in the
rejection of the price quotation. Late bids will not be opened. Low bidder will be notified, in the Notice
of Award, of the requirements to submit current copies of insurance certificates in accordance with the
Contract Documents: after review for compliance with the Contract Documents, user Department will
forward all Insurance Certificates to CICC for Review. By signature, the CONTRACTOR agrees to be
bound by the terms set forth in the MCC 7040 Plan.




Public Works Department MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Contracts & Specifications "DADE REQUEST FOR PRICE QUOTATION (RPQ)
Section Contract No: MCC 7040 Plan - CICC 7040-0/07
111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410 RPQ No: 20100499

Miami, FL 33128

This RPQ is issued under the terms and conditions of the MCC 7040 Plan .

Date Issued: 6/16/2010 Bid Date Due: 7/21/2010 Time Due: 2:00 P.M.

Bid shall be Submitted Via: Sealed Envelope to:

Name: Clerk of the Board Office EMail: valveo@miamidade.gov_
Address: 111 NW 1st Street Fax: (305) 375-4231

RPQ Added: 4/30/2010 User Bidder Request: 6/14/2010 OCI/OSBM Approval: 6/14/2010 Bidders Added:
6/14/2010

Project Number: 20100499 Estimated Value: $730,000.00 CSBE Level: CSBE Level 3
(excluding contingencies and dedicated allowances)

Project Name: People's Transportation Plan (PTP) Street Lighting Contract. Emergency: N
Project Location:  Various Loaction (See Article # 3.02 of the SP) ESP: N
SITE # LOCATION 1 DIST ESTIMATE T-S-R
#75640 Countywide Neighborhood Improvements 30 $730,000.00 0-0-0
Department Contact: Jean Bemard Phone No:  305-375-2930 Fax No: 305-375-2931
Philippeaux

Project Manager: Jean Bernard Philippeaux  Phone No: 305-375-2930 Fax No: 305-375-2931

Document Pickup: Contact: Contracts & Specifications Section Phone: (305) 375-2930  Date: 6/1¢ 6/2010
Document Pickup: Location: 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1410

Y/N: Mandatory: Date: Time: Location:
PreBid Meeting: Y. N 71612010 10:00 A.M. 111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1510
Site Meeting: N N
Type of Contract: Single Trade Method of Award: Lowest Percentage Factor
Performance/Payment Bond Required: Y Bid Bond Required: Y_ Insurance Required: Y
Addition Insurance Required: N Addition Insurance Amount: $0.00
Comm Dist: Various Davis Bacon: N AIPP: N  $0.00
Prevailing Wage Rate Requirements: Highway Construction DBD Subcontract Forms Required: N
CSBE Requirements: Y 100.0% Trade Set-a-side: N
DBE Requirements: N 0.0%_ DBE Subcontract Forms Required: N
CWP Requirements: N 0.0%
DBD Dates: Received: SOl Date: Compliance: N Memo Date:
Type: Trade: Count: Work%: BiAdg: rs
Primary Electrical Contractor 30
Anticipated Start Date: 1/24/2011 Calendar Days for Project Completion: 365
Liquidated Damages / $$ Per day: Y. $1.423.00 423.00 Method of Payment: Scheduled Monthly Payments
CAPITAL BUDGET PROJECT # - DESCRIPTION MCC ESTIMATE
6037700- PECPLE'S TRANSPORTATION PLAN NEIGHBORHOOD IMPROVEMENTS $730,000.00

FUNDING SOURCE:

S



SOURCE PROJECT NUM SITE # MCC ESTIMATE

People's Transportation Pian Bond Program 6037700 #75340 $730.000.00
Awarded To: R & D Electric. Inc. CSBE Exp Date: Paid Amt: $0.00

Collusion Affidavit Received: Y_ Date Collusion Affidavit Received: 7/21/2010

Date Dept Awarded: 8/4/2010 Date Award Letter: 8/4/2010 PO Approval Date:

Base Amt: $730,000.00 Cont Amt: $73.000.00 Ded Amt: $23,300.00 Award Amt: $826,300.00
Insurance: OCl| Reviewed: Date Approved: GL Ins Exp Dt: 12/20/2010

Bid Bond: Risk Approved: Date Approved: AL Ins Exp Dt: 8/17/2010

P & P Bond: Risk Approved: Date Approved: WC Ins Exp Dt: 3/25/2011

Scope of Work: (Contractor must obtain and submit all permits prior to performing any work.)

Work under this Contract includes furnishing of all supervision, labor, materials, tools, equipment and performing all
operations required to construct the Work in accordance with the Contract Documents.

The installation of the new street lighting system, to include installation of light poles, conductors, conduits, pull boxes,
joad center and the removal of any existing lighting system and all ancillary work necessary to complete the project.

The Contractor shall layout the proposed work in the field and contacts the Sunshine State One Call of Florida, Inc. at 1-
800-432-4770 and other affected utility owners at least forty-eight (48) hours prior to commencing any trenching or
excavation on this project.

if any changes are required due to conflict of design and or field conditions, the Engineer will make the final determination.

Design Drawings Included: N Shop Drawings Included: N Specifications Included: Y.
Project Qualifier: Phone No: EMail:
Comments:

CONTRACTOR QUALIFICATION REQUIREMENTS:

A Certificate of Competency Requirement:

1. At the time of Bid and pursuant to the requirements of Section 10-3 of the Code of Miami-Dade County, Florida and
these Solicitation and Contract Documents, the Bidder must hold a valid, current, and active:

a. Certificate of Competency from the County’s Construction Trades Qualifying Board as an Electrical Contractor; or

b. Certification, as an electrical contractor provided by the State of Florida Electrical Contractors' Licensing Board,
pursuant to the provisions of Section 489.511 of the Florida Statutes.

B. Experience Requirement:
1. The Bidder, through full time personnel employed by the Bidder, must demonstrate experience as the prime contractor
in projects with scopes comparable to the Project Scope of Work. Demonstrate the experience requirement by:

a. Providing a detailed description of completed projects, similar to the Project Scope of Work, in which the Bidder is
currently engaged or has completed within the past five years. List and describe those projects performed for government
clients, similar size private entities, and any work performed for the County. The description should identify for each
project (1) the client, (2) description of work, (3) total dollar value of the contract, (4) contract duration, (5) customer
contact person and phone number for reference, (6) statement or notation of whether Bidder isfwas the prime contractor or
subcontractor, and (7) the results of the project; or

b. Pursuant to Section 255.20, Florida Statues (F.S.), the County may consider a bid from a Bidder, meeting the license
requirements above, in good standing that has been prequalified and considered eligible by the Florida Department of
Transportation (FDOT) under Section 337.14, F.S. and Chapter 14-2, Florida Administrative Code, to perform the work
described in the Contract Documents. Contractors seeking consideration under this Paragraph shall submit along with the
Bid Documents for review and consideration, current copy(ies) of their FDOT Certificate(s) of Qualification in the Electrical

Work Class, Certification of Work Underway, and Status of Contract(s) On Hand.

BID DOCUMENTS:

Bidding documents may be purchased from the Miami-Dade County Department of Public Works, Contracts and
Specifications Section, 111 NW 1st Street, 14th Floor, Miami, Florida 33128 for a non-refundable fee of Twenty Five
Dollars ($25.00) per each complete set of documents. Payment shall be in the form of a company check, cashier's check,

(b



or money order payable to the “Board of County Commissioners of Miami-Dade County, Florida.”

ADDENDUMS - RF!"s

The Public Works Department has made changes with regard to how addendums and requests for information (RF1) will
be sent to document holders. Be advised that all Addendums, RFI’s, and the document holders list (bidder’s list) are now
available to view online at the following web address:

http://www.miamidade.gov/DPM/current_opportunities.asp

Therefore, during the advertisement period, the Department will not be sending these documents via certified mail. All

document holders must provide a dedic

ated fax number available at all hours. The Department will only be sending

addendums and RFI's by fax and posting online at the aforementioned link. The bidders list will be updated every Friday
during the advertisement phase of the contract. Please be aware that acknowledgment of receipt of all addendums and
RFI's remain a requirement when submitting bids.

VENDOR REGISTRATION:

Due to the new Vendor Registration procedures of the Department of Procurement Management, updated definitions

along with the sAffirmation of Vendor Affi

davits” has been added to the Bid Submittal Package. The successful bidder must

be registered under this new procedure prior to award.

PRE BID - BID SUBMITTAL DUE DATE:

Pre-Bid Conference time and location: Tuesday, July 6, 2010, 10:00 AM., at 111 NW 1st Street, 15th floor Front

Conference Room.

Bid Submittal Time and Location: Wednesday, July 21, 2010, 2:00 PM at 111 NW 1st Street, 17th Floor, Clerk of the

Board Office.

E Contractor - Bid Information (Bids added 6/14/2010) ‘J
DBD |Boy® Bid "LE'X

Type ||Contractor Name Trade Bid ||OK Amount Award || Type DaFt)e

‘A C ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR INC

”Electrical Contractor IDB R

8/31/2010

7040 \IL QUALITY ELECTRICAL SERVICES INC J‘;ctrical Contractor

9/30/2011

@ || N
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ol e
ol e

|
i

7040 ||All Tech Electric, Inc.

8/31/2010

‘Electrical Contractor l
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T
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|

7040 ||canseco Electrical Contractors, Inc.
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“Electrlcal Contractor l
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7040 ||J.v. Electrical Services, Inc.
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J‘;ctrical Contractor l

7040 ‘;ior International Corporation

L
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L
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7040 lJ:mes P. Moran, Inc.
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7040 ‘Marey Electric, Inc.
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o
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7040 ||Mmarvelous Electric, Inc.

H;ectrical Contractor JD

7040 |Maynard Electric
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“;ctrical Contractor

7040 ||Multi Electric Corp

8/31/

HElectrical Contractor |D

7040 |Potential Difference, Inc.

il
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4"E|ectrlcal Contractor “N ”::I

7040 ||Prime Electrical Contractors, Inc.
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|PYD Electric, Corp.
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J‘Electrical Contractor lD[:l
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IEE_HR & D Electric, Inc. JlElectrical Contractor JlY____n “S730,000.0L“Y J‘ﬂ_—“mwzmo l
W Raymond Electric, Inc. JlETectrlcal Contractor 4“;_____" 4l|$0-00 |E:]
lE)ad Runner Electric, Inc. Jlgctrlcal Contractor JDF J $0.00 Jlj
_MHBEN ELECTRIC TECHNOLOGY INC Jlatrical Contractor [’T—‘ | $0.00 JB‘BIM/ZMO

7_0;40“ SIGNAL MAINTENANCE INC Jlgctrical Contractor |N—_r J $0.00 JB |8I31I2010 I
STATEWIDE ELECTRICAL SERVICES INC Jlactrical Contractor Jr Jl$0700 ;”N M
W@E ELECTRICAL CONTRACTORS INC Jl;ctrical Contractor JDF 4"5070 Jl IE__]

N .

SYSTEMS INTEGRATION & MAINTENANCE,

7040 Electrical Contractor $0.00 8/31/2010

IN

C. Pri
|7°40 “Thevenln Enterprises Inc. J‘E?ctrical Contractor IDD‘W-OO ” l|8/31/2010 I
7040 H«lreo SIGNAL INC ”E|ectrical Contractor JlN H ”30-00 H “Pri | 8/31/2010




DPT
HD
SP

SP

PW
PW

SP

PR

PO

(" Swwsview ] {__ Contactview ] | Exit [ GowBottom ] [ Payments ]

Search ALL |

Find Contracts With Search String ==> ]

Jype
7040

7040

7040

7040
7040

7040

7040
7040
7040
7040
7040
7040

7040

MIAMI-DADE

RPQNO_
0175558
2007-005

2007.017

20070712

20070771

2008-136.19

* Yelbsw Status

Contract

Project

Name

Robert King High # 241
Cruise Terminal D and E

Fire Alarm system Upgrad

Instaftation Contract fo
Street Lighting Installa

Baggage Claim Area Fire

North Shore Open Space P
Replacement of existing
Upgrade of Fire Alarm Sy
Fire Alarm Upgrade @ PS
DHS New Directions Gener
TGK Correclional Facilit

DHS: New Direction East

Project
Location Work Type
1407 NW 7 Street Emergency Respons
1265 and 1435 N. Cruise Bou Electrical Contra
1001, 1007, 1015 N. America Fire Alarm
Various Location Electrical Contra
Countywide Electrical Contra
1741-1751 North Cruise Boul Fire Alarm
7929 Atlantic Way. Miami Be Electrical Contra
18805 NW 27 Avenue Fire Alarm
12700 NW 30 Ave Fire Alarm
20215 NW 2 Ave Fire Alarm
3140 NW 78 Street, Miami, F Electrical Contra
TGK Correctional Facility 7 Electrical Contra
3140 NW 76 Street Miami, Fire Alarm
Totals:

t _rExit Back to Top ]

9

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Capital Improvements Information System
All MCC Projects Awarded to R & D Electric, Inc. - FEIN: 611428335

Notice

te
10/5/2006
4/10/2009

12/15/2008

2/7/2008
10/12/2007

8/18/2009

3/11/2008
12/11/2008
2/25/2008
2/25/2008
3/1/2010
12/3/2008

3/13/2008

CSBE Level:

STATUS *
0% ! Cancelled
85% / On
Schedule
98% / Work
Complete:
Pending Change
Order
0%/ On
Schedule
0% / On
Schedule
100% / Work
Complete,
Pending Close-
Qut

100% /
Complete
100% /
Complete
0%  Cancelled
0% | Cancelled
0% / Awaiting
Bidders
100% ¢
Complete
98% / Work
Complete,
Pending Close-
Out

1 2 3 Other Emergency

Award
Amouns Awarded To
$575.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

$1,686,104.03 R & D Electric, Inc.

$280,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc
$196,400.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
$518,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

$107,500.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

$18,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc
$18,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
$25,900.00 R & D Electric, Inc

$23,550.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
$44,100.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

$243,000.00 R & D Electric. inc.

$199,155.00 R & D Electric, Inc

$3,360,284.03



( Status View ] (__Contact View ] [ Exit [ GooBotom ) [ Payments ]
Search ALL ] [_ Find Contracts With Search String ] CSBE Level: | 2 3 Other Emergency
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA

MIAMI-DADE Capital Improvements Information System
COUN All MCC Projects Awarded to R & D Electric, Inc. - FEIN: 611428335

Project Project Notice % Compiete / Award

DPT Type RPQNOQ Name Location Work Type. Date STATYS * Amount Awarded To

HD 7360 (017555 B:RS Robert King High # 24 1407 NW 7 Street Emergency Respons 10/5/2008  100% / Closed $575.00 R & D Electric, Inc

HD 7360 (0183688 HARRY CAIN EXTERIOR LIGH 490 NE 2 AVE. MIAMI, FL 331 Electrician, Mast 4/3/2007 100% / Closed $30,700.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

HD 7360 Q5784 E-R SITE 140 - ANNIE COLEMAN SCATTERED SITES Etectrical Contra 8/15/2006 100% i Closed  $220,000 00 R & D Electric, inc.

PW 7360 20090269 Mast Arm Replacement - C Various-Coral Gables (See S Electrical - Traf 1111872009 0% / On $428,745.00 R & D Electric, Inc
Schedule

PW 7360 20100374 Mast Amm Replacement (35 Refer to Special Provisions Electrical - Traf 3/18/2010 0% / On $385,406.75 R & D Electric, Inc.
Schedule

HD 7360 24829 A TWIN LAKES # 150 1205 95 STREET Fire Alarm 5/8/2008 100% / $73.,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
Complete

MT 7380 Map Cabinets & Signs Metromaver Third Street gro Electrical Contra 8/6/2007 100% / Closed  $132,000.00 R & D Electric, Inc

HD 7360 Robert King High, Little 1403/1405 NW Tth St. & 1275 Fire Alam 11/2/2009 25% /0On $589,362.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
Schedule

HD 7360 MDHA 04494 E HOMESTEAD GARDENS - NEW 1542 SW 4 STREET Fire Alarm 8/6/2004 100% / $99.990.00 R & D Electric, Inc.
Complete

HD 7360 MDHA 04609E R-2 INSRALLATION OF NEW FIRE 1407 NW 7TH Fire Alarm 7/1/2004 0%/ Cancelled  $49,951.00 R & D Electric, Inc.

HD 7360 MDHA 05785-€ Carver Daycare/Warehouse 1900 NW 75 Street, Miami, F General Building 10/27/2006 9% / Cancelled  $220,00000R & D Electric, Inc.

Totals " $2,229.729.75
* Yeliow Stuiussinactive Crntract

{Exit | (BacktoTop ]




Contract
61170

2007.017
W70155

05784 E-R

Type
7040

7040
7040

7360

Exit

Capital Improvements Information System

Contractor Evaluations Report

Contractor / Architect

Name
R & D Electric, Inc.

R & D Elegtric, Inc.
R & D Electric, Inc.

R & D Electric, Inc.

Date Rater
8/1/2008 Belkis Costello

5/13/2009 Bart E. Sanfilippo
10/2/2009 Juan Hernandez

11/5/2009 Fernando Urrutia

Evaluation Count: 4 Contractors: 1 Average Evaluation: 3.7

2\

Period Rate

Project 4.0
conclusion

or closeout
Interim 3.8
Completion 3.3
of

construction
Project 35
conclusion

or closeout
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FLorRIDA DEPARTMENT OF STATE

DivisioN oF CORPORATIONS

Help

Home Contact Us E-Filing Services Document Searches Forms
Previous on List Next on List Return To List Entity Name Search
No Events No Name History

Detail by Entity Name

Florida Profit Corporation
R & D ELECTRIC, INC.

Filing Information

Document Number P02000103457
FEVEIN Number 611428335

Date Filed 09/25/2002
State FL

Status ACTIVE
Principal Address

7330 NW 12TH STREET

SUITE # 203

MIAMI FL 33126

Changed 04/29/2010

Mailing Address

7330 NW 12TH STREET
SUITE # 203
MIAMI FL 33126

Changed 04/29/2010

Registered Agent Name & Address

ECHARRI, RAFAEL
7330 NW 12TH STREET
SUITE # 203

MIAMI FL 33126 US

Address Changed: 04/29/2010

Officer/Director Detail
Name & Address
Title P

ECHARRI, RAFAEL
3031 SW 11TH STREET
MIAMI FL 33135

Title VP

ECHARRI, DANIEL
9590 SW 40TH TERRACE
MIAMI FL 33165

Annual Reports

)




Report Year Filed Date

2008 05/01/2008
2009 03/25/2009
2010 04/29/2010

Document images

04/29/2010 — ANNUAL REPORT r View image in PDF format
03/25/2009 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format
05/01/2008 - ANNUAL REPORT [ View image in PDF format

04/24/2007 -- ANNUAL REPORT | View image in PDF format

04/29/2006 - ANNUAL REPORT r View image in PDF format

03/29/2005 - ANNUAL REPORT | View image in POF format

03/23/2004 - ANNUAL REPORT r View image in PDF format
01/24/2003 -- ANNUAL REPORT [ Viewimagein PDF format

Lyuuuuud

09/25/2002 - Domestic Profit [ View image in PDF format

mte: This is not official record. See documents if question or conﬂﬁl
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