TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number:

Summary Description:

Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date:
Prepared by:

Verified by:

4935-0/18

Flat Tire Repair Services

July 1, 2013/ July 24, 2013
Tracey L. Jones

Jocelyn R. Fuiton
Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow { and if appl

Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPiICS Address:

IZ Address:

SUNS

%ﬁr c nd ry, blue for tertiary)

Herrera Tire Services
592788962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL. 33127
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127

Michelin
111724631-01

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 29611

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961

Tiresoles of Broward Inc. dfbfa Miami Tire Soles
650829510-01

7800 NW 130 St, Hialeah Gardens, Fi. 33016

1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pempang Beach, FL 33064

Compliance Review:jN/A NIA N/A
Registered vendor (yes/ no):fYes Yes Yes
Indicate SBD ceriification:fNone None None
Incumbent vendor (yes/no):{No No No
Sunbiz:{Yes Mot in State of Florida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/ino)|Yes No Yes
Locally Headquartered Affirmad (yes/no):|Yes No No
Iltems being procured per current solicitation Current Lnit Extended Unit Extended Unit Exiended
ltem no. | Description | Quantity Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Group 1 - Road Service for iSD
1 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category A 820 $ 38.00 % 3200 $ 26,240.00 $ 14850 § 122,590.00 $ 65.00 % 53,300.00
2 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category B 1480 % 49.00 % 4500 % 66,600.00 $ 161.00 % 238,280.00 $ 95.00 $ 140,600.00
3 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category C 500 § 89.00 § 80.00 & 40,000.00 § 17250 § 86,250.00 $ 12500 § 62,500.00
4 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category D 925 $§ 119.00 § 99.00 % 91,575.00 $ 17250 § 159,562.50 $ 13500 $ 124,875.00
Group 2: Road Service for MDT
A. Anywhere in Miami-Dade County:
5 Flat Tire Replacement New Flyer 60 126 $ 7500 % 9,37500 § 161.00 § 20,125.00 $ 80.00 § 11,250.00
6 Flat Tire Replacement Gillig 4¢° 50 $ 75.00 5 3,750.00 $ 161.00 % 8,050.00 $ 90.00 % 4,500.00
7 Flat Tire Replacement 1350 $ 7200 $ 97,200.00 % 161.00 $ 217,350.00 $ 80.00 % 121,500.00
8 Flat Tire Replacement Gillig 4¢° 50 $ 7500 3 3,750.00 § 161.00 § 8,050.00 b3 90.00 % 4,500.00
9 Flat Tire Replacement MCI 45 50 % 75.00 $ 3,750.00 § 161.00 § 8,050.00 8 90.00 % 4,500.00
10 Flat Tire Reptacement 32' Optima 250 $ 75.00 5 18,750.00 % 161.00 § 40,250.00 $ an.o0 % 22,500.00
B. Anywhere in Scuth Broward County:
11 Flat Tire Reptacement New Flyer 60° 25 $ - 3 - 3 189.75 § 474375 $ 10000 § 2,500.00
12 Flat Tire Replacement Gillig 40° 10 3 - $ - $ i89.75 § 1,897.50 $ 100,00 & 1,000.00
13 Flat Tire Replacement NABI 40" Low Floor 100 % 400 $ - $ - $ 189.75 § 18,975.00 $ 10000 % 10,000.00
14 Flat Tire Replacement Gillig 30° 10 $ - % - $ 189.75 $ 1,897.50 $ 100,00 % 1,000.00
15 Flat Tire Replacement MCI 45’ 10 $ - ] - $ 189.75 § 1,897.50 $ 10000 % 1,000.00
16 Flat Tire Replacement 32° Opfima 25 % - $ - $ {89.75 % 4,743.75 § 10000 % 2,500.00
Group 3: Repairs at Shop {ISD & MDT)
A. Dismounting & Remounting
Dismounting and Remounting from 1 {o 9 Tires,
17 Category A 300 % 500 % 450 % 1.3500¢ % 1150 & 3,450.00 $ 10.00 % 3,000.00




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 4935-0/18

Summary Description: Flat Tire Repair Services
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: July 1, 2013/July 24, 2013
Prepared by: Tracey L. Jones

Verified by: Jocelyn R. Fulton

Note: When all prices are entered, highiight low priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for teriary)

Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPICS Address:
SUNBIZ Address:

Herrera Tire Services
5927388962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127
2701 NW 7ih Ave. Miami, FL. 33127

Michelin
111724631-01
1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961

Tiresoles of Broward inc. d/bfa Miami Tire Scles
650829510-01

7800 NW 130 Si, Hialeah Gardens, FL 33016

1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pompano Beach, FL 33064

Campliance Review:|N/A N/A N/A
Registered vendor (yes/ no):|Yes Yes Yes
Indicate SBO certification:|Nene None None
fncumbent vendor (yes/no):|No No No
Sunhiz:|Yes Not in State of Florida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/no):|Yes No Yes
: Locally Headquartered Affirmed (yes/no):|Yes No No
ltems being procured per current solicitation Current Unit Extended Unit Extended Uit Extended
Item no. | Description | Quantity | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
) Dismeounting and Remouniing from 1 to 9 Tires,
18 Category B : 300 % 10.00 % 8.00 % 240000 % 23.00 § 6,900.00 $ 20.00 § 6,000.00
Dismounting and Remounting from 1 to 9 Tires, :
19 Category C 150 % 1500 § 12.00 $ 1,800.00 $ 25.30 3 3,785.00 % 30.00 $ 4,500.00
Dismounting and Remounting from 1 to 9 Tires,
20 Category D 180 § 18.00 % 15.00 % 2,25000 % 3450 § 5,175.00 % 50.00 $ 7,500.00
Dismounting and Remounting 10 or more Tires
21 Category A 100 § 400 % 350 % 350.00 § 920 § 920.00 $ 10.00 $ 1,000.00
Dismounting and Remounting 10 or more Tires
22 Category B 100 $ 10.00 § 8.00 § 800.00 $ 1840 § 1,840.00 $ 2000 § 2,660.00
Dismouniing and Remounting 10 or more Tires
23 Category C 100 $ 1580 % 12.00 % 1,200.00 $ 2300 3% 2,300.00 $ 3000 § 3,000.00
Dismounting and Remounting 10 or more Tires
24 Category D 100 $ 1800 § 15.00 § 1,500.00 $ 3450 % 3,450.00 $ 50.00 % 5,000.00
B. Additional Charqes for Repair
Additional charge for Repair from 1 to 9 Tires,
25 Category A 120 $ - NO BID NG BID $ 575 § 680.00 $ 500 § 8600.00
Additional charge for Repair from 1 to 9 Tires,
26 Category B 120 $ - NO BID NO BID 3 17.25 $ 2,070.00 $ 1000 § 1,200.00
Additional charge for Repair from 1 to 9 Tires,
27 Category C 0% - NO BID NG BID $ 17.25 § 1,207.50 L 15.00 % 1,050.00
Additional charge for Repair from 1 to 9 Tires,
28 Category D 70 % - NO BID NG BID % 725 % 1,207.50 $ 15.00 % 1,050.00
Additional charge for Repair 10 or more Tires Category
29 A 20 % - NO BID NG BID $ 575 § 115.00 $ 500 § 100.00
Additional charge for Repair 10 or more Tires Category '
B 20 % - NO BID NC BID $ 17.25 % 345.00 % 10.00 % 200.00




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 4935-0/18

Summary Description: Ftat Tire Repair Services
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: July 1, 20134July 24, 2013
Prepared by: Tracey L. Jones

Verified by: Jocelyn R. Fulton

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPICS Address:

Herrera Tire Services
592788962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL. 33127

Michelin
111724631-01

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961

Tiresoles of Broward Inc. dfbfa Miami Tire Soles
850829510-01
7800 NW 130 St, Hialeah Gardens, FL 33016

SUNBIZ Address:]2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127 |1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 29615 1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pompano Beach, FL 33064
Compliance Review:|N/A NIA N/A
Registered vendor {yes/ no):|Yes Yes Yes
indicate SBD certification:|None None None
Incumbent vendor (ves/no):.INo No No
Sunbiz:|Yes Not in State of Florida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/no):|Yes No Yes
Locally Headquartered Affirmed (ves/no):|Yes No No
Items being procured per current solicitation Current Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Item no. | Description ] Quantity | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Additional charge for Repair 10 or more Tires Category
3MC 20 % - NG BID NO BID 3 17.25 & 345.00 $ 15.00 % 300.00
Additional charge for Repair 10 or more Tires Category
32D 20 % - NO BID NO BID $ 17.25 § 345.00 $ 1500 % 300.00
C. Instaltation of Boots
33 4"5Q 70 % 10.00 § 500 § 350.00 § 17.25 § 1,207.50 $ 10.00 % 700.00
34 8" SQ 70 % 20.00 % 1000 § 700.00 § i7.25 § 1,207.50 $ 12.00 §$ §40.00
Group 4: Tire Repair andlor Replacement at WASD
Shops
A. Tube Type
35 Tube Tire Repair from 1 to @ lires Category A 42 % - $ - $ - $ 28.75 § 1,207.50 $ 15.00 % £30.60
36 Tube Tire Repair from 1 to 9 tires Category B 42 % 14.00 $ 1200 % 504.00 § 3450 % 1,449.00 3 2500 % 1,050.00
37 Tube Tire Repair from 1 to 9 tires Category C 80 % 19.00 % 1500 $ 1,200.00 $ 4600 § 3,680.00 5 45.00 % 3,600.00
B. Tubeless Type
38 Tubeless Tire Repair from 1 to 9 tires Category A 244 § 9.00 % 700 § 1,708.00 § 2875 § 7.015.00 $ i5.00 % 3,660.00
38 Tubeless Tire Repair from 1 to 9 tires Category B 704 § 2000 % 15.00 % 10,560.00 §$ 3450 % 24,288.00 3 2500 % 17,600.00
40 Tubeless Tire Repair from 1 to 9 tires Category C 135 § 45.00 % 3500 % 472500 § 46.00 $ 6,210.00 $ 4500 % 6,075.00
C. Tube or Tubeless .
41 From 1 to 9 tires Category A 84 § 9.00 % 7.00 $ 588.00 & 2875 & 2,415.00 § 10.00 & 840.00
42 From 1 to 9 tires Category B 324 § 2000 §$ 15.00 § 4,860.00 $ 3450 $ 11,178.00 5 1500 § 4,860.00
43 From 1 to 9 tires Category C 78 5 4500 % 3500 % 2,730.00 $ 46.00 % 3,538.00 8 3500 3% 2,730.00
D. Installation of Boots :
44 4" 5Q 45 § 1000 § 500 § 22500 § 17.25 % 776.25 $ 1000 & 450.00
45 8" SQ 45 § 2000 % 1000 $ 450.00 § 23.00 § 1,035.00 $ 1200 § 540.00
E. Tube Replacement
46 Price of tuve in Category C 45 § 3500 % 30.00 % 1,350.00 % 5750 3 2,587.50 % 5000 § 2,250.00




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 4935-0/18

Summary Description: Flat Tire Repair Services
Soficitation Opening/ Closing Date: July 1, 2013/July 24, 2013
Prepared by: Tracey L. Jones

Verified by: Jocelyn R. Fulton

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow { and if applicabie, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendar Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPICS Address:
SUNBIZ Address:

Herrera Tire Services
592788962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127

Michelin
111724631-01

1 Parkway South, Greeavilie, SC 2061{E

1 Parkway South, Greenvilie, SC 2961

Tiresoles of Broward Inc. d/bfa Miami Tire Soles
650829510-01

7800 NW 130 St, Hialeah Gardens, Fi. 33016

1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pompano Beach, FL 33064

Compliance Review:|N/A N/A NIA
Registered vendor (yes/ no)|Yes Yes Yes
Indicate SBD cerlification:|None None None
Incumbent vendor (yes/no):|No No No
Sunbiz:] Yes Not in State of Fiorida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/no)|Yes No Yes
Locally Headquartered Affirmed (yes/no):IYes No Ne
ltems being precured per current solicitation Current Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Item no. § Description I Quantity | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
E. Tire Rotation
47 Tire Rotation 60 § 10.00 § 9.00 § 540.00 § 11.50 § 690.00 $ 3.00 % 180.00
Group 5: Road Service for WASD
Tube Type Repair
48 Tube Tire Repair Category A per road service call 15 5 - ] 30.00 % 450.00 $ 138.00 & 2,070.00 3 7000 % 1,050.00
48 Tube Tire Repair Calegory B per road service cail 30 3 14.00 3§ 4500 % 1,350.00 $ 14950 $ 4,485.00 $ 10000 % 3,000.00
50 Tube Tire Repair Category C per road service call 90 $ 19.00 § 40.00 $ 3,600.00 % 149.50 § 13,455.00 $ 13500 5 12,150.00
Tubeless Tire Repair
51 Tubeless Tire Repair Category A per road service call 42 8 8.00 § 30.00 % 1,260.00 § 138.00 § 5,796.00 $ 7000 & 2,940.00
52 Tubeless Tire Repair Category B per road service call 945 § 2000 % 4500 $ 42,525.00 % 149.50 & 141,277.50 $ 10000 3 94,500.00
53 Tubeless Tire Repair Category C per road service call 222 % 4500 § 40.00 % 8,880.00 § 14950 & 33,189.00 $ 13500 § 29,970.00
Tube or Tubeless Replacement
54 Tube or Tubless Tire Replacemeni-Category A 15 § 800 § 2500 % 375.00 % 138.00 § 2,070.00 $ 65.00 % 975.00
55 Tube or Tubless Tire Replacement-Category B 447 % 2000 § 35.00 % 15,645.00 % 149.50 $ 66,826.50 $ 90.00 % 40,230.00
56 Tube or Tubless Tire Repiacement-Category C 80 % 45.00 % 40.00 % 3,600.00 % 149050 $ 13,455.00 $ 12000 § 10,800.00
Boots Installed
57 4" SQ 60 % 10.00 § 500 & 300.00 § 575 & 345.00 § 10.00 § 600.00
58 6" SQ 60 5 20.00 & 10.00 8§ 600.00 $ 575 § 345.00 $ 12.00 & 720.00
Tube Replacemeant
59 Tube in Category A 30 % - $ - $ - $ 2300 % 690.00 5 15.00 § 450.00
60 Tube in Category B 30 8% - $ 2500 % 75000 $ 23.00 % 690.00 3 2500 % 750.00
$ - $ 35.00 8 2,100.00 § 23:00 § 1,380.00 $ 50.00 $ 3,000.00

61 Tube in Category C 60




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 4935-0/18

Summary Description: Flat Tire Repair Services
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: July 1, 20130 July 24, 2013
Prepared by: Tracey L. Jones

Verified by: Jocelyn R. Fulton

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow ( and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPICS Address:
SUNBIZ Address:

Herrera Tire Services
592788962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127

Michelin
111724631-01
1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 29614¢

Tiresoles of Broward Inc. dib/a Miami Tire Soles
650829510-01

7800 NW 130 Si, Hialeah Gardens, FL 33016

1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pompano Beach, FL. 33064

Compliance Review: |N/A N/A N/A
Registered vendor (ves/ no):{Yes Yes Yes
ingicate SBD certification:{None Nona None
Incumbent vendor (yes/no):]No No No
) Sunbiz:{Yes Not in State of Florida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (ves/no):Yes No Yes
Locally Headquartered Affirmed (yes/no)jYes No No
ltems being procured per current solicitation Current Unit Extended Unit Extendad Unit Extended
ltem no. { Description | Quantity | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Group 6: Road Service Tire Replacement for MDFR
62 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category A 520 $ 3200 § 16,640.00 $ 14850 % 77,740.00 $ 6500 § 33,860.00
63 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category B 520 $ 45.00 % 23,400.00 % 161.00 $ 83,720.00 $ 95.00 § 49,400.00
64 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category C 520 $ 4500 § 23,400.00 § 161.00 § 83,720.00 $ 12500 § 65,000.00
65 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category D 520 $ 4500 $ 23,400.00 § 161.00 $ 83,720.00 $ 13500 % 70,200.00
Group 7: Tire Repair and/or Replacement at MDFR
Shops
66 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category A 100 $ 450 § 45000 % 138.00 §$ 13,800.00 $ 65.00 § 6,500.00
87 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category B 100 $ 1500 § 1,500.00 $ 149.50 '§ 14,950.00 3 9500 § 9,500.00
68 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category C 100 $ 15.00 % 1,500.00 $ 14850 § 14,950.60 $ 12500 % 12,500.00
68 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category D 100 $ 3500 5 3,500.00 % 161.00 % 16,100.G0 $ 13500 $% 13,500.00
Group 8: Road Service Rire Reptacemnt for MDAD
70 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category A 20 $ 3200 % 640.00 $ 138.00 % 2,760.00 $ 65.00 § 1,300.00
71 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category B 20 $ 4500 % 200.00 % 149.50 & 2,850.00 3 95.00 $ 1,800.00
72 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category C ' 20 3 4500 $ 900.00 & 149.50 % 2,990.00 $ 12500 $ 2,500.00
73 Road Service Tire Replacement/Repair Category D 20 5 4500 § 900.00 $ 161.00  § 3,220.00 $ 13500 % 2,700.00
Group 9: Tire Repair andfor Replacement at MDAD
Shops
74 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category A 50 $ 450 § 22500 % 14950 § 7,475.00 L 65.00 % 3,250.00
75 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category B 50 3 800 % 40000 $ 149.50 % 7,475.00 $ 95.00 % 4,750.00
76 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category C 50 $ 3500 $ 1,750.00 % i61.00 § 8,050.00 $ 12500 $ 6,250.00
77 On-Site Tire Replacement Repair-Category D £ $ 15.00 % 750.00 § i72.50 § 8,625.00 - § 13500 % 6,750.00




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 4935-0/18

Summary Description: Flat Tire Repair Services
Soficitation Opening/ Closing Date:
Prepared by: Tracey L. Jones
Verified by: Jocelyn R. Fulton

July 1, 2013/July 24, 2043

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor Name:
Vendor FEIN & Suffix:
ADPICS Address:
SUNBIZ Address:

Herrera Tire Services
582788962-01
2701 NW 7th Ave. Miami, FL 33127
2701 NW 7th Ave, Miami, FL 33127

Michelin
111724631-01

1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 29611F
1 Parkway South, Greenville, SC 2961}

Tiresoles of Broward Inc. dfb/a Miami Tire Soles
650829510-01

7800 NW 130 St, Hialeah Gardens, FL 33016

1401 Green Rd. Suite A, Pompano Beach, FL 33064

Compliance Review:]N/A NIA N/A
Registered vendor (yes/ no):}Yes Yes Yes
Indicate SBD certification:None None None
Incumbent vendar (yes/no):]No No No
Sunbiz:|Yes Not in State of Florida Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/no):JYes No Yes
Logcally Headquartered Affirmed (yes/no):]Yes No No
Items being procured per current solicitation Current Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
ltem no. | Description ] Quantity | Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
78 Tube in Category A 25 $ - 3 - 3 2875 $ 718.75 b 15.0¢ § 375.00
79 Tube in Category B 25 3 25.00 % 62500 § 2875 §% 718.75 2500 $ 625.00
80 Tube in Categery G 50 $ 35.00 % 1,750.00 § 2875 § 1,437.50 $ 50.00 & 2,500.00
81 Tube in Category D 50 $ 25.00 % 1,250.00 § 2875 % 1,437.50 $ 75.00
Evaluation Adjustment 10% SBE Preference:
Total Evaluated Price: $ 588,445.00 $ 1,768,073.25 3 1,145,265.00

Optional ltems {not included in evaluated price)

identify Non-responsive vendors and reason:

Herrera Tire Services did not provide pricing for all items in the bid; as a result, they did not comply with the requirements of the ITB for awarding in the aggregate.



