TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3
Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

Item

unit Cost per

No. Estimated Qty. Item Description 1000 sheets Total
GROUP NO. 1 (Items 1 &2)
Recovered Fiber Content paper, 10% Min. Post Consumer Waste. #1 Opaque Offset Recycled- Grain Long
Smooth Finish (Min. 430 pages Per Inch)
1 200,000 sheets 8-1/2" x 11", Smooth, 24/60 lbs. White $8.84 $1,768.00
Mill Brand Name:  EarthChoice® Opaque Offset 30%
Manufactured By: Domtar
2 100,000 sheets 17-1/2" x 22-1/2", Smooth, 24/60 white $37.52 $3,752.00
Mill Brand Name:  EarthChoice® Opaque Offset 30%
Manufactured By: Domtar
TOTAL GROUP NO. 1 (Items 1 & 2): MAC $5,520.00
***|TEMS 3 THROUGH 30 WILL BE AWARDED BY ITEM***
NOTE: Items 3 - 13; Must all be recovered Fiber Content paper, 10% Min. Post Consumer Waste.
3 12,000,000 sheets #4 Xerographic Bond Recyled, 20 Ib., 8 1\2" x 11" white $6.99 $83,880.00
P-1590, P-1591 (For high-speed copiers) MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Husky Xerocopy Recycled
Manufactured By: Domtar
4 5,000,000 sheets  #4 Bond, Recycled, 20 Ib., 8 1/2" x 11", Colors $8.00 $40,000.00
P-1593 To P-1595 MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Earthchoice Multipurpose
Manufactured By: Domtar
5 300,000 sheets #4 Bond, Recycled, 20 Ib., 11" x 17", white, P-1592 $15.47 $4,641.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Husky Xerocopy Recycled
Manufactured By: Domtar
6 600,000 sheets #4 Xerographic Bond, Recycled, 20lb., 8 1/2" x 11", white $7.74 $4,644.00
P-1589, punched 3- holes for standard binder, for high speed MAC
copiers (see Section 3.6 of the Invitation To Bid).
Mill Brand Name:  Husky Xerocopy Recycled
Manufactured By: Domtar
7 150,000 sheets #4 Index, 110 Ib., 8 1/2" x 11", white , P-1570 $22.13 $3,319.50
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
8 200,000 sheets #4 Index, 90 Ib., 8 1/2" x 11", white, P-1551 $18.70 $3,740.00
MAC

Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
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TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3
Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

Ttem OUnit Cost per
No. Estimated Qty. Item Description 1000 sheets Total
9 400,000 sheets #4 Index, 90 Ib., 11'x 17", white, P-1559 $37.43 $14,972.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
10 400,000 sheets #4 Index, 90 Ib., 8 1\2" x 11", colors, P-1552- P1557 $19.66 $7,864.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
11 150,000 sheets #4 Vellum Bristol, 67 Ib., 11"x 17", colors $34.35 $5,152.50
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Vellum Bristol
Manufactured By: International Paper
12 50,000 sheets #4 Index, 110 Ib., 22 1/2" x 35, white $180.63 $9,031.50
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
13 25,000 sheets #4 Index, 110 Ib., 22 1/2" x 35", color, P-1551 $197.71 $4,942.75
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Springhill Index
Manufactured By: International Paper
NOTE: Items 14 - 30 must be certified as being made from sustainable fiber. FSC, SFI or PEFC Certification Accepted.
14 400,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 50 Ib., 17 1/2"x 22 1/2", white. COC $24.30 $9,720.00
Skid Packed Southern
Mill Brand Name:  Soporset
Manufactured By: Soporcel
15 150,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 50 Ib., 19"x 25", white. COC $29.67 $4,450.50
Skid Packed Southern
Mill Brand Name:  Soporset
Manufactured By: Soporcel
16 250,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 50 Ib., 23"x 29", white. COC $43.90 $10,975.00
Skid Packed MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Husky Offset Opaque
Manufactured By: Domtar
17 200,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 60 Ib., 17 1/2"x 22 1/2", white. COC $29.10 $5,820.00
Skid Packed Unisource

Mill Brand Name:  Soporset
Manufactured By: Soporcel
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TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3
Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

Ttem OUnit Cost per
No. Estimated Qty. Item Description 1000 sheets Total
18 100,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 60 Ib., 19"x 25", white. COC $34.60 $3,460.00
Skid Packed Southern
Mill Brand Name:  Soporset
Manufactured By: Soporcel
19 100,000 sheets Premium No. 1 Opaque Offset, 60 Ib., 23"x 29", white. COC $48.30 $4,830.00
Skid Packed Southern
Mill Brand Name:  Soporset
Manufactured By: Soporcel
20 50,000,000 sheets #4 Xerographic Bond, 20 Ib., 8 1/2"x 11", white COC $6.98 $349,000.00
Substitute, P-1510 (P-1521) MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Quickcopy
Manufactured By: Domtar
21 10,000,000 sheets #4 Xerographic Bond, 20 Ib., 8 1/2"x 11", white COC $7.74 $77,400.00
Punched 3- holes for standard binder, for high speed copiers (see Section 3.6) MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Quickcopy
Manufactured By: Domtar
22 800,000 sheets #4 Xerographic Bond, 20 Ib., 8 1/2"x14", white COC $9.48 $7,584.00
Substitute, P-1511 (P-1522) MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Quickcopy
Manufactured By: Domtar
23 2,500,000 sheets  #4 Commodity Offset D.P., 20/50 Ib., 11"x 17", white, P-1512 COC $13.95 $34,875.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Quickcopy
Manufactured By: Domtar
24 2,000,000 sheets  #4 Commaodity Offset, 24/60 Ib., 11"x 17", white COC $17.06 $34,120.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Husky Offset Opaque
Manufactured By: Domtar
25 200,000 sheets Premium No. 1 High Speed Laser Print, 24/60, 8 1/2" x 11" white COC $9.06 $1,812.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  ImagePrint
Manufactured By: Domtar
26 100,000 sheets Color Copy, 28/70 Ibs., 8.5"x 11", Photo white, 98 bright, P-1513 COC $14.12 $1,412.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Hammermill Color Copy
Manufactured By: International Paper
27 75,000 sheets Color Copy, 28/70, 11'x 17", Photo white, 98 bright, P-1514 COC $28.25 $2,118.75
MAC

Mill Brand Name:  Hammermill Color Copy
Manufactured By: International Paper
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TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3
Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

Ttem Unit Cost per
No. Estimated Qty. Item Description 1000 sheets Total
28 2,500,000 sheets  Premium, #1 Laser Print, 24 Ib., 8 1/2" x 11" white, P-1531 COC $9.06 $22,650.00
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Imageprint
Manufactured By: Domtar
29 125,000 sheets Premium #1 Laser print, 24 Ib. 8 1/2"x 14", white, P-1532 COC $14.11 $1,763.75
MAC
Mill Brand Name:  Imageprint
Manufactured By: Domtar
30 200,000 sheets Premium #1 Laser Print, 24 Ib., 11"x 17", white COC $21.38 $4,276.00
MAC

Mill Brand Name:  Imageprint
Manufactured By: Domtar

GROUP NO. 2 (Items 31 thru 46)

NOTE: Items 31 - 46 must be certified as being made from sustainable fiber. FSC, SFI or PEFC Certification Accepted.

All registered Mill Brands, Carbonless Paper, Pre-Coated, Black Print, Reverse or Straight Sequence
Acceptable Brands: Gladfelter ExcelOne, Nekoosa U20 or Nekoosa Universal or Appleton Superior FSC (No Subsititions).

31 500,000 sheets

32 50,000 sheets

33 800,000 sheets
34 80,000 sheets

35 600,000 sheets
36 150,000 sheets
37 600,000 sheets
38 150,000 sheets

39 250,000 sheets

40 100,000 sheets

Carbonless Paper, 2-Paper, White-Pink or White-Canary,
8 1/2" x 11", P-1651 to P-1652

Carbonless Paper, 2-Part, White- Canary, 8 1/2" x 14", P-1653
Carbonless Paper, 2-Part, White-Canary, 11"x 17", P1654
Carbonless Paper, 2-Part, White-Canary, 17 1/2" x 22 1/2"
Carhonless Paper, 3-Part, Pink-Canary-White, 8 1/2"x11", P-1655
Carbonless Paper, 3-Part, Pink-Canary-White, 8 1/2" x 14"
Carbonless Paper, 3-Part, Pink-Canary-White, 11" x 17", P-1657
Carbonless Paper, 3-Part, Pink-Canary-White, 17 1/2"x 22 1/2"

Carbonless Paper, 4-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-White
8 1/2" x 11", P-1658

Carbonless Paper, 4-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-White
8 1/2" x 14", P-1659
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TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3

Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

TLETT

Ut COsL peEr

No. Estimated Qty. Item Description 1000 sheets Total
41 300,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 4-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-White, 11"x 17" $28.00 $8,400.00 $32.72
P-1660
42 100,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 4-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-White, $61.25 $6,125.00 $69.51
17 1/2" x 22 1/2"
43 100,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 5-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-Green-White $14.70 $1,470.00 $14.65
8 1/2" x 11", P-1661
44 50,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 5-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-Green-White $18.70 $935.00 $18.75
8 1/2" x 14", P1662
45 150,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 5-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-Green-White $29.35 $4,402.50 $33.59
11" x 17", P-1663
46 150,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, 5-Part, Goldenrod-Pink-Canary-Green-White $62.35 $9,352.50 $71.16
17 1/2" x 22 1/2"
Southern
Mill Brand Name:  Nekoosa U20
Manufactured By: Nekoosa
TOTAL GROUP NO. 2 (Items 31 thru 46) Southern $ 99,869.00 $ 114,128.50
***|TEM 47 WILL BE AWARDED BY ITEM***
47 30,000 sheets Carbonless Paper, Self Contained, 17 Ib., white, Black Print, No Award $NO BID
22 1/2" x 34 1/2"
Mill Brand Name:
Manufactured By:
***|TEM 48 WILL BE AWARDED BY ITEM***
48 15,000 sheets Pressure Sensitive Laser and Offset, 17 " x 22", 60 Ib, White Satin $310.25 $4,653.75  $ 323.03
or Semi-Gloss, Pressure Sensitive Paper (split back) Southern

Mill Brand Name:  STRAT
Manufactured By: TECNICOTE
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TALLY SHEET

Contract #6824-1/23 Quote: 6824-1/23-3
Prices Offered From July 1, 2014 thru Dec. 31, 2014

Ttem Unit Cost per
No. Estimated Qty. Item Description Bundle Total
GROUP NO. 3 (Items 49 thru 52)
Chip Board. Estmated quatities are based on a six month usage. Price Per Bundle
49 100 bundles 8 1/2" x 11" Sheets per bundle: _ 963 $20.82 $2,082.00
50 50 bundles 8 1/2" x 14"  Sheets per bundle: _ 481 $23.30 $1,165.00
51 200 bundles 11" x 17" Sheets per bundle: _481 $28.21 $5,642.00
52 400 bundles 17 1/2" x 22 1/2" Sheets per bundle: _ 229 $27.90 $11,160.00
Unisource
Mill Brand Name:  Caraustar/Austell
Manufactured By: Caraustar/Austell
TOTAL GROUP NO. 3 (Items 49 thru 52) $ 20,049.00
Ttem Unit Cost per
No. Estimated Qty. Item Description Carton Total
***|TEMS 53 - 56 WILL BE AWARDED BY ITEM***
Computer Paper, Continuous Feed- Fan Folded, Lint and Dust Free.
20 % Post-Consumer or 50% minimum "Waste Paper" content per EPA Definitions
Delivery Exception: Continuous Feed Computer Paper for Items 56 thru 58. Deliver Skid Quantities Only.
Price per Carton
53 2,000 Cartons 20 Ib. White, 83 Brightness, 9 1/2" x 11", Clean edge Perfs., Side $NO BID No Award
and Horizontal Perfs Required. P-1518.
Sheets per carton:
Mill Brand Name:
Manufactured By:
54 1,500 Cartons 18 Ib. White, 1/2" Green Bar, 14 7/8", x 11", Horizontal Perfs Required ~ $ NO BID No Award
Sheets per carton:
Mill Brand Name:
Manufactured By:
55 2,000 Cartons 18 Ib. White, EW-20, High Bulk, 8 1/2" x 11", 3-Hole Punch, $NO BID No Award

Horizontal Perfs Required.P-1519
Sheets per carton:

Mill Brand Name:
Manufactured By:
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Unit Cost per
Bundle
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