Bid No. : 7765-1/22

Bid Title: Body Bays - Evidence Bags

Bid Opening: 10/26/11

Prepared by: Bianca Roig

Y A,

2.

Verified by: Martha Garofolo, Pablo Martinez

»_o

LT3

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yeliow (and iMapplicable, green for &

Vendor Name:

Vendor FEIN:

ADPICS Address:

SUNBIZ Address:

Reglétered Vendor ( (Yesto)
Local Preference Affirmed (YesINo)
Vendor Conlact:

Vendor Conlact Email:

indcate SBD Cerfoator: ____ .
Conviction Disclosure (YesfNoj

VendorConlact Phdne Number .

Vendor Confet FaxNumber:

ndary, blue for tertiary).

RECOMMENDED PRIMARY RECOMMENDED SECONDARY |
=] Alpha Medical Distributor, - " District Healthcare & Janitarial Midwest Medical Supply Co,
Ine, Centennial Products, inc. “SupplyInc. 1 Evergreen Supply Inc et Lim LLC
113570392 593581775 521755328 270795482 582525771 431741196
Gglcigfi[zm;$? 12'8123 P.0. Box 23905 P.0. Box 758726 Nfﬂ;ﬁ"’éﬁ;?g’;&t 341 Bullis Street 13400 Lkefront Drive
? i i i ' Earth City, Mi i 63045
(notin ADPICS) Jacksonville, Florida 32241 Baitimore, Maryland 21275 06472 Eagle Pass, Texas 78852 arth City, Missouri
none 6900 Philips Highway Ste 45 10126 NW 116 Way none none none
Jacksonville, FL 32257 Medley, FL 33178
v | Certfication #1406 Exp: 103114 | a0 e I S e
e O b OO : UL R W LU
...... yes (5/13/09) , L yes(11//11) UL, S L. S - yes
no yes no no no
Zheng-Zhong LI JaneEverson | Kenneth Hopkins Corra Lucibello | George A Everson JoAnn Rudd ]
_ 516-681 5200 | 904-332-0404 305-888-1455 _203-506-5300 _678-413- 9200 888-540-3232

_glphameddis @acl.com  [naguire

vergreenjewelry @sbcglobal.n

_ bids @medicalproducts.com

oannrudd@mmsmedical com

516-681-5291 '904-332:0406 305-888-5834 302-484-1964 770860-8845 | B00-545-0085
Ware all Affidavits Completed: - no o] yes N o yes T o -
Is this Bid Responsive (If no, state reason): - " SEEFOOTNOTE | yes O yes Cyes "y | SEEFOOTNOTE
CO"USIOH Afhdavnts w0 { no ) yes i o no o yfes I -------—---——-I:]S-- _
msurame Cemc e B L e e
ecrbant Vardor Vadiiiay =~ s . - i S e e e . e s
1| Alpha Medical Distributor, District Heaithcare & Janitorial Midwest Medical Supply Co,
Vendor Name: Inc. Centennial Products, Inc. Supply Inc. Evergreen Supply Inc Medical Products Limited, Inc LLC
ESTIaE
Quantities for 1 Unit of -
Item year Measure Bescription Unit Price | Total Price | UnitPrice| Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Body Bags
1 100 Each  Pre-natal 12 x 18 {variance up to 12x24) $2.19 $219.00]  $4.95 $495.00 $4.67 $467.00 $4.55 $455.00 $4.32 $432.001 $5.80 $580.00
2 100 Each Infant 22 x 30 (variance up to 36x60) $3.98 $398.004 $5.84 $584.00 $5.42 $542.00 $5.73 $573.00 $5.01 $501.00 $6.56 $656.00]
3 100 Each  Child 36 x 60 (variance up to 36x96) $5.19 $519.00 $7.69 $769.00] $6.32 $632.00]  $9.00 $900.00 $5.85 $585.00 $9.27 $927.00
4 2,500 Each  Adult meduim duly 36 x 96 (no subsfitutions) $7.99 $19,075.00]  $10.35 $25,875.00] $9.25 $23,125.00] $9.60 $24,000.00| $8.81 $22,025.00 $12.33 $30,825.00
5 250 Each  Adult heavy duty 36 x 96 {no substitulions) $12.38 $3095.00F $28.61 $7,152.50] $27.69 $6,92250]  $19.00 $4,750.00] $25.64 $6,410.00 $33.97 $8,492.50
6 100 Each  Adult oversized 36x96 {variance up to 48 x 100) $12.38 $1,238.00] $51.74 $5,174.00 $34.27 $3,427.001  $36.50 $3,650.00 $31.73 $317300] $60.51 $6,051.00
' Plastic Evidence Bags
7 2,500 Each  Small5x8 $0.24 $600.00]  $0.20 $500.00 $0.21 $525.00 $0.35 $875.00 $0.19 $47500] NOBID
8 2500 Each Medium 9 x 12 $0.34 $850.00] $0.33 $825.00 $0.29 $725.00 $0.45 $1,125.00 $0.27 $675.00] NOBID
9 10,000 Each Large 12x 15 $0.45 $4,500.00 $0.45 $4,500.00 $0.53 $5,300.00 $0.50 $5,000.00 $0.49 $4,900.00 NO BID
Plunger Seal Model PSW-97 pre-numbered with 7
10 conseculive, sequential digits. 12° (30.48cmy}, 3-ply
15,000 Each  gaivanized wire included {pre-inserted or loose) $0.31 $4,650.00 $0.45 $6,750.00] $0.46 $6,960.00 $0.45 $6,750.00 $0.43 $6,450.00] NOBID
$36,044.00 $52,624.50] $48,625.50 $48,078.00 $47,531.50
o . SBE 10% Bid
SBE 10% reduction Preference $4,862.55
SBE preference total Total $43,762.95




%"é Hi ; Alpha Medical Distributor, Midwest Medical Supply Co,
Vendor Name: <P i Inc. Centennial Products, Inc. Evergreen Supply Inc Praduots Limited LLC
Vendor FEIN: o o i 113570392 503581775 521755328 270795482 582525771 431741196
Bﬁlci;ﬂf‘mﬁ{f? 1';'3? P.0. Box 23905 P.0. Box 758726 \ 5;:3 Tg“’ge’ H°E:.d' \ 341 Bulls Street 13400 Lkefront Drive
{not ine;qDPICS) Jacksonville, Florida 32241 Baltimore, Maryland 21275 © oroé 4;)2nec i Eagle Pass, Texas 78852 Earth City, Missouri 63045

ADPICS Address: e

6900 Philips Highway Ste 45 10125 NW 116 Way none none none

L 3317

SUNBIZ Address: R _Afcksofmrue F532257 | Medley, ¥ B 7
Indicate SBD Certification: e n/a i mgmfncauon #11406 Exp; 10/31/14 nfa na na
Conviction Disclosure (YesNo). o no .m0 - no no no
Registered Vendor (YesiNo): e oo yes (611309 N yes (11/6/11) L. L B D L. N
Local Preferaence Affirmed (YeslNo) no yes no no no
VendorContgct:t o Zheng-Zhong LI Jane Everson Kenneth Hopkins Corra Lucibello George A. Everson JoAnn Rudd
Vendor Contact Phone Number: 516-681-5280 804-332-0404 305-888-1455 203-506-5300 678-413-9200 888-540-3232

_ Vendor Contact Email: _dl Ighameddm@aol,com

|naguire@centennialproducts.cq

khopkins @dhe-inc.com

__ bids @medlcalgroducls com

joannrudd @mmsmedical.com -

Vendor Contact Fax Number: o 516-681-5291 904-332-0406 305-888-5834 770-860-8845 800-545-0065
Woere all Affidavits Comploted: i } L 1o ho yes no yes no
Is this Bid Responsive {If no, stats SEE FOOTNOTE‘N o yes R yes o ] ' yes o yés uuuuu _SEE FOOTNOTE
Collus1on i g e ; m."-no S o R "’;,-é};"m e - - - S
Insurance Cerficate:  na Cwa | e e | Tam T o
incumbert Vendor (Vesol o e yes ST I = - S e s - ﬁno“u
Alpha Medical Distributor, District Healthcare & Janitorial Midwest Medical Supply Co,
Vendor Name: ' Inc. Centennial Products, Inc. Supply Ine. Evergreen Supply Inc LLC
ESTaEy
Quantities for 1 Unit of
Item year Measure Description 8] UnitPrice ;| Total Price §Unit Price| Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Alpha Medical Distributor, :hcare & Janltorfal Midwest Medical Supply Co,
Vendor Name: Inc. Centennfal Products, Inc. Supply Ing. Evergreen Supply Inc ; T Lic
1. Vendor did not 1. Vendor submitted 2 bid 1. Vendor submitted 2 bid 1 Vendor submltted three bld 1. Vendor did not acknoledge
Jacknowledge Addendums |packages in order to proposals in total after all proposals in total after each Addenda 2,3,& 4.

344,
2. Vendor made exception
1o items 1,2 & 5. Vendor's
#modifications onitems1&
2 are within the variances
permitted by addendum 4.
However, no subsitutions
were permitted for ltem 5.
12/21/11 = CAQ OPINION
REQUESTED 1/9112 CAOQ
responded see footnote

acknowledge all addenda. No
change between the package
excepl the addenda
Jacknoledgement.

addenda were issued. The
final bid received indicated a
14 cent increase on item 10
compared to the previosuly
submitted bids, resulting in
an aggregate increase of
$3,628.00. That final bid is
the one contained in this
tally.

addendum was issued. The final
bid received indicated a .30 cent
increase on item 4 compared to the
2 previosuly submitted bids,
resulting in an aggregate increase of
$750.00. That final bid is the one
contained in this tally.

2. Vendor did not bid on items 7,
8, & 9. 3. Page 3 of affidavits not
signed 12211 =
CAQ OPINION REQUESTED
17912 CAQ responded see
footnote

NOTE THE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES ARE FOR ONE YEAR AND THE CONTRACT IS FOR A FIVE YEAR PERIOD

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)
12/21/11 = CAQ OPINION REQUESTED ON 5 BIDS ALPHA MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS, MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO, LLC , PRODUCTS UNLIMITED INGC., SLAM INTERNATIONAL INC., TRI-TECH FORENSICS INC.
1/8/12 = CAO OPINION RECEIVED ALPHA MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS BID SHOULD BE REJECTED THE BID CLEARLY STATES NO SUBSTITUTION FOR LINE ITEM 5 OF THE BODY BAGS. AS TO AN OPINION OF
THE REMAINING BIDS A RESPONSIVENESS OPINION 1S NOT NECESSARY OR PROPER FOR THE BIDDERS IDENTIFIED ABOVE OTHER THAN ALPHA MEDICAL BECAUSE ALL HAVE SUBMITTED HIGHER BIDS




Bid No. : 7765-1/22

Bid Title: Body Bags - Evitlence Bags

Bid Opening: 10/26/11

Prepared by: Bianca Roig

Verified by: Martha Garofolo, Pablo Martinez

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow (and i applicable, green for secandary, blue for tertial

Vendor Name:

G " s

Palmetto Uniforms, Inc

Products Unlimited Inc.

Salam International, Inc.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

el i
: :
3 a

SUNBIZ Address:

ADPICS AQUIeSS:

Indicate SBO Certification:

Registered Vendor (Yes/No):

Comviction Disdloswre (YesNoj

Vendor Contact:

lLocal Preference Afiimed (Yesioy

Vendor ContectPhone Number:  ~ " "

650098268

762438342

330727513

263669072

P.O. Bax 6847

8869 SW 131 Street P.O. Box 339 Laguna Niauel. CA 92607- 4019 Executive Park Blvd, SE
Miami, Florida 33176 Justin, TX 76247 g 968 4'7 Southport, NC 28461
8869 SW 131 Strest none nons none
Miami, Florida 33176
| Certification #10602 Exp: 6/30/14 na na  va
SETROULL SRR DSL. . ne | ~ 0 .
yes i T o .. no _na
Rita C. Feiok o daneyCooper 3 AoduSglam Eric Barton

e 3052389166

1800

865-4683 ..

949-699-3663

e SIEDLE000

jcooper@products-
Vendor Conlact En: Rita @palmetiouniforms.com ~ urlimited.com _salamint@aol.com triteh@tritechusa.com
Vendor Contact Fax Number: 305-238-0869 1-940-648-3407 948-699-3650 910-457-0094
Were all Affidaits Completed: T e ] o e T T e ) o
Is this Bid Responsive (it no, slatereason): " 0 yes | SEEFQOTNOTE | SEEFOOTNOTE |~ "SEEFOOTNOTE
CoI[usig,rlﬂﬂidavits: e ) " e T e T T e T
TR o et e i et s e e ]
et Jandar TFasiay " N - R e e
Vendor Name: Palmeito Unitorms, Inc Products Unlimited Inc. Salam International, Inc. Tri-Tech Forensics, Ing,
EStmTaey
Guantities for 1 Unit of
ltem year Measure Description Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price | UnitPrice | Total Price | Unit Price Total Price
Body Bags ' '
1 100 Each Pre-natal 12 x 18 (variance up to 12x24} $5.27 $527.00 $5.70 $570.00] $4.74 $474.00 NO BID NO BID
2 100 Each Infant 22 x 30 (variance up to 36x60} $6.23 $623.00 $6.50 $650.00 $4.94 $494.00 $7.22 $722.004
3 100 Each Child 36 x 60 (variance up to 36x96) $9.56 $956.00 $8.92 $892.00 $5.64 $564.00 $10.20 $1,020.00
4 2,500 Each Adult meduim duty 36 x 96 {no substitutions) $12.00 $30,000.00 $11.98 $29,950.00 $9.44 $23,600.00 $13.98 $34,950.00
5 250 Each Adult heavy duty 36 x 96 (no substitutions) $32.70 $8,175.00| $32.00 $8,000.00 $27.44 $6,860.00 $38.63 $9,657.50
6 100 Each Adult oversized 36x96 (variance up to 48 x 100) $57.84 $5.784.00| $54.00 $5,400.00 $32.94 $3,294.00| $23.28 $2,328.00
Plastic Evidence Bags
7 2,500 Each  Small5x8 $0.43 $1,075.00 $0.33 $825.00 $0.22 $550.00 $0.14 $341.25
8 2,500 Each Medium 9 x 12 $0.83 $2,075.00 $0.42 $1 ,050.00' $0.36 $900.00 $0.02 $55.10
9 10,000 Each Large 12x 15 $0.86 $8,600.00 $0.66 $6,600.00 $0.48 $4,800.00 $0.28 $2,800.00
Plunger Seal Model PSW-97 pre-numbered with 7
10 consecutive, sequential digits. 12" (30.48cm), 3-ply
15,000 Each  galvanized wire included {pre-inserted or loose) $1.43 $21,450.00] $0.74  $11,100.00 $0.58 $8,700.00] NOBID NO BID
$79,265.00r $65,037.00 $50,236.00] $51,873.85
SBE 10% reduction sa;;zz:é: $7.926.50
,826.
SBE preference total $71,338.50




Vendor Name:

Vendor FEIN:

ADPICS AJDIBSS: oo

SUNBIZ Address:
Indlcale SBD Cemflcatlon

Local Pre!eren
Vendor Contac :

Vendor Contact Email:
_ _t Fax Number
dawls Cpmpleted

Collusmn Affidavits:
lnsuranceCerncate o
Incumbent Vendor (Yes/No):

Is th|s Bld Rqsponswe (If no, slaté reason);_r_'__

Palmetio Uniforms, Inc

Products Unfimited Inc.

Salam International, Inc.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc,

(650098268

8869 SW 131 Street
Miami, Florida 33176

8869 SW 131 Street
Miami, Florida 33176

no

' Fl!taC Felck

- Rsla @galmettoumforms com

o
ves
o
o
1

. Certication #10692 Exp: 630f14 |

wsawetes T

) 305 238 0889

yes@/SlOG)

M&M

IACAE: S N 30727518 263669072
P.0. Box 339 La un:ll{\il EZIX 28A422607- 4019 Executive Park Blvd, SE
Justin, TX 76247 e Southport, NC 28461
none none none
I A - N (Y-
no e ® e
LN WU L4 _no
o SO L. S LY
Janey Cooper * Abdul Salam Eric Barton —
1-800-865-4683 949-609-3663 910-457-6600

~ unlimited.com sdlamint@agl.com triteh @tritechusa.com
 1:940-648-3407 949-609-3650 9104570094
(SEEFOOTNOTE | SEEFOOTNOTE |~ SEEFOOTNOTE
o e S R e
o onfa nia “nfa
he no no

Vendor Name:
Eanmaied
Quantities for 1 Unit of
item year Measure Description

Palmetio Uniforms, inc

Products Unlimited Inc,

Salam International, Inc.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

Unit Price Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price .

Unit Price Total Price

Vendor Mame:

Palmetto Uniforms, Inc

Products Unlimited Inc.

Salam International, Inc.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

1. Vendos's extended prices in bid

unit price.

submittal do not reflect the quoted unit
price for items 1 & 6. The unit price
indicated in this tally sums the correct
extended price based on the quoted

1. Vendor did not
acknowledge any
addendums.

2. Vendor indicates order
must be in case quantities
1221111 = CAO OPINION
REQUESTED 1/9/12 CAO
responded see footnote

1. Vender made exceptions to

Ithe specifications on items 7,8,

and 9.

12/21111 = CAQ OPINION
REQUESTED 1/9H2 CAQ
responded see footnote

1. Vendor did not bid on items 1
and 10

12/2111 = CAO OPINION
REQUESTED 1/9112 CAO
responded see footnote

NOTE THE ESTIMATED QUANTITIES ARE FOR ONE YEAR AND THE CONTRACT IS FOR A FIVE YEAR PERIOD

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)
12/21/11 = CAQ OPINION REQUESTED ON 5 BIDS ALPHA MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS, MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO, LLC , PRODUCTS UNLIMITED INC., SLAM INTERNATIONAL INC., TRI-TECH FORENSICS INC.
1/9/12 = CAQ OPINION RECEIVED ALPHA MEDICAL DISTRIBUTORS BID SHOULD BE REJECTED THE BID CLEARLY STATES NO SUBSTITUTION FOR LINE ITEM &5 OF THE BODY BAGS. AS TO AN OPINION OF
THE REMAINING BIDS A RESPONSIVENESS OPINION 1S NOT NECESSARY OR PROPER FOR THE BIDDERS IDENTIFIED ABOVE OTHER THAN ALPHA MEDICAL BECAUSE ALL HAVE SUBMITTED HIGHER BIDS




