MIAMIDADE

CONTRACT AWARD SHEET
Internal Services Department
Procurement Management Services

Bid No. 8279-5/18-1
Award Sheet

JUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION

BID NO.:  8279-5/18-1 PREVIOUS BID NO.:
TITLE: AUDIO VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
CURRENT CONTRACT PERIOD:  08/01/2013 through 07/31/2018
Total # of OTRs: 1
MODIFICATION HISTORY
Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet
DPM Notes
APPLICABLE ORDINANCES
LIVING WAGE: No UAP: Yes 1G: Yes

OTHER APPLICABLE ORDINANCES:

CONTRACT AWARD INFORMATION:

PHONE: 305 375-3233 FAX: 305 375-4407

Yes Local Preference No Micro Enterprise No Full Federal Funding No Performance Bond
Yes Small Business Enterprise (SBE) No PTP Funds No Partial Federal Funding Yes Insurance
Miscellaneous:
REQUISITION NO.:
PROCUREMENT AGENT: CAMPBELL, ROMA

EMAIL: RCAMP@MIAMIDADE.GOV

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

VENDOR NAME: COMMUNICATIONS SUPPLY CORPORATION
DBA:
FEIN: 060961848 SUFFIX: 01 33309
STREET: 3470 NW 53RD STREET CITY:FT LAUDERDALE ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 877-462-7271
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: Yes SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
JUAN LEGER 954-777-1739 877-462-7271 954-777-1710 JLEGER@GOCSC.COM
VENDOR NAME: EDH INC
DBA: TEE'S PLUS
FEIN: 061195334 SUFFIX: 03 06340
STREET: 1425 GOLD STAR HIGHWAY CITY:GROTON ST: CT ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-782-8337
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[ .ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
STEVE WEASEL/TOM CRAIG 860-326-0504 800-782-8337 860-446-9086 TCRAIG@TEESPLUS.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

BT CONFERENCING VIDEO INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 232805984 SUFFIX: 02 80021
STREET: 11400 WESTMOOR CIRCLE SUITE 225 CITY: WESTMINSTER ST: CO ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 888-947-3663
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
DEBRA BLANCO 303-448-7800 888-947-3663 303-448-7803 DEBRA.BLANCO@BT.COM
VENDOR NAME: ENLIGHTEN DIGITAL LLC
DBA:
FEIN: 262774303 SUFFIX: 01 32819
STREET: 7512 DR PHILLIPS BLVD #50-352 CITY:ORLANDO ST: FL ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Vendor Record Verified? No

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
ROBERT ROSS 321-948-2512 - 413-798-1062 INFO@ENLIGHTENDIGITAL.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Award Sheet

Bid No. 8279-5/18-1
VENDOR NAME: ANIXTER INC
DBA:
FEIN: 362361285 SUFFIX: 01 33178
STREET: 10051 NW 99TH AVENUE SUITE 5 CITY:MEDLEY ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: Yes SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
ANGELA CALDWELL 800-432-6300 - 561-278-4304 SNL.DELRAYBEACH@ANIXTER.COM
VENDOR NAME: BEST BUY GOV LLC
DBA:
FEIN: 412140943 SUFFIX: 01 55423
STREET: 7601 PENN AVE S D6 CITY:RICHFIELD ST: MN ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET TOLL PHONE: 866-509-4108
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
ENRIQUE BARRERA 612-292-0359 866-509-4108 952-430-3711 ENRIQUE.BARRERA@BESTBUY.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

DIVINE VISUAL & SYSTEM CORP

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 450486734 SUFFIX: 01 33127
STREET: 2700 N MIAMI AVE SUITE #905 CITY:MIAMI ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 877-887-4387
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: Yes SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
SUZETTE A KELLY 786-373-3870 877-887-4387 786-373-3871 SKELLY@DIVINEVISUAL.COM
VENDOR NAME: SIGNAL PERFECTION LTD INC
DBA: AVI SPL INC
FEIN: 521760942 SUFFIX: 03 33634
STREET: 6301 BENJAMIN ROAD SUITE 101 CITY:TAMPA ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 888-884-7168
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Other: Vendor Record Verified? No
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
407-786-5000 888-884-7168 407-786-5033 PHILIP.DIPAULA@AVISPL.COM

PHILIP ] DIPAULA

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

AUDIO FIDELITY COMMUNICATIONS CORP

VENDOR NAME:
DBA: WHITLOCK
FEIN: 540617014 SUFFIX: 02 23233
STREET: 3900 GASKINS RD CITY:RICHMOND ST: VA ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 877-886-5252
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

JORDAN KANTER 561-254-5027 877-886-5252 813-884-4145 KANTERJ@WHITLOCK.COM

VENDOR NAME: CAMCOR INC

DBA:

FEIN: 560818892 SUFFIX: 01 27215

STREET: 2273 S CHURCH STREET CITY:BURLINGTON ST: NC ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-868-2462

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
DONNA R SOLOMON 954-802-2979 800-868-2462 800-298-1181 DSOLOMON@CAMCOR.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

XEROX AUDIO VISUAL SOLUTIONS INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 581428621 SUFFIX: 02 30071
STREET: 3170 REPS MILLER ROAD #190 CITY:NORCROSS ST: GA ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 866-472-3009
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
954-472-3009 866-472-3009 954-473-0205 JCLAUCIRICA@XEROXAUDIOVISUAL.

JC LAUCIRICA

PRESIDIO NETWORKED SOLUTIONS INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 581667655 SUFFIX: 02 32839
STREET: 5337 MILLENIA LAKES BLVD SUITE 300 CITY:ORLANDO ST: FL ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-345-7743
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
WAYNE SUESS 954-817-5510 800-345-7743 954-349-1598 WSUESS@PRESIDIO.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

ADVANCED COVERT TECHNOLOGY INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 582486222 SUFFIX: 01 30901
STREET: 111 TENTH STREET CITY:AUGUSTA ST: GA ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 877-233-2523
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

RYAN P MITCHELL 706-496-8275 877-233-2523 800-308-6105 INFO@ACT-SALES.COM

VENDOR NAME: SIMPLEXGRINNELL LP

DBA:

FEIN: 582608861 SUFFIX: 01 33025

STREET: 10550 COMMERCE PARKWAY CITY:MIRAMAR ST: FL  ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 954-431-3700

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
CATHY RIPPEE 954-862-5213 954-431-3700 954-435-6650 CRIPPEE@SIMPLEXGRINNELL.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

VENDOR NAME: PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY
DBA: PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS
FEIN: 590932660 SUFFIX: 01 3361016
STREET: 6510 N 54 STREET CITY: TAMPA ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-792-2644
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

LAWRENCE A MILLER 813-621-6446 800-792-2644 813-621-7688 BIDS@PYRAMIDSP.COM

VENDOR NAME: PITMAN PHOTO INC

DBA: PITMAN PHOTO SUPPLY

FEIN: 591295395 SUFFIX: 02 33176

STREET: 13911 S DIXIE HWY CITY:MIAMI ST: FL ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-252-3008

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:

Name

Phonel Phone2 Fax

Email Address
PITMANPHOTO@ATT.NET

GARY R STEINMANN

305-256-9558 800-252-3008 305-256-9789

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

50 STATE SECURITY SERVICE INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 591354432 SUFFIX: 01 33161
STREET: 915 NE 125TH STREET CITY:NORTH MIAMI ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 888-550-7828
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

JOHN M WILLIAMS 305-891-7000 888-550-7828 305-899-9562 SO0STATE@S50STATE.COM

VENDOR NAME: BASS UNITED FIRE & SECURITY SYSTEMS INC

DBA:

FEIN: 591711065 SUFFIX: 01 33069

STREET: 1480 SW 3 STREET C-9 CITY:POMPANO BEACH ST: FL ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-372-2770

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
RON WEBER 954-785-7800 800-372-2770 954-785-7804 BIDS@BASSUNITED.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

TRANSWORLD SERVICES INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 591799482 SUFFIX: 01 33172
STREET: 2025 NW 102 AVENUE WHSE #101 CITY:MIAMI ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-424-8550
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

FRANCISCO TONDA 305-477-6999 800-424-8550 305-477-6609 BOB@TWSDISTRIBUTORS.COM

VENDOR NAME: BROADCASTERS GENERAL STORES INC

DBA:

FEIN: 591888397 SUFFIX: 01 344807°

STREET: 2480 SE 52 ST CITY:OCALA ST: FL ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-342-0186

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
RICKY M FORGUSON 352-622-7700 800-342-0186 352-629-7000 RICKY@BGS.CC

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

AUDIO VISUAL INNOVATIONS

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 591958935 SUFFIX: 01 33634
STREET: 6301 BENJAMIN RD STE 101 CITY: TAMPA ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

WILLIAM J LEE 954-938-9382 954-776-4772 BILL.LEE@AVISPL.COM

VENDOR NAME: MIDTOWN VIDEO

DBA:

FEIN: 592626523 SUFFIX: 01 33155

STREET: 4824 SW 74 COURT CITY:MIAMI ST: FL ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-232-4564

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel

Phone2

Fax
305-662-2860

Email Address
FIGLESIAS@MIDTOWNVIDEO.COM

FERNANDO IGLESIAS 305-669-1117

800-232-4564

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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CLOSED CIRCUIT DESIGNS INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 650010447 SUFFIX: 01 33054
STREET: 12815 NW 45TH AVENUE #2 CITY:OPALOCKA ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
RON JACOBOWRTZ -PRESIDEN 305-652-8567 305-652-3471 RON@SAFETECH1.COM
VENDOR NAME: LH COMPUTER SERVICES
DBA:
FEIN: 650222916 SUFFIX: 01 33076
STREET: 12296 WILES ROAD CITY:CORAL SPRINGS ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
DOUGLAS E COLE 954-752-5805 954-752-3470 DCOLE@LHCOMP.COM

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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UNITED DATA TECHNOLOGIES INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 650566138 SUFFIX: 01 33172
STREET: 8825 NW 21ST TERRACE CITY:DORAL ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-882-9919
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

MARIANA RAULS 305-882-0435 800-882-9919 305-882-0436 SALESOPS@UDTONLINE.COM

VENDOR NAME: PRIVID EYE SYSTEMS CORP

DBA:

FEIN: 650570929 SUFFIX: 01 33314

STREET: 4061 SW 47TH AVENUE CITY:FT LAUDERDALE ST: FL  ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-989-6064

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
954-581-1756 800-989-6064 954-797-0453

LARRY SATTLER

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Award Sheet

VIDEOSCOPE INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 650776436 SUFFIX: 01 33166
STREET: 7711 NW 46TH STREET CITY:DORAL ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
ARTHUR M TULIN 305-436-1684 305-438-3743 SALES@VIDEOSCOPEUSA.COM
VENDOR NAME: GLOBAL SECURITY PRODUCTS INC
DBA:
FEIN: 651097812 SUFFIX: 01 33177
STREET: 16115 SW 117 AVE UNIT A2 CITY:MIAMI ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
STEVEN J SCHWARTZ 305-592-6970 305-592-9366 SSCHWARTZ@GLOBALSECURITYPRO

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT

JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Award Sheet

STRIKE INDUSTRIES INC

VENDOR NAME:
DBA:
FEIN: 651121151 SUFFIX: 01 33442
STREET: 3446 SW 15TH ST CITY:DEERFIELD BEACH ST: FL  ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: 1%10NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address

LINDA K SELLATI 954-420-9131 954-420-9132 LSELLATI@STRIKEIND.COM

VENDOR NAME: MUNWAY TECHNOLOGY INC

DBA:

FEIN: 753031125 SUFFIX: 01 33166

STREET: 7220 NW 36 ST CITY:MIAMI ST: FL ZIP:

FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:

PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 305-805-7948

ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Vendor Record Verified?

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:

Name

Phonel Phone2 Fax

Email Address
MMUNDARAIN@MUNWAY.COM

MIGUEL A MUNDARAIN

305-805-9890 305-805-7948 305-805-7948

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1
VENDOR NAME: 9X MEDIA INC
DBA:
FEIN: 770581961 SUFFIX: 01 95033
STREET: 20711 BEAR CREEK ROAD CITY:LOS GATOS ST: CA ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY:
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: -
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: SBE Set Aside Bid Pref.
Micro Ent. Selection Factor Goal
Other: Vendor Record Verified?
'Vendor Contacts:
Name Phonel Phone2 Fax Email Address
DAN DUNN 408-399-2299 408-399-2290
VENDOR NAME: TROXELL COMMUNICATIONS INC
DBA:
FEIN: 860716114 SUFFIX: 01 85040
STREET: 4830 S 38TH STREET CITY:PHOENIX ST: AZ ZIP:
FOB_TERMS: DEST-P DELIVERY: AS REQUESTED
PAYMENT TERMS: NET30 TOLL PHONE: 800-578-8858
ENDOR INFORMATION:
CERTIFIED VENDOR ASSIGNED MEASURES
[_.ocal Vendor: No SBE No Set Aside  No Bid Pref. No
Micro Ent. No Selection Factor No Goal No
Vendor Record Verified? No

Other:

'Vendor Contacts:

Name Phonel

Phone2

Fax Email Address

954-746-4832

TAN.WEINGOLD@TROX.COM

IAN WEINGOLD 954-746-4831

800-578-8858

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

ITEMS AWARDED Section:
Details:
Item # Description Oty Unit_Price
End of ITEMS AWARDED Section
AWARD INFORMATION Section
BCC Award: No DPM Award: No
BCC Date: 03/04/2008 DPM Date: 06/06/2013

Contract Amount: $§ 9,762,208.80

Additional Items Allowed: Agenda Item No.:

Special Conditions:

BPO INFORMATION Section:

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
JCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES DIVISION
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1

Award Sheet

1 | ABcW1300561
Commodity ID Commodity Name
880-11 AUDIO VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES (NOT
Department Department Allocation
AV $837,454.00
CL $168,000.00
CcO $15,670.00
CR $1,135,425.00
ET $732,208.00
FR $785,000.00
GI $883,500.00
IDO1**** $10,000.00
IDOG**** $14,116.00
IDO9**** $7,500.00
ID**** $10,000.00
ID13%*** $8,000.00
IG $20,000.00
LB $285,918.00
ME $30,000.00
MM $3,000.00
MT $2,322,017.00
PA $27,500.00
PD $489,000.00
PEQ] **#* $38,875.00
PEQ2**#* $16,000.00
PE0319** $2,664.00
PEOQS**#* $2,194.00
PR $120,000.00
PW $258,787.00
SP $300,000.00
TT $10,000.00
VZ $10,000.00
WS $44,000.00
ABCW1300562
Commodity ID Commodity Name
880-11 AUDIO VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES (NOT

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT
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Bid No. 8279-5/18-1 Award Sheet

Department Department Allocation

BU $4,256.00
CO $12,050.00
FR $599,999.00
HD $272,543.00
PD $249,000.00

. ________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________________|]
End of BPO Information Section
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