e

TALLY SHEET

Bid No. : 8607-0/18

Bid Title: SCUBA, SKIN DIVING EQUIPMENT AND REPAIR PARTS

Bid Opening: September 25, 2013

PCA: Ana "Kiki" Lang

Prepared by: Ana "Kiki" Lang
Verified by: Martha Perez-Garviso

Vendor FEIN # : o

Locally~-Headquaricred Business Certification (YES/NO):

Company's Address: o

Local Preference Certification (YES/NO): i

Veteran Business Enterprise Certification (YES/NO):

SBE Certification (YES/NO):

Acknowledgement of Addenda (YES/NO):

Affidavits Completed (YES/NQ):

‘ REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
Per Sect. Qualification Criteria:

A minimum of three (3) references must be listed in the Bidder’s

2.4 :Submittal Form as proof of experience.

e AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER . o ... OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
‘ o 591280143 o 4ei392t10 650749616 )
10525 SOUTH DIXIE HWY 4005 NW {14 AVE # 24 300 ALTON RD # 100
MIAMI, FL 33156 DORAL, FL 33178 _ MIAMI BEACH, FL, 33139
YES ) NO* YES
yes NO* YES
NO NO No
NO NO NO )
YES R . T vEs NO T
YES YES YES
Attached Attached Attached

1. CATEGORY “A” SCUBA & SKIN DIVING EQUIPMENT
AND REPAIRS (Groups 1- §)

GROUP (1) DIVE CYLINDERS & VALVES

PAGE 1 OF PAGE 10

VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
ESTIMATED {CURRENT : UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
|ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICES | EQUAL PRODUCT ;| PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL
' Underwater Kinetics tank boot with : B : -
irim for aluminum 80-Cu. Ft. Cylinder ! :
i #25033 o2 Bach :§ 510 3 7008 84.00 | $  7.00:% 84.00 ‘$ 500:% 60.00 [XSSCUBATBX7A :$§  7.00:% 84.00
‘80 cu. Ft. aluminum tank, Luxfer, ; B . . B I B : T
2 plastichootand K Valve P2 Each '§ 15500 $ 165.00:$  1,980.00 $ 160.00 8§  1,920.00 $ 15400 %  1,848.00 $ 15290:%  1,834.80
{40 cu. Ft. aluminum tank, Luxfer, T ' THERMOVALVENO
3 iplastic boot and K Valve 16 Each | N/A $ 14400:% 230400 $ 144008  2,304.00 $ 14400:%  2.304.00 IBOOT (5 129.89:% 207824
100 cu. Ft hight pressure steel tanks : T e————— s ; B . - e :
{Faber, SS Scuba plastic boot and K- - ! WORTHINGTON
4 Valve - 6 Each & NA $ 340.00:% 2,040.00 _ $ 34000:% 2,040.00 [STEEL CYLINDERS = : § 1,650.00 $ 36500:% 2,190.00
E20cu It hight pressure steel tanks, | i T T . T e '
‘Faber, SS Scuba plastic boot and K- WORTHINGTON : i
5 Valve - 4 ¢ Each | NA $ 380.00:%  1,520.00 | ‘$ 37000 '§  1,480.00 |STEELCYLINDERS :$ 30500 :%  1220.00 (5 4390003 1,756.00
TOTAL-GROUP 1 — ftems (1-5): $  7,928.00 $  7,828.00 B $  7,082.00 $  7,943.04
RANKING: SECONDARY o PRIMARY e e i
‘BAFCQ PRICING LP10% +LH 5% 3 i 1,062.30
_ BAFO Range : $7,082.00 - $8144.30
RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR
GROUP {(2) REGULATORS & INSTRUMENTATION
A. FIRST STAGE REGULATORS WITH ENVIRONMENTAL KIT _
1 Scubapro MK-2 Plus ‘ 30 | Each § 8467 $ 8500:8% 2,550.00 - 3 2,490.00 $  80.00:% 2,400.00
2 gScubapro MK17 4 Each N/A $ 15700:% 628.0Q_ - : ‘5 __2@9.00 $ 1,076.00 $ 14700:% 588.00
3 %Scub:_i]_::ro MK2S 4 Each $ 157.58 ‘% 180.00 1% 720.00 ~ $ 155.00 é $ 620.00 $ 157008 628.00
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VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
- ESTIMATED {CURRENT ¢ UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
_ ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY ~PRICES EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL
e T — e . . BTN F e

4 Scubapro R195 7 30 | Each N/A 3 9700 $ 291000 7 7 $ 145.00 3 4,350.00 $ 10000 'S 3,000.00

5. ScubaproC300 o4 Eah o oNA ‘$ 125008 500004 | 317400 5 696.00 $ 12000 5 480.00

6 Scubapro 5600 4 Each oNA $ 21500 % 860.00 S _ S ‘S 2990008 1,196.00 $ 20000 S 800.00

7. Scubapro AT00 2 . FEach NA (82800005 56000 _ ST SO B 3 37000 % 740.00 526000 S 52000

C. [NSTRUMENTATION WITH PRESSURE, DEPTH &COMPASS T
" Oceanic 200 ft. MD Nav/Com 04-" 77 B : ; :
8o M __E.?Ch § 13260 139008 AT600 1 ¥ 132008 448800 INIA
; : : PRO PLUS 3 DELUXE .

9 Oceanic Datamax Pro Plus 04-1035-07. 34 Each §  50050[041072-07 548000 § 1632000 i3 499008 16,966.00 S 549005 18,666.00

10 Compass, Occanic Module 04.1050 . 54 | Fach . § 3120 $ 3400:$  1,836.00 '$ 310008 1,674.00 $5.00:$  2,970.00
‘Computers, Oceanic, Veo 250 Module T VEOZOMODULE S T T e

11 504.3600.42 ! 52 ¢ Each $ 240.50)3700-67 - $ 215.00 $ 11,180.00 i $0239.00:%  12,428.00 |N/A
‘Oceanic Veo 250 Air/Nitrox Dive ; VEO 2.0 COMBO 04 . '

12 Computer Console Combo 2 Each : NA 3710-67 {$ 26400 3% 528.00 ‘$ 375.00 '3 750.00 IN/A

TOTAL-GROUP 2 — ltems (1-12): s 4331800 - S 47,474.00 $—30,052.00-
RANKING: PRIMARY  SECONDARY 7 S
NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:

RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS: Per Eduarde Gonzalez (CAO) email dated 10/24/13
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall _ No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR No bid'on line items &, [1 & 12
GROUP (3) WET SUITS -
A.SHORTIES o

‘Henderson Short Sleeve, 2MM, Rear | ‘

Zipper, Regular sizes (Small, Medium, : AQUALUNG :

1 Large) 30 Each $ 6500 § 75003 2,250.00 {HYDROFLEX 2MM [ §  04.00 1,920.00 $ 64.00:% 1,920.00 |SCUBAMAX W2MS $ 5000i% 1,500.00
IV Hidrogear Lomg Sleeve Shorty 1 il el T B .
:Henderson or Body Glove, Front ! ;

Zipper, Regular sizes (Small, Medium, HENDERSON : NEOSPORT 3MM L/S :

2 -Large) ;30 Each $ 5700 |A635MF 8 8200:% 2.460.00 JFRONT ZIP $ 62.00 £,860.00 $ 57001 8% 1,710.00 }DEEPSEE 3MM $ 69.85 8% 2,095.50
Henderson Neoprene Short Sleeve F/7Z. | : : S
Men’s Shorty 3MM, Regular sizes i .

3 (Small, Medium, Large) 30 | Each $ 6500 77.00:8 2,310.00 {DEEP SEA3MMS/S ' §  54.00 1,620.00 $ 3500 3 1,650.00 [SCUBAMAX WXMS2 :§ 63.00:§ 1,890.00
IMM Henderson Hyperstretch Shorty, | A o HENDERSON i o HENDERSON : R - o ’

Long sleeve, Regular sizes {Small, i : THERMOPRENE THERMOPRENE CRESSI VAPOR :

4 Medium, Large) 30 Each | $ 138.00 AG630 (5 77.00:8 2,310.00 {L/S £ 7700 2,310.00 i$ 137.00:% 4,110.00 |SLANT Zip 13142 ‘511950 .8 3,585.00
IMM Henderson Gold Core w/Knee TIHENDERSON T T HENDERSON 1 : -
pads, Full suit, Regular sizes (Small, AQUALOCK AQUALOCK E

5 Medium, Large) 32 Each $ 255.001Q830 § 22500:%  7,200.00 |Q830 !$ 225.00 7,200.00 $ 25000:% 8,000.00 |CRESSIFUSION 11115:§  187.00: % 5,984.00
Hydrogear 3MM w/Knee Pads, HENDERSON
Henderson or Body Glove, Full suit, THERMOPRENE % :

6 Regular sizes (Small, Medium, Large) | 42 Each $  88.00}A830 o i% 131.00:% 5,502.00 |BARE FULL 3MM ‘3 84.00 3,528.00 $ 8500:% 3,570.00 |CRESSIFUSION I1115:$8 187.00 : % 7,854.00
2MM Henderson full suit combo : '

(Farmer John and Shorty), Long
sleeve, Regular sizes (Small, Medium, :
7 Large) 49 Each $ 14700 § 15400:% 7,546.00 '3 ~146.00 7,154.00 $ 14600:% 7,154.00 {DEEPSEE 3MM 1% 130.00: % 6,370.00
B. SKIN SUITS

PAGE 2 OF PAGE 10
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VENDOR NAME:

AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER

OCEAN HUNTERS INC.

TARPOON LAGOON

ITEM

ESTIMATED |CURRENT

EQUAL PRODUCT |

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
FRICE

TOTAL

EQUAL PRODUCT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

EQUAL PRODUCT

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

8 Pinnacle dive suit _ s

9 Pinnacle shadow
14] ‘Henderson hot skins

C. FULL BODY SUITS

- 42 VEzrlch )

QUANTITY PRICES
2 B 5 300

5 75.00
35.00

31 ¢  Each

‘Scubapro 5MM oneflex full wetsuit,

‘Regular sizes (Small, Medium, Large,

11 iExtra Large)

T Seubapro 7MM oneflex full wetsuit,
‘Regular sizes (Sinall, Medium, Large, ! :
4 Each

12 ‘ExtraLarge}

él’innacle Merino-Elastoprenc SMM
:full wetsuit ,Regular sizes (Small,

4 Each N/A

N/A

4 | Each N/A

HENDERSON
POLYLEFIN
P810 VF

MICROPRENE
A805

$ 15000

HENDERSON
AQUALOCK
Q850

5 8400
0% 36.00

$ 12500

$ 500.00

5 6900 S 220800 |TILOSL-100

AQUALUNG

§  2,604.00 [HYDROFLEX

5 1,512.00

EQUAL PRODUCT

5 6800
'$ 35.00

§  2,108.00
8 MAReY

5 600.00

SCUBAPRO
EVERFLEX
SMM

1,[84.00

'3 75.Qof$_
S 35008

2,325.00
1,470.00

‘$ 125.00

- $ 500.00

$ 600.00

SEAC IFLEX 3

165.00 ' §

$00.00

N/A

660.00

UNIT
PRICE TOTAL

SCUBAPRO | MM PN
#63 104 200 5

100.00  $
10000 §

SCUBAPRO MM §

$ 15000

$ 896.00

SEAC IFLEX 8

200.00 ' §

S 1417508

AQUALUNG

13 Medium, Large, Extra Large}

éPinnacIe Merino-Elastoprene 7MM
Hull wetsuit, Regular sizes (Small,
14 _Medium, Large, Extra Large)

HENDERSON SCUBAPRO 3
AQUALOCK EVERFLEX SCUBA PRO ONE

4 © Fach N/A

Q870

|RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:

TOTAL-GROUP 3 — Items (1-14)]

RANKING:

Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall

offer prices for all items within a given group.

§ 27000

$ 1,080.00

$ 1,216.00

T5MM

§ 224.00

‘5 239.00

$I00

s 39,298.00

o«

33,306-00

23000

'$ 2500018

|sQuarLEx sMm g

_1,000.00
$  36,473.00

P

13750 . §

3,100.00

s lew s

20120 § 84480

4,200.00

464.00

567.00

550.00

FLEX '$

$——39.004.30-

RESPONSIVE VENDOR

PRIMARY

SECONDARY

BAFO PRICING

LP 10% + LH 5% $ 547095

RESPONSIVE VENDOR

..BAFO Range : §36,473.00 - $41,943.95

NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:

Per Eduardo Gonzalez (CAQ) email dated 10/24/13
No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,600,600.00

No bid on line item 8

GROUP {(4) GLOVES, MISCELLANEQUS DIVE GEAR, HOODS, BOOTS & FINS

A GLOVES

1 ‘Titanium gloves One size fits all

‘gKeviar gloves One size fits all

_ 52 Pair $

52 Pair S

25.00

19.08 T

S 24008

$ 3200

3 ..1,664.00

F 2500

- $ 1,300.00

$ 1300 §

2500 b 1,300.00

676.00

N/A

SIMPSON PN #39024 39.00 | $

3 Reef Pro gloves One size fits all

52 . Pair | § 1974

b 16.00 :

; cor

'$ 15.00

$ 780.00

$  12.00:% 624.00

N/A

EScubapro black 1.5MM Amara Gloves,
Regular sizes (Small, Medium, Large)

64 Pair h 12.99

i 17.00

3 1,088.00

$ 1500

$ 960.00

3 1300:% §32.00

2,028.00

444.00

5 :Akona, Rgéfclove AKG608 Small

53 Pair 1§ 17.76

5 11.00

$ 583.00

$ 1100

3 583.00

165008

6 Akona, Reef Glove AKG608 Medium

53 Pair 3 17.76

3 11.00

$ 583.00

$  1L00

3 583.00

3 16.50 ; § 874.50

87450

AKFG608 i3

689.00

AKFG608 $

689.00

7 Akona, Reef Glove AKG608 Large

56 Pair %

17.76

5 1100

$ 616.00

5 1100

3 616.00

§ 1650:% 924.00

AKFG608 ' §

728.00

" Akona, Deluxe Glove AKNG138
8  Small

$3 | Pair | $  19.08

$  15.00

$ 79500

$ 1800:8 9

;:Akona, Delixe Glove AKNGI38
9  iMedium

53 o Pair ‘%

" Akona, Deluxe Glove AKNGTI8 ™
10 :Large

53 0 Par 1§

19.08

EE] I

$  15.00

3 1500

3 795.00

b 7935.00

5 1500

S 795.00

$_ 18008

$_.1s00;

$ 795.00

$ 1500

$ 795.00

RO

954.00

'$  18.00:%

$ 1800 ;8%

954.00

$ 18.00:S

954.00

B. MISCELLANEOUS DIVE GEAR

‘Weight belt, nylon with durable buckle?

11 ffor hard weights, Size 487

53 Each : §

395

‘§ 500

S 265.00

s 5.00

) 265.00

'$ 5005

MARINE SPORTS PN #| ey
3610 :

PAGE 3 OF PAGE 10

i

243.80
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VENDOR NAME:

AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER

OCEAN HUNTERS INC.

TARPOON LAGOON

ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

CURRENT
PRICES

EQUAL PRODUCT

UNIT

PRICE .

TOTAL

EQUAL PRODUCT

TOTAL

UNIT

EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE

EQUAL PRODUCT

TOTAL

"Soft-pouch weight belt, with durable
12

-Soﬁ-pouch weight belt, with durable

:Soft-pouch weight belt, with durable
‘buckle and zipper with 6 pouches

‘buckle and zipper with 4 pouches 3

‘buckle and zipper with 5 pouches

56 Eagh

53

Each

3

13.16

Each

5

13.16

13.16

$ 151200 e
$ 143100 S

$  1,377.00 3

* :Mesh Snorkeling Bags, Akona
AKBOO!

EAqLVJialupg Mesh Dufﬂc Bag

19 Tusa SAV-7 Underwater Scooter

"Mesh Dufile Bags, Akona AKB734 5

Dive Scooters, Sea-Doo Scooters GT1 51

‘ Each 7
i Each
‘Each

£
: ¥

3.95

378.00

.
N/A

Each

335.53

N/A

1,620.00

17,850.00

2,300.00

6,900.00

0000 b i

15007‘00 e PR

969.00

_...203.00

6,900.00

20 uqdie

ar , Pelican 1650

N/A

3,995.00

275.00

7,990.00 $3,850.00
14,025.00 $ 275.00

70000

14,025.00

7085004

22 iPelican Boxes, Pelican 1550

Each

159.43

159.00

8,109.00 5 157.00

23 Pelican Boxes, Pelican 1450

Each

N/A

106.60

212.00 | 'S 106.00

Lserood
212.00

5 1900°s

18.00 : §

S 180075

'$ 1900 S

ST
3200 §

. 1,008.00

1,007.00

969.00

MARINE SPORTS

# 3621 S 1675 %

#3622 51675 f $

L1200,
1,404.00
224.00

$ 335005

17,085.00

i

$2,390.00

7,197.0G

#3623 $

5 785 %
AKB735 $
PN D65203 ‘5 2389 $

[AM OUT OF ANY
STOCK AND ARENOT :
BEIGN MADE ANY |

NMORE $ 3,400.00 - $

1675 § $54.25
325§

539999 8 2039949

938.00

887.75

42390
168750
16723

10,200.00

6,000.60

©$ 3,895.00

+$3,000.00
is 227.00

T 11,577.00

$ 15700

© 8,007.00

1S 15400

©13,719.00

7,790.00

7,854.00

126.00

218.60

24

25 ;Peiicarx Boxes, Pe]icar'lll\Olﬁ"O '

‘Pelican Boxes, Pelican 1400

N/A

85.00

Each

N/A

18.50 :

85.00 S 8500

85.00

$  63.00
: 39.00

39.00

8 109,00
; 25.00

85.00

18.50

30.00

20.00

20.00

26

2
1 Each
3

 Each

N/A

I R N - =)

279.00

2 Loisieital el e e

o
TMigse | T $ 1850
837.00 'S 279.00

837.00

$
$ 30.00
$ 22000

68700 |

©® A M Y

(5 250.00

750.00

‘Analox 02 EIl Nitrox Analyzer

27

C. HOODS

EOX-ANH Replacement Oxygen Scnsorg

3 | Eah |

N/A

o2

115.00 °

L=

345.00 5 11500

345.00

©

120.00

&0

el eaL el on eml el bm Be :

360.00

'S 11900

(e

33700

iCold Water hood (DUT), 2MM,
28

Regular sizes (Small, _Medium, Large) |

32 Each

34.21

70.00

$ 224000 s 7000

2,240.00

SEAC HOOD 3

1,088.00

EVERFLEX HOOD =
SCUBAPRO :

64 2540 230 5 27008

3400 $

864.00

entry zip, 2MM, Regular sizes (Small,

30  Medium, Large)

32 Each

| 59.54

70.00

70.00

2,240.00

1,888.00

Warm Water hood (DUT), 2MM, % ; HOTHEAD E
29 'Regular sizes (Small, Medium, Large) | 32 Each 1§ 2796 $ 7000:%  2,240.00 18 70.00:§  2,240.00 {SEAC HOOD ‘s 27008 864.00 JAQUALUNG D92723 ($ 1950 ' $ 624.00
o Hooded vest {Body Glove} wiside ‘ ymmm— ' ' : BODGLOVE :

INSOTHERM #11152
MM

“Hooded vest (Body CGlove) wiside
entry zip, 3MM, Regular sizes (Small, :

31 Medium, Large)

EScubapro 5/3mm Hooded Vest,

32 ZfReguIar sizes (Small, Medium, Large)

32

Each

57.8%

70.00

$ 224000 '3

$  2240.00 |

59.00 : $

2,080.00

N/A

59.00

5 Each

57.8%

55.00

$ 275.00

:Pinnacle Menno Lined 5mm Hooded
Vest, Regular sizes (Small, Medium,

33 Large}

5 Each

N/A

HENDERSON
Al53

63.00

HENDERSON
Al53
63.00

55.00

$_..31500 5 MM 3

1,888.00

315.00

$ 6500

5 90

295.00

i$  8000:%

400.00

N/A

D. BOOTS

27.0

TETTES00TS

Henderson gold core boots

36 %Deep Sea / Agualung Superzip Boots

6 Pair

N/A

. 28.00

$ 168.00 'S 2800

o=

168.00

5 39005

234.00

34 ‘Henderson “Octoboof” Dive Boot 60 Pair | $  28.74 $§  7000:$ 420000 {AQUALUNGERGO  |$ 1,620.00 'S 2800:S  1,680.00 _ 3,900.00
' ' ; - SCUBA PRO
35 52 pair | § 3257 $ 7000.$ 364000 [SCUBAPRODELTA § 3100 $  1,612.00 $ 32008 1,664.00 JLOWBOOTS $  2050($  1,066.00

3MM $  2499:%

149.94

37

;Scubapro Low Top Boots

4 Pair

N/A

22.00

b §8.00 22.00

&5

88.00

140.00

§ 2050 $

82.00

E. FINS

PAGE 4 OF PAGE 10

1/27/2014



VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER . OCEAN HUNTERS INC. . TARPOON LAGOON
ESTIMATED [|CURRENT i UNIT ¢ - UNIT i UNIT UNIT
ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICES EQUAL PRODUCT ;| PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL

76.00 -

6.00 3,168.00 $ 99008  3,168.00
143.00 ¢

LTl 3 9000S 828800
205000 % 68255 279825
1,600.00 $ 45003 1,440.00

2,432.00 - '§ 76.00
4,576.00 | ‘s 13200
2,665.00 '$ 65.00
1344000 13 4200

- 99.01
144.42

$ 243200 18 9900
E
¥

$

38 TusaSF-8
422400

Pair
39 i'At'omi'c smoke on the H20

266500 18 S0
1,344.00

40 Scuba-pro jet fins 352 50.84 65.00

[ N

T
(R RT3 Y

e e o en

41 ;Fii1s§, Tusa, Imprex 32 ____ Palr ______ 42.00
" Mares Avanti Super Channel ‘ : _ ”:
42 Adjustable Strap Fins 4 o Par ;. NA - 5200:% 208.00

55.26

$ 5200 5 aoseofseacaeioo s seoo s s000) 8 65008 260.00

43 SawbaproSeawingGorilla 2 Paic . WA | 15 108005 20600 10800 § 21600 s 1500008 30000 ] $ 10395 :

TOTAL-GROUP4-temsgane| s golpa3sef s e3eso| s st4ome0y B99337.01

RANKING: O S . SECONDARY oo JPRIMARY i
BAFO PRICING . LP10%+LHSY% 8 131105
~ BAFO Range : $87,407.00 - $100,518.05 >

NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:
Per Eduardo Gonzalez (CAO) email dated 10/24/13
No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00
. Subeatergory A, Gloves
RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE YENDORS:: No bid on line items 1 & 3
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall Subcatergory C. Hoods
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR No bid on line items 31 & 33

GROUP (5) MASKS, SNORKELS. DIVE LIGHTS, WEIGHTS & KNIVES

A.MASKS e SN I
b Tusa liberator plus f 50 Each £ 31.00
2 Atomic “Artic” 7 52 . Each 0§ 83.00 § BLOOIS 421200

1,500.00 $ 37008  1,850.00
JBIA00N

33.50:%  1,675.00 $

5900 § 306800 S s 2,860.00

L9
=2
=

95.00 ; 4,940.00

Atomic Frameless . 52 | Each § 5500
e o Bladk Sitesi Lo e S 2200
Volume Mask 52 Edch hY 39.00

Tusa Mask Splendive IV, M-40 2 ¢ Each $ 3100
Omer Alien Mask 40 Each N/A 42.00

33.00
48.00
32,00

1,716.00
96.00
1,280.00

30.00
42.00 :

1,560.00 1,664.00
62.00

1,400.00

1,680.00

il b
[T TS Y
wliwmliemlie

$
84.00 e $
$
$

- AR R

1,020.00 491.40

40.95

Scuba Pro Frameless single Mask T2 3 “Each i N/A 43.00 516.00 ;
Interspiro Divetor Mask with “Buddy [ : [OTS GARDIANW
g Phone™ t 5 ! Each N/A 7 - $ 1,540.00 % 7,70000 | BUDDY PHONE $ 93500:% 4,675.00 |N/A

B. SNORKELS

9 Tusaimprex SP3000 . 56 | Each | $ 1900 s 175075 9s000| o 519008 1,064.00 |sP300Q $ 1893 § 106008

10 Kapitol Reef 54 | Each | §  56.00 'S 5200 $  2:808.00 ) $ 53000 S 286200 55500 % 297000

11 iScuba Pro Spectra Dry Black Snorkels ‘ 4 Each N/A $ 2075 % 83.00 $ 3900:3 156.00 3 1995:% 79.80

C. DIVE LIGHTS

12 Haleyon mini scout | 34 . Bach [§ 6500 :8 156.00-$  5304.00 ' $ 51008 1,734.00 $ 120008  4,080.00
13 {Haleyon scout 34 . Each § 7000 $ 159.00:8 540600 B $ 5100:$  1,734.00 $ 180.00!S 612000
' HALCYON 9/21 -

48,000.00

14 ‘Halcyon 9/18 : 32 Each 3 1,005.00]125 309 021 1,199.60 38,368.00 1,092.00 : 34,944.00 |7 1,500.00

1,056.00 27.00 | 864.00 |LED BULB 60.56

1,937.92

15 Underwater Kinetics Sunlight SL4 | 32 Each :§  36.00

33.00 |

214.20

16 'Scuba Pro Nova 200 light 4 Fach : N/A 55,00 :

280.60 104.00 416.00 67.20

70.00 § , :
| | T — -

11.50

17 :Nova Light 230 Light 4 i Each | NA
18  iPrineton Tec Eco Flare Light 20 Each | N/A

& aeel B e

I e WY

$ $ $
3 s $
220.00 7 S R0000S 32000 $ 5355
f $ $ $
3 s 5.

e eminl ealen

12.00

D. WEIGHTS
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VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
) ESTIMATED JCURRENT T UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICES | EQUALPRODUCT . PRICE . TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL

‘Hard Dive Weights, Lead, 2 pound | : : :
19 plates . 40 = Fach ©$§  3.75 $ 480 % 192.00
T ‘Hard Dive Weights, Lead, 3 pound” [ S ) : : : ; ;
20 plates . 60 © Each § 540 ‘5 720°% 432.00 ; : ‘$ 520 % 312.00 ‘$ 6848 410.40
T o Dive Weights, Lead, 4 pouid ™ e T 5 N O A S IR Il _
21 plates ¢ 40 ¢ Fach 8§ 7.50
o ard Dive Weights, Laad S pond ~ e
22 iplates .0 50 ¢ Each $ 940
‘Hard Dive Weights, Lead, 6 pound 71 o0 '
23 iplates . 40 | Each % 1490
e B Dive Wetghis Casd T p |
24 pound " 4 | Fach ($ 450
‘Soft Pouch Dive Weights, Lead, 3 P R B |
25  ‘pound ‘52 : Eah 1$ 650
7 Soft Pouch Dive Weights, Lead, 4 CoTTTTTT ' -
26  pound 52 ¢ Each $§ 8.65
7 iSoft Pouch Dive Weights, Lead, 5™ o
27 pound . 46 : Each [ $ 1075 S 1400 0§ 64400 5

$ 370§ 1ag00) 5 456§ 15240

384.00 $ 7408 29600 7 '§ 9125 36480

- 600.00 D - $ 9203 460.00 s n40s 570.00
sieo0| 7 ) o ) $ 14503 580.00 | s 13t 524.40
25760 0. g 39013 179.40 5 s528'% 242,88

306.80 §  792:§ 411.84

436.80 P 5 590

58240 IR £

405.60 $ 10563 54912

28 Sydercoenduro L 40 . Each  § 5600 '$ 770008 3ps000| 4

2,240.00 % 3,000.00

29 Awomic Titanium . 60 | Eah | § 7500 'S 74.00S  4440.00 § 12900:%  7,740.00

30 ScubaPro Mako Titanium Knife = 100 | Each = N/A '$ 79.001S  7,900.00 § 4990:%  4,990.00

TOTAL-GROUP S tems(130f = 58739480 $ - §  79,417.60 $—94,882.04

RANKING: 1 o ] N PRIMAB}’

NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR: NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:
RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:: Per-Eduardo Gonzalez (CAO) email dated 10/24/13 Per Eduardo Gonzalez (CAQ) email dated 10/24/13
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered fer award of a group, the Bidder shall No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00 No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00
offer prices for all items within a given group. _ No bid on line item 30 RESPONSIVE VENDOR No bid on ke items 2 & 8

[GROUP (6) BUOYANCY COMPENSATORS

322.89 $ 47500 24,700.00 450.00 23,400.00 {SEAC SUB NICK 749.00 38,948.00

| gZeagle Ranger 52 Each 32000 :%  16,640.00
$

366.23 |PRO LT 309330 $ 26500 13,780.00 |SEAQUEST PROLT 265.00 13,780.00 {AXIOM BCD 310.00 16,120.00 {PROLT 27270 14,180.40

2 Seaquest Pro QD - 52 Each

Each 9,990.00 17035

14,070.00

9,198.90
13,371.86

3 iBC, Scuba Pro Pilot 54

4 Air2,SoubaPro i34 | Each

178.90 '$  189.00 |
105.81 $ 108.11:

10,206.00
14,486.74

185.00
105.00

17500 '8 .2A450.00

e i iem lem

99.79

N E O F N O

420.00 - 210.00 598.00

W e iem 1om (6o
e em lem e [ 6m

420.00

5 _Oc_eanic OceanPro BCD . 2 Each N/A $ 2[0.00:; 480.00 299.00

@ e (es les lem lem |

w 16 lem (o9 ien em
18R 168 em lem (80 eS

$ .
105.00 1§ 14,070.00

b

$

TOTAL-GROUP 6 — ltems (i-5): 63,592.74 61,660.00

56,760.00
RANKING: SECONDARY PRIMARY

76,297.16

BAFQ PRICING LP10% + LH3% $ 8,514.00

BAFO Range : $56,760.00 - $65,274.00

RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS::
- JPursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall :
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENDOR . RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR

GROUP (7) DRY SUITS
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VENDOR-NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
ESTIMATED ]JCURRENT ; UNET UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICES | EQUAL PRODUCT ;. PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL
‘DUI Vulcanized Rubber RS 1500SE
‘Dry Suit
-Kevlar knec pads
;-COmmercia[ hard sole boots
-With yoke
-8i-5 dry glove system - : : :
f  -Regular sizes (Small, Medium, Large) 34 Pair  : $ 2,150.00}VIKING SURVEYCR _ § 2,500.00 ' $  85,000.00 : SEAC DRY PLUS $ 2150008 73,100.00 [N/A
TOTAL-GROUP 7— (htem 1)} §  85,000.00 $ - $  73,100.00 5 _
"Equal Product™ not approved by "Equal Product"” not appreved by
3 MDFR (Betancourt & Corbett) ~ § e} ... VIDFR (Betancourt & Corbett)
RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPCNSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR
GROUP (8} DIVE SAFETY EQUIPMENT
Suba Cyliader Prassurs Gangs T ; e [ e e e G SR ORTS BN
| w/Yolk Fitting ST CT-2 38mm) : (5 8200 '$ 8L00'$  1,944.00 $ 1,896.00 $ 0 80.00°8  1,920.00 [7070 $ 8395  2,014.80
: Dive Flag for vessels 20” x 247 with 5 T [ N o T MARINE SPORTS ; e
2 stiffener $ 895 ‘s 90083 342.00 ‘S 266.00 '$  850:8 323.00 [NYLON # 4679 '3 895 % 340.10
‘See Me Safety Tube/Sausage 457, i T Y
3 iInnovative Scuba SP0134 $ 1750 ‘% 1850 % 1,110.00 18.00 : % 1,080.00 ' 17208 1,032.00 |SP0O130 3 18.00 1,080.00
Sce Me Safery Tube/Sausags 7 : s = peihei e ;
4 iInnovative Scuba SP0134 : £ 21.00 :d 2600:% 1,430.00 2500 § 1,375.00 ¢§ 2100:8 1,155.00 ‘5 26.00 % 1,430.00
“Dive Rite GM2050-40 Hose retainer 5 N o I T
S (RIT BOTTLE) 5 N/A ‘S 1100:§ 176.00 11.00 ' § 176.00 ‘§ 120018 192.00 $ 120083 192.00
Dive Kite OM053-40 Stage Clamps g RSO il IESORPRI AR
6  (RIT BOTTLE) N/A '$ 44003 704.00 44.00 : § 704.00 '3 26008 416.00 $ 9.00:% 144.00
T {foot) Miflex LP Hoses/Cofor Neon e . ‘ mmm—r————
7 :Yellow (RIT BOTTLE) Each | N/A $  48.00 $ 768.00 % 4600:% 736.00 $ 4200 3 672.00 $  4085:% 653.60
X§ Scuba AC 910 Swivels (RIT : A
8 BOTTLE) i 16 Each N/A $ 2200:% 352.00 ‘3 2200 % 352.00 '8 18.00 ? 5 288.00 $ 1850:% 296.00
X5 Scuba BG 470 Cargo Pocket (RIT '
9 BOTTLE} 16 Each N/A $ 1995 % 319.20 § 19.00:% 304.00 ‘% 16.00 $ 256.00 $§ 1565:% 250.40
Manta Junior Reel (JR) Blue (RIT ’ : i : : F
10 .BOTTLE) 16 Each N/A $ 1490013  2384.00 °$ 14900 §  2,384.00 i$ 12000:%  1,920.00 $ 137.00:$  2,192.00
- i X Scuba Delux Lili Bags w/Purge ; m— ' :
“Valve (50-100 Lbs Lifty AC060-Y1. : ;
11 {(RIT BOTTLE) 16 Each N/A ¥ 4200:% 672.00 42.0 672.00 $ 34008 544,00 £ 3675 ‘ $ 588.00
Trident 3 ft lifiBagstrap with brass ' R o : F
12 iclips- LS05 (RIT BOTTLE) 16 Each N/A $ 9.00 : § 144.00 144.00 $ 9.00 | $ 144.00 ‘3 9.99 $ 159.84
¢ Trident Mini Pony High Pressure r——— ' i
5000PSI Guage A232 PSI(RIT
13 BOTTLE) 16 Each N/A $ 2520 $ 403.20 25.20 ! 403.20 '$ 31008 496.00 $ 2300 % 368.00
TOTAL-GROUP 8 — Items (1-13); $  10,748.40 $  10,492.20 $ 9,358.00 3 9,708.74
RANKING: PRIMARY SECONDARY
LP 16% + LH 5% § 140370
BAFO Range : $9,358.00 - $10,761.10
RESPONSIVE /[NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR RESPONSIVE VENDOR
12. CATEGORY “B” WATER RESCUE EQUIPMENT
{|.(Groups ¢ -10) '
GROUP (9 WATER RESCUE EQUIPMENT e
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OCEAN HUNTERS INC.

VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER TARPOON LAGOON
ESTIMATED |CURRENT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | PRICES | EQUAL PRODUCT . PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT | PRICE

" :Horse collar B/C, with a waist and
:crotch strap. Pocket in the front.

‘Durabag, black and yellow with CO2 ; : : Aquatarius currently :
1 auto inflator %~ 130 . Each § 11570 ‘$ 30000 °$  39,000.00 |being used $ 30000 §  39,000.00 ($ 1150008 14,950.00 nvaA
. Snorkel Sodba Bro Carie Model 26 e e T RS R IR S e _ g
2 200-100 . 60 . Each $ 8.00 ‘% 720§ 432.00 {initial bid $ 72000 $  43.200.00 ) 750 % 450.00 '$ 655:% 393.00
e e K ciialon ReekeE T Nadal” B L PSR St T R A e A ARINE SPORTS PR
3 621110 (70 . Pair  $ 5850 '$ 462000 4,550.00 58.00 % 4,060.00 [4007 ©$ 80.00:$  5,600.00
4 Marker Float, Pelican, yellow 130 | Each (% 29.40 § 3,770.00 5 7000 29.00°$  3,770.00 ‘$ 3000:8 390000
5 {Wrist Compass, SUUNTO, #SK7 90 = FEach :§ 5985 $ 5,580.00 549000 o 5900 $ 531000 $ 6635 § 597150
6  iDive Light, Pelican Nemo i 80 Each $  28.00 5 2,960.00 2,960.00 $ 28.00 $ 2,240.00 § 4,800.00
7  Dive Gloves, Multimasters Large 80 Each :§ 1024] ) 48000 $  10.00 $ 800.00 VA
~ bely Pro Ling Tridon 8004 fnch - O e By A b ! DA
8 lyellow © 11 Each :$ 7500 % £,870.00 : ) , $ 7400 % 814.00 § 25008 275.00
etk Bk Black Plastie, UK wiom, 1 r e B S . . R e
9  for63cu Fe L 110 Each §  5.53 $§ 700§ 770.00 8§ 700 § 770.00 $  550:% 605.00 |XSSCUBATBRTA  § 750 $ 825.00
ok Boot. Black Plaske, U /o i, i e . o _ ettt
10 for 80 cu. Ft - HO Each @ § 5.53 % 770.00 $  7.00 % 770.00 $ 550 8% 605.00 }XS SCUBA TBR7A $ 7508 825.00
'UWATEC Dive Computer, Scuba Pro, OCEANIC PRO PLUS OCEANIC PRO PLUS 5 ! SUUNTO COBRA PN #3
11 ISMART w/o disconnect 53 Bach $ 519.79|DELUXE 04 1072-07 ©$ 488.00:$ 25864.00 |[DELUXE 04 1072-07 | $ 488.00 §  25,364.00 $ 519.001$ 27,507.00 }42142 '$ 413.00:%  21,889.00
67 o & tank plastic bost and 500 D ; ot ; : Ao NI a8
Evalve,Luxfer, $63-SVB3000 wioct Price increased from ; :
12 boot | 100 Each | $ 166.00 $ 51.00:%  5,100.00 [initial bid - § 16600 %  16,600.00 § 166.00:$  16,600.00 8 15290083 15290.00
13" " Cylume Glow Sticks, 4 inch 500 . Each $ 135 $ 150 8 750.00 | S 750.00 1203 600.00 S 1008 500.00
T Spare Air Submersible System, 300L- B R ! . 3
14 PKG C3 Each {8 20150 $ 20150°8  6,246.50 'S 20150°%  6246.50 '$ 2000018  6200.00 IS 204008 632400
15 Torpedo Bouy Rescue Can #105 40 | Each S 9625 'S 7700 $  3,080.00 ) ‘5 7700 % 3,080.00 'S 96.00:%  3,840.00 S 9900 § 396000
TOTAL-GROUP 9 — Items (1-15:f $ 101,292.50 $  155,29050 - $  88,351.00 $—70,552.50-
RANKING: SECONDARY PRIMARY _
,AU/ LP 10% + LH 5% ~$  13,252.65
BAFO Range : $88,351 - $101603.65
" ——— NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:
RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS: Per Eduardo Gonzalez (CAQ) email dated 10/24/13
Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall BAFO for Group ¢ not #Waccepted as it exceeds bid No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00
offer prices for all items within a given group. RESPONSIVE VENBOR amount RESPONSIVE VENDOR No bid on line items 1 & 7
GROUP (10} WATER RESCUE EQUIPMENT REPAIR PARTS
10 042 045
1 Scuba Pro MK2/R295 Regulator 100 Each | §$ 138.68 $ 186.00:%  18,600.00 $ 13800:%  13,800.00 [1f 300045 $ 18.00:%  1,800.00
2 iCressi Mini Console KC765250 100 Cach- | § 107.80 $ 114005  11,400.00 $ 107.00:%  10,700.00 $ 107.95:% 10,795
Scuba Pro Air 2 Second Stage #21-089: T ’ ' _ AIR 2 SERVICEKIT
3000 100 Each 1§ 107.20 $ 108.00 3 10,800.00 $ 107.001$  10,700.00 |PN# 21 085 045 11258 1,125.00
Scuba Pro Air Overhaul Kit #2 1 -085- o
4 041 150 Each {§ 1260 $ . 13.00 8 . 1,950.00 $  1200:$  1,800.00 [N/A
SpOI‘t Divers 3/8 female to 7/16(;11316 é o . [
5 iadapter #2816 150 Each :§ 5.00 $ 700 0% 1,050.00 $  400:% 600.00 $ 6.50:% 975.00
6  iRes Q Me Center Punch 230 Each ($§ 830 i$ 11.00:%  2,530.00 $  825:i%  1,897.50 $ 1200:%  2,760.00
7 :Trident Back Pack TAQS 70 Each {$ 31.20 ‘$ 37001%  2,590.00 $ 31L00i%  2,170.00 $  3450:% 241500
e T . SR
8  idurable 70 Each | § 5.00 i $ 6.00 | $ 420.00 $ 500:8% 350.00 $  450:% 315.00
1/27/2014
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VENDOR NAME:

AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER

OCEAN HUNTERS INC.

TARPOON LAGOON

ITEM

PRODUCT DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED

QUANTITY

CURRENT

PRICES

EQUAL PRODUCT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

EQUAL PRODUCT

UNIT
PRICE

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE.

EQUAL PRODUCT

TOTAL

UNIT
PRICE.

EQUAL PRODUCT

TOTAL

He

0 .
" US Divers, Dive Mask silicone 5077- 7T T

i2

‘Winchard Snap Hooks, Stainless Steel,

‘Trident Park DA15 Plastic Whistles ack

" Dive Flég with ‘Fléé_t Trident DE21

10

T Knalytical Industries 6 second, 607 ’
‘month O2 Anatyzer, Model #PSR-11- |

39-1D2

‘O-Rings Model 0-14

éO-Rings Size 013 A (Standard Rubber)

O-RlngsSlchl3V (Vlton) P20
:Sherwood O-Ring Model G-014L ¢

275

24.00

42.00

85.00 |

$  4,800.00

$ 561.00

$  1,44000

b 252000 |

b 2,720.00

025

195

$ 62.50

200§

1
e
[}
(=]
&2

imliem :

23

5 1800.S

3800 5

408.00

_2,280.00

240000 1

" 6.00
| A00.00

360000 |

1.224.00

4.00

DAIS $ 3.00
‘5 1199

5250005 500000

.5
'3

0 %
0%
0.8

: $ e

r

1,136.00

325.00

iTie Wraps, Black

EScuba Pro Regulator Mouthpiece

162

$ 6.38

950 %

1,539.00

"Dive Mask Buckles, US Divers . :
Atlantis #5036-05 RIS § 4ea.s | 36000 $... 203
Repair Glue, Aquaseal . LA $__ 5758 31625 3
‘Regulator Hose 28” x 3/8” EBach  $  16.00] $ 220003 1,562.00 3
Hose Adapiers, Sport Divers #6121 &+ 1 ‘
7/16 Male, 3/8 Female 85 Feh 8 S0 3 00 SO0 ) 330008

700 | Each | $ 020 $ 0158 10500 § 0208

&2

146.00

s

612.60
863.28

- 263400

.. 2,528.00
50.00
400
5.00
6250
27000
A412.50
1,277.29

455.00

140.00

- E.Swivel Stems, High Pressure

W5

26

{60

80

L8 ey

'HLP. Hose Standard 34” X 7/16 Male

70

(% 1275

; oy ..

5.00

$ 300.00

e

24.00

$ 1,920.00

22800

810.00

PN 01 040 051

574

5

$

- 929.88

i 3.99

$.. vew

239.40

..1680.00

14.95 ;

i

$ 1,046,50

27

156

250

i

b 702.00

875.00

HP 32 OR HP 36 3

26.75

8

2,140.00

2,084.60

390.00

80501 8

28

EDust Cover, Scuba Pro

:Reg Second Stage Hose 127, 147 Male

70

$ 2200

450

27.00

$ 1,890.00

1,470.00

N/A

30

S |

Co2 Cartridge, | Box (X20)

#626680

3

90 ¢ Each

15000

$ 5,250.00

1050

$ 945.00

,._.
~J
by
e
o

5]

6,125.00 -
T RSCUB A PRO PN # 25

630.00

SIZE

780.00

350 102

31

Alr'? Adapter, Scuba Pro, # 21-080-"
1626

37 Eaph

i $ 7.50

$ 1875

19.00 i

{

b 703.00

32

Regulator hose, yellow, 60 ft. x 3/8”

34

$ 77.00

145.00

&2
—
o
o
<
@

684.50

$ 493000

“3
~J
&«
@
=
o

2,584.00

N/A

33

34

éBurst Disk Assemb'ly', Sheerwood #1-
:4000-120-48

7 Tank Valves, Sheerwood, K-Valve |

‘with “O-Ring”

Each

i

: Each

$ 490

16.00

3 100.00

$ 3700

49.00

$ 2,058.00

'S 3600 S

_450(%

45.00

1,512.00

5000K-48 b}

4500 S

1,890.00

TOTAL-GROUP 1) — Items (1-34)

$ 8625775

3

71,565.25

$—44.35539-

RESPONSIVE /NON-RESPONSIVE VENDORS:

RANKING:

Pursuant to Section 2.4 to be considered for award of a group, the Bidder shall

offer prices for all items within a given group.

SECONDARY

RESPONSIVE VENDOR

LP10% + LH 5% 5

10,734.79

BAFO Range : $71,565.25 - $82,300.04

PRIMARY

RESPONSIVE VENDOR

NON-RESPONSIVE VENDOR:
Per Eduardo Gonzalez (CAQ) email dated 10/24/13
No Formal Legal Opinion less than $1,000,000.00
No bid on line items 4,28 & 32
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VENDOR NAME: AUSTIN'S DIVING CENTER OCEAN HUNTERS INC. TARPOON LAGOON
ESTIMATED JCURRENT ¢ UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM PRODUCT DESCRIPTION QUANTITY PRICES EQUAL PRODUCT . PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PROGUCT PRICE TOTAL EQUAL PRODUCT PRICE TOTAL

Note: "Equal Products” listed were approved by client departments (unless otherwise indicated [see Group 7 were not approved by user department])
* Ocean hunters claimed Local preference and Locally-Headquartered but did not meet the requirements as the firm did not have a Local Business Tax receipt for one year prior to bid submittal.
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