

TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 8803-1/21
 Summary Description: AUTOMOTIVE EXTERIOR AND INTERIOR RECONDITIONING AND REPAIR OR REPLACEMENT OF VEHICLE INTERIOR
 Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: Wednesday, 12 / 29 / 2011 @ 2:00 P.M.
 Prepared by: Bright Egbo
 Verified by: Martha Garololo

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow (and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary) - for Groups A & B

Vendor Name:		ADVANCED BODY & FRAME (GROUP C) SPOT MARKET	AUTO COLOR & COLLISION REPAIR, INC (GROUP C) SPOT MARKET	FINE TOUCH DETAILING & CLEANING SERVICES, INC. (GROUP C) SPOT MARKET	JUST RIGHT CAR WASH LLC (GROUP A-B-C)	SPEEDY TUNE-UP'S (GROUP A-B-C)
Vendor FEIN:		650993249-01	010617664	412154827	141990546	770692325
ADPICS Address:		3041 E 10 AVE, HIALEAH, FL 33013	18190 SOUTH DIXIE HWY, MIAMI, FL 33157	PO BOX 421803 MIAMI, FL 33242	853 NW 43 STREET MIAMI, FL 33127	130 NW 22 AVENUE MIAMI, FL 33125
SUNBIZ Address:		SAME	SAME	2801 NW 87 STREET MIAMI, FL 33147	2021 NW 2 AVENUE MIAMI, FL 33127	SAME
Is this Bid Responsive (If no, state reason):		YES	YES	NO	YES	YES
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/No):		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Contact Phone Number:		305-694-9560	786-249-0011	786-262-9990	786-709-3019	305-644-4409
Conviction Disclosure (Yes/No):		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
Were all Affidavits Completed:		YES	YES	NO - missing affidavit page 3 of 4	YES	YES
Were all Affidavits Submitted:		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Contact Fax Number:		305-694-9569	786-249-0013	305-769-9970	305-572-0706	305-644-5644
Incumbent Vendor (Yes/No):		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
Registered Vendor (Yes/No):		9/17/2009	3/26/2009	12/18/2008	6/11/2010	7/28/2009
Indicate SBE Certification:		NO	NO	NO	NO	YES
Contact Email:		afont27936@aol.com	autocolorcollision@gmail.com	finetouchcleaningservices@hotmail.com	info@justrightcarwash.com	speedytuneups@yahoo.com
Insurance Certificate:		NO	YES	YES	YES	YES
Collusion Affidavits:		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
Contact Person:		ALBERT FONT	ZOBEIDA R. CARRICABURU	MARVIN LOGUE	ABDY J. HOPKINS	ELIZABETH S. CORDERO

NOTE: THE SERVICES SHALL BE RENDERED AT COUNT FACILITY (IES)		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Item No.	Estimated Qty.	Description										
1	500	Exterior: On-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with One (1) Row of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$184.95	\$92,475.00	\$175.00	\$87,500.00	\$30.00	15,000.00	42.00	21,000.00
2	500	Interior: On-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with One (1) Row of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$47.00	\$23,500.00	\$575.00	\$287,500.00	\$25.00	12,500.00	42.00	21,000.00
3	307	Exterior: On-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with Two (2) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$201.90	\$61,983.30	\$175.00	\$53,725.00	\$30.00	9,210.00	62.00	19,034.00
4	307	Interior: On-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with Two (2) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$50.00	\$15,350.00	\$675.00	\$207,225.00	\$30.00	9,210.00	62.00	19,034.00
5	220	Exterior: On-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with Three (3) or Four (4) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$235.00	\$51,700.00	\$175.00	\$38,500.00	\$40.00	8,800.00	100.00	22,000.00
6	220	Interior: On-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with Three (3) or Four (4) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$60.00	\$13,200.00	\$675.00	\$148,500.00	\$35.00	7,700.00	120.00	26,400.00
7	375	Interior Refurbishment of vehicles (various vehicle types)	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$300.00	\$112,500.00	\$900.00	337,500.00	100.00	37,500.00
AGGREGATE TOTAL FOR GROUP (A) ITEMS 1-7				\$0.00	Total (A) items 1-7		Total (A) items 1-7	\$935,450.00	Total (A) items 1-7	\$399,920.00	Total (A) items 1-7	\$165,968.00

NOTE: THE SERVICES SHALL BE RENDERED AT THE VENDOR'S FACILITY		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
Item No.	Est. Qty.	Description										
1	500	Exterior: Off-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with One (1) Row of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$184.95	92,475.00	\$150.00	75,000.00	\$25.00	12,500.00	38.00	19,000.00
2	500	Interior: Off-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with One (1) Row of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$47.00	23,500.00	\$650.00	325,000.00	\$20.00	10,000.00	38.00	19,000.00
3	307	Exterior: Off-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with Two (2) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$201.90	61,983.30	\$150.00	46,050.00	\$25.00	7,675.00	58.00	17,806.00
4	307	Interior: Off-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with Two (2) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$50.00	15,350.00	\$650.00	199,550.00	\$25.00	7,675.00	58.00	17,806.00
5	220	Exterior: Off-site Wash, Clean, Buff and Wax Vehicles with Three (3) or Four (4) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$235.00	51,700.00	\$150.00	33,000.00	\$35.00	7,700.00	95.00	20,900.00
6	220	Interior: Off-site Reconditioning service, for Vehicles with Three (3) or Four (4) Rows of Seats, as per Section 3, entitled "Technical Specifications".	NO BID	\$0.00	\$60.00	13,200.00	\$650.00	143,000.00	\$30.00	6,600.00	115.00	25,300.00
7	375	Interior Refurbishment of vehicles (various vehicle types)	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$300.00	112,500.00	\$900.00	337,500.00	100.00	37,500.00
AGGREGATE TOTAL FOR GROUP (B) ITEMS 1-7				\$0.00	Total (B) items 1-7		Total (B) items 1-7	934,100.00	Total (B) items 1-7	\$389,650.00	Total (B) items 1-7	\$157,312.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP A & B				\$0.00	Total (A) and (B)		Total (A) and (B)	1,869,550.00	Total (A) and (B)	\$789,570.00	Total (A) and (B)	\$323,280.00

GROUP - C		GROUP - C	GROUP - C	GROUP - C	GROUP - C	GROUP - C						
2.6	Pre-Qualification of Vendors for Subsequent Spot Market Purchases (Vehicle Interior Repair and Refurbishment Services).	Pre-Qualification Requirements Met?	Pre-Qualification Requirements Met?	Pre-Qualification Requirements Met?	Pre-Qualification Requirements Met?	Pre-Qualification Requirements Met?						
ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION.		ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION.		ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION.		ARTICLES OF INCORPORATION.						
Articles of Inc. #: P00000030459		Articles of Inc. #: P02000024659		Articles of Inc. #: P10000080546		Articles of Inc. #: L07000017690						
Date Filed: 3/24/2000		Date Filed: 3/5/2002		Date Filed: 10/1/2010		Date Filed: 2/15/2007						
THREE (3) REFERENCES		THREE (3) REFERENCES		THREE (3) REFERENCES		THREE (3) REFERENCES						
1.	Company Name:	Contact Person:	Phone	Company Name:	Contact	Phone Number:	Company Name:	Contact	Phone Number:	Company Name:	Contact	Phone Number:
2.												
3.												
FAX & E-MAIL ADDRESS		FAX & E-MAIL ADDRESS		FAX & E-MAIL ADDRESS		FAX & E-MAIL ADDRESS						
Fax #: 305-694-9569		Fax #: 786-249-0013		Fax #: 305-769-9970		Fax #: 305-572-0706						
E-mail: afont27936@aol.com		E-mail: autocolorcollision@gmail.com		E-mail: finetouchcleaningservices@hotmail.com		E-mail: info@justrightcarwash.com						
LOCAL BUSINESS TAX CERTIFICATE		LOCAL BUSINESS TAX CERTIFICATE		LOCAL BUSINESS TAX CERTIFICATE		LOCAL BUSINESS TAX CERTIFICATE						
CERTIFICATE NUMBER		CERTIFICATE NUMBER		CERTIFICATE NUMBER		CERTIFICATE NUMBER						
430949-8		492438-8		481899-4		654703-9						
626134-1												

SAVINGS INFORMATION

VENDOR	GROUP	ITEM(S)	ORIGINAL BID	ITEMS	AWARD ITEM BY ITEM
JUST RIGHT CAR WASH LLC	A	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7	\$399,920.00	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6	\$62,420.00
	B	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7	\$389,650.00	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6	\$52,150.00
	Total	Total items 1-7	\$789,570.00	Total Items 1-6	\$114,570.00
SPEEDY TUNE-UPS	A	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7	\$165,968.00	7	\$37,500.00
	B	1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7	\$157,312.00	7	\$37,500.00
	Total	Total items 1-7	\$323,280.00	Total Item 7	\$75,000.00
Total in the aggregate			\$1,112,850.00		
Total Contract Value by Line Item					\$189,570.00

Comments: the following bidders were contacted to verify the bidding structured used and if they fully understood the contract terms and conditions:

- 1) Auto Color & Collision Repair Inc. = several attempts via phone and email to bidder with negatives results.
- 2) Advanced Body & Frame = Spoke with Mr. Font he understands the terms and conditions of this contract want to participate in Group (C) only spot market purchase;
- 3) Fine Touch Cleaning = The bidder responded stating they fully understood the terms and conditions and they bid based on material, time and manpower
- 4) Just Right LLC = The bidder responded stating they fully understood the terms and conditions. the bidder calculated the base price minus a 50% percent discount offered to Miami Dade County
- 5) Speedy Tune-Ups = The bidder responded stating they fully understood the terms and conditions, they estimated the cost by the amount of seating rows per vehicle. This vendor did not submit a completed affidavit page 3 of 4 therefore, they are not being recommended for award

Copies of the email for each of the bidders who responded are in the bid document file

None of the bidder have any violations / all are in compliance

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)