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TALLY SHEET
Solicitation Number: 9044-0/18

Title: Accessibility Products

Opening/Closing Day: Wednesday, May 29, 2013

Propared by: Blight W. Egbor" .

N3
Verified by: C. Thame/Caroline Burgos

Vendor Name: American Safety Utll, Corp
Vendor FEIN: 561336204 - 01
Sun Biz Address:] 2000 Gresnleaf St. #3, Evanston, IL 60202 | 529 Caleb RD. Shelby, NC 26151
Is this Bid Responsive (If no, state reason): Yos { '
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/MNo): No No
Conviction Disclosure Check-Marked? (Yes/No): No No
Woere all Affidavits Completed: Yos No
Woaere all Affidavits Submlited: Yes No
Incumbent Vendor (Yes/No); Yes No
Raglstersd Vendor (Yes/No): Yes Yes
Indicate SBD Certification; No No
Five Yrs,
item | Est. Qty. Description Modsl No.| Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price
1 1 | Each |Portable electronic wireless communication system. BC BASIC $540.00 $549.00 NO BID
Inclusion Solutions Part No. BCBASIC, or approved aqual.
2 1 | Each |Portable woven plastic mat. Inclusion Solutions Part No. AM27 $1,735.00 $1,735.00 NOBID
AM27, or approved equal. )
3 1 | Each |One (1) inch aluminum threshold ramp with non-skid TR10 $37.47 $37.47 NO BID
surface. Inclusion Solutions Part No. TR10, or approved
equal,
4 50 { Each |One point five (1.5} inch alumlnum threshold ramp with non-| TR15 §48.77 $2,438.50 NOQ BID
skld surface. Inclusion Solutions Part No. TR15, or
approved equal,
5 1 | Each |Two (2} inch Aluminum threshold ramp with nen-skid TR20 $62.47 $62.47 NO BID
surface. Inclusion Solutions Part No. TR20, or approved
aqual. :
6 1 | Each |Two {2) inch rubber threshold ramp. Inclusion Solutions TWRW2 $147.47 $147.47 NOQ BID
Pari TWRW?2, or approved equal.
7 1 | Each {Thres (3) foot long by thirty-six (36) inches wide portable PR3N $318.77 $318.77 NO BID
pathway ramp without handrails. Inclusion Solutions Part
No. PR3N, or approved equal. .
8 1 | Each |Four (4) feet portable pathway ramp without handralls, PR4N $347 .47 $347.47 NO BID
Inclusion Solutions Part No. PR4N, or approved equal. -}
9 50 | Each [Five (5) fest portable pathway ramp without handrails. PR5N $349.47 $17,473.50 NG BID
* |Inclusion Solutions Part No. PR8N, or approved equal.
10 1 | Each |Self-contained durable plastic suitcase voting booth. M2A $188.47 $186.47 NOC BID
Incluston Solutions Part No, M2A, or approved equal.
11 30 | Each {Tralning video on how to assist disabled voters at polling VIDTRA $125.00 $3,750.00 NO BID
place. Inclusion Solutions Part No, VIDTRA, or approved
equal.
i2 | 200 Each |Twelve (12) inch Orange Traffic Cone. Inclusion Solutlons | 12PVC-F $4.98 $996.00 NC BID
Part No. 12PVC-F, or approved equal. .
13 50 | Each |Parking slgn which reads *“Voter Parking” in letters and 517 $17.00 §850.00 NO BID
shows disabled wheslchalr symbol. Inclusion Solutlons Part
No. 817, or approved equal. .
14 1 | Each [Two {2) sided slgn which reads "Altermate Entrance”, with 890 $25.85 $25.85 NO BID
left and right arrow to accessible entrance with disabled
wheselchair symbol. Incluslon Solutions Part No, 90, or
approved equal. i _
15 50 | Each |Welghtaed post and base for slgn with a fixed height of thirty- P02 $26.85 $1,292.50 _NO BID
two (32} inches (without sign). Inclusion
Solutions Part No. P02, or approved equal.
16 1 | Each |Three (3) inch button which reads "Nead Assistance? ASBU $0.38 $0.38 NO BID
Piease ask me" and shows handlcap logo. Inclusion
Solutions Part No. ASBU, or approved equal.
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Vendor Name: American Safety Util. Corp
Vendor FEINY . 561336204 - 01
Sun Biz Addressy 2000 Greenleaf St. #3, Evanston, IL. 60202 | 528 Caleb RD. Shelby, NC 28151
Is this Bid Responsive {If no, state reason): Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/No): No No
Conviction Disclosure Check-Marked? (Yes/No): No No
Were all Affidavits Completed; Yos No
Were all Affidavits Submitted: Yes No
Incumbent Vendor {Yes/No); Yes No
Reglstered Vendor (Yes/No): Yes Yos
Indicate SBD Certlfication; No No
Five Yrs.
ltem | Est. Qty. Dascription Model No.| Unit Price| Total Price Unit Price
17 60 | Each | Frame signs, durable opan-piece upright sign are sus2 $89.27 $4,463.50 NO BID
wealtherproof. Inclusion Solutions Part No, S8US2, or
approved equal.
18 80 | Each |Distance measuring wheel, Inclusion Solutions Parf No. ADSO1 $57.47 $4,597.60 NO BID
ADS01, or approved aqual, :
19 1 | Each |Deluxe Survey Tools Kit. Inclusion Solutions Part No. MKDBLX $249.00 $249.00 NO BID
MKDLX, or approved equal.
20 10 | Each |Portable doorbsl! alert system. Inclusion BCMAX $599.00 $5,990.00 NO BID
Solutions Part No. BCMax, or approved agual.
21 20 | Each |Six {8) foot suitcase ramp with handles and seif adjusting SR8 $294.00 $5,880.00 NO BID
bottom transition plate. Inclusion Solutions Part No, SR6, or
approved equal.
22 2 | Each |Twenty-four (24) foot hard polysthylene mal. Inclusion VM3824 $897.00 $1,794.00 NO BID
Solutions Part No. VM3824, or approved equal. :
23 2 | Each |Polling place survey training video, Inclusion Solutions Part | VIDSUR $199.00 $398.00 NO BID
Ne. VIDSUR, or approved equal,
24 30 | Each |Disability awareness kit. Inclusion Solutions Part No. DISTRAINK $249.95 $7,498.50 NO BID
DISTRAINKIT, or appraoved equal. IT
25 10 | Each |Lite ramp with one point five (1,5) rise. In¢lusion Solutions | LR15LITE | $1,287.00 $12,870.00 NOBID
Part No. LR15LITE, or approved equal.
26 10 | Each fRamp with thres (3} inch rise. Inclusion Solutionis Part Na. LR3 $1,987.00 $19,870.00 NO BID
LR3, or approved equal.
27 20 | Each {Six (6) Inch Curb cut ramp. lnglustlon Solutions Part No. CCs $3,337.00 $66,740.00 NO BID
CCs8, or approved aqual.
Total $160,561.45
Note: Contracting Officer attempted to negotiate with Bidder, and Bldder stated that they cannct reduce their prices at this time.
Note: See ailached ADA requirement received from Bidder.
Note: Vendor Officlal name is Inclusion Solutions, LLC (see attached),
ol o




Thame, Connie {(ISD)

* From: Hollister Bundy <hbundy@inclusionsolutions.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2013 1:53 PM
To: Thame, Connie (ISD}
Cc: Clerk of the Beard (COC); 'Sheila Kamingki'; ‘Clark Fetridge’
Subject: RE: 9044-0/18- Accessibility Products.

Inclusion Solutions, LLC is the official name.

We sometimes use “Inclusion Solutions™ or “IS Elections by Inclusion Solutions” at conferences and on marketing materials.

Thank you.
HB

From: Thame, Connie (ISD) [mailto:CTHAME@miamidade.gov]
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2013 12:10 PM

To: ‘hbundy@inclusionsolutions.com’

Cc: Clerk of the Board (COC)

Subject: 9044-0/18- Accessibility Products.

Good Afternoon Mr. Bundy:
PMSD need to know what is correct name of your company.

_ub_s_bmwo V5.1 MIAMI-DADE COUNTY 5.1 ONLINE FAMIS SYSTEM  05/30/2013
LINK TO: VENDOR MAIL CODE 1.06 PM

VENDOR NUMBER: 364402376 [INCLUSION SOLUTIONS LLC

VENDOR SUFFIX: 01 CREATE DATE: 07/13/2005

MAILCODE :PO PURCHASE ORDER CREATED BY : HVICKI

HEADER STATUS: A DETAILSTATUS: A DPM REGISTER: A UPDATE DATE: 05/02/2011
ATTNLINEL : ~ UPDATED BY : HVICKI £

ATTN LINE2 :

ATTN LINE3 :SUITE3
STREET  : 2000 W GREENLEAF ST

cy : EVANSTON STATE: IL ZIP: 60202
COUNTRY :US UNITED STATES
REGION LAST BID

_.COUNTY : LASTPO :05/21/2013



KD

CONTACT NAME : HOLLISTER BUNDY

E-MAIL - : HBUNDY@INCLUSIONSOLUTIONS.COM

PHONE : 847 869-2500 FED TAX/SSN: 364402376
FAX 1 847 869-2515 FED TAX IND: F

TOLLFREE : 866 232-5487

F1-HELP  F2-SELECT FA-PRIOR F5-NEXT  F6-HEADER

F7-DETAIL F9-LINK
G014 - RECORD FOUND

Constance Thame, CPPB
Procurement Contracting Officer |
Internal Services Department
Procurement Management

111 NW 1st Street, Suite 1300
Miami, Florida 33128

Phone: 305-375-1078

Fax: 305-375-1083
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