TALLY SHEET

SPOT MARK QUOTES: JUNE 14, 2013 THROUGH DECEMBER 14, 2013

Solicitation Number:
Summary Description:
Spot Market Quotes Openi
Prepared by: R.Campbell
Verified by: Sherry Stk

Inais:: whaniali pricss areiattered

/ HaRTghlowipriced vendorin yellow (and it applicable,green for secondary, blue-for festiary™ L "t ie 1

g2
Award Pins and Fdentification Naneplates
Wednesday, May 15, 2013

Vendor Name:

Vendor Fein:

Is the Quote Responsive {If no, state reason):
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/No):

Conviction Disclosure (Yes/No):

Were All Affidavits Comleted:

Were All Affidavits Submitted:

Indicate DBD Certification:

Registered Vendor (Yes / No):

Local Vendor (Yes / No, If Yes, Indicate County):

janfi-Rovin Co.

\/.H. Blackinton & Co., Inc.
042547781 01

No
No
No
Yes
Yes
No
Yes
No

Hems being procured per current solicilation

item No. |Est. Quantity

Description

GROUP_1.- EMPLOYEE'S AWARD PINS

Previous Unit Price
For Six Months

otal for Six Months

Current Unit Price
for Six Months

Total for Six Months
06/14/13-12/14/2013

06/14113-12/14/2013

5 - Year Sterling Silver two-piece award Lapel
Pin with no gemstones (with attachable chain
and bar). Crest of pin has flat black finish in
background

1 1,400

7.00

NQ BID

NO BID

10 - Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award
Lapel Pin with one (1) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic
Aguamarine stone affixed to Lapel Pin (with
attachable chain and bar). Crest of pin has flat
hlack finish in hackground.

1,000

8.00

- 11:200.00

15 - Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award
Lape! Pin with two (2) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic
Aquamarine stones affixed to Lapel Pin {with
attachable chain and bar). Crest of pin has flat
black finish in background.

3 1,000

10.00

NO BID

NO BID

500000

20 - Year 1/10 10K Gold Filled two-piece service
award Lapel Pin with three (3} 8ss (2.25mm)
synthetic Ruby stones affixed to Lapel Pin {with
attachable chain and bar).

800

20.50

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NG BID

25 - Year 10K Yellow Plum Gold two-piece
service award Lapel Pin with one (1) 8ss
(2.25mm} Emerald stone affixed to Lapel Pin
(with attachable chain and bar).

500

108.50

- 17,6000

- 57500.00

NO BID

NO BID

30 - Year 10K Yellow Plum Gold two-piece
service award Lapel Pin with one (1)} 5-point (.05
carat) full-cut Diamond affixed to Lapel Pin (with
attachable chain and bar).

300

146.50

NQO BID

NO BID

Total ltems 1 through 6:

300.50

45,6000

NO BID

NO BID

. 152,400.00

GROUP 2 - EMPLOYEE'S NAMEPLATES

Solid brass name bars, as per bid specification,

1200 including "MIA" Logo

4.50

NOC BID

NO BID

Engraving of Employee's Name, color filled in
black enamel {Done One By One)
Minimum Order Each:

1,200

NO CHARGE

NO CHARGE

Total items 7 through 8:

2.50

7.00 1§

3,000.00
8,400.00

NQ BID

NO BID




