

TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 9719-0/18

Summary Description: 12 Roll Offs Trucks

Solicitation Opening/Closing Date: January 30, 2013

Prepared by: Lourdes Betancourt

Verified by: Jesus Lee 

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow)

Firm Name			Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc.	TP Investment Group, LLC dba Condor of South FL	Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc, dba Palmetto Truck Center	Mullinax Ford of West Palm Bch				
FEIN & ADPIC's Suffix No.			591934827 / 02	204562303 / 02	650736564 / 02	261538703				
Contact Person on ITB			David Weiger	Robert Todd Hays	David Yglesias	R. A. Wilkinson				
Completed Section 4:			Yes	Yes	Yes					
Incumbent Vendor (yes/no):			N/A	N/A	N/A					
Registered Vendor (yes/no):			Yes	Yes	Yes	No				
Certified SBE Firm:			No	No	No					
Local Vendor Affirmed (yes/no):			Yes	Yes	Yes					
Locally Headquartered Affirmed (yes/no):			Yes	No	Yes					
FL Corp. (SunBiz) Status:			Yes	Yes	Yes					
Affidavits Completed (yes/no):			Yes	w/o Collusion	w/o Collusion					
SBD History of Violations:			No	No	No					
BTS Non-Performance:			No	No	No					
Acknowledgement of 6 Addenda received (yes/no):			Yes	Yes	Yes (INT #5)					
Complied with Affirmative Action Plan (AAP) (yes/no):			Yes	Yes	Yes					
Delivery time after receipt of order (not to exceed 270 days)			Delivery: 200-270 days	Delivery: 210-270 days	Delivery: 270 days					
Truck A: Cable Hoist			Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price
Item No.	Description	EST QTY								
1	Purchase of Model Year 2013 Tilt Frame Roll Off Truck	3	\$180,258.00	\$540,774.00	\$201,055.00	\$603,165.00	\$206,754.35	\$620,263.05	NO BID	NO BID
Total				\$540,774.00	Total	\$603,165.00	Total	\$620,263.05	Total	
Truck B: Hook Arm Lift			Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price	Unit Price Per Truck	Extended Price
Item No.	Description	EST QTY								
2	Purchase of Model Year 2013 Tilt Frame Roll Off Truck	9	\$194,118.00	\$1,747,062.00	\$214,650.00	\$1,931,850.00	\$221,688.91	\$1,995,200.19	NO BID	NO BID
Total				\$1,747,062.00	Total	\$1,931,850.00	Total	\$1,995,200.19	Total	
Same Check List Requirements for Truck A and Truck B			Yes	Yes	Yes					
1	Attach truck manufacturer, fabricator, or approved dealer documentation (per Section 2.6.1)		Yes	Yes	Yes					
2	Local Service Facility in Miami-Dade or Broward County (per Section 2.6.2)		Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. 2441 S. State Rd 7, Ft Lauderdale, FL 33317	Kenworth of South Florida 2909 S. Andrews Avenue Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33316	Palmetto Ford Truck Sales, Inc. 7245 NW 36th St. Miami, FL					
3	Attach license in accordance with Chapter 320 of the Florida Statutes, SS320.27 (per Section 2.6.3)		Yes, expires 2015	N/A	N/A					

4	Attach Dimensional Drawing Chart showing the dimensions of the projected build as well as weight charts showing the weight distribution of the vehicle both loaded and unloaded and wall to wall and curb to curb turning circle charts for the truck proposed using a standard manufacturer's front bumper.	Yes	Yes	Yes	
5	Is skid plate is available directly from truck's manufacturer?	Yes	Yes	Yes	
6	If skid plate is not available directly from the truck's manufacturer, the Bidder shall provide details and drawings of the proposed local installation (See Section 3.7)	N/A			
7	When an equal product is bid, the Bidder shall furnish the factory information sheets (specifications, brochures, etc.) that show the product meets or exceeds the required specifications. Manufacturer's standard information sheets, catalogues, brochures and all supporting documentation submitted must show the product meets or exceeds the required specifications Bids that are submitted with standard product literature which offer technical data or product descriptions indicating the item or product bid does not meet the required specifications must be accompanied by a letter, on the Bidder's company stationary, identifying those differences and describing how compliance with the required specifications is to be accomplished.	Yes	Yes	N/A	

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)