
 

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 
PURCHASING DIVISION 

1 
AWARD SHEET.doc 

Revised 09/19/00 

 

CONTRACT AWARD SHEET 

INTERNAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT SERVICES 

 

BPO NO.: ABCW1401048 
 
BID NO.: FB-00091      Previous Bid No.: 8832-4/13-4  
 
TITLE: CARBONLESS FANAPART FORMS 
 
COMMODITY CODE NO.: 966-12  OTR YEARS: N/A LIVING WAGE APPLIES: 
          YES     NO 

 
 
CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2014 through OCTOBER 31, 2019 
 
AWARD BASED ON MEASURES:   YES    NO  PCO 1: SHERRY Y. CROCKETT  
        PHONE: 305-375-4693 
 

  SBE Set Aside 
  SBE Goal 
  Local Preference 
  Prevailing Wages (Reso. 90-143) 
  Living Wage  

  Bid Preference:    SBE     Micro SBE 
  CSBE Level 

 

  
 

PART #1:  VENDOR AWARDED 

 
F.E.I.N.: 650080751 01 
VENDOR: TIGER BUSINESS FORMS, INC. 
STREET: 7765 WEST 20TH AVENUE 
CITY/STATE/ZIP: HIALEAH, FLORIDA 33014 
F.O.B. TERMS: DESTINATION 
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 15 
DELIVERY: AS REQUIRED 
TOLL FREE PHONE # NONE 
PHONE: (305) 888-3528 
FAX: (305) 887-1970 
E-MAIL: MIKE@TIGERFORMS.COM  
CONTACT PERSON: MIKE PINA 

 

PART #2:  ITEMS AWARDED 

 
SEE ATTACHMENT 
 
 
 

 

mailto:MIKE@TIGERFORMS.COM
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PART #3:  AWARD INFORMATION 

 
  BCC     DPM AWARD DATE: 9/30/14  AGENDA ITEM #: N/A 

 
PURCHASING DIVISION RELEASE DATE: 9/30/14  OTR YEAR: NONE 
 
ADDITIONAL ITEMS ALLOWED: PURCHASE OF OTHER ITEMS NOT LISTED WITHIN THIS 
SOLICITTION BASED ON PRICE QUOTES 
 
SPECIAL CONDITIONS: NONE 
 
TOTAL CONTRACT VALUE: $515,000 
 
 

USER DEPARTMENT(S) DOLLAR ALLOCATED 
 
CLERK OF COURTS       $500,000 
PUBIC WORKS AND WASTE MANAGEMENT   $  15,000 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 
AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 1 
FORM SIZE:  4-1/2” X 5-1/2” Quantity Unit Price 

Per 1,000  

1.A.1 2 -Part 1,000 $45.00 

1.A.2 2 -Part 2,000 $40.00 

1.A.3 2 -Part 3,000 $33.00 

1.A.4 2 -Part 4,000 $30.00 

1.A.5 2 -Part 5,000 $25.00 

1.A.6 2 -Part 10,000 $19.00 

1.A.7 2 -Part 20,000 $17.00 

1.A.8 2 -Part 25,000 $15.00 

    
 

  

1.B.1 3-Part 1,000 $70.00 

1.B.2 3-Part 2,000 $49.00 

1.B.3 3-Part 3,000 $40.00 

1.B.4 3-Part 4,000 $38.00 

1.B.5 3-Part 5,000 $33.00 

1.B.6 3-Part 10,000 $27.00 

1.B.7 3-Part 20,000 $23.00 

1.B.8 3-Part 25,000 $22.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS’ 

ITEMS AWARDED 

1.C.1 4-Part 1,000 $65.00 

1.C.2 4-Part 2,000 $55.00 

1.C.3 4-Part 3,000 $48.00 

1.C.4 4-Part 4,000 $44.00 

1.C.5 4-Part 5,000 $40.00 

1.C.6 4-Part 10,000 $34.00 

1.C.7 4-Part 20,000 $31.00 

1.C.8 4-Part 25,000 $28.00 

        

1.D.1 5-Part 1,000 $85.00 

1.D.2 5-Part 2,000 $64.00 

1.D.3 5-Part 3,000 $56.00 

1.D.4 5-Part 4,000 $51.00 

1.D.5 5-Part 5,000 $48.00 

1.D.6 5-Part 10,000 $41.00 

1.D.7 5-Part 20,000 $38.00 

1.D.8 5-Part 25,000 $34.00 
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TIGER  BUSINESS FORMS 
PARTS AWARDED 

ITEM 2 
FORM SIZE:  5-1/2” X 8-1/2” 

Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

2.A.1 2-Part 1,000 $70.00 

2.A.2 2-Part 2,000 $50.00 

2.A.3 2-Part 3,000 $43.00 

2.A.4 2-Part 4,000 $40.00 

2.A.5 2-Part 5,000 $36.00 

2.A.6 2-Part 10,000 $30.00 

2.A.7 2-Part 20,000 $27.00 

2.A.8 2-Part 25,000 $25.00 

        

2.B.1 3-Part 1,000 $84.00 

2.B.2 3-Part 2,000 $60.00 

2.B.3 3-Part 3,000 $51.00 

2.B.4 3-Part 4,000 $47.00 

2.B.5 3-Part 5,000 $43.00 

2.B.6 3-Part 10,000 $37.00 

2.B.7 3-Part 20,000 $33.00 

2.B.8 3-Part 25,000 $32.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

2.C.1 4-Part 1,000 $99.00 

2.C.2 4-Part 2,000 $78.00 

2.C.3 4-Part 3,000 $70.00 

2.C.4 4-Part 4,000 $66.00 

2.C.5 4-Part 5,000 $62.00 

2.C.6 4-Part 10,000 $52.00 

2.C.7 4-Part 20,000 $49.00 

2.C.8 4-Part 25,000 $48.00 

        

2.D.1 5-Part 1,000 $110.00 

2.D.2 5-Part 2,000 $85.00 

2.D.3 5-Part 3,000 $78.00 

2.D.4 5-Part 4,000 $73.00 

2.D.5 5-Part 5,000 $69.00 

2.D.6 5-Part 10,000 $57.00 

2.D.7 5-Part 20,000 $56.00 

2.D.8 5-Part 25,000 $55.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 3 
FORM SIZE:  8-1/2” X 7” 

Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

3.A.1 2-Part 1,000 $80.00 

3.A.2 2-Part 2,000 $58.00 

3.A.3 2-Part 3,000 $44.00 

3.A.4 2-Part 4,000 $41.00 

3.A.5 2-Part 5,000 $37.00 

3.A.6 2-Part 10,000 $29.50 

3.A.7 2-Part 20,000 $28.00 

3.A.8 2-Part 25,000 $26.00 

        

3.B.1 3-Part 1,000 $110.00 

3.B.2 3-Part 2,000 $83.00 

3.B.3 3-Part 3,000 $68.00 

3.B.4 3-Part 4,000 $64.00 

3.B.5 3-Part 5,000 $59.00 

3.B.6 3-Part 10,000 $50.00 

3.B.7 3-Part 20,000 $48.00 

3.B.8 3-Part 25,000 $46.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

3.C.1 4-Part 1,000 $130.00 

3.C.2 4-Part 2,000 $108.00 

3.C.3 4-Part 3,000 $93.00 

3.C.4 4-Part 4,000 $86.00 

3.C.5 4-Part 5,000 $79.00 

3.C.6 4-Part 10,000 $71.00 

3.C.7 4-Part 20,000 $69.00 

3.C.8 4-Part 25,000 $68.00 

        

3.D.1 5-Part 1,000 $160.00 

3.D.2 5-Part 2,000 $130.00 

3.D.3 5-Part 3,000 $115.00 

3.D.4 5-Part 4,000 $100.00 

3.D.5 5-Part 5,000 $96.00 

3.D.6 5-Part 10,000 $89.00 

3.D.7 5-Part 20,000 $87.00 

3.D.8 5-Part 25,000 $86.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 4 
FORM SIZE:  8-1/2” X 11" 

Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

4.A.1 2-Part 1,000 $98.00 

4.A.2 2-Part 2,000 $74.00 

4.A.3 2-Part 3,000 $65.00 

4.A.4 2-Part 4,000 $61.00 

4.A.5 2-Part 5,000 $57.00 

4.A.6 2-Part 10,000 $49.00 

4.A.7 2-Part 20,000 $46.00 

4.A.8 2-Part 25,000 $45.00 

        

4.B.1 3-Part 1,000 $120.00 

4.B.2 3-Part 2,000 $98.00 

4.B.3 3-Part 3,000 $89.00 

4.B.4 3-Part 4,000 $84.00 

4.B.5 3-Part 5,000 $78.00 

4.B.6 3-Part 10,000 $70.00 

4.B.7 3-Part 20,000 $68.00 

4.B.8 3-Part 25,000 $66.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

4.C1 4-Part 1,000 $150.00 

4.C.2 4-Part 2,000 $120.00 

4.C.3 4-Part 3,000 $114.00 

4.C.4 4-Part 4,000 $105.00 

4.C.5 4-Part 5,000 $100.00 

4.C.6 4-Part 10,000 $91.00 

4.C.7 4-Part 20,000 $88.00 

4.C.8 4-Part 25,000 $87.00 

        

4.D.1 5-Part 1,000 $175.00 

4.D.2 5-Part 2,000 $145.00 

4.D.3 5-Part 3,000 $139.00 

4.D.4 5-Part 4,000 $130.00 

4.D.5 5-Part 5,000 $120.00 

4.D.6 5-Part 10,000 $110.00 

4.D.7 5-Part 20,000 $109.00 

4.D.8 5-Part 25,000 $105.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 5 
FORM SIZE:  8-1/2” X 14" 

Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

5.A.1 2-Part 1,000 $108.00 

5.A.2 2-Part 2,000 $81.00 

5.A.3 2-Part 3,000 $71.00 

5.A.4 2-Part 4,000 $68.00 

5.A.5 2-Part 5,000 $63.00 

5.A.6 2-Part 10,000 $56.00 

5.A.7 2-Part 20,000 $52.00 

5.A.8 2-Part 25,000 $50.00 

        

5.B.1 3-Part 1,000 $113.00 

5.B.2 3-Part 2,000 $110.00 

5.B.3 3-Part 3,000 $100.00 

5.B.4 3-Part 4,000 $96.00 

5.B.5 3-Part 5,000 $92.00 

5.B.6 3-Part 10,000 $82.00 

5.B.7 3-Part 20,000 $78.00 

5.B.8 3-Part 25,000 $76.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

5.C.1 4-Part 1,000 $165.00 

5.C.2 4-Part 2,000 $137.00 

5.C.3 4-Part 3,000 $125.00 

5.C.4 4-Part 4,000 $123.00 

5.C.5 4-Part 5,000 $121.00 

5.C.6 4-Part 10,000 $105.00 

5.C.7 4-Part 20,000 $102.00 

5.C.8 4-Part 25,000 $100.00 

        

5.D.1 5-Part 1,000 $198.00 

5.D.2 5-Part 2,000 $167.00 

5.D.3 5-Part 3,000 $157.00 

5.D.4 5-Part 4,000 $152.00 

5.D.5 5-Part 5,000 $147.00 

5.D.6 5-Part 10,000 $130.00 

5.D.7 5-Part 20,000 $125.00 

5.D.8 5-Part 25,000 $121.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 6 FORM  SIZE: 4-1/4" X 5-1/2"  Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

6.A.1 1-Part 1,000 $49.00 

6.A.2 1-Part 2,000 $28.00 

6.A.3 1-Part 3,000 $21.00 

6.A.4 1-Part 4,000 $18.00 

6.A.5 1-Part 5,000 $15.00 

6.A.6 1-Part 6,000 $13.00 

6.A.7 1-Part 10,000 $9.00 

6.A.8 1-Part 20,000 $7.00 

6.8.9 1-Part 30,000 $6.00 

6.A.10 1-Part 40,000 $5.00 

        

ITEM 7 FORM SIZE: 5-1/4" X 8-1/2" Quantity 
Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

7.A.1 1-Part 1,000 $53.00 

7.A.2 1-Part 2,000 $32.00 

7.A.3 1-Part 3,000 $24.00 

7.A.4 1-Part 4,000 $21.00 

7.A.5 1-Part 5,000 $18.00 

7.A.6 1-Part 6,000 $16.00 

7.A.7 1-Part 10,000 $12.00 

7.A.8 1-Part 20,000 $8.50 

7.A.9 1-Part 30,000 $8.00 

7.A.10 1-Part 40,000 $7.90 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 8 FORM SIZE: 8-1/2" X 7" Quantity 
 

Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

8.A.1 1-Part 1,000 
 

$40.00 

8.A.2 1-Part 2,000 
 

$28.00 

8.A.3 1-Part 3,000 
 

$26.00 

8.A.4 1-Part 4,000 
 

$24.00 

8.A.5 1-Part 5,000 
 

$20.00 

8.A.6 1-Part 6,000 
 

$19.00 

8.A.7 1-Part 10,000 
 

$14.00 

8.A.8 1-Part 20,000 
 

$12.00 

8.A.9 1-Part 30,000 
 

$10.00 

8.A.10 1-Part 40,000 
 

$9.00 

      
 

  

ITEM 9 FORM SIZE: 8-1/2" X 11" Quantity 
 

Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

9.A.1 1-Part 1,000 
 

$40.00 

9.A.2 1-Part 2,000 
 

$36.00 

9.A.3 1-Part 3,000 
 

$30.00 

9.A.4 1-Part 4,000 
 

$28.00 

9.A.5 1-Part 5,000 
 

$25.00 

9.A.6 1-Part 6,000 
 

$23.00 

9.A.7 1-Part 10,000 
 

$20.00 

9.A.8 1-Part 20,000 
 

$19.00 

9.A.9 1-Part 30,000 
 

$18.50 

9.A.10 1-Part 40,000 
 

$18.00 
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TIGER BUSINESS FORMS 

AWARDED ITEMS 

ITEM 10 FORM SIZE: 8-1/2" X 14" Quantity 
 

Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

10.A.1 1-Part 1,000 
 

$47.00 

10.A.2 1-Part 2,000 
 

$40.00 

10.A.3 1-Part 3,000 
 

$34.00 

10.A.4 1-Part 4,000 
 

$28.00 

10.A.5 1-Part 5,000 
 

$25.00 

10.A.6 1-Part 6,000 
 

$23.00 

10.A.7 1-Part 10,000 
 

$19.00 

10.A.8 1-Part 20,000 
 

$15.50 

10.A.9 1-Part 30,000 
 

$15.00 

10.A.10 1-Part 40,000 
 

$14.90 

      
 

  

ITEM 11 FORM SIZE: 11" X 17" Quantity 
 

Unit Price 
Per 1,000 

11.A.1 1-Part 1,000 
 

$56.00 

11.A.2 1-Part 2,000 
 

$50.00 

11.A.3 1-Part 3,000 
 

$40.00 

11.A.4 1-Part 4,000 
 

$38.00 

11.A.5 1-Part 5,000 
 

$32.00 

11.A.6 1-Part 6,000 
 

$30.00 

11.A.7 1-Part 10,000 
 

$25.00 

11.A.8 1-Part 20,000 
 

$23.00 

11.A.9 1-Part 30,000 
 

$21.00 

11.A.10 1-Part 40,000 
 

$20.50 

 



 

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 
PURCHASING DIVISION 

16 
AWARD SHEET.doc 

Revised 09/19/00 

 

TIGER BUSINESS FORMS, INC. 
OPTIONAL ITEMS 1 THUS 5 

A. VARIOUS PAPER STOCK    

1A 
CF105# TAG CF $20.00 

2A 
CF105# TAG CF $30.00 

3A 
CF105# TAG CF $40.00 

4A 
CF105# TAG CF $50.00 

5A 
CF105# TAG CF $60.00 

  
 

  

1A 
CB White $4.00 

2A 
CB White $5.00 

3A 
CB White $6.00 

4A 
CB White $8.00 

5A 
CB White $10.00 

  
 

  

1A 
CB Color $5.00 

2A 
CB Color $6.00 

3A 
CB Color $7.00 

4A 
CB Color $9.00 

5A 
CB Color $11.00 

      

1A 
CFB White $6.00 

2A 
CFB White $7.00 

3A 
CFB White $8.00 

4A 
CFB White $10.00 

5A 
CFB White $12.00 
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1A 
CFB Color $7.00 

2A 
CFB Color $8.00 

3A 
CFB Color $9.00 

4A 
CFB Color $11.00 

5A 
CFB Color $13.00 

  
 

  

1A 
CF White $2.00 

2A 
CF White $3.00 

3A 
CF White $4.00 

4A 
CF White $6.00 

5A 
CF White $8.00 

      

1A 
CF Color $4.00 

2A 
CF Color $5.00 

3A 
CF Color $6.00 

4A 
CF Color $8.00 

5A 
CF Color $10.00 

      

B 

PRE-COLLATED 
CARBONLESS FORMS   

1B 
NON PRE COLLATED FORMS 
PER PART 

$8.00 

2B 

NON PRE COLLATED FORMS 
PER PART 

$9.00 

3B 

NON PRE COLLATED FORMS 
PER PART 

$10.00 

4B 

NON PRE COLLATED FORMS 
PER PART 

$11.00 

5B 

NON PRE COLLATED FORMS 
PER PART 

$12.00 
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1B 

VARIOUS COLOR INK EA. 
ADD. COLOR 

$20.00 

2B 

VARIOUS COLOR INK EA. 
ADD. COLOR 

$20.00 

3B 
VARIOUS COLOR INK EA. 
ADD. COLOR 

$20.00 

4B 

VARIOUS COLOR INK EA. 
ADD. COLOR 

$20.00 

5B 

VARIOUS COLOR INK EA. 
ADD. COLOR 

$20.00 

      

1B 
PADDING 50 SHEETS PER 
PAD $8.00 

2B 
PADDING 50 SHEETS PER 
PAD $8.00 

3B 
PADDING 50 SHEETS PER 
PAD $8.00 

4B 
PADDING 50 SHEETS PER 
PAD $8.00 

5B 
PADDING 50 SHEETS PER 
PAD $8.00 

      

1B 
PADDING 100 SHETS PER 
PART $5.00 

2B 
PADDING 100 SHETS PER 
PART $5.00 

3B 
PADDING 100 SHETS PER 
PART $5.00 

4B 
PADDING 100 SHETS PER 
PART $5.00 

5B 
PADDING 100 SHETS PER 
PART $5.00 

      

1B 
2 SIDED PRINTING PER PART 

$8.00 

2B 
2 SIDED PRINTING PER PART 

$8.00 

3B 
2 SIDED PRINTING PER PART 

$8.00 

4B 
2 SIDED PRINTING PER PART 

$8.00 

5B 
2 SIDED PRINTING PER PART 

$8.00 
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1B 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

$20.00 

2B 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

$20.00 

3B 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

$20.00 

4B 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

$20.00 

5B 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

$20.00 

      

C 
PUNCHING - ONE (1) TIME 
CHARGE   

1C 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

2C 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

3C 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

4C 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

5C 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

      

1C 
3 OR FOUR ROUND HOLES 

$30.00 

2C 
3 OR FOUR ROUND HOLES 

$30.00 

3C 
3 OR FOUR ROUND HOLES 

$30.00 

4C 
3 OR FOUR ROUND HOLES 

$30.00 

5C 
3 OR FOUR ROUND HOLES 

$30.00 



 

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 
PURCHASING DIVISION 

20 
AWARD SHEET.doc 

Revised 09/19/00 

 

D 
NUMBERING (FOR ITEMS 1-5) 

  

  

ONE CONSECUTIVE NUMBER 
PRINTERIN RED INK OR 
CRASH PRINTED IN THE 
SAME POSITION ON ALL 
PARTS. MISSING NUMBERS 
TO BE LISTED.    SET UP 
CHARGE AND PRICE PER SET 

  

1D 
SERVICE CHARGE AND SET 
UP CHARGE $10.00 

1D PRICE PER SET $15.00 

      

  

TWO NUMBER IN RED OR 
CRASH PRINTED IN THE 
SAME POSITION ON ALL 
PARTS,  SET UP CHARGE 
AND PRICE PER SET   

2D 
SERVICE CHARGE 

$15.00 

2D 
PRICE PER SET 

$18.00 

      

  

GUARANTEED NUMBERING 
CHARGE IN ADDITION TO 
ABOVE. NO MISSING 
NUMBERS. 

  

3D 
SERVICE CHARGE 

$20.00 

3D 
PRICE PER SET 

$20.00 

      

E 
OVERPRINT MARGINAL 
WORDS (RED INK)   

1E 
2-Part $2.00 

2E 
2-Part $2.00 

3E 
2-Part $2.00 

4E 
2-Part $2.00 

5E 
2-Part $2.00 
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1E 
3-Part 

$3.00 

2E 
3-Part 

$3.00 

3E 
3-Part 

$3.00 

4E 
3-Part 

$3.00 

5E 
3-Part 

$3.00 

      

1E 
4-Part 

$4.00 

2E 
4-Part 

$4.00 

3E 
4-Part 

$4.00 

4E 
4-Part 

$4.00 

5E 
4-Part 

$4.00 

      

1E 
5-Part 

$5.00 

2E 
5-Part 

$5.00 

3E 
5-Part 

$5.00 

4E 
5-Part 

$5.00 

5E 
5-Part 

$5.00 

      

F 
OVERPRINTING ITEMS 1 -5 

  

F1 

1 OR 2 LINES (RED OR BLACK 
SCREEN) ADD TO TOTAL OR 
PER SET 

  

F2 

PART TO PART CHANGE ADD 
TO TOTAL OR PER SET 
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OPTIONAL ITEMS 6-11 

  

A 
VARIOUS PAPER STOCK - 
SINGLE PART FORM   

6A 
24#BOND $3.00  

7A 
24#BOND $4.00  

8A 
24#BOND $5.00  

9A 
24#BOND $6.00  

10A 
24#BOND $8.00  

11A 
24#BOND $12.00  

  
PERCENTAGE OF RECYCLE 
CONTENT 10% 

      

6A 
110# INDEX $20.00  

7A 
110# INDEX $24.00  

8A 
110# INDEX $25.00  

9A 
110# INDEX $30.00  

10A 
110# INDEX $35.00  

11A 
110# INDEX $40.00  

  
PERCENTAGE OF RECYLE 
CONTENT 10% 

      

6A 
25% REG. PAPER $15.00  

7A 
25% REG. PAPER $18.00  

8A 
25% REG. PAPER $20.00  

9A 
25% REG. PAPER $30.00  

10A 
25% REG. PAPER $35.00  

11A 
25% REG. PAPER $40.00  

  
PERCENTAGE OF RECYLE 
CONTENT 10% 
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6A 
COLOR PAPER $2.00  

7A 
COLOR PAPER $4.00  

8A 
COLOR PAPER $6.00  

9A 
COLOR PAPER $8.00  

10A 
COLOR PAPER $10.00  

11A 
COLOR PAPER $12.00  

  

PERCENTAGE OF RECYCLE 
CONTENT 10% 

      

B 
2 -SIDED PRINTING 

  

B6 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $8.00  

B7 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $8.00  

B8 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $10.00  

B9 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $10.00  

B10 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $12.00  

B11 
2 -SIDED PRINTING $15.00  

      

C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES 

  

6C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

7C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

8C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

9C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

10C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

11C 
ADDITIONAL PLATES - FLAT 

$20.00 

      

D 
PUNCHING - ONE TIME CHARGE 
FLAT RATE   

D6 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

D7 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 
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D8 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

D9 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

D10 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

D11 
1 OR 2 ROUND HOLES No Bid 

      

D6 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$30.00 

D7 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$30.00 

D8 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$40.00 

D9 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$40.00 

D10 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$45.00 

D11 
3 OR FOUR ROUND  HOLES 

$45.00 

      

  
NUMBERING (FOR ITEMS 6-11) 

  

E 

ONE CONSECUTIVE NUMBER 
PRINTERIN RED INK OR CRASH 
PRINTED IN THE SAME POSITION 
ON ALL PARTS. MISSING 
NUMBERS TO BE LISTED.    SET 
UP CHARGE AND PRICE PER SET 

  

E1 
SERVICE CHARGE AND PRICE 
PER SET $10.00 + $15.00 

E2 
SERVICE CHARGE AND PRICE 
PER SET $15.00 + $18.00 

E3 
SERVICE CHARGE AND PRICE 
PER SET $20.00 + $20.00 

  
  

  

` 
OVERPRINTING (FOR ITEMS 6-11) 

  

F1 

1 OR 2 LINES (RED OR BLACK 
SCREEN) ADD TO TOTAL OR PER 
SET $20.00 + $5.00 

F2 

PART TO PART CHANGE ADD TO 
TOTAL OR PER SET 

$10.00 + $5.00 
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G 
INK 

  

G1 

TWO COLORS BLACK AND ONE 
(1) PMS COLOR ADD TO TOTAL 

$45.00 

G2 

TWO (2) PMS COLORS (NEITHER 
BLACK) ADD TO TOTAL 

$85.00 

      

H 
PARCHMENT 

  

H6 
WHITE $6.00 

H7 
WHITE $7.00 

H8 
WHITE $11.00 

H9 
WHITE $22.00 

H10 
WHITE $24.00 

H11 
WHITE $34.00 

      

H6 
COLOR $6.00 

H7 
COLOR $7.00 

H8 
COLOR $11.00 

H9 
COLOR $22.00 

H10 
COLOR $24.00 

H11 
COLOR $34.00 

      

I 
140 LB MANILLA 

  

I6 
140 LB MANILLA $10.00 

I7 
140 LB MANILLA $20.00 

I8 
140 LB MANILLA $30.00 

I9 
140 LB MANILLA $40.00 

I10 
140 LB MANILLA $50.00 
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I11 
140 LB MANILLA $60.00 

      

J 
PADDING 

  

J6 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

J7 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

J8 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

J9 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

J10 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

J11 
50 SHEET PER PAD $8.00  

  
  

  

J6 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

J7 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

J8 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

J9 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

J10 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

J11 
100 SHEETS PER PAD $5.00  

      

K 
FOLDING - PER PART  

  

K6 
FOLDING - PER PART $12.00  

K7 
FOLDING - PER PART $12.00  

K8 
FOLDING - PER PART $13.00  

K9 
FOLDING - PER PART $13.00  

K10 FOLDING - PER PART 
$14.00  

K11 FOLDING - PER PART 
$14.00  

      

L 
COLLATING PER PART  

  

L6 
COLLATING PER PART  
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L7 
COLLATING PER PART  $8.00  

L8 
COLLATING PER PART  $8.00  

L9 
COLLATING PER PART  $9.00  

L10 
COLLATING PER PART $10.00  

L11 
COLLATING PER PART  $10.00  

M STITCHING    

M6 STICTCHING 
$15.00  

M7 STICTCHING 
$16.00  

M8 STICTCHING 
$18.00  

M9 STICTCHING 
$22.00  

M10 
STICTCHING $30.00  

M11 
STICTCHING $35.00  

  
  

  

 


