MIAMI-DADE
Internal Services Department
TALLY SHEET

Bid Number; FB-00132

Bid Title; SIGN LANGUAGE INTERPRETING AND TRANSLATION SERVICES

Closing Date: 14/21/2014
Prepared by: Ana Lang Signature:
Verifled by: M. Perez-Carviso Signature:

{Complets infarmation for alt vendore)-

Vendor Name:|AllWorld Language Consultants, Inc. Volance Language Srvcs Interpreters Unlimited, Inc.{lU, LLC) /dba ACD Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LEC
Office Address as Listed on Slgnature Page of Proposal:|400 S. Polnte Dr. #2508 5780 N. Swan Road 4846 University Dr. Suite # 354 2440 Madison St.
City/State/Zip Code:|Miami, FL 20852 Tucscn, AZ 88718 Lauderhill, FL 33381 Hollywoed, FL 33020

Vendors' FEIN/Suffix No.:|541725423 371571267 383938228 452801443

Recomimendation for Award: 5 ol
Iplétefor gl anaors Witligiatiation):: rde Zasl il
Recommended: Low Bidder Groups |-A, |-B, ii-A, ||

zRecbmmending

Evaluation:] Recommeded: Low Bidder Groups VI-A & Vil-A Not Recoammended

B, [ll-A, 1B, IV-A, & IV-B
o, o Not-Applicable:{NIA): Res \ caple {N/A}

SBE Eliglble

(indicate here méasure i.e., bid preference, set-asida, Micro or SBE and %) NO NO NO NO

Local Preference Eligible (10%) ) NO, LP Affirmed but no Business Tax Receipt for 1

{1, focal address, 2, Business Tax Receipt for 1 year, and 3. affirmed}]  NO, LP Affirmed but no Business Tax Receipt. NO year period YES
Locally Headquartered Preferance Eligible (15%)

{local principat place of business) NGO NO NO . YES

Veterans Preference Eligible (6%) : '
1} State registered, 2) meet iocai preference NO NO NO NO

Section 2, Paragraph 3 Minimum Requirement
Proof of interpreter's certification must be submitted along with the bid submittal or
as determined by the County. Fallure to provide the required documentation as

Per specified by the County may result in the Bidder (s) proposal not being considered
Sect. [for contract award.

QUALIFICATION FOR ALL GROUPS:

A. Bidders shail be regularly engaged in the business of providing similar the services to
those specified hereln for a minimum of three {3} years, Bidders shal! provide two (2)
verifiable business references as proof of having previously provided sign language

2.3.1 |interpreting and translation services, Yes, verified. N/A, not being recommended for award. N/A, not being recommended for award, Yes, verified.
1 . Company Name:|Corporation for National and Community Services NIA N/A Dept. of Ed, VR, Deaf & Hard of Hearing Unit
2 - * Cempany Name;]Defense Information Systems Agency N/A NIA Miami Dade College
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“““Vendor information
{Complete informiation for'all- venders

Vendor Name:;

AllWorld Language Cansuitants, Inc.

Voiance Language Srvcs

Interpreters Unfimited, Inc.(IU, LLC) /dba ACD

Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LLG

2.3.2

MINIMUNM QUALIFICATIONS GRCUP | - National Certified Slgn Language Interpreter,
Bidder must have qualified Interpreter(s) that pessess certification from at least one of the
nationally accredited institufions identified in Section 2, paragraph 2.5.1, Bidder must
provide name(s) of certified interpreter{s) performing under this group and a copy of their
certification.

MNames of certified interpreters and copy of
ceftification:

1. Robert Leadbetter,

2, Brian Gauc,

3, Joseph Riley,

4. Nancy Fidel,

5. Enrique Pereira,

6. Dina Shimek

7. Danald Michelin

8. Delbert Carter

NiA NA A 9. Maria Magdalena Gonzalez,
10. Janet P. Marquard, copy of Ci,
11. Annica Detthow, copy of CI, CT,
12.Mercy Gonzalez, copy of NAD i1
13. Michelle R. Clark, copy of NIC Master,
14. Alana Grugan, copy of NIC,
16, Krystan Gogan, copy of NIC,
16. Casey Batim, copy of NIC,
17. Jacquelina Salcede, copy of NIC,
18. Jessica Krissy Holtzman, copy of NIC,

2.3.3 [MINIMUM QUALIFICATIONS GROUP {l - Sign Language Interpreter Quality Assurance Names of certified interpreters and copy of

level (QA3): cerfification:
Bidder must have qualified interprater(s) that possess the two types of certification 1. Vickie Dwivedi, copy of FRID Cert. for QA 3 &
stipulated befow. Bidder must provide name(s) of certified Interpreter(s) performing under Associate in Science Degree from MDCC (franscript
this group and a copy of their certifications. provided, pending copy of Cert.)
NfA NIA /A
1) certification from at least one of the nationatly acoredited institutions identified in Section
2 paragraph 2.6.1.; and
2) certification from at least one private firm, community callege or university, as stipulated
in Section 2 paragraph 2.5.1.

2.3.4 |MINIMUM QUALIFICATIONS GROUP IH - Sign Language Interpreter Quafity Assurance Names of cerlified interpreters and copy of
Level (QA2): certification:

Bidder must have qualified Interpreter(s) that possess the two types of cerifflcation 1. Rosalba Russo, copy of Associate & QA 2 aiso BA
stipulated helow. Bidders must provide name(s) of certified interpreter(s) performing under from USF

this group and a copy of thair certifications. WA A A i‘iDgllagros Santiage, copy of QA 2 and AA form

1) certification from at least one of the nationally accredited institutions identified in Section 3. Stephanie Coligan, copy of QA 2

2 paragraph 2.5.1.; and

2) certification from at least one private firm, communiy college or university, as stipuiated

in Sectlon 2 paragraph 2.5.1.

2.3,5 [GROUR Iv- Sign Language Interpreter Quality Assurance Level (QA1): Names of certified interpreters and copy of
Bidder must have qualified interpreter(s) that possess certification from at least cne of the cerlification: :
private firms, community colleges or a university identified in Section 2, paragraph 2.5. 1. Eugene Whitton, copy of QA1 & EIPA score 3.3
Bidder must provide name(s) of certlified interpreter(s) performing under this group and a 2. Algjandro R. Tura, copy of EIPA score 3.5
copy of their certification. 3. Melissa Garcia, copy of EIPA score 3.4

N/A N/A N/A 4, Laure! Mciver, copy of EIPA score 3.3
5. Natasha Romero, copy of EIPA scere 3.0
6. Amber LaConts, copy of EIPA score 3.3
7. Stephanie Richmond, copy of EIPA score 3.3
8. Aimee Aivarade, copy of BA from USF
2,3.8 [GROUP V - Video Remote Interpreting {VRI).
Bidder must have gualifled interpreter(s; that possess certification from Nationa! Asscciation
for the Deaf (NAD) or Registry of Interpreters for the Deaf (RID) for Video Remote NIA NIA NIA NiA

Interpreting (VRI) services. Bidder must provide nameis) of certified interpreter(s)
performing under this group and a copy of their certification.
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“Yendor nformation:

(Compleﬁe information for. all-vendors) :

Vendor Name:

AllWorld Language Consultants, Inc.

Velance Language Srves

Interpraters Unlimited, inc.(lU, LLC) /dba ACD

Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LLC

2.3.7

GROUP VI -

Communication Access Realtima Translation {CART):
Bidder must have qualified speciaity trained stenographer{s) that possess certificaticn from
the Naticnal Court Reporters Asscciation (NCRA) as identified in Section 2 paragraph 2.5,

Names of cerlified Interpreters all are missing copy
of certification:
1. Rita G. Meyer, RDR, CRR, CBG, CCP

copy of their certification,

must provide name(s) of certified C-Print Captionist(s) performing under this groug and a

Bidder must provide name(s) of certified stenographer(s) performing under this group and a [NOTE: Bidder listed additlonal names, but no NiA NiA NIP_\
copy of their certification, certificates were provided.
2.3.8 {GROUP VIi — C-Print Mames of cerified intarpreters and copy of
Bidder must have qualified C-Print Captionist(s) that possess certification from one cf the  |certification:
private firms, community colleges or a university which offers a cerificate program. Bidder |1. Annfca Detthow copy of Cl and CT N/A NIA " NIA

Canvicilon Disclosure checked :

Yes, but clarification provided via email. Not

Scrutinized Companles Initiated: NO N/A N/A serutinized.

All Affidavits Completed: Yes NiA NiA Yes
Divislon of Corporation Status checked: Yes N/A N/A Yes
Collusion and Due Diligence; Yos A N/A Yes
Pre-Award Vendor Complated: Yes Nij N/A Yes

i Estimated:

: _ CHourg fora B[ e e L IELH RN R ST

ltein Product Description. . .. “Yr. Perlod. - | Hourly: Bllling Rate { Hourly Bliiihg Rate ~EXT: Price. LEXT. Price -
1 |General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and national holidays) 4290 $63.00 $270,270.00 365.00 $278 8560.00 $61.50 $263,835.00

Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and national
2 |holidays) 145 $69.00 $10.005.00 $70.00 $10,150.00 $66.50 $9,642.50
Mo Bid

3 |Night 12:.01 a.m, - 7:58 a.m. (Excluding Wegkends and national holidays) 95 $30,00 $7,600.0C $90.00 $8,550.00 $71.50 $6,792.50
4 |Emergency Services {Per Section 3.2.5) 45 $80.00 $3,600.001 $100.00 $4,500.00 $82.00 $3,68C.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP | - A $291,475.00 $302,050.00 $283,960,00

g for theiitems isted b s Teguired but will o

7 Hourly Billing Raté

Weelend (Friday 12:00 p.m. to Menday 7:59 a.m.)

$87.50

Natlonal Holadays (24 hours mldmght to mldnlghﬁ)

$80.00

$72.00

$20.001

$77,00

: derallyfunded purchase :

| Hourly Billing Rate |

2| Hourly Billing Rate |

‘Price .~ | Houriy Billing Rate_

_EXT: Price -

- Estimated -
R e “Hoirs fora'5:| SRR
Product Description: - - Yr. Period- | Hourly Biilling'Rate ~EXT: Price-
1 (General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and naticnal holidays) 300 $63.00 $18,900.00
Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. {Excluding Weekends and naticnal
2 |holidays) 105 $69.00 $7,245.00
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$65.00 $19,500.00 $61.50 $18,450.00
$70.00 $7,350.00 $66.50 $6,982.50
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- Vendor Informatial SN
{Complete information for-afl vendors)- =i

Vendor Name:

AllWorld Languaage Consuitants, Inc,

Volance Language Sives

Interpreters Uniimited, Inc{IU, LLC) /dba ACD

Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LLC

3 |Night 12:01 a.m. - 7:59 &.m. (Excluding Weekends and national holidays) 125 $72.26 $9,031.28 No Bid $90.00 $11.250.00 $71.50 $8,937.50
4 IWeekend (Friday 12:00 p.m. to Monday 7:59 a.m.) 55 $87.50 $4,812,50 $580.00 $4,400.00 $72.00 $3,960.00
5 [National Holidays (24 hours midnight to midnight) 50 $87.50 $4,375.00 $80.00 $4,500.00 $77.00 $3,850.00
<] Emergeﬁcy Services . 13 $82.00 $1,066.00 $100.00 $1,300.00 $82.00 $1,066.00

TOTAL__F_'QR GROUP | - B $45,429.75 $48,300.00 $41_5,24_6 Q0

GROGP 11 QUALITY ASSURANCE [GA3Y

A~ NON-FEDERALLY FUNDED DEPARTMENTS

EXT. Price 7

Houly Billing Rate.|

| Hourly Biiling Raté |

- EXT. PHEE

Houly Billing Rate | -

*.'EXT. Price

" Product Description :
1 |General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and national holidays) 2250 $63.00 $141,750.004. $60.00 $135,000.00 $56.50 $127,125.00
Na Bid
2 |Emergency Services (Per Section 3.2.5) 45 $82.00 $23,690,00 $90.00 $4,050.00 $77.00 $3,465.00
TOTAL FOR GROUP I - A $145,440.00 $139,050,00 $130,590.00

- 4 A ;

1 |Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. (Exciuding Weekends and national holidays) $69.00 $66.00 $62.00
2 |Night 12:0% a.m. - 7159 a.m. {Excluding Weekends and national holidays) $72.25 No Bid $70.00 $67.00
3 Weekend (Friday 12:00 p.m. to Monday 7:58 a.m.} $87.50) $75.00 $67.00)
4 iNational Holidays {24 hours midnight to midnight) $87.50 $80.00 $f2,DD

~Estimated |

: e ‘Hoursidora b "o L b e ettt IR Do ety

Product Description =~ - X, Period: | Hourly Billing Rate: Tice. Hourly Billfng Rate | °: EXT. Price .. - Hourly Billlng Rate
1 |General 8:00 a,m, - 5:00 p.m. (Exciuding Weekends and national holidays) 150 $59.00 $8,850.00 $60.00 $2,000.00 $56.80 $8,475.00

Evening 5:01 p.m, - 12:00 p.m. {Excluding YWeekends and national ‘

2 |holidays) 50 $656.00 $3,250.00 No Bid $65.00 $3,250,00 $62.00 $3,100.00
Weskend (Friday 12:00 p.m. fo Monday 7:59 &.m.) 50 .. $67.50 $3,375.00 $75.00 $3,750.00 $67.00 $3,350.00
4 |Emergency Services 13 $87.50 $1,137.50 $90.00 $1,170.00 $77.00 $1,001.00
TOTAL FCR GROUPI -B $16,612.50 $17,170.00 $15,926.00

Estimated |
Hours fara b |:

‘Hourly Bifling Rats

CEXT. Pries

- EXT. Price -~ - -} Hourly Biliing Rate [

" EXT-Price: = -

i product Desieription ~ Yy, Perigd
4 General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and nationat helidays) 12560 $59.00 $73,750,00 $55.00 $€8,750.00 $51.50 $64,375.00
- No Bid
2 |Emergency Services (Per Section 3.2.5) 45 $87.50 $3,837.50 $80.00 $3,600.00 $71.50 $3,217.50
TOTAL FOR GROUP Il - A $77,687.50 $72,350.00 $67,692.50

Hourly Bliling Rate

Paged of 6

Formatted By : Kiki




. Vendor,
-2 (Complate information:for 8l vendors)

Vendor Name:

AllWortd Language Consuitants, Inc.

Volance Language Srvcs

Interpreters Untimited, Inc.{iU, LLC) /dba ACD

Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LLC

1 [Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and naticnal holidays) $65.00 $60.00 $57.00
2 |Night 12:01 am. -~ 7:59 am. (Exclﬁding Weekends and national halidays) $72.26 Na Bid $75.00 $62.00
3 Wesekend (Friday 12:00 p.m. to Monday 7:58 a.m.) $67.50 $62.00
_ 4 |National Holidays (24 hours midnight to midnight) $87.50 $67.00

- EXT. Price. ..~

Hourly Billing Rate

~:¥r.Pertod -] Hou EXT..Price: --+ - [ Hourly Billing Rate | =+ 12 EXT. Price =~ Hourly Billing:Rate. | -~ . - :>.EXT. Price. ==~ | Hourly Billing Rate == ;. -
1 |General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. {Excluding Weekends and naticnal holidays) 150 $58.00 $8,850.00 $55.00 $8,250.00 $51.50 $7,725.00
Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. (Exciuding Weekends and nationat
2 |holidays) 50 $65.00 $3,250,00 No Bid $60.00 $3,000.00 $57.00 $2,850.00
3 |Weekend (Friday 12:00 p.m. to Monday 7:59 a.m.) 25 367.50 $1,687.50 $65.00 $1,626.00 $52.00 $1,660.00
4 {Emergency Services 13 $87.50 $1,137.50 $80.00 $1,040.00 $71.50 $929.50
TOTAL FOR GROUP IIl $14,925.00 $13,915.00 $13,054.50

ROUF IV GUALITY ASSURANGE (A1)
- NON.FEDERALLY EUNDED DEPARTMEN

oduct Description - Hourly Billing: Rate CEXToPrice - - EXToPrice - { Hourly Billing:Rate: *EXT: Ptice = s EXT. Price”
1 |General 8:00 am. - 5:00 p.m. {Excluding Weekends and national holldays) 5200 $58.00 $306,800.00 $50.00 $260,000.00 $46.00 $239,200.00
Evening 5:01 p.m, - 12:00 p.m. {Excluding Weekends and national

2 |holidays) 1000 $65.00 $65,000.00 $55.00 $65,000.00 $51.50 $51,500.00
3 |Night 12:01 a.m. - 7:59 am. (Excluding Weekends and national hoiidays) 120 $72.25 $8,670.00 No Bid $60.00 $7,200.00 $56.50 $6,780.00
4 |Weekend (Friday 12:00 p.m, to Monday 7:69 a.m.) 120 $67.50 $8,100.00 $65.00 $7,800.00 $56.50 $6,780.00
5 |MNational Holidays {24 hours midnight to midnight) 40 $87.50 $3,500.00 $70.00 $2,800.00 $61.50 $2,460.00
6 |Emergency Senvices {Per Section 3.2.5) 45 $87.50 $3,937.50 $80.00 $3,600.00 $66.50 $2,992.580

TOTAL FOR GROUP IV - A $396,007.50 $336,400.00 $309,712.50

Product Description - o

1 Estimated |
1. Hours fera §

Hoiitly Bitling Rate |

Hourly Billing Rate |-
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S Y Péiod CEXT.Prits | Hourly gilling Rate | .~ EXT; Price Rate | - CEXT. Price -
1 |General 8:00 a.m. - 5:00 p.m. (Excluding Weekends and naticnal holidays) 150 $59.00 $8,850.00 $£0.00 $7,500.00 $46.00 $6,900.00
Evening 5:01 p.m. - 12:00 p.m. (Excluding Yeekends and national
2 iholidays) 50 $65.00 $3,250.00 No Bid $55.00 $2,750.00 $51.50 $2,575,00
3 |Weekend (Friday 12:00 p.m. fo Monday 7:58 a.m.} 25 $67.50 $1,687.50 $65.00 $1,625.00 $56.50 $1,412.50
4 |Emergency Services 13 $87.50 $1‘137.5('J $80.00 $1,040.00 $66.50 $864.50
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Vendor informatlon o
lete ifformiation far afl vendors):

5 (Comp

Vendor Name:|AllWorld Language Consultants, Inc. Voiance Language Srvcs - Interpreters Unlimited, Inc.{iU, LLC) /dba ACD Interpreting Services For The Deaf, LLC
$14,925.00 $12,915,00 $11,752.00

1 |Video Remcte interpreting Services
UP: Y COMMUNICATION ACGESS REALTIME TRANSLATION (CART)

$69.00 {$1.15 per min.)

‘A~ NON-FEDERALLY. FUNDED DEPARTMENTS. 775 SRR
Tiama e e R e - -Estimatod
L ST T R | Hours fora g’ i R R R S g U
ltem: of & oo 7 Product Description. - ¥r. Period " i Billing i EXTe Price. o | Hourty ‘Biliing Rate |~ ° .. EXT. Price. HollifTy Billitig' Réte
4 On-site Projected CART ) 300 $128.75 $38,625.00 No Eid Na Bid Na Bid

TOTAL FOR GROUP VI - A $38,625.00

“Pricing for the items Bsted below Is required BUt will not bé considered as a basis of award.

1 Remote CART . $135.00 No Bid No Bid Na 8id

2 |Remote Projected CART $135.00

ONLY!BIDDER FOR THIS GROUP

“Hourfy Bllling Rate x5 e i Houyly Hourly Billing Rafe outly Billing R
1 G- Captionist- Captionist $128.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
NOTES: |1} Staff was unable o contact references submitted 1} Listed staif as subcrontracters.

on proposals. Therefore, additional references were
requestad and veriiled.

2) Awarded Group VIl due to being single Bidder for
that Group,

NOTE;

Iterns Stipulating a quantity wifl be utilized to determine the lowest Bidder EXCEPT FOR Group V. Group V is net heing awarded due to ambiguity in the method of award, Proposals review by
FCHD for compliance with Section 3f Appendix B preference. None of the bidders as Section 3 cerlified; {herefore, no preference applied.
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