TALLY SHEET
Solicitation Number; FB-00141

Summary Description; Pillows, Mattresses, Bed Linens, Box Springs, and Bed Frames

Solicitation Openingf Closing
Prepared by;

Verified by: .57

Dyct 10, 20
/‘/-:’Zw L

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight fow priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

ACME SUPPLY, CO,, LTD DISTRICT HEALTH CARE PINPANPUN SYMBOL MATTRESS
Vendor Name:
Is the bid responsive (if no, state reasen below): _X_Yes Mo _X_Yes _ o _X_Yes _X__Yes __ No
Indicate SBD certification: Na Yes ves No
Registered vendor {yes/ no}: Yes Yes AYes Yes
Incumbent vendor (yes/no): Yes Yas “IYes No
Local Preference Affirmed (yesfno): No Yes Yes No

items being procured per current soliciation

Unif of
Meastire

Each

Pillow: Minimum of 21 ounces of first quaiity, 100% Polyester fiber filling,
with a 7 oz.Staph cover, size; twin, 21" x 27", Flammability Requirements,
Cover materfal must comply with appiicable flammabifity standards,

Mfg.

Style

$32.99/dz

$6.00

$120.00

$9.50 $180.00

Acme

Dade Towel

= American Mills”

MDZ127PIL

T-180

No Bid

No Bid

P}]IoW (‘:ase: ' 50/?0 cottonlpt?iyesfer, 3.5 oz per yard, Thread count 130, $0.75 §22.50 $4.50 $135.00

9 20 Each size: twin, 42' X 34" Color, white $8.95/d No Bid No Bid
Ifg. ez Acme Cade o8 oFr
Style #f 29561 MD4234PIL.
Flat Sheet:  50/50 cottor/polyester, percale. Thread count 180, size: twin, :
71"X108" Color, white, hemmed on four sides, $75.00 $375.00 $90.00 450.00]-

3 5 Dozen $37.00/dz No Bid Mo Bid
Mig. Acme Dade Towel
Style # 72108 MD661C08FL-size quoted 66"X108"
Number per case; 12 i2
Fitted Sheets: 50/50 cofton/poiyester, percale, Thread count 180, size: twin
39° X 75" for use with 6 $75.00 $375.00 $81.00 $405.00

4 5 Dozen Mo, $36.50/dz oo Dade Towel No Bid No Bid
Style # 24645 MD3975TOL
Number per case: 12 12




TALLY SHEET
Solicitation Number; FB-00141

Summary Description: Pillows, Mattresses, Bed Linens, Box Springs, and Bed Frames

Solicitation Opening/ Closin &p: Oﬁr 10, Zﬂg
Prepared bys
Verified by: At

Note: When all prices are entered, highiight low priced vendor in ysllow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Method of Award: To Multiple lowest priced vendors in the Aggregate by group.
Identify Non-responsive vendors and reason:

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)

ACME SUPPLY, CO.,LTD DISTRICT HEALTH CARE PINPANPUN SYMBOL MATTRESS
Vendor Name:;
Is the: bid responsive (if no, state reason below}: _X_Yes . No _ X Yes __No 21 _ X Yes ___No X Yes ___No
Indicate SBD certification: No Yes “|Yes No
Registered vendor {yes/ no): ‘Yes Yes “lYes Yes
Incumbeni vendor (yes/mo): Yes Yes AYes No
Local Preference Affirmed (yesino}: No Yes Yes No
ltems being procured per curment solicitation :
Unit of
{ttem no. Quantity Measure Description
Bed Spreads: 50/50 cotton/polyester, size: twin 75" X 110",Ribcord fabric,
min 8oz per sq yd. Preshrunk, no ironing required, square comers. colors: $20.00 $400.00 $26.50 $530.00
blug, red or green.
5 20 Fach $117 4dz No Bid No Bid
Mfg. Acme Dade Towel
Style # ag404 MD761110 Bed Size Quote 76x110
Additional colors available; Blue, Red, Green
Blankgts: 109% polyester, size: twin 72" X 80", machine washable, resist $10,00 $10000 $10.85 $108.50
shedding, pulling and matting, colors: blue, tan green,
6 10 Each $67.50/dz No Bid No Bid
Mfg. Acmre Dade Towel
Style # 68570 MD7290BLA
Additional olors available: Blue & Tan
$1,392.50 $1,818.50
$6,962.50 $9,082.50
$6,962.50 $9,092.50 NO BID NOBID
Evaluation Adjustment 10% SBE Preference: $909.25
Total Evaluated Price: $6,962.50 $8,183.25




TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number:

FB-001

41

Summary Description: Pillows, Mattresses, Bed Linens, Box Springs, and Bed Frames

Solicitation Opening/ Closing

Prepared by:

.

r 10,2014

Verified by 7/f oy ’Qﬁm, oo

Note: When ail prices are entered, highlighticw priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor Name:

Is the bid respansive (it no, state reason below):
Indicate SBD cerfification;

Registered vendor (yas/ no}:

Incumbent vender (yesio):

Local Preference Affirmed {yes/ing):

ACME SUPPLY, CO,,LTD

_X_Yes
No
Yes
Yes

No

FAYCROFT INTERIOR &

DISTRICT HEALTH CARE PURCHASING INC.
X
Yes _____No _X_ Yes _ No
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes

X

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

PINPANPUN

No

l‘ems being procured per surrent solicitation

ltem no.] Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Description

oreisnay

Mattress: Imperial Two-Sided Tight Top Matiress — size: twin 39" x 75,
Jamisen Series 875 or approved equal.

Quilt Top: .6 oz. Freudenberg FR Fiber (x2), 3/4" 1.2-36 Compression High-
Density Polyurethane Foam {x2); Comfort Layers: 1% 1.2-36 Compression

High-Density Polyurethane Foam (x2), 2. 2 oz. Poly Bonded Fiber Insulator $130.00 No Bid No Bid
Pad (x2); Innerspring: 416 Bonnell 5-Tum coils, 13-gauge; Edge System: &
Gauge Border Wire with Edge Clip Technology; Foundation: Semi- :
Flex/Power Stack Wood and Wire Xfra-Support Foundation, $ 15500|%  46,500.00 $ 13400|%  40,200.00
ntg. Dade Towel Star
7 300 Each Style # MD3975MAT Imperial two sided tight top
Box Springs: Size: fwin - 38" x 75" , Cover: Continental style heavy duty
non-skid top panel with matching borders and corner guards.Unit: 56 colf, §74.00 No Bid No Bid :
with 3 gauge border rod. Lumber: 1* +%" Kiln-Dried Semi-Hardwood. ' o=l $ 8500 (%  17,000.00 OBl $ 9500($  19,00000 |
Mfg. Dade Towel Star
8 200 Each Style # MD3g75B0OX nen-skid top panel




TALLY SHEET
Solicitation Number: FB-00141

Summary Descripfion: Pillows, Mattresses, Bed Linens, Box Springs, and Bed Frames

Solicitation Openjng/ Closing Date: Ogéaher 10, 2014
Prepared by,&%% é/

Verified by: /{,0?/4;7’%’/&%%“
a

Note: When all prices are enlered, highlight low priced vendor in yeliow ( and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary}

FAYCROFT INTERIOR &

Vender Name; ACME SUPPLY, CO.,LTD | DISTRICT HEALTH CARE PURCHASING INC. PINPANPUN
X X
Is the bid responsive {if no, state reason below): A _Yes ___ No Yes _ Ne X_Yes _ No Yes _ No
Indicate SBD certification: No Yes Yes Yes
Registered vendor (yes/ no): Yes Yes Yes Yes
Incumbent vendor {yesino): Yes Yes Yes Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (yes/ho): No Yes Yes Yes

ltems being procured per current solicitation

Unit of
Measure Description

~Un

Item no.| Quantity

Metal frame: keyhole assembly, adjustable {o twin/full size with 1-5/8"

casters on each leg, Crate & Barrel #101567 or approved equal $ 50,00 ¢ 5,000.00 No Bid $ 2700 § 2,700.00}.
Mfg. Dade Towel Leggett and Plait
MDT56FRAME 78C
$68,500.00 $61,900.00
$342,500.00 $309,500.00
No Bid $342,500.00 No Bid $309,500.00
Evaluation Adjustment 10% SBE Preference: $34,250.00 $30,950.00
Total Evaluated Price: $308,250.00 $278,550.00

*Local Preference Range: $231,000 - $254,100
Method of Award: To Multiple lowest priced vendors in the Aggregate by group.

[dentify Non-respansive vendors and reason: N/A
THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)




