Prepared by: Mary Hammett

Verified by: Sasha Mera

Verified by: Jessica Tyrrell

Bignature:
Signature:

Signature:

Date 3 /////5

pate 3~ 1= 15

Date )3_\-%! ]

Verifed by: Herman Ramsey Signature:
Responsible; .Yes
Vendor FEIN & Suffix: 592115466-01 592402586-01 592327852-01 640701635-01 592747500-01
7323 NW 66 ST. 900 West 13th Street 1913 NW 40 CT 1120 Flowood Dr, 6683 Stuart Ave Jacksonviile,
Bid Address: Miami FL 33166 Rivera Beach FL 33404 Pompano Beach, FL33064 Flowood, MS 39232 FL 32254
Sun Biz Address: 7323 NW 65 5T, 900 West 13th Street 1913 NW 40 CT 1120 Flowood Dr. G682 Stuart Ave Jacksonville,
Miami FL 33166 Rivera Beach FL 33404 Fompano Beach, FL33064 Flowood, MS 38232 FL 32254
- SBE Certification for Commodity Code: 55078 - (No.& Exp fdate).: No - N/A No No No No
.g Local Preference Affirmed? Yes No* Yes No Yes
g Locally Headquartered Affirmed? Yes No Ne No No
[ Local Certified Service-Disabled Veteran Affirmed? No No No No No
t SBE Affirmed? No Ne Ne No No
Felony Conviction Discliosure Affirmed? No No Ne No No
Addenda's Received Affirmed? No of Addenda 2 Yesi2 Yes/2 Yes/2 No Yes/2
) Scrutinized Company Yes/No No Yes Yes Yes No
2.3 a Bidder shall provide contact person telephone number, fax number, and email address: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
2.3 b Bidder shall be the product manufacturer, authorized distributor and/or authorized -reseller Yes/No Letter: Yes/Distributor Letter Yes/Reseller Letter No Letter No Letter No Letter
*Affidavits? Yes
Violation Reports Reviewed? / Any Violation Founded? Yas /No
o U Ed
i 12" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $3.50 3.90 | % 97500 |$ 4983 !$§ 123250 |$ 500 | 1,250.00 3641 % 91000 )§ 389§ 972.50
1a 18" Safety orange traffic cones with (1) 6" reflective collar $5.72 8908 258750 f% 76113 286375 |8 000 3,375.00 711 % 2066253 7413 2778.75
1b 1" black stencil letters MDFR $0.60 04013 40,00 | § 8.08 &% 808.00 | $ 0251 % 25.00 035 % 35.00]3 070 | % 70.00
Ranking and Total ltem-1 thru 1b: $ 3,602.50 $ 4,894.25 $ 4,650.00 % 3,611.25 3 3,821.25
3 13 11 4 7
Make and Model Ne. for 1: JBG Safety#R530008C Lakeside Plastic 1250-00 12 PVCS WAP JBG/RS30008C JBG-RS3008C
Make and Model Ne. for 1a: JBC Safety#RS45015C3M6 Lakeside Plastic 1850-00-M 18 pves 6CC (VSB) WAP JBCIRS45015C3M6 RS845015C3M6
2 28" Safety crange traffic cones without reflective collar $6.28 8.9518% 173750 % 952 1|% 2,380.00 | § 11.00 | § 2.750.00 7.07 | & 1,767.50 2,047.50
s 28" Safety orange traffic cones with one(1) 6" and ore (1) 4"
a reflective collar $9.95 $ 11.75( % 15276001 & 1274 | % 16,562.001 § 15,00 | § 19,500.00 1160 | § 15197.00 | § 1248 | $ 16,224.00
2b 1" black stencil letters MDT, or T&G, or MDAD $0.00 0.40 | $ 360.00 |$ 1297 |3 11,673.00 | $ 0.25 | $ 225.00 0.35 | § 315.00 | $ 070 | $ 630.00
. 30,815 . . .
Ranking and Total ftem-2 thru 2b: $ 17,372.50 $ ,615.00 $ 22,475.00 $ 17,279.50 % 18,901.50
3 14 11 2 7
Make and Model No. for 2: JBC Safety#RS70025C Lakeside Plastic 2850-07 28 PVCS WAP JBC/RS570025C RS70032C-JBC
Make and Modsl No. for 2a:]  JBC Safety#RS70025C3M64 Lakeside Plastic 2850-07MM 28 PVCS 6 CC4ACG {VSB) WAP JBC/RST70026C3IM64 JBC-RS70032CTIME4
R e e B S B B T T B R R TR T D R e e AR T B T B B i o B A P N e SR T IR e R T T SR R A R T VRO VTR ST T By TR v e e - '"mm‘&m»:«uwxxmmmmﬂﬂﬂmﬁmw—'wwmemmnmmwmmmwwmvumwawwmﬁmvwv««mmmmJ.W&r« ey
4 36" Safety orange traffic cones without refiective collar $10.55 12.80 | 8 1824000 | § 1371 | s 19,536.75 |3 16.00 | 3 22,800.00 1293 | $ 18425253  1349|% 1922375
3 36" Safety orange traffic cones with one (1) 8" and one (1) 4"
a reflective collar $13.79 14.55 | § 3517462518 1575 1§ 380,756.25 | $  20.00 | % 483,500.00 15634 | $ 37084450 |$ 1597 |$  38B,074.75
3b 1" black stencil letters MDAD, or MD, or, WASD $0.00 0.40 | § 860000 |5 1595 % 263175.00 ¢ 025 |3 4,125.00 0.35 | 3 577500 | o04a|s 7,920.00
Ranki d Total i 3 thru 3b $ 376,586.25 $ 663,468.00 $ 510,425.00 $ 385,044.75 $ 413,218.00
anking and Total item-3 thru 3h: -
s 2 14 10 6 7
Iake and Model No. for 3; JBC Safety#RS90045CT Lakeside Plastic 3650.12 36 PVCH FL WaP JBC/RS90055CT JBC-RSI00E5CT
Make and Model No. for 3a:| JBCSafety#RS90055C T3IME4 Lakeside Plastic 3650-12MM 36 PVCHBCCACC(VSB)FLWAP JBC/RS80055CTIME4 RS20055CT3IMB4
T T T B B, L T A, 8 7 e R P e T T g T
4 Description -TD5100 Ring Top Delineator or Equal 42"
Ring Top, 4",2-3 H Bands, 84# Base $0.00 11.75 | § 822.50 25.00 | § 1,750.00 | 3 1270 | % 889.0c |§ 1591 |§ 1,113.70
3 .00 822,50 $ 1,750.00 § 889.00 $ 1,113.70
Ranking and Total ltem-4: No Bid I
1 2 6
Make and Model No. for 4:(  JBC Safety#iN-TOP+3M/B-08 JBC/H12003M+B-08 3-D Traffic Works-507605
Description -TD5100 Ri Top Delineator or Equal 42" ] ' ' '
5 ; Y
Ring Top, 4,2-3 HI Bands, 10# Base $0.00 $ 13250 % _927.50 2500 8 1750.00) 8 14.23| % ge6 10| 5 6753 1,172.50
. § e 92760 $ 1,750.00 $ 996.10 $ 1,172.50
Ranking and Total item-5: 1 No Bid 3 6 R
Make and Medel No. for 5|  JBCSafety#N-TOP+3M/B-12 JBCIH12003M4 B2 3-D Traffic Works 507527

Note: * Contractor due diligence affidavit is not appiicable term of the contract is under one (1} million dellars

*Baren Greup submitted Tax
receipt. Higher than low bidder
*Baron initial scrutinized list

Custom Products gualifed bid
higher than lower bidder




Prepared by: Mary Hammett
Verified by: Sasha Mera
Verified by: Jessica Tyrrell

Verifed by: Herman Ramsey
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Tally: Solicitation Name: Bid FB-00170 Traffic Cones

\;ES

Vendor FEIN & Suﬂ”x

208135704-01

453480806-

01

471574940-

311041388-01

261084418-01

22 E. Springfield St.

20911 Johnsen Street

3590 NW B4th Street Suite 4 Fort

9383 Vapafta RD Logan,OH

1365 N.E. 119 5t

B b O N SR R R A AN

s

Make and Model No, for 5:

1,425 Each 36" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $10.55
24,175 Each 36" Sa!fety orange fraffic cones with one (1) 6" and one (1) 4 12.79
reflective collar $13.
18,500 Each 1" black stencil letters MDAD, or MD, or, WASD $0.00
Ranking and Total Item-3 thru 3b: No Bid
Make and Model No. for 3:
Make and Model No. for 3a:
T e—— o]
Descnptlon TD51DD Ring Top Delineator or Equat
70 Each Ring Top, 4",2-3 HI Bands, &# Base $0.00
Ranking and Total Item-4: No Bid
Make and Model No. far 4:
Each Descrlptlon ~TD51 0o Rlng Top Delmeator or Equal T
5 70 ac n
Ring Top, 4",2-3 H| Bands, 10# Base $0.00
Ranking and Total ltem-5; No Bid

969 %

$ 13.80 | &

Trafﬁc Cones

1272 1% 18,

Bid Address: Frankfori, Oh45628 STE132 Pembroke Pines, FL[Lauderdale, FL 33308 43138 Miami, FL 33161
Sun Biz Address: No Bid 22 E, Springfield 5t. 20911 Johnson Street 3590 NW 54th Street Suite 4 Fort { 9383 Vanatta RD  Logan,OH 8750 W.Bryn Mawr Suited400
Frankfort, Oh45628 STE132 Pembroke Pines, FL |Lauderdale, FL 33309 43138 Chicago, Il 60631
33029
c SBE Certification for Commodity Code: 55078 - (No.& Exp./date).: No No No No No
) Local Preference Affirmed? No Yes Yes No Yes
4 Locally Headquartered Affirmed? No Yes No ] Yes
7; Local Gertified Service-Disabled Veteran Affirmed? No No No No No
H SBE Affirmed? No No No No Ne
Felony Conviction Disclosure Affirmed? No No Yes No Ne
Addenda's Received Affirmed? No of Addenda 2 No/G Yesi2 Yes/2 Yes/2 Yes/2
Scrutinized Company Yes/No No No No No No
2.3 a Bidder shall provide contact person telephone number, fax number, and email address: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes [
2.3 b Bidder shall be the product manufacturer, asthorized distributor and/or authorized -reseller Yes/No Letter: No Letter ‘Yes/Distributor Letter No Letter No Letter No Letter
*Affidavits? Yes |
Violation Reports Reviewed? / Any Violation Founded? Yes/No
e ni U de d
250 Each 12" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $3.50 $ 38115 95250 1% 346 |93 865.00 | $ 3918 977501 $ 3.60 | § 500.00 | § 488 (% 1,220.00
375 Each 8" Safety orange traffic cones with (1) 6" reflective collar $5.72 § 74313 278626f%  520|% 1950003 764|%  2856500|$  7.001% 2.625.00 | $ 953 |3 3,573.75
100 Each 1" black stencil letters MDFR $0.00 $ 0751% 7500 (3% 200]% 200.90 | § 04913 4900 |% 035§ 35.00 | % 0.956 | § 96.00
Ranking and Total ltem-1 thru 1b: No Bid $ 3,813.76 $ 301500 $ 389150 $ 3,560.00 $ 4,889.75
6 1 8 2 12
Make and Model No. for 1; JBC Safety RS30008C YT-NO15R JBC RE30008C JBE-Revolution Series FVG JBC RS 30008C
Traffic Cones
Make and Madel No. for 1a: JBC Safety RS45015C3MG YT-NO16R JBC RS45015C3MG JBC-Revolution Series PYG JBC RS 60105 C3MB
Traffic Cones
. . — o - e - , — — T ————— - M— et T
260 Each 28" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $6.28 2045008  591% 1,477.50 | % 818 % 204500|% 772|% 1,930.00 { & 10.50 | $ 2,625.00
1300 Each 28" Safety orange traffic cones with one{1) 6" and one (1) 4"
ac reflective collar $9.95 $ 1244( % 16,17200 1 § 905 | % 11,765.00 | § 1282|% 16666001 % 11.75(§ 15,275.00 ]| ¢ 1589 | § 20,787.00
200 Each 1" black stencil letters MDT, or T&G, or MDAD $0.00 $ 045 | $ 405.00 | & 200 | $ 1,800.00 [ $ 049 (% 44100 1% 035 | § 315.00 | $ 086 | § 864.00
i 18,622, 15,042.50 152, . 276.
Ranking and Total ltem-2 thru 2b: No Bid $ 52200 $ 18 5 19,162.00 § __17.520.00 $ 2421600
6 1 8 4 12
Make and Model No. for 2: JBC Safety RS70032C YT-NO1? JBCRS70032¢ JBC-Revolution Serles PVG JBC RS 7000 32C
Traffic Cones
Make and Model No. for 2a: JBC Safety RST0032CTIMG4 YT-NO17-R JBCRS70032CT3M64 JBC-Revolution Serles PVC JBC RS 7000 32CT 3M64

24,695.25

o T SR TS

5 1085 | % 15,461.25 14,235.75 19,807.50 126.00 | $ 17.33 | $
% 15.26 | § 368,910.50 | $ 1272 1% 30750600 | % 16.50 { $ 398.887.501{ % 1510 | & 365,04250 | $ 2057 | & 497 279,75
$ 0403 660000 $ 200|3 33,00000]% 0493  sossool|s ozs|s  s77s0c|s 080|s 1320000

$ 390,871.75 'S 354,741.75 $ 426,780.00 $  386,943.50 $  535,175.00

4 1 Q9 3 12
YT-No1a JBGRS90056CT JBC-Revolution Serles PVC JBC RS 500 55 CT
JBC Safely RS90045CT Traffic Cones
YT-NO18-R JBCRSS0055CTIMES JBG-Revolution Series PVC JBC RS 900 55 CT 3M84

JBC Safety RSBDD4SCT3M64

Traffic Cones

T R L e e S e S S s e MR R TR RN

s

$ 2573 (% 18011018 17.25 | 3 1,207.50 | % 13.95| § G76.50|% 2094 |$ 1,465.80 | § 19.25 | § 1,347.50
% 1,801.10 5 1,207.50 $ 976.50 $ 1,465.80 $ 1,347.50
13 7 5 10 8
Cortina Safety 03-7T47CW/03-752- Three D Traffic Works JBC H-1200 3M {Open
] C
10# BASE FT-NS28 JBCDTOP3MBV0S TD5100 Top) Bv-08
3 2573| % 1,80110F $ 17.25( % 1,207.50)] & 1595 § 1,116.50| § 22.26{ $ 1,658.20| $ 2139 % 1,487.30
$ 1,801.10 $ 1,207.50 $ 1,116.50 3 1,668.20 § 1,497.30
12 7 5 9 8
GCortina Safety03-747C Wi03.752- Three D Traffic Works JBC H-1200 3M {Open
| BCD
10# BASE FT-N538 J TOPIMBV12 TD5100 Top) Bv-12

Note: * Contractor due difigence affidavit is not applicable term of the contract is under one (1) million doffars

*OFES disclose felony conviction
not applicable higher than low
bidder




Verified by: Sasha Mera
Verified by: Jessica Tyrrell
Verifed by: Herman Ramsey

N QT .

TS U ANES BT

F /A )

-

, W Tally: Solicitation Name: Bid FB-00170 Traffic Cones

Bactge

R.esponsible:

Vendor FEIN & Suffix:

041483973-01

592282857-01

5831225879-02

651055830-01

6502581492-01

1732 S Maine St

3517 Craftsman Blvd

P.O. Box90764

5500 SW 48th Street Suite

2389 NW 13TH ST #6 Miami,

Evaluation

Bid Address: Cheshire CT 06410 Lakeland, FL 33803 Lakeland, FL 33804 B Davie FL 33314 FL 33172
Sun Biz Address: N/A 3517 Craftsman Blvd 8341 Epicenter Blvd 5500 SW 48th Street Suite | 9389 NW 13TH ST #6 Miami,

{akeland, FL 33803 Lakeland, FL 33809 B Davie FL 33314 FL 33172
SBE Certification for Commeodity Code: 55078 - {No.& Exp./date},: Na Nao Ne Ne No
Local Preference Affirmed? No No No Yes Yes
Locally Headquartered Affirmed? No No No Yes Yes
Local Certified Service-Disabled Veteran Affirmed? No No No No No
SBE Affirmed? No No No No Yes
Felony Conviction Disciosure Affirmed? No No No No No

Addenda's Received Affirmed? No of Addenda 2 No/0 Yesi2 Yes/2 Yes/2 Yes/2
Scrutinized Company Yes/No No No Ne Yes No
2.3 a Bidder shall provide contact person telephone number, fax number, and emaii address: Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
2.3 b Bidder shall be the product manufacturer, authorized distributor and/or authorized -reseller Yes/No Letter: No Letter No Letter No Letter No |efter Yesidistributor Letter

*Affidavits 7

Violation Reports Reviewed? / Any Violation Founded?

1 250 Each 12" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $3.50 $ 599! 8 1497501 % 454 |8 1,135.00 $ $ 134750|$% 895:% 2.237.50
1a 375 Each 18" Bafety orange traffic cones with (1) 8" reflective collar $5.72 $ 7751 § 290625 |3 800 S 3,000.00 | $ 8.90 | $ 3,337.50 |$  624(8% 234000l3 12608 4,725.00
1b 100 Each 1" black stencil letters MDFR $0.60 $ 225 % 205008 so0c|$ 800.00 | $ 0.251% 25000 035]% 3500{s 100($ 100.00
Ranking and Total ltem-1 thru 1b: 0 $ 4,628.75 14 $ 4,935.00 o $ 4,237.50 ] $  3,722.50 .5 $ 7,062.50
Make and Model No. for 1: JBC RS 30008C JBC #RS30008C "BC‘R:::‘:S:; :ﬁ:ec"“e' Traffic Safely #C12
Make and Model No. for 1a: JBC RS 450153M6 JBC #RS 46016C3M6 ‘JBC'RSD‘;WRL‘:;I(;:::EC“"& E"""°'C°:;‘*$B_C3 160134
2 250 Each 28" Safety orange traffic cones without reflective collar $6.28 $ g65| % 24125013 7.84!% 1,960.00 | $ 876 | § 244000 |$ 92818 232000|3 1385!% 3,462.50
9a 1,300 Each 28" Sa.fety orange iraffic cones with one(1) 6" and one (1) 4"
reflective collar $9.95 $ 12.92 | $  16,796.00 | § 1204 | § 1585200 1410 | & 16,330.00 | $ 11.97 | $ 1556100[ s 20408 2652000
2b oco Each 1" black stencil letters MDT, or T&G, or MDAD $0.00 $ 225§ 2,02500|% 1204 |3 10,836,001 % 025 | % 22500 1% 035 (% 31500 { % 1.00 | & 900.00
21,233.5 448, 995, 1 882,
Ranking and Totai Item-2 thru 2b: 10 $ ¢ 13 L 28,443.00 9 $ 20,995.00 5 $ 18,1900 15 $ 30,882.50
Make and Model No. for 2: JBC RS 45015C JBC #RS70032C "BC"RS;:‘::;; ffi:ec""e' E"""°'c°h:‘s"’fm_m 16028
Make and Model Ne. for 2a: JBC RS 70032CT JBC #RS70032CTIMB4 JBC'nggnggj:Ms 28" E"‘”“"C°Sma_c7 16028
3 1,425 Each 36" Safely crange traffic cones without reflective collar $10.55 § 18855 2401125)% 13.05]% 1859625 |$ 1570 |$ 2237250 |5 1297 | § 1848225| § 222503 3170625
3a 24175 Each 36 ngety crange traffic cones with one (1) 6" and one (1) 4
reflective collar $13.79 $ 18.95 |5  458116.25 )3 15.05|%  3s3eanvs|s 1650 | $  398,887.50 | $ 1518 |$ 38697650 |5 2650 |3 61648250
3b 16,500 Each 1" black stencil letters MDAD, or MD, or, WASD $0.00 3 225!35  a712500|3 1505|s 248325003 0.30 | § 495000 [$  035)|3  577500]s  100|$  18,500.00
] $  519,252.50 $  630,755.00 $  426210.00 $ 391,233.75 $  664,668.75
Ranking and Total Item-3 thri: 3b: 11 13 8 5 15 1
K JBC-RS90055CT 36" Cone{ Enviro-Conedt 16036
Make and Model No. for 3: JBC RS 90055CT JBC #RS90055CT Non Reflective NSWB-C12
] JBC-RS90055CT3ME4" | Enviro-Conett 16036
Make and Modei N, for 3a: JBC RS 80055CT3ME4 JBC #RS$80065CTIME4 36 Cone-Rufloctive HIWB.C12
0 Each Description -TD5100 Ring Top Delineater or Equai 42"
4 7 8o Ring Top, 4",2-3 Hi Bands, 8# Base $0.00 $ 29.50 | § 2,065.00(% 1320 | % 924.00 | $ 25.02 | $ 175140 |3 1350 |3 94500 |$ 2050 |3 1,435,00
] $ 2,065.00 $ 924.00 $ 1,751.40 $ 945.00 $ 1,436.00
Ranking and Total ltem-4: 14 3 12 4 9
Make and Model No. for 4: JBC D-TOP+3M BVOE | Three D Series 5100,4507605 JBC'°“*"";’;§:°"“‘2 o L°°"e;';l‘j'8’:]fa133'
E " Description -TD5100 Ring Top Delineator or Equal 42"
70 acl i "o
Ring Top, 47,2-3 HI Bands, 10# Base $0.00 s  2050|s 206500 §  14.05| $ 983.50 | § 27.40| $ 191800] 3 1472)s  t1om040f 8 2200]% 1,610.00
. $ 2,065.00 $ 983,50 $ 1,918.00 $  1,030.40 $ 1,610.00
Rankmg and Total Item-5: 14 2 13 4 10
Make and Model No. for 5: JBC D- TOP+3M BY12 Three D Serfes 5100,#50727 JBC‘Diamc'E'::SZ"p"‘Z' 12# L°°”‘;’&L"1"2T_IT:G133'

Note: * Contractor due diligence affidavit is not applicable term of the contract is under one {1} million dollars

The Tools Man Industrial
Supply qualifed bid. Bid is
higher than low bidder




