Bid Tabulation For FB-00306 Alcohol Drug Screening Products and Services

Bidder's Name—>

American Drug Screen Corporation

American Screening Corporation

Avertest

BTNX inc.

Concise Diagnostics

Global Infinity Entarprise ELC

Micre Distributing

Morph Medical LLC

Redwood Toxicology Laboratary,
Inc.
OPTION NO.1

FIN & ADPICS Suffix—>

26-1111180-01

200619862
Mot a Registered Vendor

273929216
Not a Registered Vendor

264301114

Not a Registered Vendor

472270565
Not a Registered Vendor

4733970488
Not a Registered Vendor

74298271101

46-4411447 01

68-03325937 (02

Contact Information-»

Edwina lames
626-941-0100 Ext. 104
Ejames@adsdrugtest.com

Julia Wise
218-798-3306
bids@americanscreeningeerp.com

Jzson Herzog
£04-767-8603
jherzog@avertest.com

David Zhu

905-944-5565
DZhu@btnx.com

Matthew Odette
954-908-0132
pherran@cencisetab.com

Joshua Ross
718-666-7999
bids@giellc.com

Brent Werley
254-935-8923
brentw@micro-distributing.com

Vidya Maharal
305-353-3030
vidys@merphmed.com

Gina Mazzocco
707-570-4304
bids@redwoodtoxicology.com

Did bidder indicate that it has a fefony conviction to disclase?— No No No No Na No No No No
Did bidder affirm Local Preference?—3 No No No Mo Yes No Ne Yes No
Did hidder affirm Local-Headguartered Preference?-» No No No No No No No Yes No
Did bidder affirm Disabled Veteran Business Enterprise Cert,?-> Mo Mo No Mo No Na Noe No No
Did bidder affirm SBE Cert.?> No No No No Mo No Mo Yes 15819 Exp. 5/31/18 Mo
Did bidder initial space regarding Scrutinized Companies?-» Mo No Yes No Yes No Yes No No
ts Submittal Form signed?-3| Yes Yes Yas Yes Yes Yes Yes Yeas Yes
Insurance Certificate Providad?—3| Not'AppHcable for Group {2} No No No No No Na No No
Are Solicitation Affidavits complete?= Yes Yes Yes Yes Yas Yes Yes Yes Yes
Did bidder complete Collusion Affidavit?= Yes No No No Mo Mo No . No No
Was a Non-Responsive Determination Needed?— No No No No No No No No No
I8
Reference
Grou Par. No. Summarized Requirement sidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal Bidder's Submittal
p
L + + A L L ¥ 4 4 + 4 4
= Submit 3 references to which the bidder has
o . o - .
= brovided urine multi-panel drug screening ) v v 4 No v
é laboratory services for a minlmum of 2 consecutive
(=
@B 2.3.1 years.
=
2
-E- Provide a current copy of certification from the No v No Ne b
= é 232 Clinical Laboratory Improvement Amendment (CLIA)
= No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid
g £
F)
a
S Provide a current copy of State of Florida Agency for|
; Healthcare Administration Licensure for Clinical No No sae coments No No v
¥ Laboratory with specialty in Toxicology affirming
g compfiance with Chapter 483, Part |, florida
< Statutes and Chapter 59A-7, Florida Administrative
= 233 {code )
(=]
Z =
w
3EG
é E a2 Submit 3 referances to which the bidder has v v No Bid v : v v v v v
9 ; E provided instant,muiti-panel, urine drug screen
= 2 o cups or dipcards for a minium of 3 consecutive
*e 2,321 [vears ‘

3/31/16 Bidder is not 2 MDC
registered Vendor, Email sent to

Bidder is deemed non responsive,
Bidder taking exceptions te hid

specifications: Price offered is
based on A bundled panel with EtG
hat includes automnatic

bidder advising to register,
JReference 2.3.3 certification bidder
states they currently do not have the

Comments—>

3/31/16 Bidder is not a MDC
2/31/16 Bidder fs not a MDC registered Vendor, Emal sent to

reglsterad Vender. Email sent to

certification because they do not

3/31/16 Bidder is not a MDC registered bidder advising to register. Bidder

Vendor. Email sent to bidder advising to

canfirmation of positive drugs by
GC-MS or LC-MS/MS, depending on
drug class, These confirmations

have any contracts with the State of

Florida howeaver, will obtaln if bidder advising to register. Bidder ailed to provide certifications as per [Bidder initiaked scrutinized
awarded the contract. Bidder

Initialed scrutinized companies

3/31/16 Bidder is not a MDC
registered Vendor. Email sent to
bidder advising to register, Bidder Is
not low bidder for either groups,

failed to provide certifications as per §2.3.2 and 2.3.3. Group 1 as per 2.23 [Jcompanies space. Bidder vendor
2.3.2 and 2.3.3, Bidder initialed

scrutinized companies space. Bidder Jas a requirement. Bidder is not low

register, Bidder faited to provide copies of
Bidder failed to provide 3 references Jregistration is showing status as would be at no additional charge.
inactive, Bidder is not low bidder for | Bidder is not low bidder for either :

eithar groups, Jeroups.

the required certifications as per 2.3.2 and
2.3.3 In Group {1). Bidder is not low bidder
for either groups.

Recommended bidder for award Bidder is not low bidder for either

Jeroup {2)

space. Bldder s not low bidder for

either groups. bidder for efther groups. groups.

lis not low bidder for either groups.

THIS TABULATHON 35 NOT A DETERMINATION OF AWARD, RESPONSIVENESS, OR RESPONSIBILITY. THE INFORMATION IN THIS BOCUMENT 15 SUBJECT TO CHANGE.
Prepared by M, Garofols
Reviewed by R, Campbell
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Bid Tabulation For FB-00306 Alcohol Drug Screening Products and Services

Redwood Toxicology taboratory,

Redwood Toxicology Laboratory,

Redwood Toxicelegy Laboratory,

Inc. Inc. inc.

OPTION NO.2 OPTION NO.3 OPTION NO.4 Phamatech, fnc. Smart Sales Inc. LabCorp Sterling healthcare Opco

454082413

68-0332937 02 68-0332937 02 63-0332937 02 330836223 01 Not a Registered Vendor

Gina Mazzacco Gina Mazzoceo Gina Mazzocto Duffy Nabars

707-570-4304 707-570-4304 707-570-4304 Dana Conde 632-200-6670

bids@redwoodtoxicology.com bids@redwoodtoxicology.cam bids @ redwaodtoxicology.com 8838-635-5840 dconde@phamatech.com duffy.nabors@smartox.com

No Ne No Mo No
No No No No No
No Ne No No No
No No No No No No bid No bid
No No No No Mo
No No No No Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No No Pending No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No No Yes Ne
No No Mo No Ne

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

Bidder's Submittal

& 4 4 + L L +
v v b v
v v v v
No Bid
No bid No bid
v v Vv v
v v v v v

Bidder is deermed non responsive,
Bidder taking exceptions to bid
specifications: Price offered is
based on A bundted panef with EtG
that includes automatic
cenfirmation of positive drugs by
GC-MS or LC-MS/MS, depending on
drug class. These confirmations
would be at no additional charge.
Bidder is not fow bidder for either
groups.

Bitider taking exceptions to bid
specification: Price offeres is based
on a bundled panel with Ethanol
that includes automatic
confirmation of positive drugs by
GC-FID, GC-MS, or LC-BES/M5,
depending on drug class. These
confirmations would be at no
additional charge. Bidder is not low
I!Jidder for either groups.

Bidder is deemed non responsive,
Bidder taking exceptions to bld
specifications: Price offered is
based on A bundled panel with EtG
that includes automatic
confirmation of positive drugs by
GC-MS or LC-MS/MS, depending on
drug class. These confirmations
woutd be at no additional charge.

gronps.

IBidder is not fow bidder for either

Recommended bidder for award group

(1)

14/1/16 Bidder is not a MDC
reglistered Vendor. Erpail sent to

bidder advising to register, Bidder
Initfaled scrutinized companies
space. Bidder is not low bidder for
either groups,

Reason for No Bid: Does not wish to
bid on this solicitation.

Reason for No Bid: Inadequate time
to respond.
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FE-00206 81D TABULATION ALCOHOL AND DRUG SCREENING PRODUCTS AND SERVICES

Redwood Toxicology Redwood Toxicology Redweod Toxicology Redwood Toxlcology
American Orug Screen American Screening Glabol Infinity Enterprise Laboratory, fnc. Laborotory, inc. lLaboratory, Inc. Laboratory, Inc, )
Bidder's Name- Corporation Carporation Avertest BTNX Inc. Concise Diagnostics i Micro Distributing Morph Medical OPTION NO.1 OPTION NO.Z GPTION NO.3 QPTION NO.4 Phamatech, inc. Smart Sales Jnc. LabCorp Sterling heaithcare Opro
item Estimated Unit Unit Extended Extended uUrit extended Unit Unit Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extenaes
Group No, Quantities Item: Description Unit Price}Extended Price§Unit Price§ Exterded Price | Price ] Extended Prica | Price Price it Price Price Price Price Unit Price] Extended Price |Unit Price| Extended Price |Unit Price] Extended Price | Price | Extended Price] Price Price Uit Price; Price Unit Price Price Unit Price] Price Unit Price Prica init Price Price
e + NG <+ J 4 + o & b L A N 4 4 R + 4 o4 ¥ + + b < & 4 4 - 4 L + + + 4 ¥ 4
-
25
= e
aa
281,
-4
a g E No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mg Bid Na sld No Bid
=y &
R
g =
24 Urine Sample Testing 7 Penel Screen as per
1 6,282 Section 3, Paragraph $17.00 5106,794.00] $12.90 $81,037.80 $105.00! $659,610f $3.2035F $20,124.387, 53.15 $19,788.30 55.65 $35,493,30) 55,658 535,453.30)] $56.90, 543,345 B0| 54,25 $26,698.50
Totgl 3105, 794.00 $81,037.80 $652,61'D $20,124.387 519,788.30 $35,493.30 $35,493.30 $43,345.80 $26,698.50
Preliminary Ranking-> See Comment Sea Comment See Comment See Comment See Comment ) ‘1
The price of $3.15 is for The price of $5.65 is for
screen only confirmation  Iscreen anly confirmation
Bidder failed to provide |[fee not kicluded. A |fee not included. A
Comments 3 references per separate price offeredis  Iseparate price offered Is
requirements. Bidder js $20.00 Confirmation per  [$10.00 Confirmation per |The price offered The price offered
able to provids anfy 1 druy for 7 drug panel with fdrug for 7 drug ponel inciudes confirmation  |inclides confirmation
referenca. ethonal with ethano! ee e
. T fogy d i Toxicalk fedwood Toxicolegy Redwood Toxicology
Americon Drug Screen American Screering Global Infinity Enterprise teboratory, inc. Laboratory, inc. Loberatory, inc. Laboratory, inc,
Bidder's Name-> _Corporation Corgoration Avertast BINX Inc, Contise Dingnostics LLC Micra Distributing Morph Medicol OPTION NO.1 OPTION NG.2 OPTION NO.3 OPTION NO.4 Phamatech, fac. Smmait Sales e LabCorp Sterling healthcare Opca
Item Estimated Unit Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended nit ini Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended Extended
Group No. Quantities Itemn Description Hnit Price] £xtended Price |Unit Price] Extended Price | Price § Extended Price | Price Price Unit Price Price Price Prite Unit Price] Extended Price JUnit Price] Extended Price | Unit Price{ Extended Price | Prica  {Extended Price| Price Price Unit Price] Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price ttnit Price Price Unit Price| Price
¥+ N € L - <+ 4 4 ) A & | o 4 + L + & - 4 + + 4 - + + 4 - - ) J N 4 1 + 34
9w
25
53
2
o No Bid No EBid
[=]
= Z
o=
S
< o .
=8 Integrated Urine Callection Drug Testing Cup as
1 31,410 |per Section 3 Paragraph 3.3 52,10 $65,961.00] $2.89 30, 774.90 Wo Bid 52500 578,525,00] 54.25] 5133,452.50 5245 $76,985.91 $2.86 $89,832.60 $5.18; $162,075.501 $2.18; $68,473.80 $2.18] 568,473.80) 52,138 568,473.80] 52.18] $68,473.80) 5235 $73,813.50) §2.25 $70,672.50
Total | $65,961.00 $90,774.50 $78,525.00 $133,492.50 57698591 589,832,560 $162,075.50 569, 473.80 568,473,580 $58,473.80 $68,473.80 $73,813.50 $70,672.50
Freliminary Ranking-> i
Comments—
. . i | OPTIONALFRODUCTS . -
Redwood Toxlcalogy d d Toxicolog Redwood Toxicology Redwaod Toxicalogy
American Drug Screen American Screening Global Infinity Enterprise taboratary, inc. Loboratory, Inc. Laboratory, Inc. Laberatary, Inc.
Bldder’s Nurma) Corparetion Corporation Avertest BTNX Inc. Concise Biagnostics HC Micro Ristributhig Morph Medical OFTION NO.1 OPTION NG.2 OFTION NO.3 OPTION NO.4 Phamatech, Inc. Smart Sales fnc. LabCorp Sterling healthcare Opca
Item Estimated
Group Na, Quantities item Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price. Unit Price Unit Price Unit Frice Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Prica
+ + 4 3 4 & 4 N L 4 & & & ¥ N 3+ 4 S 4 +
1 i Each Synthetic cannabinoids {K2/Spice} $18.00 rach standard $18.00 each standard § 518,00 each standard $18.00 each standard -
1 e
g @ 2 1 Fach Ethyl glucuronide / ethyl sulfate (ETG/ETS) 545,00 each premium 4580 each premiump $45.00 each premium $45.00 each premium
g a 3 1Each _ |Phencyclidine (pcp) $3.00 43.00 $3.00 53,00
(=}
g‘ a 4 1 Each Methadone (MTD) $3.00 $3.00 53,00
&
23 5 1 Each Fostazy (MDMA] 4$3.00 53.00 53.00 $3.00
Ee
o % & 1 Each Buprenorphine (BUP} 55.60 screen only! 35,00 screen only $5.80 screen onby) $5.00 screen anly|
ez
= 7 1 Each Methamphetamine {MET) $3.00 screen only $3.00 screen only $3.00 screen only] $3.00 screen only|
B 1 Each Oxycodone (DY) £5.00 screen ont 55,00 screen only $5.00 screen onk 55.00 sereen only
Pricing for Cptional Product{s) shalf nog affect method of award, Award shall be based on pricing for Reguired Product{s} anly,
Redwood Toxicology dwood Toxicolagy Redwood Toxicology dwood Toxicology
American Drug Screen Armericon Screening Glabal infinity Enterprise Loboratery, inc. Laboratery, inc. Laboratery, fnc. Laboratory, Ing,
Bidder's Nome—> Corporotion Corporation Avertest BINX Inc, Concise Dingnastics LLC Micro Distributing Morph Medicol OFTION NO.1 OPTION NG.2 OPTION NO.3 OPTION NO.4 Phamatech, Iac. Smart Sales lne. tabCarp Sterling healthcare Opco
Item Estimated
Group No, Quantities ttem Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Prce Unit Price Unit Price
+ 4 N 4 4 4 R 4 + ¥ 4 4 <+ + & <+ + 3+ + +
1 1 Each Phencyclidine {PCP) £8.20 SGLS_B 5128.96 box af 35
B‘ § 2 1 Each Methadone {MTD) 50,20 5 $0.39 512,49 bow of 25 ,
3 E 3 1Each Synthetic cannabineids {K2/Spice} s1.20 $1.79 %£12.45 box of 25
g
& E 4 1 Each Ecstasy {MDMA} $0.20 - 56.39 512,49 box of 25
= E 5 1 Each Buprenorphine (BUP) $6.2G 50.39 $12,49 box, of 25
z
= = [ 1 Fach Aicohot .04 $0.16 $0,71 $12.49 box of 25
F —
5 2 7 1 Each Methamphetamin= {MET} 30,20 30.39 512,49 box of 25
EE 8 1fach  loxycodone {(Oxy) $0.20 5039 $50.63 box of 25
g2
- 9 1 Each Ethyl glucuronide / ethyl sulfate [ETG/ETS) $1.50 $3.57 $92.81 benk of 25
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