

TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: FB-00360

Summary Description: Fusee/Flares (Traffic/Marine Signals)

Bid Opening 5/6/2016

Prepared by: Mary Hammett

*Mary Hammett 6/8/16*

*Najaly Bode 6/8/16*

Verified by: ED Tipton

*Najaly Bode 06/08/16*

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow ( and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor Name:				F5Vortex LLC DBA: Black Bear Solutions 472635451-01				Genuine Parts Co. DBA: NAPA AUTO PARTS 580254510-01							
Sunbiz Address:				3045 Turnbull Bay Rd New Smyrna Beach, FL 32168				2999 Circle 75 Parkway Atlanta, GA 30339							
ADPICS Address:				Same as above				9250 58TH Street Doral FL33178							
Affidavits Completed (yes or no):				Yes				Yes							
Is the bid responsive (if no, state reason below):				Yes				Yes							
Indicate SBD certification:				No				Yes							
Registered vendor (Yes/no):				Yes				Yes							
Incumbent vendor (Yes/no):				No				No							
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/no):				No				Yes							
Locally-Headquartered (Yes/no):				No				Yes							
Local Certified Veteran (Yes/no):				No				No							
Items being procured per current solicitation			Current	Unit Price	Extended Price	Negotiated Unit Price	Negotiated Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	1-Negotiated Unit Price	1-Negotiated Extended Price	2-Negotiated Unit Price	2-Negotiated Extended Price		
Item no.	Description	Estimated Quantity Annually	Unit Price	Price	Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Price	Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price		
1	Traffic Flares In accordance with Section 3.2	50,000	\$1.14	Manufacturer: Orion Model No.:RTZ9340 Quantity Per Case: 36	\$6.50	\$325,000.00			Manufacturer: Orion Model No.:BK770-6303 Quantity Per Case: 36	\$2.69	\$134,500.00	\$2.35	\$117,500.00	\$1.84	\$92,000.00
2	Marine Flares In accordance with Section 3.3	500	\$0.00	Manufacturer: West Marine Model No.:WES8665770 Quantity Per Case : 4	\$15.82	\$7,910.00	\$8.00	\$4,000.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Identify Non-responsive vendors and reason:

**THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)**

TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: FB-00360

Summary Description: Fusee/Flares (Traffic/Marine Signals)

Bid Opening 5/6/2016

Prepared by: Mary Hammett *Mary Hammett 6/8/16*

Verified by: ED Tipton *ED Tipton* Najaly Bode *Najaly Bode 06/05/16*

Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yell

Vendor Name:	Lawmens & Shooter Supply, Inc	Standard Fusee Corp DBA: Orion Safety Products 061240151-01
Sunbiz Address:		28320 St Michaels Rd Easton, MD 21601
ADPICS Address:		P.O. Box 1047 Easton MD 21601
Affidavits Completed (yes or no):		
Is the bid responsive (if no, state reason below):		
Indicate SBD certification:		
Registered vendor (Yes/no):		Yes
Incumbent vendor (Yes/no):		Yes
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/no):		No
Locally-Headquartered (Yes/no):		No
Local Certified Veteran (Yes/no):		No

  

Items being procured per current solicitation			Current	Unit		Unit	Extended
Item no.	Description	Estimated Quantity Annually	Unit Price	Price		Price	Price
1	Traffic Flares In accordance with Section 3.2	50,000	\$1.14	NO BID	Manufacturer: Standard Fusee Corp ModelNo.:9340 Quantity Per Case 36	\$56.16	\$2,808,000.00
2	Marine Flares In accordance with Section 3.3	500	\$0.00	NO BID		No Bid	No Bid

Identify Non-responsive vendors and reason:

**THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)**