MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/building
E.S. Windows, LL.C

3550 NW 49 Street

Miami, FL 33142

Scoprk:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER-
Product Control Section to be used in Miami-Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami-Dade County) and/ or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami-Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform
in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately
revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right
to revoke this acceptance if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product
or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “EL200” Aluminum Horizontal Rolling Window - L.M.L.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W16-86, titled “ES-EL200 Horizontal Rolling Alum. Wdw.
(L.M.L.)”, sheets 1, 2, 3, 3.1, 4 and 5 through 11 of 11, dated 12/19/16, with revision D dated 06/22/20, prepared
by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product
Control Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County
Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Colombia, model/series, and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", unless
otherwise noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in
the materials, use, and/ or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of
any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.
ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors
and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA No. 20-1208.07 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3 and
E-4, as well as approval document mentioned above.

The submitted documentation was reviewed by Manuel Perez, P.E.

NOA No. 21-0608.03

MIAMIUNTY Expiration Date: January 19, 2027
Approval Date: September 02, 2021

8/20/21 Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

[y

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s

A. DRAWINGS

1. Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0617.04)

2. Drawing No. W16-86, titled “ES-EL200 Horizontal Rolling Alum. Wdw. (L.M.1.)”,
sheets 1, 2, 3, 3.1, 4 and 5 through 11 of 11, dated 12/19/16, with revision D dated
06/22/20, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 20-1208.07)

B. TESTS
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of an aluminum horizontal
sliding window, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report No.
FTL-11027, dated 04/23/20, signed and sealed by Idalmis Ortega, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 20-1208.07)
2. Test reports on: 1) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
2) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of an aluminum horizontal
sliding window, prepared by Blackwater Testing, Inc., Test Report No.
BT-ESW-17-007, dated 10/24/17, and addendum letter dated 12/15/16, both signed
and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 18-0221.03)
3. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Forced Entry Test, per FBC, and TAS 202-94
5) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
6) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of an aluminum horizontal
sliding window, prepared by Blackwater Testing, Inc., Test Report No.
BT-ESW-16-007, dated 12/08/16, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0617.04)

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exami
NOA No. 21-
Expiration Date: January 19,
Approval Date: September 02, 2021




E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)
C. CALCULATIONS

1.

2.

Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 5%
Edition (2014), dated 06/10/15, and updated on 11/09/20 to comply with FBC 7t
Edition (2020), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-1208.07)

Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE

1.

Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1.

Notice of Acceptance No. 18-0725.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their

“Kuraray SentryGlas® Xtra™ (SGX™) Clear Glass Interlayer” dated 05/23/19,
expiring on 05/23/24.

Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 05/09/19,
expiring on 07/08/24.

Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0622.01 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
for their “Saflex PVB Clear and Color Glass Interlayers” dated 08/06/20, expiring
on 05/21/21.

Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0622.03 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
for their “Saflex Storm - Saflex and Saflex HP Composite Glass Interlayers with
PET Core” dated 08/06/20, expiring on 12/11/23.

F. STATEMENTS

1.

Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 6" Edition (2017), with FBC 7t
Edition (2020), and of no financial interest, dated November 9, 2020, issued by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA’s No. 20-1208.07)

Testing proposal issued by the Product Control Section, dated 04/15/13, signed by
Jaime Gascon, P.E., Product Control Supervisor.

(Submitted under NOA’s No. 20-1208.07)

Distributor Agreement signed by Carlos Garcia and by Evelyn Daes.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0617.04)

Laboratory compliance statement for Test Report No. BT-ESW-16-007, issued by
Blackwater Testing, Inc., dated 12/08/16, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0617.04)

Proposal No. 16-1228 issued by the Product Control Section, dated 11/16/16, signed
by Manuel Perez, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 16-0617.04)

Manuel Pérez, P.E.
Product Control Examai

Expiration Date: January 19;
Approval Date: September 02, 2021



E.S. Windows, LL.C

[y

(]

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA'’s (CONTINUED)

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 18-0221.03, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Series
“EL200” Aluminum Horizontal Rolling Window - L.M.I., approved on 05/10/18 and
expiring on 01/19/22.

NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

DRAWINGS

1. None.

TESTS

1. None.

CALCULATIONS

1. None.

QUALITY ASSURANCE

1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.19 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20, expiring on
07/04/23.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.

3. Notice of Acceptance No. 21-0216.01 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
for their “Saflex PVB Interlayers - Clear and Colored for Glass” dated 04/29/21,
expiring on 05/21/26.

4. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0622.03 issued to Eastman Chemical Company (MA)
for their “Saflex Storm - Saflex and Saflex HP Composite Glass Interlayers with
PET Core” dated 08/06/20, expiring on 12/11/23.

STATEMENTS
1. None.

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-1208.07, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Series
“EL200” Aluminum Horizontal Rolling Window - L.M.I., approved on 02/18/21 and
expiring on 01/19/22.

Manuel Pérez, P.E.
Product Control Exapai
NOA No. 21-
Expiration Date: January 19,
Approval Date: September 02, 2021




72 15/16" 72 15/16” 72 15/16" .
FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH |
12
(3) ANCHORS " (3) ANCHORS " (3) ANCHORS
o AT MTG. STILE ENDS A0 M 2z e AT MTG. STILE ENDS oC M i AT MTG. STILE ENDS o MAX.
AX. AT 5" O.C. I MA- AT 5" O.C. HEAD On_INaie AT 5” O.C. HEAD |
HEAD/SILL S ; HEAD/SILL HEAD/SILL
CORNERS *w 5 CORNERS @ CORNERS @
T T T~ | T T~ -
L4 1 Iy | L 1 N : e L
i I g I | ] e T . ) J ) 7 A3 7 |
== =
i T | 1 | |
il il 1l
[ S PR T sdbooode |
—_ [ e — { -
| i, n N s ~ oy R s AR I .
<3 AN A &7 1 2 s 7, S L
£ & &/ /A 7z \&J | o N A 77 £ g N I A ]
<8 &l | TemreAETEEE "/ e %8 1B wle I AT s s %[0 3|8 5 |0 / ST S
< Qg ]| I i! | <l J|g Qg I | < L5 Q|2 il ? ‘
2T S N|© I K ' 2T~z N|© I | =T ST N|© ':‘J> i }
Y wle w0l [|':|'>|: Ty ||':|_I>|I o2 el el | I | Fn
oz VG wia —H _____Jl_:_________Jﬁ______ T, |2 © g wla T = _____Lr:__________.{,{_____: 5 ©lT PG wio _____H_________I I . s2l@
R i - 1 K Lxe [E 7 1 il |- A b I I 3z
- | o<|=s | o <|= I =<
Il 1 h -3 2 I Iy -3= I I q
| i I h | _1 Il I 1 I J 1 h
| __u____#_ I e | I Sedl=rmai ol
, =A== === =qE===Ts
. yal ' I ' 0 l
I | 1. T 1 P | —
- A1 — i = = i =L
s I_H \ 3 \ J 0 v — . - I
B S _E/ /E“\"I 1" % ~m§ B S L~ 11" S 'mé B RN i g 12" ‘ | im%
FALSE MUNTINS 4 ) VN4 | Max 2=z MAX. %3z \8/ MAX. | -1
(SURFACE APPLIED) I\ ST 35k SILL Ik e S IEY
MAY BE USED ([ ) = o = o | ©
32 11/16" |\ 32 11/18 32 11/16" 32 11/16" 32 11/16" 32 11/16"
D.L. OPG. \ D.L. OPG. o D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. <
L 36 9/16” . (3) ANCHORS 36 9/16" (3) ANCHORS 36 9/16" (3) ANCHORS
VENT WIDTH ' ‘— AT MTG. STILE ENDS VENT WIDTH AT M:!’G. STILE ENDS VENT WIDTH AT MTG. STILE ENDS
AT 5" 0.C. AT 5" O.C. AT 5" O.C.

TYPICAL ELEVATION

FLANGE FRAMES

THESE WINDOWS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.
SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.

ES-EL200

HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUMINUM WINDOW (L.M.I.)

APPROVAL APPLIES TO SINGLE UNITS OR SIDE BY SIDE
COMBINATIONS OF H.R./H.R. OR HORIZONTAL ROLLING WITH
OTHER WINDOW TYPES IN MODULES OF TWO OR MORE WINDOWS
USING MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS IN BETWEEN.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURE FROM WINDOWS OR MULLION NOA WILL

APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017 (BTH EDITION)/2020 (7TH EDITiON) FLORIDA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON—COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017/2020 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER [INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.
CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

TYPICAL ELEVATION

FLANGE FRAMES WITH FLUSH ADAPTER

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-N

21-0608.03

O.

Expiration Date-01/19/2027

By
Miami-Dade Produc CQ_p ol

THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE

R e T

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON 'ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'".

TYPICAL FLFVATION
FLANGE FRAMES WITH FIN ADAPTER

MAXIMUM DESIGN LOAD RATING = + 65.0 PSF
(FOR SIZES SHOWN ABOVE OR SMALLER)

MTG. STILES WITHOUT REINFORCING

65.0 PSF

MAXIMUM DESIGN LOAD RATING = + 80.0 PSF
(FOR SIZES SHOWN ABOVE OR SMALLER)

MTG. STILES WITH REINFORCING

- 90.0 PSF

OPERATING VENTS CAN BE 1/4 TO 1/3 OF WINDOW WIDTH
MAX. D.L. OPG. FOR FIXED LITE NOT TO EXCEED 12.7 SQ. FT.

FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. FRAME AREA OF WINDOW
NOT TO EXCEED TESTED FRAME AREA OF 31.46 SQ. FT.

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No.

Expiration Date: 01/19/2022
Bymmzém

Miami/—Pade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol

20-1208.07

DEC 0 12

a
f
€

COMP—ANL\W16—86ES |

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

—-5158 ] =

| TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

FAX. (305) 638

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI,

J( ES—EL200 HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW. (LM..) ]

!

INTERLAYERS ON SHEET 3 ADDED

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC

by [description

no| date
A [01.11.17
B [09.27.17
c [01.12.18
D [06.22.20

(revisions:

1'=0"

12-19-16

scale: 1,2
dr. by: TARIQ

date:

drawing no.

W16—-86
sheet 1 of 11)



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


110" 110"
FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH
i LY 5
7" MAX. Al WIG: S/IT'LEHEED(;S 19" MAX. 7" MAX. A = AT 19" MAX.
HEAD/SILL = HEAD HEAD/SILL N _ HEAD
/ 4 - 4 - T~ 7 - — T T~
CORNERS e ~ T CORNERS T e | @5 %
- ! ! ! !" ! ~—T T T L N S i I
4 = = — =
- . .l "
il | il 1
pan i | - et 1 25
I A / i, L F AN AA / ~
£ AN 7, & A L AN, 7, & 7,
= = \8/ Al = v v/ \&/ = = 2/ ___u_(é__,l = {; (; 7/
228 w8 wlg W T d 7 T 8 wiE wig T T i
e N H,:l‘>:{ <‘,:' =T S R[S ||‘:.l|>|: ' l
= = o ld N ! s W ole ol I b .
o= 3 : ! d=z= vz © - i || S —
olg v E 0 N I "_—__—_J*I—_—_—_—__J:;_—_—_- 0 ©|L ] [a} - |_I:*_:'_—‘_"_I gyl | .
o > i I| S| >< m E > I || | H >< m
- 4 h og|= i l o=z
1 L -3\Z I L -2z
| - Al
:_“::::}ﬂ: ——H_-___%::_
/|| | Il I
- ! 1 T tal > | Tl > = - b ) 1 VA ) I TN | | N { e
! ! LRI U L 1 ” | | B LU L U | L - "
FALSE MUNTINS_/ B ~o -7 /B ~L L 11 |8 = 3 | AL~ 1" | . |
(SURFACE APPLIED) MAX. %5y o MAX ) %32
MAY BE USED SILL e EY= SILL Ts|Sx
[le] o © o
[&] (5]
32 11/16” 32 11/16" 32 11/16" & e (3) ANCHORS 32 11/16” 32 11/16" _ s211/18"
D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. ~— AT MTG. STILE ENDS AT MTG. STILE ENDS—" D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. :
. AT 5" 0.C. AT 5" 0.C. . :
36 9/16" 36 9/16’ 36 9/16 36 9/16 A
VENT WIDTH VENT WIDTH VENT WIDTH VENT WIDTH
TYPICAL ELEVATION TYPICA LEVATION PRODUCT RENEWED
FLANGE FRAMES e - 10" . — & FLANGE FRAMES WITH FLUSH ADAPTER 55 complying with the Florida
@) littiors FRAME WIDTH Building Code
— AT MTG. STILE ENDS — ’31 /fx NOA-No. 21-0608.03
: AT 5" 0.C. | . ’ L ]
HEAD/SILL AN | ~HEAD Expiration Date-01/19/2027
CORNERS T 4 - ; By
< S o = ! Miami-Dade Producf Contyol
] _’J % 7
MAXIMUM DESIGN LOAD RATING = + 65.0 PSF
A Y N !y (FOR SIZES SHOWN ABOVE OR SMALLER) — 65.0 PSF
:_“:::: ot N :_”:::: b .
= ” ; :: (F \ H ; :: T ; - i, MTG. STILES WITHOUT REINFORCING
) /N \6 )/ s a\ 86/ / G\ 1
B e &/ [ Il 7l == A E—’ v/ N8/
ICERN ) i 8 g Tt b =5 e e -/ MAXIMUM DESIGN LOAD RATING = + 80.0 PSF
3E SE XS i i I: i }} <= . (FOR SIZES SHOWN ABOVE OR SMALLER)  — 90.0 PSF
N zs g2 1 A I I | e MTG. STILES WITH REINFORCING
& g \ —— T | B REE
= ; ) l : ! ES OPERATING VENTS CAN BE 1/4 TO 1/3 OF WINDOW WIDTH
I | | I Y MAX. D.L. OPG. FOR FIXED LITE NOT TO EXCEED 12.7 SQ. FT.
PR E [ | I b
= - ——n——--#}- FOR ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS MAX. FRAME AREA OF WINDOW
" ' [ ] : | NOT TO EXCEED TESTED FRAME AREA OF 47.36 SQ. FT.
|
s | ‘ PRODUCT REVISED
= : = e ~ as complying with the Florida
— = B0 r < =1k ) ] Building Code
/8 = ]| S i 12" |o®  NOA-No. 20-1208.07
&) / i MAX. 3 % 3% Expiration Date: 01/19/2022
i I SILL | 258 KW
s , O By: ALy
(3) ANCHORS .:./ 32 11/16 32 11/16 L 32 1_1_116 _J ‘ MiamjéDade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol
AT MTG. STILE ENDS—| D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. DEC 0 120
AT 5” 0.C." .,
| 36 9/16" | 36 9/16 <
' VENT WIDTH ' : VENT WIDTH ;

TYPICAL ELEVATION

FLANGE FRAMES WITH FIN ADAPTER

e
f
c

(C.A.N. 3538 )}
COMP—ANL\W16—86ES )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

-5158 l(

FAX. (305) 638

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

J( ES—EL200 HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WOW. (LM..) ]

|

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

by description

(revisions:
(nol date
A [01.11.17
B [09.27.17
c [01.12.18
D |06.22.20

.

ate:  12-19-16 }

<4
2
=
Fy
N
©

chk. by:

Lscale:

e

drawing no.

W16—-86
sheet 2 of 11



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


T
U (]
L
Y ©
0
(] i
N
z 322
Or 138|2
-z 2 <;:
ke 28
L S =0
m 9 [o) \L’__ § (&
N 2
SEN
ok 2
1/8" TEMP. GLASS 1/8" TEMP. GLASS o5 ?) -
2 _"
3/8" AR SPACE 5/16" AR SPACE gg§§ .
1/8" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS 1/8” HEAT STREN’D. GLASS 1/8” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS 1/8" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS o Egg 3
.090" Interlayer .090" Interlayer .090" Interlayer T .090” Interlayer ) ggE g
Trosifol PVB Trosifol PVB Trosifol PVB | Trosifol PVB 14 xZ 9 8
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’ By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’ By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’ \ By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’ g i (?) . ]
| —
OR OR OR . OR Lz S8
.090” Interlayer .090" Interlayer \ .090" Interlayer '.I .090” Interlayer - 80g
SentryGlas SentryGlas | SentryGlas '. SentryGlas < i g,’ S
By ‘Kuraray America, inc.’ By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ \ By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ \ By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ -
OR OR | —OR | —OR -
.090" Interlayer .090" Interlayer \ | | .090" Interlayer \ | || .090" Interlayer =
Saflex Clear And Color Glass Saflex Clear And Color Glass \ '|I \ Saflex Clear And Color Glass \ 0l Saflex Clear And Color Glass f
By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ | | | By ’Eastman Chemical Co.’ | | | By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ ~ ©
OR OR | 1] or I 1] or = L
| | 1 |
.075" interlayer .075" Interlayer Vo .075” Interlayer |} | .075" Interlayer 2 ?
Saflex CP With PET Core Saflex CP With PET Core \ | | Saflex CP With PET Core Vo | Saflex CP With PET Core . 3
By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ \ | | | By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ || |I By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ = o
'\ |II 1 | \ 1 \ = —~
1/8” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS 1/4" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS \". I". I'. | 1—1/8" HEAT STREN’D. GLASS \ ll'.l '.I lI —1/4” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS S §
\ | \ 1 %) N
\ I', \ |1 \ I'. |1 | = .
: SILICONE . SILICONE ¥ VL SILICONE . EREE SILICONE 319+ %
% = DOWSIL 795 % 2 DOWSIL 795 % w Vol DOWSIL 795 % G Vo || | DOWSIL 795 eioy -«
= DOWSIL 983 = DOWSIL 983 = \ VLl -powsit 983 = \ ]| powsi g83 @
P DOWSIL 2400 z DOWSIL 2400 Z | |11/ powsiL 2400 Z VL1 L/ powsiL 2400 2l o -
=4 (HOT MELT) =8 (HOT MELT) 9 T/~ (HOT MELT) =4 - T/~ (HOT MELT) = = ¥ o
|2 ) (2 [\ D £ RIO2Mm?
@ / N N \ ~|° / A g Q M ]
| | / \ T 4 \". I|Zx ;9
| 1 A
) I.l | g B g o
& & x ,r o \ / ! i L{LO) <
© @ @ S / S / Didm s #
e w i 4 x ” e ——
& £ : b A )
@ g 42 5 5 ()
o
w Lt
GLASS TYPE ‘1’ GLASS TYPE ‘2’ GLASS TYPE ‘1i’ GLASS TYPE ‘2i’ Egé
5/16” OVERALL LAM. GLASS 7/16” OVERALL LAM. GLASS 7/8” OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS 7/8" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS % "': 4 N
S
PRODUCT RENEWED 8§ ‘;‘ S g
as complying with the Florida AL
GLAZING OPTIONS Building Code SHEE
NOA-No. 21-0608.03 éa ’é E’ i
i
Expiration Date-01/19/2027 [SIE= =S
2]
By PMRNREE
Miami-Dade Product Control cllo/=z|3|Y
- Olg|= (N |5 |
PRODUCT REVISED Sl5(815]8
as complying with the Florida e 8 <|mfo|o
Building Code =
NOA-No. 20-1208.07 A\ eeeen ] : ol -
5/16” & 3/8” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF: Expiration Date: 01/19/2022 2l el v e
SeaCER; oy Mtiutlh Jpins 2 M E
‘HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER i i/ )1 "i\q’: el B
NOTE: BY 'LINGERMANN GMBH’ Miam :Datl_e ProductTontrol : = IR
— e ==l ol s«
GLASS CAPACITIES ARE AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS. DEC 0 1 202 EPEIE SIS
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS) PERIMETER SEALANT: "3/ |[ drawing  no.
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION SILICONE %‘S/ W16—86
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAQ5-DEC-219 DOWSIL 791 %$\\ > -
\
GE 2000 T (sheet 3 of 11)



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


1/2" MIN. TYP.

EXTERIOR

GLASS BITE

1/8" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090" Interlayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

1/4" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

SILICONE
DOwWSIL 795

AT 1/4 POINTS ON LITES
WIDER THAN 36" ONLY

1/8” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090"

Interlayer

SentryGlas

By

M1A

1/2" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

T

EXTERIOR

M3

GLASS TYPE 2A’
7/16" OVERALL LAM. GLASS

GLASS

5/1 6" AIR SPACE

1/8" TEMP.

I
SILICONE
DOWSIL 791
(1/8" X 1/4")

\

1/2" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

EXTERIOR
g ;

.—1/8" HEAT STREN’D. GLASS

.090” Interlayer
SentryGlos

By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.

'. —1/4" HS. GLASS

_ SILICONE
/ DOWSIL 795

/< AT 1/4 POINTS
) ALL SIZES

‘—KM

GLASS TYPE ‘2Aj’
7/8" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

‘Kuraray America, inc.’

1/4” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

SILICONE
DOWSIL 795

AT 1/4 POINTS ON UTES
WIDER THAN 36" ONLY

GLAZING OPTIONS

DOWSIL 791
(1/8” X 1/16”)

1/2" MIN. TYP.

.090”

interloyer

VS/”S" HEAT STREN’D. GLASS

\  — SentryGlas

By 'Kuraray America,

Inc.’

3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090” interlayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

3/16” HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

SILICONE

1 DOWSIL 795
M1A

ot

\
o \ ~— 3/16" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS -
F | - E
2B SILICONE 2 |®
s 9 _/ DOWSIL 795 =3
el
na AN w3
~ \ ~
— ‘\ L
- ‘\I 3
II
|
f
/
/

EXTERIOR

@ AT 1/4 POINTS ON LITES

10

EXTERIOR

/ WIDER THAN 36" ONLY

1/4" TEMP. GLASS

5/16" AIR SPACE
1/8" HEAT STREN'D. GLASS

.090" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB

By ‘Kuraray America,
OR

.090" Interlayer
SentryGlas

GLASS TYPE '3’
7/16" OVERALL LAM. GLASS

Inc.’

By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’
OR

.090" Interlayer

Saflex Clear And Color Glass
By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’

OR
.075" Interlayer

Saflex CP With PET Core
SILICONE

1/8" HS. GLASS

" SILICONE
= DOWSIL 795
[%2] i
3 RNl
| Al
b
( i
o
5
o
e AT 1/4 POINTS
& M4

ALL SIZES

GLASS TYPE ‘4i’
7/8" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

MAXIMUM DESIGN LOADS FOR GLASS TYPE ‘4

NOT TO EXCEED +80.0 PSF

By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0608.03

Expiration Date-01/19/2027

By
Miami-Dade Produc CQ_n ol

AT 1/4 POINTS ON LITES

M3 ) WIDER THAN 36" ONLY

5/16” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:
SPACER:

"HELIMA’ LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
BY 'LINGERMANN GMBH’

AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.
PERIMETER SEALANT:

SILICONE

DOWSIL 791

GE 2000

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

20-1208.07

Building Code
NOA-No.

\\ {%&F@

iration Date: 1/19/2022

5? “\\CENSg **.

Mlami/Pade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol

DEC 0 1 2020

a

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

f
C

COMP—ANL\W16—86ES )

-5158 ]

!

(

FAX. (305) 638

){ ES—EL200 HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW. (L.M.I.)]

GENERAL REVISION

by [description

(revisions:
(hol date

D 106.22.20

12~-19-16

b
I
b3
N
~
—
B
[}
o
@

date:

drawing

<)
z
=
Fy
A
°

W16—-86

no.

sheet 3.10f 11



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


i r“ﬁ\ TYPICAL ANCHORS N o
e . . /f &
| _—"" FOR SPACING g 3
| ' , @ Q .
AN AT s =2 FOR SPACING 2 2 ZE
= il |2 esg | Y
— - | | g (=] -
7 ) i 7 .\ 1 I
T ] M16 4 (1) }
) © |
. — E14 | .
=20
o S
- T ¢
—(ms) ‘ I —
AR (7 l @5)/ Efl f hiil i
{ ] e \\__@
il i | | Al
| | | :
1 il ! 1!
i ol i - R OPTIONAL TO
, i @ ulfl || M6 ) SWEEP LATCH
| | i o IR
L TRl _ Ll
[ e | H [ =
' U 1. I
| Bi L
l II II .l I' |I
A | | Je
o | | | i1
[T 1l | | | hf
‘ i [ | il ]
il ' Bl
I - | ! i
1 1L [ : ! |
- [ e = = 04 hi |
5 po: | ol . %‘ 5 o oy |
o] e 1 ! N T [ri] = i [ i
T [ | 1l — T - |
24 [ I 1 a - o 14 | M1 [
Z M 1 kﬂ it E g < | i :'\ |
= H \ > a = N _
Z X T T z X M7 \J\ ]
E i : : : s &3] :| :| :| | -
'. i (Bl @\ @ PRODUCT RENEWED
| il 1 \ﬂ f P as complying with the Florida
it T fMB) OPTIONAL TO Building Code
, i 1L 1 \2/ SPRING LATCH NOA-No. 21-0608.03
| i1 .
| :' ! ' :l :‘- f | Expiration Date-01/19/2027
(| it ! iff | By
[ | ! | :' :' :' I / Miami-Dade Producf Contyol
1| I i =,
| ] | o1 [
' Ul | _ il WEEPHOLES:
[ [ | || (o1 Wl
I :| "/_QAHI | II| W= EACH END
;| :| [ / (I :'
[ - ) 1B =
mr—D i) &)
= _——(M13) - N @
— ©) @ g
: B Sl | ' o N E PRODUCT REVISED
ﬁ@ ) %} =y 7 @ﬁ < |0 as complying with the Florida
2 — 9atitatl > Building Code
/N | @ < ! A\ ! NOA-No. 20-1208.07
——r = | /77— \i’ ? Expiration Date:g1/1 9/2022
< 5 S ) ~
: as . N P T ) e _:/ :KW
T A e -3 ‘o LT % ok i BY: £
N . EDGE DI'SR =2 S L e e T N MiamiéDade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol
T Y |5 { Wi @ AP IR RN : FOR WINDOWS WITHOUT DEC 0 170
4 N\ > s R AN\ 7 \u@sm_ RISER LIMIT MAX. i
Ll “ .| ‘TYPICAL ANCHORS =~ || ™| \ S EXT.(+) LOADS TO 65.0 PSF
\TYHCA,_ ANCHORS \ ~— FOR WINDOWS wiTHoUT |+~ '} SEE ELEV.— || - \__18Y
SEE ELEV. E‘T%SILL RISER LIMIT MAX. FOR SPACING VA WOOD BUCK
FOR SPACING —EXT.(+) LOADS TO 65.0 PSF
EDGE DIST. |

,,,,,,

No. 81223 =
T Qz

1-1/2" X 5/16" WEEPHOLES AT 5-1/2" FROM

~

f
)

COMP—ANL\W1 6—86ES)

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

JL

FAX. (305) 638—5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

[ES—ELZOO HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW. (L.M.I.)j

J

B

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

GENERAL REVISION

by [ description

B [09.27.17
C {01.12.18
D |06.22.20

A 101.11.17

(revisions:
no[ date

12-19-16

.
.
]
o~
~N
.
P
]
o
@

dr. by: TARIQ

date:
chk. by:

3 e o )
drawing no.

W16—86



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURE NOT BY ‘E.S. WINDOWS’
MUST SUSTAIN LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM
AND TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEe ELEV. FOR SPACING
1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)

INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1—1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1-1/4” MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)

DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS
1—-1/2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)

1/4" DIA, TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS)
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS

OR

INTO METAL STRUCTURES (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)

(3) THREADS MIN. PENETRATION BEYOND SUBSTRATE
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—-T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8”" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MiN.)

(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

TYPI

INTO CONCRETE AND MASONRY = 2-1/2" MIN.
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1" MIN.

INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4" MIN.

WOOD AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.

CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.
C-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.

TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0608.03

METAL }f
STRUCTURE g
/| EDGE DIST. N
I
K\ g 1! Epce
|
K\z 1l \5 |
P\ e
25
JIE
<~ |1
_LM_ >

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1208.07

Expiration Date-01/19/2027

By
Miami-Dade Produc CQ_.n ol

Expiration Date: 01/19/2022
Bymmﬁm

Miami/—Pade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol

DEC 0 1 202

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED
MULLION & MULLION ANCHORS
SEE SEPARATE NOA

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

|

\
J

_\‘\l(hu
ku 3|
[{e]
()] 1|
"\____._/“S|
= 0 3:
£ 352
o |
Or 83|
- P NI
<°- 3 5|3
EOQ&"QO
Ozgy ¢
By %
FoE
5
Qtap
Ogud
O0Szmo
r el
o::.ogﬂ_
HiH
mn:zgﬁ-
<H3“-m
Lz%28|
1 =02 &)
..lﬁz"gs_i'
o K|
=
= ©
Rk Il
5 i
= [2o]
. 2]
= [{e]
3 ~~
= 8
© 2
=1 T
n:—'&
—4 -
= N~
N
NIOZm Y
A Mo
o .M
T2z 59
s
§BZ fs)
- =9
g 17 It
] 0 <
iy s

;"

\

(
L.S

(revisions:
(no[ dat

[dater 12-19-16 ]

[

=
=

tion

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

| UPDATED To 2017 FBC

| NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

dat “d_e_scrlp

01.11.17

B [09.27.17]

c [o1.12.18]

A

. e[ by[
|
|

\
A

—— | b _DE.Z?._E‘U

i N

scale: 1/2" = 17

r
-
r

||dr. by: TARIQ

|| ehk. by:

drawing no. |

heet 5 of 11)



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


@ ~——, REINFORCING

©

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
APPROVED MULLION

(E16 AS REQD. 1/4” MAX. .
. \ . SEE SEPARATE NOA
1/4" MAX. e VENT WIDTH SEE ELEVS. TeaMs | [ —f e
SHIM ' : , s
L~ N\ s :| TYPICAL ANCHORS —l_
w16) (£4) (s E6 @ 16) @ @ fa) | . | SFE ELEV. )
ET\ NN N o o e ;< - FOR SPACING N
TYPICAL ANCHORS | I H
SEE ELEV. | o \ s E (|
FOR SPACING /fj_ T[H_ Se— _i = e \.‘ / 11/4 ::
— <] [
BY e —— Yiess
] o 4 : q
o = . A Y
= i : : 1oal
8 l B - el
g T E |: §‘:|(=\\\
a = OC : | ol | : \\
s AR
A at g St
| o b I \. — ]
C N S - \ TYPICAL ANCHORS
M1g) (M5) (M16) EXTERIOR o | 4 o, —SEE ELEV.
METAL N 4 - FOR SPACING
STRUCTURE D.LOEC.. . .f /, 4
18Y WINDOW WIDTH WINDOW WIDTH
WOOD BUCKS .
WINDOW_WIDTH
X0 LAYOUT
OX OPPOSITE
1/4" MAX. VENT WIDTH e
i @j (w6) X TYPICAL ANCHORS
REINFORCING { o/ /4 MAX. SEE ELEV.
AS REQD. \ SHIMS FOR SPACING
SEE ELEVS.
i
. \
1 92
W - — .
S 5 f E
8 b
=] = =
e E .
e @ =L ———— == g
E e e e e [ 2]
b a
o
£~ N | (e N N [ | I IR | | I | N [ S —————— 9]
« S 3
| l I r -\__ “
[ — N ; .
| EXTERIOR (€s) (€17) s
o Mt 18Y % i
b.L. OPG. WOOD BUCKS J
WINDOW WIDTH
PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED l
TYPICAL ANCHORS X0X LAYOUT as complying with the Florida as complying with the Florida Ol B ”“/I
SEE ELEV. =S Building Code Building Code Qo pb Fag N
FOR SPACING NOA-No. 21-0608.03 NOA-No. 20-1208.07 g\ cENs 2
irati . 27 N & . Q) -
Expiration Date-01/19/2027 EXQ%'O" I3*"te-§1/1 9/2022 x 2 \
By By: Y272} °  No.8i223 | =
Miami-Dade Product Contyol Miami/—‘pade Produc‘t’Co}ntrol ke }' ¥ E
: o
UEC 0 1 ZE'J.J / RN
STATEQ@F - %g,;;
. FLoriBh. "‘@\\\\/
R
TONAL 2

a
I

COMP—ANL\W16—86ES |

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 2626978

, SUITE 220

, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

L-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

(L.M.I.)Jl/
=

FAX. (305) 638—5158

9360 SUNSET DRIVE

A
MIAMI

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET
MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638—5151

[ES-—ELZOO HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW.

[

)

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

GENERAL REVISION

by | description

no| date
A [01.11.17
B (09.27.17
c [01.12.18
D 06;22.20

)

3 ol .
12—19-16 |(revisions:

b
I
H3
N
~N
-
5
[}
Qo
@

(d_ate:



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


EDGE DIST. }

WINDOW HEIGHT

ALT.

EXTERIOR

SHIMS

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

%
2\g
= |z
{ 0
L B
AT H 7
v » NS
v -~
4 v L % = .
EDGE DIST. B

METAL

4 EDGE DIST. . STRUCTURE

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

INSTALLATION DETAILS WITH

SEE SHEETS 4 & 6 FOR WINDOW DETAILS

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED
MULLION & MULLION ANCHORS
SEE SEPARATE NOA

EDGE DIST. __,j,\

| TYPICAL ANCHORS
\ SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

1/4" MAX.
TshMs | [
TYPICAL ANCHORS : ;f' ALT.
SEE ELEV. a
FOR SPACING o —T
| =
b 4 -
PR 1
” T g
1
P
1 1/4 ¢
. i~
= A
a R =
W
O
o 4 2R
s
.4
B
2 4
WINDOW_WIDTH

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 21-0608.03

Expiration Date-01/19/2027

By
Miami-Dade Produc Cg_p ol

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

20-1208.07 \\ {‘%\’..,”.Ef’l@

FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER

Mlami/Pade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol

DEC 0 1 202

/’/\
iration Date: 1/19/2022 £ Sv eENss 2

-? . -\
5 i gz T T
EXI w fits
el I m=
\= A, Loe N
© 0 SWEGE < LT
X S
\‘?\/ !%le}f . -L-OB‘DP\ (©X \“ﬁf

\f/ ;'a-’rr 1"\@;@'{ % ) 4
Ly

f
C

COMP—ANL\W16—86ES |

Z

s

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

, SUITE 220

, FLORIDA 33173

| TEL.(305) 264-81.00

r-.
A

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

(

9360 SUNSET DRIVE

MIAMI

-5158 ]

FAX. (305) 638

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET
MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

)( £S-EL200 HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW. (LM.L.) ]

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

by [description

B [09.27.17
C |Dt.12.18
D 106.22.20

A [01.11.17

(revisions:
no| date

12-19-16
="

scale: 1,2

<]
2
=
B
u
o

sheet 7 of 11



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


TYPICAL ANCHORS

JLLUSTRATIVE DTLS. ONLY %E gﬁ%mc
EXT. OR INT. FINISHES

NOT BY E.S. WDW. 2
= | |
= <€ |
S
N O
§ p - i % <|
S I S
ALT.
#10 TEKS/SELF DRILLING SCREWS
AT 6 FROM ENDS
AND 12 0O.C. MAX.
=
5 g
= =
= 1 g
S ®
= >
£

#10 TEKS/SELF DRILLING SCREWS
AT 6 FROM ENDS
AND 12 0.C. MAX.

/})

Fella e
]

@L—w

___dn
] al
1/2" MIN
1/4" MAX
GAP

/TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

#10 WOOD SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

#10 TEKS/SELF DRILLING SCREWS

1/4" MAX.
GAP I~
1/2" MIN.
/é} ALT.
—_—
==
| [
G \AT 6 FROM ENDS
D dL AND 12 O.C. MAX.
—
TYPICAL ANCHORS
e EXTERIOR
FOR SPACING
WINDOW WIDTH

INSTALIATION DETAILS WITH FIN

FRAME ADAPTER

SEE SHEETS 4 & 6 FOR WINDOW DETAILS

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0608.03
Expiration Date-01/19/2027

By
Miami-Dade Product Contyol

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1208.07

Expiration Date: 01/19/2022
B;Wmeﬁiﬁa

t
Miami/—Pade Pro_duc,t”Co)'ltrol

12

1 (o)
ku @
©
g 3
— _____J|®
=
zZ 3SRz
Or 28|2
=c ® %<
N}
25 <1l
: =
5,8 8|3
Qo 0|©
Opga ¢
o .
Loy %
ok uw
2
e
u o
83w
QLEme
[f44 o
o&ﬁgﬁ
i
Ez29«
QuUSh i
u.""‘ﬂ_'o
r4 0
I_QEV
2882,
Lias ¥
A—
™
=
—
= [+ o]
. o]
= o
= ©
. [\
= [{e]
3 o)
4 8
o =
SO »
alam &
a:—'&
) -
Z|ges s
o )
NIOZ ™Y
|l Mo
S . 5]
I|£€= 5©
o
§32 Fe)
o=h
e 7
N -m_d
tﬂmrf)ﬁn—
S
oY
LiGlE
[TYR T RTY]
T|T1L
wninin
2
wla|v|d
5555%
HEIEIEE
QZz1Z|z|4
SIEIEIE(E
Slolo|olh
4
Vlo|lolo|id
Mo|lZzlZ2|Z2|0
>~
)
1IN
g.ﬁ‘l‘-'.\'uz
Oloj=|n |~ |
2101518[5|8
>
gg<moo)
o |
oll v o
THwl B
SRR
N IrEIE &
A
sJlajls]|l6
f.—'_
drawing no.

. = =



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


ITEM # PART # REQD. | DESCRIPTION MATERIAL MANF. /SUPPLIER/REMARKS
E1 ES—EL104 1 FRAME HEAD 6063-T6 =
E2 ES—EL201 1 FRAME SILL 6063-T6 -
E3 ES—EL202 1 SILL TRACK ) 6063-T6 .
E4 ES—EL102 2 FRAME JAMB (OPERATING) 6063-T6 =
E4.1 ES—EL101A | 2 FRAME JAMB (FIXED) 6063~T6 -
E5 ES—EL105 1 INTERLOCK STILE 6063-T6 =
E6 ES—EL106 1 JAMB STILE 6063-T6 =
E7 ES—EL107 2 VENT TOP & BOTTOM RAIL o 6063-T6 =
£8  ES—EL108A 1 FIXED MTG. STILE 6063—T6 =
E9 ES—EL109 AS RQD. | GLAZING BEAD (5/16" LAM. GLASS) o 6063-T6 -
E10 ES—EL110 AS RQD. | GLAZING BEAD (7/16” LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 =
E10A ES—EL123 | AS RQD. | GLAZING BEAD (7/16" LAM. GLASS) 6063—T6 -
E11 |  ES-EL111 AS RQD. | GLAZING BEAD (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 -
E11A ES—EL116 AS RQD. | GLAZING BEAD (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) o 6063-T6 -
E12 ES—EL112 | AS REQD. | FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER 6063-T6 -
E13 ES—EL115 | AS REQD. | FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER WITH FIN i 6063-T5 | —
E14 ES—EL114 | AS REQD. | HEAD SCREW COVER _ 6063-T6 | —
E15 ES—2011 | AS REQD. | SILL RISER 6063-T6 -
E16 ES—EL220 | AS REQD. | INTERLOCK STILE STIFFENER 6005-15 | —
E17 ES—EL221 | AS REQD. |FIX. MTG. STILE STIFFENER _ 6005-T5 -
E18 ES-EL113A | AS REQD. | JAMB SCREW COVER 6063-T6 N
M1 ES—5008A | AS REQD. | GLAZING BEAD BULB SILICONE DUROMETER 60+5 SHORE A
M1A EL100-G02 | AS REQD. | EXTERIOR LEAF GASKET - SILICONE | DUROMETER 6045 SHORE A
MIB | ES—H—340-G05 | AS REQD. | EXTERIOR WEDGE GASKET SILICONE DUROMETER 655 SHORE A
M2 80-372A | 2/ LME | SETTING BLOCK AT 1/4 POINTS (LAM. GLASS) SILICONE DUROMETER 8045 SHORE A
M3 EL100-BO1 | 2/ LTE | SETTING BLOCK AT 1/4 POINTS (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) SILICONE DUROMETER 80+5 SHORE A
M4 EL100-301 | AS REQD. | VENT STOP _ o RGD PVC | -
M5 W23211NG | AS REQD. | PILE W'STRIPPING WITH PLASTIC FIN POLYPROPYLENE | —
M6 SKO8—4010 | 2/ VENT | SPRING LOADED LATCH a 6063-T6 ALTERNATE TO SWEEP LATCH
M7 ES—1012 2/ LATCH | LATCH SPRING § ST. STEEL N
M8 SL302-XX | 2/ VENT | SWEEP LATCH N DIE CAST ALUM | —
M9 waA2L 2 WEEP HOLE COVER RIGID PVC N
M10 ES—1000—P1L | - LEFT NOTCH CAP B NYLON =
M11 ES—1000—P1R = RIGHT NOTCH CAP NYLON | -
M12 |  WPSA-N1 2 3/4" X 3/4” RETIC FOAM PAD FOAM =
M13 | TAR—16019P-A 2 ROLLER ' POLYAMIDE & ACETAL| —
M14 | TAR—16019P 2 ROLLER HOUSING POLYAMIDE =
M15 48 x 1" - FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER ASSEMBLY FASTENERS ST. STEEL | FH SMs
M16 #8 X 1" = FRAME AND VENT ASSEMBLY FASTENERS o ST. STEEL PH SMS
M17 #8 x 3" - FRAME SILL ASSEMBLY FASTENERS ST. STEEL PH SMS
M18 48 X 3/4" - SWEEP LATCH FASTENERS - | sTosTERL FH SMS
M20 | #14 X 3/4" — | ASSEMBLY FASTENERS FOR FLUSH ADAPTER ST. STEEL PH SMS

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

21-0608.03

Building Code

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1208.07

Expiration Date-01/19/2027

ade Produc Cgp ol

EXx|
Y

iration Date: 01/19/2022

MiamjéDade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol |

DEC 0 1 203

......

© - \ACENSE
= ¢ No.8f223
=RARH % [
=9 ",

0000

S

<y

Ly

e SioNp. B

A

f

COMP—ANL\W16—86ES )

K

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

L-FAROOQ CORPORATION
, SUITE 220
, FLORIDA 33173

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

(9360 SUNSET DRIVE

TEL. (305) 264-81.00

A
MIAMI

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET
MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638—5151

/((ES-EL200 HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WOW. (LM..) ]

)

‘NO CHANGE THIS SHEETY
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

by [ description

| C |o1.12.18]
LD 06.22.20

ate

01.11.17

o
c
.
B
>
[
-
—

| B |09.27.17

no
A

12-19-16

dr. by: TARIQ

chk. by:

date:

(Ao
drawing no.

W16—-86



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


‘— 2.917

2.812

2.187

062 1.295
TYP.

2.347

R’

.062

o—1.313 -050

a 1.187

;\_\

—{ .633 519 0_:;9_ —«=} r.135
T T T I ¥
625 f 625 625 ? ? 625 ) ?
i~ =050 .974 i 050 .974 i 974 i 062 974
—{ 202 vl L-.zoz — 202 ol L».zoz

GLAZING BEADS

625 .
S

SPRING LOADED LATCH

2.148 |
1.187 -
r<—1.187<>] " ‘_‘ % ISiES
JAMB STILE —
@ FRAME HEAD o5 e 188~ 125 1.025
1.938 062
- .050 )
1,187~‘>‘ (TYP_ __‘ <=—| 708 l-»
? [ 1.260
.062—1P ? - 2N PN
N (E16) INTERLOCK STILE STIFFENER M6 )
i ) 1.187 (€7)  VENT TOP/BOTTOM RAIL &) "
.062 1.474 .
TP. =
sy 513
3.310 .
2.685 =) ’ =—1.313 — |l 040 _—f
1.740 LS 1.013
@ INTERLOCK STILE l |
E— — 826 L
L 2.917 2.049 41.277
(E17) FIX. MTG. STILE STIFFENER
1.407 2 He= 010 r_
=) l ~Hl- oes
.062 J | .3?8
.062
g ——322 TYP. 2.500
I3 - = 625 = 2.000
250 IS A== 046 —f=—
= 1.387 E14)  HEAD SCREW COVER
(e3) SILL TRACK FIXED MTG. STILE ) 857
s ’r!\iﬁ"a SILL RISER
i i -
o 2.814 500 H } 625
' 2.313 T oL
719 2.780
< ‘ ﬁ _—j v—'r— .
.062_? E12) FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER
TYP.
2 [ . PRODUCT RENEWED
T L as complying with the Florida
Seid .062 - _QI Building Code
2.917 ql = 2.917 : 1 NOA-No. 21-0608.03
.050_><_? 1 1.500 —o{l=— 063 Expiration Date-01/19/2027
= TYP. 1.187 L By
| I = ! gy g Miami-Dade Product Contyol
500
—>1 875 = _.,]'525 L 5T_m _;, Rﬁ] 625
2.780

FRAME JAMB (OPERATING)

&

FRAME JAMB (FIXED)

':F13\' FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER WITH FIN

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 20-1208.07

Expiration Date: 01/19/2022
Bymmeéﬁw

Miamj/—Pade Produc,t”Co)'ltrol

DEC O 1207

=

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

2

~ COMP—ANL\W16—86ES |

|
J

(C.A.N. 3538)
FAX. (305) 262-6978

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-81.00

(

-5158 ]’

FAX. (305) 638

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638—5151

.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

E
MIAMI

.-'[ES—ELZOO HORIZONTAL ROLLING ALUM. WDW. (L.M.I.)J

Y
W
|| date: 12-19—1a_

| —

;

=

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
'NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
GENERAL REVISION

by -_des?_r__'rp_tlon

(revisions:
no| date

C [D1.12.1B
D |06.22.20

A [D1.11.17
B |09.27.17

|(arawing ™ ro.

)

|scole: 172" = 1"
“dr- by: TARIQ

(e b

—_—

W16-86 |

(sheet 10 of 11)



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


(S398-9IM\INV—dWOO I 8516-8c9 (S08) "Xv4  1S1G-8c9 (S0£) AL o e #a ol 5 ©
= = = . i c

o 8.69°29% Amomv XV 00T8-79T Amwmv g =11 rlee .|_.|._ INVIN Ihe i o o e ORVL Aq ip R_u

(8esg ‘N'V3) MN..ﬁmm vaikod TNvIn 13341S 6% "M'N 0GG¢ TSNe SIS O TG o S

k 0Ze 3LNS ‘IAINA LISNNS 09E6 577 ‘SMOANIM 'S'3 R T £©
ANFWJOTI3AIA LONAON 7@ SHIANIONT TonalI55ap [ Aq | 55D 5

£ | NOILVYHOJdH0D DOoUVHTVY T._.z.d "MAM WAV ONITIOY TVINOZINOH ooﬁuumdw Suoisial)| °+8+-Zh e D =

sheet 110of 11

L

R

FLUSH FRAME ADAPTER CORNE

FRAME TOP CORNER

VENT TOP & BOTTOM CORNER

R
20-1208.07

ADAPTER CORN

PRODUCT REVISED

©
-}
=
S
i
0
£
-
£
=
3
o
£
2>
o
E
]
0
)
©

Building Code

FIN FR
as complying with the Florida
21-0608.03 NOA-No.

Building Code

.’ PRODUCT RENEWED
NOA-No.

L

8 -
=) [
2 -
N L=
o
v m A
- )
=
- 3
£ &
- 3
£ &
.UMJP
= €
- a
X > o=
w o=
I~ —
N S
& <
o 3
= -’
- 0
-
A
£ &
2 N8
5 =g
- |
£) g
¥ »S
w o=

DEC 0 120

QTTOM CORN

FR

FIX. MTG. RAIL CORNER



mp045
noa20-1208.07

mp045
noa21-0608.03


	ADP1A24.tmp
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADP3730.tmp
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC




