MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION

11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/economy

PELA Investments LL.C, dba American Aluminum Doors
1026 East 24 Street
Hialeah, FL 33013

Scork:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction materials.
The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER -Product Control
Section to be used in Miami Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority Having Jurisdiction
(AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami Dade County) reserve the right to have
this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform in the
accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately revoke,
modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right to revoke
this acceptance, if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product or material
fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Aluminum Outswing French Door w/wo Sidelites— L.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W10-43 Rev F, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.L)”,
sheets 1 through 6 of 6, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on DEC 23, 2020, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation,
signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami—Dade County Product Control Revision stamp with the
Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami—Dade County Product Control Section.
MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant
Limitations:

1. Six (6)-%4” Ultraconl anchors at threshold (sill) meeting end required into conc. and five (5)-1/4” Ultracon

required at sill mullion ends into Conc.

2. Surface applied chair rail and partial alum veneer may be used for decorative purposes.
LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, city, state and series
and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in the
materials, use, and/or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of any
product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to comply with
any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed by
the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then it shall
be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors and
shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA revises (name change) NOA # 21-0114.02 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3
and E-4, as well as approval document mentioned above.

The submitted documentation was reviewed by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

ha ; and NOA No. 21-1109.02

l 2 ? [ 44 i Expiration Date: October 06, 2025
Approval Date: December 02, 2021

Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

PELA Investment LL.C, dba American Aluminum Doors

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMTTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’S

DRAWINGS

1.  Manufacturer's die drawings and sections (submitted under see below)

2. Drawing No. W10-43 Rev D, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1 through 6 of
6, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on SEP 22, 2015, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and
sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS (Submitted under file #12-0214.03/#10-0629.04)

1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
Along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum outswing French Door,
prepared by Fenestration Testing Lab., Test Report No. FTL 6188, dated 05/20/10, signed and
sealed by Jorge A. Causo, P. E. (Note: This test report has an addendum anchor location marked
drawings dated 01/10/12, issued by Fenestration Testing Lab.)

C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 2014(5" edition),
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated APR 17, 2015 and last revised on SEP 22, 2015,
signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
2. Glazing complies w/ ASTME-1300-02, -04 & -09.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 12-1231.10 issued to Eastman Chemical Company, (Former Solutia
Inc.) for “Saflex: Clear & color glass interlayer “, expiring on 05/21/16.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.10 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their “Butacite®
PVB Glass Interlayer”, expiring on 12/11/16.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2014 (5™ Edition) and letter of no financial interest,
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, 04/10/15, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
2. Lab compliance as part of the above referenced test report.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises & renews NOA # 12-0214.03, expiring on OCT 05, 2015.
2. Test Proposals # 09-1163, dated 08/26/09 approved by BCCO & surface applied chair rails dated
March 05, 2012 approved by PERA.

2. EVIDENCE SUBMTTED under previous NOA

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W10-43 Rev E, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 6 of 6, including 4.1, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on 11/01/17, prepared by Al-
Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None. |9L\4? %

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 21-1109.02

Expiration Date: October 05, 2025
Approval Date: December 02, 2021




PELA Investments LLLC, American Aluminum Doors

C.

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

CALCULATIONS

1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying FBC 5 Edition (2014) and
with FBC 6™ Edition (2017), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 10/27/17, signed and
sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0712.05 issued to Eastman Chemical Company, for their “Saflex
Clear & Color Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 05/21/21.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-1114.14 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their “Trosifol®
Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 07/08/19.

STATEMENTS

1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 5 Edition (2014) and FBC 6" Edition (2017) and of
no financial interest, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 10/27/17, signed and sealed by
Javad Ahmad, P.E.

OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA 15-0423.05, expiring on 10/06/20.

EVIDENCE SUBMTTED under previous approval

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W10-43 Rev E, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 6 of 6, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on NOV 13, 2017, prepared by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

TESTS (Submitted under file #12-0214.03/#10-0629.04)
1. None.

CALCULATIONS (submitted under file #17-1226.07)
1. None.

QUALITY ASSURANCE
1.  Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0712.05 issued to Eastman Chemical Company, (Former Solutia
Inc.) for “Saflex: Clear & color glass interlayer “, expiring on 05/21/21.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former DuPont De
Nemours) for their “Trosifol® ultra clear PVB Glass Interlayer”, expiring on 07/08/24.

STATEMENTS (submitted under file #15-0211.07)

1. Statement dated OCT 10, 2019 issued by American Aluminum Door Corp., requesting Renewal
with no change, signed by Maria Ibragolin, President.

2. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 6™ Edition (2017) & no financial interest, prepared by
Al Farooq Corp, dated 102/27/17, signed & sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

OTHER
1. This NOA renews NOA #17-1226.08, expiring on 10/05/25.

| 9%'2 [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 21-1109.02

Expiration Date: October 05, 2025
Approval Date: December 02, 2021




PELA Investment LLC, American Aluminum Doors

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. EVIDENCE SUBMTTED previously:
A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W10-43 Rev F, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 6 of 6, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on DEC 23, 2020, prepared by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1.  None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying FBC 7™ Edition (2020),
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 12/30/20, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1.  Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0712.05 issued to Eastman Chemical Company, (Former Solutia
Inc.) for “Saflex: Clear & color glass interlayer “, expiring on 05/21/21.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former DuPont De
Nemours) for their “Trosifol® ultra clear PVB Glass Interlayer”, expiring on 07/08/24.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 7" Edition (2020) & no financial interest, prepared by
Al Farooq Corp, dated 12/30/20, signed & sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

G. OTHER
L. This NOA revises NOA #19-1022.12, expiring on 10/05/25.

| 9%'2 [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 21-1109.02

Expiration Date: October 05, 2025
Approval Date: December 02, 2021



PELA Investment LLC, American Aluminum Doors

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. NEW EVIDENCE SUBMTTED

A. DRAWINGS (submitted under # 21-0114.02)
1. Drawing No. W10-43 Rev F, titled “Aluminum Outswing French Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 6 of 6, dated 06/08/10 and last revised on DEC 23, 2020, prepared by Al-Farooq
Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1.  None.

C. CALCULATIONS (submitted under # 21-0114.02)
1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying FBC 7't Edition (2020),
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 12/30/20, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1.  Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0712.05 issued to Eastman Chemical Company, (Former Solutia
Inc.) for “Saflex: Clear & color glass interlayer “, expiring on 05/21/21.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former DuPont De
Nemours) for their “Trosifol® ultra clear PVB Glass Interlayer”, expiring on 07/08/24.

F. STATEMENTS

1. Statement letter dated 11/19/ 21 by American Aluminum Doors Corporation (Seller) of sales of
NOA #21-0114.02, all rights, equipment and know how to Pella investment, LLC, signed by
Ms. Maria S. Ibragollin, owner American Aluminum Doors Corporation.

2. Statement letter dated 11/19/21by (Buyer) PELA Investments, LLC (dba American Aluminum
Doors) of legally purchase of all rights for NOA# 21-0114.02, signed by Gustavo Douille,
owner of PELA Investments, LLC.

3. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 7" Edition (2020) & no financial interest, prepared by
Al Farooq Corp, dated 12/30/20, signed & sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E. (submitted under # 21-
0114.02)

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises by name change of NOA #21-0114.02, expiring 10/05/2025.
2.  Notarized sales agreement between American Aluminum Doors Corporation and PELLA investment
LLC, signed respectively on behalf of their company by Ms. Maria S. Ibragollin, owner and
Gustavo Douille, owner.

3. Florida Department of State, Division of corporation listing of fictitious owner name change
(G2100146143) dated 11/01/21 by PELLA investments.

| 9%? [. £ hand

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 21-1109.02

Expiration Date: October 05, 2025
Approval Date: December 02, 2021




144" 72" MAX. t B
OVERALL FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH ko %
72" MAX. . m b
DOOR FRAME WIDTH 12 k—“————«/ﬁ =
. y . S
. 12" 12" . . 3 S L3 z 2512
6" MAX. 12 Wy 6 MAX. | sureace apren || 88 B 8|2
HEAD /SILL 3" Ny 3" 3" 6" 3" O HEAD SURFACE APPLIED HEAD/SILL Q ‘ FALSE MUNTINS T
CORNERS 1 @ N 1 SILL /~ FALSE MUNTINS CORNERS C i [ FALSE MUNTIN <i 3%
| | ! | L1 | g | Y 0 | | | I | Koo 8o
; E ; 1 I ! e ! ] ! | I | ! ; 1 1 ! 1 P 1 .L O d & ~— g Q
- i l---- R e ez %
T N  PRODUCT REVISED ) N got &
ii Y, /dq \ EE as complying with the Florida Y \ H 8 S & ﬁ
<l ../ Building Code " = Wi e
-+ y CDNCE’%‘LED// \ SURFACE __“Mif{ NOA-No. 21-1109.02 T CONCEALED/./ h N . 8 2 8 o
/ FLUSH .BOKT % il FLUSH BOLT R Ozz® 8
: - BOLT iratl 10/06/2025 K
oS — Y N if Expiration Date / \SdiéFACE o JE2 2
@ 1 C/// ) //}{/ @ //\® | By Isbeq | Lhan @__ / @ BOLR i 8 ? %% @
‘;/w_‘ﬁ'/__A~ e ,_m__gf,Miami—Dade Product Control // ——Awijl*—\*— g w § s
T \ TR TN Lz228
— / " /s \ " — / { \ N ¢
& .l ! 7 i L%, R - , ! H %l 22058
8 vg b “5 ) L9 A 32 28 ¥ w8 oy Ay 3|8 wo2rl |
=T >© [ e { S =0 R (P— NE e e R y S . |Z | C——
= ’ T sdeooos 0| —oo=gkzoos S N L ‘// L et S N
82 o2 N3k el 3| / s - 0z e g|d \ Y ® % 2 I ~I - -
E —+ § i a i R £ § o . Al = & o
i I L 1 -
\ Il T o / [ \ T® & [ = 8 z
h U i
SRZER=EES / =EEEREEES PRODUCT REVISED (CONCEALED ==EER==7= = P 3
- AN / I ~+——" as complying with the Florida -+ LUSH BOLT s Sla ~
. . CONCRALED I g | )
-/ ALUM PANEL N ct SURFACE Building Code SURFACE =) Ie) 3
| *ADHERED TO GLASS" ] FLUSHY BOLT ~ B0yt ! NOA-No. 21-0114.02 89&” 218 8
/.- -OPTIONAL 1.\ / o . ~ H slaln <
—A:ﬁ:\t: :—_ﬁ"_m L Expiration Date 10/06/2025 ] -;/il':;::: i uz_x = E z
‘ / I — o =
! \ // / H By |9L~<7[‘K4enjg // H b g(ﬁf
: | | ~~ o | A EN-
QINACTIVE i actve | 1] l iR Miami-Dade Product Control L ' \ o 0 i ) % % t;; Q g
h < T~ | ~ - 0N || —d N
| Al g p Ly = ¥ i INACTWVE | [ | {1 g pACTIVE 51 < N
] T Iﬂ{i/’ (AN 1 ] l " f 1 T " Bl g
" R T , 2af t . TRt " Xlol sISSE 6
SURFA%EHA/\?SPEEE_/ 32 7/8 25 1/8 t: e g 32 7/8 < 3% SURFA%EH:FQPE;%E 25 1/8 G,PE 3 12HE:45\>< < ?:% =1 bz g
MAY BE USED D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. |~ 3 6" D.L. OPG. %8 MAY BE USED D.L. OPG. ’ Dy w8 Zig¢e ? c
> o X i
34 3/4" \ TYP. ALUM PANEL t 34 3/4” = 221
LEAF WIDTH (6) THRESHOLD ANCHORS L(3) THRESHOLD ANCHORS ’ LEAF WIDTH s U
T - AT SIDELITE MULLION END ADHERED TO GLASS (6) THRESHOLD ANCHORS |
ALUMINUM OUTSWING FRENCH DOOR (L.M.L) AT MTC. STILE END OPTIONAL AT MTG. STILE END M
APPROVI_?L APPLIES TO S}NGLE (X) AND DOUBLE (XX) LEAF DOORS TYPICAL ELEVATIONS o
WITH OR WITHOUT SIDELITES. THESE DOORS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT. @ § 2 §
SIDE LITES CAN BE ON ONE OR BOTH SIDES OF DOOR. THE FRAME AREA OF ALTERNATE UNIT NOT TO 3/16" HEAT STREN'D GLASS SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED : z :: o
SEE SHEET 2 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITIES. EégEgch%é 56 SQ. FT. (TESTED FRAME AREA) : 28|58
LOWER DESIGN PRESSURE FROM DOOR OR SIDELITE CAPACITY : a0 Iterlayer - or Gluss Ble¥|o|e
CHART SHALL CONTROL THE ENTIRE ASSEMBLY. By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’ %B % alg
" » N Ol [
THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE 1/2 g‘lu%iEl?L&MP&gé R, HEFRE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION) FLORIDA BUILDING CODE \ :‘E)QO‘f ‘l”t}f\;’gye' SRR
INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ). B;"s:‘K‘immy America. Inc. 12
1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE T slreeeTs
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS _ . \ 3/16" HEAT STREN'D GLASS Shels| 2|2 2
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE. W & T THIS DOCUMENT IS NOT VALID WITHOUT CORPORATE SEAL |||&|5|<|g <«
ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS = = i SILICONE OF ‘AMERICAN ALUMINUM DOORS CORP.’ SleroTaraT:
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE z|\® g} z|® DOWSIL 995 (= J
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO. =R ! = XY ——
A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY. © 3 :' ;‘ © |3 °
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON~METALLIC AND NON—COMPRESSIBLE. o ;i x; ‘ o ® g
MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT i i 3 @ s
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE e <l 5
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS. Il § =l
THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION i m\[w o 3 55
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY @) 22) o neEe 2 3 Zg?gg e
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR & & b 8 drawing no.
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC. = SIDELITE — DOOR
CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY, I 3 W10—43

AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.
DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON ‘ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

GLAZING DETAIL
7/16" OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

sheet 1 of 6



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


D.L.O. HEIGHT (SIDELITE) = FRAME HEIGHT — 4.500”
D.L.O. WIDTH (SIDELITE) = SIDELITE WIDTH - 3.125"

a

|

f
C

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-81.00

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978
COMP—ANL\W10—43AAD )

(

FAX. (305) 693-2851 }

AMERICAN ALUMINUM DOORS CORP.
1026 EAST 24TH STREET

HIALEAH, FL. 33013
TEL. (305) 693-2642

[ ALUMINUM OUTSWING FRENCH DOOR (L.M.i.))

|

)

BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCA05-DEC-219

DOORS WITHOUT SIDELITES STATIONARY PANEL (0) OR DOORS WITH SIDELITES DOOR W. | SIDELITE W. SIDELITE W. SIDELITE W.
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF @ @ @
FRAME HEIGHT |DOOR FRAME wiDTH | 7/16” LAM. GLASS FRAME HEIGHT | DOOR wiDTH |SIDELITE wipTH | UN-REINFORCED JAMB| REINFORCED JAMB ; A f
INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) INT. (=) INCHES INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) INT. (=) EXT. (+) INT. (=) ! /
96 3 () [72 )| 650 75.0 24 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 ALl B | i
28 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 *g O / O ® €
36" MAX. 72" MAX. 84 > (g();)) 32 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 n / 2 . 2 2
DOOK o AME DOOR FRAME WIDTH 36 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 w 7 7z % 7
© © 40 58.7 67.5 58.7 67.5 S \ .
E F 24 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 = N
‘ ! PN o 36 (X) 28 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 @ \
/ Y 72 (XX) 32 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 % NI
1
= O // ©Onr- Ot/ ©m . 36 65.0 75.0 65.0 75.0 (%) !
% o A / N\ 24 65.0 74.1 65.0 75.0 (ox)
=T Z 7 . 65.0 5 65.0 75.0
.l 7 7 7 96 36 (x) 28 69 SIDELITE_ W. DOOR WIDTH
gz N g g 72 (XX) 32 65.0 65.4 65.0 75.0
g N N / 36 61.8 61.8 65.0 75.0 @
AN N\ ‘
® ) ® |/ PRODUCT REVISED R— h
e ) T—T—m
: ‘ as complying with the Florida 1S g i G D= R @—*
’ Building Code 5
(x) (xx) NOA-No.  21-1109.02 n f? 7
Expiration Date 10/06/2025 — = PRODUCT REVISED Y 7 K
D.L.O. HEIGHT (DOOR) = FRAME HEIGHT — 11.250” lelaanb s as complying with the Florida £ N
D.L.O. WIDTH (DOOR) = LEAF WIDTH — 9.625” By . Building Code - /
e M - . : Miami-Dade Product Control o Ly NOA-No. 21-0114.02 J/
MAX. DOOR LEAF WIDTH = 34.5 bg B’ 106/202 Vi
DOOR LEAF HEIGHT = FRAME HEIGHT - 2.250 UN-REINFORCED DOOR JAMB REINFORCED DOOR JAMB Expiration Date 10/06 5
By |9L\<7 |. £ handa I
Miami-Dade Product Control
REINFORCING
OPTIONAL
OVERALL FRAME WIDTH
2 SIDELITE W. DOOR WIDTH
FIXED LITE (0) LOAD CAPACITY — PSF ﬂ n i
L i=s /
FRAVE KEIGHT [SI0ELTE WOTH [ oy T soeute w, | E E— )
24 65.0 750 (SEE CHART) EXTERIOR Jel o e  ®
- ‘ @ SIDELITE WIDTH MAX. DOOR WIDTH = 36” o . /o, ,
o 28 65.0 75.0 : (SEE CHART) ) i 7 7
32 659 759 | REINFORCING = N ’
IN =
36 65.0 75.0 OPTIONAL g N
40 58.7 67.5 el Err— \
24 65.0 75.0 Sl A I 3 @ \
W< 4/ ]
% 28 65.0 75.0 T35 o I 0 :
32 65.0 75.0 S g f =
=\ f ] ( OXX0 )
36 65.0 75.0 x| L @@%ﬁ @ @i%@
5 - LIMIT MAX. FRAME AREA = 96 SQ. FT. PER FBC
24 65.0 74.1 ©
65.0 69.5 EXTERIOR
96 28 SIDELITE WIDTH MAX. DOOR WIDTH
32 65.0 654 | (SEE CHART) (Xx)
3 618 618 SIAND ALONE SIDELITE
(o)
NOTE:
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE sgg 23 ﬁ%za

UPDATED TO 2014 FBC
REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
UPDATED TO 2020 fBC

byTdescription

(revisions:
no| date

C |04.13.15

D 109.21.15
E [11.01.17
F 112.23.20

Ul

S

06—-18~10

o
%
=
z
L‘
©

date:
chk. by:

S
drawing no.

W10-43

sheet 2 of 6



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS

TYPICAL ANCH

SEE ELEVATIONS
FOR SPACING

ORS

A\

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEVATIONS

1BY WOOD BUCK FOR SPACING

2BY WOOD BUCK

WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURE NOT BY ‘AMERICAN DOOR’
MUST SUSTAIN LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM
AND TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

a
f
C/

|

FRAME HEIGHT

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

21-1109.02

Expiration Date 10/06/2025

SEE ELEVATIONS EDGE DIST /I\ , (SEE SHEET 1)
FOR SPACING A 1 A
. EBGE DIST." T a|)/ T et St
R A e . f ‘&_ N Lv'. » o/ L/#/’l E DIST.
-5 3 . _— . 6 . p ’ é
T [T L - I »
=
L . Ll
X |O @ x |O x 1O
i © @ 4 i
® =I5 L —0 25 5 26 5
<= s =
A}T >z F :} I > =
T |» — = ] )

of

. ¢
1/2" MIN. - —

THROW BOLT /

PENETRATION

Sl
N

il

1

P

| ————

@

TYPICAL ANCHORS:

METAL AW _DADE. COUNTY APPROVED) |
STRUCTURE  |!MULLION & MULLION ANCHORS !
EDGE DIST. y || SEE SEPARATE NOA I
: y i I :I
i 1 | | B H
| L o
>
18
>
<« i<C
wl 2B
NE
“»

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEVATIONS
FOR SPACING

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

EXT.

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

OR
1 WOOD STRUCTURE
= /
N o
G .

ilh Building Code 1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/JAMBS)
z!! _';“‘Z;'Pff“ct oo i NOA-No.  21-0114.02 Fgg Ti';’;‘gAL N CL!ORS 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)
1ami-ba u 1N
|I| || Exviration Date 10/06/2025 DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS
it By ISt | Lhan 1=1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (HEAD/SILL/JAMBS)
1t Miami-Dade Product Control 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO BLOCKS (JAMBS)
= . Wl 1-3/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE (AT DOOR THRESHOLD ONLY)
sl R o B T
5 © W & NENG) e 1 ; 1/4" DIA._TEK SELF N WS (GRADE 5 CRS)
™ o © = i1 i sF
- % Y ow S g 1L il INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS
(] <C d
o - m ! OR
Q g o EZ Al h r: ”D INTO METAL STRUCTURES (HEAD/JAMBS)
K K Bk it (3) THREADS MIN. PENETRATION BEYOND SUBSTRATE
He il ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)
i HiE »
i SILICONE ! STEEL: 1/8" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
i DOWSIL 995 :; :’ (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)
il i
i m —@ TYPI T
il R
@\ 1[I ®) te TRIMMED INTO CONCRETE AND MASONRY = 2—1/2" MIN.
Il il INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1” MIN.
: ]
i 1 ;:ﬂ INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4" MIN.
== i =
U 040 ALUM PANEL it WOOD AT HEAD OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.
OPTION Al CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.
il
/2" N, PANEL ADHERED TO—T fil} C-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.
THROW BOLT ©O) oc QQ%LA;S]C"C’)‘;’; I
PENETRAT!ON\ o U T )
-y ; i SEALANTS:
, ,’\ @ , ALL FRAME AND PANEL JOINT, INSTALLATION SCREWS AND
. /@ 2l @\'L__ Qe | 4 SURFACE APPLI HEADS OF ANCHOR SCREWS AT SILL TO BE SEALED WITH
i < |Z @ T L |5 IR_RAI WHITE/ALUM COLORED SILICONE.
% I I OPTION
Ol EBI;i74
/ Jé
/ AR : < ? / LY g 'vl < 9
R A R v N 1 o < - oS . N :
< v EDGE @sT. " Y “NON METALLIC _« EDGE DISk Sl NON METALLIC —n 99 990
r N CURED & HARDENED R i g0 CURED & HARDENED Deb 23
TYPICAL ANCHORS Rl N, TYPICAL ANCHORS l = R MM,

SEE ELEVATIONS
FOR SPACING

STATIONARY UNITS

SEE ELEVATIONS

FOR SPACING

OPERABLE UNITS

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1=1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD (HEAD/JAMBS)

THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS

vy

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX, (305) 262-6978
COMP—ANL\W10—43AAD )

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

ﬂ

FAX. (305) 693-2851

1026 EAST 24TH STREET

HIALEAH, FL. 33013

[ ALUMINUM OUTSWING FRENCH DOOR (LML)
AMERICAN ALUMINUM DOORS CORP.
TEL. (305) 6932642

|

|

)

UPDATED TO 2014 FBC
REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

byl description

D |09.21.15
E 111.01.17
F 112.23.20

nol date
C |04.13.15

N(revisions:

06—18-10

=4
4
<C
=
=
o
[
©

chk. by:

date:

|
drawing no.

W10—43



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


s N
. STEEL REINFORCING U 2
1/4" MAX. @ OPTIONAL @WITH @ k <
SHIM =~ SEE SHEET 2 REINFORCING ~ FLUSH BOLT OPERATOR FLUSH BOLT OPERATOR © ¥
R FOR CAPACITY ON INSIDE FACE AT INACTIVE LEAF ON STILE FACE AT ACTIVE LEAF NS B X
4. —
S g O z g2
— X W @
HRE 3 Eg' INACTIVE LEAF ACTIVE LEAF o E =gz
N e b= = O
. . < = TN
gs.S83
— __4 + - o d 8 N a Q
= : azS x
e = po
= == ggat
L °‘ o 2 g?} [=]
L% ?5. o] E g g g
Oz 3
TELE
® @ WITHOUT E Wp* B
D.L. OPG. REINFORCING =Z 5 ®
D.L. OPG. EXTERIOR 002
LEAF WIDTH g3 E
t 1 I\
SIDELITE WIDTH DOOR WIDTH ;ﬁ = o -
S| 2
OVERALL FRAME WIDTH 3o ,
i - ° 3
PRODUCT REVISED B % " ©
TYPICAL ANCHORS LIMIT MAX. FRAME AREA = 96 SQ. FT. PER FBC as complying with the Florida S|¢ =
K LY e Building Code : o als 8
NOA-No. 21-0114.02 ] —— =S HoS
>
Expiration Date 10/06/2025 é - W=
PRODUCT REVISED B L ap EIS5m
- - - B 7 “n E = —
as complying with the Florida y___ ol _ 5
Building Code Miami-Dade Product Control ZI= E B g
NOA-No. 21-1211.02 D.L.O L. OPG. % 3 § M g;
=< .
Expiration Date 01/24/2024 I = e o ré:
By |9L\<7 l. L hand % é ﬁ __|<'f rg
TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS Miami-Dade Product Control Z ol
SEE ELEV. SEE ELEV. 1/4" MAX =l é ]
FOR SPACING FOR SPACING . . = So<J
SHIM Zl<—T¥H
1/4" MAX. 1/4" MAX. FLUSH BgE&TS%tERggFEQ >
SHIM SPACE SHIM @ FLUSH BOLT OPERATOR ® @ 21 SE‘P;SiiE'NG
2BY WOOD BUZK o
= x
I . & g  ACTIVE LEAF B QoD STRUETURE ACTIVE LEAF QISP
SN
@ e Ia
g9 ™ - % lolo
=il ® = e I 501515 <
. =y o e L = e o g @ % %
- S e —————————= N | | S\ e ==
2 = —’JD* O ) )
8 e Eerm s Ee ey 161 “ o A
A CHOIZIZ TS
& Be 3 4 el ] g & HEEEER
B olo|~|~
= “ EXT. dlelolalule
e L
EXTERIOR TYPICAL ANCHORS S5
METAL STRUCTURE . SEE ELEV. o
(SEE SHEET 3 D.L. OPG. FOR SPACING °
FOR SPEC) ‘ © =
|
1BY 34 3/4” MAX. © =
WOOD BUCK ' LEAF WIDTH =0 9 y 5®
BzC £ I
36" MAX. 3 55
FRAME WIDTH | ——
drawing no.

sheet 4 of 6



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

1/4" MAX.

T SAM ()
/}D

1/4” MAX.
SHIM

2BY WOOD BULK
R
00D STRUZTURE

favoal

EDGE DIST.

1BY
WOOD BUCK

EXTERIOR

D.L. OPG.

SIDELITE FRAME WIDTH

STAND ALONE (O) STATIONARY UNIT

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-1109.02

Expiration Date 10/06/2025

By |9L\<7 l. £hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

EDGE DIST.

\ TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 21-0114.02
Expiration Date 10/06/2025

By IQL@? l. £ handa
Miami-Dade Product Control

3
fid
«d

23 W

PR
(O BIE

Y ¥ |3
(] ¥
S

—~ =
Z 3Rz
Cr 983
- o @ IZ
Ea 8T
<F <3ls
o< 810
ogs8 - 8°

o "
Loy %
For wu

]
Qtar
O2uy

pud

0289 o
o’mcc &
O&Dgﬁ
i
mn:zSN
gUSE
u‘gfl}_’o
i S0 ©
2885,
<NQEE\J
C______——— O
Y
. -
=l 8
e 0
-

O )
Sl 2
ol %)
C)o o
| c
slam
= ] =
w}Oﬂ P
EIS5Em

zY —
(D—ION
;3¢mg
$<N.I
) ~ =
Slzp™ @
§<< b )
S|lewLts
ZI oW
EUJN;E‘.
2I=ZEo0= g
| < L+~
CTTTTTTTTTD
=S

£

g88

gl

5 5|58
=l (Elee
S oo
— Wi
9 2%
0 a|e
()] E[LCL
o xi{D|D
>
T
v IR )
glel ZIZIS
Lol |alo|w~
.‘gU glow
\%8 o ww
| ———
=4
1
© o
T g
< =
3y B
£ o |l #
© o Q
(LT
drawing no.

(sheet4.10f 6 ]



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


( (o)
4'00378 - 2.125 ITEM # PART # REQD. DESCRIPTION MATERIAL | MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS g Q <
i .375 1 R1-101 3/DOOR | FRAME HEAD/JAMB 6063-T6 | — m 5‘3
. A
} 688 + 2 R1-107 2/LEAF | DOOR TOP/BOTTOM RAIL 6061-T6 | — S | O
iy
1.500 2.1 R1-107 AS REQD. |TOP/BOTTOM RAIL(TRIMMED)/CHAIR RAIL | 6061-T6 |- = r 4 DRIz
2.250 0. 82/2
= 3 R1-104 AS REQD. | WEATHERSTRIP ADAPTER 6063-T5 | — =5 =8z
J 4 R1-102 1/DOOR | THRESHOLD 6063-T6 | — E s =2§&l4
o g
AJ L. 5 R1-111 AS REQD. | GLAZING ADAPTER (SIDELITE) 6063-T5 | — 14 §o s 8 §
192 2.016 — 6 R1-108 1/LEAF HINGE STILE 6063-T5 | — g Y 3
Wow
7 R1-109 1/LEAF LOCK STILE 6063-T5 | — by
(1) FRAME HEAD/JAMB / Kog &
8 R1-103 AS REQD. | SIDELITE JAMB 6063-T6 | — 06ap
" 5 .
1.608 9 - 1/CORNER | ASSEMBLY WASHER STEEL 17 0.D. X .450 LD. X .110 THK. o oy pa
r F.o;} 10 R1-105 3/LEAF HINGE DOOR PORTION 6063-T5 | — 8' & gg §
38 170 H 11 R1-106 3/LEAF | HINGE FRAME PORTION 6063-T5 | — 02 Eg @
§ 2000 [ 12 - 2/LEAF 3/8"-16 X 32" LONG THREADED ROD STEEL - 1d g} ‘2 g @
~1.500 ' | 13 - 2/LEAF | 3/8"-16 NUT - - qu2Eg
v Lz 58
N 14 _ 1/HINGE | 5/16” X 6" ROD STEEL PLATED STEEL ho8% -
— el
(3) WEATHERSTRIP ADAPTER H o 15 - 8/ LEAF | GLAZING TUBE 6063~T5 | SILICONED IN PLACE 555
500 ; 17 3063 AS REQD. | BULB WEATHERSTRIPPING FLEX. PVC | MELTPOINT PLASTICS, (DUROMETER 78+3) ||/
’ j 5“ [ © 18 W13331NW AS REQD. |PILE WEATHERSTRIPPING - ULTRAFAB = -
N | ) - 5
HE} ﬁf‘ 687 | @ 3.375 20 2508 AS REQD. |FLUSH BOLTS - REGENT HARDWARE = % Y
. -
: | o 21 - OPTIONAL | REINFORCING CHANNEL STEEL - ks 3'
1 22 #8 x 3/4” AS REQD. | FRAME ASSEMBLY SCREWS - PH SMS Sln ©
3 55 " o o
3900 H| @ 23 #14 X 3/4 AS REQD. | SIDELITE JAMB SCREWS ~ AT 5” FROM ENDS & 12" O.C. a g 8
4.000 : o Z
078 I PRODUC_T REV'SED - 24 - 2/ LITE SETTING BLOCKS EPDM DUROMETER 8015 SHORE A 5 ah y
e p— as complying with the Florida = Lo <
TYP. I Building Cod His o L
2.000 uilding Code EiD5m
|| NOA-No.  21-1109.02 LOCKS: z” -
irati U 2133y
I | M Expiration Date 10/06/2025 ACTIVE_LEAF: S 5538
[ ]
L1750 By Ishegit dhn PRODUCT REVISED CONVENTIONAL DOOR LEVER LOCKSET AT 38" FROM BOTTOM Bl
Miami-Dade Product Control gi ifgirlr‘lpl&ndgewﬂh the Florida FASTENED WITH (2) #8 X 1-3/8" PH MACHINE SCREWS. Sll=p >3
NOA N9 51-0114.02 FLUSH MOUNT STRIKE PLATE AT INACTIVE LEAF FACING LOCK sI<S&ra
(2) TOP/BOTTOM RAIL (19 (1) 3 PIECE HINGE —No. - - FASTENED WITH (2) #8 X 1/2" FH MACHINE SCREWS. > g =3
- - = [{e) ~
Expiration Date 10/06/2025 SURFACE MOUNT DEAD BOLT LOCK, KEY OPERATED ON SR ES
2.163 —= ey 875 s EXTERIOR AND THUMB TURN ON INTERIOR LOCATED = e
B lebag | Lhanl, . F<<— I &
| 3.913 . y___ AT 45" FROM BOTTOM S Ol
i | e Miami-Dade Product Control FASTENED WITH (2) #10 X 2—1/2" OH MACHINE SCREWS. ——
062 gEE===Ey ZF FLUSH MOUNT STRIKE PLATE AT INACTIVE LEAF FACING LOCK
i Typ. | 375 ! FASTENED WITH #8 X 1/2" FH MACHINE SCREWS.
’ .580 »
500 m A é 1.750 580 CONCEALED FLUSH BOLTS WITH MANUALLY OPERATED glzlalg
T } e »1 ’“ ! LEVERS MOUNTED ON FACE OF ACTIVE LEAF LOCK STILE g P
L_2075 090 {1 3.750 ! LOCATED AT 14” FROM BOTTOM AND 17" FROM TOP. T8IEI]
: 7 094 | 687« 765 FASTENED WITH (2) #8 X 1/2” PH MACHINE SCREW £|8e| ]S
; 4.000 TYP. Sielglele
? INACTIVE LEAF SEHRIE
[+%
4.000 » CONCEALED FLUSH BOLTS WITH MANUALLY OPERATED 2% 5|8 5
(+) THRESHOLD (S A 4.000 LEVERS LOCATED ON INSIDE FACE OF INACTIVE LEAF o|5185(5
Tl 078 LOCK STILE AT 14” FROM BOTTOM AND 17" FROM TOP. N
‘ FASTENED WITH (2) #8 X 1/2” PH MACHINE SCREW o
© 650 STEEL REINFORCING @ #8 x 1/ )
r ' 9% (5)  HINGE STILE @) 36 KSI MIN NEEEE
: NOTE: TOP AND BOTTOM FLUSH BOLTS MUST BE ENGAGED Slelnlzlzle
] F’ DURING PERIODS OF HURRICANE WARNING. Blol%|g| 2|«
d 4.577 ' slololalals
e J
2.094 094 —= .687 =—1.864 @
| 062 P =
TYP. [ : °
e \ 050 TOP/BOTTOM RAIL (TRIMMED)| QW el 1 .
: S ? ) oL r= SURFACE APPLIED CHAIR RAIL T E
192 2.000 590 1.750 o .750 8 e
= L } 500 1 .5oo—>1 - s 52
4 : 0ot 2 2 9091 3 515
¢ sor3 = 1.077 500 N DeC 2.3 2020
)00 ‘ o062—f— 1 o062l T ' C S drowing - no.
4
B onoh B | W10-43
’ \ —
SIDELITE JAMB (7) LOCK STILE (5) SIDELITE GLAZING BEAD @ GLAZING TUBES ’!mf\fﬁ?’\\\\\‘ (sheet 5 of 6 )



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


E<<n¢!o§£z<1aqoov )| rssz—ce9 (o) xvs  zvoz-s69 (soe) 3L |[|[ e — R b ©
B8BL69-€9¢ (GOB) "Xvid OOT8POT (GOE) "13L : ¢ b~
@ J (8858 “N'V') £LTEE VAINOTA ‘INVIW 133y WSIWWNJWKM,«MMM@ S . SR o
.* 02z 3LINS ‘IAIHA L1ISNNS 09€6 || || . HNINNDD o3 ¥3d A3 S1 180 9 _ . ©
INIWCOTIAIA LONAOY '@ SHIINIONI dd00 Sd00d WNNINNTY NVOIINY e e . s B «b = LB/8 oos >

_ &) NOLLYHOJHO0D DOOHVA-TV | [ (1/71) 4000 HONZu3 ONWSLNO WONINNTY )¢ e T [ 0ts1-50 mien 2

DOOR LEAF CORNER
TOP & BOTTOM

(1] Ln
2 N °
RS
ac 3|Y| |5
w o 0.6 .w
ne Y| O -
> o 43
wE o 1 -]
g3 e |8
odl § i
T.m...mZ a —|o
S%0s 5 I8
228 ¢ °
5 232z & If
S50 8
Z afmz o @S
O
O]
m =
= O
qE
KRS 3 ol |
& = N[N [
ad 6 O|o =
O & Qi oY 5
=i | N <O -
o 9 S: 7S] 4|8
L weE Nﬂ__l m.w
= PN I AN
- _Imu.w M — |o
050 s ™T
A Dame 0 %M
LR R
08%« % £
Ey,50 ¥ »&
cZ W oS

2
e
-

FRAME TOP CORNER
FRAME BOTTOM CORNER



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


	21011402w
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER)

	21011402DWGNOA
	SS - American - OS Glazed Alum FD Sidelites (LMI) - DWG W10-43




