MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NO A) www.miamidade.gov/economy
E.S. Windows, LLC

3550 N. W. 49" Street

Miami, FL 33142

ScoprE:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction materials. The
documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER -Product Control Section to
be used in Miami Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control Section
(In Miami Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami Dade County) reserve the right to have this
product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform in the accepted
manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately revoke, modify, or
suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right to revoke this
acceptance, if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product or material fails to
meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “6500” Aluminum Sliding Glass Doors w/ reinforcements-LMI

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W13-07 Rev F, titled “Series 6500 Alum Sliding Glass Door (LMI)”,
sheets 1 through 16 of 16, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 03-17-13 and last revised on NOV 17, 2020,

signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control Renewal stamp with the
Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large Missile Impact Resistant

Limitations:

1. See SGD w/wo Head Receptor (HR) Design Pressures (DP) Vs. Reinforcements & glazing options in sheet 4.

2. See sheet 2 for SGD elevation without HR and anchors capacity charts in sheet 5 at Head & sheet 6 at sill.

3. See sheet 3 for SGD elevation w/ HR doors and Head/sill anchors capacity charts in sheet 6 at sill. Standard
jambs item # E-3 is limited to max DP= +/- 85 PSF only. The max Exterior Positive DP not to exceed = +120.0
PSF, all the cases. Heavy Duty (#E-4) may be used per all tables & free jambs.

4. See sheets 7, 9 & 11, for fixed panel arrangement using alum clip item E-29 (top/bottom) & threshold item E-11.

L ABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, BARRANQUILLA,

COLOMBIA and series and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no change

in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in the

materials, use, and/or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of any product,

for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to comply with any
section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed by the

expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then it shall be

done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors and

shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews #20-0118.09 of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2 & E-3 & E-4, as well as approval

document mentioned above.

The submitted documentation was reviewed by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

NOA No. 23-0314.07
MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

Expiration Date: September 19, 2028
| APPROVED | ’
I 9("4? b 4"’“]@ Approval Date: March 30, 2023

Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. Evidence submitted under previous approvals

A. DRAWINGS
1. Manufacturer's die drawings and sections (submitted under file referenced below)
2. Drawing No. W13-07 Rev C, titled “Series 6500 Alum Sliding Glass Door (LMI)”, sheets 1 through
16 of 16, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 03-17-13 and last revised on SEP 08, 2016,
signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS (submitted under file #13-0115.05)
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of OXXO aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratories, Test Report No. FTL-7130 (FTL 12093), dated
04/05/13 and last revised on 09-12-13, signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P.E.

Along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of OXXX aluminum SGD, prepared by
Fenestration Testing Laboratories, Test Report No. FTL- 6990(FTL12051), dated 08/06/12,
signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P.E.

3. Additional reference test report #BT-ESW-15-005.

C. CALCULATIONS

1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC-2014 (5t
Edition), prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated MAY 29, 2015, OCT 21, 2015 and last
revised on AUG 24, 2016, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

2. Engineering structural analysis of tested stiles & interlocks Vs. redesigned, prepared by Al
Farooq Corporation, dated AUG 13, 2012, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E. and
approved dated 09/14/12 by RER (submitted under file #13-0115.05).

3. Glazing complies w/ ASTME-1300-02, -04 & -09.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DeNemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/4/17.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.10 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DeNemours & Co., Inc.) for “Kuraray Butacite PVB Interlayer”, expiring on 12/11/16.

F. STATEMENTS (Item #2 submitted under file #13-0115.05)
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2014 (5™ Edition) and letter of no financial interest,
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated 05/29/15, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
2. E-mail dated 09/12/13 issued by Fenestration testing lab, clarify 2" shim gap used at
unanchored (free) jambs in Test report FTL-7130, sample A-1, sent by Ms. Iliana Sanchez.
3. Lab compliance as part of the above referenced test report. e L@? B

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date: September 19, 2028
Approval Date: March 30, 2023




E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

G. OTHER (Items 2 thru 4 were submitted under file #13-0115.05)

1.
2.

3.

4,

This NOA revises #13-0115.05, expiring 09/19/18.

Test proposal dated AUG 13, 2012, prepared by Al-Farooq Corp and approved dated 09/14/12 by
RER.

ES Windows Distribution agreement -Energia Solar, S.A. and ES Windows, LLC, dated
09/12/13, signed by Ms. Adriana Montoya, Manager and Andres Chamorro, General manager
respectively on behalf of the companies.

Technical cut sheet data for EPDM, rubber compound by Solucionesencaucho, Columbia.

2 Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS

1.

Drawing No. W13-07 Rev E, titled “Series 6500 Alum Sliding Glass Door (LMI)”, sheets 1 through 16
of 16, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 03-17-13 and last revised on May 15, 2018, signed
and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS

1.

Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC-2017 (6"
Edition), prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated MAR 21, 2018 and last revised on May
08, 2018, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE

1.

Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1.

2.

Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DeNemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/4/18.

Notice of Acceptance No. 16-1117.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont De
Nemours & Co., Inc.) for “Trofosil , ultra clear, clear & color PVB Interlayer”, expiring on
07/08/19.

F. STATEMENTS

1.

2.

Statement letter of conformance to FBC 6" Edition (2017) and of no financial interest,
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated 03/14/18, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
Statement of lab compliance, as part of test report.

G. OTHER

1.

This NOA revises & renews #15-0602.07, expiring 09/19/23.
| 9(«4? [. £ han.

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date: September 19, 2028
Approval Date: March 30, 2023



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

3. Evidence submitted under previous approval

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W13-07 Rev F, titled “Series 6500 Alum Sliding Glass Door (LMI)”, sheets
1 through 16 of 16, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 03-17-13 and last revised on
NOV 17, 2020, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.
C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 7" Edition
(2020), dated 11/06/20, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 05/09/19,
expiring on 07/08/24.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DE Nemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/4/23.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7™ Edition (2020), dated 11/06/20,
issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows, LLC,
dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen. MGR)
respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOA(s) files.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA No. 18-0322.05, expiring 09/19/23.

| 9%? L% ke

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date: September 19, 2028
Approval Date: March 30, 2023



E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. New Evidence submitted

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W13-07 Rev F, titled “Series 6500 Alum Sliding Glass Door (LMI)”, sheets
1 through 16 of 16, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 03-17-13 and last revised on
NOV 17, 2020, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
Note: This is renewal with no change.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS (submitted under previous approval)
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 07/08/24.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DE Nemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/4/23.

D. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7™ Edition (2020), dated 03/10/23,
issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows, LLC,
dated 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen. MGR)
respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOA(s) files).

G. OTHER
1. This NOA renews NOA No. 20-0118.09, expiring 09/19/28.

| 9%'2 [. £ han,

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date: September 19, 2028
Approval Date: March 30, 2023



INSTRUCTIONS:
USE CHARTS AS FOLLOWS.

DETERMINE DESIGN WIND LOAD REQUIREMENT BASED
ON WIND VELOCITY, BLDG. HEIGHT, WIND ZONE
USING APPLICABLE ASCE 7 STANDARD.

STEP 1

STEP 2 DETERMINE DOOR CAPACITY FROM TABLES ON SHEET 4
=—="—% [OR THE GLASS TYPE AND REINFORCING TO USE.

USING CHARTS ON SHEETS 5 FOR DOORS WITHOUT HEAD
RECEPTOR, SHEET 6 FOR DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTOR
AND CHARTS ON SHEET 6 FOR SILL ANCHORS SELECT
ANCHOR OPTION WITH DESIGN RATING MORE THAN DESIGN
LOAD SPECIFIED IN STEP 1 ABOVE.

STEP 3

THE LOWEST VALUE RESULTING FROM STEPS 2 AND 3
SHALL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

STEP 4

THESE DOORS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.
SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.

SERIES ES—-6500
ALUMINUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR
THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE

REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017 (6TH EDITION)/2020 (7TH EDITION) FLORIDA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE

REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2017/2020 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECENVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON ‘ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)".

1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer
K——Tros'tfo! PVB
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.'

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

—
D: \
=
- |
= 4 SILICONE
5, ,i;ﬂ/ DOWSIL 983
Vel
= Al \
. (M7

(@)

EXTERIOR TI GLASS BITE
|
[ )
T
s

GLASS TYPE ‘A’
9/16" OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

1/4" TEMP. GLASS
—3/8" AIR SPACE

XU’#’ HEAT STREN'D GLASS
\
\

.090" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

SILICONE <>\ K_

A
DOWSIL 791\\

SILICONE
DOWSIL 983

15/16" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

EXTERIOR
z
S

GLASS TYPE ‘Al
1-1/4" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

__1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer

rSentryGics
\ By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

SILICONE

| VDOWS:L 983

3/4" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

P}

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘B’

9/16" OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

1/4" TEMP. GLASS

Y—C‘)/B" AIR SPACE

SILICONE \ 1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
\
\

DowsiL 791 .080" Interlayer

- 1/4" HEAT STREN'D

SILICONE
DOWSIL 983

15/16" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

EXTERIOR
A

GLASS TYPE 'BI’
1-1/4" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

GLAZING OPTIONS

DAYLITE OPENINGS WIDTHS:
FIXED STILE—~INTERLOCK =
INTERLOCK—ASTRAGAL =
LOCK STILE—~INTERLOCK =

DAYLITE OPENING HEIGHT:
PANEL HEIGHT 7.375"

PANEL HEIGHT
PANEL HEIGHT

|

1l

PANEL WIDTH — 7.437"
PANEL WIDTH - 6.375"
PANEL WIDTH — 7.187"

WOV 1

DOOR FRAME HEIGHT — 1.750” (W/O RECEPTOR)
OVERALL HEIGHT — 3.500” (WITH RECEPTOR)

1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0314.07
Expiration Date 09/19/2028

By ! 9L\<7 f éé’mJa
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By \9%7 l. £hand
Miami-Dade Product Control

\ TSenth!cs
\ \ By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

GLASS

3/8” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:

SPACER:

‘HELIMA” LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
BY ‘LINGERMANN GMBH’

AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.
PERIMETER SEALANT:

SILICONE
DOWSIL 791
GE 2000

LAMINATED GLASS
INSUL. LAM. GLASS
LARGE MISSILE IMPACT

10

T
O BlE
Yo |0
Lot
™~
© S
\____ﬁ__ﬂzrj)
~ )=
Z 3Rz
Or 28|2
=5 =¢=
=a o off
<z 3904
za. S el=s
Sol 9|9
Qug ¢g|°
Laa %
o %4
ok W
-
83n8
w =
828
Czmo
ﬁﬁ:<o
Qoogd
O9%Lz <
TELE
<i50 5
u_‘”m.:g
:ZOE@
288,
giost
A
CcC___—___———— O
—\
= ]
o Rad
R [r|)
o
S =2
S [{o]
2 2
35 N2
<O
o 1O =
z a0 =
S| -
—d
o
(73]
~ =
=1Q0ds
7
_J; -
T|IOTPm®
‘d‘rp)'
212 ]
DL = - ©
LIE= I
M ~~
N
& -8
O E O
gilnunn =
(zhjlﬂ—d
o] M =E R
A N —
[ )
2l I
G18|Hi8
=l | I
E2inl?o
Olclwly
gmggg
Lad
gm&’ge
clilalzie
PEHEE
olZ|ElclE
oD Z15
>
)
NI
3| P4 iy Ay S
Oilo|-|alc|o
@ ERIHE
>
egoamu.
./ L./
‘
- |
[
~ o
i =
s} Pl
[;IE
G -
- | X
3 5|6
o .
drawing no.

(sheet 1 of 16)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


120" MAX.

. CLUSTER OF
14 1/2" MAX. 8, 10 OR 12 ANCHORS
. . . HEAD . AT INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
4 MAX. J ) > _ / SEE SHEET 5
HEAD B Ve = N o N A I
CORNERS . > _ = . S
L7/ . . AN A N Y . Ce e e . .
e\ © © ° \ o 0/ /e o b/ e e \ e L © D/ /D 0/ L3 & \ﬂ e o 3 / o © o
5 \o \%Q e . __
T nE, e
240"
DOOR FRAME WIDTH
( 4 PANEL MAX. )
] H N T A A H— - H ] - - H
& ©
_ | ! PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED
] i! 0 as complying with the Florida as complying with the Florida
SR G - Building Code S1di
i b e =z 23-0314.07 Building Code
! | NOA-No. - : NOA-No. 20-1118.09
| | - .
= _ ’t E: Expiration Date 09/19/2028 Expiration Date 09/19/2023
(] 1 | -
E @ t: {: @ ;/ @ By IS | Lhank, By 5o T
8 ] - ::ii::: - %I::::: // Miami-Dade -P/reduCt Control Miami-Dade P/rqduct Control
14 . h |[ /// // //
5 W e 7 v
g o s , 7/
T - i‘ ,// z[ /s / .
= 5 - z ! h
38 - i S SEE SHEET 4 SEE SHEET 4
E T ~15h :::é:::}l‘::::: FOR \ FOR
r ©gd - o3 | H /REINFORCEMENTS L /REENFORCEMENTS
o —1Z - - h K 1 i
£ & ! ly
i I
= i i <:::1 c:_Jl>
2 ] I A L b
: NI R
14 (! I
(e} il b
(e} ot }! iE
e — i !y 3-PLY
h §: HOOK LOCK
| |
opo—soooo LEE
- | |
1 |
- K i
4 ® © £
- AN m 1 R f i NI i m i m 1 1 | !
EALSE. MUNTIN 54" 1/8" 54" 1/8” 54" 1/8" 54" 1/8"
OPTIONAL D.L.C. D.L.O. D.L.O. D.L.O.
61 9/16” 61 5/16"
' PANEL WIDTH 60 1/2" PANEL WIDTH
. PANEL WIDTH
4 MAX. 127 MAX. I
SILL SILL %
CORNERS P - : J—
' P = . P T . . ; 7 . . .
! . ’ o . . Ve e e /\ . . \ . o/ . o a/\ o . . R
I CLUSTER OF T -
6 OR 7 ANCHORS TYPE ‘BB’
AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL SILL ENDS 3"
o SEE SHEET 6 L TYP. f S
7 / \ | / \
l.}.” . e e Lo e o . . A . . I ST . . .
4" MAX L 127 MAX. 3" L
SiLL TESTED DOOR ELEVATION (4 PANELS OR LESS)

SiLL
CORNERS

OXXO (DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR)
MAX. AREA NOT TO EXCEED 200 SQ. FT. PER FBC 2014

1 HEAD ANCHORS

WITHOUT RECEPTOR

3
STAGGERED

CLUSTER OF

4, 5 OR 6 ANCHORS

AT JAMB ENDS
SEE SHEET 5

o //
° ///
~ /;/

° . / o

° 2l / &

= [22) =

2 0

NS (=]

. o "

O

e

[®]

° <€

0.

<€

(@]

(]

. 3 OR 4 ANCHORS S

. TYPE ‘BB’ -

AT JAMB SILL ENDS z

SEE SHEET 6 &

o ¥4}

[}

. ey (24

e ™ (@]

P T L

=< & \\il I/’// N

E%Fi§%§ m

< LJ

H 70 I

[¢] o v

=z

ANCHORED UNANCHORED o]

JAMBS JAMBS =

<€

X

Q

j )

bt

U1

STAGGERED

W iiiggy

GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR HEAD AND 6 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART OR ANCHOR CHARTS

WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

e
O B
Yo ¥ |0
l
™~
(] S
N
e e N 0 ]
zZ =2z
O 882
- % Q=
EE 8%
€= 3484
[ S BiIs
Ecos3d|o
48~ @lo
Omﬁ &
Loy %
fr or w
0ban
Q244
628 o
on:n: &
Qaog
OdLz <
raove §
rega o
guUsSiL g
u_ww;o
|EOE‘3
=282 d
Lozt
N
C
~
= ]
= D
o
= 3
= 0
%) o
%! o
3 2
o
o 1O >
z|aL =
= .
o
o
(98]
~ =
s1vnds
Sz T
<o MY
<+ I
ol M o
Bz~ .8
Sil«=z 5 ¢
g —~
L,,'JBZ“‘S
1%} ‘O§3
EU?“U)){J
= <
L = §
p—
O
N ™
4]
Zlelkblo
B HIE
= v
SITlnlR
COOEO
x| N EIS
S§839
SHEEE
ool T
0|88
olniE|oln
role(31Z21D
>
Lo
A REEIETIS
=(151 Do g peg
Qlo|~|N|c|e
218 8|8|=
éSOQMg
| C———

03-17-13

o
Z
=
BS
£
u
el

chk. by:

date:

drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


N " CLUSTER OF 2 ANCHORS
9 5/8 2 3/4 & ANCHORS AT JAMB ENDS
4" MAX. MAX. TYP. AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS AT ANCHORED
W ;o' o ) P SEE SHEET 6 - JAMBS
CORNERS I — - - /(,, NN T . - X . . ; . " oY
o o s o \ N o . ol S B \ B . o s ° \ o o .
y S /// \\\M ',//
T = 10 -
hgt=
¥ u
5
. 192”7

1 .3/4"

DOOR FRAME WIDTH
( 4 PANEL MAX. )

SEE SHEET 4 FOR OVERALL DOOR HEIGHT WITH HEAD RECEPTOR

SItL
CORNERS

SILL

OXXO (DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTOR)

MAX. AREA NOT TO EXCEED 162.33 SQ. FT. PER

FBC 2014

b7
I
P ;: PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED
7] s = b as_complying with the Florida, as complying with the Florida
T Building Code Building Code
H NOA-No. 23-0314.07| NOA-No. 20-1118.09
5 ] // H @ // @ Expiration Date 09/19/2028 | Expiration Datew
o I
3 @ A v/ By |St=g | Lhank By |stag [ Lhan
o - —=z 2’:n::Z::: /// Miami-Dade Product Control Miami-Dade Product Control
a e amt S 7/ v
5 4 ” ’ v g
z|T = [
ZIE Lo % ] x SEE SHEET 4 SEE SHEET 4
L2 Y No - L FOR FO
> R s======fmsTIoss / RE!NFORCEMENTNN / REINFORCEMENTS
Ml w|gd o|a - i ; 3
-5 Tz = _ il
N £ 1
T ¥
s i <?:1 l_":_:l“>
= — I 7
& - I | B {
o ;m; —————— \‘
& ¥
o i
[a] T H
. i 3-PLY
i HOOK LOCK
T TR T
— I
- I
I
it
4 ® ©
- IEEEEIEEEE Rl IR L L A L
"1 /g 4" 1/8" 4" 1/8" 42" 1/8"
FALSE MUNTIN 42" 1/ / (3/ - ({
OPTIONAL D.L.O. D.L.O. D.L.O. .L.O.
49 9/16" 49 5/16"
‘ PANEL. WIDTH 48 1/2" PANEL WIDTH
” PANEL WIDTH /)un
4" MAX. 8 1/2" MAX. I )
SILL SitL % :
CORNERS e e :
s ° . o o ° o o o [/ o ° ° \ o o / ° ° ° °
[ o . o o e o o /\ R . o . o o/ . o/\ o . o .
T CLUSTER OF T
6 OR 7 ANCHORS TYPE ‘BB’ .
AT INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL SILL ENDS 3
- SEE SHEET 6 o TP, I“ o
7 7
! ~ P ~ - N
8 1/2" MAX. .
4" MAX. 3
TESTED DOOR ELEVATION (4 PANELS OR LESS) s

HEAD ANCHORS
WITH RECEPTOR

&

CLUSTER OF

AT JAMB ENDS
SEE SHEET 6

WOW 17

° ///
° v
- -
. S o
s/ |
. i B
w)
Lt
[&]
. g N
. %0
= g r
z < 6
N TR b
¢ - o
<C
[&]
2
. 3 OR 4| ANCHORS S
TYPE ‘BB’ 2
AT JAMB SILL ENDS 5
SEE SHEET 6 Ao
. L
x©
= pd
iy 5
I T ] ‘ Q
L %ef N =
fas) ~-— zZ
I"ﬁ H"{ sy o
R Sgoc T
©|°8 UNANCHORED =
JAMBS zZ
ANCHORED ©
JAMBS 2N
%(n
Swn
Lum
v
— no
(]
Yl o®
L2 A BT
o ld
Sl &
L
w

e

O.~ STATEOF
"oe . & o0
7 @@ o Z’.’OR\OP’?

&3Sy
///
mns

NAL @

__4 OR 5 ANCHORS

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART OR ANCHOR CHARTS

SEE CHARTS ON SHEET 6 FOR HEAD OR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.
WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

f
C

COMP—ANL\W1 3——07ESW)

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

wﬂ(

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638~5151

[ SERIES ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM.)]

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

D |03.20.18
E 105.09.18
F 111.05.20

C {09.14.15

revisions:
no| date

|

03~-17-13

Q
2
=
B
el
u
©

date:
chk. by:

drawing no.

W13—-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF (WITH OR WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR)

REINF. LEVEL ‘1’

REINF. LEVEL ‘2’

REINF. LEVEL '3’

OANEL WIDTH Do?%ggﬁmz GLASS ‘A’ & ‘A1’ | GLASS ‘B’ & 'Bl’ | GLASS 'B’ & ‘B1’ | GLASS ‘B’ & 'Bt’
INCHES INCHES EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=)
36 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 1200 | 135.0
42 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 1100 | 120.0 1200 | 135.0
48 82 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 96.3 105.0 1200 | 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.6 93.3 106.7 | 120.0
60 - - 85.0 85.0 77.0 84.0 96.0 108.0
36 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
48 84 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 96.3 105.0 120.0 | 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.6 93.3 106.7 | 120.0
60 - - 85.0 85.0 77.0 84.0 96.0 108.0
35 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 1200 | 135.0
42 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
48 90 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 96.3 105.0 120.0 | 135.0
54 - N 85.0 85.0 85.6 93.3 106.7 | 120.0
60 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 96.0 108.0
36 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 1350
48 96 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 96.3 105.0 120.0 | 135.0
54 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 106.7 | 120.0
60 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 96.0 108.0
36 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 - - 85.0 85.0 1100 | 120.0 1200 | 135.0
48 102 - - 85.0 85.0 96.3 105.0 120.0 | 135.0
54 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 106.7 | 120.0
60 85.0 85.0 - N - -
36 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
48 108 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 120.0 | 135.0
54 - - 85.0 85.0 - - - -
60 - - 85.0 85.0 - ~ - -
36 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
48 114 - - 85.0 85.0 - - 1200 | 135.0
54 - - 85.0 85.0 - - - .
60 - - 85.0 85.0 - - - -
36 - - 85.0 85.0 1100 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
42 - - 85.0 85.0 110.0 | 120.0 120.0 | 135.0
48 120 - - 85.0 85.0 -~ - 120.0 | 135.0
54 - - 85.0 85.0 ~ - - -
60 - - 85.0 85.0 - - - -

CHART ABOVE SHOWS FRAME HEIGHTS FOR DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR.

FOR DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS OVERALL HEIGHT =

DOOR FRAME HT. FROM CHART + 1 3/4"

b

(WITH HEAD RECEPTOR)

(W/O HEAD RECEPTOR)
121 3/4" MAX. OVERALL HEIGHT

120" MAX. DOOR FRAME HEIGHT

OVERALL HEIGHT (WITH HEAD RECEPTOR)

L; ; gl
¥ 1T Ul 1L |

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07 NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Datew Expiration Date M’)
By ! QL\‘7 f Zé‘qu By | QL\<‘2 f [4‘7’1‘14

Miami-Dade Product Control Miami-Dade Product Control

NOTE:

SEE SHEET 12 FOR FIXED PANEL CLIP, ANGLE AND SNAP ON THRESHOLD REQUIREMENT.
ALSO SEE SHEET 8 FOR APPLICABLE EXTRUSION TEMPERS FOR STILES/INTERLOCKS.

DOOR FRAME HT. FROM CHART + 1-3/4"

DOOR HEIGHT AND WIDTH SIZE MUST COMPLY
EGRESS REQUIREMENTS PER FBC AS REQUIRED.

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCA05-DEC-219

7 Ve
=
q_U 2
(v} 5
INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL A N
Z 5§§§
OQr 88|2
RE .83
€= 394
5,592
= ERHE
: Owy ¢
E Loy %
Eor uw
1 o!—Dm
03245
: w
NON-REINF. LEVEL ‘1’ O'§E o
WITH STANDARD FRAME JAMBS (ITEM #E3) ©0acgd
O Lz 3
EP229
ASTRAGAL Eﬁ 2B
] Z o E @
4288
Los F
f—
C____————
—r
p—r = o0
E < o |
[+¢]
= .
EXT. % a
REINF. LEVEL ‘2’ A 2 8
WITH HEAVY DUTY FRAME JAMBS (ITEM #E4) o0 .
z)\Jd5 8
s|-u
o
(2]
> b
=|QnT 5
= %@EE
o ‘fr’)u!:
[« D My
BlL=x ;°©
EELE
1%} moéa
2 I
GiWe=sE
~—
T
-
Qj/ REINF. LEVEL '3’ | .
0
WITH HEAVY DUTY FRAME JAMBS (ITEM #E4) g g % g
EZinln
Slele|
SElFIFIS
2l 1885
SIFESES
SlelZiz|E
® . |B|8Ig
vinlolola
olelZlz|5
>
1O
A MR
OlelT|&|8)8
2|8 8|8z
§8ocuu_
- L_/
| G

03~17-13

<4
x
<
=
=
o
o
o

date:

chk. by:

S
drawing no.

W13-07

(Sheet 4 o 16)



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
(DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR)
(APPLICABLE TO SHEET 2 ELEVATION)

ANCHOR TYPE ANCHOR TYPE ‘AA’ ANCHOR TYPE ‘BB’ ANCHOR TYPE ‘C’ ANCHOR ‘cC’
SHIM SPACE 1/4” SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM 1/4” SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM 1/2” MAX. SHIM 1/4” SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM 3/8” SHIM
8 ANCHORS | 8 ANCHORS | 10 ANCHORS | 8 ANCHORS | B ANCHORS | 10 ANCHORS | B ANCHORS | 10 ANCHORS | 12 ANCHORS | 8 ANCHORS | B ANCHORS | 10 ANCHORS | 12 ANCHORS | 8 ANCHORS
AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG.
DOOR FRAVE| STILE ENDS | STIE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS
PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (4) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+)
INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=)
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 82 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
60 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 84 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
60 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 90 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
60 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 96 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
60 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0 108.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 102 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 126.5 135.0 135.0 135.0 126.5 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 117.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 117.0 120.0 120.0 120.0
60 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 129.6 135.0 135.0 135.0 129.6 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 108 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 117.5 135.0 135.0 135.0 117.5 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
60 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 121.3 135.0 135.0 135.0 121.3 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 114 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 109.7 135.0 135.0 135.0 109.7 135.0 135.0 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
60 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
36 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 129.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 129.0 135.0 135.0 135.0
42 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 135.0 113.9 135.0 135.0 135.0 113.9 135.0 135.0 135.0
48 120 135.0 130.6 135.0 135.0 130.6 135.0 102.8 128.5 135.0 135.0 102.8 128.5 135.0 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
60 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0 85.0
+ ANCHORS AT |4 ANCHORS AT|5 ANCHORS AT|4 ANCHORS AT|4 ANCHORS AT|5 ANCHORS AT|4 ANCHORS AT|5 ANCHORS AT|6 ANCHORS AT| 4 ANCHORS AT |4 ANCHORS AT |5 ANCHORS AT|6 ANCHORS AT| 4 ANCHORS AT
FREE STANDING | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STANDING | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STAND. | FREE STANDING
JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS | JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS

CHART ABOVE SHOWS FRAME HEIGHTS FOR DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR.
LIMIT ALL EXTERIOR LOADS TO +120.0 PSF MAX.

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07
Expiration Date 09/19/2028
By |9L\‘~‘7 |. £ hanl

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By IQL\¢7 [. £hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

SEE CHART ON SHEET 4 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ABOVE FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.
SEE CHART ON SHEET 6 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART
HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL
APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

~

a

|

COMP—ANL\W13—07ESW )

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220
MIAMI, FLORIDA 33473
TEL. (305) 264-8100

LSERES ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LMJ)]

|

|

f
C

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

(

FAX. (305) 638—5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by Tdescription

nol date

N(revisions:

£ |05.09.18
F 111.05.20

C {09.14.15
D {03.20.18

03-17-13

date:

| SO——
drawing

W13-07

chk. by:

no.



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


-
HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF U z
(DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTOR) SILL ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF ' - o
(APPLICABLE TO SHEET 3 ELEV. & SHEET 11 DETAL) (APPLICABLE TO DOORS WITH OR W/O HEAD RECEPTOR) m 5
n
ANCHOR TYPE ANCHOR TYPE 'AAA’ ANCHOR TYPE ANCHOR TYPE ‘BB’ ~ M
SHIM SPACE 1/4” MAX. SHIM SHIM SPACE 1/4" MAX. SHIM g 5 51>
-t
8 ANCHORS 10 ANCHORS 6 ANCHORS 7 ANCHORS =z ©8 z
AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. "<" s 2§/
DOOR FRAME STILE ENDS STILE ENDS DOOR FRAME STILE ENDS STILE ENDS o . S gIs
(o} o
PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (4) EXT. (+) PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. () EXT. (4) :sR‘gggg:gsvﬁf:tE::EIEﬁda coagtgls
INCHES INCHES INT, (<) INT. (<) INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (=) Building Code o af: %
26 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 NOA-No. 23-0314.07 14 ag P
ERm
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 Expiration Date 09/19/2028 8 g X
- oW
o | e e A I oy s Ches
] ) . . Miami-Dade Product Control Qaogd
60 108.0 108.0 60 108.0 108.0 OLzE 3
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 E2Y99 &
& =
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 PRODUCT REVISED E W aLb
- - - ()
48 84 135.0 135.0 48 84 135.0 135.0 2 ifgiwglg::’gewﬂh the Florida 559 5 S
54 120.0 120.0 54 120.0 120.0 NOA-No. 20-1118.09 <GasE
e N
60 108.0 108.0 60 108.0 108.0 Expiration Date 09/19/2023 | E———
36 135.0 135.0 15 135.0 135.0 _ = -
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 By 5t | Lhank = 5
48 90 135.0 135.0 48 90 135.0 135.0 Miami-Dade Product Control = i
[
54 120.0 120.0 54 120.0 120.0 = 3
60 108.0 108.0 60 108.0 108.0 @ 5
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 =2 2
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 ol O X%
Z|dL &
48 96 135.0 135.0 48 96 135.0 135.0 =
s
54 120.0 120.0 54 120.0 120.0 M =N
=\ 5
60 108.0 108.0 60 108.0 108.0 é = o= 5
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 ~18+B 4
< .
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 5lZzz ;9
48 102 135.0 135.0 48 102 135.0 135.0 H|FZ3
54 120.0 120.0 54 120.0 120.0 2|33 ®
60 85.0 85.0 60 85.0 85.0 Elu8 § E
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 S G
| C—
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 ~
48 108 135.0 135.0 48 108 135.0 135.0
54 85.0 85.0 54 85.0 85.0 ElelE|o
Lifltim
60 85.0 85.0 60 85.0 85.0 2505,
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 EMEEtS
o
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 gf wlyle
S EIES
48 14 134.0 1350 48 114 1328 135.0 SEE CHART ON SHEET 4 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF DESIRED SRR
54 85.0 85.0 54 85.0 85.0 GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES. oEigle g
60 85.0 85.0 60 85.0 85.0 SEE CHART LEFT FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY. 2
36 135.0 135.0 36 135.0 135.0 SEE CHART RIGHT FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY. PN =
2 N EEIE
42 135.0 135.0 42 135.0 135.0 LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART, HEAD ANCHOR CHART Si€<is|als
48 120 126.0 135.0- 48 120 124.5 135.0 OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. :g RIS
54 85.0 B85.0 54 85.0 85.0 ojlefola]u|w
(Spt.
60 85.0 85.0 60 85.0 85.0 2
4 ANCHORS AT | 5 ANCHORS AT 3 ANCHORS AT | 4 ANCHORS AT "
FREE STANDING | FREE STANDING FREE STANDING | FREE STANDING i o
JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS JAMB ENDS 7 &
g =
o .
. >
CHARTS ABOVE SHOWS FRAME HEIGHTS FOR DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR. s & j
FOR DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS OVERALL HEIGHT DOOR FRAME HT. FROM CHART + 1-3/4" ] 5|5
g e T
LIMIT ALL EXTERIOR LOADS TO +120.0 PSF MAX. drowing o,
sheet 6 of 16



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


FOR UNANCHORED JAMBS
USE ES-6500-004 ONLY

REINF.
MAX. DOOR SEE SHEET 4
FRAME WIDTH &1l @ QT QS%OM
1 /[ 7 : NOTE:
o4 & a5 g lﬁ ] 1. OPERABLE PANEL TO BE ON EXTERIOR TRACKS WITH SAFEGUARD.
L
- 8:5; 0 L 2. CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSES ONLY.
2 P It 1—}’ 3. FOR APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURES AND REINFORCEMENTS
% 7= - REQUIREMENTS SEE SHEET 4.
]
i j 4. FOR ANCHOR DETAILS SEE SHEETS 9 THRU 13.
ég (SHOWN) — PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
sxucc;z\gi / EXTERIOR e e A
e S NOA-No. 23-0314.07
: REINF.
FRAME WIDTH € / SEE SHEET 4 YA TOP /' SEE SHEET 4 Expiration Date 09/19/2028
' & BOTTOM
r E By ]91«47 [ Ké'ini.
a 1 /' vk . Miami-Dade Product Control
A (%
G ©r G ©F §r~ j - y,,&"/"'"”"" g = } =
== 05 L i ff y i} ke < e
- L < < -
ﬁ?; T <l | J !
LE\ l‘l - [u{’ } : =
OXO (SHOWN) S — [, Ll e P
@ E:: EXTERIOR
REINF & BOTTOM
: REINF.
HEET 4
e WO 3 ¥ somow /oo S SEE SHEET 4\ 3 PRODUCT REVISED
I FRAME WIDTH = - as complying with the Florida
1 = N £ Building Code
| NOA-No. 20-1118.09
o ) Lu b ®] ”::}“‘\‘\‘ Expiration Date 09/19/2023
O O O ®~~8,_ | 1 ] ittt
=> <« Qé f = e = — - By lsbag [- L hand
P % ¥ L—":l f ] ] Miami-Dade Product Control
Z % % = I
—_—*j
XOX (SHOWN)
EXTERIOR
+ 00k REINF. AT TOP ggg\jFéHEET 4
MAX. HEET 4
( FRAME WIDTH N SEE SHEET \ 29 (29 eV @& BOTTOM
! | : ‘ » Z
[ X C o
o of of et ot j yARLIE 2 {,E
- 1. - - Lz .
ok L
o = Dé - L —,] = <= N
% 7 % % 3 & = -
il E
,_:I L i
OXXO(SHOWN) e

APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS
MAX. 4 PANELS OR LESS

MAX. FRAME AREA NOT TO EXCEED 200 SQ. FT. (DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTORS)
MAX. FRAME AREA NOT TO EXCEED 162.33 SQ. FT. (DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS)

EXTERIOR

a
(C.A.N. 3538) fC
COMP—ANL\W13—07ESW )

FAX. (3085) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638~5151

[ SERIES ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM.)]

|

J

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by description

D {03.20.18
E {05.09.18
F 111.05.20

C 109.14.15

(revisions:
no[ date

|

03-17-13

g
K4
=
B
0
A
°

scale:
chk. by:

date:

C—————
TR
drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


ITEM # PART # QUANTITY DESCRIPTION MATERIAL MANF. /SUPPLIER/REMARKS
El ES—6500-001 1 STANDARD FRAME HEAD 6063-T6 -
E2 ES-6500-002 1 FRAME SILL 6063~T6 -
E3 ES—-6500—~003 2 STANDARD FRAME JAMB 6063-T6 LIMIT MAX. LOADS TO +85 PSF
E4 ES-6500-004 2 HEAVY DUTY FRAME JAMB 6063~-T6 -
ES ES—-6500-005 2/ PANEL TOP AND BOTTOM RAIL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063—T6 -
E6 ES-6500-006 1/ PANEL LOCK STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063~-T6 -
E7 ES-6500-007 1/ PANEL INTERLOCK STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6005-T5 -
E8 ES-6500-008 1 ASTRAGAL STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6005-T5 -
ES ES—-6500-008 1 ASTRAGAL ADAPTER 6063-T6 -
E10 ES-6500-010 1 ADD—-ON TRACK 6063-T6 -
E11 ES—-6500-011 1 THRESHOLD (LENGTH = OPNG. WIDTH BETWEEN FIXED PANELS) 606376 -
E12 ES—-6500-012 2 SNAP—IN JAMB COVER (OPTIONAL) 6063~T5 -
E13 ES-6500-013 1 TRACK INSERT 606316 -
E14 ES—-6500-014A - RETAINER CLIP, 4" LONG 6063-T6 -
E15 ES—-6500-015 AS REQD. SCREEN RAIL 6063—-T6 -
E16 ES-6500-016 AS REQD. ASTRAGAL REINFORCEMENT, FULL PANEL LENGTH 6005-T5 -
E17 ES—-6500-017 AS REQD. INTERLOCK REINFORCEMENT, FULL PANEL LENGTH 6005-T5 -
E18 E£S—-6500-018 AS REQD. HEAD COVER (OPTIONAL) 6063~T5 -
E22 ES-6011 AS REQD. SCREW COVER (OPTIONAL) 6063-T6 -
E24 ES-6500-019 1 HEAD RECEPTOR 6063-T6 -
£25 ES-6500-020 1 RECEPTOR REINFORCEMENT, FULL LENGTH 6005-T5 -
E26 ES-6500-021 1 FRAME HEAD AT RECEPTOR 6005-T5 -
E27 ES-6500-023 1/ PANEL LOCK STILE (LAM. GLASS) 606316 -
£28 ES—-6500-024 2/ PANEL TOP AND BOTTOM RAIL (LAM. GLASS) 606316 -
E29 ES—-6500—-025 1/ PANEL INTERLOCK STILE (LAM. GLASS) 8005-T5 -
E30 ES—-6500-027 1 SILL SCREW COVER 6063-T5 -
E31 ES—-6500-026 1 ASTRAGAL STILE (LAM. GLASS) 6005-T5 -
£32 ES-6500-033 2 FIXED PANEL BOTTOM GUIDE 6005~-T5 -
M1 #12 x 1 1/2" 3/ CORNER | FRAME ASSEMBLY SCREWS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M2 #10 X 1 1/47 4/ CORNER | PANEL ASSEMBLY SCREWS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M3 #8 x 1" 2/ LOCK LOCK FASTENERS ST. STEEL F.H. SMS
M4 #8 X 3/47 2/ HANDLE HANDLE SET FASTENERS ST. STEEL P.H. SMS
M6 #10 X 1/27 2/ cup RETAINER CLIP FASTENERS ST. STEEL F.H. SMS
M7 ES-6500-GO1A 4/ PANEL GLAZING GASKET (LAM. GLASS) SILICONE DUROMETER 6545 SHORE A, EXTRUSIONES S.A
M8 E-214 AS REQD. ASTRAGAL ADAPTER WSTRIPPING VINYL THERMOPLASTIC ELASTOMER
M10 ES-8011 AS REQD. SPACER GASKET EPDM DUROMETER 80+5 SHORE A, EXTRUSIONES S.A.
M11 27-445 AS REQD. GLAZING WEDGE GASKET EPDM DUROMETER 75+5 SHORE A, SOLUCIONESENCAUCHO
M12 27448 AS REQD. BOTTOM RAIL GLAZING GASKET EPDM DUROMETER 68+5 SHORE A, SOLUCIONESENCAUCHO
M13 27-449 AS REQD. GLAZING GASKET AT TOP RAIL AND STILES EPDM DUROMETER 75+5 SHORE A, SOLUCIONESENCAUCHO
M16 1/4" X 1/27 AS REQD. GLAZING TAPE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) FOAM -
M17 Q3007190 AS REQD. FABRIC COATED FOAM WEATHERSEAL POLYETHYLENE | Q—LONG
M18 Q2007190 AS REQD. WEATHERSEAL EXTERIOR POLYETHYLENE | Q—LONG
M19 Q1507270 AS REQD. INTERLOCK BUMPER POLYETHYLENE | Q—LONG
M20 W2230012K AS REQD. PILE W'STRIPPING POLYPROPYLENE | —
M21 GTT—-234/460-02~A 2/ PANEL ROLLER - PABOSE
M22 PS01-1015-008B 1 MORTISE LOCK KEEPER - INTERLOCK
M23 PS0O1-0035-00B 1 TWO POINT 3—PLY HOOK LOCK - INTERLOCK
M24 PS01-0016—XXX 1/ MOV. PANEL| HANDLE SET - INTERLOCK
M26 52019 AS REQD. THRESHOLD W'STRIPPING - AMESBURY
M27 ES-7000 GO1 AS REQD. SILL W'STRIPPING SILICONE DUROMETER 6045 SHORE A
M29 ALU—-A-027 - FIX. PANEL ANGLE, 2" X 2" X 1/8" X 7/8" LONG 6063-T5 HEAD/SILL (FIXED PANEL)
M30 #14 X 17 2/ CuP FIX. PANEL ANGLE FASTENERS - HWH SMS
M31 ES-5008 AS REQD. BULB W'STRIPPING EPDM DUROMETER 70 SHORE A
M32 ES-6500-S01 - 1/4" SPACER FOR JAMB NYLON -
M33 ES—-6500-502 - 1/2" SPACER FOR ASTRAGAL NYLON -
M35 P6304 AFK - ADHESIVE PILE PAD (4" X 1" X 1/27) - ULTRAFAB
M38 W73341NK0O0OB AS REQD. THRESHOLD WEATHERSEAL PILE -
M39 ES—-6500-301 AS REQD. BOTTOM SPACER POLYPROPYLENE | —

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date 09/19/2028

By lSL@? l. Lhand
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By 19k¢7 [. £hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

B LoROE oS 3
&, ,®/©N AL @%\\\\

f
<

(C.A.N. 3538)
COMP—ANL\W13—07ESW )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

wwﬁ{
(

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

[SERIES‘ ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR

)U

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [ description

11.05.20

(revisions:
nol date
¢ |09.14.15
D [03.20.18
E |05.09.18
F

{

03-17-13

4
4
<
=
=
a
o
©

dote:
chk. by:

[
e
drawing no.

W13-07

iy



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


(LOAD BEARING)
SEE CHART

3/8" MAX. SHIM

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

37 MiIN.

SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2 \ s~
FOR SPACING AND | STAGGERED 1BY WOOD BUCK T2\
w  SHEET 5 FOR QUANTITY f\ DIAGONAL (SEE NOTE SHEET 1) Z |0
> T
= . ) IS}
& |- EDGE DIST. i CONCRETE i °u
z BT D 13 KST MIN. N=Nint7
n a < NG|
s </ NG}

DOOR FRAME HEIGHT

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK/ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

STAGGERED |

. SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2
1 FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 5 FOR QUANTITY

ONCRETE Lt [l « i 7 3 KStMIN.

2, CONCRETE -

e . L
Y . .

©

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date 09/19/2028
By |9Lu<7 |. Lhand

Miami-Dade Product Control

Ol
@9—"1
O

J};J

bdd

UNITS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTORS

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By IQLWZ l. £ hand
Miami-Dade Product Control

SEALANT:

ALL JOINTS AND FRAME CONNECTIONS SEALED WITH
WHITE/ALUMINUM COLORED SILICONE.

WEEPHOLES:

W = 1/4” X 3” LONG WEEP HOLES AT 4 1/2" FROM

EACH END.

ALTERNATE WEATHERSEAL
W v

EXT.

©

ALT.

1/2"
MAX.

:4’. i:v 4l 4A;i 31‘;"M}N;_ -”’44 ‘,
o STAGGERED, -
DIAGONAL

1/2"

SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2
FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 6 FOR QUANTITY

i
| |
|
\1 ll ]
ol i
It i :
iy ;
i :
gl =
@ it 5 & :
o iy - i = @] H
— 3 ! i T T 5 b /L H
E - g S g E A
= ! o) T s T 3] / )
fe i . ] é _J = <Z(
5 il - Q i i > o
& b ° < x = A 5
i S
i ° Z
L &
' 3
H H[ | SILICONE DOWSIL 791
i AT THRESHOLD ENDS
il '
Ha 129 :
W
SILICONE Al v
/DOWSIL 791 itk
SN . e ©) - ' 5
@\ I
_—c) -
H 7 PQURED & HARDENED @/ i Yv i
@//BU T | «HIGH STRENGTH GROUT / B o M29
------ © NON-SHRINK, NON—METALLIC e .Bygu;:;v;e;vum;:;a.~ 4
/. : , _§c = 5000 PSI MIN. @@5/ AR RRRRRRARK IR TR KRRRRRARAN IS
& P < - T ..%  NOT BY 'E.S. WINDOWS’ ' "x R |
, a e o " MUST TRANSFER SHEAR s AN
o SEL e ae W% 4H 3 JRRR TYPICAL ANCHORS
£ gosg'm;—ﬁr!ﬁ , e LOADS TO STRUCTURE N ES S Nw, IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
: N - INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
TYPICAL ANCHORS & IN PAIRS AT FRAME
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS STAGGERED FOR SPACING AND
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME DIAGONAL SHEET 6 FOR QUANTITY

R

a
f
C

|

COMP—ANL\W13—07ESW )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET
MIAMI, FL. 33142

[SERIES ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.I.)J
TEL. (305) 638-5151

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

C 109.14.15
D |03.20.18
E |05.09.18
F 111.05.20

revisions:
nol date

{

03-17-13

<4
[
<
=
Fy
[
k-]

date:
chk. by:

4 T
drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURE NOT BY ‘E.S. WINDOWS’
MUST SUSTAIN LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM
AND TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
— —— — AT HEAD (FOR DOORS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR) — — —

TYPE ‘AA'— 5/16” DIA. ULTRACON BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI)

L INTO WOOD STRUCTURES l
1=7/8" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD 1

\ THRU 1BY OR 2BY BUCKS INTO CONCRETE ‘
1—1/2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE ‘

TYPE 'BB'~ 5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY ‘DEWALT’ (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI)
} DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE 1
1-1/2" MIN. EMBED

4" DA, T F_DRILLIN (GRADE 5 CRS) l
5/16" DIA. TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS) }

INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS v
| (3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS |
| ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063~T5 MIN.)
STEEL:  1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
t (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) ,
, OR .
| INTO METAL STRUCTURES |
(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS '
| ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.) |
STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

| Tvee "c-
| TYPE ‘CC'-

L

-

L

— AT SILL (FOR DOORS W/WO HEAD RECEPTOR — —
RPE ‘BB'— 5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY ‘DEWALT (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI)
) DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE

L 1-1/2" MIN. EMBED
5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY 'DEWALT (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI)

} INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1—-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

l THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE OR BLOCKS

l 5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY 'DEWALT’ (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI)
] DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE
1—1/2" MIN. EMBED

[ 1/4" DIA. TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS) ‘

: INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS

l (3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS }
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)

| STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.) |
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

- —— AT JAMBS (FOR DOORS W/WO HEAD RECEPTOR) —  — —l
|
|
|
|

OR ]

1 INTO METAL STRUCTURES
(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS

ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063-T5 MIN.) |

STEEL: 1/8" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
B (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

Lat
X mtﬂ
37 MIN. l s 2%
STAGGERED | | =
DIAGONAL
=t g b
EDGE DIST. _LH = L%
L)
| :mga Q
AN 22 Sl l
UUEmnes ULl
=30
" I
%0 I
<m ()w
= A lw I
wg @
N
) S

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2
FOR SPACING AND

SHEET 5 FOR QUANTITY

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07 NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2028 Expiration Date 09/19/2023
By | 9L\47 f léﬂni. By \SL@? l. £ hand

Miami-Dade Product Control Miami-Dade Product Control

ALTERNATE SUBSTRATES UNITS WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTORS

SEE CHART
SHEET 5

METAL
3 MINL STRUCTURES
STAGGERED Es/ga L%?é)
DIAGONAL
EDGE DIST.
| )
N —— |
C__ L UsmnmemUll 3
20
> 52
[ [1:e4
% &
<§( m
= 2
€8

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2
FOR SPACING AND

SHEET 5 FOR QUANTITY

_________ MRS W i T L |

—— = e e yed oy ——

(U 338

EXT.
P
J—
fe——

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 2
FOR SPACING AND

SHEET 5 FOR QUANTITY

INTO CONCRETE = 2-1/2" MIN.

INTO BLOCKS = 3-1/8" MIN.

INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1-1/4" MIN.
INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4" MIN.

WOOD AT HEAD OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.
CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.
C~-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.

SEE SHEET 11 FOR UNITS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS

a
(C.A.N. 3538) fC
COMP—ANL\W13—07ESW )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET
MIAMI, FL. 33142

[ SERIES ES-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LM.L))
TEL. (305) 638-5151

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TQO 2020 FBC

by [ description

D |03.20.18
E |05.09.18
F 111.05.20

C |09.14.15

N(revisions:
nol date

03-17-13

o
e
=
EN
o
o
o

date:

chk. by:

T
drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS O BIF-
IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT HEAD IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT HEAD L - L
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS m o
. & IN PAIRS AT FRAME & IN PAIRS AT FRAME )
4° MIN. SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 3 SEE ELEV. ON SHEET 3 ~wlz
STAGGERED FOR SPACING AND FOR SPACING AND Zz SEIZ
EDGE DIST. DIAGONAL SHEET 6 FOR QUANTITY SHEET 6 FOR QUANTITY o 2 812
SEE SHEET 3 4 MIN l-- z ” g Z
STAGGERED METAL €= 384
. __EDGE DIST. DIAGONAL STRUCTURES . gl
2 o ‘ ” Eo ol oo
W 3z8 [/ SEE SHEET 3 ! 3/18” THK. ODdq a|o
S A T3 l 11/2" ﬂ\ / ez %
b o | T % @ ‘ ) o fggE
N ! [ Qonp
% 2 ’ Oy
o I
- <%0 - iz, ||O20 g b
OPTIONAL =0z OPTIONAL 32 |60%GE 3
Yoo Yoo |[|EE20 R
< ~|2 < S8 & u 525
— 1o ) e T R
& - L, - kzos8
T Il ol ol COT
7% 7] > -
g 1 [ 1 ——
5 5 ] —
3 2 = 3
e = £ = 5
L 5 L o !
= i = 3 )
T s I 8 ©
$ g s @ n
= 2 = < 3
PRODUCT RENEWED e o o & o a ~
as complying with the Florida o o « o o0 %
Building Code S & o] 4 z/3amD £
NOA-No. 23-0314.07 8 £ g = g|-u
m -
Expiration Date 09/19/2028 i v i - = 2 7 s
— [ b —
Miami-Dade Product Control £ 153‘ § % = 5
5 5 i B
<< < (%]
W] & Sl oS8
S 3 glna 27
. EluL=so
& M =EE
SN
C__—————— O
UNITS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS :jgggg:g'}vﬁ‘ﬂﬁfgm da M
TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING HEAD RECEPTOR MOUNT SHOWN, SEE DETAIL IN SHEET 3 Building Code ol |
1~ —  —  — AT HEAD (FOR DOORS WITH RECEPTOR) ——  —  — —1 AND ANCHOR CAPACITY CHART IN SHEET 6 —No-. - : %g 23
. , " . ' irati 09/19/2023 NEI=
TYPE 'AAA'— 5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=177 KSI, Fy=155 KSI) Expiration Date 9/ 9/ 22 3 o 3 g
- . nde, Tl N &~
| DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE- | z‘i’ami]_;:z Pif:dict E— 018 0|8 |e
1-3/4”" MIN. EMBED ontro Qi izl a
91%glt g
| 1/4" DIA. SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 5 CRS) | HEHME
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS 5
| (3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS ] P
ALUMINUM: 3/16” THK. MIN. (6083—T5 MIN.) . gg HEEE
| STEEL:  3/16” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.) | B
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) : o S[o]olwlx
OR = ;
| INTO METAL STRUCTURES | RIE
: (3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS 2
| ALUMINUM: 3/16" THK. MIN. (6063—-T5 MIN.) | > g
STEEL: 3/16" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.) . 5 =
(STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) . B Lj
oW w0 drawi .
INTO CONCRETE = 2-3/16" MIN. rawing - no
INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 1—1/2" MIN. W13-07
CONCRETE AT HEAD/SILL f'c = 3000 PSI MIN. Sheet 115716



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


7\
TYPICAL ANCHORS z
T ©) Q ©) WYz
FOR SPACING ﬂ s
AND QUANTITY STD. JAMB INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL v
—~ )=
STD. @ Z 2RIz
O 882
OR H.D. FIX. PANEL WIDTH CEEIE
s =2dfa
o D.L. OPG é 2. 383
SHEET 4 L. . S
PRODUCT RENEWED 028788
as complying with the Florida oz N
o o] N/ Building Code @ g Moo«
g - : NOA-No. 23-0314.07 Ees,
zZ e — on
Z18 — \ Expiration Date 09/19/2028 0245
W2 — ame 829
: : By \9L\4'2 |. £ han. o‘ﬂ:m: 8
= — = : Miami-Dade Product Control o ; e =} 3
@é o W e ‘*
. r"g g voo §
- ] S
Y e PRODUCT REVISED LuUd_ 9
o as complying with the Florida t 03
_ r - ! = Building Code - 08I
il 1 - ) Y NOA-No. 20-1118.09 Lok
o — » S \\ 4/ w1 oyl = Y iesSsy = ==
S g [j \\ \ : 7 Expiration Date 09/19/2023 cC——————
o O / I " f““: —
=] % By 19k¢7 [. £hande = 3
] -
© DL OPG. Miami-Dade Product Control ~ o
S 2
Py [{e]
£27 €29 |(u29 EXTERIOR 2 3
PANEL WIDTH § 5
1BY WOOD BUCKS O g
SEE NOTE SHEET 1 29 3
1/2" MAX. DOOR FRAME WIDTH =4 vy
LOAD BEARING a L
SHIMS = (£ nq 5
= o = VY
TI02mY
g2 . "s
@ OPPOSITE @ OPPOSITE Bl€=x j©
LT Z 9
INTERLOCK H.D. JAMB ol B =8
m p—_
H.D = « 8
M29 D e 3 E
OR @ STD. | C—
FIX. PANEL WIDTH xlZ)ee TYPICAL ANCHORS -
SEE ELEV.
D.L. OFG. FOR SPACING ”
AND QUANTITY Zielelo
A
b 8 g 0nin °
= o Cly|lviy
= == & S & N
. < 25y e
g = : [ Qeziziz o
oo 4 " v b o % % =
1‘;' p = » < QlQ g
d= L, S E1212)8
b ; >
T - . o
T - .
BT 2 PR =S e
o S EEERE
G o SEEEE
" =i o s B QIO L|o|w|w
W T 1 EP & ] \_z(‘" S =
7 T ! %z 2
z 9" "
883 =
EXTERIOR = =
2]
o o
Fy
@ @ 112
< S5
3 | ——
T .
%,jw 1 ? m drawing no.
DOOR FRAME WIDTH 1/2" MAX. W13—-07
LOAD BEARING
SHIMS sheet 12 of 16



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


2BY WOOD BUCK

OR

" MIN.
ERED

WOOD STRUCTURE
SEE NOTE SHE
3

<

EDGE DIST.

1/2" MAX.

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

EXT.

LOAD BEARING
SHIMS

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.

FOR SPACING
AND QUANTITY

FIXED PANEL:

SEE HEAD/SILL CLIP

1/2" MAX.
SHIMS

==
TYPICAL ANCHORS

SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING
AND QUANTITY

—<=

DIST.

v

m——r

3" MIN
STAGGERED

HED

METAL
STRUCTURE

1/2" MAX.

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

LOAD BEARING
SHIMS

ANGLE DETAIL ON SHEET 7 & 9

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date 09/19/2028

By IgL\‘:'? 1 KA‘MJL,

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09

Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By IQL\¢7 |. Lhanl.

Miami-Dade Product Control

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.

FOR SPACING
AND QUANTITY

\zd
3" MIN
STAGGERED

&

EXT.

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

‘ éON(__iRETV

MASONRY = v -

QR

EDGE DIST.

i

1/2" MAX.

NOW 1 7 2020

LOAD BEARING

SHIMS

N
Uiz
Yo © |
[
~
(v 5
N
]
—_ )=
4 SR
] a7
o'" m@z’
EE L33
€= 394
€&,S8)3
og§ &l°
>a
Loy ¥%
o wuw
™
Qcap
Q2u
ng
o - RU I
X Pt
Qidgs
OILg <
XELR
ez "
<uﬂh.m
u_mw_;o
r4 o
i =02 O
288%
oz K
f—
[
—~
= 8
——d Rt
p——a h’})
o
= B
= [(o]
~~
a 8
3 )
(D .
o 1O >
= I R
O |-
—t
o
(Ve
~ b
slnwngsg
Szt
<O®m'ﬂ
ﬁmf
s2 5
BlL£=z 5 ©
HITZ 5
& - 5
O E O
T
GluBsE
w
| N ——
|
L
.
EEBQ
IR ENia]
Eiriociu
EU)V)O
Slele|§
Sla|E &N
qumo
"& Slo|F
2xl2121g
U AR
QO =
o188 g
Olnio|o|&
ozl Z| 2D
2
200212 2|
O-‘-’VOC’)LD
O (NIe e
210181818\
>
gkgoomu
[ C—
R
|
~ o
N z
o - .
5] I
3 =BG
-
drawing no.

sheet 13 of16



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


MAX. DOOR MAX. DOOR
FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH
00 00
[ I [ T
- ©F O 8. O @ & ©F 5.
> &5 - aj
) ]
| | | |
® ®
XO (SHOWN) OXO (SHOWN)
OX

ANCHORS AT HEAD/SILL AND FREE JAMB ENDS
SEE ELEVATIONS ON SHEETS 2 & 3

(APPLICABLE TO ALL SIZES ON SHEET 4 AND CONFIGURATIONS ABOVE)

®«_.

MAX. DOOR MAX. DOOR
FRAME WIDTH FRAME WIDTH
0 ce
[ P Pl [
O O @& O @ @ O 05,
OI OI
= = 0n &= => op
Ll L
©® @ ® PRODUCT RENEWED
XOX (SHOWN) OXXO(SHOWN) as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date 09/19/2028
By | 9L\<? |. £hande

4 PANELS OR LESS

Miami-Dade Product Control

MAX. FRAME AREA NOT TO EXCEED 200 SQ. FT. (DOORS W/O HEAD RECEPTORS)
MAX. AREA NOT TO EXCEED 162.33 SQ. FT. (DOORS WITH HEAD RECEPTORS)

DOWSIL 790 = 100% STRETCH

ALLOWABLE LOADS FOR DOOR HEIGHTS VERSUS
100% STRETCH SILICONES

1/4" MIN. GAP 3/8”" MIN. GAP
DOOR HEIGHT 100% 100%
96" 135 PSF 135 PSF
108” 135 PSF 135 PSF
120" - 135 PSF

MAXIMUM GAP = 1/2" ALL CASES

CHART APPLICABLE TO ALL SIZES, LOAD CAPACITIES AND
CONFIGURATIONS AS SHOWN ON SHEETS 4, 5, 6 AND 7.

NOTE:
DATA IN THIS SHEET MAY BE USED TO QUALIFY SEALANT

TO BE USED AT UNANCHORED JAMBS.

PLEASE REFER TO SEALANT MANUFACTURER'S DATA AND
APPLICATION MANUAL FOR COMPATABILITY OF SEALANT TO
SUBSTRATE & DOOR MATERIAL FINISH AND COMPLIANCE
FOR WARRANTY. (UNDER SEPARATE REVIEW)

>
Lp

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By |94\<7 l. Lhank

Miami-Dade Product Control

- CONCRETE -
MASONRY

v.

»MASONRY

"wOR-

v

] SILICONE
DOWSIL 790
MIN. GAP = 1/4”

MAX. GAP = 1/2
DEPTH = 3/8” MIN.

1/47 MIN. 1/4" MIN.
1/27 MAX. DOOR WIDTH DOOR WIDTH 1/2" MAX.
GAP ' GAP
FREE STANDING H. DUTY JAMB FREE STANDING H. DUTY JAMB

FIXED SIDE OPERABLE SIDE
Ix IN"4 Sx IN"3
8.895 | 3.387
FIXED PANEL:

SEE HEAD/SILL CLIP ANGLE DETAIL ON SHEET 7 & 9

\
(C.A.N. 3538)

C

COMP—ANL\W13—-07ESW )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

|

~5158 J

FAX. (305) 638

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

[SERIES £S-6500 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.I.)J

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

by [description

C {09.14.15
D {03.20.18

(revisions:
(no] date
E |05.09.18
F 111.05.20

'[

)

03~17-13

<4
4
<
=
=
£
Y
©

. by:

date:
k.

(e

C_———
drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


—
6.270 3.000 Uz
. 772
125 1,692 = 1,692 — 3.000 mk 2
r - J o0 (.094 :
? 7 . ? = h
4
? 030 t=— g § 51>
2.150 2,422 195 - —e ], 9 ; o ‘? __ZJ
—e{le— 078 2.700 2.638 125 o | : [E g § <
3.701 3701 | g <-2
ﬂ & 3 4707 4.707 4.879 E18 HEAD COVER & 3 o< 8 g
: 4.879 Ood& 8|0
6.117 el G a9y
’ [ {.287 wuw g
U B ] Lo 6530
Yy B oal
E24 HEAD RECEPTOR 040 } J 711L» ! 03 ‘;‘:‘T“,
| — — i | ggEc e
% i
- a
6.068 ~, PANEL TOP & BOTTM RAIL PANEL TOP & BOTTM RAIL —=1 1.063 t=— £92 o329
260~ 1= | 188 @ (LAM. GLASS) @ (NSUL. LAM. GLASS) —1.001 == SCREW COVER 2EER:
| wsh @
3 T ASTRAGAL —=1 1.062 r» E g 3: i §
125 3.812 3.812 ASTRAGAL E8 (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 5 85 e
1.925 E31 (LAM. GLASS) 3 zo= o
—={ 1.001 = ﬂja.osz« : ~>f; FAQZ ; gios ¥
j—
gm 2.660 - | C—
] , 1.201 2.163 =
1 b = 2
1.896 1.896 : 1792 0T 1373 S 5
E25 RECEPTOR STIFFENER —Jl 078 . : ! = 0
% 6 2.275 ) 062 == S Q
. = 2.549 : i 8 ©
R} ] 7T 125 8
5.541 094 =—.190 .094 c1o 5 COVER “ 9
JAM Vv
I 3.500 3.500 e @ ASTRAGAL ADAPTER 2 2
o llQ §
(‘L—_}’—Tﬂ——-w <=—1.530«>J ~=1.030 402 gldy &
' PANEL LOCK STILE PANEL LOCK STILE } ﬁ | ] o %
2.656 2.782 s b
_%/QF?‘j £27 (LAM. GLASS) @ (lNSUL‘ LAM. GLASS) E16 ASTRAGAL STKFFENER ? 468 .290 % I n g ;‘6
1.688 . 062 [ 040 2 % D n ©
I : QMY
j 3.500 3.500 rr—z.um’ct 772 812 M
S I - O
| 141 —={1.001 = 141 1.063 - C\E=J°
L 6.333 ’ L L ] f E13)  TRACK INSERT @ SILL SCREW COVER g == .8
} — j T - 125 1.617 Kln@=~
sy | 215 1,732~ 125~ == ANy
E26)  FRAME HEAD AT RECEPTOR 078-flee %2 y : — | r, 361 = B
e ‘ i o7 — N §  C——
| I J .709 ’%J—J—U-[J—ﬂ——-{ 952 .086 (Y
5.54‘1 { ‘250 ﬁ
1 Lﬂf —={1.003 f=— T*L-iﬁ?——”“* (:%L 2l
L b = = m
.zso] .zso] 2.063 —=1 | o84 9lgd|8
094 =—2.109 ~—2.109 E17)  INTERLOCK STIFFENER 312109
2.031 TYP. 2.157 e E10 ADD—ON TRACK @ RETAINER CLIP =P Z|Z|R
i = SIS
I pERE PANEL INTERLOCK PANEL INTERLOCK ! 1.074 {016 SEEE
@ (LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) ~ IR
L — 93 |2)s|8
6.125 2250 — i 2.250 —= 2.000 -100 ‘@ 948 >
. F—2 N 551 3]
STANDARD FRAME HEAD J ] AREEEE
@ (WITHOUT HEAD RECEPTOR) 250? L»zooo—ol @ 1.331 118 | 590 glelv|s)z(a
- 1.499 ' PRODUCT RENEWED @ CLAZING GASKET g (‘; 8|88~
_ M29 as complying with the Florida Cliglo|e|wie
PRODUCT REVISED INTERLOCK STIFFENER I Bilding Code =2E .
as complying with the Florida E 5& 2.597 NOA-No. 23-0314.07
Building Code 5251 602 e
NOA-No. 20-1118.09 a 5.251 : ; : 7T Expiration Date 09/19/2028 T o
Expiration Date 09/19/2023 3.310 E N By I;Lw? [ hande: g g
094 Y __ .
.094 I el Miami-Dade Product Control s
By__ gl i TP, TYP. 2.873 2511 | A ! 2 e
{Miami-Dade Product Control 188 —={l— 078 3 55
7 Frr P re It | ) ' %ml?m S ——
J ‘4 L HJ L,_Q I ‘ drawing no.
5.431 .
1.188 1.188 2780 | W13-07
STD. FRAME JAMB
(e2) FRAME SILL (£3) Luar wax. LoADS 485 PsF (E4)  HD. FRAVE JAMB E11)  THRESHOLD sheet 15 of 16



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


FRAME TOP CORNER
STD. JAMB (SHOWN)
H.D. JAMB (SIMILAR)

FRAME BOTTOM CORNER
STD. JAMB (SHOWN)
H.D. JAMB (SIMILAR)

i

4‘1‘
/§i\l|% |

i
i

>

D

0>

(AN—

N\
\Y

N

~U

PANEL TOP/BOTTOM CORNER
LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SHOWN)
INSUL. LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SIMILAR)

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0314.07

Expiration Date 09/19/2028

By 19%7 l. £ hank
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 20-1118.09
Expiration Date 09/19/2023

By IQL\¢7 [. £hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

{7
/ j//,
Q.2

B
o
o
o
o

N
Oz
Y © ||
[¥8]
~
(1] 5
.
e [
Z P ES
s B>
Qr 28|2
- M&Z
=0 9T
€S 394
€5.,58(3
og§ 8
o ;
Loy %
o
P
OQbap
0244
343
Ssm0
[ 4 &
oogd
O3LE 3
14
frono §
rzago
guUsSi 3
Wwe - o
Lzo58
- O
Zm"'m
€Hos ¥
U S
O
—
= B
e Rl
e u’E)
o
= 3
S o
2 B
3 n
o .
>
29 %
s 2d
o
w3
=
%gmd'm
et} - B
<(O®pr)
i {
ol M o
BIZx ;O
ole= _J
LITE=Z 5
Lt . O
.O—-\"}
Q0o
m ——
iy S
CTTTTTTTTTTD
=
w
E'EJEQ
i lad | D
il
2(!)(/)0
Slele|8
SN
Rl
- o
3‘&%%&
dlzlololE
o222
>
LO
o =]
NS
o-‘l—‘ﬂ‘omiﬂ
ZHOI= 1N Q e
2918|818\
\gg‘-’o"’“—

'[

03-17-13

g
%
=
-y
v
°

chk. by:

date:

drawing no.

W13-07



ic045
New Stamp

ic045
New Stamp


	23031407w-ES
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER)

	20111809D
	SS - ES - 6500 SGD (LMI) DWG W13-07(.09)




