MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/economy
E.S. Windows, LLC

3550 NW 49 Street

Miami, F1.33142

Scork:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction materials. The
documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER -Product Control Section to
be used in Miami Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control Section
(In Miami Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami Dade County) reserve the right to have this
product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to perform in the accepted
manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately revoke, modify, or
suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right to revoke this
acceptance, if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product or material fails to
meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code, including
the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “6100” Aluminum Sliding Glass Doors (Dry glazed) w/ reinforcements-S.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W12-33 Rev 1, titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”,

sheets 1, 2, 3, 3.1, 3.2, 4, 5, 5.1, 6 through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated JUN 19, 2012 and

last revised on JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product

Control Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County

Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Small Missile Impact Resistant

Limitations:

1. See Design Pressures (DP) Vs reinforcement & glazing options charts in sheets 3, 3.1, 3.2, 4 & 5. See approved
configurations in sheet 2.

2. See anchors capacity charts in sheet 5 & 5.1. Lower DP shall control of the charts in sheets 3 thru 5.1.

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,

Columbia, S.A. and series and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in the
materials, use, and/or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of any product,
for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to comply with any
section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed by the
expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then it shall be
done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors and
shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA #23-0724.14 consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E2, E-3, E-4, E-5 and E-6, as
well as approval document mentioned above.

: : , |sbas |. Lhank
The submitted documentation was reviewed by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E. F

NOA No. 24-0312.02

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY ot . 0
Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024
Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

E.S. Windows, LL.C

[

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

Evidence submitted under previous NOAs

DRAWINGS

1. Manufacture's die drawings and sections (see files below).

2. Drawing No. W12-33 Rev E, titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”, sheets 1
through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated JUN 19, 2012 and last revised on
03/08/16, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

TESTS (Submitted under files #14-0428.23/#13-1007.03/#13-0226.05/#12-0620.01/#09-1217.02)
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked—up drawings and installation diagram of OX aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratories, Inc., Test Report No. FTL —7572, dated 11/03/13,
signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P. E.
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of OXXX aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratories, Test Report No. FTL- 6293 (FTL
10063), dated 10/15/10 and FTL- 5669 (FTL 08057, signed and sealed by Jorge A. Causo, P.E.
and Michael Wenzel, P.E. respectively.
2. Additional Test reports on (Submitted under files #07-0828.08)

1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of OXXX aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratories, Test Report No. FTL- 6293 (FTL
10063), dated 10/15/10 and FTL- 5669 (FTL 08057, signed and sealed by Jorge A. Causo, P.E.
and Michael Wenzel, P.E.

CALCULATIONS

1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC-2014(5™"
Edition), prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated AUG 13, 2015 and last revised on MAR
07, 2016, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

2. Glazing complies w/ ASTME-1300-02, -04 & -09.

.
| ;E“-‘:"’} | o "'l:.”r"l-l:’--
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. NOA No. 14-0916.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours & Co.,
Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/4/17.
2. NOA No. 14-0916.10 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours & Co.,
Inc.) for “Kuraray Butacite PVB Interlayer”, expiring on 12/11/16.
3. Technical cut sheet data for EPDM, rubber compound by Solucionesencaucho, Columbia.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2014 (5™ Edition) and letter of no financial interest,
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated 08/13/15, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.
2. Lab compliance as part of the above referenced test report.

.
| ;E“-‘:"’} | o "'l:.”r"l-l:’--
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

2. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W12-33 titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”, sheets 1, 2, 3, 3.1,
4,5,5.1, 6 through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 06/19/12 with revision G
dated on 03/09/18, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. Testreports on: 1) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
2) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Small Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
4) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
5) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum sliding glass door, prepared
by Fenestration Testing Lab, Inc., Test Report No. FTL-8721, dated 03/08/17, signed and sealed
by Idalmis Ortega, P. E.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations complying with FBC2017 (6" Edition), prepared by Al
Farooq Corporation, dated 01/19/2018, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. NOA No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours & Co.,
Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/04/23.
2. NOA No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours & Co.,
Inc.) for “Kuraray Trosifol PVB Interlayer”, expiring on 07/08/24.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 6™ Edition (2017) and of no financial interest,
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 01/19/2018, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad,
P.E.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises & renews NOA # 15-0430.03, expiring 06/14/2018.

.
| g,lf-\_-:-r;\. |I. f J'flifr.l]_l’_.,
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

W

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

Evidence submitted.

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W12-33 Rev H, titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”,
sheets 1, 2, 3,3.1,3.2,4, 5, 5.1, 6 through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation,
dated JUN 19, 2012 and last revised on DEC 01, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq,
P.E.

TESTS
1. Testreports on: 1) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
2) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Small Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
4) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
5) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by Blackwater Testing Lab, Inc., Test Report No. BT-GMP-19-012, dated
09/19/2019, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P. E.

CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations complying with FBC2020 (7 Edition), prepared by Al
Farooq Corporation, dated 05/17/2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. NOA No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours &
Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/04/23.

2. NOA No. 19-0305.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont DeNemours &
Co., Inc.) for “Kuraray Trosifol PVB Interlayer”, expiring on 07/08/24.

STATEMENTS

I. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 7™ Edition (2020) and of no financial
interest, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 05/17/2021, signed and sealed by
Jalal Farooq, P.E.

2. Statement letter dated DEC 08, 2021 issued by GMP Consulting & Contractors, Inc.
authorizing ES winows, Inc. use of test report BT-GMP-19-012, signed by Nicholas
Abuchaibe, CFO.

OTHER

1. This NOA revises NOA # 16-1130.04, expiring 09/05/2024.

2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows, LLC,
dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen. MGR)
respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOAC(s) files)

3. Reference Test report Bt-GMP-021.

.
| g,lf-\_-:-r;\. |I. f J'flifr.l]_l’_.,
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W12-33 Rev I, titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”, sheets
1,2,3,3.1,3.2,4,5,5.1, 6 through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated
JUN 19, 2012 and last revised on JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8" Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 07/19/23, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E. (submitted under
previous approvals)

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA # 21-0628.15 and updates to FBC 2023, expiring 09/05/24.
2. Distribution agreement between ES Windows, LLC (distributor) and Energia Solar, S.A,
(manufacturer, dated 08/01/18, signed by MS. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Ms. Evelyn Deas
(MGR) respectively (submitted under previous approvals).

| ;’{"":? |I' ;{“'{:"f“]-l:’-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. New Evidence submitted.

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W12-33 Rev I, titled “Series -6100 Alum Sliding Glass Door (SMI)”, sheets
1,2,3,3.1,3.2,4,5,5.1, 6 through 12 of 12, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated
JUN 19, 2012 and last revised on JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 24-0205.08 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers”, expiring on
07/08/29.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8™ Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 03/07/24, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E
2. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8™ Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 07/19/23, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E. (submitted under
previous approvals)

G. OTHER
1. This NOA renews NOA # 23-0724.14 and updates to FBC 2023, expiring 09/05/29.
2. Distribution agreement between ES Windows, LLC (distributor) and Energia Solar, S.A,
(manufacturer, dated 08/01/18, signed by MS. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Ms. Evelyn Deas
(MGR) respectively (submitted under previous approvals).

| ;’{"":? |I' ;{“'{:"f“]-l:’-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



CLUSTER OF 6 OR 7 ANCHORS
AT ASTRAGAL ENDS

)

N

CLUSTER OF 6 OR 7 ANCHORS

X i 272 AT INTERLOCKS
8" MAX. 2 3/4 9-1/2 SEE SHEET 5 FOR ) . SEE SHEET 5 FOR
EAD e QUANTITY AND CAPACITY < QUANTITY AND CAPACITY
CORNERS FT T AT T
PRODUCT RENEWED e S
as complying with the Florida
Building Code 192"
NOA-No. 24-0312.02 DOOR FRAME WIDTH
Expiration Date 09/05/2029 ___ | | iy
By . ol PRODUCT REVISED ‘.
Miami-Dade Product Control @ as complying with the Florida
Building Code
REINF. OPTIONS NOA-No. 23-0724.14 .
§E$H§SE§TS \ Expiration Date09/05/2024 ),
By \9{«<? l. Lhan < Q\J‘
A N Miami-Dade Product Control %/7/“%
‘v ‘ % ‘y g '
7. 7 2 7
© - © 280, 7o © 200 :
ALTERNATE SIZE UNITS: = " INTERLOCK " ASTRAGAL - "
MAX. FRAME AREA OF DOORS NOT TO EXCEED 8 = .
MAX. TESTED AREA OF 160 SQ. FT. T %8 %o '
s ol N\ N(|&
8 § v o n O
i Wi~ ] M
L -8 -3 :
§ £
DAYLITE OPENINGS: = ) "
D.L.0. HEIGHT = PANEL HEIGHT — 7.000” <:: { :{> <?:‘ A
D.L.O. WIDTH = PANEL WIDTH - 6.937" { ) X
PANEL HEIGHT = DOOR FRAME HEIGHT — 1.375" . Zz
ol
SERIES—-6100 ALUMINUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR
SEE SHEETS 3 THRU 4 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF .
DESIRED GLASS SIZE BASED ON APPLICABLE GLASS TYPE
AND REINFORCING OPTION. @ i
USING CHART ON SHEETS 5 & 5.1 SELECT ANCHOR OPTION
WITH DESIGN RATING MORE THAN DESIGN LOADS REQUIRED. d—h x
LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY N
(REINFORCING OPTION/GLASS TYPE) OR ANCHOR CHARTS 42 5/16" 42 5/16" 42 5/16" 42 5/16” <3y
WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. o5
[&]
THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE 49 1/4" 49 174" 49 174
PANEL WIDTH ‘ »
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION)/2023 (8TH EDITION) FLORIDA BANEL WiDTH EL WD 49 7/8 PANEL WIDTH
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ). o PANEL WIDTH o
1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE ; N ; T
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT . . R . . A B : . R . . ?
LOADS TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE. S —
ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS 9 1/2" CLUSTER OF & nke 37 MIN. L CLUSTER OF 4 OR 5 6" MAX.
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE MAX. AT ASTRAGAL ENDS TYP. OO oeKs SILL
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO. SEE SHEET 5.1 FOR IYPICAL ELEVATION AT NIERLOCKS o) CORNERS

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOQOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020/2023 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEWIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON 'ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

QUANTITY AND CAPACITY

THESE DOORS ARE RATED FOR SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.
MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED IMPACT RESISTANT SHUTTERS
REQUIRED FOR INSTALLATIONS UP TO 30 FT. OF GRADE.
SHUTTERS NOT REQD. FOR INSTALLATIONS ABOVE 30 FT. OF GRADE.

VERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH EGRESS LIMITATIONS WHERE REQUIRED.

LAMINATED GLASS
DRY GLAZED

QUANTITY AND CAPACITY

eeeeee
. oy

W

a
f
C

COMP—ANL\W12-33€S )

(C.AN. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

FAX. (305) 6385158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638~5151

[ SERIES-6100 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (SM.)]

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

GENERAL REVISION
REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC

UPDATED TO 2023 FBC

by [ description

07.14.23

E 112.23.15
F 101.15.18
G 103.09.18
H 106.22.21

(revisions:
nol date

"J{

—~18~12

06
scale: 1/2"=1"-(Q
dr. by: TARIQ

dote:
chk. by:

e —]
drawing no.

W12-33



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME W.

ot o1 &

o P

Ze 22

9
x,o (SHOWN)

OX
XX

DOOR FRAME HT.

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

. ]
o
I
w O B @ ©-
< 7 7 7
& S
14
:
O 1
T
OXO (SHOWN)
XXX
DOOR FRAME WIDTH
}__‘ l
I
o O ©- O O
< 7 7 7
& < <> || <
a8
:
(]

XXX (SHOWN)

bOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

-
-

- :
9
XXXO (SHOWN)
XXXX
OXXO
APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS

SEE APPLICABLE

IN SHEETS 3 THRU 4

[INTERLOCK REINFORCING

EXT.

AAV

Z ASTRAGAL REINFORCING

EXT.

SEE SHEETS 3 THRU 4

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

\SEE APPLICABLE
INTERLOCK REINFORCING
IN SHEETS 3 THRU 4

\

=]

Iy k4

tt& G
'C“J g

[ et e e :
FEes P ea
— 1 [ U 1Eag =

L

r / \
- EXT. N
ASTRAGAL REINFORCING SEE APPLICABLE
SEE SHEETS 3 THRU 4 INTERLOCK REINFORCING
HEETS 3 THRU 4
DOOR FRAME WIDTH IN SHEETS 3
I— 7\
= ] : L
1
: I [ ;
S0
- Tt ! ’ Py
i
&5 = === Z! =
S

[

EXT.

ZASTRAGAL RE
SEE SHEETS

DOOR FRAME

INFORCING
3 THRU 4

WIDTH

\SEE APPLICABLE
INTERLOCK REINFORCING
IN SHEETS 3 THRU 4

Fl

NOTE:

CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSE
SEE APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURE & SIZE IN
SHEETS 3 THRU 4 AND ANCHOR INSTALLATION IN
SHEETS 5 & 5.1.

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By \9{«<? l. Lhan
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By IgL\‘t? [ Zé‘mJe
Miami-Dade Product Control

AVTTT7

m
Qg
G © |2
© T
\__——_MN
~ =
Z B~
Or 282
I3 <
":5 &l
C 814
<§ Z.NE
g 5|3
Eooed|o
Cona ¢
> N ¢
Low %
Eor
D
Ogm‘rﬁ
(o 2. -
[ 4 S
on.ﬂgﬂ
Oz 4
mmmog
€ usT 5
wa -9
kzo58
2382
<mmEEL/
T D
o
= s
&£ T:‘“)
% 2
2 3
D o~
[Te]
v
4 3
03}_ é
w
Z| Oy -
[ o
= - -
e 2R
23@"5
219<3
<0 ©
. 3
g€z 5©
= TSN
L?32 o
w— N
nll, .0
gg(/)mg\f
Cchij)——d
% M= E
[ G
=
2l lel |
& |53l
= 2l x>
glz|3lal?
ugog%
SN
5“&“93
Qo @ >
SIEEIRIES
ISIEI R -
oG laniElo
ole|olxelS 2
>
0O
.. -
Slelz 55|51
Lllojn|~= o=
2I°=5|818|6
\g@wwGI—
| S————
o~
i
© g
Tl g
© =
o | .
sl B
RIERER
B 3 e |2
=l L2 el .‘S)
S
drawing no.

(sheet 2 of 12)



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


© ©®

INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL

; ®

@ @ @

EXTERIOR

REINFORCING OPTION #1

ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL

© ®

INTERLOCK @ ASTRAGAL

38 37 @
(@)

®

I L e

-
@/U“‘J{

@ @ @

EXTERIOR

REINFORCING OPTION #2

STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL

SEE CHART ON THIS SHEET FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ON SHEET & FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5.1 FOR SiLL ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART,
HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SiLL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY
TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By |9L\<7 |. Lhand

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By J 9¢\<7 [ 144434
Miami-Dade Product Control

1/4” H.S. GLASS

.060" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.’

1/4” TEMP. GLASS

! 10

13/16" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

3

N

GLASS TYPE ‘A’ (DRY GLAZED)
GLAZING DETAIL

EXTERIOR

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO05-DEC-219

4 m
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF W
PVB LAMINATED GLASS TYPE ‘A’ m e "
ALL CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN ON SHEET 2 \ N
z
PANEL WIDTH{  DOOR REINF. OPTION #1 |REINF. OPTION #2| || 2 © Q>
NOMINAL  [FRAME HEIGHT o 25|
INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) | INT. (=) [EXT. (+#)] INT. (-) =5 g g
36 85.0 140.0 850 | 110.0 E g =gla
40 85.0 140.0 85.0 | 110.0 5383
o< o|v
44 85.0 140.0 85.0 110.0 oo a2
48 85.0 140.0 85.0 110.0 Loy %
82 For u
50 85.0 134.4 81.6 105.6 O053m
53 81.6 126.8 77.0 99.6 032 o
56 72.9 120.0 72.9 94.3 o9 E 9o
o
60 68.0 112.0 68.0 88.0 Quog 4
po &
36 85.0 140.0 85.0 110.0 g g WE §
40 85.0 136.4 850 | 1100 LT 5
44 85.0 127.4 850 | 110.0 L g 4 g8
48 o 85.0 120.0 85.0 110.0 ad g g < d
50 85.0 96.0 81.6 105.6 Qions .
R —
53 85.0 90.5 77.0 99.6 —
56 85.0 85.7 72.9 94.3 = ©
3 s}
80 80.0 80.0 68.0 88.0 v e
|
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 o« 2
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 g ©
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 9 §
48 102 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 3 ~
O %
50 85.0 96.0 81.6 105.6 oladln =
53 85.0 90.5 77.0 | 996 £ -y
56 85.0 85.7 72.9 94.3 Blun g
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 = P
= @] <t M
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 =0 "ag
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 s £z ;©
108 — B
48 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 © .8
50 85.0 96.0 81.6 105.6 Qi3 =
53 85.0 90.5 77.0 99.6 G | ud 8B
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 e —
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 Y
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0
114 ol e
48 85.0 $6.0 85.0 110.0 z |zlgE
50 85.0 960 | 816 | 1056 RN
QICIO NIV
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 SMEMNE
wi>
40 85.0 100.0 850 | 110.0 = & P& oy
120 SxlLiElelZ
44 85.0 96.2 85.0 110.0 Sia|3eeE
i kad g
48 85.0 90.0 850 | 110.0 88|22 Ele
>
L0
2 NEIEIEIEE
O peed LMY P L OV | O]
ZHOIN T O
2|8 |58/8]5
g\g winlolr -
T
~N
]
© o
& 3
(=] = 0o
PNy
) ° .
5 MR
[ “ ﬁq;}a © R+ 6
dow i Lond T ——
drawing no.



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


©

INTERLOCK

REINFORCING OPTION #1

ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By J SL@? |. £ hand
Miami-Dade Product Control

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE

SEE CHART ON THIS SHEET FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5.1 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART,
HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY
TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

d e
NN

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024 'X0' OR ‘OX’ DOORS ONLY

By \QL\=7 [. L handa
Miami-Dade Product Control

1/4” H.S. GLASS

.060" Interlayer
Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.’

TT/H TEMP. GLASS

ALyt 10

13/16" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

Ny

GLASS TYPE ‘A’ (DRY GLAZED)
GLAZING DETAIL

EXTERIOR

BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-DEC~-219

%3]
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF g U W
PVB LAMINATED GLASS TYPE ‘A’ m ‘“p
‘XO' OR ‘OX’ CONFIGURATIONS ONLY e
z
PANEL WIDTH|  DOOR REINF. OPTION #1 ' d @
NOMINAL  [FRAME HEIGHT ) e
INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) | INT. (=) hd FZ- e cc?‘ ?
36 1100 | 1100 l&‘ Y =g
40 110.0 110.0 g5 o S @8
44 110.0 110.0 o dﬁ“‘:’,
u -
48 & 110.0 110.0 &- w E
50 105.6 105.6 05 % o
53 99.6 99.6 O2ud
56 94.3 94.3 o %) E 4 g
60 88.0 88.0 Qaogd
36 110.0 110.0 g ggg §
40 110.0 110.0 €55C &
44 110.0 110.0 Ty %gg 2
48 84 110.0 110.0 - ggs d
50 105.6 105.6 CiuozF J
S —
53 99.6 99.6 3
56 94.3 94.3 = ®
60 88.0 88.0 v 5
|
36 110.0 110.0 x §
40 110.0 110.0 )= -
44 110.0 110.0 0 8
(g My
48 90 110.0 110.0 2 o it
>
50 105.6 105.6 ol =R
53 99.6 99.6 = %
56 94.3 94.3 Al Y5
36 110.0 110.0 g % D 1 IP
40 110.0 110.0 =l ©
44 110.0 110.0 glZ€z 5°
96 Iz 5
48 110.0 110.0 © .8
50 105.6 105.6 Qlunss™
M — ]
53 99.6 99.6 % WHsE
36 110.0 110.0 e —
40 110.0 110.0 M
44 110.0 110.0
48 102 110.0 110.0 Eloln
: : 28|k
=l T
50 105.6 105.6 z|3|e/®
36 110.0 110.0 sl |20x S E
Las
40 110.0 110.0 = E= 1R
44 108-1/2 0% 1100 IR AISIE
~ : FE R
48 110.0 110.0 § Z15Ee
>
LD
ol 12/2]5[8
o) - Wi N
ZHO < e N
2o 15181818
>
é’/ 8 wlo|x|..
C
o
&
&
© 5
£
£ ¥
909 s g
b e ko
T e T Y
drawing no.

sheet 3.10f 12



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


LOAD CAP - P (@
SEE CHART ON THIS SHEET FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY P%E;SIEEMINATED G&(;IgYTYPE S.i, hu -
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES. o oo m '?
X0', 'OX’ OR ‘OXO’ CONFIGURATIONS ONLY ~
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY. PANEL WIDTH BOOR REINF. OPTION #2 iy b
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5.1 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY. NOUINAL  FRAME. HEIGHT : #Rllz =zg2>
— [*13
PRODUCT RENEWED LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART, neres | neres |EXT (HINT ()] 1| Q g 88 z
as complying with the Florida HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY 36 85.0 123.0 k= § 2 9o
Building Code TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. 40 ss0 | 1230 ||| €% <32
NOA-No. 24-0312.02 Ecoocdlo
44 85.0 115.7 o-8~8
Expiration Date 09/05/2029 48 o |80 [ 100 Jf&gy Z
By She9 | Lhank 50 816 | 1056 g og «
Miami-Dade Product Control 7 7 7 2 % 53 77.0 99.6 O 8 "’,8
7, 7. s, 7. “ m
= | = 56 729 | 943 o 828 o
60 68.0 88.0 EXe S
Qaog
36 850 | 123.0 00: g E g g
o
XO (SHOWN) OXO (SHOWN) 40 850 | 1230 st =
ox 44 85.0 115.7 L % 7/ g
: 48 85.0 | 1100 "S53
96 = Z0 <
INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL PPROV FIGURATION 50 81.6 | 105.6 Ciozr
@9 37 53 77.0 | 99.6 )
@) & 56 72.9 94.3 ? N
PRODUCT REVISED 80 68.0 88.0 v g
1 as complying with the Florida 36 85.0 123.0 |
Building Code - : x 8
NOA-No. 23-0724.14 40 85.0 123.0 Q ©
Expiration Date09/05/2024 “ 850 1199 3 §
—_— 48 102 850 | 110.0 < Nt
1 By Ishgt L 50 81.6 | 1056 o9 %
E r Miami-Dade Product Control 53 770 99.6 g = é b
) 56 72.9 94.3 255 -
\ 36 85.0 123.0 == o= 5
| 1/4" HS. GLASS 40 50 | 1230 ||| 2I8% 1}
. L]
| .060" Interiayer 44 108 85.0 110.0 S Z =z 3@
J‘ Trosifol PVB . , 48 85.0 110.0 N B /uo?
o y By ‘kuraray America, Inc. 50 816 105.6 ﬂl m 8 _.E: 0,
—— . < N
——1/4" TEMP. GLASS 53 77.0 98.6 SluBse
@ @ @ @ 36 85.0 1230 | |\
—
40 108-1/4 | 850 | 1230 | |™
EXTERIOR ) 41-3/8 85.0 123.0
3N 36 850 | 110.0 5
= 40 850 | 110.0 4
STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK |2 48 114 850 1100 5 "
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL - o i 10 . : 5 &
> l l’[ 50 81.6 105.6 < z
) :: :: 36 85.0 | 110.0 @ o
A 40 850 | 110.0 © <
N EH 120 >
ey L 44 85.0 110.0 )
. Ute—x 48 85.0 | 110.0 8l 2
o [\ e o5 z
o 1o ~
& 3 o
o e
D
GLASS TYPE ‘A’ (DRY GLAZED) o {ﬁ
GLAZING DETAIL i? g
g =
%A
3 &
NOTE: e 47 9nag ————
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE Gvm b e drawing no.
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS) W12—33
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5—DEC—219 sheot3 20712



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


©) ©®

ASTRAGAL

INTERLOCK

®

\8J

f Eti:_, 1S

|
T

s @

EXTERIOR

REINFORCING OPTION #1

ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL

©) ©®

INTERLOCK @ ASTRAGAL
| ®
L =T
3
[ 1 {
Mt J 1
& @® @ &
@ EXTERIOR

REINFORCING OPTION #2

STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL

SEE CHART ON THIS SHEET FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5.1 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART,
HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY
TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By 19%? [. Lhande

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By 1 9[/\“‘2 I Ké’mJé
Miami-Dade Product Control

1/4" H.S. GLASS

035" Interiayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraroy America, Inc.

i

Il—“ /4" TEMP. GLASS

13/16" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

§

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘A1’ (DRY GLAZED)
GLAZING DETAIL

NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-DEC-219

—-—
[ %3]
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF “ U L
SENTRIGLAS LAMINATED GLASS TYPE ‘A1’ m w
ALL CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN ON SHEET 2 |
Ty
PANEL WIDTH|{  DOOR REINF. OPTION #1 |REINF. OPTION #2| || 2 = ® z
NOMINAL  |FRAME HEIGHT o el
INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) | INT. (=) |EXT. (+)}|INT. (=) =5 = z <
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 | 140.0 : g =¢la
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 | 140.0 g 328
oS el
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 140.0 & g2
48 85.0 100.0 85.0 140.0 Loy X%
82 fFor w
50 85.0 96.0 85.0 134.4 O053m
53 85.0 90.5 85.0 | 126.8 O3 o
56 85.0 85.7 850 | 120.0 628 o
c [ 4 &
80 80.0 80.0 85.0 112.0 Qaogd
o
36 85.0 1000 | 850 | 1400 g M BE 3
40 85.0 100.0 850 | 140.0 L =
44 85.0 100.0 850 | 1400 b g @ g8
48 o 85.0 100.0 85.0 137.3 el g e d
50 85.0 96.0 85.0 105.6 Loz ¥ L
53 85.0 90.5 85.0 99.6 QC;::,;D
56 85.0 85.7 85.0 94.3 = @
3 7]
60 85.0 80.0 85.0 88.0 v, e
36 85.0 100.0 850 | 1100 o ®
O [}
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 Q ©
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 o 8
£ M
48 102 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 3 ~
1O %
50 85.0 96.0 85.0 105.6 oD =2
53 85.0 90.5 85.0 99.6 =|-u
56 80.0 80.0 85.0 94.3 R T RN
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 =1Z25-5
29+
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 < "g
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 S £z ;©
108 clI2ZzE35
48 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 © .8
50 85.0 96.0 85.0 105.6 SIn8=~
| IR, i G
53 85.0 90.5 85.0 99.6 biwespE
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 (i—/-ﬁz_m_—.j‘—/
40 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 M
44 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0
114 4 44
48 85.0 96.0 85.0 110.0 zl gl
50 85.0 96.0 85.0 | 105.6 IMEINE
OISOy
36 85.0 100.0 85.0 110.0 M
L
40 85.0 1000 | 850 | 1100 ==
120 95 - E oz
44 85.0 96.2 85.0 110.0 SNFEEE
L ld <
48 85.0 90.0 85.0 | 110.0 RS
Mol | Oix |32
>
LO
2} NEEIENE
=310C] Do v g B .
Olojn |~ ola|-
R
\g\g wlwlolx )
|G
R ( )
i
© o
1 ¢
8 i
e s B B o -3
ST s Pl
 ————
drawing no.



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

— AT HEAD —
1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSi, Fy=148 KSI)
‘ INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES

1-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

} THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONCRETE
1-1/2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE

1 TYPE 'B'-~ 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE
| 1—1/2" MIN. EMBED

L TYPE 'C'— #14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)

INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS

OR
| INTO METAL STRUCTURES

(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS
| ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
| (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

L
i_TYPE ‘B'— 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT  (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)

DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE
L 1-3/4”" MIN. EMBED

rTYP;A'— " DAL

— AT SILL —

—_— — AT JAMBS—
1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT (Fu=164 KSI Fy=148 KSI)
0 INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES

{ 1—1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

1 THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT (Fu=1864 KSI Fy=148 KSI)
DIRECTLY INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
‘ 1—1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS

i TYPE ‘'C'— #14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS
OR
| INTO METAL STRUCTURES
(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS
| ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)
STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)
L (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED)

ﬁYPE ‘A -

| TYPE 'B'-

ANCHOR EDGE DISTANCES

INTO CONCRETE = 2-1/2" MIN.
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1" MIN.
INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4” MIN.

WOOD AT HEAD OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN. NOA-No.

]

_ ]

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

24-0312.02

CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.
C—90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.

Expiration Date09/05/2029
By 19¢\=7 l. £ hande

Miami-Dade Product Control

-
HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF 4 ku g
ANCHOR TYPE ‘A’ |ANCHOR 'B’| ANCHOR 'C’ ANCHOR TYPE ‘A’ |ANCHOR 'B’| ANCHOR 'C’ m !?
6 ANCHORS | 7 ANCHORS § ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS 6 ANCHORS | 7 ANCHORS 6 ANCHORS | 6 ANCHORS N 53
AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. 4 ™ g 5
AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS ° - Sg 8 ’2’
PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (+) | EXT. (#) | EXT. (+) | EXT. (+) PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (+) | EXT. (+) | EXT. (+) | EXT. (+) m oz O EIT
INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (—) INT. (—) INT. (=) INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. () INT. (~) ’E g Z 8§ %
30 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 30 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 ¥ S ° §§ S
36 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 36 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 (@ ggj g
40 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 40 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 & g E E
42 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 42 108-1/2 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 ° B 5—-?’ 2
44 82 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 44 108.5 110.0 110.0 110.0 o 8 W
48 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 48 101.8 110.0 110.0 110.0 O' 8 E ?ﬂ} 8
50 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 50 98.9 110.0 110.0 110.0 O ?3 E 3 §
53 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 53 95.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 g 0nas e
56 134.4 140.0 140.0 140.0 30 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 & é £z a
60 132.4 140.0 140.0 140.0 36 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 b 2 g 8
30 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 40 109.8 110.0 110.0 110.0 - 98 J
36 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 42 114 105.7 110.0 110.0 110.0 < wo Z -
40 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 44 102.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 g—/—;\ T
42 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 48 85.6 110.0 110.0 110.0 g g
44 84 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 50 g2.8 108.3 110.0 110.0 v, t‘I—!‘)
48 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 30 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 % ,°g
50 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 36 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 8 f\
53 135.5 140.0 140.0 140.0 40 120 103.2 110.0 110.0 110.0 % §
56 131.7 140.0 140.0 140.0 42 99.3 110.0 110.0 110.0 é ) :
60 127.5 140.0 140.0 140.0 44 95.8 110.0 110.0 110.0 o || E] g
30 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 48 89.6 104.6 110.0 110.0 é - B:J
36 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 C—HJ (f; IZ;) 2_) S
40 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 _% % D5 o
42 1400 | 1400 | 1400 | 1400 PRODUCT REVISED 53 (=B
44 90 138.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 as i‘l’gi':“:'gi’“dgew“h the Florida 8 § i o ;
48 130.4 140.0 140.0 140.0 NOA-No. 23-0724.14 ‘? Do = E
50 127.1 140.0 1400 | 140.0 Expiration Date09/05/2024 2naz
53 122.7 140.0 140.0 140.0 - ol = =
56 118.9 138.8 140.0 140.0 By _ !Steg | Lhank ‘L——C:::MD
60 1147 1338 120.0 120.0 Miami-Dade Product Control ~
30 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 ol 1w
36 140.0 140.0 140.0 140.0 ARERE
40 135.9 140.0 140.0 140.0 g z % é i
42 1511 | 1400 | 1400 | 1400 | e cHART ON SHEETS 3 THRU 5 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY S EEIN
44 96 126.8 1400 140.0 140.0 OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES. Bleleiol2
*° L 1394 149.9 1409 SEE CHART ABOVE FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY 3o i
50 1700 | 110.0 1100 | 1100 | SEE CHART ON SHEET 5.1 FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY. SEEERE
>3 1100 1 1100 ] 1100 } 1100 | oweR DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART, 2
56 106.3 110.0 110.0 1100 HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SILL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY slHesret=Ts
60 104.3 110.0 110.0 110.0 TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. g %5 o é § ;
30 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 g PN 581815
36 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 RN
40 123.0 123.0 123.0 123.0 )
42 102 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 5:*!
44 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 © =]
48 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 & S )
50 107.3 110.0 110.0 110.0 “ 3\ 2
53 103.2 110.0 110.0 110.0 t%ﬁ L aan9 ‘_g £ | :‘é
VoL F AR
- drawing no.
W12-33



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


SILL ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

SILL ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

ANCHOR TYPE 'B’

ANCHOR TYPE 'B’

4 ANCHORS | 5 ANCHORS 4 ANCHORS | 5 ANCHORS
AT NTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG.
AVERAGE |DOOR FRaME | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME | STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS
PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (+) | EXT. (+) PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT EXT. (+) | EXT. (+)
INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (~) INCHES INCHES INT. (—) INT. (-)
30 140.0 140.0 30 123.0 123.0
36 140.0 140.0 36 123.0 123.0
40 140.0 140.0 40 123.0 123.0
42 140.0 140.0 42 110.0 110.0
108-1/2
44 82 140.0 140.0 44 110.0 110.0
48 140.0 140.0 48 110.0 110.0
50 140.0 140.0 50 107.6 110.0
53 140.0 140.0 53 103.4 110.0
56 140.0 140.0 30 110.0 110.0
60 140.0 140.0 36 110.0 110.0
30 140.0 140.0 40 110.0 110.0
36 140.0 140.0 42 114 110.0 110.0
40 140.0 140.0 44 110.0 110.0
42 140.0 140.0 48 104.0 110.0
44 84 140.0 140.0 50 101.0 110.0
48 140.0 140.0 30 110.0 110.0
50 140.0 140.0 36 110.0 110.0
53 140.0 140.0 40 120 110.0 110.0
56 140.0 140.0 42 108.1 110.0
60 138.7 140.0 44 104.2 110.0
30 140.0 140.0 48 97.5 110.0
36 140.0 140.0
40 140.0 140.0
42 140.0 140.0
44 90 140.0 140.0
48 140.0 140.0
50 138.2 140.0
53 1335 140.0
56 129.4 140.0
60 124.8 140.0
30 140.0 140.0
36 140.0 140.0
40 140.0 140.0
42 140.0 140.0
44 96 138.0 140.0
48 130.0 140.0
50 110.0 110.0
53 110.0 110.0
56 110.0 110.0
60 110.0 110.0
30 123.0 123.0
36 123.0 123.0
40 123.0 123.0
42 110.0 110.0
44 102 110.0 110.0
48 110.0 110.0
50 110.0 110.0
53 110.0 110.0

SEE CHART ON SHEETS 3 THRU 5 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY
OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REINFORCING TYPES.

SEE CHART ABOVE FOR SILL ANCHOR CAPACITY.
SEE CHART ON SHEET 5 FOR HEAD ANCHOR CAPACITY.

LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM DESIGN LOAD CHART,
HEAD ANCHOR CHART OR SiLL ANCHOR CHART WILL APPLY
TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By J 9@47 l. £hande
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By \9{«<? l. Lhan
Miami-Dade Product Control

a\
f
C

|

COMP—ANL\W12-33ES )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI,

[ SERIES-6100 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (SM..)

|

GENERAL REVISION

REV. PER RER COMMENTS
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

07.14.23

(revisions:
nol date
F 101.15.18
G {03.08.18
H |06.22.21

Ul

06~18-12

=
&
<
=
b
F)
9
°

chk, by:

date:

| G
drawing no.

W12-33

sheet 5§, 10f 12



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


‘ )R
“ . TYPICAL ANCHORS )
EDGEDIST. 4 [ 2 5/16" MIN. IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT mk 7
= a 24, |[oSTAGGERED | INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS PRODUCT RENEWED ~
CONC .. | 414y s & IN PAIRS AT FRAME as complying with the Florida %
3 KSI MIN N s . SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND Building Code r 4 o R~
a5 B ’ SHEET 5 FOR CAPACITY NOA-No. 24-0312.02 5. § 1E
e =z
1BY WOOD BUCK | ﬁ Expiration Date 09/05/2029 !:(- g g %*
SEE NOTE SHEET 77~ . ) — B |shes [ Lhanke et 3g|3
PR Y___ So&gf©
1 l e ) Miami-Dade Product Control Qoo ©
| Lz
s ot &
5 = -
- PRODUCT REVISED 05an
g . . S50,
~ as complying with the Florida o Aue
- Building Code oo 2925
NOA-No.__ 23-0724.14 L
o
Expiration Date09/05/2024 g : E.';) T 3
C - <}
[id [\ ]
By \9{«<? l. Lhan < w % .u-.: &
Miami-Dade Product Control ul- z g g 4
882
gLos ¥
S ——— N—
S——
N
i g @
: L /\/\/ in/ E‘
i [a' o]
1 o 3
) = ©
| = G
[fe]
: 3 8
[
- [©) .
e (O x
b4 ' <
&) (_ZD. N
- [
X % % .EE
[&] o~
I} — N wn <+ ©
IOE s m 2 SEALANT: ggmgg
Led wl Q. <+ i
3 | ° o & ALL JOINTS AND FRAME CONNECTIONS SEALED WITH a0
Lo ; g o WHITE /ALUMINUM COLORED SILICONE. S Z z 5©
x| < £ S =Tz R
g = B M o= 2
S I i WEEPHOLES: 2lnp 2
| i & an GluBs e
I it W1 = 2-5/8" LONG WEEP NOTCH AT EACH END w
! fIn W2 = 1" LONG WEEP NOTCH AT EACH END — — —>
| Wil
i 4 I‘ v
| I % Pl o Zolk
! 1 I N\ Yy e
| B = )
| il /@ M
1 v [N e -l I E
! 4 9518 8 el
2WIge EHMENE
i - Ol Iy <
: | ol 5 gledix
==/|F (] 8olZzlEl
. 7 o210 D2
& (26 K
Loy e ‘é’ o212 I2IKIR
ol 81218812
u %» 3.500 .%':ﬁgggg
i L O 1 ; &) EEEnoEe
i C D
i ® i (7
< L 1 L || o~ E
@%ﬁ@ 5 E — \@ 5
1r7)_| P B T e S 1 1] e [ R a . N
Lo @ S UFY'-'J“\\AQ\POURED & HARDENED 8
- , 73) 23 T CONE 9 an HIGH STRENGTH GROUT .
N -4 4\7{,_2/, SN T Qq \[ ngKSc, MIN. NOT BY 'E.S. WINDOWS' 8
S| < EDGE'DIST. 4 s |, XNwr (5 KSI MIN.) TR TR RPN
< ' e TYPICAL ANCHORS Gl o Lold drawing  no.
- IN-LINE CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS W12-33
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND S
SHEET 5.1 FOR CAPACITY sheet 6 of 12



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


EXTERIOR

/

T
\

1/2"
Y WOOD

EDGE DIST. ?<

/

WOOD STRUCTURE

|

| A | {5555 | M

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 5 FOR CAPACITY

E

1/4" MAX.

SHIM

EDGE DISA.
&

& 4
<

<

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

.
—T 7]

EXTERIOR

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 5 FOR CAPACITY

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.02
Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By J 9{/\4? l. £ hand

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By |9L\<7 |. £ hand

Miami-Dade Product Control

METAL STRUCTURE

SEE SPECS ON
ﬁ SHEET 5
EDGE DIST. ,
ﬁ ‘ ; =s = i
| aog | vz | |

EXTERIOR

L7

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 5 FOR CAPACITY

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

EDGE DIST.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY
APPR’D MULLION
SEE SEPARATE NOA

Hi— o L

T T 7

EXTERIOR

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET & FOR CAPACITY

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURES NOT BY ‘E.S. WINDOWS'
MUST SUPPORT LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM AND
TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

f
C

COMP—ANL\W12—33ES )

a

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305B) 264-8100

L

|

-5158 J

FAX. (305) 638

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

(SERIEs—smo ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (S.M.;.)j

|

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

GENERAL REVISION
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by description

07.14.23

E 112.23.15
F |01.15.18
G 103.09.18
H 106.22.21

(revisions:
nol date

[

=4
[
<
=
=
)

[
°

chk. by:

drawing no.

W12-33



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


Ve P
Q2
INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL INTERLOCK PRODUCT REVISED &
. N PANEL WIDTH gﬁ icl::iwglé[:)ndgewﬂh the Florida ?-?m é
SHIM @ 37 38 NOA-No. 23-0724.14 0. o g 3
et & <
©) Expiration Date09/05/2024 E& gld
28Y WOOD BUCK = g2 Y=
OR — X/ A By lghasg |. £ hand e %O < B 8
WOAD STRUCTU %/\ Miami-Dade Product Control oz q ~a
. Bgu %
E a3
5 JiE
e 7 1 [} w o
<t g e o9 E o g
g o oo g b
SeEHETIES = O%Lg <
RN 8 Lo LI QN S anane [ )] @
[ AR SRR St ELec §
CSA—RHE O Y e e ey o N (= qERED
© l&J | S T o u‘ ZOE o
518 = =09
~ g GB ,,,,,,,,,,,,, < 1] m E o )
—
k_}& r‘/‘\"\f————‘—‘-’“\
= = 3
\@ ® * @ a 5
(s o
/ &) S 3
et Q ~~
o 8
D.L.O. D.LO. 2 ®
om0 , = i
IOR TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS O %
PANEL WIDTH EXTER PANEL WIDTH SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING % j E £
. =
DOOR FRAME WIDTH @ Kot <'\/ 3| i b 3z
SHIM b
= ; -
{ _TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS ALUMINUM AND STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK AND ASTRAGAL STILES S510%m?
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING ZIQaYM o
) SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION ONLY. ollZz P
USE AS SHOWN ON SHEETS 3 THRU 4. S L. % § > o fg
SEE CHARTS FOR REINFORCING OPTIONS LOAD CAPACITY, INCLUDING GLASS OPTIONS. h = E‘g
SEE ELEVATION FOR ANCHOR SPACING AND SHEET 5 & 5.1 FOR ANCHOR CAPACITY. a = u.t{% <
1/4" MAX. g o) P=EF
1/4" MAX. @ @ ™ SHIM = S———
SHIM T SY ALTERNATE ALTERNATE @ \/ % | [ —
| ’ AREE
28y WOOD BUCK /| =) = B __! , HIRHISE
WOQD STRUCTU PRODUCT RENEWED > —g H——=— MM
as complying with the Florida = LB 2SI H 0w
Building Code . . E’ © e ol el
NOA-No. 24-0312.02 . . 58 S
= = AN
D W — 1 _% Expiration Date(w 30 %» 1 —— g Ba oy % & g é EJ g °
= By IgL\‘7 [ Zé’r’@e ! ] =3 b L a L E
j Miami-Dade Product Control f lz: _E ‘ g MEEIEIS
— -y — . bq [z S bt r'N) u'_u o g i
o= —— HiE e -, 285|512 )8 ]
8 K = R bm Lt ] OO w|wlolx|.
[fe} 4 ‘_“3 o \-AE J
i B ==t ISl T2 EXT. —
*[p J . B AR
by ] ol "o
s —— l Z\\‘f %
S CH T L s
o 1 _§ I E 2
- [V I &
S S8 5]l5
1 HE 27 anag
= a e olla -
EXT. EXT. W:g@ 3“?5

/ _TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS
IN PAIRS

e

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

1/4" SHIM
MAX.

| §4d (15) SEE B.OM. AT SHEET 11

©®

ASTRAGAL

©)

INTERLOCK

TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

D
X
IS
e et W

a a
w&" b
N
\0 rs
nig i
o~ B |

% Blsa

(&%
Lud
el <,
ad
4
<
IS

e

2 5/16"
STAGGERED

EDGE DIST.

OX0O CONFIGURATION

DOOR _FRAME WIDTH

1BY WOOD BUCK
SEE NOTE SHEET 8

TYPICAL ANCHORS
IN PAIRS

g

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
1/4” SHIM

MAX.
(396oh
|
f
s mreiss el
1 A \ =
. %\;;::b NN
i o it 1‘3
zoS dnbv nd
B gLe
o L IL___ry
g "
a
: 7 EXT.

EXTERIOR

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.02
Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By ]QL\<7 [ Zéﬁnje

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024
By \9{«<? l. Lhan

Miami-Dade Product Control

METAL
STRUCTURE

ALUMINUM AND STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK AND ASTRAGAL STILES
SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION ONLY.
USE AS SHOWN ON SHEETS 3 THRU 4.

SEE CHARTS FOR REINFORCING OPTIONS LOAD CAPACITY, INCLUDING GLASS OPTIONS.
SEE ELEVATION FOR ANCHOR SPACING AND SHEET 5 & 5.1 FOR ANCHOR CAPACITY.

f
C

COMP—ANL\W12—33ES )

;

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

}

FAX. (305) 638—-5158 [

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

[ SERIES—6100 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (S.M..)
MIAMI.

)H

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

GENERAL REVISION
REV. PER RER COMMENTS

UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

(revisions:
nol date
£ [12.23.15
F lo1.15.18
G [03.09.18
H |06.22.21
i 107.14.23

|

06—18-12

=4
<
[
=
)
[
©

chk. by:

date:

|

drawing no.

W12-33
sheet 9 of 12



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


ITEM # PART # QUANTITY DESCRIPTION MATERIAL MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS
1 ES6001 1 FRAME HEAD 6005-T5 -
2 ES6023 1 FRAME SILL — 3-1/2" HIGH 6005-T5 -
3 ES6003 2 FRAME JAMB 6063-T6 -
3A E£S6030 2 ALTERNATE FRAME JAMB 6063-T6 -
4 ES—-6000-040 2/ PANEL TOP RAIL 6063-76 -
5 ES--6000~-041 2/ PANEL BOTTOM RAIL 6063—-T6 -
6 ES~6000—-042 AS REQD. LOCK STILE 6063-T6 -
7 ES-6000—-043 AS REQD. INTERLOCK 6063~T6 -
8 ES~6000-044 AS REQD. FEMALE ASTRAGAL 606376 -
10 27-564 4/ PANEL GLAZING GASKET SILICONE DUROMETER 655 SHORE A, EXTRUSIONS S.A.
11 ES6016 4/ PANEL PANEL GUIDE (TOP ONLY) CELCON LOCATED AT PANEL ENDS
12 ES6015 2/ PANEL FIXED PANEL BOTTOM GUIDE 6063-T6 SECURE W/ (2) #8 X 3/4" FH SMS
13 ES6010 2/ PANEL RETAINER CLIP, 8" LONG AT HEAD, 7" LONG AT SILL 6005-T5 AT MTG. RAIL HEAD & SILL ENDS
13A #8 x 3/4” 3/ CLP RETAINER CLIP FASTENERS ST. STEEL | FH SMS
14 ES6011 2/ JAMB JAMB SCREW COVER 606315 OPTIONAL
15 ES6014 3/ FIX. PANEL| FIXED PANEL CLIP, 4" LONG, AT 53" O.C. 6063-T6 AT 7" FROM EACH END AND AT MIDSPAN
16 ES6012 AS REQD. INTERLOCK STIFFENER (LENGTH = PANEL HT. — 2-3/8") 6063~T6 -
17 ES6013 AS REQD. ASTRAGAL STIFFENER (LENGTH = PANEL HT. - 2-3/8") 606376 -
18 17X 2" X 3/167 AS REQD. STEEL TUBE REINFORCING (LENGTH = PANEL HT. — 2-3/8") A36 STEEL |TO BE PAINTED
21 W222521K AS REQD. STILE & JAMB W'STRIPPING - ULTRAFAB
22 W223221K AS REQD. TOP RAIL PILE W'STRIPPING - ULTRAFAB
23 ES6027 AS REQD. BOTTOM RAIL W'STRIPPING EPDM DUROMETER 754 SHORE A
24 #10 X 1-1/2" PH SMS 8/ PANEL PANEL ASSY SCREWS - -
25 #10 X 17 PH SMS 2/ CORNER | FRAME ASSY SCREWS - -
26 GTT-354/460—-A 2/ MOV. PANEL] TANDEM ACETAL WHEEL IN METALLIC HOUSING - PABOSE
27 1/4-20 X 1-3/4" PH MS 1/ ROLLER | ROLLER INST. SCREWS - -
28 2300-10SS 1/ MOV. PANEL! STD. MORTISE LOCK, AT 48-1/2" FROM BOTTOM ST. STEEL | -
28A 2468700 1/ MOV. PANEL| MULTI POINT MORTISE LOCK, AT 48-1/2" FROM BOTTOM ST. STEEL | WITH 2448 TRIM PLATE
29 #10-24 X 3/8" PH MS 2/ LOCK LOCK INSTALLATION SCREW ST. STEEL | -
30 E£S6017-1 1/ LOCK LOCK KEEPER (STD. LOCK) PLATED STEEL| AT 48-1/2" FROM BOTTOM
30A 244700 1/ LOCK LOCK KEEPER (MULTI POINT LOCK) ST. STEEL | AT 48-1/2" FROM BOTTOM
31 #10 X 5/8" PH SMS B 2/ LOCK LOCK KEEPER MOUNT. SCREW (STD. LOCK) ST. STEEL | —
31A #8 X 3/4" FH SMS 4/ LOCK LOCK KEEPER MOUNT. SCREW (MULTI POINT LOCK) ST. STEEL | —
32 #6237 1/ LOCK INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR PULL - (3) #6-32 X 1/2" FH MS, ST. STEEL
34 #12 X 3/4" 2/ Cup FIXED PANEL CLIP FASTENER ST. STEEL | FH SMS
35 - AS REQD. 1"X4" LONG SELF ADHESIVE PILE PAD WOOLPILE | AT HEAD AND SILL
37 ES6019 AS REQD. RESTRAINING PLATE NYLON AT TOP & BOTT. INTERLOCKS & ASTRAGAL
38 #8 X 3/4" FH SMS 2/ PLATE RESTRAINING PLATE FASTENER - -

LATCHES:
ITEMS 28A AND 30A USED FOR DOORS WITH STEEL REINFORCING ONLY
ITEMS 28 AND 30 USED FOR ALL OTHER DOORS.

PRODUCT RENEWED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No.

24-0312.02

Expiration Date09/05/2029
By lehag [ Lhand

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

23-0724.14

NOA-No.

Expiration Date09/05/2024
By \9{«<? l. Lhan

Miami-Dade Product Control

N
(O Q%
L
G ¥ |3
(1] T
o™~
_ =
r 4 2RI~
Or ©3|2
25 %«
&l
e
: s
zn. <515
Solglo
&
Owy ¢
o X
gor
[
o3a8
i =l
8>m
gLzmo
1414 1
O&Dgﬂ
O%Liz 3
gmmog
e .a
guUsSh g
u'mw__»o
I-Z-OZ@
2882,
<mmEEL
.
N
= 2
£ &I_s
= 2
S ©
D o~
9]
(99}
Q )
o
Oo 1%
= <
O
Z|1J0 0~
o x
= - =
21D 5
zgm\—-g
219 <+
T Moo
N ]
g€z °
= TR
(?32 o
—
o= D
Glne 2T
O‘uj’ﬂ“d
% M ZE
N S
D
G
ol e
z |22\
= ZlLlTx
= = 7]
CiIzZz|0|0
ogogg
o u3
SHEEIN G
E“mmr—ﬁ
:§:z§a§
IR
o|ZEIZIE o
Mol 1O o1 2
>
O
4 REIEERR
gi‘ﬁn‘m'c;ﬁﬁ
O e O N e
2P 2518|818
/o
\b\CLxJLA.OI_J
S —
o~
{
o [
T &
© =
o ..
gl &
B 2l
3 5|5
T e TN,
drawing no.

sheet 10 of 12



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


[ 6.135

§

3.750

=—.078

i
094 J AS(——)

TYP.

I

L

2.078

125
2.250

: i
188

@ ASTRAGAL STIFFENER

@ 2.312
FRAME HEAD
@ LOCK STILE
1,437 —=
o 1.546
7 h 3.313 '
{
1.999 1.749
2.562 2.312
.078
3.563 e
[
e 5 2
J L 6.057 ? 1.984
LI 1.999 @ INTERLOCK STILE
062
TYP,
4.375 '
(©) paneL TOP RAL e el 094 |
== £ |
? ‘T
_} r T 1.750
ARG @ FRAME JAMB ) JL
4.441 'w
3.563
L - 1.788 .078
2.562 T TYR.
078 | S
Typ. ~.094
‘6;'1 L T
M § q (.125
1.709 4
1,546 — 3.374
@ PANEL BOTTOM RAIL @ FIXED PANEL CLIP ASTRAGAL STILE

—= 1.002 =

L
}
|
2.031
1.499 ] <.~~T‘Y2P5_
2.047

INTERLOCK STIFFENER

r—.260

~t>§ 1.000 r“ ~¢>~|
™

3.000

©

L/

@ RESTRAINING PLATE

1.500

1.750

)

RETAINER CLIP

1.221

1.069

L)

.O72~?

.801

BASE POLYMER = EPDM RUBBER
DENSITY = 10.26 Lbs/Gal
HARDNESS = 7045
TENSILE STRENGTH = 905 PSI
ELONGATION AT BREAK = 273%
TEAR STRENGTH = 1.343 Kip/ft
BRITTLENESS TEMPERATURE = —40" F
COMPRESSION SET = 27% (22h@158°F)
GLAZING GASKET

SCALE 11

—= 1.000 j=—

s
2.000
188~ pem

@ INTERLOCK REINFORCING

[omm,o
.
385

100 ]
100_Jl ?

@Fix. PANEL BOTTOM GUIDE

375

094 __|
TYP.

125
.685 gl ii n N ﬁ
U m U !

3.500

1

®

FRAME SILL

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.02

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By l QL\Q‘Z f 14’1434
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.14
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By 19%7 l. £ hanl,

Miami-Dade Product Control

.287~>1 T:—K

.040} 711
S

SCREW COVER

r—1‘437~—>

1.999
124
6.057
078
1.999
L 082
TYP.
s ::L“ﬁ:ﬁ.) B
A

ALT. FRAME JAMB

P17 anas

W W b e b

f
C

COMP—ANL\W12-33ES )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

C

|

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638~5151

[SER]ES—MOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (S.M.l.)}

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

GENERAL REVISION

by [description

07.14.23

(revisions:
(no| date
£ [12.23.15
F [01.15.18
G |03.09.18
H |06.22.21

i

|

06—-18~12

o
4
<
=
=
[
u
o

chk. by:

date:

drawing no.

W12-33



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


(S3ce~Z LM\ INV—dWOD N[ ggig—ge9 (508) ¥4 1S15—8c9 (S08) 3L 1 Fwwxm M@Moﬁxoooz £C¥L L0 1) h 4a 1wl g M WM
D [ e oo s o | | e s || | 312
.h 0ZZ 3ALINS ‘IAIHA LISNNS 09€6 13381S 6y MN 055E NOISIAZY V3N 8151 10| 4 s
IN3IWdOTIAIA LONAOHd @ SHIINIONT OT1 SMOANIM "S3 e T e} 2 @

€| NnolLYu0du0D DoouVH-TV @._.2@ 300Q SSY19 ONINS WNY 85;&5& ( ek “mmwo_m;mu 5

(1]
- o -— ©
= N [-] - < -
as Olo - T | N °
Wi oy s S 4| Q £
20 | |6 Q& A o
mE 0|0 - Wwoe w0 o ey
¥ o|ls| 40 ws | o - £ 3
2 < i[O =[S - = |9 [}
¥ <g|lolE s > OO 4|3 &3
w ~ <
$ Nl ule WE G| L8
o - N = W [90] 0 < |9 -~
g“ c - | R en/_ - N n b
T.mo Q ~|Q ng 8 ey s
050 £ |38 C.mo a "mie
D8n¢é 2 5o 520 1§ ‘s =
i 2 3 bl
QESZ § o g2 ¢ a k
093! = £ QEsz § —[1 iy
0= < OOd_ P £
Rs.mo “. > RC“A e ®
GeaZ W 4% pga2 & &=

FRAME BOTTOM CORNER

2
(24

&

77 N /

BOTTOM CORNER

PAN

PANEL TOP CORNER

S\



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


	w24031202Ren23072414
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER)

	23072414



