MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590  F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NO A) www.miamidade.gov/economy
E.S. Windows, LLC

3550 N. W. 49 Street

Miami, F1.33142

ScoprE:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER -
Product Control Section to be used in Miami Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami Dade County) and/or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material fails to
perform in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may
immediately revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER
reserves the right to revoke this acceptance, if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section that this product or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building
Code, including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series 6000 Aluminum Sliding Glass Doors(2-Tracks) w/wo Reinforcements-L.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W11-41 Rev H titled “Series- 6000 Alum Sliding. Glass Door
(L.M.L)”, sheets 1 through 13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11 and last revised on
JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control
Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County
Product Control Section.

Limitations:

1. See Design Pressure (DP) tables in sheets 3, 4 and 5 with applicable reinforcing required at interlock &
astragal. Also see approved configurations in sheet 2. Lower capacity of DP table or anchor capacity table
sheet 6 shall control.

2. Applicable Egress requirement to be reviewed by building official.

3. Min (2) item #26 Pabose (GT345/460A) rollers per panel as specified per sheet 11 of Bill of material.

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Columbia and series and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved".

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been
no change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change
in the materials, use, and/or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of
any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.

ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its
distributors and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA #23-0724.15 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3, E-4 and
E-5, as well as approval document mentioned above.

. ) . | E‘,Ii.u:u-. |I {f..l"';-l"rq_lld.
The submitted documentation was reviewed by Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E. ;-

NOA No. 24-0312.03

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY Expiration Date: September 05. 2029
Xpiration Date: dSeptember 0D,

Approval Date: May 09, 2024

Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/economy

E.S. Windows, LL.C

[

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

Evidence submitted under previous NOAs

DRAWINGS

1. Manufacturer's die drawings and sections (Submitted under file #14-0408.01).

2. Drawing No. W11-41 Rev C, titled “Series- 6000 Alum Sliding Glass Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1
through 13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11 and last revised on JUL
01, 2016, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

TESTS (Submitted under file #14-0408.01/#11-0825.07)
1. Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum sliding glass door,
prepared by Fenestration Testing Lab, Inc., Test Report No. FTL-6292 (samples A-1, B-1, C-1,
D-1 & E-1), dated 08/15/11, signed and sealed by Marlin D. Brinson, P. E.
(Note: This report has been revised for glazing types in sample Al & E-1)
2. Additional roller assembly qualification test report #FTL-7651 per TAS 201, 202 & 203-94

CALCULATIONS

1. Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 2014 (5%
Edition), prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated 12/23/2015, signed and sealed by Javad
Ahmad, P.E.

2. Roller assembly dead load structural analysis prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated
02/17/14 and last revised on 06/16/14, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E. (Submitted
under file #14-0408.01).

3. Glazing complies w/ ASTME-1300-02 -04 & -09

QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 14-0916.11 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 07/04/18.

STATEMENTS

1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2014 (5™ Edition) and letter of no financial interest,
prepared by Al Farooq Corporation, dated 12/15/15, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

2. Laboratory compliance statements, part of the above referenced test reports.

3. Distribution agreement between ES Windows-Energia Solar, SA, Colombia and ES Windows,
LLC, USA, dated 10/29/10, signed by MS Carla Torrente and Andres Chomaro, respectively.

4. Two panel test E.S. Windows commitment letter dated June 29, 2016 and single roller test
proposal dated June 20, 2014, both signed by A. Chamorro, General Manager.

.
| g,lf-\_-:-r;\. |I. f J'flifr.l]_l’_.,
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises & renews NOA#14-0408.01, conditionally for one year, expiring
01/19/2018
2. Test proposals dated 06/30/16 & 04/15/14 approved by RER and Test proposal # 10-0506,
dated 09/23/10, approved by BCCO.

2. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W11-41 titled “Series- 6000 Alum SLD. Glass Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets 1 through
13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11, with revision “F” dated
03/07/18, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. Testreports on: 1) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
2) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
3) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
4) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
5) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of aluminum sliding glass door, prepared
by Fenestration Testing Lab, Inc., Test Report No. FTL-8721, dated 03/08/17, signed and sealed
by Idalmis Ortega, P. E.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations complying with FBC2017 (6" Edition), prepared by Al
Farooq Corporation, dated 01/19/2018, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DeNemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/04/23.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 6% Edition (2017) and of no financial interest,
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated 01/19/2018, signed and sealed by Javad Ahmad,
P.E.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises & renews NOA # 15-0430.04, expiring 01/19/2018.

| ;’{"":? |I' ;{“'{:"f“]-l:’-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

3. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W11-41 Rev G titled “Series- 6000 Alum Sliding. Glass Door (L.M.1.)”, sheets
1 through 13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11 and last revised on
JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. Anchor verification calculations complying with FBC 2020 (7™ Edition), prepared by Al
Farooq Corporation, dated May 17, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 17-0808.02 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. (former E.I. DuPont
DeNemours & Co., Inc.) for the “Sentry Glass ® Interlayer”, expiring on 07/04/23.

F. STATEMENTS

I. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 7™ Edition (2020) and of no financial interest,
prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, dated May 17, 2021, signed and sealed by Jalal
Farooq, P.E.

2. Distribution agreement between Energia Solar, S.A.-ES Windows and ES Windows, LLC,

dtd 08/03/15, signed by Ms. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Andres Chamorro (Gen. MGR)
respectively (original copy in various ES approved NOA(s) files.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA # 16-1130.03, expiring 09/05/2024.

| ;’{"":? |I' ;{“'{:"f“]-l:’-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LL.C

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

4. Evidence submitted under previous approval.

A. DRAWINGS
1. Drawing No. W11-41 Rev H titled “Series- 6000 Alum SLD. Glass Door (L.M.I.)”, sheets 1
through 13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11 and last revised on JUL
17,2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.
2. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8" Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 07/19/23, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

G. OTHER
1. This NOA revises NOA # 21-0628.15 and updates to FBC 2023, expiring 09/05/24.
2. Distribution agreement between ES Windows, LLC (distributor) and Energia Solar, S.A,
(manufacturer, dated 08/01/18, signed by MS. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Ms. Evelyn Deas
(MGR) respectively (submitted under previous approvals).

.
| ;E“-‘:"’} | o "'l:.:‘r"l-l:’--
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

5. New Evidence submitted

DRAWINGS

1. Drawing No. W11-41 Rev H titled “Series- 6000 Alum SLD. Glass Door (L.M.1.)”,
sheets 1 through 13 of 13, prepared by AL-Farooq Corporation, dated 07/22/11 and last
revised on JUL 17, 2023, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

B. TESTS
1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their

“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers”, expiring on 07/04/28.

F. STATEMENTS
I. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8" Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 03/07/24, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E
2. Statement letter of conformance to FBC 2023 (8" Edition), prepared by Al Farooq
Corporation, dated 07/19/23, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E. (submitted under
previous approvals)

G. OTHER
1. This NOA renews NOA # 23-0724.15 and updates to FBC 2023, expiring 09/05/29.
2. Distribution agreement between ES Windows, LLC (distributor) and Energia Solar, S.A,

(manufacturer, dated 08/01/18, signed by MS. Carla Garcia (MGR) and Ms. Evelyn Deas
(MGR) respectively (submitted under previous approvals).

.
| ;E“-‘:"’} | o "'l:.:‘r"l-l:’--
-

Ishaq I. Chanda, P.E.

Product Control Unit Supervisor
NOA No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date: September 05, 2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024



CLUSTER OF ANCHORS 6[\6" CLUSTER OF ANCHORS Q @)
i . AT ASTRAGAL ENDS 27N AT INTERLOCKS || . -
6" MAX. 2 3/4 9-1/2" SEE SHEET 6 FOR 5. SEE SHEET 6 FOR (] N
HEAD vl QUANTITY AND CAPACITY o QUANTITY AND CAPACITY -
CORNERS e A e = =
SRS PO P P SRR (S P z SR~
. s \\ Ve : * * o b= :_g % <Z(
192" g 2 3 S
DOOR FRAME WIDTH P G|Q
PRODUCT RENEWED In Eagegl®
as complying with the Florida ot
Building Code ; ; x Lon %
NOA-No. 24-0312.03 ; ’ &g ?_E w
Expiration Date09/05/2029 PRODUCT REVISED : 8 GaQ
A as complying with the Florida pya
gy Sty | Lhan Building Code ) O%8E% g
Miami-Dade Product Control REINF. OPTIONS NOA-No. 23-0724.15 . A 8 3 g g §
SEE SHEETS irati . S 4
3RS L] Expiration Date09/05/2024 ﬁ% > |l Eggs ©
\ B lsbas . Lhanl. . ° ‘1€ Wk 3
R y 7 L we . o
y N Miami-Dade Product Control : B g gs ¢
, , , ; g -
4 s s s ) SR g
/// /// /// /// o
C S/ D Vo E v D . F ——
= " INTERLOCK 7 ASTRAGAL C e . 9
5] . - ol
W &= = 0
T % % o 8 . I o
ol¢ SIE 55 . 8 Py
DAYLITE OPENINGS: g wlg oo . = %
D.L.O. HEIGHT = PANEL HEIGHT — 7.000” s =z e . A =
D.LO. WIDTH = PANEL WIDTH - 6.937” g 2o _
PANEL HEIGHT = FRAME HEIGHT — 1.375” a _ . olas &
<}: :> <}: Z -
%l =1 Y=
. s2 21PN+ 5
‘ Y <§( % % (0] ;) B
[ 3 el
- SHENE:
: gl&Ez j©
QI1F=z*1g
i — Y
(%] b —
SERIES—6000 ALUMINUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR . = 8{%% E
Led M=
SEE SHEETS 3 THRU 5 FOR DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF @ 2 i
DESIRED GLASS SIZE AND REQUIRED REINFORCING. ! : e )
USING CHART ON SHEET 6 SELECT ANCHOR OPTION WITH &k ,
DESIGN RATING MORE THAN DESIGN LOADS REQUIRED. s " o
8 z
LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM GLASS OR ANCHOR 42 5/16" 42 5/16" ‘ 42 5/16" 42 5/16" 2l2h HE g8
CHARTS WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM. DL OFG. DL OPG. & ' D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. 58 cz|c 818
. (& Six ™~
THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE 49 1/4” rer o 1 ‘ 49 1747 28 € ele
PANEL WID ' . a0l
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION)/2023 (8TH EDITION) FLORIDA PANEL WIDTH NEL WIDTH 48 7/8 PANEL WIDTH 5ol 8 g
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ). PANEL WIDTH §g Zlele
T P N M DD
1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE ; N ; S N
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT . . SRR . . R G A . . S . . } ? 5
LOADS TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE. S St A R
” QT AN
ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS 9 1/2 e G be 3" MIN. CLUSTER OF ANCHORS 6" MAX. HcEEEE
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE MAX. SEE SHEET 6 FOR e, AT INTERLOCKS SILL 258 ]8]5
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO. QUANTITY AND CAPACITY TYPICAL ELEVATION 26%@?5%% PR CORNERS EENNEED
A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY. . OX X )
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON~METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE. =l® B
i .
MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT UIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT STl e
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE IR
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020/2023 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS. U= el s
THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION L e T«
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY Jurog o, 2073 S L8 5%
OF STRUCTURE RECENVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR = Sy | enm——
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANGE ETC. THESE DOORS ARE RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT. Grawing no.
CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY, SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL. W11—-41
. , VERIFY COMPLIANCE WITH EGRESS LIMITATIONS WHERE REQUIRED.
DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON 'ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'. : i shest 1 of 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


DOOR FRAME W.

’i_' i
s O 27 2 %
& -y ]
[r e
8 | @
T

XO (SHOWN)

OX

XX

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

.
O gﬁ}

>

OXO (SHOWN)

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

7
H+—@ %x“\@ --®

3

119 @4

_.@_W

e
Y

G

XXX (SHOWN)

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

DOOR FRAME HT.

]
jiion NPy PGy FOR Pl
R~ ’ % %
G = = &= = 7
i
XXXO(SHOWN)
XXXX
OXXO
APPROVED CONFIGURATIONS

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No.

Expiration Date09/05/2029
1§L\<7 |. £ hande

By

24-0312.03

Miami-Dade Product Control

NOTE:

CONFIGURATIONS SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION PURPOSE
SEE APPLICABLE DESIGN PRESSURE & SIZE N
SHEETS 3 THRU 5 AND ANCHOR INSTALLATION IN SHEET 6.

— EXTERIOR
‘;:I]
f !—,ﬁ}__/’/\] E
; | e B | '
E E ] S Tl 1 8
(= I [_—_J k__;J ! | >3
— A =7 /L N F‘“D
| E——
d el ey |
E Lﬂ L F ] B
n  [— I
25 &
B EXTERIOR
7] § e
— Vm = i
M — | = | L
; = IE -] Di:] ¢l
et/ | == ]
| ‘FJ R " -
D B 2
" == 5
2 L. &
EXTERIOR  —
.
~—;:~r’\37‘r—//Al [ i ! 155 L
e B2 :
|_—;“ T ] 4‘7‘___7 ] i R
N 1 = [— i D
R == :
i > \[""’“’
F 3
bod k_——__r'ﬁ ]
— EXTERIOR
R _F] FT.

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024
By |9¢\=7 |. Land

Miami-Dade Product Control

E?
C
COMP—ANL\W11—-41ES )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

(

|

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

(SERIES—-GOOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.L)

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by Tdescription

E {01.15.18
F 103.07.18
G 106.21.21
H 107.14.23

nol date

e

(revisions:

|

:

07-22~11

<
x
<
=
>
o
[
©

scale: —
chk. by:

date:

T T
drawing no.

W11—-41
sheet 2 of 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


\&J

EXTERIOR

13/16" MIN. TYP.

INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILE
OPTION #1
WITHOUT REINFORCING
SHILICONE BEAD
DOWSIL 983
SILICONE BEAD
DOWSIL 983 3/16" TEMP. GLASS

. , 3/8" AIR SPACE
1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
] 1/47 HEAT STREN'D GLASS
.090" Interlayer
SentryGlas

) .090" Interlayer
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.

SentryGlas
r‘By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

o
e
wi Led
= SILICONE = SILICONE
@ DOWSIL 983 § o DOWSIL 983
o ~ 13
< ©3
o < [}
r()

% AT 1/4 POINTS
ALL SIZES

(47) AT BOTTOM RAIL
(42) AT TOP RAIL & STILES

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘B’
1" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

GLASS TYPE ‘A’
9/16" OVERALL LAM. GLASS

GLAZING OPTIONS

3/16" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF U @
PRODUCT RENEWED WITHOUT REINFORCING o |5
as complying with the Florida ‘8_
Building Code GLASS TYPE 'B’ ——————
NOA-No.  24-0312.03 PANEL WIDTH|DOOR FRAME| GLASS TYPE ‘A’ | & 'B' REVERSE ||| & S B z
o 29 NOMINAL HEIGHT ) L
Expiration Date09/05/20 INCHES INCHES | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) | EXT.(+) | INT.(=) =5 3¢
By  |5hep [ Lk 30 750 | 750 | 750 | 750 : g =8lo
Miami-Dade Product Control 36 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 ¢S o § g3
42 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 (o} gg e
44 82 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 % Lw E
48 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 P
PRODUCT REVISED (o] Q@ Q
as complying with the Florida 53 67.9 67.9 67.9 67.8 o AW g
Building Code 60 60.0 60.0 60.0 60.0 o9 E M o
NOA-No.__ 23-0724.15 30 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 Qzog 3
Expiration Date09/05/2024 16 750 1 750 1 750 1 750 g Ihz $
By 5heg |- L 42 o 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 < é 20 o
Miami-Dade Product Control 44 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 I.I‘. z g E‘ 8
48 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 - 90< o
53 67.9 67.9 67.9 67.9 qinz* L
30 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 F%::__;S
36 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 ; %
42 102 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 = o
i
44 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 x ©
48 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 2 °
50 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 9 §
30 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 5 ~
<& O 93
36 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 oladl; =7
42 108 750 | 750 | 750 750 |||5]7 Y
44 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 DI -
; <+
48 75.0 75.0 75.0 75.0 = 32, o
2 a¥mrag
SILICONE BEAD Q€= 5©
DOWSIL 983 NOTE: sizzik 0
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE H e 5\”’,
3/16" HEAT STREN'D GLASS BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS)| & ujg <4
090" Interlayer AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION 2 s
SentryGlas DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-DEC-219 Co—
By 'Kuraray America, Inc.’ M)
1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS o
aizl B
3/8" AIR SPACE SIENE:
z 8 & 2]
—3/16” TEMP. GLASS » 82|z 5%
. 3/16 ~ 3/8” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF: SINEIEN
g SPACER: 2y xlz|2
t H o
= SILICONE HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER AR
£ DOWSIL 983 ‘ ; oitlgigle
=, BY 'LINGERMANN GMBH oim 882
© % AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS. 2
e il PERIMETER SEALANT: sl etet=ts
2 i IH SILICONE c R
7 v,:; tg! DOWSIL 791 8Bz ]5]8]5
Tl GE 2000 I EMRBE
Lk ?_4\ ./
: G -
& \ AT 1/4 POINTS |
2 ALL SIZES S g
“ 41) AT BOTTOM RAIL 5 B
(42) AT TOP RAIL & STILES . R
LT a3 S
GLASS TYPE ‘B’ (REVERSE) bRV
1" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS drawing no.



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


/ N
193]
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF “ U L
@ REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK m M
Lo GLASS TYPE -
L_lh_ PRODUCT RENEWED PANEL WIDTH| DOOR FRAME N [ oyt ’Q o ;
~ @ as complying with the Florida NEL WD R o GLASS TYPE ‘A GLASS TYPE 'B B’ REVERSE g I
) Building Code INCHES INCHES EXT. (+) | INT. (=) JEXT. (4+) INT. (=) |EXT. (+)]INT. (=) hd l'z" » OIS
% NOA-No.  24-0312.03 g &l
36 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 s =82
](i::a N Expiration Date09/05/2029 40 85.0 145.0 850 | 1450 | 850 | 1100 @S, <83
N
By 557 FEpas 44 85.0 1450 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 8 gg e
— >
= Miami—-Dade Product Control 48 - 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 e buw ¢
= ) = 50 81.6 139.2 B81.6 139.2 | 816 105.6 05 ?, ™
. i 53 77.0 131.3 770 | 1313 | 770 99.6 O2ug
56 72.9 124.3 729 | 1243 | 729 94.3 ooz o g
] PRODUCT REVISED 60 68.0 116.0 680 | 1160 | 68.0 88.0 Qaogd
—_— as complying with the Florida O 2 E = 3
Building Code 36 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 F o g ©
NOA-No.  23-0724.15 40 85.0 1450 | 850 | 1450 | 8.0 | 110.0 CE5C 5
| il -
fﬁ——-———«J | Expiration Date09/05/2024 44 85.0 145.0 85.0 1450 | 85.0 110.0 kz? g8
1 | = 48 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 -l 90
By Shey | Lhank e 96 1 . e o8 iz ¥
n Miami-Dade Product Control 81.6 139.2 1.6 139.2 81 6 P
) 53 77.0 131.3 77.0 1313 | 770 99.6 | ———
S 56 72.9 94.3 72.9 94.3 72.9 94.3 = S
4@ @ 60 68.0 88.0 68.0 88.0 68.0 88.0 = b
{
36 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 & ©
EXTERIOR 40 85.0 145.0 850 | 1450 | 850 | 110.0 =4 ©
INTERLOCK ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILE 44 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 9 §
OPTION 42 48 102 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 g O ~
# 50 81.6 1392 | 816 | 1392 | 816 | 1056 olah g
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK = D Ry
53 77.0 99.6 77.0 99.6 77.0 99.6 = &
56 72.9 94.3 72.9 94.3 72.9 94.3 alnh N
36 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 = % o5 b
pr} <t |
40 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 T 0 g
44 85.0 145.0 85.0 145.0 85.0 110.0 S| z ¢
108 Sizzlbp
48 85.0 145.0 85.0 140.6 85.0 110.0 © .9
50 81.6 105.6 81.6 105.6 81.6 105.6 Qln 3 2 ~
M _—
53 77.0 99.6 77.0 996 | 77.0 99.6 HWss g
36 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 | 850 110.0 =
40 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 M) h
44 14 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 "
48 85.0 110.0 85.0 1100 | 85.0 110.0 2lzl &
(e}
50 81.6 105.6 81.6 105.6 81.6 105.6 2 § 0 6
36 85.0 110.0 85.0 1100 | 85.0 110.0 SEMEE
S EL
40 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 L51S &1 5w
120 S lxlzglZ
44 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 SEI AR
nie ! .
48 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 Q2o
Oimi |k Z
>
POy
2 MEENE
olrivin| ol
= HO O N
SRR
gg winlo I_)
[
& o
T g
HE e !— E
e | % 2°
- . X
NOTE: S 516
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE r—
win .
BASED ON ASTM E1300-08 (3 SEC. GUSTS) g no
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION W11—41
DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAQ5-DEC-219 e
sheet 4 of 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


at

[T

|

EXTERIOR

INTERLOCK

OPTION #3

ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILE

STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK
ALUMINUM REINFORCING AT ASTRAGAL

s @
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY — PSF Y @ i}
ING A AG <+
PRODUCT RENEWED REINFORC T INTERLOCK & ASTRAGAL m i
as complying with the Florida GLASS TYPE N s
Building Code PANEL WIDTH| DOOR FRAME e~
- - oy o~
NOA-No. 24-0312.03 NOMINAL HEIGHT Eim(ss) TYI::IT AZ : gTLAs(s)TTSf (B) EXTB(R)EVEIESEE : g e % Z
INCHES INCHES XT. (+ . (- EXT. (+ L= . {+) ] INT. (~ & <
Expiration Date 09/05/2029 E& g
—_— 36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 <: = Qe
T 40 85.0 1300 | 850 | 1300 | 850 | 1100 €3,383
Miami-Dade Product Control 44 85.0 130.0 850 | 1300 | 850 | 110.0 0@y ~e
W ;
48 5 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 & G w g
ODUCT REVISED 50 81.6 124.8 81.6 124.8 81.6 105.6 o5 g =
PRODU =
as complying with the Florida 53 77.0 117.7 77.0 117.7 77.0 99.6 032 w o
Building Code 56 72.9 111.4 72.9 111.4 72.9 94.3 oSz g
NOA-No. 23-0724.15 60 68.0 104.0 68.0 1040 | 680 88.0 OQaogd
Expiration Date09/05/2024 36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 | 85.0 110.0 g g E g 3
[+ 4 o
By st | Lhmnk 40 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 < L 5 g g
Miami-Dade Product Control 44 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 Lz g 8
48 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 -t 80g
96 G35 E
50 81.6 124.8 81.6 124.8 B81.6 105.6 )
G—
53 77.0 117.7 77.0 117.7 77.0 99.6 T
56 72.9 111.4 72.9 111.4 72.9 94.3 Z ©
60 68.0 104.0 68.0 104.0 68.0 88.0 = o
{
36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 & s
40 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 < ©
44 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 9 §
48 102 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 g ~
50 81.6 124.8 816 | 1248 | 816 | 1056 !9 o2
53 77.0 117.7 77.0 117.7 77.0 99.6 £ - &
56 72.9 111.4 72.9 111.4 72.9 94.3 ZARGRT N
36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 = (;) @ - u"?
40 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 = a ™ ®
44 85.0 130.0 85.0 1300 | 85.0 110.0 g Z z j©
108 SiI2FL g
48 85.0 125.7 85.0 125.7 85.0 110.0 <£!> .8
50 81.6 124.8 81.6 124.8 81.6 105.6 Liln 3 = ~
53 77.0 117.7 770 | 1177 | 770 99.6 & 8=
36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 —
40 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 -
44 14 85.0 125.2 85.0 125.2 85.0 110.0 .
48 85.0 117.3 85.0 117.3 | 85.0 110.0 gzl &
o
50 81.6 105.6 81.6 1056 | 81.6 105.6 I
36 85.0 130.0 85.0 130.0 85.0 110.0 gé MEE
X
40 120 85.0 126.7 85.0 126.7 85.0 110.0 =] S & HE
oo x zZ
44 85.0 117.6 85.0 117.6 85.0 110.0 58 § z
o .
48 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 85.0 110.0 OIF 1z Elg
MOimixiw| 2
>
O
o) TSR
S EE
20/513/8]5
>
\f‘__)) 8 wilw ojx
<
n
8 g
5 =
sl B
j Proam g 2l <
NOTE: Ve 3 5|2
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE ——
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS) drawing - no.
AND FLORIDA BUILDING COMMISSION W11—41

DECLARATORY STATEMENT DCAO5-DEC-219



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


HEAD ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

SILL ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY - PSF

ANCHOR TYPE ‘A’ | ANCHOR TYPE ‘B’ | ANCHOR TYPE 'C’ ANCHOR TYPE 'B’
6 ANCHORS | 7 ANCHORS & ANCHORS 6 ANCHORS 4 ANCHORS | 5 ANCHORS
AVERAGE | DOOR FRAME! AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AT MTG. AVERAGE | DOOR FRaME] AT MTG. AT MTG.
PANEL WIDTH!  HEIGHT STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS STILE ENDS STILE ENDS PANEL WIDTH|  HEIGHT STILE ENDS | STILE ENDS
INCHES INCHES INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INT. (=) INCHES INCHES INT. (~) INT. (-)
30 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 30 145.0 145.0
36 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 36 145.0 145.0
40 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 40 145.0 145.0
42 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 42 145.0 145.0
44 82 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 44 82 145.0 145.0
48 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 48 145.0 145.0
50 139.2 139.2 139.2 139.2 50 139.2 139.2
53 131.3 131.3 131.3 131.3 53 131.3 131.3
56 124.3 124.3 124.3 124.3 56 124.3 124.3
60 116.0 116.0 116.0 116.0 60 116.0 116.0
30 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 30 145.0 145.0
36 145.0 145.0 145.0 145.0 36 145.0 145.0
40 135.9 145.0 145.0 145.0 40 145.0 145.0
42 131.1 145.0 145.0 145.0 42 142.6 145.0
44 96 126.8 145.0 145.0 145.0 44 96 138.0 145.0
48 119.5 139.4 145.0 145.0 48 130.0 145.0
50 116.3 135.7 139.2 139.2 50 126.6 139.2
53 1121 130.0 131.3 131.3 53 122.0 131.3
56 94.3 94.3 94.3 94.3 56 94.3 94.3
60 88.0 88.0 88.0 88.0 80 88.0 88.0
30 130.0 130.0 130.0 130.0 30 130.0 130.0
36 130.0 130.0 130.0 130.0 36 130.0 130.0
40 125.9 130.0 130.0 130.0 40 130.0 130.0
42 102 121.4 130.0 130.0 130.0 42 102 130.0 130.0
44 117.3 130.0 130.0 130.0 44 127.8 130.0
48 110.3 128.7 130.0 130.0 48 120.0 130.0
50 107.3 125.1 130.0 130.0 50 116.7 130.0
53 99.6 99.6 99.6 99.6 53 99.6 99.6
56 94.3 94.3 94.3 94.3 56 94.3 94.3
30 130.0 130.0 130.0 130.0 30 130.0 130.0
36 127.5 130.0 130.0 130.0 36 130.0 130.0
40 117.3 130.0 130.0 130.0 40 127.6 130.0
42 108 113.0 130.0 130.0 130.0 42 108 123.0 130.0
44 109.1 127.3 130.0 130.0 44 118.7 130.0
48 102.4 119.5 130.0 130.0 48 111.4 130.0
50 9g8.5 105.6 105.6 105.6 50 105.6 105.6
53 95.6 99.6 399.6 99.6 53 99.6 99.6
30 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 30 110.0 110.0
36 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 386 110.0 110.0
40 108.8 110.0 110.0 110.0 40 110.0 110.0
42 114 105.7 110.0 110.0 110.0 42 114 110.0 110.0
44 102.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 44 110.0 110.0
48 95.6 110.0 110.0 110.0 48 104.0 110.0
50 92.8 108.3 110.0 110.0 50 101.0 110.0
30 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 30 110.0 110.0
36 110.0 110.0 110.0 110.0 36 110.0 110.0
40 103.2 110.0 110.0 110.0 40 110.0 110.0
42 120 99.3 110.0 110.0 110.0 42 120 108.1 110.0
44 95.8 110.0 110.0 110.0 44 104.2 110.0
48 89.6 104.6 110.0 110.0 48 97.5 110.0
EXT.(+) Dp = 85 PSF MAX. NOTE:

SEE SHEETS 3 THRU 5 FOR

TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

T, T o —ATHEAD— — — —
I TYPE ‘A'— 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)

} INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES
1=1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

{ THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONCRETE
1-1/2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE

| TYPE ‘B'~ 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=164 KS|, Fy=148 KSI)
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE
| 1-1/2" MIN. EMBED

| TYPE 'C'~ #14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO MIAMI~DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS
OR
J INTO METAL STRUCTURES
(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS
ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063—T5 MIN.)
STEEL: 1/8" THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)

_—— — — —AT SILL — — — — —

| TYPE ‘B'~ 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI)
DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE
1-3/4" MIN. EMBED

L (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) J

r — — —  —AT JAMBS~ — — — —
TYPE ‘A'— 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KS|)
INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES

1-1/2” MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD

THRU 1BY BUCKS INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS

| TYPE 'B'~ 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT' (Fu=164 KS|, Fy=148 KS)
| DIRECTLY INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS
; 1—=1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. OR BLOCKS

1 TYPE 'C'— #14 SMS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS (GRADE 2 CRS)
INTO MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED MULLIONS
OR

| INTO METAL STRUCTURES

(3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS
] ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063-T5 MIN.)

STEEL: 1/8” THK. MIN. (Fy = 36 KSI MIN.)

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By 1 9[/\‘1‘2 [ [%nﬁg
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By J QL@? [ Zé’rm}e
Miami-Dade Product Control

|
|

L (STEEL IN CONTACT WITH ALUMINUM TO BE PLATED OR PAINTED) _J

ANCHOR EDGE DISTANCES

INTO CONCRETE = 2-1/2" MIN.
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1" MIN.
INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 3/4” MIN.

WOOD AT HEAD OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN.
CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PS! MIN.
C—-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PS! MIN.

DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY OF DESIRED GLASS SIZE.

USING CHART ON THIS SHEET SELECT ANCHOR OPTION WITH DESIGN RATING MORE THAN
DESIGN LOADS REQUIRED.
LOWER DESIGN PRESSURES FROM GLASS OR HEAD, SILL, JAMB ANCHOR CHARTS WILL
APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

‘‘‘‘‘‘‘
®o

Oigpl. B

Ly

f
C

COMP—ANL\W11-41ES))

a

(C.AN. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173
TEL. (305) 264-8100

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION

ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT

LQSGO SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

|

FAX. (305) 638—-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

LSERIES—BOOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.L)

|

|

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

byTdescription

E i01.15.18
F 103.07.18

G 106.21.21
H 107.14.23

(revisions:
no[ date

-

07-22-1

date:

S
drawing no.

W11—-41



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


2 5/16" MIN.

CONC.
3 KSI MIN.

EDGE_DIST. -4

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 6 FOR CAPACITY

1BY WOOD BUCK . |

SEE NOTE SHEET .8

—— )

1

1 O

)

4,

SHIM

1/4" MAX.

A

/@ - -\\/\/-
B

©

3.500

g -

@ 4

-
o
o
Lad [
X
o 2 g &
= I o o
3 _ ~
w % 5‘ &
£ai
g :
bt "
=
walld
s s/
T % W2 .
>3 s EDGE "DIST, . 4

a4
S POURED & HARDENED
A,\‘“\H!GH STRENGTH GROUT

NOT BY 'E.S. WINDOWS’
(5 KSI MIN.)

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN—LINE CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 6 FOR CAPACITY

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03

Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By ‘QL@? [ 14‘“’139
Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By 19L\=7 l. £ hanl
Miami-Dade Product Control

SEALANT:

ALL JOINTS AND FRAME CONNECTIONS SEALED WITH
WHITE /ALUMINUM COLORED SILICONE.

WEEPHOLES:

W1 = 2-5/8" LONG WEEP NOTCH AT EACH END
W2 = 1" LONG WEEP NOTCH AT EACH END

f
C

COMP—ANL\W11-41ES )

a

(C.AN. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

f

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

 SERIES-6000 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LML)

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

byTdescription

(revisions:
(nol date
£ ]01.15.18
F 03.07.18
G [06.21.21
H [07.14.23

.

|

07-22-11

hk. by:

=4
4
<
=
b
a
-
°

!
!
E
i
|

Lo J

date:

drawing no.

W11-41



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


EXTERIOR

:

Y WOOD BUYCK

EDGE DIST.

WOOD STRUCTURE

N
7>

i

LI T [l

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET & FOR CAPACITY

1/4" MAX.
SHIM

a
—>

_EDGE DISA.
r-3

a 4 s

v

BET
4

<

METAL STRUCTURE
SEE SPEC
ON SHEET 6

EDGE DIST.

SHIM
Y A" —
_J

1 1

|

o —
— N Tl

EXTERIOR

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET & FOR CAPACITY

1
f ]

</
7 1
wﬂhww%EL_J

jﬁw

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 6 FOR CAPACITY

EXTERIOR
1/4" MAX.
SHIM

PRODUCT REVISED EDGE DIST.
PRODUCT RENEWED as complying with the Florida =1
as complying with the Florida Building Code MIAMI-DADE COUNTY /+\ /i\
Building Code NOA-No. 23-0724.15 APPR'D MULLION E |
NOA-No. 24-0312.03 SEE SEPARATE NOA ; |
Expiration Date09/05/2024 n T
Expiration Date 09/05/2029 lL_J I____(;g Uy BUH WWL——]

By 19L\<? . é//’mJA

By 1 9[/\“‘2 ! Zé’mﬁé
Miami-Dade Product Control

Miami-Dade Product Control

EXTERIOR

TYPICAL ANCHORS

IN STAGGERED CLUSTERS AT
INTERLOCK /ASTRAGAL ENDS
& IN PAIRS AT FRAME

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING AND
SHEET 8 FOR CAPACITY

PROPERLY SECURED 1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURES NOT BY 'E.S. WINDOWS'
MUST SUPPORT LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM AND TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING
STRUCTURE.

%
WV
<+
© =
— )=
2 SR~
O 28|2
% Q<
E& .8
o
<E Z.NE
gL 383
Ol glo
oo ¢
>« ;
Loy %
F o r
=3
3u8
ui vl
8>m
CSsmo
r S
0Eds:
R
ﬂ:ngw
gUSL 5
u'“-‘(h_'o
tZOE@
285
g Loz ¥
p—
[
R
= 2
= BI
o [29]
o "
< @O
D ~~
[’p]
[95]
2 3
p—g
CHO 5
[ <
& || -
=4 e v
[=] o
= -~ =
Sl E LR
=z T8
219+
<0 ®
I EET
%;Z )
i - 3
7] O 5 >
Ling 2
gl gusd
% M=
CTTTTTTTTTTTTTD
£
i
oll 5
algl ¢
S
55|22
SRR
_‘,‘om()g
Q‘XO:;(JZ
Lo\a‘-’..<(
HHEEE
853:
olm BB 2
>
o
@w"-".?&'&?
O-bJﬂf\P'd‘
Qlo|~|olni=
2I°5|818|5
égu'“'ux,
(—Q
- i
N ol
R z |
5 =
w12
& e
3 55
| R
drawing no.

sheet 8 of 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


1/4" MAX.
SHIM 3

PANEL WIDTH

2BY WOOD BUCK/| |
OR
WOQD STRUCTU

2 5/16
STAGGERED

PRODUCT REVISED

Building Code
NOA-No.

By |9L\<7 I. £Aand.

@

@

D.L.O.

PANEL WIDTH

INTERLOCK
(ALUM REINF.
OPTION SHOWN)

DOOR FRAME WIDTH

ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILE

EXTERIOR

INTERLOCK
(STEEL REINF.
OPTION SHOWN)

PANEL WIDTH

TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

©

ALUMINUM OR STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK AND ALUM REINF. ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILES
SHOWN FOR ILLUSTRATION ONLY.
USE AS SHOWN ON SHEETS 4 & 5.
SEE CHARTS FOR REINFORCING OPTIONS LOAD CAPACITY, INCLUDING GLASS OPTIONS.
SEE ELEVATION FOR ANCHOR SPACING AND SHEET & FOR ANCHOR CAPACITY.

1/4" MAX.
SHIM 38 ALTERNATE
28y WOOD BUCK /| | =

OR
WOQD STRUCTU

0 P —

2 5/16
STAGGERED |

ooyl rEnlen I ]

|

TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

EXT.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03
Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By l;LF? [ éé‘mlc.

Miami-Dade Product Control

")

ALTERNATE

&

1/4” MAX.
SHIM

&

- 25/16
STAGGERED

@ 1/4" MAX.

D.L.O.

SHIM

R
0
w2
as complying with the Florida & ¥
e — i
23-0724.15 > e 5
P~
Expiration Date09/05/2024 6. §$§
mm F
e =8|
Miami-Dade Product Control g a3 & g
OOE,O (&
Oagd ¢
Lo X
W <
FoE u
= D
Qoap
o843
OS¢
=)
0Edg:
HiE
mu:zg“‘
qUSL 5
ul‘é‘(ﬁ_'o
t 205 0
2882
Loz &
p—
| G
(T
= 3
= O
o @
o )
O (o]
O Lol
7 3
TYPICAL ANCHORS IN PAIRS % N2
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING GRS R
ALSO SEE SHEET 6 M- 2
O Ll W
= -
=] o
3 =
i F LN
S19< 0
L0 "y
= Z;gi
b ==L 3
i -3
g =
El oz d
% M=
|
=
4
28 s
¥ 23&%
[N o z|G|Gin
S P o §2= 2%
T 5520w
LGQO al el a8
@ AL
S olg T X
% » g&a@“
are SIEIEAEE
i) >
N =
- 0 IR
R gleis 5|88
. ol |ala|
» 2I°5]8/8|8
égmuom
 C—
0
o~
o~
Ky
o .
2
: g
AR
drawing no.

(sheet 9 oi13)



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


TYPICAL ANCHORS
IN DIAGONAL PAIRS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

gz

©

©

TYPICAL ANCHORS iN PAIRS

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING

1/4” SHIM
MAX.
: 1/4" MAX.
64p (15) SEE B.OM. AT SHEET 11 SHIM

Lol

RSl

DR I —— e

RM??UM&U

f@

) ﬂlmr—’j

e SR 1

ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILE

O0XO CONFIGURATION
DOOR_FRAME WIDTH

INTERLOCK

SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
1/4” SHIM

MAX.

f“

]
3 4
&
N .A'
. 4 /
’5 p&
o
& a
o &
ud
A /
T a
s —
1BY WOOD BUCK
SEE NOTE SHEET 8
TYPICAL ANCHORS
IN DIAGONAL PAIRS
é
Y- -3
R «
N %
. 3
‘(7). a4 b.
a .
Lot ‘4'
4 .
4
PO —

EXT.

EXTERIOR

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03
Expiration Date 09/05/2029
By |9L\47 |. £ hanl

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED
as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By 19{«47 l. L han
Miami-Dade Product Control

METAL STRUCTURE

EDGE DIST.

SEE SPEC.
ON SHEET 6

ALUMINUM AND STEEL REINFORCING AT INTERLOCK AND ASTRAGAL/LOCK STILES
SHOWN FOR JLLUSTRATION ONLY.
USE AS SHOWN ON SHEETS 4 & 5.
SEE CHARTS FOR REINFORCING OPTIONS LOAD CAPACITY, INCLUDING GLASS OPTIONS.
SEE ELEVATION FOR ANCHOR SPACING AND SHEET & FOR ANCHOR CAPACITY.

a
(C.A.N. 3538) fc
COMP—ANL\W11-41ES )

FAX. (308) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

=

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

{SERIES—SOOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.I

Qﬂw

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

E {01.15.18
F {03.07.18

G [06.21.21
H 107.14.23

(revisions:
nol date

07-22-11

chk. by:

date:

(T T
drawing no.

W11—-41



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


ITEM # PART # QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION MATERIAL | MANF./SUPPLIER/REMARKS
ES-6001 1 FRAME HEAD 6005-T5 | —
2 ES~-6023 1 FRAME SILL — 3-1/2" 6005-T5 | —
3 ES—6003 2 FRAME JAMB 6063-T6 | —
3A ES6030 2 ALTERNATE FRAME JAMB 6063-T6 | —
4 ES-6000—040 2/ PANEL |TOP RAIL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
4A ES-6004 2/ PANEL | TOP RAIL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
5 ES—-6000-041 2/ PANEL | BOTTOM RAIL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | ~
5A ES—6005 2/ PANEL | BOTTOM RAIL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
13 ES—-6000-042 AS REQD. |LOCK STILE (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
6A ES—6006 AS REQD. |LOCK STILE (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | -
7 ES-6000-043 AS REQD. |INTERLOCK (LAM. GLASS) 6063-76 | -
7A £S—-6007 AS REQD. |INTERLOCK (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 606316 | —
8 £S-6000-044 AS REQD. |FEMALE ASTRAGAL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
8A ES—6008 AS REQD. |FEMALE ASTRAGAL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-76 | —
9 ES—6500-GO1A 4/ PANEL | GLAZING GASKET (LAM. GLASS) SILICONE | DUROMETER 6545 SHORE A, EXTRUSIONES S.A.
11 £S-6016 4/ PANEL | PANEL GUIDE (TOP ONLY) CELCON | LOCATED AT PANEL ENDS
12 ES—6015 2/ PANEL |FIXED PANEL BOTTOM CLIP , 7" LONG MIN. 6063-T6 | SECURE W/ (2) #8 X 3/4” FH SMS
13 ES—-6010 2/ PANEL | RETAINER CLIP, 8" LONG 6005-T5 | AT MTG. RAIL HEAD & SILL ENDS
14 ES—6011 2/ JAMB | JAMB SCREW COVER 6063-T5 | OPTIONAL
15 ES-6014 AS REQD. |FIXED PANEL CLIP, 4 LONG 6063-T6 | AT 20" FROM EACH END AND 27" 0.C. MAX.
16 ES-6012 AS REQD. |INTERLOCK STIFFENER (LENGTH = PANEL HT. — 2-3/8") 6063-T6 | —
17 £S-6013 AS REQD. |ASTRAGAL STIFFENER (LENGTH = PANEL HT. — 2-3/8") 6063-T6 | —
18 1" X 2" %X 3/18" AS REQD. |STEEL TUBE REINFORCING (LENGTH = PANEL HT. — 2-3/8") A36 STEEL |TG BE PAINTED
21 W222521K AS REQD. |[STILE & JAMB W'STRIPPING - ULTRAFAB
22 W223221K AS REQD. |TOP RAIL PILE WSTRIPPING - ULTRAFAB
23 ES-6027 AS REQD. |BOTTOM RAIL W'STRIPPING EPDM DUROMETER 75+4 SHORE A
24 #10 X 1-1/2" PH SMS 8/ PANEL | PANEL ASSY SCREWS - -
25 #10 X 1" PH SMS 2/ CORNER | FRAME ASSY SCREWS - -
26 GTT-354/460~A 2/ MOV. PANEL| TANDEM ACETAL WHEELS IN METALLIC HOUSING - PABOSE
27 1/4-20 X 1-3/4" PH MS| 2/ ROLLER | ROLLER INST. SCREWS - -
28 191056 1/ MOV. PANEL| STD. MORTISE LOCK, AT 40" FROM BOTTOM ST. STEEL |INTERLOCK (ASSA ABLOY)
28A 191014 1/ MOV. PANEL| MULTI POINT MORTISE LOCK, AT 40" FROM BOTTOM ST. STEEL |INTERLOCK (ASSA ABLOY)
29 #10-24 X 3/8" PH MS 2/ LOCK | LOCK INSTALLATION SCREW ST. STEEL |-
30 191018 1/ LOCK | LOCK KEEPER (STD. LOCK), AT 48—1/2" FROM BOTTOM PLATED STEEL| INTERLOCK (ASSA ABLOY)
30A 191040 1/ LOCK | LOCK KEEPER (MULTI POINT LOCK), AT 48-1/2" FROM BOTTOM | ST. STEEL | INTERLOCK {ASSA ABLOY)
31 #10 X 5/8”" PH SMS B 2/ LOCK | LOCK KEEPER MOUNT. SCREW (STD. LOCK) ST. STEEL |-
31A #8 X 3/4" FH SMS 4/ LOCK | LOCK KEEPER MOUNT. SCREW (MULTI POINT LOCK) ST. STEEL | -
32 #6237 1/ LOCK | INTERIOR AND EXTERIOR PULL - (3) #6-32 X 1/2” FH MS, ST. STEEL
34 #10 X 3/4” PH SDS 2/ CUP | FIXED PANEL CLIP FASTENER ST. STEEL | -
34A #10 X 3/4" PH SDS 2/ CLIP | FIXED PANEL CLIP FASTENER ST. STEEL | -
35 - AS REQD. | 1"X4” LONG SELF ADHESIVE PILE PAD WOOLPILE | AT HEAD AND SILL
37 ES-6019 AS REQD. | RESTRAINING PLATE NYLON | AT TOP & BOTT. INTERLOCKS & ASTRAGAL
38 #8 X 3/4” FH SMS 2/ PLATE | RESTRAINING PLATE FASTENER - -
39 ES-4013 AS REQD. | GLAZING WEDGE - -
41 ES—4014 AS REQD. | BOTTOM RAIL GLASS STOP EPDM DUROMETER 684 SHORE A
42 ES—4018 AS REQD. |TOP RAIL & STILES GLASS STOP EPDM DUROMETER 754 SHORE A
43 - AS REQD. |1/4” X 1/4” GLAZING TAPE FOAM -
44 - 2/ UTE | SETTING BLOCK, 1” X 1/8" X 2-1/2" LONG EPDM DUROMETER 80%5 SHORE A

LATCHES:
LIMIT ITEMS 28 AND 30 FOR USE WITH DOORS WITHOUT REINFORCING OPTION 1.
ITEMS 28A AND 30A CAN BE USED FOR ALL DOORS WITH OR WITHOUT REINFORCINGS.

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03
Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By J 9¢\<7 l. Lhan

Miami-Dade Product Control

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By 1;L@7 l. £ hanl
Miami-Dade Product Control

LSER!ES——GOOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.[.)}

|

(revisions:

a
(CA.N. 3538) fc
COMP—ANL\W11—41ES )

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

|

(

REV., PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

byl description

£ 101.15.18
F 103.07.18

G {06.21.21
H [07.14.23

nol date

-

07-22-11

o
o
<C
s
>
Fe)
[
©

date:
chk. by:

SRR
drawing no.

W11-41

sheet 11013



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


2.078

I 6.135 3.750 ' 3.687 o 1,437 —f
e | |
094 _ r — -
rw N pp— 054
’ % T 125
1.500 078 1.750 1.750 [[j :
078 TYP. | 2.250
1.125 1.875 ‘ I o7 e, a5
J— L— 078 || 1| 419 o ™
TYP. 3 L T i
O FRAME HEAD ® LOCK STILE LOCK STILE 188
(LAM. GLASS) (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) @ 6.057
1546 1 546 s ASTRAGAL STIFFENER
31 ‘
3.250 90
} i — 1.002 -
T 7 188
094 094 078
- F125 ] L
1.749 [E 1.749 R e — )]
2.562 2.562 2.312 2.312 I
078 078 =t 203
3.563 e 3.500 Tve. 419 ] 1.499
? 125 R ==
u M ? JA— ﬂ}{ Lﬂ_'375
o 1.984 ———on 1.984
2.047 @
P q @ INTERLOCK STILE INTERLOCK STILE FRAME JAMB
E— T (LAM. GLASS) (INSUL. LAM. GLASS)
ks 212 (®)TERLOCK STIFFENER 1 788
4.375 ’ 4. :
(3) PANEL TOP RAlL PANEL TOP RAIL 1000
(LAM. GLASS) (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 094 ] [ 09 GTM’J .
R i 641 -
) Ll ! 1
o e % /-——JMWJT ? '
T T dl
1.750 [ 1.750 2000 1.709
! 188~}
e e WEH 2 — (09 Fixep PANEL oL
4,441 (I — 419 4.441 | L
3.500
3803 L = = = 078 Al o7s INTERLOCK REINFORCING I‘”‘WT
2.562 2.562 T e TYP. . —
078 || 078 || 551
TYP. TYP. 287 . g
125 125 j I‘” e 770
— I L - o |
é : .040 711
——1.546 —= ——1.546— 3.374 3.374 (9 GLAZING GASKET
(LAMINATED GLASS)
PANEL BOTTOM RAIL PANEL BOTTOM RAIL ASTRAGAL STILE ASTRAGAL STILE
> {LAM. GLASS) @ (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) @ (LAM. GLASS) (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) SCREW COVER BASE POLYMER = EPDM RUBBER
T T DENSITY = 10.26 Lbs/Gal
375~ PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED HARDNESS = 705
’ T” as complying with the Florida as complying with the Florida TENSILE STRENGTH = 905 PSI
ﬁ}*# Building Code Building Code ELONGATION AT BREAK = 273%
«T 1.000 {c ﬁt o 250 NOA-No. 24-0312.03 NOA-No. 23-0724.15 TEAR STRENGTH = 1.343 Kip/ft
o BRITTLENESS TEMPERATURE = —40° F
— ~ Expiration Date09/05/2029 Expiration Date09/05/2024 COMPRESSION SET = 27% (22h@158F)
094 —_——
e T @ By 19L\4? l. Lhan, By lghasg |. Lhande
Miami-Dade Product Control 1.104—~ Miami-Dade Product Control
3.500 1.500 'ﬁ
3.000 l 385
125 QYOPO Al f
685 iﬁ ‘ii Al W © 1.750 iy anaa
i o I LU u y i 202
! 6.151

O,

FRAME SILL

&)

RESTRAINING PLATE

©)

RETAINER CLIP

@ FIX. PANEL BOTTOM CLIP

f
C

COMP~ANL\W11—41ES )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

(SER!ES—GOOO ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (L.M.L)

JH(

J

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by Tdescription

E {01.15.18
F 103.07.18
G |06.21.21

H {07.14.23

(no] date

N(revisions:

07-22-11

date:

drawing

W11-41

chk. by:

no.

sheet 12 of 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


f PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0312.03
Expiration Date 09/05/2029

By 19L\=7 l. £Ahande

M

N Miami-Dade Product Control

C

N

PANEL TOP CORNER
INSUL. LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SHOWN)
LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SIMILAR)

3

1

PA TTOM CORNE
INSUL. LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SHOWN)
LAM. GLASS RAIL & STILE (SIMILAR)

AN

FRAME _TOP CORNER

FRAM

RNER

r’—1.437~—‘>

1.999
124
| S
6.057
078
1.999
L 082
TYP.
t::éa B
i SR e

ALT. FRAME JAMB

PRODUCT REVISED

as complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0724.15
Expiration Date09/05/2024

By }9%7 l. £ hand
Miami-Dade Product Control

J C
COMP—ANL\W11—41ES )

a

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (308) 264-8100

|

|

FAX. (305) 638~5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAML, FL. 33142

[ SERIES-6000 ALUM SLIDING GLASS DOOR (LML)
TEL. (308) 638-5151

|

)

REV. PER RER COMMENTS

3 TRACK OPTION ADDED
EDITORIAL CHANGES

NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by description

E |01.15.18
F 103.07.18

G 108.21.21
H 107.14.23

(revisions:
nol date
UL

07-22-11

dr. by: TARIQ

date:
chk. by:

——
drawing no.

W11-—41
sheet 13 0f 13



Ishaq Chanda
New Stamp


	w24031203Ren 23072415
	11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208
	DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER)

	23072415dwg

