MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590 F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LLC
3550 NW 49" Street
Miami, FL 33142

Scork:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER-
Product Control Section to be used in Miami-Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami-Dade County) and/ or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami-Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material failsto perform
in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately
revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right
to revoke this acceptance if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product
or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Clipped, Extruded Aluminum Tube Mullion — L.M.L.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. M04-04, titled “Aluminum Tube Mullions”, sheets 1 through 9
of 9, dated 04/26/04, with revision J dated 06/29/23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by
Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product Control Renewal stamp with the Notice of
Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant

LLABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Colombia, model/series, and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", unless
otherwise noted herein.

RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.

TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in
the materials, use, and/ or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of
any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.
ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.

INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors
and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.

This NOA renews NOA No. 23-0717.20 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2 and E-3, as
well as approval document mentioned above.

The submitted documentation was reviewed by Manuel Perez, P.E.

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY o .NOA No. 24-0312.06
Expiration Date: September 16,2029
Approval Date: May 09, 2024

5/2/24 Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LLC

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s
DRAWINGS

1.

2.

Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.

(Submitted under NOA No. 04-0712.01)

Drawing No. M04-04, titled “Aluminum Tube Mullions”, sheets 1 through 9 of 9,
dated 04/26/04, with revision J dated 06/29/23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation,
signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0717.20)

TESTS

1.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC TAS 202-94
3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94
4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94
5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
6) Forced Entry Test, Type “D-A” fixed window, Grade 10, Level LV
1 per ASTM F 588-04, Side-Hinged Door Systems per AAMA 1304-
02 and per FBC 2411.3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of windows mulled together,
prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Reports No. FTL-3810, dated
05/16/03; FTL-3819, dated 06/09/03 and FTL-3820, dated 06/09/03, all signed and
sealed by Joseph Chan, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 04-0712.01)

CALCULATIONS

1.

Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 6%
Edition (2017), dated 01/12/18, and updated on 11/04/20 to comply with FBC 7%
Edition (2020), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq,
P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-1118.13)

QUALITY ASSURANCE

1.

Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1.

None.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exapai
NOA No. 24-0312.0
Expiration Date: September 16, 9
Approval Date: May 09,2024




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)
F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7% Edition (2020), with FBC
8™ Edition (2023), and of no financial interest, dated July 14, 2023, issued by Al-
Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0717.20)
2. Laboratory compliance letter for Test Reports No. FTL-3810, dated 05/16/03;
FTL-3819, dated 06/09/03 and FTL-3820, dated 06/09/03, all issued by Fenestration
Testing Laboratory, Inc. and all signed and sealed by Joseph C. Chan, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 04-0712.01)

G. OTHERS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-1118.13, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Clipped,

Extruded Aluminum Tube Mullion - L.M.1., approved on 02/18/21 and expiring on
09/16/24.

Wanuel, 2
Manuel Petez, P.E.

Product Control Exapai
NOA No. 24-0312.0

Expiration Date: September 16, 9
Approval Date: May 09, 2024




E.S. Windows, LLC

(]

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED
DRAWINGS
1. None.

TESTS
1. None.

CALCULATIONS
1. None.

QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. None.
STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 8™ Edition (2023) and of no

financial interest, dated March 7, 2024, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and
sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 230717.20, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Clipped,
Extruded Aluminum Tube Mullion - L.M.1., approved on 08/24/23 and expiring on
09/16/24.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exapai
NOA No. 24-0312.0
Expiration Date: September 16, 9
Approval Date: May 09, 2024




S —— -
o PIN
i (N7
i
N
::::..“.WL
L:::::_Tr_..._.
3.000 . i
{<
L.—:::.'—’_LJ::
4.000 "

TYPICAL

MULLION SYSTEM IS RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT.
AND CAN BE USED WITH ALL MIAMI—DADE COUNTY APPROVED 5.000
IMPACT AND NON—IMPACT RESISTANT PRODUCTS. l

6.000
RECTANGULAR ALUMINUM TUBE MULLIONS

USING MULLION PROPERTIES ONLY

NOTES:

THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION)/2023 (8TH EDITION) FLORIDA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

ALL GLAZING PRODUCTS USED WITH THESE MULLIONS MUST MEET THE
APPLICABLE BUILDING CODE REQUIREMENTS LE: WIND LOAD, WATER
INFILTRATION, FORCED ENTRY RESISTANCE, SAFEGUARDS ETC.

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT LOADS
TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON-METALLIC AND NON--COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020/2023 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING AROUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON 'ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

INSTRUCTIONS:
USE CHARTS AND GRAPHS AS FOLLOWS.

DETERMINE DESIGN LOAD REQUIRED PER ASCE 7
FOR PARTICULAR OPENING.

USE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED GLAZING PRODUCTS
MEETING ABOVE LOAD REQUIREMENTS.

USE CONNECTION TO MULLION AS PER PRODUCT
APPROVAL.

USING CHARTS ON SHEET 3 SELECT MULLION SIZE WITH
DESIGN RATING MORE THAN DESIGN LOAD SPECIFIED
IN STEP 1 ABOVE.

USING ANCHOR TYPES ON SHEETS 5 THRU 9 AND ANCHOR CHARTS
ON SHEET 4, SELECT ANCHOR TYPE WITH DESIGN RATING
MORE THAN THE DESIGN LOADS SPECIFIED IN STEP 1 ABOVE.

STEP 1

STEP 2
STEP 3

STEP 4

STEP 5

2.000

WINDOW FRAME

TUBULAR SHAPES
ALLOY = 6063-T6

3.000

4.000

MULLIONS CONTAINING TYPICAL GLAZING PRODUCTS

HORIZONTAL OR VERTICAL

SEE WINDOW OR DOOR APPROVAL FOR FASTENERS SIZES AND SPACING

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

24-0312.06

Expiration Date: 09/16/2029
By?WWwém

MiamiéDade Producrt’CJntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

23-0717.20

Expiration Date: %9/1 6/2024
By?W M)‘

Miami/—_pade ProductControl

f
C

( 2
MULLION\MO4—04ESW )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-8100

|

)

LLC
FAX. (305) 638-5158

3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMLE, FL. 33142

ALUMINUM TUBE MULLIONS
TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS,

|

)

UPDATED TO 2014 FBC
UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
UPDATED TO 2023 FBC

by [description

11.05.20
J [06.29.23

G {07.14.14
H 101.17.18

i

(revisions:
(nol date

[

04—-26-04

o
4
<
=
=
)
[
©

date:
chk. by:

drawing no.

MO4—-04



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


»1 1.000 E{st
!

Ix = 950 N4

Sx = 634 IN\3

1 X3

STD. MULLION
606376

1 s

el o 125

4.000

= 2.037 IN\4
= 1.018 IN\3

1 X 4

STD. MULLION
6063-T6

i - 1.000 e
2.000 2.000
.323 )
: s 125 [‘250
at 1.000 r» ' I
2.000 ! }
.338 {.125
}
| |—-.125 !
4.000 =t
3.000
i | 6.000 6.000
338 .323 5000
f I e b 125 —o o 125 —ed o 250
Ix = 1.466 N\4 Ix = 2.975 m\4
Sx = .977 IN\3 Sx = 1.487 IN\3
1 X3 1 X 4
CUSTOM MULLION CUSTOM MULLION
6063-T6 6063-T6
2.000 ———er Ix = 5.204 w4 Ix = 8276 N4 Ix = 15.203 1N\4
éi-.izs Sx = 2.082 IN\3 Sx = 2.758 IN\3 Sx = 5068 iN\3
7
. 2,000 2 X5 2 X6 2 X6
l | 125
| i STD. MULLION STD. MULLION HEAVY MULLION
) 6063~T6 6063-T6 6063-T6
4.000 /} Q\
3.000 =125 1
156 TYP.—= f=—
125 fo 2.750 32%0
2.000 o 1.405
Ix = 1.467 m\4 Ix = 2.976 N4
Sx = .978 IN\3 Sx = 1.488 IN\3 c :
C
2 X3 2 X 4 L 3.750 } | 4500
STD. MULLION STD. MULLION - '
6063-T6 B063-T6 OPTIONAL ot
OPTIONAL
—od f=— 125
Ed = MIN. EDGE DIST. £d. Ed = MIN. EDGE DIST.
2.000 1/2" FOR 1/4" DIA. ANCHORS 1/2" FOR 1/4" DIA. ANCHORS
5/8" FOR 5/16" DIA. ANCHORS 5/8" FOR 5/16" DIA. ANCHORS
MULLION CLIP MULLION CLIP
6063-T6 6063-T6
L 2.000

Ed = MIN. EDGE DIST.
1/2" FOR 1/4" DIA. ANCHORS
5/8" FOR 5/16" DIA. ANCHORS

ANGLE CLIP

6063-T5

PRODUCT RENEWED

as complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.06

Expiration Date: 09/16/2029
Bf%%wﬂﬁﬁﬁﬂ

MiamiéDade Producrt’CJntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0717.20

Expiration Date: %9/1 6/2024
By?W M)‘

Miami/—_pade ProductControl

WYz
;U')
Led
<

(] 3

-/

S
Py
£ RI=
o 8 2z
= F mgo
b= o4
g 2 Z.NE)J
[ <&
Eoocd|®
Goa ¢
> o ;
Loy %
Fgor
e D
Qoap
ORud
o>(‘0
CSzeo
vl » 4 ©
Qa.agﬂ
il
Engu
WS g
u_gm..'c
r 203 2
wl O &
zm_m
€Gos ¥
f—
[
TN
[+9]
I
I
(V2] [£9]
prd 3
Q @
- (=}
-~ A
o i
E >
Q =
MEL"
m o
D -)“‘N
""gmv&;
=lo¥Y
ol Mg
ZlZ2z ;5°
= Soury
SIF=28
1 .83\/
<U2LQ$_J
W s P
C_TT D
£y
ol o I
gleig|e
¢ Nl
olo|8le
Sl L
Ololololy,
Fol e
QUnlolalz
SlEEef
2885
o3 31518
>
L0

A BEERE

O-(-Jﬁ‘l\l{)m

2o~ =lo|N

.;2"055:8

g\g@:{:_*;

,
<l .
I
S|
o™ i
4’ o~
3> .

. F
¥ |2 R
- <]
33 z

T ™Yy

drawing no.

sheet 2 of 9



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF (TUBE MULLIONS) DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF (TUBE MULLIONS) DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF (TUBE MULLIONS) [ “‘U %
CUSTOM|CUSTOM clusgro?’M CIUS)'(I‘04M cUSTOM clus)gr(fM m %
WINDOW DIMS. | x 3|1 x4 2x3]|2Xx4|2X5|2%6|2X6 WINDOW DIMS. 'y xs|1x4|2xX3|2xX4|2X5|2%x6|2X6 WINDOW DIMS. |y x 3|1 x4 2X3|2X4|2X5|2X6|2X6 P
WIDTH (W) |MULL SPAN| STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | HEAVY ||WIDTH (W) MULL SPAN| STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | HEAVY || WIDTH (W) MULL SPAN| STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | STD. | HEAVY | || 2 2RI
19-1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 75.3 | 143.0 | 116.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" - 382 | 275 | 559 | 977 | 150.0 | 150.0 o E 8 g P4
26-1/2" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" 543 | 1032 | 839 | 1466 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" - 27.6 - 403 | 705 | 1108 | 150.0 "<' g = % =
30 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" 480 | 911 | 741 | 1295 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 307 - 24.4 - 356 | 623 | 97.9 | 1500 &S, § g =
37" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 377 389 | 739 | 601 | 1050 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 37 - - - 28.9 | 50.5 | 79.3 | 145.1 OQmwgy ¢
42 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 427 343 | 651 | 529 | 925 | 1425 | 150.0 | 150.0 42 - - - 25.4 | 445 | 69.9 | 127.8 & E'g <
48" 38-3/8" | 140.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 48 74-1/4” | 300 | 570 | 463 | 81.0 | 1247 | 150.0 | 150.0 48 120" - - - 223 | 389 | 61.2 | 1119 0530
54" 1249 | 1500 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 54" 267 | 506 | 412 | 720 | 1108 | 1462 | 150.0 54 - - - - 346 | 544 | 994 024y
60" 1125 | 1500 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 60" 240 | 456 | 37.0 | 648 | 997 | 1316 | 150.0 60" - - - - 311 | 489 | 895 o X 2 ® g
66" 102.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 66" 218 | 414 | 337 | 589 | 90.7 | 119.6 | 150.0 66" - - - - 28.3 | 445 | 814 Qaog 4
72" 93.7 | 149.3 | 1420 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 72 200 | 380 | 309 | 540 | 831 | 1037 | 150.0 72" - - - - 26.0 | 408 | 746 g g 53) g 3
19-1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 52.0 | 110.4 | 80.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" - 287 | 207 | 420 | 734 | 1168 | 150.0 g n5T &
26-1/2" 1439 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26~1/2" 375 | 797 | 57.9 | 113.0 | 1500 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26~1/2" - 20.7 - 30.3 | 53.0 | 843 | 1500 i z 2 g8
30" 127.1 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30 332 | 704 | 51.2 | 998 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" - - - 26.8 | 468 | 744 | 1367 - 90
37" 103.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" 269 | 571 | 415 | 81.0 | 1256 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" - - - 21.7 | 379 | 603 | 1109 Lioas ¥ o
42 90.8 | 144.4 | 137.1 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 427 23.7 | 503 | 365 | 71.3 | 1106 | 1459 | 150.0 42" - - - - 334 | 532 | 977 ||= )
48” 50-5/8" | 79.4 | 126.4 | 119.9 | 150.0 | 1500 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 48" 847 207 | 440 | 320 | 624 | 968 | 127.6 | 150.0 48" 132" - - ~ - 29.3 | 465 | 855 8
547 70.6 | 112.3 | 106.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 54 - 39.1 | 284 | 555 | 86.0 | 1135 | 150.0 54" - - - - 26.0 | 414 | 760 " :';
60" 635 | 1011 | 959 | 144.4 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 60" - 352 | 256 | 499 | 77.4 | 102.1 | 150.0 60" - - - - 234 | 372 | 684 z 2
66" 578 | 91.9 | 87.2 | 131.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 66" - 320 | 233 | 454 | 704 | 92.8 | 150.0 66" - - - - 21.3 | 338 | 6241 Q o
72" 53.0 | 842 | 80.0 | 1204 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 72" - 29.3 | 213 | 416 | 645 | 851 | 1500 72" ~ - - - - 31.0 | 570 3 B
19-1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 348 | 747 | 538 | 1091 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" - - - 32.3 | 565 | 89.9 | 1500 g %
26-1/2" 108.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" 251 | 539 | 388 | 787 | 1332 | 1500 | 1500 || 26-1/2" - - - 233 | 408 | 649 | 1192 W O =
30” 95.9 | 150.0 | 144.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 307 222 | 476 | 343 | 696 | 117.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" - - - 206 | 360 | 57.3 | 1053 o|—
37 77.8 | 1236 | 117.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 377 - 38.6 | 278 | 56.4 | 954 | 1258 | 150.0 37 - - - - 29.2 | 465 | 854 2lih s
42 68.5 | 108.9 | 103.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 427 - 340 | 245 | 497 | 841 | 1108 | 150.0 42" - - - - 257 | 410 | 752 s % D50
48" 58" 600 | 953 | 90.4 | 1359 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 48" 96 - 29.8 | 21.4 | 435 | 735 | 97.0 | 150.0 48" 144" - - - - 225 | 358 | 658 ola Mg
54" 53.3 | 847 | 80.3 | 1208 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 54 - 26.5 - 38.6 | 654 | 8.2 | 150.0 54 - - - - 200 | 319 | 585 % g i o ;
60" 48.0 | 762 | 723 | 108.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 60" - 23.8 - 348 | 588 | 77.6 | 142.0 60 - - - - - 28.7 | 527 5 -
66" 436 | 69.3 | 657 | 98.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 66" - 21.6 - 316 | 535 | 705 | 129.0 66" - - - - - 26.1 | 479 z v § z
72 400 | 635 | 602 | 90.6 | 137.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 72" - - - 29.0 | 49.0 | 646 | 1183 72" - - - - - 23.9 | 439 W= E
19-1/8" 1233 | 1500 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" - 525 | 378 | 766 | 1340 | 1500 | 150.0 ——)
26-1/2" 89.0 | 1453 | 137.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" - 379 | 273 | 553 | 967 | 137.7 | 150.0 eI Ee o BE INSCRIBED HORIZONTAL MULLION | (f
30” 78.6 | 1284 | 121.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30” - 33.4 | 241 | 489 | 855 | 121.7 | 150.0 y
37" 63.7 | 104.1 | 98.3 | 148.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" - 27.1 - 39.6 | 69.3 | 987 | 150.0 ST AING | ! 888k
42" 56.1 | 91.7 | 86.6 | 130.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 42" - 23.9 - 349 | 61.0 | 869 | 150.0 VERTICAL N F’RODUCT‘\ R 33 lzlg -
48" 63" 491 | 802 | 758 | 114.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 48" 108" - 20.9 - 305 | 53.4 | 760 | 139.1 MULLION INE
54 437 | 713 | 67.4 | 1016 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 547 - - -~ 271 | 475 | 67.6 | 123.7 z NN
60" 393 | 642 | 806 | 915 | 139.7 | 1500 | 150.0 60" ~ - - 244 | 427 | 608 | 1113 GLAZING sLazng || SIZ SR
. PRODUCT PRODUCT =% ~ DIEIEIRo
66" 357 | 584 | 551 | 831 | 127.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 66 - - - 222 | 388 | 553 | 101.2 2 £ 5 5|5(5(2
727 327 | 535 | 505 | 762 | 116.4 | 1500 | 150.0 72" - ~ ~ 204 | 356 | 507 | 927 ot Il SaENe B
17 BRI
ALL LOADS ARE EXT.(+)/INT.(-). SIEIElE|8g
0w | 2055 -18
NOTE: | W1 i o e MULLION SPAN 8o~
MULLIONS RATED IN THESE CHARTS MAY BE ORIENTED PRODUCT RENEWED | —
VERTICALLY OR HORIZONTALLY. as complying with the Florida q
(INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS ALLOWED) NOANo. 24-0312.06 TYPICAL MULLION ARRANGEMENTS gl g
Expiration Date: 09/16/2029 PRODUCT REVISED 3 =0
o oo Ml Sy WOTH () = WLEU2 | g Eemelying with the Florids L
A!:lCH?RS TYPEI D" AND 'E° APPLICABLE TO Miamiépade produc,rm;ntrm NOA-No. 23-0717.20 3 jla )85
4", 5 AND 6" TUBE MULLIONS. Expiration Date: 09/16/2024 o=
ANCHORS TYPE ‘A’, 'B’, 'C’, ‘F’ AND ‘G’ APPLICABLE MUL B;M,%Mg 5%& drawing . no.
TO ALL TUBE MULLIONS. ULLIONS Mol pade Prodiacgt oro M04—-04



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


o
DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY — PSF [ hu §
WINDOW DIMS. ANCHORS TYPE ANCHORS TYPE ANCHORS TYPE m S
WIDTH (W) IMULL SPAN A B C D E F G WIDTH (W) [MULL SPAN A B C b E F G WIDTH (W) IMULL SPAN A B C )] E F G e Jr
19~1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 117.7 | 150.0 || 19~1/8" 103.0 | 150.0 | 140.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 60.8 | 121.7 || 19-1/8" 637 | 1275 | 87.1 | 150.0 | 1500 | 37.6 | 75.3 & =R %
26-1/2" 143.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 85.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" 74.4 | 1487 | 101.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 433 | 87.8 26-1/2" 46.0 | 92.0 | 629 | 1257 | 1464 | 272 | 543 o E 3 % Z
30" 127.1 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 75.0 | 150.0 30" 65.7 | 131.4 | 89.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 388 | 77.6 30" 406 | 81.3 | 555 | 111.0 | 129.3 | 240 | 48.0 E s =§ §
37" 103.0 | 150.0 | 140.8 | 150.0 | 1500 | 60.9 | 121.7 37" 53.3 | 1065 | 72.8 | 1455 | 150.0 | 31.4 | 629 37" 330 | 659 | 450 | 90.0 | 104.8 - 38.9 & ?50 §§ :
42" 90.8 | 150.0 | 124.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 53.6 | 107.2 42" 469 | 938 | 641 | 1282 | 149.2 | 277 | 554 42" 290 | 581 | 397 | 793 | 92.3 - 34.3 Owy ¢
48" 38-3/8" | 79.4 | 150.0 | 108.5 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 46.9 | 93.8 48" 74-1/4" | 411 82.1 56.1 | 1122 | 130.6 | 24.2 | 485 48" 120" 254 | 508 | 347 | 69.4 | 808 - 30.0 & E = E
54" 70.6 | 141.2 | 965 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 41.7 | 83.4 54" 365 | 73.0 | 498 | 997 | 1161 | 215 | 431 54" 226 | 452 | 308 | 61.7 | 71.8 - 26.7 0537m
60" 635 | 127.1 | 86.8 | 150.0 | 1500 | 375 | 75.0 60" 328 | 657 | 449 | 897 | 1045 - 38.8 60" 20.3 | 406 | 278 | 555 | 64.6 - 24.0 (4] ui =
66" 57.8 | 1155 | 78.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 34.1 | 68.2 66 29.9 | 59.7 | 40.8 | 816 | 950 - 35.3 66" - 369 | 252 | 505 | 58.8 - 21.8 (o " E & g
72" 53.0 | 1059 | 723 | 1447 | 1500 | 31.3 | 625 72" 274 | 547 | 374 | 748 | 87.1 - 32.3 72" - 339 | 231 | 463 | 539 - 20.0 Qeog §
19~1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 89.2 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 91.1 | 150.0 | 124.4 | 150.0 | 1500 | 53.8 | 107.6 19-1/8" 580 | 1159 | 79.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 342 | 68.4 g S E;_J, g @
26~1/2" 109.1 | 150.0 | 148.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 64.4 | 1288 || 26-1/2" 657 | 131.5 | 89.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 388 | 77.6 26-1/2" 418 | 837 | 571 | 1143 | 133.0 | 247 | 49.4 4 § 57 &
30" 96.3 | 150.0 | 131.6 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 56.9 | 113.8 30" 58.1 | 116.1 | 79.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 343 | 686 30” 369 | 739 | 505 | 100.9 | 1175 | 21.8 | 43.6 k2 2 g8
37" 78.1 | 150.0 | 106.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 46.1 | 92.3 37" 47.1 94.1 | 64.3 | 1286 | 149.7 | 27.8 | 556 37" 300 | 59.9 | 409 | 81.8 | 95.3 - 35.4 90
42" 68.8 | 137.6 | 940 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 40.6 | 81.3 42" 415 | 829 | 567 | 1133 | 131.9 | 245 | 490 42" 26.4 | 52.8 | 36.1 721 | 839 - 31.2 Liszt L
48" 50-5/8" | 60.2 | 120.4 | 823 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 356 | 71.1 48" 84" 363 | 726 | 496 | 991 | 1154 | 21.4 | 429 48" 132" 231 | 462 | 315 | 631 | 735 - 27.3 %:‘“mw
54" 535 | 107.0 | 731 | 1462 | 150.0 | 31.6 | 63.2 54" 32.3 | 645 44.1 88.1 | 102.6 - 38.1 54" 205 | 411 | 280 | 56.1 | 65.3 - 24.2 0
60" 482 | 963 | 658 | 131.6 | 1500 | 284 | 56.9 60" 290 | 581 | 397 | 793 | 923 - 34.3 60" - 369 | 252 | 505 | 588 - 21.8 " :»o’
66" 438 | 876 | 59.8 | 119.6 | 139.3 | 259 | 517 66" 26.4 | 52.8 | 36.1 72.1 | 83.9 - 31.2 66" - 336 | 229 | 459 | 534 - - pd b
72" 401 | 803 | 548 | 109.7 | 127.7 | 237 | 47.4 72" 242 | 484 | 330 | 661 | 77.0 - 28.6 72" - 308 | 21.0 | 421 | 49.0 - ~ % B
19-1/8" 131.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 77.9 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 79.7 | 150.0 | 108.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 47.1 | 94.1 19~1/8" 531 | 1062 | 72.6 | 1452 | 150.0 | 31.4 | 62.7 = 2
26-1/2" 95.2 | 150.0 | 130.0 | 150.0 | 1500 | 56.2 | 112.4 || 26-1/2" 575 | 1150 | 786 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 340 | 679 26-1/2" 383 | 76.7 | 52.4 | 1048 | 1220 | 226 | 453 g %
30" 84.1 | 1500 | 1149 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 49.7 | 99.3 30" 50.8 | 101.6 | 69.4 | 1388 | 150.0 | 30.0 | 60.0 30" 339 | 677 | 463 | 925 | 107.7 | 200 | 40.0 W gg -
37" 68.2 | 136.4 | 931 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 403 | 805 37" 41.2 | 824 | 56.3 | 1125 | 131.0 | 243 | 486 37" 275 | 549 | 375 | 750 | 87.4 - 32.4 O~ x
42" 60.1 | 120.1 | 820 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 355 | 709 42" 363 | 726 | 49.6 | 99.1 | 1154 | 214 | 429 42” 242 | 484 | 330 | €61 | 77.0 - 28.6 2lu b Y5
48" 58" 52.6 | 1051 | 71.8 | 1436 | 1500 | 31.0 | 62.1 48" 96" 318 | 635 | 434 | 8.8 | 101.0 - 37.5 48" 144" ~ 423 | 289 | 578 | 67.3 - 25.0 s g Q5 o
54" 467 | 934 | 638 | 1276 | 1486 | 276 | 552 54” 282 | 56.4 | 386 | 771 | 89.8 - 33.3 54" - 376 | 257 | 514 | 599 - 22.2 ola ."s
60" 420 | 841 | 574 | 1149 | 1337 | 248 | 497 60" 25.4 | 50.8 | 347 | 69.4 | 808 - 30.0 60" - 339 | 231 | 463 | 539 - 20.0 % § i o ;
66" 382 | 76.4 | 522 | 1044 | 1216 | 22.6 | 451 66" 231 | 462 | 315 | 631 | 735 - 27.3 66" - 308 | 210 | 421 | 490 - - 2T o<=8
72" 350 | 701 | 47.9 | 957 | 111.4 | 207 | 41.4 72" 212 | 423 | 289 | 578 | 67.3 - 25.0 72" - 28.2 - 386 | 44.9 - - un g % I
19-1/8" 121.4 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 71.7 | 143.4 || 19-1/8" 70.8 | 141.7 | 96.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 41.8 | 83.7 Q,N%jog, TJ’PE{;’S HORIZONTAL MULLION _jWm = =
26-1/2" 87.6 | 150.0 | 119.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 51.8 | 1035 || 26-1/2" 511 | 1022 | 69.8 | 138.7 | 150.0 | 302 | 60.4 AT HEAD/SILL/JAMBS ARCHES 10 BE INScRIBED | e
30" 77.4 | 150.0 | 105.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 457 | 91.4 30" 452 | 90.3 | B1.7 | 123.4 | 1436 | 267 | 53.3 ANCHOR TYPES INSIDE RECTANGULAR SHAPE
37" 62.8 | 1255 | 857 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 37.1 74.1 37" 366 | 732 | 50.0 | 1000 | 1165 | 216 | 432 a AT JAMES CHLS
42" 563 | 1106 | 755 | 150.0 | 150.0 | 32.7 65.3 42" 32.3 64.5 44.1 88.1 102.6 - 38.1 ///‘/’ELAZING RN _ 88 3 g
48" 63" 48.4 96.8 66.1 132.2 | 1500 | 28.6 57.1 48" 108" 28.2 56.4 38.6 77.1 89.8 - 33.3 AL \ </// i PRO/[D}J\CT \\\»\ = IEl8 g
547 430 | 860 | 588 | 1175 | 1368 | 254 | 50.8 54" 251 | 502 | 343 | 685 | 79.8 - 29.6 MULLION = S = 5 ; ; § F
60" 387 | 77.4 | 529 | 1058 | 1231 | 229 | 457 60" 226 | 452 | 308 | 617 | 71.8 - 26.7 zl ANCHOR é alg g 2
66" 352 | 70.4 | 48. 96.1 | 111.8 | 208 | 416 66" 205 | 41.1 | 280 | 56.1 | 653 - 24.2 GLAZING GLAZING Il ETAL #1 Q% kg3
PRODUCT PRODUCT % ~ CEET o
72" 323 | 645 | 441 88.1 | 102.6 - 38.1 72" - 376 | 257 | 514 | 59.9 - 22.2 2 z o|5|5|512
GLAZING GLAZING N
PRODUCT PRODUCT 3
ALL LOADS ARE EXT.(+)/INT.(-). MEEERE
Al Ol 25|88
NOTE: | w1 ﬁ\ W2 MULLION SPAN ! % 2 55018
ANY ANCHOR CONDITION SHOWN HEREIN MAY COVER PRODUCT REVISED ~ o ANCHOR TYPES ' 1l Bl I
LOCATIONS AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMB ENDS. st;mpg":’g with the Florida :T ?{,E/SIS/%ILE/JAMBS R
FOR ANCHORS DESCRIPTION SEE SHEETS 5 THRU 9. NOANG. ° 23.0717.20 TYPICAL MULLION ARRANGEMENTS i o
(INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS OR SPANS ALLOWED) Expiration Date: 09/16/2024 T g
_ '{7/14 WIDTH (W) = Wi+ w2 | PRODUCT RENEWED 2ol s
s s y: 2 as complying with thgemFlond% apn PRI s
ANCHORS TYPE ‘D’ AND ‘E’ APPLICABLE TO Miamfpado ProductCohtrol Building Code 1111 4 < b3 2852
4", 5" AND 6" TUBE MULLIONS. Exoi t_' Date: 9/16/20.29 )
ANCHORS TYPE ‘A", ‘B’, ‘C’, 'F’ AND ‘G’ APPLICABLE R 7 drawing . no.
TO ALL TUBE MULLIONS. ANCHORS By: A MO4—04
MiamiéDade Produc,t’Co}ltrol m



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+

4 PER

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+
CLIP (2 ON EACH WING)

1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+
2 PER ANGLE

‘ Ed. ! 2 PER CUP (1 ON EACH WING) 1 PER ANGLE £4 2 1/4" MIN.
L P ]
< N v S| - ®. v b T 1:h N v | i LR N b :
‘ e Ml v;»MviN. \h T Mo o ST TMNTL . v i O | I Il e T
lhia’s -~ "-.¢/‘//WP~-V~°, 4 T N SN B " e gy 4 --vvl// s g e Wit v '1/‘ R I
— i . - N —_— 1 - R =g i _— n —_—
é oty /‘_ Iy // __/ 6 __><‘ / 8! "_/ /” “/
AN WL ! N sl
T T T s I T ) : L 1 B 1 ]
. o s w -5 i s i vt 5 + 1 it g
; l'z ” H Dz .T r‘ !s ” “ >2 % ¥
[ — | I -~
/ | ity = | | i T = T
;: ig I: :: - ! :l 1: :: - {
i d I I [} | { i
. | ! { i . | i [
% i | 'Ll LFLoaming cup NI | Ly FLOATING CLIP o L )
s ) | 1BY ekt SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL 2 X 2X1/8 = i b 1 BY it SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL Iy 2 X2X%X1/8
. ;; :; WOOD BUCK |: :n ALUM ANGLE . n} :| WOOD BUCK ;: §| I ALUM ANGLE
N (SR | Y #14 SMs N e - Loy #14 sms WU
- | i b 1-3/4" 0.C. MIN. - | | b 1-3/4" 0.C. MIN. b
| z Lo 2 PER ANGLE | i P 2 PER ANGLE P
t i J— / | t t I / - — L
' l ' ! 4, ! L L
1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ . .
2 PER CLIP (1 ON EACH WING) / 1 PER ANGLE 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+
£d. 4 PER CLIP (2 ON EACH WING) 2 PER ANGLE
Ed. 1" MIN.
// ; ;/ ‘/
! i::?/fﬁﬁﬁ?;é;i;: :j;; I — i | e [ e
| L i//TYP.///tj_ | I///,_ >< / - ///__
. f =7 H = L 0 - i | 7 L4 i =
% I ] // I , /f ‘/’ ’ //I/ 6 l E ! l /T //: !/T i Jl/
id LT SN | i Ve
| ¥ T g T T i T > 2 REE
! ! H H = [0 :x ;1 H H = o
| | - -
f } 1 y ! } 1o
! I i !
: ! | i [ : | | [T [N
> | L w.J FLOATING CLIP AR L Y = | i‘ 1y FLOATING CLIP Ty R
< | j| WooD BucK == SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL 1R 2X2X1/8 | { 2 BY i SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL U 2X2X1/8
. ! ] WOoD ! (o ALUM ANGLE . ! §| WOOD BUCK ihoh o ALUM ANGLE
N o ~|  STRUCTURE by #14 sMs HoH N - vy _#14 sSMs P4
| ‘ n AR i T | N TR |
| t i i I |
| i s o Ad 2 PER ANGLE A : | ; S 1 S Y
| |
¥
ANCHORS TYPE 'B
T v _ PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED
o v oo as complying with the Florida  As complying with the Florida
s gy e Building Code Building Code
e NOA-No. 24-0312.06 NOA-No._ 23-0717.20
i = Expiration Date; 09/16/2029 Exgir7;4tion Dateﬁ: 9/16/2024
% % 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT’ B;{}W By: 2A02
! ‘i (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 Ksl) MiamiL_pade Produc,t’Co)ntrol Miam{:Dade P’°d“°1t'c°}'t’°l
:{ {: ULTRACON+ MAY BE HEX OR FLAT HEAD
:{ {; SUBSTRATE |Ed. = MIN. EDGE DIST. |MIN. EMBEDMENT
! 'd WOOD 1" 1-1/2"
| " -
e - CONCRETE 2-1/2 1-3/4
| |
. 4 ' WOOD = 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURE S.G. = 0.55 MIN.
ALTERNATE CONCRETE = f'c = 3000 PSI MIN.

ANCHOR LOCATION

ANCHORS TYPE 'A’

ALL CLIPS AND ANGLES TO FIT SNUG INTO TUBE MULLIONS.

CLIPS OR ANGLES CONNECTED DIRECTLY TO MASONRY TO BE PROTECTED
WITH ALKALI-RESISTANT COATINGS, SUCH AS BITUMINOUS PAINT OR
WATER-WHITE METHACRYLATE LACQUER.

yr 07

0y
" WUz
| U
o
© S
N
3
Zz o RIS
O 23|z
[ % ©Z
=
. ©
<z 393
Ecoc,c >
- N
OLug e
W -
oy %
EFor w
(.
Qoap
Ugm‘r{
023
OFe® 8
<
0ids:
2YER
ErZ28«
QUi g
ulww_:o
FZ£o05 @
=984
€GeS &
j—
R
[£9]
wn
i
02} o
prd ©
O —
| 8
— e
2 Y
=
Q b
MEE
@ o
- N
F(é)mi\#z
To Y
Z2l0< R
2 2
ZlZ2=z ;5 ©
Sz 0%
) -
o 'OEV
QL <
Www =¥
oy
S
88|82
< sl
pag B N1
c838§
12lelelo]y
o
QoialglZ
S
R
5 55/5|2
>
O
vl 1221818
gﬂey\'gg
B-4ilei Rl et REE N
L2i°ls5=|8
£8u1~—;)
el =
s
Sl
R
S .
>
. © 2
b - .
818 s
drawing no.

sheet § of Q



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


U\Q
/4" DIA. ULTRACON 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ / LTRACON L - Q
1 - UL + 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ A 1/4" DIA. U +
2 PER CUP (1 ON EACH WING) / 1 PER ANGLE Ed. 4 PER CLIP (2 ON EACH WING) 5 PER ANGLE m j‘
'S
Z Tg|=
Y P
A 37 MIN. A ‘ - . ’I} . . ﬁ Co ? . 1} O 88|z
. 1| ‘ TP [ t . } . N v . o R E y < v ; 5 ) & %
i v \ﬁ . \ @ v | * i . < .‘ 1Y N i { v e v | | v . < q1® E F g |
ol . g . ] L 5 } - . vv s 9|, ,v{, 1 v ! S e N E v i g 9 <ﬂ. < ~2
~ E —— T E = T 2 T . T E 3 i T - v .- T L_%] am— T T — T T m (e} o \L’_ 8 =
W0 T | | T T ¥ q‘ - 11 T ] 5 [ T [T T £ T T Eo 1B T ogR-é8
" t 1 B 1 ! .
| Lol b R i | E Eof (ol Loy X%
| [ <
! bl - i 4 i b T FgoE =
}l bl f i o N { 0Lz
| L i 1. | L e 1N 8358
:‘ P21 CEue T NS0 MuLL o 2x2x1/8" | Z| i i o e o L2 X 2 X 1/87 ays
f H rod ALUM ANGLE . ) ! P - o ALUM ANGLE OfE™ g
--------- g Loy #14 sus by N R LY HoY 0acogy
I b 1-3/4" 0.C. MIN. Lo - | 1 I 1] LFLOATING CLIP o O3z 4
i oo 2 PER ANGLE Lo I | P SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL o YER:
| L L | i o L g C5C 5
! Lo Lo | i P #14 SMS L pus_ 8
| | i i | | I [ [ 4 PER ANGLE ! [ rso0s ¢
! ! f ! ! | I [ [ ! [ wl OO
| - n | : N N S
! I i | I |
Av f ____I_._/E,_LM _LJ]FJ_" I /], 1 ___L..A,‘L__ _M4_ J
[+ 4]
wy
Ed. uiv
03] 29]
1\ z 3
: s v ~ O -
¥ AI/ T T AV T < v | . | v 3 !.8
; l | { v i v < <f _.J n
| | | e g s ~
| | o : i s
i I | | i T (j H o
I I h{ - <§( ! | 1 | Led i
! " | o A I -
| B [ ») - b
! i - T T Q@ @ i i =l w g b
i i [l P ) P z I
I 1 P i | 1/27(2) I [ 20@""?
| j Lo i - ! | M o
Lo — | [ e | 2010 =
R - | . ! ZlZz ;©
Wy T YL ! 3 ! SISz
i 1 {
. e lﬁ L 2 - | | 2 =3
B R <. . K N < 4 dn L - i | T e =<
I R I ] . g il ! | ! YN 8=
v ‘%Y\L e A L ! v Wm = e
@ s > S
ﬁ LOCATION OF SCREWS CONNECTING =
td. | ANGLES TO TUBES
1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+
2 PER CLIP (1 ON EACH WING) alelolg
| b
:zlg|
c|®|R|g £
ANCHORS TYPE D’ %8 2oy
: ”» ” » PRODUCT REVISED clg 8igz
sl s . , APPLICABLE FOR 47, 5" AND 6" TUBE MULLIONS ag Complying with the Florida §§ g 25
. P H H o
SR b S PRODUCT RENEWED Building Code o5|5/5|2
e g Y as complying with the Florida NOA-No. 23-0717.20 2
o Building Code Expiration Date: 09/16/2024
i ]i NOA-No. 24-0312.06 RW ;7%7 | NEEEE
| ! . oSy
| r} Expiration Date: 09/16/2029  BY: / M)‘ S ENEEE
| ! » ¢ » H il s ol
N u 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT Bym s Miamf-Pade ProductTontrol |2 1515.- 12
>§< :l ! (Fu=164 KSI, Fy=148 KSI) ,L 1;1 & -121 )
o
. :: ! ULTRACON+ MAY BE HEX OR FLAT HEAD Miamf_Pade ProductTontrol =
o~
> " ! SUBSTRATE |Ed. = MIN. EDGE DIST.|MIN. EMBEDMENT 3
e ! CONCRETE 2-1/2" =374 &1
< ~
' ) ) CONCRETE = f'c = 3000 PSI MIN. S 5
B3 <
: LIS W *.‘G"‘ﬁ < 8 5
ALTERNATE s U tudy
ALL CLIPS AND ANGLES TO FIT SNUG INTO TUBE MULLIONS. T E——
ANCHOR LOCATION rawing  no.
CLIPS OR ANGLES CONNECTED DIRECTLY TO MASONRY TO BE PROTECTED
WITH ALKALI-RESISTANT COATINGS, SUCH AS BITUMINOUS PAINT OR MO4—-04
ANCHORS TYPE 'C’ WATER—WHITE METHACRYLATE LACQUER. e s
——S e o]



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


—
Uiz
5/16" DIA. ULTRACON 5/16” DIA. ULTRACON m g
4 PER CLIP (2 ON EACH WING) 2 PER ANGLE 4
[}
2 3Rz
32MIN o) Raols
. e /F e ,A{ < T . . . | Y bz- 86z
< |7 TP ] % S A : =u 8|3
1 o : | _ S LT . ! v . <Y ] < S Z_NBJ
e g% - I o SRR | AR 1 IR AT S I ! g3 _S@ls
T T T ru T T ) o] [e Bl ]
T | T ] i3 ﬁ' [ [ oDa~¢@
i ] 1 1 m = N %
! bl | N ww g
? T $ % FoE
! T 05z,
| 1o L o L ggat
> P . ]
i == % oo 2X2X%X1/8 pud
! N - (o ALUM ANGLE OLE" g
————————————— - L J| | FLoaTing cLp b 0aogd
[ i | SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL | | OLE 3
] g | | i Eouc 8
| | | #14 SMS | ! rz oo
| ! | 4 PER ANGLE I ! <g:m @
' ! - W2ls s
| - ~
| o - 28854
/ | f f [ i iz ¥ g
; . N LA —
e N TN
[ve}
e
i
€8] o
1\ /r z @
® B < N O Loy
< v | | . ._.-.' g
v e 1 — 2
! < <5 A4 F 3 .
. vl >
wl ‘ o &
SIEL L Wi =
_1Z | | ! o &
| | | O .=
T DI ® o - (é) w5
L L2 ! 218%8;
N T I 2o 'R
! ! Z/Zz ;°©
' 3 =S zz4%2
: 1 : D — %
! i 1 O s >
| | Bz
! A 1 e s
PRODUCT RENEWED ——
LOCATION OF SCREWS CONNECTING as complying with the Florida |
ANGLES TO TUBES Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.06
Exg%ion Date; ggm 6/2029 HHEEE
« 1%
By: M c é % § 2
o
- & =
ANCHORS TYPE E’ MlampéDade Produc,t’Ct;ntrol ﬁi E o §
3 ” ” PRODUCT REVISED clalo 81
APPLICABLE FOR 47, 5" AND 6 TUBE MULLIONS As complying with the Florida g § % § 5
Building Code 8151552
NOA-No. 23-0717.20 =
Expiration Date: 09/16/2024 || .. -
QW 2lolTi=I18 R
it s R
DO I~ O
" . s Miamj-Dade ProductTontrol 'S clo o
5/16" DIA. ULTRACON BY 'DEWALT > we EEEEE
(Fu=177 KSi, Fy=155 KSI) )
ULTRACON MAY BE HEX OR FLAT HEAD AR )
SUBSTRATE |Ed. = MIN. EDGE DIST. |MIN. EMBEDMENT z - }
CONCRETE 3-1/8" 2" z ® g
o ” .
CONCRETE = f'c = 3000 PSI MIN. ellsll®
. N A e K] S ” .
1007 el SlE s B
C—
T TN
ALL CLIPS AND ANGLES TO FIT SNUG INTO TUBE MULLIONS. drawing no.
CLIPS OR ANGLES CONNECTED DIRECTLY TO CONCRETE TO BE PROTECTED
WITH ALKALI~RESISTANT COATINGS, SUCH AS BITUMINOUS PAINT OR M04-04
WATER—WHITE METHACRYLATE LACQUER. m
snee o]



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


" WYz
Yoo |0
1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ 1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ 1/47 DIA. ULTRACON+ (V 9
2 PER CUP (1 ON EACH WING) 1 PER ANGLE " 4 PER CLIP (2 ON EACH WING) 2 PER ANGLE e i
. Ed. ) £d. 2 1/4" MIN. 3
1 i | -~
o XI=
| 1 I TYP. I & SRIZ
I 99, P ) | | Yy oA b i Or 882
%/ xj7/ Ny Y | } 75! ! t j%§/ a O 7R / y l ST
, | PrlZ | LA i ' 1y | | e gl
| o i g ” “ s 3 bt ! T ! [ W - ki [] } T - ’if' +5 [ [ Ty ) 4 Sol g
1! i T > T T ; T > 1 7 Omﬁ -
! ' T ~ P ’ LI i 3 KN g, X%
/ | T - / { ! o - : gor &
/ T i f | ibon -3
- i 1o oty : ! } T it Qbao
x| ! T FLOATING CLIP o . % { :, jL g FLOATING CLIP R . Q2 ,:
=y ! l 1) SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL (ol 2 X2X1/8 = ! | Tt SNUG FIT INSIDE MULL o] L2x2x1/8 ays
. f } ! NI ALUM ANGLE . ! i il [t ALUM ANGLE O'Eg“’ o
4 o J Uy #14 SMs bou N N S = LoJ #14 SMs bou 0acg s
< { | b 1-3/4” 0.C. MIN. . - , , L 1-3/4” 0.C. MIN. b X
! | b 2 PER ANGLE L i i L 2 PER ANGLE Lo " ETER:
! } o/ Al i [ A R . rz9
! 1, ! - 1 4, | - - o u 2L &
kzos @
288z
ghas ¥
| —
o
o
w0
i
(7] e}
z 3
© @
3 g
% : 0 5 -
§ x
s 3 °
WiTn
§ v o o
l I Sl e o
a | Flghsa
| | oS on
! 4 E% O<3 )
i 3 Q. 3
|: :g Z Z z 3@
i i =\ 2243
|! !! . —
e et - J . O s >
| | Y8
. 4 : W=
ALTERNATE PRODUCT RENEWED s
ANCHOR LOCATION as complying with the Florida |~/
Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0312.06
Ex%ion Date: ggm 6/2029 88|85
<@~ 0
By: M c é é § 2
~N
Yt H F O =
ANCHORS TYPE 'F’ ANCHORS TYPE G M'a""ipade P’°d“°frc‘;“"°' = 2R ey
PRODUCT REVISED c28g%
AT _JAMBS ONLY AT _JAMBS ONLY As complying with the Florida & g g E 5
Building Code 8155152
NOA-No. 23-0717.20 =
Expiration Date: 09/16/2024 °
N Jin L REEHE
1/4” DIA. ULTRACON+ BY ‘DEWALT’ By: 8‘5 by g ? §
(Fu=184 KSI, Fy=148 KSI) Miam{:Dade Produc,t’Co}\trol < ©sls =8
ULTRACON+ MAY BE HEX OR FLAT HEAD Zj&lelxz-|>
|G
SUBSTRATE |Ed. = MIN. EDGE DIST.|MIN. EMBEDMENT
MASONRY 2-1/2" 1—1/4" 5| -
o |l
MASONRY = C-80 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK f'm = 2000 PS| MIN. ‘I s
~
© L¢)
ALL CLIPS AND ANGLES TO FIT SNUG INTO TUBE MULLIONS. R
CLIPS OR ANGLES CONNECTED DIRECTLY TO MASONRY TO BE PROTECTED ree e
WITH ALKALI-RESISTANT COATINGS, SUCH AS BITUMINOUS PAINT OR v “drawing  no. .
WATER—WHITE METHACRYLATE LACQUER. MO4—04

sheet 8 of 9



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY - PSF DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY — PSF g Q %
WINDOW DIMS. ANCHORS QUANTITY WINDOW DIMS. ANCHORS QUANTITY WINDOW DIMS. ANCHORS QUANTITY m“‘ g
WIDTH (W) [MULL SPAN] 2 3 4 WIDTH (W) [MULL SPAN| 2 3 4 WIDTH (W) [MULL SPAN] 2 3 4 14 SM [
. . - # S METAL STRUCTURE 3
19-1/8 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8 937 | 1405 | 150.0 2, 3 OR 4 ANCHORS - OR v 4 el
" ” » SEE CHART FOR CAPACITY TUBE MULLION oy g e
26—1/2 150.0 | 150.0 150.0 26—1/2 115.9 150.0 150.0 26—1/2 67.6 101.4 135.2 e] n-z- & o P4
= :
30" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" 102.4 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" 59.7 89.6 | 119.5 f% b= g = % =
37" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" 83.0 | 1245 | 150.0 37" 48.4 72.6 %69 | = FrEmTmmT—reoooTooS é g § e
42" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 42" 73.1 | 109.7 | 146.3 42" 42.7 64.0 85.3 T 3 T oz Q-8
48" 38-3/8" | 1401 | 1500 | 150.0 48” 84” 640 | 96.0 | 128.0 48" 373 | se0 | 747 |  F—mEmT T ez %
54" 1245 | 150.0 | 150.0 54" 56.9 853 | 113.8 54" 33.2 49.8 6.4 i % E % o .
60" 112.1 | 150.0 | 150.0 60" 512 | 76.8 | 102.4 60" 29.9 | 448 | 59.7 #10 zF; ;’gg ) 8 u"}g
o)
" ” ”» > (4]
66 101.9 | 150.0 | 150.0 66 46.5 69.8 93.1 66 27.2 40.7 54.3 |1 /8" THICK ALUM CHANNEL oozZa g
72" 93.4 | 140.1 | 150.0 72" 42.7 64.0 85.3 72" 24.9 37.3 49.8 LENGTH TO FIT SNUG . ocdgd
" . — MULLI e
19-1/8 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 {| 19-1/8 140.5 | 150.0 | 150.0 INTO MULLION UBE MULLION o] ggm 3
26-1/2" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" 101.4 | 150.0 | 150.0 % i §§ N
= i
30 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 30" 89.6 | 1344 | 1500 TUBES MAY BE NOTCHED Ll g g 9
37" 137.8 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" 72.6 | 109.0 | 145.3 AS SHOWN TO ALLOW INSTALLATION A — d 88 5
OF CLIP ANGLE ; | €zZ0z @
42" 121.4 150.0 150.0 42" 64.0 96.0 128.0 CAULK JOINT AFTER ASSEMBLY i : woe r-
‘ S —— N—
48 50-5/8" | 106.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 48 96 56.0 84.0 | 112.0 414 FH SMS | ‘
54" 94.4 | 1416 | 1500 547 498 | 747 | 99.6 1-1/2" 0.C. MIN. METAL STRUCTURE 1 3
60" 850 | 127.4 | 150.0 60 448 | 672 | 89.6 R TUBE MULLION ! : o
66" 772 | 1158 | 150.0 66" 40.7 61.1 81.5 ! i 027 5
79" 70.8 | 1062 | 141.6 72" 37.3 56.0 #7 Y. pmeme———te e e L I o .
- - o] 1S 2
19-1/8 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8 124.9 | 1500 | 150.0 , - ]
26—-1/2" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 26-1/2" 90.2 135.2 | 150.0 < - - - - g %
30 148.3 | 150.0 | 150.0 30” 79.6 | 1195 | 150.0 (j - &
37" 120.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" 64.6 969 | 1292 | 0~ | 1 T~_pmmmmmmggte-oe-q pmem————ppe————d po—em e ﬂ ~~~~~~~~~ &5} -
T It o
427 1059 | 150.0 | 150.0 42" 56.9 85.3 | 113.8 | , | D ey o
! | | ! FINY ¢ 5
48" 58" 92.7 | 139.0 | 1500 48" 108" 49.8 74.7 99.6 | | ‘ s -3 g
|
54" 82.4 | 1236 | 150.0 54" 44.2 66.4 88.5 THIS SCREW CAN BE i : ) 8 ¥
) . INSTALLED IN EITHER-{| #10 FH SMS 1, | ! Z SR
60 742 | 1112 | 1483 80 39.8 59.7 79.6 DIRECTION ‘W@a i 2 PER CLIP ‘ | ! <\ Zz= -
66" 67.4 | 101.1 | 134.8 66" 362 | 543 | 724 i R | ! | o B
. » | i I | S o= 2
72 61.8 | 927 | 1236 72 33.2 49.8 66.4 , ] ! ! ] ! | / 3 2B F
19-1/8" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8" 112.4 | 150.0 | 150.0 WMmsE
26-1/2" 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 26-1/2" 81.1 | 1217 | 150.0 1-3/8" X 2° X 1/8" (FOR 2BY TUBE) PRODUCT RENEWED e —
» » - U as complying with the Florida |~
37" 110.7 | 150.0 | 150.0 37" 58.1 87.2 116.2 ALUM ANGLE NOA-No. - i
., X CUT TO FIT SNUG INSIDE TUBE 24-0312.06 _
42 97.5 146.3 | 150.0 42 51.2 76.8 102.4 Expiration Date: 09/16/2029 R8I
[ I VI
5 63" 853 | 1280 | 1500 e 120" 44.8 67.2 89.6 Byl_iw ) s <lnlolB
. Sio|8e
54" 75.9 113.8 | 150.0 54" 39.8 59.7 79.6 o/ N SIR|E
ANCHORS DETAIL #1 MiamiéDade Produc,t’Ct;ntrol Slololnal-
60" 68.3 | 102.4 | 136.5 60" 35.8 53.8 71.7 AL 10 METAL CONNECTION PRODUCT REVISED 22121208
" " O | i 8 <
66 621 93.1 1241 66 326 48.9 652 As complying with the Florida @ g g E &
72" 56.9 | 853 | 113.8 72" 29.9 448 59.7 Building Code vII%IE o
. - #14 SMS/TEKS NOA-N 2 © =z
19-1/8 150.0 | 150.0 | 150.0 || 19-1/8 102.2 | 150.0 | 150.0 -No. 3-0717.20 =
= i - - Is}
26—1/2" 1311 150.0 150.0 26-1/2" 738 1107 1475 SUBSTRATE | Ed. MIN. E"DCE DIST. IMIN. CL TO CL SPACING Expiration Date: 09/16/2024 N
” » METAL 5/8 1/2" ) MBS
30 1158 | 150.0 | 150.0 30 65.2 97.7 | 130.3 By: 20 SI2 |5 8|2
37" 939 | 1409 | 150.0 37" 528 | 79.3 | 105.7 METAL = 1/8” MIN. THK. STEEL Fy = 36 KSI MIN. Miam;/:pade producmo}.tm 2°55]=|8
a0 827 | 1241 | 1500 4 65 P 031 1/8" MIN. THK. ALUMINUM (6063~T6 MIN.) HEBEEE
—
48" 74-1/4" | 72.4 | 1086 | 144.8 48" 1327 40.7 61.1 81.5 i ———
54" 64.4 | 965 | 1287 54" 36.2 54.3 72.4 =
|
60" 57.9 86.9 | 1158 60" 32.6 48.9 65.2 ol !
66" 527 | 79.0 | 105.3 66" 206 | 444 | 592 SR
72" 48.3 | 72.4 | 965 72" 27.2 | 407 | 543 ol s &
- o 3
gree 3oy wOe 3 a S
rou T e 5
S
drawing no.

sheet 9 of §_



mp045
noa23-0717.20

Manny Perez
noa24-0312.06


	ADPA3F9.tmp
	Miami, Florida 33175-2474
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADP78C2.tmp
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADP4D0E.tmp
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC




