MIAMI-DADE MIAMI-DADE COUNTY

COUNTY PRODUCT CONTROL SECTION
11805 SW 26 Street, Room 208

DEPARTMENT OF REGULATORY AND ECONOMIC RESOURCES (RER) Miami, Florida 33175-2474
BOARD AND CODE ADMINISTRATION DIVISION T (786) 315-2590 F (786) 315-2599
NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE (NOA) www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LLC
3550 NW 49" Street
Miami, FL 33142

Scork:

This NOA is being issued under the applicable rules and regulations governing the use of construction
materials. The documentation submitted has been reviewed and accepted by Miami-Dade County RER-
Product Control Section to be used in Miami-Dade County and other areas where allowed by the Authority
Having Jurisdiction (AHJ).

This NOA shall not be valid after the expiration date stated below. The Miami-Dade County Product Control
Section (In Miami-Dade County) and/ or the AHJ (in areas other than Miami-Dade County) reserve the right
to have this product or material tested for quality assurance purposes. If this product or material failsto perform
in the accepted manner, the manufacturer will incur the expense of such testing and the AHJ may immediately
revoke, modify, or suspend the use of such product or material within their jurisdiction. RER reserves the right
to revoke this acceptance if it is determined by Miami-Dade County Product Control Section that this product
or material fails to meet the requirements of the applicable building code.

This product is approved as described herein and has been designed to comply with the Florida Building Code,
including the High Velocity Hurricane Zone.

DESCRIPTION: Series “9500” Aluminum Window Wall System - L.M.I.

APPROVAL DOCUMENT: Drawing No. W09-25, titled “Series 9500 Alum Window Wall System
(L.M.1.)”, sheets 1, 2, 2.1 and 3 through 17 of 17, dated 04/16/09, with revision H dated 09/12/23, prepared by
Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E., bearing the Miami-Dade County Product
Control Renewal stamp with the Notice of Acceptance number and expiration date by the Miami-Dade County
Product Control Section.

MISSILE IMPACT RATING: Large and Small Missile Impact Resistant

LABELING: Each unit shall bear a permanent label with the manufacturer's name or logo, Barranquilla,
Colombia, model/series, and following statement: "Miami-Dade County Product Control Approved", unless
otherwise noted herein.
RENEWAL of this NOA shall be considered after a renewal application has been filed and there has been no
change in the applicable building code negatively affecting the performance of this product.
TERMINATION of this NOA will occur after the expiration date or if there has been a revision or change in
the materials, use, and/ or manufacture of the product or process. Misuse of this NOA as an endorsement of
any product, for sales, advertising or any other purposes shall automatically terminate this NOA. Failure to
comply with any section of this NOA shall be cause for termination and removal of NOA.
ADVERTISEMENT: The NOA number preceded by the words Miami-Dade County, Florida, and followed
by the expiration date may be displayed in advertising literature. If any portion of the NOA is displayed, then
it shall be done in its entirety.
INSPECTION: A copy of this entire NOA shall be provided to the user by the manufacturer or its distributors
and shall be available for inspection at the job site at the request of the Building Official.
This NOA renews NOA No. 23-0928.18 and consists of this page 1 and evidence pages E-1, E-2, E-3 and
E-4, as well as approval document mentioned above.
The submitted documentation was reviewed by Manuel Perez, P.E.
NOA No. 24-0513.04
M'AM'UNTY Expiration Date: October 28,2029

Approval Date: July 25,2024
7/18/24 Page 1


http://www.miamidade.gov/building

E.S. Windows, LLC

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s
DRAWINGS

1.

2.

Manufacturer's die drawings and sections.

(Submitted under NOA No. 03-0314.07)

Drawing No. W09-25, titled “Series 9500 Alum Window Wall System (L.M.1.)”,
sheets 1, 2, 2.1 and 3 through 17 of 17, dated 04/16/09, with revision H dated
09/12/23, prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.18)

TESTS

1.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 9000 aluminum
outswing entry door w/sidelites, prepared by Blackwater Testing Inc., Test Report No.
BT-ESW-18-004, dated 05/17/18, signed and sealed by Constantin Bortes, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 19-0708.05)
Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 9500 aluminum
window wall system, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Reports
No. FTL-5991, dated 10/02/09, both signed and sealed by Jorge A. Causo, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 10-0504.01)
Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 9500 aluminum
window wall system, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report
No. FTL-6129, dated 03/10/10, signed and sealed by Jorge A. Causo, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 10-0504.01)

Product Control Exami
NOA No. 24-0513.04
Expiration Date: October 28,
Approval Date: July 25,2024



E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

1. EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)
B. TESTS (CONTINUED)

4.

Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of series 9500 aluminum
window wall system, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report
No. FTL-5546, dated 01/09/09, signed and sealed by Michael R. Wenzel, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0623.01)
Test reports on: 1) Air Infiltration Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

2) Uniform Static Air Pressure Test, Loading per FBC, TAS 202-94

3) Water Resistance Test, per FBC, TAS 202-94

4) Large Missile Impact Test per FBC, TAS 201-94

5) Cyclic Wind Pressure Loading per FBC, TAS 203-94

6) Forced Entry Test, per FBC 2411 3.2.1, TAS 202-94
along with marked-up drawings and installation diagram of an aluminum outswing
entrance door, prepared by Fenestration Testing Laboratory, Inc., Test Report No.
FTL-5554, dated 05/10/08, signed and sealed by Carlos S. Rionda, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 09-0623.01)

C. CALCULATIONS

1.

Anchor verification calculations and structural analysis, complying with FBC 6
Edition (2017), dated 01/19/18 and 09/12/18, then updated on 11/16/20 to comply
with FBC 7" Edition (2020), prepared by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed
by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

(Submitted under NOA No. 20-1208.10)

Glazing complies with ASTM E1300-09

Manue ez, P.E:
Product Control Exami
NOA No. 24-0513.04
Expiration Date: October 28,
Approval Date: July 25,2024




E.S. Windows, LLC

[y

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

EVIDENCE SUBMITTED UNDER PREVIOUS NOA’s (CONTINUED)

QUALITY ASSURANCE

1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER).

MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 22-1116.01 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 12/15/22, expiring on
07/04/28.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-0915.22 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their

“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 11/19/20,
expiring on 07/08/24.

STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 7t Edition (2020), with FBC
8t Edition (2023), and of no financial interest, dated September 26, 2023, issued by

Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.
(Submitted under NOA No. 23-0928.18)

OTHERS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 20-1208.10, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Series
“9500” Aluminum Window Wall System - L.M.I., approved on 02/18/21 and expiring
on 10/28/24.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exami

NOA No. 24-0513.0
Expiration Date: October 28, 9
Approval Date: July 25,2024




E.S. Windows, LLC

NOTICE OF ACCEPTANCE: EVIDENCE SUBMITTED

2. NEW EVIDENCE SUBMITTED
A. DRAWINGS

1. None.
B. TESTS

1. None.

C. CALCULATIONS
1. None.

D. QUALITY ASSURANCE
1. Miami-Dade Department of Regulatory and Economic Resources (RER)

E. MATERIAL CERTIFICATIONS

1. Notice of Acceptance No. 23-0717.30 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their
“SentryGlas® (Clear and White) Glass Interlayers” dated 08/31/23, expiring on
07/04/28.

2. Notice of Acceptance No. 24-0205.28 issued to Kuraray America, Inc. for their

“Trosifol® Ultraclear, Clear and Color PVB Glass Interlayers” dated 03/21/24,
expiring on 07/08/29.

F. STATEMENTS
1. Statement letter of conformance, complying with FBC 8" Edition (2023), and of no
financial interest, dated May 9, 2024, issued by Al-Farooq Corporation, signed and
sealed by Jalal Farooq, P.E.

G. OTHERS
1. Notice of Acceptance No. 23-0928.18, issued to E.S. Windows, LLC for their Series
“9500” Aluminum Window Wall System - L.M.1., approved on 11/09/23 and expiring
on 10/28/24.

Manuel Perez, P.E.
Product Control Exami

NOA No. 24-0513.0

Expiration Date: October 28,
Approval Date: July 25,2024




D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG.
SEE SHEET 2 SEE SHEET 2 SEE SHEET 2
AT T~ A P
e N 7 8 / N
1 . i [ I L 1] }_}ﬁl‘»__w,-”,,-___w
1 =] 17111 L L I A
~—d - ~ ‘F"//
|
|
D1 12 i
11 F |
~ NEVAR B
D (EN I
>%< >g< . ;?:11:::::::1:
Go G g I
- e |
- - ;i g /!
h
5 5 -+ s, (G , /
Y im o Yim ~ /DT 12 | /s
3 S u/ G L Ve
Bln £ 813 gl -+ NN NEVAN B IR
3| @iz 3 9zx » N [ .
= 72} = %) o ~ Ve £| 7 i
=y aly 2y 3 1| £ g 5 IR
oo » o la 7] O //' / )i)’ o
2 <2( =z 4 // 7 I: % i
[ & 5__L| 2 7 <, ly
oo r——: - \
- O 0N
el<h ie /|
jaa] o (.I)L‘J (& ‘k \\
2 s 05 Tl e s IHEEAN
[a) v m ) I N
o S SR N v I| SEE "E.SN\WINDOWS'
x < v it LML DOOR\NOA
o a d || FOR DOOR RATING
o | o | & DETAILS.
z HGE |
> |
8 7 8 LE":::__::::::::
P —— o s s ,—'"“L
. - - ~ e P
TN I 111 R N 1] F,H;ﬁ“::;:m
vob /// i AT Tt [ P //\l!! Y
S~ JARN 4 N
» / " ;o S~ T / ST
% L / e 'Vé’g;Ng‘;- / MAX. MULLION SPACING a
/ 3 H
CORNERS | / SEE SHEETS 3 & 4 /

'\ ANCHORS TYPE A, B, C OR D /
~—2, 3 OR 4 AT EACH JAMB \
SEE SHEET 4

ANCHORS TYPE A, B, C OR D
SEE SHEET 4

SERIES 9500 ALUMINUM WINDOW WALL SYSTEM TYPICAL ELEVATION

THIS SYSTEM IS RATED FOR LARGE & SMALL MISSILE IMPACT
SHUTTERS ARE NOT REQUIRED.

CODE REQUIREMENTS FOR SAFEGUARDS MUST BE OBSERVED.

THIS PRODUCT HAS BEEN DESIGNED AND TESTED TO COMPLY WITH THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020 (7TH EDITION)/2023 (8TH EDITION) FLORIDA
BUILDING CODE INCLUDING HIGH VELOCITY HURRICANE ZONE (HVHZ).

1BY OR 2BY WOOD BUCKS & BUCK FASTENERS BY OTHERS, MUST BE
DESIGNED AND INSTALLED ADEQUATELY TO TRANSFER APPLIED PRODUCT
LOADS TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE.

ANCHORS SHALL BE CORROSION RESISTANT, SPACED AS SHOWN ON DETAILS
AND INSTALLED PER MANUF'S INSTRUCTIONS. SPECIFIED EMBEDMENT TO BASE
MATERIAL SHALL BE BEYOND WALL DRESSING OR STUCCO.

A LOAD DURATION INCREASE IS USED IN DESIGN OF ANCHORS INTO WOOD ONLY.
ALL SHIMS TO BE HIGH IMPACT, NON—METALLIC AND NON-COMPRESSIBLE.

MATERIALS INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO STEEL/METAL SCREWS, THAT
COME INTO CONTACT WITH OTHER DISSIMILAR MATERIALS SHALL MEET THE
REQUIREMENTS OF THE 2020/2023 FLORIDA BLDG. CODE & ADOPTED STANDARDS.

THIS PRODUCT APPROVAL IS GENERIC AND DOES NOT PROVIDE INFORMATION
FOR A SITE SPECIFIC PROJECT, i.e. LIFE SAFETY OF THIS PRODUCT, ADEQUACY
OF STRUCTURE RECEIVING THIS PRODUCT AND SEALING ARQUND OPENING FOR
WATER INFILTRATION RESISTANCE ETC.

CONDITIONS NOT SHOWN IN THIS DRAWING ARE TO BE ANALYZED SEPARATELY,
AND TO BE REVIEWED BY BUILDING OFFICIAL.

DESIGN LOADS SHOWN ARE BASED ON 'ALLOWABLE STRESS DESIGN (ASD)'.

~—2, 3 OR 4 AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION

‘___DOOR MULLION ANCHORS
SEE SHEETS 4 & 6

INSTRUCTIONS:
USE CHARTS AS FOLLOWS.

DETERMINE DESIGN WIND PRESSURE REQUIREMENTS BASED
ON WIND VELOCITY, BLDG. HEIGHT, WIND ZONE USING
APPLICABLE ASCE 7 STANDARD.

SEE CHARTS ON SHEET 2 FOR GLASS DESIGN LOAD
CAPACITY.

STEP 1

STEP 2

STEP 3 CHECK MULLION DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY FOR A GIVEN

SPACING AND HEIGHT USING CHARTS ON SHEET 3 FOR
STOREFRONT MULLION AND SHEET 5 FOR DOOR MULLION.
THE CAPACITY SHOULD EXCEED THE DESIGN LOAD.

USING CHARTS ON SHEET 4 SELECT ANCHOR OPTION
WITH DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY MORE THAN DESIGN LOAD
SPECIFIED IN STEP 1 ABOVE.

STEP 4

THE LOWEST VALUE RESULTING FROM STEPS 2, 3 AND 4
THAT EXCEED THE DESIGN WIND PRESSURES DETERMINED
THRU STEP 1 SHALL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

STEP 6 FOR SYSTEMS WITH UNANCHORED JAMBS, USING SHEETS 9
& 10, DETERMINE THE MIN. & MAX. GAP DIMENSIONS.
WHEN USING THIS SYSTEM WITH DOORS, THE LOWER VALUE
OF THE DESIGN PRESSURE RATING FOR THE SYSTEM AND
THE DOOR SHALL APPLY.

STEP 7

D.L. OPG D.L. OPG.
WIDTH WIDTH
SEE CHART SEE CHART
SHEET 2 SHEET 2
[ -4
— L LI
&
£ A A
o
5lu o AR ~
=iz
= N T R 55 (2
= WiT >9< ks >?<
x| I|n D Tin D
8 Sl \10/ Sk \10/
(= aig 0.1
ol ‘s o\ 7y
B (8] /// F &) e
| = 7
[%8] %]
c
7 N8/ 7/A8/
U= M FH T
; Al
/
/
[ ANCHORS TYPE A, B, C OR D
~—-2, 3 OR 4 AT EACH JAMB
SEE SHEET 4
TYPICAL ELEVATIONS SINGLE LITE

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
B:WM%mﬁi%a

MiamiéDade Produc,t’C(;ltrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.18

Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
B:WM%Wﬁé%%

Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co)'ltrol

WINDOW WALL SYSTEM WITH GLASS TYPES ‘A" & ‘B’
COMPLIES WITH REQUIREMENTS OF ANSi

Z87.1.

LAMINATED GLASS
INSUL. LAM. GLASS
LARGE MISSILE IMPACT

a
Qo
G &
© i)
- /2
.___.w,g
oy
o
£ =3EiC
O 58|c
cv>lo
& .85
<E z &
& =g
Eoogo
6oa ¢
>N ;
Loy %
For u
.
Ogmg
oio—mo‘
ra &
Qn.ngﬂ
0Lz <
mmmcg
cz
uUSE g
We -0
kzo58
o OO L
Z M= 0
gias ¢
| U
G
g T
— 0
— [I¢]
- -
= 7
= &
= "
[ w
7 -
o 8
)
N e
= .
Z 0 - %
=|-dw "
2l x
Z e
ENY e 5
5303;,‘;10
S99 < w4
<O‘ ~)
SIZEJ°
8Z= 8
[ O
gmmg.
o s = -
%LIJP’)§D—
AN
CTTTTTTTTTTTD
N
sllbiole
B¢ 88
~ll 818
PR
cIRTIRIR
O -
ﬁEgEE
SIEd IR
HEEE
5|5 1215(5
>
o
S EIIE
O-A-JEDCOIXJN
Olloja |||
295/8|=|8
égmu.wI_J
.
g |
© o
T |z
g =
o B
o 2
© ol E
© el ©
T Ty
drawing no.

(sheet 1 of 17)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


CHART #1
GLASS LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
GLASS TYPE | GLASS TYPE | GLASS TYPES
NOMINAL DIMS. w’ ‘B’ ‘A1’ & 'BI’
D.L.O. WIDTH| D.L.O. HEIGHT| EXT.(+)/INT.(=) | EXT.(+)/INT.(=) | EXT.(+)/INT.(=)
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 65.0 120.0 90.0
40" o 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
48" 65.0 120.0 90.0
52" 65.0 120.0 90.0
57-1/4" 65.0 120.0 90.0
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 65.0 120.0 90.0
40" 93-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
48" 65.0 120.0 90.0
52" 65.0 120.0 90.0
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 65.0 120.0 90.0
40" 97-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
48" 65.0 120.0 90.0
52" 65.0 120.0 90.0
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 105" 65.0 120.0 90.0
40" 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
48" 65.0 120.0 90.0
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 106" 65.0 120.0 90.0
40 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
48" 65.0 120.0 90.0
28" 65.0 120.0 90.0
32" 65.0 120.0 90.0
36" 115 65.0 120.0 90.0
40" 65.0 120.0 90.0
45-1/2" 65.0 120.0 90.0
NOTE:
GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS).

INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS OR HEIGHTS ALLOWED.

5/8" MIN. TYP.

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer
-~ Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, Inc.

\1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS

TR
(I
- b
< ] G
) b
”/ ‘e_é]ja“r
—
=% e

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE A’
9/16" OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

1/4" TEMP. GLASS

1/2" AR SPACE

-1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
.080" Interlayer

Trosifol PVB
By ‘kuraray America, inc.’

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

D.L.O. HEIGHT

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer
SentryGlas
By ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

V /4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

o
3
z f, LLEn
210 i
i{ é a: :;[ 14
: i
/ @U‘e i
]
e S S O

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE 'B’
9/16" OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

1/4”" TEMP. GLASS

1/2" AR SPACE

1/4” HEAT STREN'D GLASS
.090" Interlayer

SentryGlas
YB)/ ‘Kuraray America, Inc.’

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

5/8" MIN, TYP,
GLASS BITE

@1

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE 'Bi’

1-5/16" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

GLAZING OPTIONS

Qﬁ. w b E| h
5 [i\ i.fl ’
Z |, Ql l bI{
PRODUCT RENEWED 2‘_!5’ ! “! ) ! 14
As complying with the Florida © & i 1
Building Code I >/li| "! 121
NOA-No. 24-0513.04 t&.ﬂfllw— !: !
Exq%tmion; : % 0/2812029 | | L
By: Y472} o
MiamiéDade Produc,t’Ct;ﬂrol % ‘?;r—__‘/—'~:3L:’_f__——1 15 \@
=
&
D.L.0. WIDTH D.L.O. WIDTH GLASS TYPE ‘A1’
1-5/16" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS
-
xI
o
¥
o 1/2” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:
»y 3 SPACER:
LI B 'HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
t BY ‘LINGERMANN GMBH’
& AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.
8 » PERIMETER SEALANT:
T v SILICONE
S DOWSIL 791
= GE 2000
GLASS

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.18

Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
Bj%%%wﬁéﬁa

Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co}-trol

Vg
[
| &
(o] jT
[0)]
g
py
®
zZ 3R
Q- 33|c
=z "o
L 2 QN
¢z 30
& o)
)
Eoosd
4]
Ogg ~
Loy %
fFf or W
3
Qoap
O2ud
28y
GCeEmo
(vl 2 4 S
Qoo
’_Dm
OILE 4
U}%mw
mng‘“
quUSi g
u.%w.:o
Tt £o0s @
.J(.'J‘D(_i
Zm_w
dians ¥
—
[
— ©
= ©
3 wn
= !
w
= M)
’L_.I._J 0
w —
> 1)
[@p] (@]
A
3 .
=10 =
= W L
S~
5| E
= -
= ™~
E I p BCA R
2303;)5
SHO < 8
Z=i0 . 3
ol£d=z 1 ¢
BITZ+ 0
& - 8
w O =
Slpno =
ol MY B
Gluim =B
\/ _
C D
=
— -
Fingd
Lx.(:/[]h-%
.’tmgw
882‘\"—5
S
HaZigl2
T8 o<
Ol | =%
IR r- 10
SIS
>
1]
A NEERE
O-O-‘LO(XJ(DN
Qlo|N|a ==
2°el8 =8
gS‘““-OI_
o
(o]
it
© o
Lol &
Shs .
.. -y
£ R
© allsll5
T T
drawing no.

sheet 2 of 17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


D.L.O. WIDTH

D.L.0. HEIGHT

D.L.O. HEIGHT

5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

.090" Interlayer
Saflex Clear And Color Glass
By 'Egstman Chemical Co.'

XT/-’%" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

&) §

D.L.O. HEIGHT

INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS OR HEIGHTS ALLOWED.

CHART #1.1
GLASS LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
GLASS TYPES
NOMINAL DIMS. 'C & CY
D.L.O. WIDTH| D.LO. HEIGHT | EXT.(+)/INT.(=)
28" 90.0
32" 90.0
36" 90.0
40" Y 90.0
45-1/2" . 30.0
48" 90.0
52" 80.0
28" 90.0
32" 90.0
36" 90.0
40" 93-1/2" 90.0
45-1/2" 90.0
48" 90.0
52" 90.0
28" 30.0
32" 90.0
36" 97-1/2" 90.0
40" 90.0
45-~-1/27 90.0
48" 90.0
28" 90.0
32" 90.0
36" 105" 30.0
4Q" 80.0
45-1/2" 90.0
28" 90.0
32" 109" 90.0
36" 90.0
40" 30.0
28" 90.0
32° 115" 30.0
36" 90.0
40" 90.0
NOTE:

GLASS CAPACITIES ON THIS SHEET ARE
BASED ON ASTM E1300-09 (3 SEC. GUSTS).

Er_‘:%F‘ 15 @

EXTERIOR

5/8" MIN. TYP.
GLASS BITE

X I

GLASS TYPE ‘C’
9/16” OVERALL LAMINATED GLASS

1/4" TEMP. GLASS

1/2" AIR SPACE
1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS
.090" Interlayer

Saflex Clear And Color Glass
By 'Eastman Chemical Co.’

1/4" HEAT STREN'D GLASS

EXTERIOR

GLASS TYPE ‘C1’

1-5/16" OVERALL INSUL. LAM. GLASS

GLAZING OPTIONS

1/2” AIR SPACE CONSISTING OF:

SPACER:

‘HELIMA" LOW PROFILE ALUMINUM SPACER
BY 'LINGERMANN GMBH’

AROUND THE PERIMETER OF THE GLASS.

PERIMETER SEALANT:

SILICONE
DOWSIL 791
GE 2000

PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED

As complying with the Florida As complying with the Florida
Building Code Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0513.04 NOA-No.

Expiration Date:10/28/2029 Expiration Date; 10/28/2024
BfW%%a%fi%a B;%%Wa%fé%a

23-0928.18

Miam;éDade Producrt“‘c&'ntrol Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co}-trol
SEP 27 2523

GLASS

Vg
Lt
Yo &
@ R
e /@
g
PN
4 S &0
Or 88l
CILA e}
F& L85
<E N
gt 3@
Col g
oo @
> N :
Loy %
For w
-]
Qoap
Q3ud
629
CLsme
rXx &
on.di
O3z <
mmmog
xza
guUSL g
u%‘ﬂ_‘o
P S0 @
2882,
g Sas
R— g N
[
— ©
= i
= 7
[20]
= !
ad [{e)
5 —
& 8
Q
" z
=2 .
=10 <
[
=4
g|" &
= - N —
END g 6
EBO)F)U')
=1 R
20 . ]
SIZ34 2
. )
21z="g
w O
Slnw =
Z|0nsd
%LLIP‘)E»-
C T
P
2|k
21 E
8%,
<ial2
§ zlolF
Lo ElIFY
ST g
fw S
2 lwikld
al nlS
5] Sialo
o D2 Z
>
o
o =)
I EEE
.gU 23
g)g Wl
¢

04~-16-09

5
o~
o~
o
o
I
f
H
|
2
L
N4
£
LJ

N
i o
s x
«
S
>
RS
o
g [
G

date:

S
drawing no.

W09 -25
(sheet 2.10117)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


CHART #2
MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF
WITH OR WITHOUT INTERMEDIATE HORIZONTALS] [WITH OR WITHOUT INTERMEDIATE HORIZONTALS
JAMB IV JAMB ‘It
NOMINAL DIMS. MULL ‘M1’ NOMINAL DIMS. MULL ‘MY’
EXT. (+) EXT. (+)
WIDTH (W) | FRAME HEIGHT| INT. (=) WIDTH (W) |FRAME HEIGHT! INT. (=)
307 100.0 30" 65.0
36" 100.0 36" 65.0
42" 20" 100.0 427 108" 65.0
48" 100.0 48" 65.0
54" 100.0 53" 65.0
60" 100.0 30" 65.0
30" 100.0 36" 65.0
36" 100.0 42" 110-1/2" 65.0
42" 78" 100.0 48" 65.0
48" 100.0 52" 65.0
54" 100.0 30" 65.0
59" 100.0 36" 65.0
60" 65.0 42" 1147 65.0
30" 100.0 48" 65.0
36" 100.0 50" 65.0
42" 86-1/2" 100.0 30" 65.0
48" 100.0 36" 120" 65.0
53" 100.0 42" 65.0
54" 65.0 48" 64.5
60" 65.0
30" 100.0
36" 100.0
42" 90" 100.0
48" 100.0
51" 100.0
54" 65.0
60" 65.0
307 100.0
36" 100.0
47" 0" 100.0
48" 100.0
54" 65.0
60" 65.0
30" 65.0
36" 65.0
42" 98-1/2" 65.0
48" 65.0
54" 65.0
58" 65.0
30" 65.0
36" 65.0
42" 102" 85.0
48" 65.0
54" 65.0
56” 65.0

INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS OR HEIGHTS ALLOWED.

2]
CHART #3 INTERMEDIATE HORIZONTALS g Q f‘,;;
MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF MULLION LOAD CAPACITY - PSF a (OPTIONAL) m B
WITH OR WITHOUT INTERMEDIATE HORIZONTALS WITH OR WITHOUT INTERMEDIATE HORIZONTALS L o
e 1ot R 10 =
JAMB I’ | JAMB 'J1 JAMB JU' | JAMB U1 | 3 \z 2 =e|-
NOMINAL DIMS. MULL 'M2’ | MULL ‘M3’ NOMINAL DIMS. MULL 'M2' | MULL 'M3' | < =====dt==ckodles==adeond Or 23|
EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) EXT. (+) | & 5 F g - 815
WIDTH (W) | FRAME HEIGHT| INT. (=) INT. (=) WIDTH (W) |FRAME HEIGHT] INT. (-) N (-) | & . = u €z 33
= (')
30" 30.0 120.0 30" 90.0 120.0 ] P w Ecosd
» T = 6o 2
35 90.0 120.0 36" 90.0 120.0 N “p i = SN
% y o E & o §
42" ., 90.0 120.0 42" 110-1/2" 90.0 120.0 - Egoe &
72 % Oban
48" 90.0 120.0 48" 30.0 109.8 I | 0 on
54” 90.0 120.0 52" 90.0 101.4 g T 8 g &
~m
60" 90.0 120.0 30" 90.0 1200 | Wi w2 w3 g EX a9
30" 90.0 120.0 36" 30.0 120.0 o 03I E 2
. . . nee @
36 90.0 120.0 42 114 90.0 117.9 E WIDTH (W) = Wi E i §§ N
42" g 90.0 120.0 48" 90.0 103.2 @ AT FRAME JAMSB Luv_ 8
9]
48" 90.0 120.0 50" 30.0 99.1 g W2 + W3 A6 85 -
547 90.0 120.0 30" 90.0 1200 | & WIDTH (W) = <ZosE
: : : : < AT FRAME MULLION 2 wo=rl
60" 90.0 120.0 36" u 30.0 120.0 o R |
120 a N
30" 90.0 120.0 42" 90.0 106.4 @ — ©
36" 90.0 120.0 48" 90.0 93.1 Z = r?
42 86-1/2" 90.0 120.0 = §
48" 90.0 120.0 =
53" 90.0 120.0 D 7 3
60" 90.0 120.0 e = 2
30 90.0 120.0 Eamaa =19+ 2
36" 90.0 120.0 ElOW
: ~¢ 2 &
42 00" 30.0 120.0 = =NV g b
48" 30.0 120.0 =26
. S0+ @1
51 90.0 120.0 2o Mg
60" 90.0 11200 JAMB J1’ S EET D
30 90.0 120.0 NO REINF. DI Z .8
» 11 ALUM nil O 5
36 0.0 120.0 Ix 4] 8.7605 =lVN8=
42" - 90.0 120.0 Sx_N"3] 3.5042 Eliulm = F
48" 90.0 120.0 C—————
547 90.0 120.0 D D V7] g M
60" 90.0 116.4 J
307 90.0 120.0 A= ololg
LiT|w I
36" 90.0 120.0 NN
; ] g1218%
42 o 90.0 120.0 o SEIESE
98-1/2 S
48" 90.0 120.0 SNEEIRE
Y Y clalzlal g
54" 90.0 120.0 x SIEIEEE
- 10
58" 90.0 114.4 MULLION ‘M1 MULLION ‘M2’ MULLION *M3’ 5|5 2152
o 500 00 NO REINF. ALUM REINF. STEEL REINF. B
367 90.0 120.0 Mi_ | ALUM M2 | ALUM M3 ALUM [ STEEL B
Ix IN"4] B.7132 Ix IN"4[12.6724 Ix IN"4] 8.7132 | 2.7858 2l PR =R b
42" ) 90.0 120.0 Sx INv3| 3.4853 Sx W3] 5.069 §x IN3] 3.4853 | 1.0381 Slels | o
8 102 90.0 120.0 B EIEE
48" . . B S8« 3
N PRODUCT RENEWED PRODUCT REVISED § Olwle ol
54 90.0 114.6 As complying with the Florida As complying with the Florida S =
56" 90.0 110.5 Building Code Building Code | S
e 500 700 NOA-No. 24-0513.04 NOA-No. 23-0928.18 2
" Expiration Date:10/28/2029 Expiration Date; 10/28/2024 ® o
36 90.0 120.0 &W 1744 2 o
42" 108" 90.0 120.0 By: Ao By: §a72) g =
e >
48" 90.0 115.0 MiamiéDade Producrﬂ:(;ntrol Miam{:Dade Produc,t’Co}ntrol ¥ E| 2
-t . X
53" 80.0 104.1 3 56
SO —
: a drawing no.
{ SEP 27 20
MULLIONS | W09-25

sheet 3 of 17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


CHART #4 ANCHOREiJS?j)) gA‘i??'I";Y PSF
ANCHORS TYPE ‘A’ | ANCHORS TYPE 'B’ | ANCHORS TYPE ‘C’ | ANCHORS 'D’
NOMINAL DIMS. 1/4” MAX. SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM 3/8” MAX. SHIM [1/4” MAX. SHIM
WIDTH (W) |FRAME HEIGHT] A2 A3 Ad B2 B3 B4 c2 C3 C4 D2 D3
30" 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 112.4 | 120.0 | 120.0 } 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" 797 105.9 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 96.4 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 106.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
48" 92.7 1 120.0 1 120.0 | 84.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 93.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
54" 82.4 1120.0|120.0] 75.0 | 112.4 | 120.0 | 82.7 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
60" 74.1 11112 1200 67.5 | 101.2 11200 744 11116 {1200 | 119.5 | 1200
30" 120.0 1 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 } 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 114111200 | 120.0 [ 103.8 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 114.5  120.0 | 120.0 ] 120.0 | 120.0
42" 78" 97.8 1120.0 | 120.0| B9.0 | 120.0 | 120.0| 98.1 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 1200
48” 85.5 | 120.0 | 1200 77.8 | 116.8 | 120.0] 85.8 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 1200
54" 76.0 | 1141 11200 69.2 | 103.8 | 120.0 | 76.3 | 114.5 1 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
60" 68.4 |102.6 | 120.0 ] 62.3 | 93.4 | 120.0] 68.7 | 103.0 | 120.0 | 110.3 | 1200
30" 120.0 | 120.0 1 120.0 1 112.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 ] 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 120.0
36" 102.8 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 93.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 103.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 120.0
42" 86-1/2" 88.2 | 120.0 1 120.0 | 80.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 } 88,5 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
48" 77.1 | 1157 | 120.0| 70.2 | 10563 | 1200 | 77.4 | 116.1 1 120.0 | 120.0 | 1200
54" 68.6 | 102.8 1 120.0 | 62.4 | 93.6 | 120.0 | 688 | 103.2 | 120.0 1 110.5 | 120.0
60" 61.7 | 926 11200 56.2 | 84.2 | 112.3 | 61.9 | 92.9 | 120.0| 99.4 | 120.0
30" 118.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 [ 107.9 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 119.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 120.0
36" 98.8 | 120.0 1 120.0 ] 90.0 | 120.0 | 120.0{ 99.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 } 120.0 | 120.0
42" N 84.7 1120.0 | 1200 77.1 | 115.7 | 120.0 | 85.0 | 120.0 1 120.0 { 120.0 | 120.0
48" % 741 1112 11200 | 67.5 | 101.2 | 1200} 744 | 111.6 | 120.0 1195 | 120.0
54" 65.9 | 98.8 | 1200 60.0 | 90.0 | 119.9 | 66.1 | 99.2 | 120.0 | 106.2 | 120.0
60" 58.3 | 89.0 [ 1186 | 54.0 | 81.0 |107.9 | 59.5 | 89.3 | 119.0 | 95.6 | 120.0
30" 111.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 } 101.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 111.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 2.7 1 120.0 1 120.0| 84.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 93.0 | 120.0 {1 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" N 78.4 , 118.1 1 120.0§ 72.3 | 108.4 | 120.0 | 78.7 | 119.6 | 120.0 § 120.0 | 120.0
48" % 69.5 11043 | 120.0| 63.3 | 949 |120.0| 69.8 | 1046 | 1200 | 112.0 |, 1200
54" 61.8 | 92.7 [ 120.0] 56.2 | 843 | 11241 620 | 93.0 1200} 99.6 | 120.0
60" 556 | 834 (1112 506 | 75.9 | 101.2| 558 | 83.7 | 1116 | 89.6 | 120.0
30" 108.4 | 120.0 1 120.0 ] 98.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 108.8 | 120.0 | 120.0 ] 120.0 | 120.0
36" 0.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 82.2 | 120.0 1 120.0 | 90.6 | 120.0 {1 120.0 1 120.0 | 120.0
42" 98-1/2" 77.4 1 116.1 1 120.0{ 70.5 | 105.7 | 120.0| 77.7 | 116.5 | 120.0 } 120.0 | 120.0
48" 67.7 1101.6 {1200 616 | 925 | 120.0| 68.0 | 102.0 | 120.0 | 109.2 | 120.0
54" 60.2 | 90.3 | 120.0| 548 | 822 | 109.6 | 60.4 | 90.6 | 120.0| 97.0 | 120.0
30" 104.7 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 95.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 { 105.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 87.2 1120.0 | 120.0| 79.4 | 119.1 1 120.0 | 87.5 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" 102" 74.8 | 112.1 ,120.0 | 68.0 | 102.1 | 120.0] 75.0 | 11251 120.0 ] 120.0 | 120.0
48" 65.4 | 981 1 120.0] 595 | 89.3 | 119.1| 656 | 985 | 120.0 ] 105.4 | 120.0
54" 58.1 | 87.2 | 116.3| 52,8 | 79.4 | 1058 | 58.4 | 87.5 | 116.7 | 93.7 | 1200
30" 98.8 [ 120.0 1 120.0] 90.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 99.2 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 108" 82.4 |120.0 {1200 75.0 | 112.4 | 120.0] 82.7 |120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" 70.6 1 105.9 | 120.0| 64.3 | 96.4 | 120.0| 70.9 | 106.3 | 120.0 ] 113.8 | 120.0
48" 61.8 | 92.7 [ 120.0] 56.2 | 84.3 | 1124 | 62.0 | 93.0 | 120.0| 99.6 | 120.0
30" 96.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 87.9 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 97.0 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 80.5 | 120.0 1 120.0| 73.3 | 109.8 | 120.0 | 80.8 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" 110-1/2" | 69.0 | 103.5 | 120.0 | 62.8 | 94.2 | 120.0 | 69.3 | 103.9 | 120.0 | 111.2 | 120.0
48" 60.4 | 806 | 120.0] 55.0 | 824 | 108.9| 606 | 90.8 | 1200 | 87.3 | 120.0
30" 93.6 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 85.2 | 120.0 { 120.0 | 94.0 | 120.0 { 120.0 } 120.0 | 120.0
36” 1147 78.0 1 117.11120.01 71.0 | 10865 | 120.0) 78.3 | 117.5 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
42" 66.9 | 100.3 | 120.0 § 609 | 913 | 120.0] 67.1 | 100.7 | 120.0 1 107.8 | 120.0
48" 585 | 878 | 117.1]1 53.3 | 79.9 {1065 ] 58.7 | 88.1 [117.5] 94.3 | 1200
30" 83.0 |120.0 | 120.0 | 81.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 88.3 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0 | 120.0
36" 120" 74.1 11112 1120.01 675 [ 101.2 1 120.0] 744 | 1116 | 1200 | 119.5 | 120.0
42" 63.5 | 5.3 1120.0] 57.8 | 86.7 | 115.7 ] 63.8 | 95.7 | 120.0 | 102.4 | 120.0
48" 556 | 834 1 111.2] 506 | 759 1012} 558 | 837 | 111.6] 89.6 | 120.0

INTERPOLATION BETWEEN WIDTHS OR HEIGHTS ALLOWED.

INTERMEDIATE . ,
HORIZONTALS E.S. WINDOWS
OPTIONAL DOOR
ALL FIXED LITES SEE SEPARATE NOA
] B A LI T
i A —
I N
N i e AT R
7 VA 7 AN FE BN | 7
7, 7 | | s,
’(:g g 0w S f; ::g e f: : ;} AN
g y L] g L 7 - Lz 2N
I | e ettt S T o (RS S * 7 TS N R AAE | N
L VN | ity e [ S Y | w e il 1 AT
= , . = 2 I 2 “ N [l A
5 S A = i ; i
- b - b i b AR 7
| - i i -
e N 7 :: \ !ZHF /o A
g i N . i N VAR 7
I L 1 byt !
— i -
v 3 0 L b L
W1 w2 W1 w2 w1 w2
WIDTH (W) = W1+ W2 WIDTH (w) = — %1+ W2 WIDTH (W) = W1, W2
2 2 2 4
E.S. WINDOWS
—DOOR & TRANSOM
| SEE SEPARATE NOA
T‘: ::::::T
I Ly i 2
] 1] L | |
Il . i 3 td 3 b
4" 2 3,, | H 3:' F:::x:::;j ‘s
4" E i /ol 2
———Dl 3" [ I / I @)
4 > I !
I & o/ “
xT i
w i 4 e | Eoo==
¢ ., v 7 Ii
Z . ¢ ot !
L {/ k ‘.
1L 0 i 1 ‘ ! R
g1 RREREE N 7
| " N i ’
IS £ AN
" 3 !
3 o2 I N
» ’ l
. 3 %:::::sﬁ
A2, B2 C2 A3, B3, C3 A4, B4, C4 3 b
W1 w2
ANCHORS TYPES: SEE SHEET 7 FOR DESCRIPTION WDTH (W) = W1+ W2
A2 = (2) ANCHORS TYPE 'A’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION 2
B2 = (2) ANCHORS TYPE 'B’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION
C2 = (2) ANCHORS TYPE 'C’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION
D2 = (2) ANCHORS TYPE ’D’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION
A3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'A’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION
B3 = (3) ANCHORS -TYPE 'B’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION
C3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'C’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION PRODUCT REVISED
D3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'D’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION As complying with the Florida
Building Code
A4 = (4) ANCHORS TYPE 'A’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION NOA-No. 23.0928.18
B4 = (4) ANCHORS TYPE B’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION o .
C4 = (4) ANCHORS TYPE 'C’ AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION EXRiration Date:10/28/2024
D4 = (4) ANCHORS TYPE ‘D' AT EACH SIDE OF JAMB AND MULLION gy, 7200)

PRODUCT RENEWED

As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No.

Expirati
By:RW

24-0513.04

ion Date; %0/28/2029
ﬂ&q)'

Miamiépade ProductTontrol

Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co}-trol

SEP 27 203

N
O i
L
Wee &
© )
P £ 4
g
4 @)=
0. 33|&
=z “do
u oo
g 2 2 &
el Ia
el e
o
Oopg ¢
Lo
LW <
ok w
[
357
w el
85m
LeEmo
[+ 4 &
oLésg
it
mng“‘
gUSL g
Yoo
bz 58
JG(D<_§
Zm—m
€ias ¥
N
C____TT
[— e
— ©
- w0
= -
o o]
pa— '
o
= "
() Vo]
b
(2] —~
> ['e]
(2} Q
L)
—t e
= .
=10 o’
=~ L L
S d L
S|k
= e N
B(é)m-&tn
= oo
S0« 1
=a '8
8;3_.}‘0
o~
8|F="8
w O
Slppo 2
EiSn S
%LLJT’)E;—
|
N
— -
188
WwiTik|x
NI
|5 2|82
NGNS
ngEg
9. 1z2lnlZ
Sl g
OQ—IE—ES
YRR
Digiolaio
oisiz|=>12
>
Lo
RIS
oBI&& 2
2°5/87)8
égmu.@:t—)
. )
o i
b ol
T z
< =
o ..
. >
> £
] a
- . -~
s 55
drawing no.

(sheet 4 of17)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


FRAME HEIGHT

FRAME HEIGHT

-
CHART #5 CHART #6 ( (ORI
DOOR MULLION LOAD CAPACITY~PSF DOOR MULLION LOAD CAPACITY-PSF m* &[
SIDELITE | FRAME |MULL 'MD!’|MULL 'MD2’ SIDELITE | FRAME |MULL 'MD1|MULL 'MD2' e 2
WIDTH | BEIGHT [ ex1. (+) | EXT. (+) WIDTH HEIGHT T eyr 4y | ExT. (+) 4 < ® =
INCHES | INCHES | INT. (=) | WNT. (=) INCHES | INCHES | NT. (=) | WNT. (=) O, wolg
32 120.0 120.0 30 50.0 30.0 EZ > § =
36 120.0 120.0 36 90.0 90.0 gz ol
42 86_1,/2" 120.0 120.0 42 9 90.0 90.0 a 4 Sol §
” - N el
ES. WINDOWS' 46 1/4" MAX. 48 120.0 120.0 48 90.0 90.0 u 8 %N %
DOOR DOOR WIDTH 54 120.0 120.0 ” 500 9.0 3 ey g
SEE SEPARATE NOA 60 120.0 1200 | < 60 90.0 900 |= Obap
\—- 32 120.0 1200 | ¥ 30 90.0 900 |» ORud
_____;%V 36 120.0 1200 |9 36 90.0 900 |5 ORE" g
| 4 = <
Y i /0 ., 2 | geq/pr | 1200 1200 | T 42 102 90.0 900 | 8 gEg §
72 s 7 % 48 120.0 120.0 g 48 90.0 90.0 o ¢ oo S ¢
. :,// | 2 54 115.7 1200 | & 54 90.0 900 |© < g%u‘_ &
z i // | S 58 111.3 1200 |4 30 90.0 90.0 T k z cu':) s 8
o |p===z=====3fl | of 32 116.2 1200 | o 36 108 90.0 900 |B -l 00
e I . ., |© 36 110.5 1200 |© 42 90.0 90.0 = Cionz >
‘v I \ i v w| X 42 110-1/2" 103.0 120.0 %) 48 89.3 30.0 z _BJ
e i AN R4 3 8 = ol —
/. ! N e 96.5 1200 |6 30 90.0 90.0 < gr ©
! N 52 92.5 1200 | % 36 90.0 900 | L = o
—————— ‘ 32 106.1 1200 | & e “ h :
tﬁ ______ \ﬂ . . & 42 84.9 90.0 > = o
—————— 36 101.0 1200 | = 48 80.2 90.0 o P ©
E 43 374" & 42 114" 94.1 120.0 & 30 7 = z 9
SIDELITE_ WIDTH MA)/(/. INTERMEDIATE 48 8.1 1200 1% oL 20913 - 3
SEE CHART ' CL TO CL DM —HORIZONTALS ' : Z % 120 7o 200 1% 2 ~
OPTIONAL 50 86.3 1200 | O 42 725 90.0 @ Elo-
32 91.0 120.0 g 48 68.7 900 |z =0
) o
. , 46 1/4” MAX. % 120 865 1200 & Elshy o
Es WiNDDOo%SR DOOR WIDTH “2 80.7 1200 14 ES. WINDOWS = g oo
5 755 T8 1E DOOR & TRANSOM =IZom 0
SEE SEPARATE NOA - SEE SEPARATE NOA 2 8 <+ é
e 89" MAX. b e usfutbuspdsg e = Z=z ;©
. o ! i ‘ zz+0
s k v, DOOR WIDTH o | s | SIEZ- 35
______ | | i | nl .os
F---------jp-Y----Z-z LTI Lo oITTT P oI ooTIoI]ETIIICoCossoTTIn == &J n L(Ln.) <
| S S Ly [ Cmm— giwo = E
| / i 7 7 | i\ I i i N R I
, ) i I I G—
I iy AR B RN o - | | /A
& I a £ [ N = Sl i 2o N i =)
: L 2 - 1 N 5 = IO N 5
5 Vo N i e P , P ) 1 P TE i ! n_ |
o , AN | T ek o % 728 1 A S|= wo % A AN IS 8 |82
Lu . I 7 ) 35 77 bl 7 NbE---= ) 2 = Y l i 7 g £EE
& 2 | , ez w Cokd T EEES =¥ ez o 7. Lkl “ 2z S
‘s ] s : |0 B4t Fll ( . 18 - 7 i T Al 2 . 1S NEIMEE
P 4 % © e 3 - i I s SINIING
i R © % w N I % i ! 7l 4 © | eI
! ! S b 7o 7 s ! b f ’ 3 SREEIE
f N ity s s e ! Ny ! e 9% x|%|0
N ¢y ! l (. t © 28|80
i ! \H!}L// i i N/ I ©35185|2
R \ﬂ ______ \Jj N AR ] I \ﬂ uf___--_ﬂ 2
b 43 3/47 2 3 . v Q v émggag
SIDELITE WIDTH MAX. 'ggg?z%’ﬂﬁ[g SIDELITE_WIDTH 86 1/2" MAX. SIDELITE WIDTH 86 1/2" MAX. Ollp|&|& =
SEE CHART ' CL TO CL DIM. OPTIONAL SEE CHART CL TO CL DIM. SEE CHART DGOR WIDTH 2581518
PRODUCT REVISED =3 o e e
PRODUQT R_EN EWED_ As complying with the Florida | ——
As complying with the Florida Building Code - {
:g:dl:‘lg Code 24-0513.04 G NOA-No. 23-0928.18 Q
\-No. - - = = Expiration Date; 10/28/2024 2 g
Expiration Date: 10/28/2029 3
By: A e — || 5
-y i Miam{—‘Dade Produc,t’Co)ﬂrol £ ¥
Miamj-Dade ProductTontrol . © S
» a9
D MULLION 'MD1’ MULLION 'MD2’ SEP 27 252 drawing no. |
OOR-WINDOW WALL NO REINF. ALUM REINF. W '
MD1 | ALUM MDZ | ALUM 09—-25
TRANSITION MULLION Tx N4, 9.9140 Tx 4] 155994
Sx N3] 3.9615 Sx IN"3] 6.2333 sheet § of17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


N

NS

e

//
<, s
e " s
7 7

‘s

e

)

iasesfauuguds

| , [

[ Sil

| I

R A

*ﬁ}; I :/Zf .,
i am ’
I / I{ 7
[ I
I / I
s ) :i L
i PV I | e
v s 1
i 77
| .
i ]
AN 7
i . v,
1 li
i !
i A
i AN \%}f

‘E.S. WINDOWS'
-DOOR & TRANSOM
{ SEE SEPARATE NOA
5 A e e ] = b 191 =
. ! . |
A r [ LaLy [
___________ A
___________ ooz -
‘};:z::::ij | ‘}ﬁ:=:::=%‘
/ x§ i ir AN fl //
- i i
Tl S R e
2l / IR N 5
ok il it S
w © v i v plEzooo=% 8T
Siw 14 oo 7N =
2|a 2o 7o o|2
E ! | = g
F I S e
\ i a Vg ol
L i S
N i / ! Q
Ny i
N s i
X i i
!Lzzzzzzﬁ | [yzxzzzzgi
FHtH-—— -~ Wl H
E i v
SIDELITE WIDTH 86 1/2" MAX.
SEE CHART DOOR WIDTH
CHART #7
ANCHOR LOAD CAPACITY ~ PSF
EXT.(+) & INT.(-)
NOMINAL DIMS. ANCHORS ANCHORS ANCHORS ANCHORS
WIDTH (W) |FraMe HEGHT| TYPE ‘A3’ TYPE ‘B3’ TYPE 'C3’ TYPE ‘D3’
30 99.5 108.5 99.9 120.0
36 88.9 96.9 89.2 120.0
42 o6 80.4 87.6 80.6 120.0 &
48 73.3 79.9 73.6 118.1 g
54 67.4 73.4 67.6 108.6 9
60 62.3 67.9 62.6 100.5 =
30 935 101.9 93.9 120.0 2
36 83.6 91.1 83.9 120.0 &
42 102 75.5 82.3 75.8 120.0 o
48 68.9 75.1 69.1 111.0 o
54 63.3 69.0 63.6 102.1 ©
30 88.2 96.1 88.5 120.0 e
36 78.8 85.9 79.1 120.0 B
108 =
42 71.3 77.7 71.5 114.8
48 65.0 70.9 65.2 104.8 &
30 83.5 91.0 83.8 120.0 2
36 74.6 81.3 74.9 120.0 o
114 o
42 67.4 73.5 67.7 108.7 -
48 61.5 67.1 61.7 99.2 g
30 80.9 88.2 81.2 120.0 <
36 120 72.2 78.7 72.4 116.3 %
42 65.1 71.0 65.4 105.0 é
48 59.3 64.7 59.6 95.6 z
ANCHORS TYPES: SEE SHEET 7 FOR DESCRIPTION
A3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'A’ AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION
B3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'B’ AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION
€3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'C' AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION
D3 = (3) ANCHORS TYPE 'D’ AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION i
|
5
5

FOR ANCHOR CAPACITIES FOR THE ABOVE CASES

SEE SHEET 4.

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
B;W%%a%fé%a

MiamiéDade Produc,t’Cc;ntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0928.18
Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
Byp\w

Miami/:Dade Produc,t’Co}\trol

TRANSITION MULLION ANCHORS
DOUBLE DOOR WITH TRANSOM

SEP 27 2303

Ul
Lt
G © |0
© q
\\________cn
g
—~
o
£ 87
OQr 28|
= P "‘3‘?0
hw AR
g5 3q|”
g2 Ia
ol¢g
o;.uﬁ <
Loy X%
Fgor o
o
Obap
O2u4
°>m
&Lzmo
X x &
Qn.ngﬁ
i
Ec29«
QuUsL g
w
u'zm_'o
it S0 0
2885
LLos ¥
p—
N
— ©
= ©
= 7
193
- My
Ll [(a}
% —_
S 79}
[¥p) O
e
= .
=10 3
=M "
2" &
£, - -
E N+ 5
Egm;m
SO 4
= Q | 5y
S BT
e
O
Slow 2
= =
Sl =
| G
N
-
8 Bl
~ at::
g QIZ
ﬁ959§
Claixigg
OlE | ElE
AESE1E-
I E IS
OiDjo|==Z
>
S
2 SRR
olsl&|& 22
2°58/ -8
égmuoI
¢

]

04-16-09

date:

&
x
<
=
5
)
I
°

chk. by:

YT Ty
drawing no.

W09—-25
(sheet 6 o117)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


FRAME HEIGHT

;YZFE’ICSI:E\?NCHORS 9 é TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS: SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING [ U @
. SEE ELEV. k
L > e N
o0 Bué% /FOR SPACING 2B FOR SPACING f_TYPE 'A'— 1/4" DIA. ULTRACON+ BY 'DEWALT (Fu=164 KSI, Fym148 KSI) m T
_ . g z INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES -
a. EDGE DIST. | g v | 1-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD r 4 o R~
< gy
: ~ B EneE THRU 1BY WOOD BUCKS INTO CONCRETE Oc 8 AIS
; O . . i * 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE I-<- g 2 8|
| NE| DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE 5,58
Jf l 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. 6od ¢
3 1 oo %
DL 2 LR ! INTO CONCRETE AND BLOCKS = 2-1/2" MIN. Obao
[y sia » » P
@ =t 215 INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1” MIN. (1/4” ANCHORS) ORud
& & INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1-1/4" MIN. (5/16" ANCHORS) 0228 o
N | <& L T T Qi8S
oL e < e — ——— I — J— J— — J— — I —_— o
= = l;ypg 'B'— - = : " (Fu=138 KSI, Fy=137 KSI) e ggE g
\@ INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES E :: zg 8
1-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD LU a9
[
I THRU 1BY WOOD BUCKS INTO CONCRETE I g(@)ﬁ 5
—_ ” - W
g VETAL TYPICAL ANCHORS EoGE I 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE €35 & g
g STRUCTURES FOR SPACING H)LSLT DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE —
. 1-1/4” MIN. EMBED INTO CONC. — ©
F .
" - ['e]
° & J | ANCHOR EDGE DISTANCES S 5
= e i INTO CONCRETE AND BLOCKS = 2-1/2" MIN. = 8
. % L INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1" MIN. & b
w - - . O - - — o o
g~ r [TYPE 'c’'~ 5/16” DIA ULTRACON BY ‘DEWALT' (Fu=177 KS|, Fy=155 KSi) = @’
]I, INTO 2BY WOOD BUCKS OR WOOD STRUCTURES o~ %
= %% ‘ 1-1/2" MIN. PENETRATION INTO WOOD =T
L_gg:;g e THRU 1BY WOOD BUCKS INTO CONCRETE =1 N3N
Qo: —{3) X6 1 1-1/4" MIN. EMBED INTO CONCRETE =12 “<s o
= = D a ©
7 DIRECTLY INTO CONCRETE =] 8 AN
1-1/2" . EM . << -9
E | 1/2" MIN. EMBED INTO CONC =229
s ANCHOR EDGE DISTANCES 812243
o | INTO CONCRETE AND BLOCKS = 2-1/2" MIN, Q32"
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1” MIN. (1/4” ANCHORS) = oL
INTO WOOD STRUCTURE = 1-1/4" MIN. (5/16" ANCHORS) AWM =Er
Lo T ImEE e e T e T A e R S | G
R
I T - nh"" o T . — T s T - - Y
TYPE 'D'~ 1/4” DIA, TEKS OR SELF DRILLING SCREWS ST/ST (GRADE 5 CRS)
& 1l | INTO METAL STRUCTURES AN
& o PRODUCT RENEWED (3) THREADS MIN. TO EXTEND BEYOND METAL THICKNESS glhigy
S i Qf.if:in“‘gp'é’g;l%w““ the Florida ALUMINUM: 1/8” THK. MIN. (6063=T5 MIN.) ~|Ble|®
3 i " poll K72] Niw
° H NOA-No. 24-0513.04 | (SSTTEE[ :IN1 éCS)NT/g:K\;VITﬁ”\/iLUSKUMZ TgGaﬁKilL,l\;‘AE[gj %R PAINTED) §%\F § "
1 . 100 112w
b 1/4” DRIL—FLEX BY ‘DEWALT Expiration Date; 10/28/2029 SHE 2
{u n’ (3) AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION By ANCHOR EDGE DISTANCES EERE
HER = » Cigioldlo
i Miam;éoade Produ gntml 3 INTO METAL STRUCTURE = 1/2” MIN. 3151252
ctT T N
®\ b WOOD AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS SG = 0.55 MIN. e
Pl CONCRETE AT HEAD, SILL OR JAMBS f'c = 3000 PSI MIN. ] NEIEEAI
& il " C-90 HOLLOW/FILLED BLOCK AT JAMBS f'm = 2000 PSI MIN.  |\O/5/&/& 2 =
' s B -
©) ® 5°5 PRODUCT REVISED Slgfalelol=
& As complying with the Florida ) J
R =42 WEEP HOLES: Building Code —
©, é§ Pwe W1 = 3/8" WEEP HOLES NOA-No. 23-0928.18 8| -
] @ gmu (1) AT 3" FROM EACH END Expiration Date: 10/28/2024 ® :u o
N, (2) AT EACH MULLION AT 3" FROM MULLION CENTERLINE. By: 729 sISIE
2 - _ ; Miam{_pade Produc,t’Co}ntrol g||8)a 2
e e T S % BB
oo Vv 4 . s drawing no.
TYPICAL ANCHORS WOOD BUCKS AND METAL STRUCTURES NOT BY ‘E.S. WDW.
EDGE DIST. P L NG MUST SUPPORT LOADS IMPOSED BY GLAZING SYSTEM AND W09—-25
TRANSFER THEM TO THE BUILDING STRUCTURE. LAMINATED GLASS VT



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


1BY
WOOD BUCKS

&

L

EDGE DIST. |

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

.

i

I

I

FRAME HEIGHT

D.L. OPG.

;

H
LY E
mgg
TIVO
mwm
Silad
0
=

1/4" DRIL-FLEX BY 'DEWALT
(3) AT EACH SIDE OF MULLION

EDGE DIST.

' g
Sy
-
&
: ® &
m f'% Y -
H %TITIQ—:F 13{
B —J ]!
¥ 0o
| il
L
| I
b |
[H ]‘! :!i
i
. TR
3 [ 1
% Il (L
= H; Jz al
e I
g 4
LY -
S5
/ SIES
Tino
Z%L g HE
] X io
8 <<
f1 7] ® =
w1 v v v

. L ?
v® , [
v N 4
N .

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV.
FOR SPACING

SEp 27 2323

Vg
G * |2
© W
o
g
Z o Q=
o5 ity
€. © g 4
=z Ol
b= g = 8|0
<F < &
Eooo o
ogg @
20 %
<
(el I
g D
ond
Q2uv
OREDS
0Edg:
O3z 4
ETER:
€ L5 5
il
Lz%2=28
i =02 C
2285
L
—
|
VR ¥
o [+8}
= i
= 7
[19]
- !
] ]
= —
> s}
Z 3
= %
FO- =
= 3k
2 &
=|lgo 35
= D fn 0
28 "g
S ES=np
'y =z [Te)
PRODUCT RENEWED &)= -2
As complying with the Florida QlaB=~
Building Code o v =
NOA-No. 24-0513.04 | & |W™=F
Expiration Date: 10/28/2029 |c—————
%W 1 e
By: M
MiamiéDade Produc,t‘C<;1trol olelols
MO W
[SUGE R ol I s 4
PRODUCT REVISED I
As complying with the Florida & ZIRIE
Building Code Slolwle |y
NOA-No. 23-0928.18 SIEHE
Lt xT
Expiration Date: 10/28/2024 8% 55/
RW iss S2le/5|2
By: B
Miami/;Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol
LI RETEI I
SRR
INSUL. LAM. GLASS GBI
é 8 wlwio|x
C
ol
ol
é i ] o
F ol %
<+ | F
; ?l; %
R
[+ o S el
B 0 el o
 CR——
drawing no.

(sheet 8 of 17)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


\/

1BY

WOOD BUCKS\

V.

UNSECURED JAMB
AT STRAIGHT OPNGS.

WITHOUT REINF.
@ SEE SHEET 3
FOR CAPACITY

"‘%ﬁ

{:__

T W e b ®
N / RN
A Y T ! . 5
q. v ~ » N Y
S @ EXTERIOR C:S [ S
S D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG. s '
\_SILICONE
DOWSIL 790
MIN & MAX. DEPTH = 3/8” MIN. MIN & MAX.
GAP FRAME WIDTH GAP
SEE CHART BELOW SEE CHART
BELOW
ALUM REINF. AP
SEE SHEET 3 FRAME HEIGHTS
FOR CAPACITY UPTO MIN. | MAX.
96" 3/16"| 3/4"
108" 5/16"| 3/4"
A0 E” 120" 3/8" | 3/4"

D.L. OPG.

D.L. OPG.

STEEL REINF.

@ SEE SHEET 3
FOR CAPACITY

v

;,
I!
i‘?
;
!
l|
A,//h
1
§
{
i
|
it
l
i
i

D.L. OPG.

D.L. OPG.

ALTERNATE SEALANTS AT JAMB GAPS CAN BE
DESIGNED BY ENGINEER OF RECORD
BASED ON MANUFACTURER GUIDE LINES.

SeP 27 1

Uy
L
- &
© i
AR -
S 1O
Z Se|>
o I~y
O 28z
E& .85
g g 2
e g
ﬂ o] G-
539 <
O a ¢
< ;
Loy %
For
3
QLap
aTE
OLE"3
Qang -
S 35 |
E229«
QUSL g
T % .- Q
t =Sos 0
2885
oz ¥ kﬁ
o
— )
= o
= I
o
-3 My
Lt w0
P 2
7 ]
— z
= .
=10 =
=38 °
2 o
2| o
NVt 5
=18257
=) R
olZ=z 5°
BTz 3
PRODUCT RENEWED o -
As complying with the Florida bkt (f) 8 =
Building Code EiYin < o
NOA-No. 24-0513.04 | & |WM =~
Expiration Date: 10/28/2029 | __— >
KW > S
By Ao
Miamiipade Producﬂ.’Co)ntrol olBlgls
o B TN
PRODUCT REVISED ~ ;) 2 2
As complying with the Florida SEE R
Building Code 2 Olwlelu
NOA-No. 23-0928.18 2,12 0l2
I
Sl Bet.10126/2024 pEieEd
5|5121512
By: 4778 =
Miami/;Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol ©
v W 0| O™
clesials s
Ololaoi e =
LAMINATED GLASS 20587 |8
et 8 wiwlolx
N/ NS —
| D

eeeeeeee

o

®a
uuuuu

/ONAL

amnm

N
AY
\\\\\

04-16-09

©
~
L)
P
o
53
7

dr. by: TARIO

date:
chk. by:

T Y
drawing no.

W09-25
(sheet 9 of 17)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


v

1BY

WOo0D BUCKS\

©

UNSECURED JAMB

AT STRAIGHT OPNGS.

WITHOUT R

®

kS

EINF.

SEE SHEET 3
FOR CAPACITY

|

:s; E Lo o e B e e i—*ﬁ@ e T e e e T ] e T e e e e . :
- e s e e e e e ] e |
T S 11 | ¥ . SO A
" ===t =g/ «
- ] B B X
e —
¥ 3 g L N
] é ‘ x g
N 5
: @ EXTERIOR @ @ a
D.L. OPG. D.L. OFG.
SILICONE
DOWSIL 790
MIN & MAX. DEPTH = 3/8" MIN. MIN & MAX.
GAP FRAME WIDTH GAP
SEE CHART BELOW SEE CHART BELOW
AL FRAME HEIGHTS GAP
FOR CAPACITY UPTO MIN. MAX.
96" 3/16"] 3/4”
108" 5/167] 3/4"
- - 120" 3/8" | 3/4”
f]%ﬁ)' ALTERNATE SEALANTS AT JAMB GAPS CAN BE
S i a0 - DESIGNED BY ENGINEER OF RECORD
E=———————xx——dl B === BASED ON MANUFACTURER GUIDE LINES.
- 1] =
i
D.L. OPG. (19) & D.L. OPG.
STEEL REINF.
@ SEE SHEET 3
FOR CAPACITY
Ee—— e e e
- =
B — T T — D R _é
D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG.

o)

SEP 27 B3

C WV
Lt
Yo © |8
o~N
© 5
m g
4 o )
) 2 9|g
=5 =¢ic
o
= ; 2 9|v
4z < 8
Eoou o
oz§ °©
Lol 2
gobE &
i
0530
O2uy
Q% m
OLED S
Qoo g w
O3L% 4
€229 8
guUsi g
I % [
t 205 2
2982
iz ¥
./
C
e
— ©
= et
= it
8
é Y
w —~
7 3
i z
e
Z .
=10 - §
=30
g &
=lge 95
= oy '
SO <20
o 783
SIEZE
PRODUCT RENEWED &|Z="8
As complying with the Florida PP L(O_) =~
Building Code N8
NOA-No. 24-0513.04 EJ wo s
Ex%ion Date: 10/28/2029 |
J N
By: M
Miamii‘pade Produc,t’t:(;'utrol cloln
o oW
Slwdy
PRODUCT REVISED ~ole o
As complying with the Florida CIR|E k=
Building Code 12l olulelw
NOA-No. 23-0928.18 SNHAE
X
Expiration Date; 10/28/2024 AR
B 17/’4 4 552|512
y: =
Miami/;Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol 2
AREBERE
Slig|s|g|= |
INSUL. LAM. GLASS iSRRI
\%;g wivjolz
C——
] B
: o |
: 4
S| FlL
RIERIE &
B8 zf
S8 LB s
| GO
Ty
drawing no.

isheet 10 of 17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


k

SECURED JAMB

o1

AT CURVED OPNGS.

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
CHART BELOW

TYPICAL ANCHORS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
CHART BELOW

2BY WOQD BUGK
WOOD STRUCTURES

As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No.

24-0513.04

% HOLE PLUG FOR CAPACITY 5 FOR CAPACITY
fat = =\
L Lo e W
g - / 8 - b =
w E L 4 'E [N
® | [ 4 S— g
B B s S RS | ;
- =4 =
L ! ‘A
; |
v | S TYPICAL ANCHORS [, | |
TYPICAL ANCHORS = SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING LAMINATED GLASS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
- CHART BELOW
CHART BELOW o FOR CAPACITY' - METAL
FOR CAPACITY -~ v s STRUCTURE
. 2BY WOQD BUGK
» 0 <4
WOOD STRUCTURES ) |
. ™ , e )
18Y /g ; Z Z
WOOD BUCKS ™| ¥ Lo
< F (:) X 1/4" MAX.
N 3/8" MAX. . . /
o - SHIM
SHIMS
. 3/8" MAX.
3/8" MAX. FRAME WIDTH / S .
SHIMS HIMS
SECURED JAMB TYPICAL ANCHORS TYPICAL ANCHORS
T AT CURVED OPNGS. SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING T SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
. CHART BELOW . CHART BELOW
7 HOLE PLUG FOR CAPACITY 5 FOR CAPACITY
(] (]
Lui . L wi
a — / b — & ek
V8] -«E I} -E VS w o
Y ) 2 o] L
= 4= [ A i £
\
TYPICAL ANCHORS — TYPICAL ANCHORS INSUL. LAM. GLASS
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
SEE ELEV. FOR SPACING
e CHART BELOW
CHART BELOW . FOR CAPACITY' METAL
FOR CAPACITY - v STRUCTURE PRODUCT RENEWED
9

1BY/‘

WOOD BUCKS'  ~

<
<

e___

S%D

3/8" MAX.
SHIMS aa
3/8" MAX. FRAME WIDTH 3/8" MAX. -
SHIMS SHIMS
1 / JAMB ANCHORS DESIGN LOAD CAPACITY — PSF

sl /? ANCHORS TYPE 'B’ ANCHORS TYPE 'C’ ANCHORS TYPE ‘D’
N ; AT 9" O.C. AT 18” O.C. AT 9" 0.C. | AT 18" O.C.
s> 4 1/4” SHIMS | 3/8" SHIMS | 1/4” SHIMS | 3/8" SHIMS | 1/4° SHIMS | 1/4° SHIMS
Y 5 T T O (5 /INT (=) | EXT.(+)/INT (=) | EXT (%) INT (=) | EXT (1) /INT (=) | EXT.(2)/INT (= | EXT (20 /T (=)

4 307 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0

. 36" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0

i 4 7 427 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0

i1 i 48" 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 120.0 1137

547 120.0 120.0 112.0 112.0 120.0 101.0

2 L»— w 60" 120.0 120.0 100.8 100.8 120.0 90.9

1/4" MAX.

SHIM

SeP 27 2343

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
ByRW

MiamiéDade Producrt’CQntrol
PRODUCT REVISED

As complying with the Florida
23-0928.18

Building Code
NOA-No.

Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
B;WMmmﬁéﬁm

MiamiéDade Produc,ﬂ'.:o)'atrol

ur(;
)
e 9
[a]
© )
\‘__.___‘QG)
g
Py
Z 3t
Or 88|
A IS
EE .85
<E Z &
E&,38
oz8~¢
>0
Loy %
fFokE w
5
O0Gap
O2u4
gyg
Lo o
r o &
On.ogﬁ
Oz 4
mmwog
xz2
guUSL 3
u_u‘ﬂ_’o
4 ®
1 =02 U
2882
ClLos ¥
f—
7
— ©
g [To]
= 7
w
= "
Lad ©
5 —
ps )
o <
3 N2
~<-' .
=10 3
;jg -
Sl x
Z| o
=N+ 5
5303;—35
30<rm010
=|a . M
823_3@
T~
8)|F="18
%) O
Slno 2
&Elrin = d
%LIJI’)E;—
|
N
—
S
Wl T
r\wgz
b 's) 24
58255
E_Egr—g
clelgig g
] L
Ol | Ti=lE
IS
igiolalo
MisS|z2<Z
>
L0
A BEHEEE
OW(DK}!X)N
Llloia|ai=~
.‘gﬁa%:%
ol[o
\b\CwL‘_OI"
C
o |l =
o
S ga
IR R
S wir <
B . 5 || A
g0l
Silalls]l5
T ey
drawing no.

sheet 110f17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


WITHOUT REINF.
@ SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY

®

WITH REINF.
SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED
LARGE MISSILE IMPACT RESISTANT
TRANSOM
W——&m ~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~ -
e e - -t o
D.L. OPG. D.L. OPG
EXTERIOR
WITHOUT REINF.
SEE SHEET 5 e
FOR CAPACITY -

. D.L. OPG.

LEAF WIDTH

;  MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APRROVED
| LARGE MISSILE IMPACT RESISTANT DOOR
|

EXTERIOR

D.L. OPG.

©

—|
E
|
[ ] =k g{ ﬁ_
j S @'—‘—@\\ ~ [ v/” . f\\

L N g v . <
v g . B °
\ANCHORS TYPE
A B, CORD

SEE SHEETS 4 & 6

o T T T
T
1
S
S ]
D.L. OPG
EXTERIOR
WITH REINF.
SEE SHEET 5 e
FOR CAPACITY -

D.L. OPG.

LEAF WIDTH

EXTERIOR

Now. v a
. -
\ANCHORS TYPE
A B, C ORD

SEE SHEETS 4 & 6

SEE SEPARATE NOA FOR DESIGN LOAD
CAPACITY OF DOORS AND DOOR ANCHORS.

LOWER VALUES FROM DOORS NOA
OR STOREFRONT SYSTEM CAPACITY CHARTS

WILL APPLY TO ENTIRE SYSTEM.

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
Bymm@m

MiamiéDade Produc,t’Co}ltrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.18

Expiration Date; 10/28/2024
Bybﬂmwe@m

Miami/;Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol

LAMINATED GLASS

STORE\W09—-25

f
_c

’

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROCOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (308) 264-8100

M

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

[ SERIES 9500 ALUM WINDOW WALL SYSTEM (LM ]

|

)

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by{description

E |01.26.18
F 109.28.18
G [11.18.20

H 109.12.23

(revisions:
ol date

|

s
L]
:
x
N
M
P
o
I}
@

dr. by: TARIQ

chk. by:

date:  (04-16-09

| S
[ ———
drawing no.

W09—-25



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


®

WITHOUT REINF.
SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY

MIAMI-DADE COUNTY APPROVED
LARGE MISSILE IMPACT RESISTANT
TRANSOM

®

WITH REINF.
SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY

D.L. OPG.

©

WITHOUT REINF.
SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY

D.L. OPG.

EXTERIOR

MIAMI—-DADE COUNTY APRROVED

_____________ —
e
AVAUS S R
51V
AL " - T TTTT T
I
4] e
e ]
LEAF WIDTH
EXTERIOR

LARGE MISSILE IMPACT RESISTANT DOOR

D.L. OPG.
WITH REINF.
@ SEE SHEET 5
FOR CAPACITY
D.L. OPG.

EXTERIOR

LEAF WIDTH

EXTERIOR

STORE\WO09~25ES )

f
C

:

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (3085) 264-8100

(

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
Bymﬂw@m

Miamii‘pade Produc,t’c&'ntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida

Building Code
NOA-No. 23-0928.18

Expiration Date; 10/28/2024
Bybﬂmwe@m

Miami/;Dade Produc,t’Co}ltrol

INSUL. LAM. GLASS

SEP 27 2323

FL. 33142

TEL. (305) 638-5151

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI,

[ SERIES 9500 ALUM WINDOW WALL SYSTEM (LMl )

|

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

byTdescription

E |01.26.18
F 109.28.18
G {11.18.20

H 109.12.23

(revisions:
nol date

09

date:  04~16-

©
~
Lt
B
o
e}
71

chk. by:

S
S ————
drawing no.

W09-25



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


4 (o)
4970 2.500 2.500 ITEM NO.| PART NUMBER| QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION MATERIAL | MANF. /SUPPLIER /REMARKS u L
‘ (.210 | 1.110 = 1 £S9506 AS REQD. | FRAME HEAD (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — m“- o
_/—L—— 2 ES9503 AS REQD. | FRAME SILL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — 2
! - ! {;T 3 ES9505 AS REQD. | FRAME HORIZONTAL (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T5 | ~ > S z
Led
oAl 090 1.968 4 ES9504 AS REQD. | GLAZING STOP (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T5 | — Qr ©3lx
2.500 TP 200 2.500 =z |0
5 £S9507 AS REQD. | FRAME JAMB/MULLION (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — b 4 oxg|0
=5 | 5A £SS013 AS REQD. | DOOR MULLION 6063-T6 | — g & 3 g
(IS 5.000 1.063 5.000 e L 6 ES9502 AS REQD. | FRAME COVER 6063~T5 | — 6 § ~8
J 4 190 7 ES9508 AS REQD. | POCKET FILLER (LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | — 8 g& %
1853 —=11.063 = 8 ES9501 AS REQD. |SILL FLASHING 6063-T6 | — g b3y
090 Al 110 9 ES9016 AS REQD. |JAMB FILLER 6063-T6 | — O S "f;
. . G w
@ FRAME HEAD [J;b TYP. 10 £S9510 AS REQD. | MULLION REINFORCING 6063-T6 | — (o °) E @ o
L 104 - AS REQD. | MULLION REINFORCING STEEL | - Qaog %
- &
r—1.953-> 11 #12 X 17 | AS REQD. | FRAME ASSEMBLY SCREWS ST/ST | PH. SMS 8 ggg 3
_ — xz oo
— () rFravE JamB/MULLION | (58)  DOOR MULLION 2 AS REQD. | WEDGE GASKET EPDM quzt g
13 - AS REQD. | GLAZING COMPOUND SILICONE | DOWSIL 795/983 L2 g g 2
090 1.240 = 14 - AS REQD. | TRIM GASKET EPDM | — o Q0
TP, 757 o 7 | CE R
2.500 ﬂ os6 15 - AS REQD. |INTERIOR SPACER 1/4” X 1/4” EPDM | — »
) 02500  — ——47 16 - AS REQD. | SETTING BLOCK (LAM. GLASS) EPDM | DUROMETER 7545 SHORE A | | o)
4 ~TQ{8P0 17 - AS REQD. |SIDE BLOCK EPDM | DUROMETER 7545 SHORE A g ?ﬁ
' 18 ES9017 AS REQD. | DOOR MULLION REINFORCING 6063-T6 | — = w
[+0}
4.970 ?—‘ = ”
4.540 e
3.988  1.063 - 090 SEALANTS: %‘2 g
@ FRAME HORIZONTAL $ ALL FRAME CORNERS, JOINTS, MULLION SEAMS AND PERIMETER OF — &
& GLAZING BEAD TO FRAME SEALED WITH SILICONE SEALANT. = »
1.462 QO £
«1.953—7 786 S 0w
A = o
_ Z| -
(AT T ! Elvnis
.090 = g @5
TYP. @ POCKET FILLER DOOR MULLION REINFORCING 28 <+ 3 ®
2.500 Sz .8
B 937 937 BE=zq
1.000 §é§‘ -1 ﬁ - f“ it
1 - 4 dlinz
185 Hillwlm = ¢
4.970 PRODUCT RENEWED S|
As complying with the Florida | =<
Buildi
@ FRAME SILL —ef fe 125 125 Ngﬁ'r'].’;'.c"de 24-0513.04
4.500 4.500 WELDS Expiration Date: 10/28/2029 g\E 2B
By: A ~ i s
e bt OI= 9T
070 MiamiéDade Producrﬂ:(;ntrol 52 SN E
2.875 g ] il
150 r _] 435 435 PRODUCT REVISED OlEIZIE §
L 188 § § As complying with the Florida g8 olfle
625 ‘r Ch Building Code CIEIEIELE-
— T NOA-No. 23-0928.18 || |5
! MULLION REINFORCING MULLION REINFORCING Ex%io,. Date: 10/28/2024 ||, et
c N DRI A R
5180 By: Muz@m Sl
j 304 Mi ;/ de Prod )ﬂl Soelg -8
SILL FLASHING T iamf_pade Product Tontrol 31610 012
p—
C
=—1.938 -
.
.060 ]
(TYP.T {.289 & ‘u
r —e=t .200 q N 4 Q?
f I e 3.988 : g
1311 .060 - il
1.624 : 1118 313
) - . ik
ol £
T ——
/. AL oso SEP 27 2343 S ———
L ) drawing no.
1 1.301 . W09—-25
@ GLAZING STOP @ JAMB FILLER @ FRAME COVER (sheet 14 of 17)



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


2.500

4.970 {
|

*<}~1.578<>1<>—1.813—‘>

FRAME HEAD

.090
TYP.

5.000

— .090
TYP.

2.500

o]

B ML Y]

<>—1,593—*><“—1.813‘9J

@ ALT. FRAME HEAD

=210

ITEM NO.| PART NUMBER| QUANTITY | DESCRIPTION MATERIAL| MANF. /SUPPLIER/REMARKS
1A ES-9554 AS REQD. | FRAME HEAD (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063~-T6 | ~
1.1 ES—~9558 AS REQD. | ALT. FRAME HEAD (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
2A £S—-9551 AS REQD. | FRAME SILL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T6 | —
3A £S-9553 AS REQD. | FRAME HORIZONTAL (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063-T5 | —
4A E£S-95852 AS REQD. | GLAZING STOP (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063~-T5 | ~
SA ES—-9555 AS REQD. | FRAME JAMB/MULLION (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) | 6063-T6 | —
7A ES-3556 AS REQD. | POCKET FILLER (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) 6063~-T6 | -
16A - AS REQD. | SETTING BLOCK (INSUL. LAM. GLASS) EPDM DUROMETER 7545 SHORE A

-

T1.578~>

2.500

4.970

FRAME HORIZONTAL

<»~145784>1
e 9

.080
{TYP' 110 —=
el e e

2.500

F—ZSOO—T

1.813

Ejv .090
TYP.
204

FRAME JAMB,/MULLION

5.000

T
185
4.970
FRAME SILL
> 1.563
o
IR
1.624 1311
[
— 1.301 Lr
GLAZING STOP

7.757<'—

POCKET FILLER

SEP 27 2323

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No.

24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
Byw

Miamiﬁ_pade Produc,t’CtDntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No.

23-0928.18

Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
By?WWM

Miamif—pade Produc,t*Co}utrol

a

|

C
STORE\W09—25ES )

(C.A.N. 3538)

FAX. (305) 262-6978

AL-FAROOQ CORPORATION
ENGINEERS & PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT
9360 SUNSET DRIVE, SUITE 220

MIAMI, FLORIDA 33173

TEL. (305) 264-81.00

(

|

FAX. (305) 638-5158

E.S. WINDOWS, LLC
3550 N.W. 49 STREET

MIAMI, FL. 33142
TEL. (305) 638-5151

[SER!ES 9500 ALUM WINDOW WALL SYSTEM (L.M.l.)}

|

)

UPDATED TO 2017 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET
UPDATED TO 2020 FBC
NO CHANGE THIS SHEET

by [description

E |01.26.18
F 109.28.18
G 111.18.20
H 109.12.23

nol date

(revisions:

T

04~16-09

<
24
<
=
>
Fe)

-
i)

date:
chk. by:

drawing no.

W09—-25



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


(S35z-60M\3401S () sctc—sc (o) xvi  isig—ges (Sog) 3L ST RTRT IJ s >
U Whmw-wwmﬁwﬂ Xvd 00T8-v9Z (§0€) M13L ZYLEE 4 TAVIN 583 020z o1 Tarvaan Zoil s < n,_A S
8ESE "NV ELTEE VAIHOT TNVIN 13341S 6% "M'N 0G6G¢ L133HS SIHL 3ONVHD ON 81'82'60] 4 o ©
0ZZ 3LINS ‘IAIHA LISNNS 09€6 : - — S o=
.& ININLOTIAIA LONAOH ¥ SHIINIONT O11 SMOANIM 'S'3 o8 tﬂoﬂamuw%wm % m%mmo <4 ( Rel ik
€| NOILYHOJHOD DOoHVH-TV T.:jv W3LSAS TIVM MOGNIM WNTY 0066 &EL ( Suoisined) | 609tv0 mwop| | B = |5
a <
O—& % g9y .
s o/ £
\ \ A « mm 5
N \ E o 9 2 m
NN as QY
\ N — ™ © Q
A o€ N 3
E.M ° o
Eoo | % a
o) O
=8 |a o
Ww.c g 2
Qo y 9
aEf2 £
083 ¢ = E
£,350 5 8
& adaz 5 @ =
W (1] M N _
O 2 Q M o
= B: gy ¢C
e 2 c 3
N wg N 3
e & 22 .m o
= n.M a []
- O> |¢ T
D254 0 ©
QEcz ~2
08%% &t
o 5 8
adaz § & =
o
Z
04
o O
= &
& >
Q) O
© E
o O
O m
. "
. :
& &
o

() #12 X 172
FH SMS

™~
N
>
H ZS
™~ -
~ e
< L eE
N LJ
g N 2 &
—~ ~ o
oE - %v O
=<2 ©
4mG pd
TEE S
_ 4 W -
#mc |
=
X
(@
O
(]

m \l.:v
= S |
™~ =
5
=<
™~ B
— ZW%
£ /RE

— Xy
—~ TE
HH.V\ X+~ &H
<+ T
-2
o E
=2
e w



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


ALUM ANGLE
1" X 7/8" X 1/8"

ALUM SPLICE
o 1-1/2" X 1/8"
<+ é:EB
w )
|
| ALUM SPLICE
PR 1" X 1/8"

#10 X 1/2" PH SMS
" 4 PER PLATE

i~ #10 X 1" FH SMS
4 PER PLATE

#10 X 1/2" PH SMS
4 PER PLATE

JAMB AT _CIRCULAR JOINT

® ® 2t
l PN
] \ éﬂ

\#10

1 PER ANGLE 12N

#10 X 1/2” PH SMS
2 PER ANGLE

ALUM SPLICE
2" X 1/8"

#10 X 1/2" PH SMS N
2 PER PLATE

ALUM SPLICE
1-5/8" X 3/8"
~7
<t |
< 410 X 17 FH
. - 2 PER PLATE
' a—— o~

fé@ —
#10 X 1/2° PH SMS

- 2 PER PLATE

#10 X 17 FH SMS
2 PER PLATE

JAMB HEAD AT ANGLE JOINT

0 X 1/2" PH SMS
PER ANGLE

X 1/2" PH SMS

#10 X 1”7 FH SMS 1 PER ANGLE

SMS

#10 X 1”7 FH SMS

4 PER PLATE
&
<
1] N 1
Il I \\X‘ T /h

‘ (Y
ALUM SPLICE #10 sus
2" x 1/8 4 PER PLATE

ALUM SPLICE

5/8" X 3/16 #10 X 1" FH SMS

4 PER PLATE

HEAD & HEAD AT ANGLE JOINT

PRODUCT RENEWED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 24-0513.04

Expiration Date: 10/28/2029
Bi%%Wu%fiwa

Miamiﬁ‘pade Produc,t’cgntrol

PRODUCT REVISED
As complying with the Florida
Building Code

NOA-No. 23-0928.18

Expiration Date: 10/28/2024
BfW%mmﬁéﬂa

Miamif—pade Produc,t*Co}utrol

SEP 27 233

[« OB
[ie)
Yo |2
(1] )
n
g
Z 32
Or ?’gﬂ‘
Eg e
W R
€= =
zc». 26
OSoZ o
Oug ¢
> "
Loy X%
For-
3
Qcap
ORud
o>0’)
o= o
rr &
angﬁ
it
mngﬂ
quUsL 3
u_“‘(h_—o
5202@
Jw@(_j
Zm“u
LGz ¢
f—
[
— 0
— [T}
= -
= 7
o
= "
Lad w0
7S —
> 0
[(Vp) (o]
M
o et
= R
ZHO oy
= -
S &
Z) sl -
EIND 4 5
5303;5
SO W )
Q0 | )
o€z ¢
SISz g
& . 8
W OS5
Slonw 2
ol NGy R
%LIJP’)EH
AN
C T
-
-
ELE
PO ol I PO e
SR
Cln|8le
8%.{(\4}_
SHEEIEE
2HalZialz
gzl
Ol | T lE
I
o 512152
>
&
2 BRI
OA—JLOKXDCDN
LSloiniN| ==
2958/ 7|8
ggwu_oI)
I
gl
Sl
1|l @
3iS .
ezl
PRI
-t o ~
ERIR 5
T TN
drawing no.

sheet 17 of17



mp045
noa23-0928.18

Manny Perez
noa24-0513.04


	ADP6A50.tmp
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADPE83D.tmp
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC

	ADP2600.tmp
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC
	E.S. Windows, LLC




