Walters, Vivian (ISD)

From: David, Patty (WASD)

Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2014 6:33 PM

To: Walters, Vivian (ISD)

Cc: ~ Forhat-Diaz, Vivian (1SD)

Subject: Re: For your Review Project No. E13-WASD-10

Yes that's correct.

Patty David, Acting Chief
Intergovernmental Affairs Section
3071 SW 38 Avenue, 538-6
Miami, Florida 33146
786-552-8040

Sent from my iPhoneld
Please excuse any misspelling or errors.

On Jan 28, 2014, at 5:46 PM, "Walters, Vivian (I1SD)" <WalterV@miamidade.gov> wrote:
Patty,

Please confirm; the total estimated cost for the subject prO]ect is $10 Million - (2 agreements
@ $5 million each).

Please note, the total amount is what’s reflected on the “worksheet”.
Regards,

Vivian O. Walters, Jr.

Contract Development Specialist 11
Internal Services Department

Small Business Development Division
111 NW 1st Street #19 Floor

Miami, Fl 33128

walterv@miamidade govV
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From: David, Patty (WASD)

Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2014 4:00 PM

To: Forhat-Diaz, Vivian (ISD)

Cc: Walters, Vivian (ISD)

Subject: RE: For your Review Project No. E13-WASD-10

| am sorry | attached the wrong NTPC. Please use the attached.
1



