TALLY SHEET

Soticitation Number: 9231-0/18
Summary Description: Award Pins And Identification Nameplates
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: October 6, 2010
Prepared by: Ruth Laurean
Verlfled by: ##C 4.¢4 M”A‘W )
Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in y L green (OrSe ry, De or tertiary}
Vendor Name Caras LLC D/P/A Eagle Recognition Metis Inc.
Is the bid respensive (if no, state reason below):]  Bid needs legat opinicn from CAC (Re: Gold Variables) Bid is nen-responsible - Not able to provide relerences
Indicate DBD certilication: Non-SBD Non-SBD
Registerad vendor (yes/ no): Yes,Registered (01/27/10) Yes, Registered (10/22/2010)
Al affidavits complete (yes! no): Yes, Al affidavits complete No, Missing Collusion Affidavil
Incumbent vendor (yes/ng): Yas, Incumbent vendor No, Mon-Incumbent
Loca! Preterence Aflirmed {yes/ino): tocal Preference not alfirmed No, Lecal Prelerence not affirmed

lHems being procured per current solicitation
lem # | Summarized Requirement
The Bidder(s) shall maintain an office or production faciiity stalfed by company representatives who can
be contacted Monday through Friday 8:00 AM 10 5:00 PM. Bidder must provide companry’s complete
1 address, telephone number, separale facsimile line number, and e-mail address.

Compahy Name: Caras LLC D/B/A Eagle Recognition Metis Inc.
Company Complete Address: 4312 75th Street West, Bradenton, FL 34209 2800 Glenn Avanue
Telephone Number: {941) 727-9797 {405) 585-6384
Facsimile Number: (941) 727-9798 4 (405) 602-0218

E-Mail Address: dlilf@ sagletecognilion.com
2 Bidder shall provide sample of similar pins {gold and siiver) with the bid submittal for evaluation by the Samptes fonvarded to Office of the Commission
County.

List references from Commercial andfor Government Agencies' where bidder has provided award pins
3 and identification names ptates tor a minimum ol one-year conseculively.

23 mmartin @ metising.com
Samples forwarded to Olfice of the Commission

1) __Name of Business: Oifice Depot City of Brawley
Contaél's Name: Jerry Wicklander i| Angela Mayo
Telephone: ) (561) 438-76872 | (760) 351-3048

2) Name of Business: Lee County, Florida City of Pleasanton
Contadt's Mame: Elaine Schullz Debra Farmer
Tetephone: (239) 533-2002 (925) 931-5054

3) Mame of Business: Elizabeth Greco

Contacl's Name: Lee County Port Authority

Claudia Main
Telephone: (239) 768-4335 {828) 323-7421
Current Extended Extended
liem No Description City Unit Price Unil Price Price Price
Group 1 - Employee's Award Pins $4.5
1 5-Year Sterling Silver two-piece award Laps! Pin with ne 1400 % 5.93 | % 8,302.00 1169 | & 16.366.00
gemstones {with attachable chain and bar). Crest of pin has ’
fiat black finish in background,
§ 73818 7,380.00

. . 1416 | % $4,160.00
2 i(-Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award Lapel Pin 1000 $5.96

with one (1) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic Aquamaring stone
alfixed to Lapel Pin {with attachable chain and bar). Crest
of pin has flat btack finish in background.

3 |15-Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award Lapel Pin 1000 $7.36] § 883)% 8,830.00
with two {2) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic Aquamarine stones
affixed to Lapet Pin (with attachable chain and bar). Crest
of pin has flat black finish in background.

4 20-Year 1110 10K Gold Filled two-piece service award 200 $12.72] $ 1475 | $ 11,800.00

1663 | $  16,630.00

2422 |$  19,376.00
Lapel Pin wilh three {3) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic Auby

stones atfixed to Lapel Pin (with attachable chain and bar).
5 25-Year 10K Yellow Plum Gold iwo-piece service awarg 500 $69.50 $ 75.61 | § 87,805.00

Lapel Pin with one {1) 8ss (2.25mm) Emerald stone affixed
to Lapel Pin {with attachable chain and bar).

7797 1% 38,985.00

6 |30-Year 10K Yellow Plum Gold two-piece service award 300 $683.001% 102.91 | § 30,873.00
Lapel pin with one (1) 5-point (.05 caral) full-cut Diamond
aflixed 1o Lapel Pin {wilth_attachable chain and bar}.

Total (ltems 1 through 6): s 21541 |8 104,960.00

103.61 | §  21,083.00

248.28 | §  136,600.00
g -

G -
136,600.00

104,990.00
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TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Mumber:
Summary Description:
Solicitation Opening/ Clesing Date:

Prepared by:
Verified by: :
Note: When all prices are entered, highlighl low priced vendor in yellow { and if applicable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

9231-0/18

Award Pins And Identification Nameplates
October 6, 2010
Ruth Laureano

Vendor Name:
is the bid responsive (il no, state reason betow):
Indicate DBD cenification:]

Registered vendor (yes/ no):

All affidavits complete (ves/ no):

Incumbent vender {yes/no):

Local Preference Affirmed {yes/no}:

Caras LLC D/BIA Eagie Recognilion
Bid neads legal opiniors from CAQ {Re: Gold Variabtes)
Non-SBD
Yes,Registered (01/27/10)
Yes, At affidavils complete
Yes, Incumbent vendor
Local Prelerence nol affirmed

Bid is non-responsible - Net able to provide references

Yes, Registered (10/22/2010)
No, Missing Collusion Affidavit

Ne, Lecal Preference net affirmed

Melis Inc.

Non-SBD

No, Non-Incumbent

Itams being procured ger current solicitation

ftermn # 1 Summarized Requirement
Curreni Extended Extended
ltem Mo Description Qty Unit Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
Group 2 - Employee's Nameplates
Solid brass name bars, as per bid specification, including $2.09 | § 5351% 6,420.00 7093 8,508.00
7 “MIA" Loge. 1200
Engraving of Employee's Name, color filled in black enamel $0.20 [ % 5.35 | % 6.420.00 359 |$%  4,788.00
8 |pone One By Cne) 1200
Minirmum Qrder Each:
.7
Total (ltems 7 and 8): $ 1070 $ 12,840,00 11.081%  13,286.00
__Total Raw Price: - 3 -
Evaluation Adjustment 10% Local Preference: - "
Total Evaluated Price: 12,840.00 13,296.00
Optional #ems (not included in evaluated price) Bidder found non-responsive by the CAO Bidders References could not provide
(took exception lo the terms & conditions of references on the company. Found
. . the solicitation). Non-Responsible,
Identily Non-responsive vendors and reason:

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A
DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)
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TALLY SHEET

Solicitation Number: 9231-0/18
Sumpary Desciiption: Award Ping And identification Nameplates
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: i Qctober 6, 2010
Preparedby: Ruth Laureano
Verifled by: )
Note: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow ( and if applicable, green for secondary, blu
Vendor Name: Seybert Sales Company 0.C. Tanner Recognition Co. Awards LLC d/b/a Trophy World
Is the bid responsive (il no, state reason below) Bid needs legal epinion from CAQ (Re: Gold Bid needs legal opinion from CAQ (Re: Bidder taok Bid is responsive
Indicate DBD centilication: Non-SBD Non-SBD Non-SBD
Aegistered vendor {yes/ na): Yes, Registered { 01/05/2011} Registered {new app needed} Yes, Regisiered {08/08/08)
All affidavits complete (yes/ no): Yes, All aflidavits complete Yes, Al aflidavits compiete Yes, All aflidavits complele
Incumbent vendor (yes/no): No, Mot Incumbent No, Net Incumbent No, Not Incumbent
_ Local Preference Aflirmed (yes/no): No, Local Preference not atfirmed No, Locat Preference not affirmed Yes, Local Preference was Aflirmed

ltems being procured per current soliciiation
item # I — Summarized Requirement
The Bidder{s) shall maintain an office or praduclion momw stafled by company representatives who can
be contacted Menday through Friday 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM. Bidder musi provide company™s complete
1 address, telephone number, separate Jacsimile line number, and e-mail address.

Company Name: Seyben Sales Co. Inc. Q.C. Tanner Recognition Company Awards LLC d/b/a Trophy Word
Company Complets Address: 4981 Garden Drive, Delray Beach, FL 33445 321 Northiske Bivd. #209, N. Palm Beach, FL 33408 | 6400 NW 77 Coun, Miami, FL 33166
Telephone Number: (561) 638-7677 (561) 863-5065 (305) 592-5850
Facsimife Number: (661) 838-6364 (561) 863-4840 {305) 592-5854
E-Mail Address: weseybert@msn.com dan.norman@cctannar.com lar| wasdstrophywords.com
2 {Bidder shall provide sample of similar pins (gold and silver} wilh the bid submitial ior evaluation by the Samples forwarded to Cffice of the Commission Papear Sample only Sample of badge & backing forwarded to Aviation
County. Depariment.
List referencas from Commerdial and/or Government Agencies' where bidder has provided award pins
3 |and identification names plates for a minimum of one-year consecutively.
1) _MName of Business: Ingluded . DHL Miami-Dade County
Contact's Name: Jackson Heallh Services Scotl Trurmpolt Miriam Bivero
Telephone: Walker Sainvil - Employee Recognition {054) 626-1949 (305) 375-2443
2)  MName of Business: {786) 466-B387 Baplisi Health South Florida Builders Associalion of South Florida
Contact's Name: Pinellas County Personnel Bol Shirk Toni Hinkley
Telephone: Karen Merdier - Personnel
3) Name of Business: {727) 464-3746 {786) 662-7073 {305) 556-6300
Contact's Name: ) City of Hollywood Ryder System City of Doral Police
Telephone: Lisa Smith, HR Risk Management Fran Hoskin Teresa Grardal
(954} 921-3218 (305) 500-7717 (305) 593-6609
Current Extended Extended Exlended
ltern No Descriplion _ Qty Unit Price Unit Price Price Unil Price Price Unit Price Price
Group 1 - Employee's Award Plns X
i 5-Year Sterling Silver two-piece award Lapel Pin with no 1400 % 1382 | $ 19,348.00 [ 1824 |$§  25536.00 NO BID NO BID
gemstonas {with atiachable chain and bar}. Crest of pin has
flat black finish in background.
$ 1561 [ $ 1561000 $ 2035 (& 20,350.00 NO BID NC BID
2  [10-Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award Lapel Pin 10G0 $5.96

with one {1) Bss (2.25mm) synthelic Aquamarine sione
affixed to Lapel Pin {with attachable chain and bar}. Crest
of pin has flat black finish in background.

3 |16-Year Sterling Silver two-piece service award Lapel Pin 1000 $7.36] $ 17.40 | 3 17,400.00 $ 2246 | %  22,460.00 NO BID

with two (2) 8ss (2.25mm} synihelic Aquamarine siones
affixed to Lape! Pin {with aitachable chain and bar). Crest
of pint has flal btack finish in background.

4 |20-Year 1/10 10K Gold Filled two-piece service award 800 $12.72] $ 27.391% 21,912.00 $

NO BID

44116 528800 NG BID NO BID

Lapel Pin wilh three (3) 8ss (2.25mm) synthetic Ruby
stonas affixed 1o Lapel Pin {with attachable chain and bar).

5 |25-Year 10K Yelow Plum Gold wo-piece service award 500 $69.50] 108.89 | 54.445.00 # 12762 | 63,810.00 NO BID NO BID

Lapel Pin with one (1) 8ss (2.25mm) Emerald stone affixed
to Lapel Pin {with altachable chain and bar).

6 [30-Year 10X Yalow Plumn Gold two-piece service award 300 $83.00 | % 145.40 [ $ 43,620.00 $ 17468 (§  62,404.00 NO BID
Lapel pin with one (1) 5-point {.05 carat) full-cul Diamond
affixed to Lapel Pin {with altachable chain and bar).

NQO BiD

Total (items 1 through 6}: $ 32851 | $ 172,335.00 $ 407.46 | §_ 218,848.00 § -
§ - 3 : § -
$ - $ - $ -
§ 172,335.00 $_ 219,848.00 $ .
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TLALLY 2iCcCis

Solicitation Number:

Summary Description:

Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date:
Prepared by:

Verified by:

9231-0118

Award Pins And Identification Nameplales
October 6, 2010

Ruth Laureano

Hete: When all prices are entered, highlight low priced vendor in yellow ( and il applicable, green for secondary, by

Vendor Name:
Is 1he bid responsive (if no, state reason below):
Indicate DBD certification:

Ragistered vendor {yes! no):

All affidavits complele {yes/ no}:
Incumbent vendor {yes/no):
Local Preference Affirmed (ves/no):

Seybett Sales Company
Bid needs legal opinion from CAQO (Re: Gold
Non-5BD
Yes, Registered { 01/05/2011)
Yes, All aflidavits complete
No, Not Incumbent
No, |.ocal Preference nol aflirmed

0.C. Tanner Recagnition Co,
Bid needs legal cpinion from CAO {Re: Bidder 100k

Non-580

Registered {(new app needed)
Yes, All atfidavits complete

Nao, Not Incumbent

No, Local Preference not alliemed

Awards LLC dfb/a Traphy World
Bid is respoensive
Non-5BD
Yes, Registered (08/08/08)
Yas, All affidavils complete
No, Not Incurmbent
Yes, Local Preference was Affiimed

Items being procured per current soficitalion

Opticnal iems (not included in evaluated price)

{dentily Non-responsive vendors and reason:
1

lhe CAQ {took exceplion to he
terms & conditions ot the
icitation

exception 1o the terms & condifions ol 1he solicitaiion.

ltem # | Summarized Requirement
Current Extended Exiended Extended
llem No Descriplion Qty Unit Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price Unit Price Price
Group 2 - Employee's Nameplates
Salid brass name bars, as per bid specificatior, including $2.99 428§ 513600 $ 103218 12,384.00 $ 275 % 3,300.00
7 “MIA" Logo. 1200
Engraving of Employee's Name, color filled in black enamel $0.20 430 (% 5,160.00 $ 525§  6,300.00 $ 400f%  4,800.00
8  |({Done One By One) 1200
Minimum Order Each: Note: no die fee  Minimum order Each: 500
Tetal (ltems 7 and 8): 858 [§ 10,206.00 $ 1657 [ § 18,684.00 $ 675 % 8,100.00
Total Raw Price: b: B R % .
Evaluation Adjusiment 10% Local Preference: E - - 810.00
Tolal Evaluated Price: 10,296.00 . 18,684.00 7,290.00
Bidder found non-responsive by |Bidder found non-responsive by the GAQ {100k Bidder found non-responsive by CAQ (inserted in

his bid submiital a minimum order quansity).

THIS YALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY AND IS NOT A

DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE/RESPONSIBLE BIDDER(S)
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