TALLY SHEET
Solicitation Number: 9695-0/18 Traffic Poles, Mast Heads, and L.E.D Signals & Housings

Summary Description: To purchase, Traffic Poles, Mast Heads, and L.E.D Signals & Housings
Solicitation Opening/ Closing Date: 10/17/2012 Wednesday 2:00pm
Prepared by: Mary Hammett

Verified by: Mary Hammett and Kristina Guillen i
Note: When all prices are.entered, highlight low pri¢ed vendor in yellow { and if app
' Vendor Name:

DESCRIPTION

Conviction Disclosure (Yes/No):
Were all Affidavits Completed:
Were alt Affidavits Submitted:
Incumbent Vendor {Yes/No):
Registered Vendor {Yes/No):
Indicate SBD Certification:
Collusion Affidavits:

. EST. QTY.

i2fz /2012 . bﬂ?a-/ﬁ’mfw% izl2/re

licable, green for secondary, blue for tertiary)

Vendor FEIN:

ADPICS Address:

Sunbiz Address:
Is this Bid Responsive (If no, state reason):
Local Preference Affirmed (Yes/No):

Control Technologies, In¢

General Supply & Services, Inc
DBA GEXPRO

South Dade Electrical Supply, Inc

Temple, Inc

The Arraé Group

Transportation Conirol Systems, Inc

592038877-01

205021902-01

CURRENT PRICE

591109106-01 630573758-01 743164734-01 591673144-01
2776 3. Financial Court 8060 N.W.77th Court P.O. Box 560965 P.O. Box 2066 2460 N Courtway PKWY# 206 1030 86th Street
Sanford, FL 32773 Medley, FL 33166 Miami, FL. 33256-0965 Decatur, AL 35602 Merrit Island, FL 32953 Tampa, FL 33619
100G Bridgeport Ave 5th Floor 13100 S.W. 87th Avenue 305 Bank Street 170 Sun port Lane Suite 800 1030 S 86th Street
Same as above Shelton, CT 06484 Miami, FL 33176 Decatur, Al 35601 QOrlando, FL 32808 . Tampa, FL 3361¢
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No Yes Yes No No No
No No No Mo No No
Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes
Yes 3 -'Ye.s‘ w Yes No Yes Yes
Yes No No No No No
Yes 08/05/10 Yes 07/01/08 Yes 04/09/08 Yes 01/24/11 Yes 03/29/2011 Yes 10/14/08
No No No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes

UNIT PRICE |EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED PRICE

L.E.D Countdown Signal Moduies
Only Dialight Model#430-6479-
001F or Approved Equal

2,500

$158.55

$119.95 $299,875.00

$147.58 $368,950.00

No Bid

No Bid

$146.00

$365,000.00

Mo Bid

No Bid

$ 129.41 $323,525.00

L.E.D Countdown Signals
Modules Dialight Model#430-6479-
001F Compiete with Housing or
Approved Equal

750

$239.00

$162,000.00
$216.00

$256.53 $192,397.50

No Bid

No Bid

$268.00

$201,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

3 22566 $169,245.00

Group {B) Total Lines tems 3and 4 Extended Total:

$461,875.00

$561,347.50

$566,000.00

$492,770.00

Note: Contrsi Technolagies, inc added an item 4a {750 Housing Mode# TSL-PED-16 CIL-2-FL/m32253) that is not listed in ITB

Section 2 Paragraph 2.25 !nformatiqn sheets shalt be submitted for each item offered

THIS TALLY SHEET IS AN INDICATION OF PRICES ONLY ANDG ! NOT A DETERMINATION OF THE LOWEST RESPONSIVE RESPONSIBLE B{DDER(S})




